

John D. Saxon, P.C.
BILLING WORKSHEETS
SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

JDS
\$385.00/hr

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPL	B T X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE: 0003265		Ashley Leigh Maner				STANDARD				
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000		v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine								
LEG	030	Legal Services	10/13/10	JDS	B NT	Initial office conf. w/client. Review facts, legal issues, client documents. Discuss causes, courses of action. Review, explain, sign contingent fee agreement. Open file.	1.00	450.000	855.00	
<i>insufficient detail to listing for cases related to. unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	10/25/10	JDS	B NT	Review email from client.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	10/26/10	JAH	B NT	Conf. w/MYG confirming client is on my case list. Review forwarded client emails.	0.20	250.000	50.00	
<i>insufficient detail & duplicate but unrelated.</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	10/26/10	JDS	B NT	Review email from client w/additional factual information.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
<i>unrelated.</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	11/18/10	JDS	B NT	Review voicemail message from client re: unemployment. Call from, conf. w/, client re: same.	0.20	450.000	90.00	
<i>no authority why necessary for this case. insufficient dup. unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	11/19/10	JAH	B NT	Review client materials.	0.30	250.000	125.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	11/29/10	JDS	B NT	Review note from MYG re: client's unemployment appeal hearing.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	11/30/10	JDS	B NT	Review, reply to email from JAH re: client's unemployment appeal hearing.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/01/10	JAH	B NT	Review email from JDS re: unemployment hearing.	0.10	250.000	25.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/03/10	JAH	B NT	Draft letter, fax information to DIR.	0.60	250.000	150.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/03/10	JAH	B NT	Have TA fax copy of letter from defendant to client re: released through no fault of her own.	0.10	250.000	25.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/06/10	JAH	B NT	Conf. w/client to prepare for unemployment hearing; represent client at same.	1.60	250.000	400.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/06/10	JDS	B NT	Conf. w/JAH re: client unemployment hearing.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/09/10	JAH	B NT	Review DIR rejection of client's unemployment. Call from, conf. w/, client re: same.	0.20	250.000	50.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/13/10	JAH	B NT	Draft EEOC charge and fill-in field. Email draft to client.	1.90	250.000	475.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/14/10	JAH	B NT	Review, reply to client email re: William Crosby. Make corrections to charge and give to JDS.	0.10	250.000	25.00	
<i>Duplication</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/14/10	JDS	B NT	Review email from JAH to client enclosing draft EEOC charge, her reply, his reply.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/15/10	JAH	B NT	Make changes to EEOC charge per JDS; call to, conf. w/, client re: same. Email new draft to client, get approval and file at EEOC.	1.00	250.000	250.00	
<i>Duplication</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/15/10	JDS	B NT	Review, revise draft EEOC charge, cover letter. Confs. w/JAH re: same.	0.30	450.000	135.00	
<i>Duplication</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/22/10	JAH	B NT	Draft memo to JDS re: appeal to DIR.	0.10	250.000	25.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/22/10	JDS	B NT	Review, reply to memo from JAH re: appeal of unemployment determination.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/23/10	JAH	B NT	Review memo from JDS re: appeal to DIR. Case research re: same.	2.10	250.000	525.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/23/10	JDS	B NT	Phone conf. w/JAH re: unemployment appeal.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/27/10	JAH	B NT	Call to, conf. w/, JDS re: appeal of unemployment decision. Draft same and fax to Dept. of Industrial Relations.	0.40	250.000	100.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/29/10	JDS	B NT	Review email from JAH to client re: unemployment.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
<i>unrelated</i>										

CALL CALL \$1200.00

John D. Saxon, P.C.
BILLING WORKSHEETS

SORTED BY CLIENT CODE

BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T	X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE: 0003265		Ashley Leigh Maner									
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000		v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine				STANDARD					
LEG	030	Legal Services	01/05/11	JDS	B	NT	Review unemployment notice of determination.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	01/20/11	JAH	B	NT	Review, reply to client email re: unemployment appeal.	0.10	250.000	25.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	01/20/11	JDS	B	NT	Review disallowance of application of appeal. Review email from client, JAH's reply.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	02/22/11	JAH	B	NT	Review Dept. of Industrial Relations materials. Draft notice of appeal. Make changes per JDS and fedex same to Calhoun County Circuit Court.	3.10	250.000	775.00	<i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	02/22/11	JDS	B	NT	Conf. w/JAH re: appealing unemployment case. Review, revise notice of appeal.	0.20	450.000	90.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/03/11	JDS	B	NT	Call from, conf. w/, Arthur Fite re: settlement.	0.30	450.000	135.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/07/11	JDS	B	NT	Review filed notice of appeal of unemployment benefits.	0.10	450.000	45.00	<i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/07/11	JDS	B	NT	Call to, left message (H) for, client. Call to (C), conf. w/, client re: settlement.	0.40	450.000	180.00	<i>unrelated to winning</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/08/11	JAH	B	NT	Conf. w/JDS re: client's willingness to settle.	0.10	250.000	25.00	<i>Duplicate</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/08/11	JDS	B	NT	Review notice of service of summons and complaint (unemployment hearing/appeal).	0.10	450.000	45.00	<i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/08/11	JDS	B	NT	Call from, conf. w/, Arthur Fite re: settlement.	0.20	450.000	90.00	<i>insuff. data</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/09/11	JAH	B	NT	Review notice of service of appeal on AL DIR.	0.10	250.000	25.00	<i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/09/11	JAH	B	NT	Call from, conf. w/, client re: case status.	0.10	250.000	25.00	<i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/10/11	JAH	B	NT	Review notice of no service to Linkan, LLC. Conf. w/JDS re: possibility of serving Arthur Fite. Have MYG calendar.	0.10	250.000	25.00	<i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/10/11	JDS	B	NT	Conf. w/JAH re: unemployment appeal.	0.10	450.000	45.00	<i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/10/11	JDS	B	NT	Review notice of non-service of Complaint. Conf. w/JAH re: same.	0.20	450.000	90.00	<i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/15/11	JDS	B	NT	Review, reply to email from client re: new job.	0.10	450.000	45.00	<i>insuff. data</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/25/11	JAH	B	NT	Conf. w/JDS re: service on Arthur Fite.	0.10	250.000	25.00	<i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/29/11	JAH	B	NT	Review Alabama DIR answer to appeal.	0.10	250.000	25.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/29/11	JDS	B	NT	Review answer of Dept. of Industrial Relations.	0.10	450.000	45.00	<i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/30/11	JAH	B	NT	Review voicemail from Frank Marsh w/Alabama DIR re: jury demand.	0.10	250.000	25.00	<i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/01/11	JDS	B	NT	Conf. w/JAH re: jury demand.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/05/11	JAH	B	NT	Call to, left message for, A. Fite re: service. Call from, conf. w/, Fite re: I do not represent Linkan at this time.	0.10	250.000	25.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/05/11	JDS	B	NT	Conf. w/JAH re: service of unemployment appeal.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/06/11	JAH	B	NT	Draft alias summons, motion to strike jury demand. Have JDS approve same. Find restaurant address for FUJI. File alias summons and motion.	1.10	250.000	275.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/06/11	JDS	B	NT	Review civil summons (U/E appeal); review motion to strike jury demand.	0.10	450.000	45.00	<i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/07/11	JAH	B	NT	Review order granting motion to strike.	0.10	250.000	25.00	

John D. Saxon, P.C.
 BILLING WORKSHEETS
 SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
 BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG W.C. DESCRIPTION DATE EMPLY T X COMMENT HOURS RATE WIP AMOUNT BILL AMOUNT

CLIENT CODE: 0003265
 ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000

Ashley Leigh Maner
 v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine

STANDARD

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/08/11	JDS	B NT	Review order granting motion to strike.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/11/11	JAH	B NT	Review notice of docket call.	0.10	250.000	25.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/12/11	JDS	B NT	Review notice of docket call in unemployment case.	0.10	450.000	45.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/13/11	JDS	B NT	Review notice of docket call for unemployment case.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	05/01/11	JDS	B NT	Review notice of service of Complaint.	0.10	450.000	45.00	clerical / insuff detail
LEG	030	Legal Services	05/02/11	JDS	B NT	Review Arthur Fite's notice of appearance.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	05/03/11	JDS	B NT	Review letter from Frank Marsh re: docket of 05/10/11.	0.10	450.000	45.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	06/08/11	JDS	B NT	Review email from client re: status. Note to JAH.	0.10	450.000	45.00	insuff detail
LEG	030	Legal Services	06/12/11	JDS	B NT	Review email from JAH to client re: status.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	06/30/11	JAH	B NT	Review client email.	0.10	250.000	25.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	06/30/11	JDS	B NT	Review email from client re: status, recent developments.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	09/23/11	JAH	B NT	Draft letter to EEOC responding to defendant. Make corrections per JDS and email same.	0.40	250.000	100.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	09/23/11	JDS	B NT	Review, revise draft reply to EEOC. Conf. w/JAH re: same. Review exhibits to letter.	0.30	450.000	135.00	duplication
LEG	030	Legal Services	09/23/11	JDS	B NT	Review email from client, reply by JAH, reply by client, reply by JAH re: pictures of party, letter to EEOC.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	12/16/11	MGM	B NT	Took call from EEOC investigator informing us that they will not issue a cause finding but will send notice of right to sue letter soon.	0.20	225.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	01/13/12	JDS	B NT	Review right to sue letter.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	01/20/12	MGM	B NT	Draft letter and request form to EEOC requesting EEOC file.	0.20	225.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	02/20/12	MGM	B NT	Scan, download, and save to e-file, Bates stamp client's EEOC file.	0.10	225.000	22.50	clerical
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/10/12	JDS	B NT	Review, revise draft Complaint. Conf. w/MGM re: same.	0.60	450.000	270.00	duplication
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/10/12	MGM	B NT	Draft Complaint and give to JDS for review; enter JDS' revisions to Complaint; prepare service package; file Complaint at federal courthouse.	2.00	225.000	450.00	insuff. detail some clerical
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/12/12	MGM	B NT	Phone conf. w/Judge Hopkins' clerk (2x) about sending her a separate request for service certified mail and a redacted exhibit A & B; review (3) emails from clerk re: same; download to client's e-file documents 1-3.	0.40	225.000	90.00	clerical
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/13/12	MGM	B NT	Took certified mail receipt to Judge Hopkins' docket clerk per her request.	0.50	225.000	112.50	clerical
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/24/12	JDS	B NT	Review phone message from client re: former employer is selling the business.	0.10	450.000	45.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/25/12	MGM	B NT	Print out document 6.	0.10	225.000	22.50	clerical
LEG	030	Legal Services	05/01/12	MGM	B NT	Tried to locate a better address to send the Complaint to because the summons was returned unexecuted; conf. w/JDS re: same.	0.30	225.000	67.50	
LEG	030	Legal Services	05/04/12	JDS	B NT	Review return of summons unexecuted as to defendant.	0.10	450.000	45.00	clerical

MGM rate \$125.00 hr.

John D. Saxon, P.C.
BILLING WORKSHEETS

SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
-------	------	-------------	------	-------	-----	---------	-------	------	------------	-------------

CLIENT CODE: 0003265
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000

Ashley Leigh Maner
v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine

STANDARD

LEG 030	Legal Services	05/04/12	JDS	B	NT	(CONTINUED)					
LEG 030	Legal Services	05/23/12	MGM	B	NT	Prepare service of process package to serve defendant at different address than the first time; e-filed request for service by certified mail; downloaded to client's e-file and printed out document 7; took service package to the courthouse.	1.10	225.000	247.50		<i>clerical</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	05/25/12	MGM	B	NT	Download and print out the re-issuance of the summons.	0.10	225.000	22.50		<i>clerical</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	06/05/12	MGM	B	NT	Download, print, and file document 9, summons returned executed.	0.10	225.000	22.50		<i>clerical</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	06/17/12	JDS	B	NT	Review letter from Stephen McCormick w/Alabama DIR to Ted Hooks, Calhoun Co. circuit clerk.	0.10	450.000	45.00		<i>unrelated</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	06/18/12	MGM	B	NT	Review voicemail from opposing counsel, Arthur Fite re: defendant's answer.	0.10	225.000	22.50		<i>unrelated</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	06/20/12	JDS	B	NT	Review letter from Board of Appeals, State DIR, to Ted Hooks, circuit clerk.	0.10	450.000	45.00		<i>unrelated</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	06/21/12	MGM	B	NT	Review, print and file defendant Linkan's answer.	0.20	225.000	45.00		<i>unrelated</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	07/12/12	JDS	B	NT	Review defendant's motion to set state court action for trial.	0.10	450.000	45.00		<i>unrelated</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	07/16/12	JDS	B	NT	Review order f 07/16/12 re: state court unemployment proceeding.	0.10	450.000	45.00		<i>unrelated</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	07/16/12	MGM	B	NT	Print out for hard file the order re: motion to set trial date.	0.10	225.000	22.50		<i>unrelated/ clerical</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	07/24/12	JDS	B	NT	Review order setting deadline for RPPM.	0.10	450.000	45.00		<i>clerical</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	07/24/12	MGM	B	NT	Save to client's e-file and print out for CAB to calendar and JDS to review the order re: RPPM deadline; email to CAB w/deadline to calendar re: same.	0.10	225.000	22.50		<i>clerical</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	07/25/12	JDS	B	NT	Review e-notice of deadline for RPPM.	0.10	450.000	45.00		<i>duplicate</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	08/13/12	JDS	B	NT	Conf. w/MGM re: unemployment appeal.	0.10	450.000	45.00		<i>unrelated</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	08/16/12	MGM	B	NT	Review voicemail from Arthur Fite, opposing counsel, re: RPPM; email to Jessica Horn, AF's legal assistant, re: same. draft RPPM and email to Horn for A. Fite's review; review email from J. Horn re: same.	1.30	225.000	292.50		
LEG 030	Legal Services	08/16/12	MGM	B	NT	Review email from Jessica Horn, legal assistant, re: RPPM.	0.10	225.000	22.50		
LEG 030	Legal Services	08/17/12	JDS	B	NT	Review defendant's motion to continue trial in U/E appeal.	0.10	450.000	45.00		<i>unrelated</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	08/17/12	MGM	B	NT	Review and download to client's efile defendant's motion to continue; review and respond to Jessica Horn's email re: RPPM.	0.10	225.000	22.50		<i>unrelated</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	08/20/12	JDS	B	NT	Review, revise draft RPPM. Conf. w/MGM re: same.	0.20	450.000	90.00		<i>input - detail to allocate</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	08/20/12	MGM	B	NT	Phone conf. w/Arthur Fite, opposing counsel, re: RPPM; review and respond to email from Jessica Horn, legal assistant, re: same. Print out RPPM draft and give to JDS for review; enter JDS' revisions to RPPM and e-file same.	0.40	225.000	90.00		<i>input - detail to allocate non-duplicative & non-clerical</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services	08/21/12	JDS	B	NT	Review order of 08/21/12.	0.10	450.000	45.00		<i>unrelated</i>

John D. Saxon, P.C.
 BILLING WORKSHEETS
 SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
 BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPL	B T	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE: 0003265		Ashley Leigh Maner				STANDARD				
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000		v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine								
LEG 030	Legal Services	08/21/12	MGM	B	NT	Save to client's e-file and print out order re: motion to continue; give to JDS for review.	0.10	225.000	22.50	unrelated
LEG 030	Legal Services	02/11/13	JDS	B	NT	Conf. w/MGM re: discovery.	0.20	450.000	90.00	unrelated
LEG 030	Legal Services	02/11/13	JDS	B	NT	Review email from MGM to Jessica Horn re: discovery cutoff, reply from Horn, reply from MGM. Conf. w/MGM re: same.	0.20	450.000	90.00	unrelated
LEG 030	Legal Services	02/11/13	MGM	B	NT	Send email to Jessica Horn, Arthur Fite's assistant, re: filing a joint motion to extend discovery deadlines; review email response from Horn re: same; my reply to same; call to, left voicemail for, J. Horn re: whether to file motion or simply do an expedited discovery process before we file the joint status report in two weeks; phone conf. w/Horn re: same; left voicemail for Arthur Fite re: same; conf. w/JDS about filing motion.	0.70	225.000	157.50	
LEG 030	Legal Services	02/18/13	MGM	B	NT	Phone conf. w/Arthur Fite, opposing counsel, re: LLC dissolution and LLC selling restaurant; review, download, and print for client files defendant's motion to set for trial in state unemployment case; save and print out order re: deadline for joint status report and give to CAB to put on calendar and calendar same on my personal work calendar; print out previous order re: joint status report.	0.50	225.000	112.50	some clerical
LEG 030	Legal Services	02/20/13	JDS	B	NT	Conf. w/MGM re: discovery, order of 02/20/13.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services	02/20/13	JDS	B	NT	Review e-notice of order of 02/15/13.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services	02/20/13	MGM	B	NT	Filed defendant's motion to set for trial in hard file; filed order re: joint status report deadline of 03/04/13.	0.10	225.000	22.50	unrelated
LEG 030	Legal Services	02/28/13	MGM	B	NT	Phone conf. w/client re: signing an affidavit; phone conf. w/client regarding information for affidavit.	0.30	225.000	67.50	unrelated
LEG 030	Legal Services	03/01/13	MGM	B	NT	Drafted declaration for client to sign; call to, left voicemail for, client; phone conf. w/client re: affidavit; make changes to affidavit and sent via email for client to review.	2.20	225.000	495.00	Some - no off. court filed in the case
LEG 030	Legal Services	03/04/13	JDS	B	NT	Review, revise joint status report. Conf. w/MGM re: same.	0.20	450.000	90.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services	03/04/13	MGM	B	NT	Phone conf. w/client re: affidavit; attempted to fax joint status report draft to Arthur Fite (3) times; review and respond to email from Jessica Horn, Arthur Fite's legal assistant, re: joint status report; gave JDS a copy of joint status report to review; review email from client re: affidavit; made changes to affidavit and emailed back to client to sign; phone conf. w/client re: changes to affidavit; make JDS' revisions to joint status report; make opposing counsel's changes to joint status report. efiled same.	1.10	225.000	247.50	unrelated & clerical
LEG 030	Legal Services	03/05/13	MGM	B	NT	Review and respond to email from client re: signed affidavit.	0.10	225.000	22.50	unrelated
LEG 030	Legal Services	03/08/13	MGM	B	NT	Review, download to client's efile and print out document 14, joint status report.	0.10	225.000	22.50	clerical
LEG 030	Legal Services	03/11/13	MGM	B	NT	Saved signed copy of client's affidavit to client's efile.	0.10	225.000	22.50	clerical

John D. Saxon, P.C.
 BILLING WORKSHEETS
 SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
 BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE: 0003265			Ashley Leigh Maner							
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000			v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine			STANDARD				
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/20/13	JDS	B NT	Conf. w/MGM re: pre-trial conf. Review order setting same.	0.20	450.000	90.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/20/13	MGM	B NT	Save to client's efile and print and give to CAB to put deadlines on firm calendar; put deadlines on personal work calendar.	0.10	225.000	22.50	clerical
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/28/13	JDS	B NT	Call to, conf. w/, client re: bench trial of unemployment appeal on Monday.	0.30	450.000	135.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/29/13	JDS	B NT	Review file. Call to, left voicemail for, Arthur Fite.	0.20	450.000	90.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/30/13	JDS	B NT	Call from, conf. w/, client re: upcoming trial. Review file. Call to, conf. w/, client re: contacting certain possible witnesses.	1.10	450.000	495.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	03/31/13	JDS	B NT	Call to, left voicemail for, William Crosby (or Crosby Price). Review, organize file. Select, copy exhibits. Call to, conf. w/, client re: trial proceedings. Prepare trial notebook. Review, highlight exhibits. Prepare for trial generally.	2.50	450.000	1125.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/01/13	JDS	B NT	Travel to Anniston for unemployment compensation trial. Conf. w/Judge, Court personnel, opposing counsel re: employer representative unavailable for trial, need to reschedule. Travel to Arthur Fite's office. Conf. w/Fite, Don Harrison, MGM re: scheduling hearing/trial. Call to, conf. w/, client re: same. Return travel.	3.50	450.000	1575.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/01/13	JDS	B NT	Review order of 04/13.	0.10	450.000	45.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/01/13	MGM	B NT	Travel to Anniston w/JDS to attend client's unemployment trial which ended up getting rescheduled; went to opposing counsel, Arthur Fite's office to check calendars to agree on a new date for the trial; return travel to Birmingham; review, print and give to CAB to calendar the order rescheduling unemployment trial for May 23, 2013; save same to client's efile; calendar new date on my personal work calendar; phone conf. w/client re: drafting pre-trial order.	3.70	225.000	832.50	unrelated No order in this case that date
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/02/13	MGM	B NT	Organized client's unemployment file folder to figure out the date of the hearing that I need to request transcript from; phone conf. w/Hearing & Appeals division of AL Dept. of Labor to request transcript of hearing from 12/6/10; draft letter requesting written copy of transcript; scan signed copy of letter to ALDL requesting transcript; print out order setting pre-trial conf. and scheduling order for hard file; revised letter to ALDL; prepared label and mailed letter; review order setting pre-trial order; draft joint proposed pre-trial order; legal research on Title VII pregnancy discrimination for disparate treatment and retaliation claims; email the draft of proposed pre-trial order to Arthur Fite, opposing counsel.	4.70	225.000	1057.50	unrelated, clerical, inuff. data
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/03/13	MGM	B NT	Filed documents in file.	0.10	225.000	22.50	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/03/13	MGM	B NT	Save to client's efile signed letter to finance dept. requesting written transcript of unemploymet hearing; review and respond to email from Arthur Fite, opposing counsel, re: proposed pretrial order draft.	0.10	225.000	22.50	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/04/13	JDS	B NT	Review, revise draft pre-trial order. Confs. w/MGM re: same.	0.20	450.000	90.00	clerical unrelated & clerical & inuff. data

John D. Saxon, P.C.
BILLING WORKSHEETS

SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPL	T	X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
-------	------	-------------	------	------	---	---	---------	-------	------	------------	-------------

CLIENT CODE: 0003265
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000

Ashley Leigh Maner
v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine

STANDARD

LEG	030	Legal Services	04/04/13	JDS	B	NT	Call from, conf. w/, MGM re: draft PTO.	0.10	450.000	45.00	45.00	<i>Duplicative</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/04/13	MGM	B	NT	Phone conf. w/Arthur Fite, opposing counsel, re: proposed pre-trial order; review and respond to email from Jessica Horn, Fite's assistant, re: proposed pre-trial order; review and respond to J. Horn's email re: same; print out pre-trial order to give to JDS for review; enter JDS' revisins to order and email to Horn; phone conf. w/Fite to see if he could look at the draft; call to JDS to discuss the email to Judge Hopkins explaining why we will email it to her in the morning; sent email to Judge Hopkins explaining that we will email the proposed order to her in the morning	1.30	225.000	292.50	292.50	<i>Some clerical w/uff. Detail to determine time properly chargeable</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/05/13	MGM	B	NT	Review voicemail from A. Fite; call to, left message for, same; sent proposed pre-trial order to Judge Hopkins via email.	0.20	225.000	45.00	45.00	<i>Some clerical w/uff. Detail clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/11/13	JDS	B	NT	Review email from Kim Clark re: pre-trial conf. for today is cancelled. Review voicemail from Ms. Clark.	0.10	450.000	45.00	45.00	<i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/11/13	JDS	B	NT	Review email from Kim Clark re: dates for pre-trial conf. Review reply from Jessica Horn, review calendar, reply to same. Review reply from Hom.	0.20	450.000	90.00	90.00	<i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/11/13	MGM	B	NT	Review email from Kim Clark re: cancelling pre-trial conf. today due to bad weather; conf. w/CAB re: new dates for same; review email from JDS re: same; review email from Clark re: same; review email from Jessica Horn, assistant to Arthur Fite, re: same	0.20	225.000	45.00	45.00	<i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/12/13	JDS	B	NT	Review e-notice of setting of pre-trial conf. Review email from CAB re: call from Kim Clark, Judge Hopkins' courtroom deputy; call to, conf. w/, Clark. Review email from CAB re: call from Ms. Clark.	0.40	450.000	180.00	180.00	<i>Some clerical for updates & duplicative</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/12/13	MGM	B	NT	Filed RPPM in pleadings hard folder; saved notice cancelling yesterday's pre-trial conf.; review email from CAB re: rescheduling pre-trial conf.	0.10	225.000	22.50	22.50	<i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/15/13	JDS	B	NT	Review notice of pre-trial conference.	0.10	450.000	45.00	45.00	<i>Duplicate entry</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/15/13	JDS	B	NT	Review notice of setting of pre-trial conference.	0.10	450.000	45.00	45.00	<i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/15/13	MGM	B	NT	Review, save to client's efile and printed out for CAB to calendar, notice rescheduling pre-trial conf.; calendar date for pre-trial conf. on my personal work calendar.	0.10	225.000	22.50	22.50	<i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/17/13	JDS	B	NT	Review, highlight transcript of unemployment hearing.	0.40	450.000	180.00	180.00	<i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/26/13	JDS	B	NT	Review draft proposed pre-trial, prepare for pre-trial conference. Travel to Anniston. Attend pre-trial conference w/MGM, Judge Hopkins, opposing counsel. Return travel.	4.40	450.000	1980.00	1980.00	<i>Pretrial filed prior travel</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/26/13	MGM	B	NT	Print out pre-trial order for conference; attend pre-trial in Anniston w/JDS, Judge Hopkins.	4.30	225.000	967.50	967.50	<i>Some P also duplicative</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	04/29/13	JDS	B	NT	Review minute entry for pre-trial conference. Review e-notice setting trial for 07/22/13. Review pre-trial order; review email from Kim Clark, Judge Hopkins' courtroom deputy, re: need to change trial setting from 07/22. Review reply from Jessica Horn on behalf of opposing counsel. Conf.	0.60	450.000	270.00	270.00	<i>mostly clerical; w/uff. detail</i>

John D. Saxon, P.C.
 BILLING WORKSHEETS
 SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
 BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	B T X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE:	0003265	Ashley Leigh Maner								
ENGAGEMENT CODE:	0000	v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine				STANDARD				
LEG 030	Legal Services		04/29/13	JDS	B NT	(CONTINUED)				
						w/MGM re: dates. Reply to same. Review revised e-notice of trial setting.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		04/29/13	MGM	B NT		1.10	225.000	247.50	clerical
						Save and print for client's files document 16, pretrial order; review pretrial order and calendar deadlines on personal work calendar and give to CAB to put on firm calendar; review, save and print order setting preliminary charge conference; conf. w/JDS re: resetting trial date; review email from Kim Clark w/Judge Hopkins' chambers re: re-setting trial date; review email from Jessica Horn re: same; downloaded document 17, notice of hearing to client's files; changed date of preliminary charge conf. and trial date on personal work calendar according to notice of hearing.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		04/30/13	JDS	B NT	Review notice of hearing.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		05/10/13	JDS	B NT		0.10	450.000	45.00	unrelated
						Review voicemail from client re: status.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		05/16/13	JDS	B NT		0.10	450.000	45.00	unrelated
						Conf. w/MGM re: upcoming unemployment trial.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		05/21/13	JDS	B NT		0.20	450.000	90.00	unrelated
						Call from, conf. w/, Alysonne Hatfield w/State DIR re: need to continue unemployment trial. Review email from Hatfield re: possible new trial dates, reply to same.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		05/22/13	JDS	B NT		0.30	450.000	135.00	unrelated
						Review email from Alysonne Hatfield re: trial date. Reply to Hatfield re: same. Review reply from Hatfield, reply to same. Review order of 5/22/13.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		06/02/13	JDS	B NT		0.60	450.000	270.00	unrelated
						Work on voir dire, themes for trial.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		06/03/13	JDS	B NT	Review order of 6/3/13.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		06/05/13	MGM	B NT		0.10	225.000	22.50	clerical
						Calendar new date of preliminary charge conference on my personal work calendar.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		06/24/13	JDS	B NT		0.10	450.000	45.00	clerical
						Review email from Kim Clark, Judge Hopkins' courtroom deputy, re: exhibits, labels.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		06/24/13	MGM	B NT		0.20	225.000	45.00	clerical
						Checked on pre-trial deadlines since trial date was moved; review, save and print for client's files document 18, defendant's pre-trial disclosures.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		06/25/13	MGM	B NT	Phone conf. w/Arthur Fite, opposing counsel, re: whether we received their pre-trial disclosures.	0.10	225.000	22.50	
LEG 030	Legal Services		06/27/13	JDS	B NT		0.10	450.000	45.00	clerical
						Review email from Kim Clark re: trial exhibits.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		07/01/13	JDS	B NT	Conf. w/MGM re: trial exhibits, witnesses. Review, revise witness, exhibit lists. Review EEOC file to select exhibits.	0.60	450.000	270.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		07/01/13	JDS	B NT		0.10	450.000	45.00	duplicate
						Review email from MGM re: witness, exhibit lists.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		07/01/13	MGM	B NT	Draft witness and exhibit lists and email to JDS; enter JDS' revisions to same and e-file same.	1.10	225.000	247.50	
LEG 030	Legal Services		07/08/13	MGM	B NT	Review email from Jessica Horn re: witness list.	0.10	225.000	22.50	
LEG 030	Legal Services		07/11/13	MGM	B NT	Phone conf. w/client re: new witness that contacted her who is willing to testify (Amanda Bereksazi). Ms. Bereksazi worked at Fuji Japanese Cuisine approx. 10 years ago and was fired when she became pregnant.	0.20	225.000	45.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		07/12/13	JDS	B NT		0.10	450.000	45.00	clerical
						Review email from Kim Clark, courtroom deputy, re: proposed jury instructions, verdict form.				

BILLING WORKSHEETS
SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T	X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE: 0003265		Ashley Leigh Maner									
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000		v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine				STANDARD					
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/12/13	JDS	B	NT	Review plaintiff's supplemental witness list. Conf. w/MGM re: same.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/12/13	MGM	B	NT	Conf. w/JDS re: amended witness list; draft supplemental witness list; phone conf. w/client re: contact information for her grandmother and boyfriend; efiled supplemental witness list on CM-ECF.	1.70	225.000	382.50	
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/16/13	MGM	B	NT	Saved to client's files and print out for review Judge Hopkins' proposed jury instructions and proposed verdict form.	0.10	225.000	22.50	<i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/18/13	MGM	B	NT	Call to Amanda Berkeksazi, a witness, re: her availability to testify in client's upcoming trials this month, I spoke w/Amanda's grandmother, who told me to call back @ 2:30 or 4:30 when Amanda returns from work; phone conf. w/Carl Hairrell, client's fiance and potential witness, re: his availability to testify in the upcoming trials this month; call to, no answer/no voicemail to, Linda French, client's grandmother, re: her availability to testify at client's upcoming trials; phone conf. w/client's grandmother re: her availability to testify at client's upcoming trials; phone conf. w/Amanda Berkeksazi re: her availability to testify at plaintiff's upcoming trials; phone conf. w/JDS re: scheduling of witnesses at trial.	1.10	225.000	247.50	<i>which trial? unemployment on this case?</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/22/13	JDS	B	NT	Review order changing time of hearing/pre-trial conf.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/22/13	MGM	B	NT	Phone conf. w/client re: what time her grandmother, fiance, and she should be at court on Thursday; conf. w/JDS about what time we can expect to call client's fiance as a witness on Thursday.	0.20	225.000	45.00	<i>unrelated case/wisuff detail to determine</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/23/13	JDS	B	NT	Review, analyze Judge's proposed jury charges, special interrogatories. Review pre-trial order. Review, or organize file. Travel to federal courthouse. Attend preliminary charge conf. w/opposing counsel re: settlement. Return travel.	2.80	450.000	1260.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/23/13	JDS	B	NT	Review confirmation of court reporter for unemployment appeal trial.	0.10	450.000	45.00	<i>clerical or unrelated dupli work</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/23/13	MGM	B	NT	Save to client's efile notice changing time of preliminary charge conference; print out 2 copies of pre-trial order for the conference today; review same; print out email from Kim Clark, Judge Hopkins' assistant, re: trial exhibits; print out attached exhibit form for trial; printed out missing pleadings for hard file; gave JDS special verdict and jury instructions for review; call to Judge Hopkins' chambers about the location of this afternoon's charge conference; email JDS to let him know conference is in Birmingham and not Anniston; attended preliminary charge conference; drafted questions to take witness, Linda French, on Thursday at the unemployment hearing.	4.60	225.000	1035.00	<i>clerical wisuff. data as to properly chargeable amount of time</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/24/13	JDS	B	NT	Conf. w/MGM re: witnesses for upcoming trial, questions to ask them, witness order.	0.50	450.000	225.00	<i>which trial?</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/24/13	JDS	B	NT	Call to, conf. w/, Ashley's grandmother re: testimony. Call to, conf. w/, client re: her testimony, legal issues, settlement.	0.80	450.000	360.00	<i>which trial?</i>

John D. Saxon P.C.
BILLING WORKSHEETS

SORTED BY CLIENT CODE

BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T	X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE: 0003265		Ashley Leigh Maner									
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000		v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine				STANDARD					
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/24/13	JDS	B	NT	Review file, exhibits, prepare for unemployment appeal trial.	1.80	450.000	810.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/24/13	JDS	B	NT	Review notice of minute entry of proceedings before Judge Hopkins (preliminary charge conf.).	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/24/13	MGM	B	NT	Call to witness, Amanda Bereksazi, re: time to appear in court tomorrow, spoke w/a male in the household who told me Amanda would call me back on my cell phone; call to, no answer/no voicemail, Linda French, client's grandmother, re: her testimony for client's unemployment trial tomorrow; phone conf. w/Ms. French re: her testimony for tomorrow; conf. w/JDS re: unemployment trial.	0.90	225.000	202.50	unrelated Trial of this case started 7/29/13
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/25/13	JDS	B	NT	Travel to Anniston. Conf. w/client, grandmother. Attend, participate in State court unemployment trial. Conf. w/Arthur Fite re: settlement. Conf. w/client, grandmother, fiance re: trial, strategy, direct examination, settlement. Return travel. Call to, conf. w/ client.	6.60	450.000	2970.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/25/13	JDS	B	NT	Prepare, dictate plaintiff's voir dire questions	2.80	450.000	1260.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/25/13	MGM	B	NT	Phone conf. w/JDS re: Linda French's testimony in client's unemployment trial today.	0.10	225.000	22.50	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/26/13	JDS	B	NT	Conf. w/MGM re: witnesses, exhibits for use with each, background research on defendant's witnesses.	0.30	450.000	225.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/26/13	JDS	B	NT	Review voicemail from Molly Turner w/Judge Thomason. Return call to, left voicemail for, Ms. Turner.	0.10	450.000	45.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/26/13	JDS	B	NT	Review email from Tammy Ford enclosing trial transcript. Conf. w/MGM re: missing exhibit #3. Review email from MGM to Ford re: same. Review defendant's proposed voir dire. Begin work on trial notebook. Call to, left voicemail for, Molly Turner.	0.50	450.000	225.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/26/13	JDS	B	NT	Review, revise draft proposed order for Judge Thomason. Conf. w/MGM re: same.	0.30	450.000	135.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/26/13	JDS	B	NT	Conf. w/CAB re: voir dire questions re: women working outside home, unwed mothers. Review, revise plaintiff's voir dire questions. Call to, conf. w/ client, Begin general trial preparation. Prepare trial notebook. Prepare to-do list. Work on strategy. Copy pleadings for trial notebook. Work on concept of ideal juror. Review People Finder information for defendant's witnesses. Gather trial materials, resource books.	4.80	450.000	2160.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/26/13	MGM	B	NT	Conf. w/JDS about next week's trial and the unemployment trial yesterday; conf. w/JDS about proposed order for Judge Thomason re: unemployment trial; email Tammy Ford, court reporter, re: emailing us exhibit 3, Fuji Japanese Cuisine's employment handbook; review email from Ford and printed out exhibit 3 for JDS; draft proposed order for unemployment trial and give to JDS for review; enter, print out questions I drafted for Linda Ward's testimony and give to JDS; conducted PeopleMap reports on Jennifer Lin and William Crosby Price.	2.40	225.000	540.00	duplicate; some unrel'd insert. Detail to determine related unrel'd
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/27/13	JDS	B	NT	Review, highlight pleadings. Review pre-trial order. Review unemployment hearing transcript,	5.20	450.000	2340.00	

John D. Saxon, P.C.
 BILLING WORKSHEETS
 SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
 BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE: 0003265		Ashley Leigh Mancr								
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000		v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine				STANDARD				
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/27/13	JDS	B NT	(CONTINUED) highlight same. Organize, review file. Work on, analyze evidentiary, legal issues. Review EEOC file. Select, copy rebuttal exhibits.				
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/28/13	JDS	B NT	Prepare general/blind cross examination; determine witnesses, witness order. Analyze legal issues. Copy exhibits, assemble exhibit books. Prepare direct examination of Crosby Price. Call to, conf. w/, client (2x). Call from, conf. w/, client. Conf. w/MGM re: duties to delegate to her. Review, revise supplemental exhibit list. Review, revise master exhibit list on Court form. Review, revise questions for Lynda Ward. Conf. w/MGM re: same. Review public documents re: Jennifer Lin, Crosby Price. Review, rehearse voir dire. Outline, rehearse opening statement. Select, copy rebuttal exhibits.	10.50	450.000	4725.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/28/13	MGM	B NT	Conf. w/JDS re: tasks for trial; drafted, proofread, and printed out plaintiff's supplemental exhibit list and gave draft to JDS for review; entered JDS' revisions; phone conf. w/Amanda Berekhazi re: testifying on Tuesday at 9:00 a.m. for client's trial; legal research re: using a pre-trial order to impeach a witness; searched for, saved to client's efile and printed out Lin divorce documents.	4.10 3.00	225.000	922.50	Some clerical
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/29/13	JDS	B NT	Travel to Anniston. Confs. w/client. Attend day one of trial (voir dire, opening statement, direct examination of Sebastian Lin). Conf. w/client. Return travel.	11.10 9.0	450.000	4995.00	Reduced for travel; hotel in Anniston @ 90 - 110/night
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/29/13	JDS	B NT	Call from, conf. w/, client re: direct examination, damages. Further work on examination of Sebastian Lin. Work on direct examination of Amanda Berekhazi. Review, select, copy rebuttal/impeachment exhibits. Review emails from MGM re: her conversation w/Berekhazi. Revise direct examination of Berekhazi.	2.60	450.000	1170.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/29/13	MGM	B NT	Travel to Anniston w/JDS to attend trial as co-counsel in client's Title VII case; return travel. Email JDS (2x) re: whether Amanda Berekhazi will be available to testify as a witness for plaintiff; call to Berekhazi re: her availability to testify tomorrow.	13.20 13.00	225.000	3420.00	Reduced for travel; hotel in Anniston
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/30/13	JDS	B NT	Travel to Anniston. Confs. w/MGM re: legal issues. Attend day 2 of trial. Return travel. Legal research on topics addressed by Court; confs. w/MGM re: same. Letter brief to Judge Hopkins. Outline notes to distinguish defendant's cases. Outline, rehearse closing argument.	16.20 14.00	450.000	7290.00	Reduced for travel
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/30/13	JDS	B NT	Review notice of minute entry for pre-trial matters on 7/29/13. Review minute entry for day 1 of trial. Review email from Freeman Fite to Court re: cases he found on point to Court's legal inquiry on remoteness of "me,too" evidence.	0.20	450.000	90.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/30/13	MGM	B NT	Travel to Anniston w/JDS to attend trial as co-counsel; return travel. Conf. w/JDS re: research assignment Judge Hopkins gave us regarding evidentiary issues concerning Amanda Berekhazi's testimony; drafted and emailed to Judge Hopkins' chambers a memo regarding same.	14.70 12.50	225.000	3307.50	Reduced for travel
LEG	030	Legal Services	07/31/13	JDS	B NT	Travel to Anniston to federal courthouse. Argue legal motions. Resume trial (day 3). Charge conf. w/Court. Conf. w/client. Travel to county	7.80 4.50	450.000	3510.00	Some of sm unrelated

John D. Saxon, P.C.
 BILLING WORKSHEETS
 SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
 BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T X	B T COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE: 0003265		Ashley Leigh Maner								
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000		v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine				STANDARD				
LEG 030	Legal Services		07/31/13	JDS	B NT	(CONTINUED) courthouse to deliver draft order in <u>unemployment appeal</u> . Return travel.	4.00	450.000	1800.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		07/31/13	JDS	B NT	Conf. w/MGM re: research, email to Judge Hopkins re: jury charge on employee handbooks, review same. Work on closing argument; outline, rehearse same.	0.60	450.000	270.00	<i>unrelated - cannot differentiate time for related</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services		07/31/13	JDS	B NT	Call to, left voicemail for, Molly Turner in Judge Thomason's chambers. Review minute entry for day 2 of trial. Review email from Kim Clark, courtroom deputy, re: final jury instructions from Court. Review same. Review, revise email from MGM to Court, opposing counsel, re: legal issues to be researched.	13.30	225.000	2992.50	<i>reduced for travel</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services		08/01/13	JDS	B NT	Travel to Anniston w/JDS to attend trial in client's Title VII case; attended trial as co-counsel in client's federal trial; return travel. Conf. w/JDS re: research assignment Judge Hopkins gave us regarding whether an employer has to follow its employment manual under Title VII; printed out the finalized jury instructions and special verdict form for JDS to review; drafted email to Judge Hopkins re: jury charge addition and emailed to chambers with case attached.	10.00	450.000	4500.00	<i>reduced for travel</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services		08/01/13	JDS	B NT	Travel to Anniston to federal courthouse. Deliver closing argument. Attend day 4 of trial. Await, receive jury verdict. Conf. w/client. Return travel.	0.20	450.000	90.00	<i>same unrelated insuff detail</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services		08/01/13	MGM	B NT	Review minute entry for proceedings in day 4 of trial. Review e-notice of jury verdict for plaintiff. Review order in <u>unemployment compensation hearing</u>.	9.80	225.000	2205.00	<i>reduced for travel</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services		08/02/13	MGM	B NT	Travel to Anniston w/JDS for federal trial in client's Title VII case; attend trial as co-counsel; return travel.	0.10	225.000	22.50	
LEG 030	Legal Services		08/05/13	JDS	B NT	Review email from JDS w/case law on issue of number of employees and statutory caps in Title VII cases.	0.40	450.000	180.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		08/05/13	JDS	B NT	Conf. w/MGM re: response to Court on issue of statutory caps. Review response by opposing counsel.	0.40	450.000	180.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		08/05/13	MGM	B NT	Review, revise response to Court on statutory caps. Review email from MGM to Court transmitting same.	2.50	225.000	562.50	
LEG 030	Legal Services		08/06/13	MGM	B NT	Review defendant's letter brief on Title VII statutory caps; review and forward to JDS opposing counsel's assistant, Jessica Horn's email w/letter brief attached; draft letter brief to Judge Hopkins and gave to JDS for review; enter JDS' revisions to letter brief and emailed to Judge Hopkins' chambers; conducted PeopleMap search on Hsien Chang Lin.	0.30	225.000	67.50	<i>clerical</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services		08/07/13	MGM	B NT	Saved and printed for client's files Linkan's notice re: statutory caps; phone conf. w/client re: whether Judge Hopkins had ruled on damages yet; saved and printed for client's files plaintiff's notice re: statutory caps.	0.20	225.000	45.00	<i>some clerical insuff. detail</i>
LEG 030	Legal Services		08/07/13	MGM	B NT	Review final judgment re: statutory caps document 33; printed same for JDS to review; saved to				

John D. Saxon, P.C.
 BILLING WORKSHEETS
 SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
 BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE: 0003265		Ashley Leigh Maner								
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000		v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine				STANDARD				
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/07/13	MGM	B NT	(CONTINUED) client's files; printed courtroom deputy's notes (sealed)(document 30); save and print to client's files jury instructions; email CAB w/deadline to submit attorneys fees.				
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/12/13	JDS	B NT	Review voicemail message from client re: final judgment.	0.10	450.000	45.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/13/13	JDS	B NT	Review email from MGM re: call from client re: final judgment. Call to, conf. w/, client re: entry of final judgment by Judge Hopkins. Conf. w/MGM re: same.	0.30	450.000	135.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/13/13	JDS	B NT	Organize file, trial notebooks/exhibit books upon completion of trial.	0.10	450.000	45.00	clerical
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/13/13	MGM	B NT	Review voicemail from client re: Judge's order re: jury verdict; email JDS re: jury verdict and statutory caps.	0.10	225.000	22.50	
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/16/13	JDS	B NT	Review voicemail from Arthur Fite. Return call to, conf. w/, Fite re: defendant's solvency, collectability of judgment.	0.30	450.000	135.00	related to collecting, not to winning
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/26/13	JDS	B NT	Review letter from Fronzena Webster re: payment of client's unemployment compensation after unemployment compensation appeal trial.	0.10	450.000	45.00	unrelated
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/27/13	JDS	B NT	Review defendant's motion to amend, alter, or vacate judgment.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/27/13	MGM	B NT	Review, save and print to client's files defendant's motion to alter judgment.	0.10	225.000	22.50	clerical
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/28/13	MGM	B NT	Review, save and print for client's files scheduling order re: defendant's motion to amend judgment.	0.10	225.000	22.50	clerical
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/30/13	JDS	B NT	Review email from MGM re: pleadings for review by affiants in support of fee petition. Email, forwarding same to Alicia Haynes. Conf. w/MGM re: same.	0.40	450.000	180.00	for petition not part of case in chief
LEG	030	Legal Services	08/30/13	MGM	B NT	Asked JDS about Maner request for attorney fees; looked at final judgment order which set deadline to submit request @ 09/06/13; review scheduling order re: defendant's motion to reduce judgment; call to Judge Hopkins' chambers re: when to file request for attorney fees; phone conf. w/Kim Clark, Judge Hopkins' assistant, re: deadline to file request for attorney fees; conf. w/JDS re: same.	0.50	225.000	112.50	same
LEG	030	Legal Services	09/05/13	JDS	B NT	Conf. w/MGM re: fee petition. Call to, left messages for, Alicia Haynes re: fee petition affidavit. Call from, conf. w/, Haynes re: same. Review, revise draft petition, affidavit. Pull supporting fee/hourly rate information.	1.80	450.000	810.00	same
LEG	030	Legal Services	09/05/13	MGM	B NT	Conf. w/JDS re: request for attorneys fees due tomorrow; reviewed Mitzi Gattis' file to see what we need to file w/attorney fee request; drafted attorney fee petition, fee breakdown per attorney, revised JDS' affidavit in support of Maner's petition for award of attorneys' fees and costs and gave all to JDS for review.	3.80	225.000	855.00	same
LEG	030	Legal Services	09/06/13	JDS	B NT	Review email from Mistie Smith re: Alicia Haynes' affidavit. Call from, conf. w/, Ms. Smith re: addition needed for Joe Hutchings' work on case. Review fee petition. Revise affidavit. Incorporate	2.40	450.000	1080.00	same

Case 1:12-cv-01088-VEH Document 46-1 Filed 12/05/13 Page 15 of 17
 JOHN D. SAXON, P.C.
 BILLING WORKSHEETS
 SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
 BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	B T T X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE:	0003265	Ashley Leigh Maner								
ENGAGEMENT CODE:	0000	v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine				STANDARD				
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/06/13	JDS	B NT	(CONTINUED) footnote, exhibits re: unemployment compensation claim, appeal. Review, revise time records.				
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/06/13	JDS	B NT		0.80	450.000	360.00	same
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/06/13	JDS	B NT	Proofread, execute affidavit. Proof time and expenses. Confs. w/MGM, CAB re: individual attorney time summaries. Proof final fee petition product.	0.10	450.000	45.00	same/clinical
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/06/13	MGM	B NT	Review email from Mistie Smith w/revisions to Haynes affidavit.	2.00	225.000	450.00	same
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/06/13	MGM	B NT	Conf. w/JDS re: request for attorneys fees; review Gattis and Hall files to find a brief in support of plaintiff's motion for atty fees; review email from Alicia Haynes to JDS w/affidavit in support of plaintiff's motion for atty fees attached; entered JDS' revisions to same.	0.10	225.000	22.50	same/clinical
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/09/13	MGM	B NT	Print out and file in hard file plaintiff's petition for attorneys fees and exhibits A-C; filed original exhibits in hard file; saved same to client's efile.	0.10	450.000	45.00	clinical
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/12/13	MGM	B NT	Review defendant's motion to dismiss.	0.20	225.000	45.00	clinical
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/13/13	JDS	B NT	Review, save and print for client's files defendant's motion to dismiss; calendar deadline to respond to same; email CAB to put on firm calendar.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/13/13	MGM	B NT	Conf. w/MGM re: response to motion to alter, amend, vacate judgment.	4.20	225.000	945.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/16/13	JDS	B NT	Drafted response to defendant's motion to amend, alter or vacate judgment; review, save and print for client's files defendant's amendment to its MTD; legal research re: Rule 59(e).	0.60	450.000	270.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/16/13	MGM	B NT	Review, revise plaintiff's opposition to defendant's motion to alter, amend, vacate judgment.	5.70	225.000	1282.50	
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/17/13	MGM	B NT	Revise and proofread plaintiff's opposition to defendant's motion to alter, amend or vacate judgment; gave same to JDS for review; enter JDS' revisions; efile same via CM/ECF; legal research re: emotional distress and punitive damages under Title VII; save and print for client's files the following cases from Westlaw: U.S. EEOC v. W&O, Inc., Tucker v. Housing Authority of Birmingham; save and print for client's files document 40, plaintiff's opposition to defendant's motion to alter judgment.	0.10	225.000	22.50	clinical
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/25/13	MGM	B NT	Filed documents in hard file in the file room.	3.20	225.000	720.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/26/13	JDS	B NT	Drafted plaintiff's opposition to defendant's motion to dismiss.	0.10	450.000	45.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/26/13	JDS	B NT	Conf. w/MGM re: substance of our response to defendant's estoppel motion.	0.60	450.000	270.00	
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/26/13	JDS	B NT	Review, revise plaintiff's opposition to defendant's motion to add defense of collateral estoppel/res judicata.	0.10	450.000	45.00	clinical
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/26/13	MGM	B NT	Review email from client re: status.	6.10	225.000	1372.50	
LEG 030	Legal Services		09/26/13	MGM	B NT	Drafted plaintiff's opposition to defendant's motion for leave to add defenses and motion to dismiss; review and forward to JDS email from				

BILLING WORKSHEETS
SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG W.C. DESCRIPTION DATE EMPLY T X COMMENT HOURS RATE WIP AMOUNT BILL AMOUNT

CLIENT CODE: 0003265 Ashley Leigh Maner
 ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000 v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine STANDARD

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T	X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
LEG	030	Legal Services	09/26/13	MGM	B	NT	(CONTINUED) client re: status of case; gave draft of plaintiff's opposition to defendant's MTD to JDS for review; entered JDS' revisions to same and filed via CM-ECF.				
LEG	030	Legal Services	10/01/13	MGM	B	NT	Review, save and print for client's files defendant's reply to MTD and 2 exhibits; call from client re: status of case.	0.30	225.000	67.50	67.50 <i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	10/10/13	JDS	B	NT	Review, revise draft settlement sheet. Conf. w/DVB re: same. Letter to client enclosing unemployment proceeds.	0.20	450.000	90.00	90.00 <i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	10/20/13	JDS	B	NT	Review signed settlement sheet for unemployment compensation proceeds.	0.10	450.000	45.00	45.00 <i>unrelated</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	10/23/13	MGM	B	NT	Review, save and print for client's files defendant's opposition to plaintiff's petition for attorneys' fees.	0.10	225.000	22.50	22.50 <i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	11/21/13	JDS	B	NT	Review order of 11/21/13 re: resetting deadlines.	0.10	450.000	45.00	45.00 <i>clerical</i>
LEG	030	Legal Services	11/21/13	MGM	B	NT	Review, save and print for JDS Judge Hopkins' memorandum order and opinion, document 44, denying defendant's post judgment motions, scheduling order issued by Court re: plaintiff's filing a supplemental fee petition, document 4, and two subsequent notices re: same scheduling order.	0.20	225.000	45.00	45.00 <i>clerical</i>

CATEGORY LEG Legal Services TOTALS:

272.90 90187.50

ENGAGEMENT 0000 FEE TOTALS:

272.90 90187.50

EXP	CPY	Copies	10/14/10	OFC	E	NT	Copies				0.75
EXP	CPY	Copies	03/31/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				18.25
EXP	CPY	Copies	05/21/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				1.25
EXP	CPY	Copies	07/01/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				1.50
EXP	CPY	Copies	07/26/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				13.50
EXP	CPY	Copies	07/26/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				41.00
EXP	CPY	Copies	07/28/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				65.00
EXP	CPY	Copies	07/29/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				5.00
EXP	CPY	Copies	07/30/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				16.00
EXP	CPY	Copies	07/31/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				5.50
EXP	CPY	Copies	08/01/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				1.00
EXP	CPY	Copies	09/06/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				3.50
EXP	CPY	Copies	10/01/13	OFC	E	NT	Copies				1.00
EXP	CTR	Court Reporter	04/02/13	MGM	E	NT	Fee for written copy of hearing transcript (At Dept. of Labor c/o Finance Dept.)				75.00
EXP	CTR	Court Reporter	07/29/13	MGM	E	NT	Ashley Maner v. Linkan, LLC AL DIR transcript (Tamera Ford, official court reporter to Judge John C. Thomason).				546.00
EXP	CTR	Court Reporter	07/30/13	JDS	E	NT	Unemployment trial/half day per diem (Freedom Court Reporting)				150.00
EXP	FAX	Fax Transmittal	01/20/11	OFC	E	NT	Fax Transmittal				1.25
EXP	FAX	Fax Transmittal	05/02/11	OFC	E	NT	Fax Transmittal				2.50
EXP	FAX	Fax Transmittal	06/18/12	OFC	E	NT	Fax Transmittal				1.25
EXP	FEX	Federal Express	02/22/11	JAH	E	NT	Federal Express to Ted Hooks, clerk/Calhoun Co. Circuit Court.				41.78
EXP	FIL	Filing Fee	02/22/11	JAH	E	NT	Filing fee w/jury demand (Calhoun Co. Circuit clerk)				366.00
EXP	FIL	Filing Fee	04/09/12	MGM	E	NT	Filing fee for Complaint (Sharon Harris, clerk).				350.00
EXP	MIL	Mileage	04/01/13	JDS	E	NT	Mileage/travel to Anniston to attend unemployment appeal trial.				63.63

} All OK

} unrelated

appears unrelated based on date & services related to that date

insuff. detail - which case?

Case 1:12-cv-01088-VEH Document 46-1 Filed 12/05/13 Page 17 of 17
John D. Saxon, P.C.
BILLING WORKSHEETS
SORTED BY CLIENT CODE
BILL THRU DATE: 12/31/99

CATEG	W.C.	DESCRIPTION	DATE	EMPLY	T X	COMMENT	HOURS	RATE	WIP AMOUNT	BILL AMOUNT
CLIENT CODE: 0003265		Ashley Leigh Maner								
ENGAGEMENT CODE: 0000		v. Fuji Japanese Cuisine				STANDARD				
EXP	MIL	Mileage	04/26/13	JDS	E NT	Mileage/travel to Anniston to attend pre-trial conference w/MGM.			68.68	
EXP	MIL	Mileage	07/25/13	JDS	E NT	Mileage/travel to Anniston to attend state unemployment appeal trial.			74.58	<i>unrelated</i>
EXP	MIL	Mileage	07/29/13	JDS	E NT	Mileage/travel to Anniston to attend trial (day 1).			78.48	
EXP	MIL	Mileage	07/30/13	JDS	E NT	Mileage/travel to Anniston to attend trial (day 2).			78.48	
EXP	MIL	Mileage	07/31/13	JDS	E NT	Mileage/travel to Anniston to attend trial (day 3).			80.23	
EXP	MIL	Mileage	08/01/13	JDS	E NT	Mileage/travel to Anniston to attend trial (day 4).			75.71	
EXP	MTE	Meals Expense	04/01/13	JDS	E NT	Meals Expense re: attend unemployment appeal trial in Anniston.			2.75	<i>unrelated</i>
EXP	MTE	Meals Expense	04/26/13	JDS	E NT	Meals Expense re: attend pre-trial conf. in Anniston.			12.84	
EXP	MTE	Meals Expense	07/25/13	JDS	E NT	Meals Expense re: attend State unemployment appeal trial.			10.45	<i>unrelated</i>
EXP	MTE	Meals Expense	07/31/13	JDS	E NT	Meals Expense re: attend trial in Anniston (day 3).			15.80	
EXP	MTE	Meals Expense	08/01/13	JDS	E NT	Meals Expense re: attend trial in Anniston (day 4).			17.53	
EXP	POS	Postage	10/14/10	OFC	E NT	Postage			0.44	
EXP	POS	Postage	01/20/12	OFC	E NT	Postage			0.44	
EXP	POS	Postage	05/23/12	OFC	E NT	Postage			6.85	
EXP	POS	Postage	04/02/13	OFC	E NT	Postage			0.46	
CATEGORY EXP Billable Expense TOTALS:									2262.38	
ENGAGEMENT 0000 EXPENSE TOTALS:									2262.38	
ENGAGEMENT 0000 TOTALS:							272.90		92449.88	
CLIENT 0003265 TOTALS:							272.90		92449.88	
REPORT TOTALS:							272.90		92449.88	

unrelated - this case filed April 10, 2012