

12. Attorney fees of ~~\$500.00~~ per hour for Partner's time spent, ~~\$300.00~~  
~~\$250.00~~ ~~\$150.00~~  
per hour for Associate attorney time spent and \$95.00 for paralegal/legal assistant

time spent are as follows:

<u>DATE</u>	<u>ACTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>FEE</u>	
9/6/12	Factual Research and Development	0.75	\$ <del>225.00</del>	Assoc. Atty
10/22/12	Claim Letter Issued	0.30	\$ 28.50	Para. - L. Assist.
10/26/12	Telephone call from Defendant	0.10	\$ 9.50	Para. - L. Assist.
11/7/12	Review letter of representation from attorney Brad Medaris, Esq.	0.10	\$ <del>50.00</del> 25.00	Partner
11/7/12	Mail demand letter to attorney	0.25	\$ 23.75	Para. - L. Assist.
11/9/12	Emails to/from attorney Medaris	0.10	\$ <del>50.00</del> 25.00	Partner
11/13/12	Exchange emails with attorney Medaris	0.20	\$ 19.00	Para. - L. Assist.
11/14/12	Email to attorney Medaris	0.10	\$ <del>50.00</del> 25.00	Partner

11/20/12	Telephone call and email to attorney Medaris	0.15	\$	<del>75.00</del> 37.50	Partner
11/28/12	Exchange emails with attorney Medaris	0.20	\$	<del>100.00</del> 50.00	Partner
12/03/12					
12/5/12	Telephone call to attorney Medaris	0.10	\$	9.50	Para. - L. Assist.
12/10/12	Exchange emails with attorney Medaris	0.20	\$	<del>100.00</del> 50.00	Partner
12/17/12					
12/17/12	Telephone call to attorney Medaris	0.10	\$	<del>50.00</del> 25.00	Partner
12/21/12	Review email from attorney Medaris	0.10	\$	<del>50.00</del> 25.00	Partner
1/4/13	Telephone call to attorney Medaris	0.10	\$	9.50	Para. - L. Assist.
1/9/13	Exchange emails with attorney Medaris	0.10	\$	<del>50.00</del> 25.00	Partner
1/10/13	Draft Complaint	0.60	\$	<del>180.00</del> 90.00	Assoc. Atty
1/10/13	Mailed & emailed draft complaint and letter to attorney Medaris	0.40	\$	38.00	Para. - L. Assist.
1/10/13	Review email from attorney Medaris	0.10	\$	<del>30.00</del> 15.00	Assoc. Atty
1/14/13	Review email from attorney Medaris	0.10	\$	<del>30.00</del> 15.00	Assoc. Atty
1/29/13	Telephone call to attorney Medaris	0.10	\$	9.50	Para. - L. Assist.
5/7/13	Further factual research	0.25	\$	<del>75.00</del> 37.50	Assoc. Atty
5/15/13 - 5/17/13	Draft Summons, finalize Complaint and other case initiating documents	0.75	\$	<del>225.00</del> 112.50	Assoc. Atty
5/17/13	Mailed case initiating documents to local counsel for filing	0.50	\$	47.50	Para. - L. Assist.
5/22/13	Review and reply to emails from local counsel's office re: case opening	0.50	\$	47.50	Para. - L. Assist.
5/22/13 - 5/28/13	Review orders issued by the court	0.40	\$	<del>120.00</del> 60.00	Assoc. Atty

6/14/13	Receipt & review of Order to Show Cause	0.10	\$	<del>30.00</del> <sup>15.00</sup>	Assoc. Atty
6/14/13	Draft Notice of Lawsuit & Waiver of Service	0.30	\$	<del>90.00</del> <sup>45.00</sup>	Assoc. Atty
6/14/13	Email Notice of Lawsuit & Waiver of Service to attorney Medaris	0.10	\$	9.50	Para. - L. Assist.
6/14/13	Email from attorney - he is not retained	0.10	\$	<del>30.00</del> <sup>15.00</sup>	Assoc. Atty
6/14/13	Email to attorney Medaris	0.10	\$	9.50	Para. - L. Assist.
6/17/13	Draft response to Order to Show Cause	0.50	\$	<del>150.00</del> <sup>15.00</sup>	Assoc. Atty
6/17/13	Send out for service of process as to Defendant Daniel Valencia	0.75	\$	71.25	Para. - L. Assist.
6/18/13	Draft Motion for Entry of Default Documents	0.50	\$	<del>150.00</del> <sup>75.00</sup>	Assoc. Atty
6/19/13	Filed Motion for Entry of Default and mailed courtesy copy to Judge Hopkins	<del>0.60</del> <sup>0.10</sup>	\$	<del>57.00</del> <sup>9.50</sup>	Para. - L. Assist.
6/24/13	Receipt and review of Entry of Default	0.10	\$	<del>30.00</del> <sup>15.00</sup>	Assoc. Atty
6/27/13	Follow up on service of process as to Defendant Daniel Valencia	0.20	\$	19.00	Para. - L. Assist.
6/27/13	Review service of process issues regarding Defendant Daniel Valencia	0.20	\$	<del>60.00</del> <sup>30.00</sup>	Assoc. Atty
7/2/13	Prepared Plaintiff's Affidavit and Memorandum of Law	1.00	\$	<del>300.00</del> <sup>150.00</sup>	Assoc. Atty
7/8/13	Review Summons Returned unexecuted	0.10	\$	<del>30.00</del> <sup>15.00</sup>	Assoc. Atty
7/10/13	Draft status report	0.50	\$	<del>150.00</del> <sup>75.00</sup>	Assoc. Atty
7/17/13	Filed and mailed status report	<del>0.25</del>	\$	<del>23.75</del>	Para. - L. Assist.
		0.10		9.50	

8/19/13 - 8/28/13	Follow up on service of process as to Defendant Daniel Valencia	0.30	\$	<del>90.00</del> 45.00	Assoc. Atty
9/9/13	Follow up on service of process as to Defendant Daniel Valencia	0.10	\$	<del>30.00</del> 15.00	Assoc. Atty
9/11/13	Draft Notice of Partial Dismissal as to Defendant Daniel Valencia & Status Report	0.50	\$	<del>150.00</del> 75.00	Assoc. Atty
9/12/13	File Notice of Partial Dismissal as to Defendant Daniel Valencia & Status Report	<del>0.30</del> 0.10	\$	<del>28.50</del> 9.50	Para. - L. Assist.
9/18/13	Review Pro Tanto Dismissal Order issued by the Court	<del>0.25</del> 0.10	\$	<del>75.00</del> 15.00	Assoc. Atty
9/19/13	Draft Motion for Default Judgment documents as to Defendant Taqueria Valencia, LLC	3.00	\$	<del>900.00</del> 450.00	Assoc. Atty
9/20/13	File Motion for Default Judgment as to Defendant Taqueria Valencia, LLC	<del>0.75</del> 0.10	\$	<del>71.25</del> 9.50	Para. - L. Assist.

	Hours	Fee		
Partner	1.15	<del>1.15</del>	\$	<del>575.00</del> 287.50
Assoc. Atty	10.35	<del>10.50</del>	\$	<del>3,150.00</del> 1552.50
Para. - L. Assist.	4.1	<del>5.60</del>	\$	<del>532.00</del> 389.50
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>15.6</b>	<b>16.10</b>	\$	<b><del>4,257.00</del> 2229.50</b>