

Date	Attorney/Staff	Description of Services Provided	Time	Amount	Total	Lexington's Objections	Court's Ruling (a blank entry indicates any objection was overruled)
10/21/2015	AH (ANNETTE HOGUE)	Online research regarding attorneys' fees	0.75	52.50			
		Total	0.75				
10/18/2012	DA (DEBI ADAMS)	Prepare memo to GEM re facts section to MSJ, pull excerpts from various transcripts;	2.10	147.00			
10/18/2012	DA (DEBI ADAMS)	Prep copies of documents for Judge's copy;	0.80	56.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	
10/18/2012	DA (DEBI ADAMS)	Print all cases cited in Lexington's 2nd motion for summary judgment for JJS;	0.60	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/Administrative activity.
10/20/2012	DA (DEBI ADAMS)	Print excerpts from Mintz and Pearson depo transcripts;	0.40	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/Administrative activity.
10/22/2012	DA (DEBI ADAMS)	Draft tables of content / authorities re Silverbell's resp to Lexington's 2nd MSJ;	1.20	84.00			
10/22/2012	DA (DEBI ADAMS)	Revise memo of P & A's; revise table of contents/authorities, finalize same; assist with e-filing same;	2.70	189.00			
10/22/2012	DA (DEBI ADAMS)	Begin prep of MSJ;	2.10	147.00			
10/23/2012	DA (DEBI ADAMS)	Download Plaintiff's notice of errata and motion for leave to replace incorrectly file motion for violation	0.30	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/Administrative activity.
10/23/2012	DA (DEBI ADAMS)	Draft reply opp to mtc of errata and motion for leave to replace incorrectly filed motion for violation of rule 11;	0.70	49.00			
10/23/2012	DA (DEBI ADAMS)	Finalize file and serve reply; opp to plaintiff notice of errated motion for leave to replace incorrect	0.40	28.00			
		Total	10.00				
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Initial review of complaint;	1.50	412.50			
10/23/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Telephone call with Client re response;	0.30	82.50			
10/23/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Research legal procedures regarding response in Federal Court;	1.50	412.50			

10/24/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Began research for Ariz law on bad faith regarding counter claim;	3.00	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
10/24/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Review Lexington's DR Comp and exhibits;	1.50	412.50			
10/31/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Begin to draft Answer and Counterclaim;	1.50	330.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Reduced by 20%. Related to Bad Faith in part.
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Research law re Az policy interpretation, specific policy terms such as underlying insurance,	3.00	825.00			
10/24/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Review and analyze applicable Ins Policies - Evanston and Lexington	1.25	343.75			
10/25/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Tel call to K Israel re Requirements for Answer and Counterclaim;	0.25	55.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Reduced by 20%. Related to Bad Faith in part.
10/25/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Research facts to answer.	3.00	825.00			
10/25/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Cont research law re Az policy interpretation, specific policy terms such as underlying insurance,	2.50	550.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Reduced by 20%. Related to Bad Faith in part.
10/26/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Locate and review Exhibits for Answer and CC.	2.50	550.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Reduced by 20%. Related to Bad Faith in part.
10/26/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Meeting with TAE re defending Scott Homes per request;	0.75	206.25		Defense of Scott Homes	
10/29/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Telephone call regarding defending Scoot Homes;	0.40	110.00		Defense of Scott Homes	
10/29/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Email Jim Holland re Scott Homes representation in DR case and filing of answer.	0.30	82.50		Defense of Scott Homes	
10/29/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Email Jim Holland re Scott Homes needs representation and must file answer.	0.30	82.50		Defense of Scott Homes	
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Tel call with Tom Cologna re Revised Fee Agreement; Tel Call with Peter Gerstman re agreement for Silverbell.	0.50	137.50			
10/30/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDDER)	Revise and finalize Answer, CC and exh for filing	2.20	484.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Reduced by 20%. Related to Bad Faith in part.

10/30/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conference with TAE regarding revisions;	0.50	137.50			
10/30/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Revised Fee Agreement;	0.40	110.00			
10/30/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Review Order re Rule 16 Sch conf;	0.40	110.00			
10/30/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email K Israel re Rule 16 Sch Conf.	0.25	68.75			
10/30/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conference with TAE;	0.02	55.00			
10/30/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Research FRCP req and Discovery deadlines for Fed Ct.; email K Israel with FRCP req., expert and dus req,	0.30	82.50			
10/30/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Review case law re Insurance policy Interpretation in Az;	0.80	220.00			
10/31/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft research memo	0.40	110.00			
10/31/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email KI re revised stip language to extend rule 16 sch conf.	0.40	110.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Review Scott Homes' Answer filed by Holland;	0.40	110.00		Defense of Scott Homes	
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email Jim Holland re Answer and Scott Homes cont. representation.	0.40	110.00		Defense of Scott Homes	
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email KI re Extension of time to file response to Lex Motion to Dismiss	0.30	82.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	EMail Opp. Counsel re Stip to Cont. Mtn to Dismiss	0.30	137.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft/Revise Stip to Cont. filing deadline for resp to Motion to Dismiss	0.80	220.00			
11/01/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Research applicable law and begin to draft resp to Lexington Mtn to Dismiss;	4.10	1,127.50			
11/01/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conf with TAE	0.25	68.75			

11/01/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	RS law applicable to Lexington's motion to dismiss and continued to draft resp to Lexington Mtn to Dismiss	5.20	1,430.00			
11/01/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Final draft resp to Lexington Mtn to Dismiss	4.00	1,100.00			
11/01/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Lex Reply to Mtn to Dismiss	0.60	165.00			
11/01/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Lex Policy terms	0.40	110.00			
11/02/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Tel call to Jim Holland re Jt Case Man Plan; Email KI re Conf call to discuss Joint Case Management plan.	0.25	68.75			
11/02/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email KI re Proposal for Case Man. Plan;	0.10	27.50			
11/05/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Research and calendar deadlines and review AZDC local rules	0.75	206.25			
11/08/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft SB Language for Joint Case Management Plan.	1.00	275.00			
11/08/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Tel call to Kelly Hedbery re Case Management Plan and conf call to discuss plan	0.50	137.50			
11/09/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Research Lexington lawsuits in other jurisdictions	0.50	137.50			
11/12/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC with KI re percip and expert witnesses needed and depositions wanted from Lexington	0.50	137.50			
11/13/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conf with TAE re Conf Call with all parties re Case Man. Plan.	0.50	137.50			
11/16/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conf call with all parties re Case Management Plan.	1.00	275.00			
11/19/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Case management Plan; Email KI and Email JH for comments for the Defendants proposed portionof	3.00	825.00			
11/26/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Finalize and send Case Man Plan to KI	1.00	275.00			

11/26/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Rule 26 disc statements;	1.20	330.00			
11/29/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Research law FRCP Rule 26 requirements.	1.20	330.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise Case Man Plan; email to KI	1.30	357.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review revised Case Man. Plan; email KI with comments	0.60	165.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise Case Man Plan; Send to KI for comments; email staff re edits to Case Man. Plan	1.00	275.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf call with Tom Cologna re docs for production in case;	0.25	68.75			
12/04/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review documents from client and produced in underlying action	1.40	385.00			
12/04/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Doc review for document production and identification in Fed case; Draft Memo re rule 26 disc statement;	1.80	495.00			
12/06/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont Doc review for production in this case; Revise Memo re rule 26 doc prod	1.80	495.00			
12/07/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email KI re attendance and requirement for Sch Conf	0.30	82.50			
12/11/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prepare for and Attend Sch Conf	3.50	962.50			
12/13/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE re Results from Sch Conf Hearing	0.30	82.50			
12/14/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Supp Disc Statement	0.40	110.00			
12/14/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Disc - Sp Rogs, Req for Prod Docs to Lexington	1.80	495.00			
12/17/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise discovery to Lex; Sp Rog and RPD	0.60	165.00			
12/17/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise discovery; email KI for comment	0.50	137.50			

12/17/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email S. Prater re expert retention; email ki re Az experts for bad faith claim	0.40	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
12/18/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC to S Prater re expert retention re coverage;	0.20	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
12/18/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft LTR to client re Prater retention and other needed experts	0.80	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
12/21/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Finalize and send LTR to client re Prater retention	0.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
12/21/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email client re Prater retainer	0.30	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
12/23/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conference re discovery plan;	0.75	206.25			
12/28/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft memo for JWE call with AI D re prop damage at Silverbell	0.80	220.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email client re conf call regarding case status and discovery plan;	0.30	82.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	email KI re memo re property damage	1.50	412.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email KI re questions and comments regarding Az ins law	0.30	82.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Status call with client reps re case status, needed experts and discovery plan	0.40	110.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Begin to draft LTR to client re Estimates for anticipated litigation costs	0.40	110.00			
01/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Cont. Drafting client ltr re expert costs; draft memo for file on same subject	0.70	192.50			
01/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Finalize and send LTR to client re expert cost est	0.60	165.00			
01/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email client re Experts retention approval needed	0.20	55.00			
01/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Disc Responses from Lexington re SB Rogs and RPD;	1.00	275.00			

01/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft LTR to Lex re lack of relevant docs produced.	0.60	180.00			
01/06/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Tel call to Tom Cologne re case status update re discovery, corp disc, and experts	0.30	82.50			
01/06/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Prater; revise Prater retainer LTR	1.30	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
01/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Fed Ct Admission; Tel Conf to Jalana Commerford re Az sponsor	0.50	137.50			
01/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Ct Order re Mtn to Dismiss filed by Lex.	0.40	110.00			
01/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re Lex policy provision and analysis	0.30	82.80			
01/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE re Lex policy provision and analysis	0.30	82.50			
01/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Meeting with Prater re initial case meeting to discuss docs and scope of services	2.00	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith .
01/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	RS case law re Coverage Trigger under Lex policy - exhaustion of Evanston policy.	1.00	275.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Resp to Lexington's Mtn to transfer re related cases	1.20	330.00			
01/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Memo to PBR re Coverage trigger case law RS	0.50	137.50			
01/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Resp to Lexington's mtn to transfer	2.70	742.50			
01/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email KI re Claims expert referral	0.30	82.50			
01/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize response to mtn to transfer; email KI	1.30	357.50			
01/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Lexington's Motion for Summary Judgment;	2.00	550.00			
01/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	RS applicable case law including law cited by Lexington;	2.00	550.00			

01/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft memo re Lexington's MSJ	0.50	137.50			
01/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email Smita M - lex counsel - re discovery responses	0.50	137.50			
01/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont drafting Memo regarding Lexington's MSJ; email Smita M re insufficient discovery responses- discovery dispute.	0.40	110.00			
01/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont. MSJ Case law RS and Memo regarding applicable law	4.80	1,320.00			
01/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Start to draft Silverbell Resp to Lexington's MSJ	1.00	275.00			
01/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email Eric Lynch re declaration from Evanston in support of response to MSJ;	0.30	82.50			
01/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email Jalana Commerford re decl for MSJ	0.30	82.50			
01/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email Prater re referral to claims exp	0.20	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
01/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont Draft P&A for Resp to Lex MSJ and Cross-MSJ	6.80	1,870.00			
01/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conf with TAE re Disc Dispute; review rogs responses	0.60	165.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont. drafting P&A for Opp to Lex MSJ and Cross-MSJ	2.30	632.50			
01/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Review Disc; RPD;	0.80	220.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Prep for call with Lex re disc disp	0.40	110.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Call with Lex re Disc Disp	0.50	137.50			
02/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont research law and Draft Mtn to Cont MSJ Resp Deadline per FRCP Rule 56d	0.80	220.00			
02/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont drafting Mtn to Cont Lex MSJ to do Disc - FRCP Rule 56d	5.00	1,375.00			

02/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont Draft mtn to Cont deadline for MSJ resp and decl; Email Smita M re cont of MSJ and stip;	4.90	1,347.50			
02/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Arcaid Ins Docs and Righi file for ins info	1.50	412.50			
02/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Peter Gerstman re information regarding Ins Broker and Decl for MSJ	0.30	82.50			
02/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	RS case law re duty to defend, breach of duty to defend, and related subjects.	1.00	275.00			
02/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email JH re Scott Answer	0.40	110.00		Defense of Scott Homes	
02/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Declarations for MSJ	2.50	687.50			
02/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Memo re Declarations for MSJ	0.50	137.50			
02/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Sep Statement of facts for Resp to Lex MSJ	0.50	137.50			
02/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Edit/Revise MSJ and decls	2.10	577.50			
02/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Smita M and KI re Cont MSJ Opp Deadline	0.30	82.50			
02/13/2008	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Eric Lynch re Modlin Decl in Resp to MSJ	0.50	137.50			
02/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Stip to cont proposed; draft memo to tae re stip	0.40	110.00			
02/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise Opp to MSJ; Revise Decls and email decls to witnesses	2.50	687.50			
02/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Rick Righi and Peter Gerstman Decl and email to them for approval	1.00	275.00			
02/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email KI re contact clerk	0.20	55.00			
02/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise MSJ with TAE edits;	2.00	550.00			

02/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email Eric Lynch and Peter Gerstman re status of declarations;	0.60	165.00			
02/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email KI drafts for review;	0.30	82.50			
02/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email Steve Prater re expert declaration for resp to Lex MSJ	0.30	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
02/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Revise Steve Robson's declaration and email for review and approval	0.50	137.50			
02/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Research and Draft Silverbell SSOF in response to Lex MSJ	2.40	660.00			
02/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Conflict Waiver re rep of Scott Homes; email Jim Holland re representation of Scott Homes in this case.	1.00	275.00		Defense of Scott Homes	
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Cont Drafting SSOF; revise decls; email Jalana Commerford, Rick Righi and Eric Lunch re the status	3.50	962.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Steve Prater's revised decl for MSJ Resp.	0.20	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Call Court Clerk re Rule 56 ruling	0.30	82.50			
03/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Proposed MSJ Stip; email Smita M - counsel for Lex	0.30	82.50			
03/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Tel call to Steve Pearson; email Steve Pearson re Modlin Declaration	0.30	82.50			
03/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Revise Decl for Steve Pearson; email for review and approval	0.50	137.50			
03/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Revise Opp; print for JWE; revise Stip to cont deadline; Draft Prop Order; file	1.80	495.00			
03/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	RS law re other insurance provision; draft research memo	2.80	770.00			
03/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Cont drafting memo re other insurance provision	0.50	137.50			
03/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email Steve Pearson re status of executed declarations	0.20	55.00			

03/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont. "Other Ins" case law RS	0.50	137.50			
03/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Get docs for JWE re Stewart Meeting and Claims expert retention	0.60	165.00			
03/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Tel call to Steve Pearson re revisions to declarations for MSJ resp.	0.30	82.50			
03/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Revise conflict and fee letter for rep of Scott Homes Legal research re same;	0.80	220.00		Defense of Scott Homes	
03/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft Reply to Rule 56d mtn; draft memo	1.70	467.50			
03/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Revise Response to Lex MSJ; get documents ready for filing; multiple emails and tel calls to Eric Lych and	4.30	1,182.50			
03/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Edit Resp to MSJ to make it 17 pages as per local rules	1.00	275.00			
03/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Edit/revise resp to Lex MSJ	1.00	275.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft SSOF; email Eric Lynch and Steve Pearson re Modlin decl; finalize docs for filing	5.30	1,457.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Review TAE rule 56d reply	0.30	82.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Finalize SSOF in resp to Lex MSJ; locate and organize exh; draft GEM decl in suport of resp to Lex MSJ	1.80	495.00			
04/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Finalize SSOF in resp to Lex MSJ; locate and organize exh; draft GEM decl in suport of resp to L.ex MSJ	1.50	412.50			
04/02/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Finalize Resp to Lex MSJ & Decl	1.20	330.00			
04/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email Smita M re discovery docs and need for call with court	0.20	55.00			
04/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft LTR to Smita re disc responses and dispute	0.40	110.00			
04/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conf with JWE re case status and discovery	0.40	110.00			

04/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Smita M response letter re discovery dispute; review Court's Order re denying Motion to Transfer	0.50	137.50			
04/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE and TAE re disc and depositions	1.00	275.00			
04/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft LTR to Smita re disc dispute; LTR to Court re MSJ Response.	1.00	275.00			
04/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Case law RS re Atty-client communication re coverage decision.	1.00	275.00			
04/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Disc; email counsel re discovery; draft Memo re discovery	1.20	330.00			
04/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Research Rutter Guide re Ins Law and potentially applicable exclusions	1.20	330.00			
04/10/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Smita M re Conf Call	0.30	82.50			
04/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Emails to client re expert retention - AI D.;	0.20	55.00			
04/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Letters to experts re FRCP req for expert reports	0.80	220.00			
04/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review and revise ltrs to experts re expert reports	0.30	82.50			
04/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Meeting with David F re file documents and expert reports	0.80	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages
04/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Memo re AI D as an expert for wood decay	0.30	82.50			
04/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re case status and TAE review of Az ins. law	0.60	165.00			
04/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Lex Discovery	0.50	137.50			
04/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Tel call to David F re Schedule expert meeting	0.10	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
04/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Smita re dicoverly;	0.20	55.00			

04/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review David F Exp Disc	1.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
04/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Meeting with DF re Exp Disc and report	2.80	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
04/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review law and Draft Mtn to Stike the affidavit of Smita M filed in support of Lex Reply to MSJ	1.30	357.50			
04/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Stip to Cont Expert disclosure	0.50	137.50			
04/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review applciable law re Mtn to Strike and Draft Mtn to Stike	1.00	275.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Revise Stip for Expert deadline; emai Smita M re stip for expert disc	1.00	275.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Exhaustion power point; draft research memo regarding exhaustion	0.50	137.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC to Prater re exhaustion opinions	0.40	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
05/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft status update LTR to client re status of exp retention	0.50	137.50			
05/06/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Revise and send LTR to clients re expert retention	0.50	137.50			
05/06/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Docs prod by Lex; Draft Index of docs prod by Lexington	2.90	797.50			
05/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft LTR to Smita M re depo dates and doc review	0.80	220.00			
05/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email clients re disc and docs; draft supp discovery	2.50	687.50			
05/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	RS law re Rip and tear coverage - Case law reseach memo	1.50	412.50			
05/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Meeting with JWE & TAE re discovery plan, depositions and expert assignments	2.00	550.00			
05/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft LTR to Smita M re Depo Ntc.	1.00	275.00			

05/10/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	LTR to Lexington re depositions	0.40	110.00			
05/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	TC with Al D re expert scope of testimony	0.70	192.50			
05/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	TC with KI re case stauts; LH scope of testimony	0.40	110.00			
05/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	TC LH re case status and scope of testimony;	0.50	137.50			
05/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Research - burden of proof on damages;	2.00	550.00			
05/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	RS case law re occurance definition and interpreation	0.75	206.25			
05/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft Depo Ntcs for Lexington's Witnesses - mintz, wills and hughes	0.80	220.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
05/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email Steve Prater and David F re Conf call for exp rpts	0.30	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
05/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email KI with Cost of Repair questions and thoughts	0.30	82.50			
05/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft Disc Response to Lexington's Rogs and RPD to Silverbell and RPD to Scott Homes	1.60	440.00			
05/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	TC to Tom Cologna re KI retainer	0.60	165.00			
05/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont. Draft Disc Response to Lexington's Rogs and RPD to Silverbell and RPD to Scott Homes	2.60	715.00			
05/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email Kelly Headberg and Smita re depos;	0.50	137.50			
05/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email KI re discovery status;	0.20	55.00			
05/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email client re depo avilability and prep	0.40	110.00			
05/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conf with JWE re client depo;	0.25	68.75			

	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Nautilus re revisions to cost of repair;	0.25	68.75			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Jacob McSweeny re Righi Depo	0.25	68.75			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Sub Settlement Agreements from State Court Action for release language and scope of releases	1.40	385.00			
06/02/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review David F Expert Rpt and Tel call with Fran re Expert Rpt and supporting docs	1.70	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
06/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE re disc and expert reports.	0.50	137.50			
06/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise Draft Depo Ntcs with docs	0.60	165.00			
06/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Call with Prater re expert report and scope	0.30	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
06/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize Depo Notices for Lexington's witnesses;	0.80	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
06/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to Lexington re Objections to depo ntcs/discovery	1.00	275.00			
06/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to Witnesses re depo prep	1.20	330.00			
06/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Prater Memo from call re summary of opinions	1.00	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
06/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Client re Conf call re witnesses and prep;	0.25	68.75			
06/06/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to Smita M and Kelly Headverg re deposition schedules.	0.25	68.75			
06/10/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize LTR to Dolores Cavasos and Chris Weity re depositions and representation at depo and prep;	0.80	220.00			
06/10/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Call with KI re Disc objections to Lexington	0.05	137.50			
06/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize and file/serve Def Depo Ntcs	1.50	412.50			

06/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Finalize discovery responses; call with client re disc responses approval and depo schedule	2.50	687.50			
06/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC with AL D re expert Rpt and wood decay opinions	0.40	110.00			
06/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email KI and Clients with Disc Status Report for review	0.60	165.00			
06/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email Clients re depositions, scheduling and prep	0.40	110.00			
06/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conf call with Counsel re depo schedule	1.00	275.00			
06/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Cont. Draft Disc to Lex - RFA, Rogs and RPD; Memo to TAE re Lex discovery	1.70	467.50			
06/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email Lex Counsel re Depos and Schedule	0.40	110.00			
06/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review draft expert report of Avelar;	3.00	825.00			
06/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review AD report; TC to AD; email regarding revisions; rain research;	1.20	330.00			
06/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC to LH; Email LH with comments regarding revisions; Review GS report; TC with YR; email YR comments	1.00	275.00			
06/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review DF rpt; TC to DF;	0.10	27.50			
06/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email revisions ; Letter to Prater re limited scope of report	0.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
06/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC to Menter re Lexington potential subp of docs from underlying case	0.40	110.00			
06/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review revised Prater Exp Rpt; draft expert disclosure statement and attached reports.	12.00	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
06/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Emails to experts re status of reports.	0.30	82.50			
06/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC to LH re status of Avelar report and report exhibits.	0.40	110.00			

06/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to EH re case status and disc deadlines and stip to continue expert and disc deadlines.	0.50	137.50			
06/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email EH re stip to continue expert and disc deadlines.	0.40	110.00			
06/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email to EH re depos notices and objections	0.40	110.00			
06/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Experts re status of final expert reports; emails to experts re final expert reports	1.30	357.50			
06/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	EMail to Kelly Headberg re sch depos	0.50	137.50			
06/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email KH re depos; email clients re depo dates;	1.00	275.00			
06/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Memo re new disc; RS law; TC with New counsel for Evanston	1.00	275.00			
06/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conference with TAE re insurance reports;	0.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
06/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email EH re Pro Hac Vice App; need for Errata	0.20	55.00			
06/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE and TAE re depos schedule and coverage	0.60	165.00			
06/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Daivd F re status of exp rept	0.30	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
06/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Final Expert Disclosure Statement	1.10	302.50			
06/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	RS for depo prep - ins bad faith claims; claims handling procedures and guidelines	1.30	286.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Reduced by 20%. Related to bad faith in part.
06/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont draft expert disclosure statement and organzie expert reports	0.50	137.50			
06/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Edit Ntc of Service for Expert Disclosure Statement	0.40	110.00			
06/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	MEmo re Call with Ct for discovery disputes; Review Ct Local Rules and procedures	0.50	137.50			

06/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Emails re depo sch	0.40	110.00			
06/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Find Wills sub; review prod doc req in subp.	0.60	165.00			
06/21/013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep; Call with Ct re Disc Disp; Conf with JWE/TAE	2.50	687.50			
06/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to EH re Disc resp	1.00	275.00			
06/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Lex Expt Rpt - Google	1.00	275.00			
06/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont Drafting Lex Disc LTR - meet and confer on SB disc. resp.	1.40	385.00			
06/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE and TAE re Lex Exp rpt	0.60	165.00			
06/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	RS law on covered damages, sub-carve out, resulted damages;; re-review exp rpt; draft memo	2.30	632.50			
06/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Amended 30b6 ntc; LTR to Lex re 30b6 depo; emails re depo sch	1.60	440.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
06/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email KI re Memo; email clients re depositions	0.30	82.50			
06/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize Disc LTR meet and confer on SB disc resp.	2.00	550.00			
06/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Righi Prod of Docs to LExington; Email Righi	1.00	275.00			
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Lexington's AI letters; Draft Memo AI coverage positions	1.00	275.00			
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email KH re depositions	0.40	110.00			
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE; locate LEX docs for corres to and from Chartis, Wills, maseros	1.30	357.50		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Lex Corres docs; Memo	2.00	550.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	

06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Mike Raymond re Depo and docs for Righi	0.50	137.50			
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	PACER RS for other Lexington cases; finalize ltr to EH re Disc	2.80	770.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review E&E docs for production supp	2.60	715.00			
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize and send disc LTR	0.40	110.00			
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Tom C re depo prep; draft email/memo to Tom C re notes from depo prep call	2.00	550.00			
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review TAE breif for disc dispute; make minor changes; email KI	1.30	357.50		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Call with client re docs and doc production	0.40	110.00			
06/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review E&E corresp for doc prod and pri log	2.00	550.00			
06/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review E&E corresp for doc prod and pri log for response to Lexington discovery requests.	3.40	935.00			
06/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email and TC to client re Privilege Log; email KI privilege log	0.70	192.50			
06/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Legal research re Mediation Privilege in subsequent Ins. coverage litigation; Conf with TAE re Research	0.90	247.50		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
06/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep and Call with E Harris re Disc dispute and depositions	1.60	440.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
06/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email to E Harris Re response to disc dispute	1.50	412.50		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
06/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re disc; Review client partnership docs for prod to Lex	1.50	412.50			
06/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to David F re Supp Exp Rpt and scope of work	0.80	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Mike Rayond re Conf call before depo of Evanston witnesses	0.40	110.00			

06/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Supp Disc Resp to Lexington - Rogs and RPD Set 1 - supplemental responses	2.30	632.50			
06/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont. Draft Supp Disc Resp to Lexington - Rogs and RPD Set 1 - supplemental responses	0.10	275.00			
06/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to EH re Subp	1.00	82.50			
06/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont. Draft Supp Disc to Lexington - Rogs and RPD Set 1 - supplemental responses; Finalize Pri Log	3.80	1,045.00			
06/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize Discovery and Privilege Log; LTR to EH re serving supplemental discovery reponses;	4.40	1,210.00			
06/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC and emails to EH and MR re Modlin depo scheduled and availability	0.50	137.50			
06/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	File Memo re depos to be taken and dates for depos	0.30	82.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Final Revisions Disc and Pri Log; TC to client re dicsovery	2.80	770.00			
06/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to EH re disc; email Lex re depo dates	0.40	110.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Final Revisions to Disc Responses and Pri Log	1.00	275.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC with Prater; Memo; RS Plitt background and legal work	1.50	330.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Reduced by 20%. Related to bad faith in part.
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Obj to Lex Depo Subject matters for its 30b6 depo ntcs.	1.50	412.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Amended Depo Ntcs; Memo to TAE	1.00	275.00			
07/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont. Draft Obj to Lex Depo Subject matters 30b6	1.00	275.00			
0701/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Trans of Disc Hearing for rulings	0.50	137.50			
07/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re damage depos and docs	0.50	137.50			

07/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft Amended Depo Ntc; memo to tae	1.00	275.00			
07/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Depo Prep for Paul Klamka; review Terrecon report and file materials	0.70	192.50			
07/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont. Depo prep Paul Klamka; review Terrecon report and file materials; draft outline; attend Depo of Klamka;	0.70	1,787.50			
07/02/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email M Raymond re document production by Evanston/M	1.50	82.50			
07/02/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Call and emails re Sch Depo prep with clients and experts	0.40	110.00			
07/02/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	LTR to Exp re sch expert depositions and depo prep; TC to Harris re deposition schedule; conf with	1.20	330.00			
07/02/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Emails to Peter Gerstman re possible depo; emails to Tom Cologna re depo prep	0.60	165.00			
07/02/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email to Mike Raymond re Evanston Doc Production and Mediation/Attorney Client Privielged Scott	0.70	192.50		Defense of Scott Homes	
07/02/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft Ntc of Service of Subp re Wills	0.50	137.50		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
07/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	LTR to E Harris re Lexington docs	0.40	110.00			
07/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	TC to David F re Resp to Lexington's Exp Rpt	0.40	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
07/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Finalize Depo Ntcs for Lex Witnesses	1.30	357.50			
07/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft LTR to E Harris re 10 depo limit; objections to more than 10 depo	0.30	82.50			
07/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft cover letter to E Harris re Def Depo Ntcs	0.30	82.50			
07/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Finalize depo ntcs and serve	0.80	220.00			

07/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Call with KI re case status and discovery	0.40	110.00			
07/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email Exp re dates for sch of depositions; email E Harris re exp depo dates	0.40	110.00			
07/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC to David F re Need for production of a supp exp rpt	0.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
07/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Righi Depo Prep; Get docs to Mark; review file	3.00	825.00			
07/10/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Rule 26 Disc - exp and ntc of service	0.60	165.00			
07/10/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Lex Supp Exp Disc and Expert Rpts	0.50	137.50			
07/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Tel call to Rick Righi re Depo Prep and Scott Homes Att Privileged Communication	0.70	192.50			
07/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Cont. Prep for Righi Depo; Draft short outlines; attend Rick Righi sepo	7.50	2,062.50			
07/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TAE Conf resummary of Righi Depo and docs marked as Exh.	0.70	192.50			
07/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft LTR to E Harris re depositions	0.50	137.50			
07/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Opp to mtn to Compel	2.80	770.00			
07/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Tel Conf re Depo prep with Steve Robson	.	137.50			
07/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Depo Prep Conf Call Tom Colonga and Status update call with both Colonga and Peter Hollingshead	1.20	330.00			
07/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email E Harris re Depos; Att client privileged memo to SR re depo prep re summary of topics to be	1.20	330.00			
07/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Sch Depos	0.40	110.00			
07/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conf with TAE re Mintz; Tel call to E Harris re willis depo; RS who is Jodi Mintz	1.40	308.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Reduced by 20%. Related to bad faith in part.

07/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE re case status and depositions to date	0.50	137.50			
07/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Depo Prep for Robson Depo; Meeting with Robson; Defend Steve Robson at Depo	6.00	1,650.00			
07/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Emails regarding scheduling depositions	0.20	55.00			
07/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Joe Fraiser re RAA depo prep	0.40	110.00			
07/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Memo re Robson Depo	0.30	82.50			
07/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re Robson depo and RS in Couch on Insurance	0.50	137.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Memo to Tom Cologna re Depo Prep Notes	2.40	660.00			
07/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review ntc of Service	0.30	82.50			
07/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Legal RS - Couch on Ins Practice Guides re excess insurance.	0.70	192.50		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
07/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	RS law re Couch - re insurance law and statements for deposition of Steve Plitt	0.70	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
07/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Client meeting; Prep for and Defend Tom Cologna depo	6.00	1,650.00			
07/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re need for wills depo	0.50	137.50			
07/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Depo Prep Call with Dolores Cavazos; email Traci Ribero re disc dispute	0.80	220.00			
07/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to E Harris re discovery dispute; LTR to E Harris re Exp Disc; MSJ Prep for Oral Arguments	1.60	440.00			
07/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for OA re Mtn to Strike; Draft Outline	2.00	550.00			
07/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for OA re MSJ; Draft Outline; get binders; depo prep	4.60	1,265.00			

07/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for MSJ; Argue MSJ; Travel to Tucson by car for Cavasoz depo	8.00	2,200.00			
07/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep & Defend Depo of Cavaos	5.00	1,375.00			
07/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review MSJ Order; email E Harris re scheduling depositions; email M Raymond re depositions, docs and msj order	1.00	275.00			
07/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re MSJ; Email to Traci Ribero re Wills depo confirmation	1.00	275.00			
07/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Response to Mtn to Leave to Amend	0.50	137.50			
07/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Harris & Ribero re depositions and disc; review CS MSJ; Collateral est legal research for Silver...	1.90	522.50			
07/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Menter re depositions and MSJ order	0.40	110.00			
07/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email E Harris re Disc	0.80	220.00			
07/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email LJ re Chi Depo Sch; Draft Subp for Expert files; RS law of docs to be produced by Experts in Fed Case.	1.00	275.00			
07/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email E Harris re Subp of expert docs & Draft Exh for subp for docs	1.10	302.50			
07/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re disc and Scott privileges;	0.20	55.00			
07/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Beth F and Righi re Maintain Scott Homes Att Client Privilege; Email SR re attt client privilege	0.40	110.00		Defense of Scott Homes	
07/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Edit and revise subp re expert and 30b6 docs.	0.60	165.00			
07/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft LTR to Experts re Subp of file docs	0.30	82.50			
07/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review In-Line Rpt; email Joe Fraiser and Lonnie Haughton re INLine expert report contents; meeting prep for	1.50	412.50			

07/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Depo Prep Meeting with Joe Fraiser with Docs.	3.70	1,017.50			
07/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Revise Subp	0.40	110.00			
07/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	LTR to E Harris re disc; LTR to E Harris re exp disc	1.70	467.50			
07/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Finalize LTR to E Harris re disc	0.60	165.00			
07/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conf call with RAA team re depo prep	0.80	220.00			
07/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC to AL D re depo prep and percip depositions	0.50	137.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Disc LTRs; Prep for disc Conf Call with Counsel re Disc Dispute	1.80	495.00			
07/24/413	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Prep for exp meeting with David F;	0.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
07/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Prep for call with Court re Discovery Dispute	0.50	150.00			
07/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Depo Prep meeting with David F and doc review	1.70	374.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Reduced by 20%. Related to bad faith in part.
07/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Prep & Call with Court re Disc Dispute	1.00	275.00			
07/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Prep and RS law re Disc Brief for Court on Disc Dispute	1.00	275.00			
07/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft disc brief re Feb18th discovery hearing; emails to E Harris	4.40	1,210.00			
07/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email EH re disc	0.50	137.50			
07/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Get docs for Mintz depo; email E Harris re Gogel docs and depo	0.40	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
07/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Compare the varrious versions of the 2001 and 2002 Evanston Ins Policies produced	0.20	55.00			

07/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to JF re RAA opinions and depos	0.20	55.00			
07/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email EH re depos	0.50	137.50			
07/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to EH re JF depo	0.80	220.00			
07/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to EH re Gogel depo	0.80	220.00			
07/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Org Docs for Mintz depos	0.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith.
07/27/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Legal RS re contract liability exclusions and 2 Az cases	0.80	220.00			
07/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review claims file; Organized and copy docs for TAE depo of Wills and/or Mintz	1.30	357.50			
07/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email EH re Gogel docs and depo	0.40	110.00			
07/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re Mintz depo	0.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
07/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Tel call to Plitt re doc production in response to subpoena.	0.30	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review docs Subp by Lex for sub contractor files and Menter	0.80	220.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email AL D and S Prater re need more depo dates of avilability	0.30	66.00			Reduced by 20%. Related to bad faith in part.
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise prop disc stip; email EH re depo and disc stip	1.00	275.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	RS Ins Law re Couch on Ins.	1.00	275.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for Disc Conf Call;	2.30	632.50			
08/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Emails with EH re disc call w. ct	0.50	137.50			

08/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Emails to EH; LR re JF and LH exp disc; Review Lex Obj to In-Line Subp for Docs; LTR re In-Line	1.90	522.50			
08/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Call with M Raymond re Lex Subp to Markel; TC with Court re disc dispute; revise brief and file;	2.30	632.50			
08/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for Avelar Depo	1.00	275.00			
08/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Attend RAA depo prep meeting with RA, JF, and LH	7.00	1,925.00			
08/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email clerk re Lexington Brief; review case law cited	0.50	137.50			
08/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to JF re revised Cost of Repair	0.20	55.00			
08/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for Disc Dispute Hearing re 2.18.14	1.50	412.50			
08/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE re Mintz depo	0.30	82.50			
08/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Emails re Woo Depo on Calendar	0.40	110.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email and call with EH re Stip for experts; prep for disc hearing	2.50	687.50			
08/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for Disc Hearing 2.18.14	2.00	550.00			
08/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to JF re Depo Prep; Email EH re docs	0.40	110.00			
08/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for Discovery Hearing; attend hearing;	4.50	1,237.50			
08/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to Harris re In Line Subp	0.50	137.50			
08/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Book Travel - No Charge		0.00			
08/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re Wills depo	0.30	82.50		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	

08/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	EH LTR re In-Line final	0.70	192.50			
08/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Call with EH re In-Line	0.20	55.00			
08/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Plitt Depo prep & Doc review	1.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
08/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	TC to KI re Case status update	0.20	55.00			
08/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	RS Mtn for Entry of Judgment; email KI	0.50	137.50			
08/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conf with TAE; LTRs and emails re In-Line	6.00	1,650.00			
08/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Org docs for Plitt Depo; Depo prep;	1.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
08/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conf with TAE; Org docs for Plitt Depo;	5.00	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
08/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Depo prep; LTRs and emails re In-Line	0.30	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
08/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Depo Prep for Plitt depo	4.00	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
08/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Prep & Deposition of S Plitt	6.00	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
08/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Memo re Plitt testimony	1.00	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
08/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	book travel - No Charge	0.80	0.00			
08/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Privilege Log and doc review for prod - mediation privileged documents	1.40	385.00			
08/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Doc redaction re med docs	0.50	137.50			
08/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conf with TAE re depo notes	0.50	137.50			

08/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Doc review and depo prep for Gogel; LTR to COUnsel re Med pro docs; produce med docs; etc.	3.90	1,072.50			
08/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Depo prep and outline - Gogel	2.50	687.50			
08/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Emails to KI; Gogel prep	1.30	357.50			
08/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Gogel Depo Prep, Doc Reivew and Draft Outlines	7.00	1,925.00			
08/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Depo of Gogel and prep;	8.50	2,337.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email KI; Prep for call with expert Steve G	0.50	137.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conf call with KI re Plitt Opinions	0.60	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conf call with SG re depo prep; email docs to him for review	0.90	247.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Prep for SG depo; email KI	0.80	220.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC to Al D re depo prep; TC to Mike Raymend re pearson and Modlin depo.; Draft LTR to EH re	3.70	1,017.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Finalize MR email depo and doc prod; email LJ	1.00	275.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Prep & Defend depo of SG	4.00	1,100.00			
09/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Modlin Depo prep	1.00	275.00			
09/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Prep & Depo of Modlin in SF	11.00	3,025.00			
09/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Call with Court re Disc Dispute	0.50	137.50			
09/06/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Travel to NY (includes some travel on Thurs Night to NC)	0.00	0.00			

09/06/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep & Defend Depo of Al. D.	5.50	1,512.50			
09/06/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email TR re Woo Depo	0.40	110.00			
09/06/013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Do Memo re Al D Depo summary	0.60	165.00			
09/06/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to TAE; DOc review for depo	0.50	137.50			
09/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Travel	3.00	0.00			
09/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email re Depos Woo and docs	0.20	55.00			
09/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Joe F re depo prep and opinions; Memo re JF depo prep	0.80	220.00			
09/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE RAA depo	0.70	192.50			
09/10/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep & Depo of Kirshenbaum	7.00	1,925.00			
09/10/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Lonnie Haughton re Depo prep	0.40	110.00			
09/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re depos and Mtn to Stay	0.50	137.50			
09/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Doc review for docs related to Zurich denial	0.50	137.50			
09/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to Traci; Zurich RS and Memo; TC to MR re depos and disc	1.60	0.00			
09/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Disc Call with Court	0.50	137.50			
09/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Mail and emails re discovery stip	1.00	275.00			
09/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE re case status	0.30	82.50			

09/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for call with client re demand	0.50	137.50			
09/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Call with client re authority for demand	1.00	275.00			
09/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Woo depo prep and doc review	1.20	330.00			
09/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Woo depo prep including conference with TAE	1.50	412.50			
09/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep & Take Woo Depo	7.00	1,925.00			
09/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Memo re Kevin Woo depo and docs	1.00	275.00			
09/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re Woo depo and MSJ	0.30	82.50			
09/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE and TAE re comp disc	0.30	82.50			
09/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Begin to Draft MSJ	1.30	357.50			
09/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Legal Research for MSJ; Edit TAE ltr re Med	0.70	192.50			
09/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont Drafting MSJ	3.60	990.00			
09/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Amend Answer; memo	1.80	495.00			
09/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont Drafting Scott Homes amended answer	0.40	110.00		Defense of Scott Homes	
09/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont Drafting MSJ	2.50	687.50			
09/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont. Draft MSJ	3.20	880.00			
09/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont drafting MSJ; Memo to TAE	4.60	1,265.00			

09/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise MSJ; Draft SSOF	1.20	330.00			
09/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise MSJ; Cont. Draft SSOF	3.30	907.50			
09/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont drafting and revising MSJ, SSOF and decls	6.60	1,815.00			
09/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Depo trans review for msj	1.40	385.00			
09/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont revise MSJ, SSOF, Decls, depo trans	4.50	1,237.50			
09/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont drafting and revising MSJ, SSOF and decls	5.60	1,540.00			
09/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize MSJ	4.50	1,237.50			
09/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize MSJ	1.30	357.50			
09/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE	0.50	137.50			
09/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Lex MSJ; draft memo	0.80	220.00			
09/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email JSS re detail info for MSJ	0.50	137.50			
09/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review MSJ Resp and related docs by Lex	0.60	165.00			
09/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Being drafting response to Lex MSJ	4.80	1,320.00			
09/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Resp to Lex MSJ	4.70	1,292.50			
09/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Resp to Lex MSJ	1.20	330.00			
09/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont Drafting MSJ	3.60	990.00			

09/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conf with JJS re MSJ	0.50	137.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont Drafting MSJ	3.50	962.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft resp to SSOF and Defs SOFF	5.10	1,402.50			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conference with JAM re msj;	0.40	110.00			
10/01/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft resp to SSOF and Defs SOFF	4.40	1,210.00			
10/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont work on MSJ, Decl and exh	5.90	1,622.50			
10/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	COnt work on MSJ, Decl and exh	9.80	2,695.00			
10/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont work on MSJ, Decl and exh	8.80	2,420.00			
10/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Finalize MSJ	2.70	742.50			
10/03/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Review MSJ for reply	0.80	220.00			
10/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Review Lex Opp to MSJ; RS law; draft memo	2.70	742.50			
10/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conference with JWE re msj's	1.00	275.00			
10/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft Reply to MSJ; Memo to TAE	5.80	1,595.00			
10/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont Drafting MSJ Reply	3.00	825.00			
10/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Revise TAE Reply to SB MSJ	2.50	687.50			
10/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft Reply and add citations to Doc and law	5.40	1,485.00			

10/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Reply and add cite to Doc and law	1.70	467.50			
10/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	review and locate docs for mtn for sanctions	0.80	220.00			
10/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Doc review re Mtn for Sanctions	1.00	275.00			
10/09/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conf with TAE re Lex Mtn for Sanctions	0.60	165.00			
10/09/2012	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Gogel depo trans re Sanctions mtn and date of services provided by InLine	0.80	220.00			
10/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Prepared letter to Robeiro re Rule 11 alleged violations and SB response	1.00	275.00			
10/10/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review and revise Response to Mtn for Sancations	2.36	632.50			
10/10/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Finaize and File Resp to Sanction Mtn	1.00	275.00			
10/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email Traci Ribero re Mtn for leave to file Mtn for Sanctions.	0.20	55.00			
10/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conf with TAE re Mtn for Sanctions	0.50	137.50			
10/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Edit Final Reply to Mtn re Rule 11; email E Harris	0.80	220.00			
10/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review file for docs for Opp to Lex mtn to re-open disc; review Pacif-04 discovery dispute.	1.40	385.00			
10/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Rearch law and doc review for mtn to open disc	2.10	577.50			
10/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Doc review for Mtn to reopen disc; draft mtn; tc to TAE	3.00	825.00			
10/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Resp to Lex Mtn Re-Open Discovery.	4.00	1,100.00			
10/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Doc review for Mtn to reopen disc; draft mtn; tc to TAE	5.20	1,430.00			

10/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Doc review for Mtn to reopen disc; draft SB response to reopen discovery; tel call to TAE re Lex Mtn to Reopen Disc	1.00	275.00			
10/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise and Finalize Resp tp Lex Mtn to Reopen Disc	3.30	907.50			
10/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft LTR to E Harris re Subcontractor Settlement Agreements	0.30	90.00			
10/16/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Errata to GEM Decl with missing exh	1.00	300.00			
10/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	MSJ Oral Argument Prep	0.50	150.00			
10/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email KI re Atty fees covered under ins in Az	0.30	90.00			
10/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for MSJ Oral Argument; Doc locate and review; draft outline; meet with TAE	5.70	1,710.00			
10/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for MSA Oral Augments; Review MSJ docs and exh; draft outline; meet with TAE re MSJ prep	5.00	1,500.00			
10/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Travel to PHX	0.00	0.00			
10/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep and Attended Federal Court hearing re MSJ Conference call with client re hearing;	5.00	1,500.00			
10/17/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Return to San Jose	3.00	0.00			
10/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Ct MSJ Order; conf with TAE re MSJ Order; email client re results from MSJ Order	2.00	600.00			
10/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Call from client Tom Cologna re Court MSJ Order	0.70	210.00			
10/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	review correspondence re JPO Conf with Ct	0.50	150.00			
10/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	LTR to each Expert re trial date and exh due date	1.00	300.00			
10/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise LTR to experts re trial date, exh due and MSJ ruling limiting issues for trial	0.40	120.00			

10/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Coggins depo; draft Coggins Decl re Scott Homes' policy, procedures and compliance with AI	2.70	810.00			
10/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont. Draft Coggins Declaration; RS policy req	1.60	480.00			
10/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Tom Coggins re Decl and Exh	0.50	150.00			
10/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Memo re JPO tasks and deadlines	1.20	360.00			
10/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Memo re JPO deadlines and SB proposed MILs; email Kevin S re meet and confer on pre-trial matters	0.30	90.00			
10/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Memo re trial designations of depo test	0.30	90.00			
10/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Tel Call to Lonnie Haughton and Memo re trial exhs for RAA team and revisions to RAA Powerpoint	0.50	150.00			
10/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with JWE re RAA Poierpoint revisions	0.50	150.00			
10/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft SB MIL #1 - exclude Terrecon Rpt and supporting decl	1.50	450.00			
10/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	email KS re JPO Deadlines, TC to TAE re status of mils and JPO deadlines	0.30	90.00			
10/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revised Rearch memo for JAM re Fed Rules of Evidence and applicable AZDC local rules;	0.30	90.00			
10/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont working on drafts of SB Mils 1-8 and supporting docs	2.90	870.00			
10/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Tel Call to Lonnie Haughton re sch exp meeting	0.30	90.00			
10/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for Exp Meeting; review RAA Power point	0.70	210.00			
10/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial Prep Meeting with RAA and revisions to Powerpoint	3.60	1,080.00			

10/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	RS AZ and CA case law re occurrence def and property damage during policy period; Tel call to	4.60	1,380.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email Steve Gustafson re trial exh	0.30	90.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for Conf Call with AIG re pre-JPO meeting and exh exchange;	0.80	240.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE	0.20	60.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Call with PLs Counsel re JPO and Exh	1.00	300.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont Draft Mills 1-8; RS applicable law.	3.40	1,020.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont drafting Mills and GEM Decl in support with exhs	2.30	690.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	review Lonnie Haughton's Revisions to Powerpoint and propose revisions	0.60	180.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft portions of the JPO - witnesses and stipulated facts; Get Exhs lists started and org.	4.50	1,350.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Research JPO req. and local rules, email Kevin S re meet and confer on JPO requirements and	1.30	390.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Get trial exh organized; Tel Call to Lonnie Haughton and Alan at Nautilus re Powerpoint and	4.60	1,380.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Kevin S re JPO requirements;	0.20	60.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to Alan at Nautilus re docs evidencing building by building cost of repair breakdown;	0.40	120.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Tel with call to Coggins re trial testimony;	0.40	120.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Get Exh AI Accord from exhs for Coggins testimony	0.40	120.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont draft Exh list and locate/organize/produce SB trial exh.	2.10	630.00			

10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont drafting JPO portions and Exh/Exh list preparation	1.70	510.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont Drafting JPO - issues of fact and law;	0.60	180.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Conf with TAE re issues of fact and law;	0.50	150.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize MIL; GEM Decl; located test and exh to support MILs.	4.40	1,320.00			
10/23/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	JPO - Exh List and get/org exhs	6.00	1,800.00			
10/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	JPO - prepare draft witness list jury instruction;	0.75	225.00			
10/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Depo designation; Righi memo to TAE re JPO;	1.25	375.00			
10/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	JPO - revise issues of fact and law;	1.00	300.00			
10/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email to Kevin re meet and confer for JPO	5.50	1,650.00			
10/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize and File MILs	0.70	210.00			
10/24/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Continued to research and draft Jury Instructions	0.80	240.00			
10/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalized SB Exh List; locate bate stamped docs; TC with Jilian Searles re exh exchange, copying	5.50	1,650.00			
10/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Az Jury Instruction - start, locate, Draft	0.30	90.00			
10/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Edit JPO docs and org exh for meeting with counsel;	1.20	360.00			
10/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Tel and emails to counsel re JPO counsel meeting and exh exchange	0.50	150.00			
10/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Meeting with Lexington re joint trial exhibits	7.00	2,100.00			

10/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial conference;	1.50	450.00			
10/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Meeting with JWE, TAE, KI re trial;	2.20	660.00			
10/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Final Filed JPO re trial prep;	1.75	525.00			
10/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Memos re analysis of Lexington's trial Cost of Repair and Scott Homes compliance with AI	2.00	600.00			
10/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	el call to Tom Cologna re trial schedule and prep for lost rent testimony; emails to Tom Cologna	0.80	240.00			
10/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review trans from JPO hearing; Draft Memo re Court rules and requirements; TC to Kevin S re	1.00	300.00			
10/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC and emails to Kevin re trial matters and any response to Silverbell's settlement demands;	0.50	150.00			
10/28/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Subcontractor SA matrix with allocations for trial binder	1.00	300.00			
10/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	email to Kevin S re trial matters, opening statement docs/exh; emails to Court staff re Exhibits	2.80	840.00			
10/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial Prep - prepare witness outlines; Call with Lonnie Haughton re Courtroom tech and powerpoint;	2.60	780.00			
10/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Depo and policy langauge review for mtn for clarification; Draft Resp to Lexington's Mtn for Clarification.	2.00	600.00			
10/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Court Orders; Draft Resp to Lex Mtn for Clarification	1.00	300.00			
10/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont. Drafting Resp to Lex Mtn for Clarification	2.50	750.00			
10/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft SB Memo re clarifiation - get supporting Exhibits and/or Decl.	3.00	900.00			
10/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Stip for Dismissal of bad Faith	0.50	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to bad faith/punitive damages.
10/29/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Research Az case law re occurrence def and specifically the different oc def in Evanston and	1.00	300.00			

		Lex policies					
10/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	TC to KI trial prep and bad faith dismissal; email to Kevin S re Opening statements and stip for	1.00	240.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Reduced by 20%. Related to bad faith/punitive damages in part.
10/30/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Research file docs for evidence for completion dates for specific scopes of work - roofs, stucco,	1.50	450.00			
10/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial email to trial team re issues to discuss; revise, finalize and file Resp to Lexington's Mtn	1.00	300.00			
10/31/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Prep for Expert meeting with RAA team - list of topics and trial exh; Expert meeting with JWE, LH	4.50	1,350.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Org trial boxes for shipment	1.40	420.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review file dos for Cert of Occupancy; draft memo re substantial completion vs Cert of Occupancy;	2.20	660.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Cont. Review file dos for Cert of Occupancy; draft memo re substantial completion vs Cert of Occupancy;	3.40	1,020.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial Prep Conf with JWE - trial responsibilities and split up witness examination.	0.50	150.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial Prep call with exp Steve G re cost of repair opinions and revised scope.	1.00	300.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial Prep - Org trial docs; draft exhibit outlines for witnesses; create trial binder; gather supplies	3.40	1,020.00			
11/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial Prep - Org trial docs; draft exhibit outlines for witnesses; create trial binder; review Rutter	2.20	660.00			
11/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial Prep call with Tom Cologna	1.30	390.00			
11/04/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial Prep call with Al DeBonis	1.00	300.00			
11/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial prep; witness prep and witness examination outlines.	4.40	1,320.00			
11/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Trial prep; Finalize drafts of witness outlines; review revisions	4.80	1,440.00			

	MEISENHELDER)	to depo designations; Review wills					
11/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Prep for Tom Cologna and Jose Fraiser examination and review prior depo testimony; create jury	8.00	2,400.00			
	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial - jury selection; opening statements; discussions with Ct; prep and meeting with Tom Cologna -	11.00	3,300.00			
11/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial - Cologna direct and cross; Haughton direct and cross; meeting and prep with Joe Fraiser and	11.00	3,300.00			
11/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial - Joe Fraiser direct exam; get RAA Powerpoint in evidence; meeting and prep with Joe Fraiser	12.00	3,600.00			
11/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial - Joe Fraiser cont. direct and cross exam; Al DeBonis direct and start cross;	8.00	2,400.00			
11/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial Prep; Pack docs for Az	4.20	1,260.00			
11/05/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial Prep call with Coggins re trial testimony and Outline Coggins testimony	1.60	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2089]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
11/06/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial Prep call with Al DeBonis	1.00	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2090]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
11/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Revisions to jury instruction; Prep for Jury selection; draft memo to JWE re opening statement outline	1.50	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2091]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
11/07/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial Prep: Finalize drafts of witness outlines; review revisions to depo designations; Review wills	4.80	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2095]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
11/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Prep for Tom Cologna and Joe Fraiser examination and review prior depo testimony; create jury	8.00	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2100]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
11/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial - jury selection; opening statements; discussions with Ct; prep and meeting with Tom Cologna -	11.00	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2106]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
10/08/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial - Cologna direct and cross; Haughton direct and cross; meeting and prep with Joe Fraiser and	11.00	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2115]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
11/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Trial - Joe Fraiser direct exam; get RAA Powerpoint in evidence; meeting and prep with Joe Fraiser	12.00	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2123]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.

		and					
11/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial - Joe Fraizer cont. direct and cross-exam; Al D. direct and start cross;	8.00	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2130]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
11/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial Prep - prep for week 2 witnesses - Coggins, Avelar, Gustafson and Lex Witnesses. Draft witness	6.00	1,800.00			
11/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial - Al DeBonis Cross; Coggins direct and Cross; Prep - assist with JWE prep of R Avelar.	8.00	2,400.00			
11/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial - Coggins cross and redirect; Richard Avelar direct exam; meeting and prep with Gustafson re trial test;	10.00	3,000.00			
11/11/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial- Richard Avelar Cross and re-direct; Examination of Gustafson; prep for jury instructing; prep for	8.00	2,400.00			
11/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial - Lex case; Wills, Righi cross-exam of Paul Klamka, jury instructions prep;	10.00	3,000.00			
11/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial - prep and argu jury instructions and verdict forms;	3.50	1,050.00			
11/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial Prep - Prep for Gogel Cross;	4.50	1,350.00			
11/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Resp to mtn for DV; Prep for Gogel Cross	5.50	1,650.00			
11/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial - Gogel direct and prep for gogel cross	8.00	2,400.00			
11/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial - Gogel cross; Closing arguments; Jury Instructions;	7.00	2,100.00			
11/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Trial - Prep and Jury Verdict;	3.00	900.00			
11/12/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Email client with status updates - jury verdict; next step;	0.50	150.00			
11/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Call with TC re status and next step	0.60	180.00			
11/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft Mtn/Brief re Offset; Review Exh; RS law	3.70	1,110.00			

	MEISENHELDER)						
11/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Befin draft Mtn/Brief re Offset; Review Exh; RS law	4.00	1,200.00			
11/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Cont. Drafting Brief re offsets, draft GEM decl; RS law; Conf with TAE	6.10	1,830.00			
11/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Cont. Drafting Brief re offsets, draft GEM decl; RS law; Conf with TAE	0.40	120.00			
11/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Finalize Brief re Offset and Decl	2.60	780.00			
11/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	RS law for the Mtn for Fees and Costs; email KI	0.70	210.00			
11/13/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Resp to Lexington's Offset Motion; RS Labrum Motions from Pacif-04; RS Law re Loss	5.00	1,500.00			
11/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Resp to Lexington's Offset Motion; RS Labrum Motions from Pacif-04; RS Law re Loss	1.40	420.00			
11/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	LTR to Experts re bills and expert amounts	0.40	120.00			
11/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	RS law re taxable costs and fees; draft memo re requirements of bill of cost and att and non-taxable costs mtn	1.70	510.00			
11/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Research Resp to Lexington's Offset Motion;	1.00	300.00			
11/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Conf with JAM re Cost Bill; Review Rutter Guide re Post-Trial Mtn.; tab guide for GEM and JAM Review	2.40	720.00			
11/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Time Entries for GEMMtn for Fee re compliance with local rules	1.00	300.00			
11/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Draft Decl for offset motion; get exhs	1.30	390.00			
11/14/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	TC with TAE re offset mtn; finalize for filing	0.60	180.00			
11/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Time Entries for Mtn for Fee re compliance with local rules	0.40	120.00			

11/15/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email JSS re Req info for Mtn for fee; statement of facts; verdict question	0.30	90.00			
11/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Finalize and file SB Resp to Lex Mtn for Offset and GEM Decl	0.80	240.00			
11/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review and revise time entries to comply with local rule req.	2.00	600.00			
11/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Research sample Proposed Form of Judgments; email KI re samples	0.60	180.00			
11/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review time entries for compliance with req of local rules - Att fees and costs Mtn	2.60	780.00			
11/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Research law re judgment and form of judgment; Draft prop judgment and email TAE and KI for	1.40	420.00			
11/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Lex response to Offset brief	0.50	150.00			
11/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Email and TC to KI re Ct req for Proposed Judgment; Review Order and cited FRCP; Revised Proposed	2.70	810.00			
11/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise time entries to comply with task based itemization req by LR - Mtn for At Fees and Costs	2.40	720.00			
11/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise time entries to comply with task based itemization req by LR - Mtn for At Fees and Costs	1.50	450.00			
11/18/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Research samples of Proposed Judgments; Research pre and post judgment interest law and add to	1.00	300.00			
11/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Memo re Cost Bill; Research form docs for Cost Bill	0.40	120.00			
11/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	RS law re pre and post judgment interest; Draft P&A section for request for prejudgment interest;	1.80	540.00			
11/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Review Case cost and expenses for Cost Bill and request for Non-taxable costs	1.50	450.00			
11/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Revise time entries to comply with task based itemization req by LR - Mtn for At Fees and Costs	1.50	450.00			
11/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHOLDER)	Draft Objections to Lex Proposed Form of Judgment and file	1.00	300.00			

11/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Sept time for att fees mtn and task specification	0.70	210.00			
11/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review draft of Cost Bill	0.50	150.00			
11/19/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	RS for Teilborg Orders on attorney fee claims; Draft memo to TAE and JAM	1.00	300.00			
11/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Research reasonable hourly rates in Az; Research reasonable hourly rates of opposing counsel firms;	2.00	600.00			
11/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	RS the recoverability of expert witness fees in Az	0.50	150.00			
11/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	RS the types of Non-taxable costs recoverable under Az law	0.80	240.00			
11/20/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Revise and revise Sept time for fee app	0.80	240.00			
11/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Email to TC re status of case and judgment	0.30	90.00			
11/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Add fact sections to Draft of Motion for Fees and Costs; Draft Intro; Draft claim for prejudgment	5.80	1,740.00			
11/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Add fact sections to Draft of Motion for Fees and Costs; Draft Intro; Draft claim for prejudgment	2.70	810.00			
11/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Start draft Statement of consultantion; Start Draft LTR to COusel for consultantion; email KS were to	4.80	1,440.00			
11/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Cont Drafting GEM Decl and exhs and revise P&A's to include TAE revision	4.50	1,350.00			
11/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Revise P&A with info from TAE; Draft KI declaration; Cont Drafting GEM Decl and Exh	4.00	1,200.00			
11/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Court Judgment; email JWE, TAE, KI and clients re judgment	1.20	360.00			
11/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Review Eh Appeal email; Conf with TAE and JWE; email KI	0.50	150.00			
11/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHELDER)	Revise fees and costs motion and GEM decl to delete interest section from motion	0.70	210.00			

11/21/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Conf with TAE re litigation costs	0.70	210.00			
11/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Revise fees and costs motion and GEM decl to delete interest section from motion	0.80	240.00			
11/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	TC to Agelo re Stip to Stay; Conf with TAE and email KI; draft LTR to client and notice of appeal	1.50	450.00			
11/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	TC to Rob Lewis re supporting decl for motion for fees and costs; Draft Lewis Decl and revise KI decl	2.00	600.00			
11/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Emails to KI re case status and appeal	0.40	120.00			
11/22/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Emails to AR re Judgment amount and bond; calc bond amount; RS multiplier for bond; review JAM costs docs	2.00	600.00			
11/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Revise decl and email Lewis with Decl; revise decl and email KI with Decl.	1.00	300.00			
11/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Review Lex Mtn for Stay; Conf with TAE	0.50	150.00			
11/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Draft Response to LExington's Motion to Extend Stay	1.00	300.00			
11/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Locate and/or draft all 12 exhibits for Silverbell Motion for Fees; Finalize P&A for TAE review;	2.40	720.00			
11/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Review JAM Draft of Cost Bill	0.40	120.00			
11/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Cont drafting and revising all 15 exhibits; add case law to mtn re recoverability of contingency fee	2.20	660.00			
11/25/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Review and Finalize Cost Bill	0.60	180.00			
11/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Finalize Declaration and Brief	2.00	600.00			
11/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Prep for Call with counsel re consult on fee claim; revise statement of consultation	1.50	450.00			
11/26/2013	GEM (GREGORY E. MEISENHEDER)	Finalize Motion for Fee and all exhibit and file	2.00	600.00			

		Total	1091.10				
11/26/2013	GEM:GEM N/C	Travel to Az.	3.00	0.00			Non-compensable
11/26/2013	GEM:GEM N/C	Travel to PHX for AZDC Admission	3.00	0.00			Non-compensable
11/26/2013	GEM:GEM N/C	Travel to SJ	7.50	0.00			Non-compensable
11/27/2013	GEM:GEM N/C	Travel to OC	0.00	0.00			Non-compensable
11/27/2013	GEM:GEM N/C	RS appellate procedure for 9th cir; draft memo; review practice guide and federal rules	2.20	0.00			Non-compensable
11/27/2013	GEM:GEM N/C	RS appellate procedure for 9th cir; draft memo; review practice guide and federal rules	0.50	0.00			Non-compensable
11/27/2013	GEM:GEM N/C	Draft LTR to EH re non-taxable costs; RS post judgment interest amounts; email AR re bond; emails	1.20	0.00			Non-compensable
	GEM:GEM N/C	RS recoverability of non-taxable costs; Conf with JAM & TAE; email KI; Revise Fees and costs motion	2.50	0.00			Non-compensable
	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Gather paperwork, draft application for JWE Pro Hac Vice motion, file JWE Pro Hac Motion	1.00	70.00			
	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Telephone calls to David Frangiamore of 2nd Insight re retention	0.20	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Filing	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/02/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Filing	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/02/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review	0.50	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/02/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email to Lexington counsel	0.10	7.00			
12/02/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/03/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email to Lexington counsel with TAE LTR	0.10	7.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	
	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/03/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/03/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.

12/03/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/04/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/04/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing/distribution	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/04/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Telephone call and emails to insurance expert David Frangiamore	0.40	0.00		Related to Bad Faith/Punitive Damages	Entry deducted. Related to Bad Faith.
12/04/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/04/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/04/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/04/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/05/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/06/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/06/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/09/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and email response re deposition subpoenas	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/09/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/10/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/10/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/10/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.30	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/10/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and distribution, file	0.40	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/10/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and distribution, file	0.40	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/11/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Create an index of Lexington Docs	0.20	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/11/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and distribution, file	0.40	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.

12/17/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.30	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/17/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.40	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/18/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.50	35.00			
12/18/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review and filing	0.30	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/18/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Research filing procedures	0.20	14.00			
12/18/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/19/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Email review	0.10	0.00		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Entry deducted. Clerical/administrative activity.
12/19/2013	GI (GWEN IRVIN)	Correspondence review and filing	0.20	11.20		Clerical/Administrative Activity	Reduced by 20%. Clerical in part
			2.06				
12/19/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Review Righi Document production (partial); Review Evanston Reporting; Lex. correspondence;	1.70	425.00			
12/19/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Review case law re production of documents;	0.50	125.00			
12/19/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Meeting w/GEM regarding opposition to Lexington's MSJ;	0.40	100.00			
12/19/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Review Separate Statement of Facts and revise ;	1.50	375.00			
12/19/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Research requirements re judicial notice of prior proceeding in State Court;	0.70	175.00			
12/20/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft request for judicial notice;	0.80	200.00			
12/20/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Final request for judicial notice;	1.20	300.00			
12/20/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Identify applicable deposition testimony that lays foundation for evidence in support of opp. To msj;	3.20	800.00			
12/20/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revise GEM declaration;	1.60	400.00			
12/20/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revise separate statement of facts in opposition to Plaintiff's MSJ;	2.50	625.00			
12/23/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Research improper reliance on attorney affidavit;	0.60	150.00			
12/23/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revise opposition to MSJ;	1.50	375.00			

	A. MALTZER)						
12/23/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Proof legal citations re opposition to MSJ;	1.30	325.00			
12/23/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revise legal citations and table of authorities re opposition to MSJ;	1.00	250.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revise objections to evidence;	0.70	175.00			
12/23/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Research Federal and local rules requirements re MSJ reply brief;	0.90	225.00			
12/23/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Review Lexington's opposition to our MSJ;	1.50	375.00			
12/23/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Review Silverbell's MSJ;	1.00	250.00			
12/23/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft template for reply brief;	1.10	275.00			
12/24/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft requests for production of documents to Lexington;	1.30	325.00			
12/27/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Cite check legal authority cited by Lexington opposition to Scott Homes motion for summary judgment;	2.00	500.00			
12/27/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Research case law regarding effect of settlement in the underlying lawsuit;	1.50	375.00			
12/27/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memo to TAE re faith and credit and res judication effect of state court judgment and settlement;	1.60	400.00			
12/30/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Review MSJ reply brief for corrections;	3.50	875.00			
12/30/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revise reply brief re motion for summary judgment;	2.80	700.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Finalize Silverbell's MSJ reply brief for filing;	1.50	375.00			
12/30/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Research declaratory relief complaint allegations;	1.20	300.00			
12/31/2013	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Review Lexington's Motion for sanctions;	0.60	150.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Review Lexington's MSJ reply brief;	1.00	250.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft response to Lexington's motion for sanctions;	0.90	225.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze Lexington's Motions for sanctions;	0.80	200.00			

01/02/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze Lexinton's revised sanctions motin;	1.50	375.00			
01/02/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft response to Lexinton's sanctions motion;	3.30	825.00			
01/02/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Finalize response to sanctions motion;	2.50	625.00			
01/02/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft declaration re motin for sanctions response;	2.00	500.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft response to Lexington's revised motion for sanctions;	1.20	300.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze reply and eratta re sanctions motion;	0.63	150.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Respond to Lexington's Amended Special Petition;	1.60	400.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re collateral estoppel;	2.00	500.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memo to GEM re lexington's motion to re open discovery;	1.20	300.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft opposition to Lexington's motion;	1.30	325.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze deposition transcripts re opposition to Lexington's motin to reopen discovery;	1.30	325.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft motion for pro hac vice admission	1.10	275.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze Order from Judge Teilborg	1.50	0.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze Order re MSJ and other motions	1.30	325.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re motion for fees/sanctions	1.50	375.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re AZ local rule 54.2 re Fees Motion	1.50	375.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft motion for reasonable expenses re sanctions	4.00	1,000.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze ruling re MSJ re sanctions;	1.50	375.00			
01/03/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft declarations ISO motion for reasonable expenses	0.50	125.00			
01/06/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft table of expenses re motion for reasonable expenses	2.00	500.00			
01/06/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft meet and confer correspondence to AIG's counsel re motion for reasonable expenses	0.50	125.00			

01/06/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft motion for reasonable expenses re sanctions	1.80	450.00			
01/06/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft declarations ISO motion for reasonable expenses	1.00	1.00			
01/06/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft table of expenses re motion for reasonable expenses	0.50	125.00			
01/06/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	File and serve motion for reasonable expenses	1.00	250.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze Order re trial setting	1.20	300.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft template for Joint Pre Trial Order	1.80	450.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Meeting w/ GEM re JPO issues;	0.30	75.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Meeting with JWE & GEM re joint trial exhibit;	1.00	250.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Meeting w/ Plaintiff's counsel re organization of exhibits for trial	8.00	2,000.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Worked on draft joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	1.00	250.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze Pltf's MIL	1.50	375.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Meeting w/ Plaintiff's counsel re organization of exhibits for trial	3.00	750.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Defendants' Exhibit List re Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	4.00	1,000.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Jury Instructions re Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	2.00	500.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare Exhibits for Trial	1.00	250.00			
01/08/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare Defendants' Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	0.50	125.00			
01/08/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft correspondence to AIG counsel re joint PTO	0.70	175.00			
01/08/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Forms of Verdict re re Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	1.50	375.00			
01/08/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Deposition designations re re Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	3.00	750.00			
01/08/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare Exhibits for Trial	0.80	200.00			
01/08/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare Defendants' Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	2.50	625.00			
01/08/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft correspondence to AIG	0.30	75.00			

	A. MALTZER)	counsel re joint PTO					
01/08/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Forms of Verdict re Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	1.00	250.00			
01/09/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Deposition designations re Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	1.70	425.00			
01/09/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Proposed Voir Dire Questions	0.60	150.00			
01/09/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Call w/ Kyle Israel re Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	0.60	150.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare Defendants' Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	1.20	300.00			
01/09/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft correspondence to AIG counsel re joint PTO	1.30	325.00			
01/09/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Defendants' Exhibit List re Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	0.50	125.00			
01/09/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Forms of Verdict re re Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	0.30	75.00			
01/09/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Deposition designations re re Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	1.10	275.00			
01/09/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare Defendants' Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order	3.40	850.00			
01/10/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft joint witness list re joint proposed final pretrial order	0.80	200.00			
01/10/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft stipulated and contested facts and law re joint PTO	3.70	925.00			
01/10/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft correspondence to AIG counsel re joint PTO	1.10	275.00			
01/10/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze and revise Plaintiff's stipulated contested facts and law re PTO	4.00	1,000.00			
01/10/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Jury instructions re Joint PTO	3.50	875.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft objections to Plaintiff's Exhibits re PTO	2.10	525.00			
01/10/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare Defendants' PTO for filing	5.50	1,375.00			
01/13/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft and Revise Jury Instructions re PTO	3.00	750.00			
01/13/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Deposition designations re PTO	2.00	500.00			
01/13/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Verdict Forms re PTO	1.30	325.00			

01/14/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Exhibit List re PTO	0.90	225.00			
01/14/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Witness List re PTO	1.80	450.00			
01/14/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze and revise Plaintiff's request for extension re time to file PTO	1.10	275.00			
01/14/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Voir Dire Questions re PTO	0.50	125.00			
01/14/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare and file Defendants' PTO	2.50	625.00			
01/14/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Correspondence/calls w/ Plaintiff's counsel re filing of PTO	0.50	125.00			
01/14/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revised Jury Instructions re PTO	3.00	750.00			
01/14/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Objections to Plaintiff's Exhibits re PTO	2.50	625.00			
01/14/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Deposition designations re PTO	1.50	375.00			
01/14/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Correspondence/calls w/ Plaintiff's counsel re filing of joint PTO	1.30	325.00			
01/15/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revised Jury Instructions re PTO	4.40	1,100.00			
01/15/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Objections to Plaintiff's Exhibits re PTO	1.20	300.00			
01/15/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Deposition designations re PTO	1.80	450.00			
01/16/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revised Voir Dire Questions re PTO	0.50	125.00			
01/16/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revised stipulated and contested facts and law re PTO	1.00	250.00			
01/17/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Correspondence/calls w/ Plaintiff's counsel re filing of joint PTO	0.80	200.00			
01/17/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Verdict Forms re PTO	0.80	200.00			
01/17/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Exhibit List re PTO	1.20	300.00			
01/17/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft Voir Dire Questions re PTO	0.30	75.00			
01/17/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revise statement of the case re PTO	0.30	75.00			
01/17/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare and file Defendants' PTO	2.50	625.00			

01/20/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft and revise stipulated and contested facts and law re PTO	1.20	300.00			
01/20/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Correspondence/calls w/ Plaintiff's counsel re filing of joint PTO	0.70	175.00			
01/20/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Correspondence/calls w/ Plaintiff's counsel re filing of joint PTO	0.40	100.00			
01/20/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Silverbell pretrial preparation	0.50	125.00			
01/21/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re foundation for certificates of insurance from subcontractors;	1.30	325.00			
01/21/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare trial exhibits;	0.80	200.00			
01/21/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revise deposition designations for trial and draft and file errata;	4.50	1,125.00			
01/21/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare deposition testimony for use at trial;	2.00	500.00			
01/21/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft emorandum re federal rules of evidence;	1.80	450.00			
01/22/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re occurrence as used in the Lexington Policy;	2.40	600.00			
01/22/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re retained limit;	1.50	375.00			
01/22/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare deposition testimony for use at trial;	0.20	500.00			
01/23/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare exhibits for use at trial;	1.30	325.00			
01/23/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Correspondence w/Lexington counsel re deposition testimony and stipulation to errata	0.70	175.00			
01/23/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re certificates of insurance and subcontractor exclusion;	3.80	950.00		Defense of Scott Homes	
01/23/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re use of video deposition testimony;	1.80	450.00			
01/23/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare deposition testimony for use at trial	1.50	375.00			
01/23/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare exhibits for use at trial;	1.10	275.00			
01/23/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare deposition testimony for use at trial;	1.50	375.00			
01/23/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re foundation for admission of exhibits;	2.10	525.00			

01/23/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research and draft memorandum re one occurrence rule;	3.80	950.00			
01/24/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re authentication of photographs;	1.30	325.00			
01/24/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re certificates of insurance and subcontractor exclusion;	0.20	500.00			
01/24/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Trial prep; Pack doc for trial;	4.20	1,050.00			
01/24/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Trial prep call with Coggins re trial testimony and outline Coggins testimony;	1.60	400.00			
01/24/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Trial prep call with Al DeBonis;	1.00	250.00			
01/27/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft revisions to jury instruction; Prep for jury selection; draft memo to JWE re opening statement outline;	1.50	375.00			
01/27/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re certificates of insurance and subcontractor exclusion;	3.20	800.00			
01/27/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare exhibits for trial re Al Debonis	1.10	275.00			
01/27/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re foundation for certificates of insurance from subcontractors	1.30	0.00		Duplicate Entry [1995]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/27/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare trial exhibits	0.80	0.00		Duplicate Entry [1996]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/27/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revise deposition designations for trial and draft and file errata	4.50	0.00		Duplicate Entry [1998]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare deposition testimony for use at trial	2.00	0.00		Duplicate Entry [1999]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re federal rules of evidence	1.80	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2020]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re occurrence as used in the Lexington Policy	2.40	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2021]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re retained limit	1.50	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2022]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare deposition testimony for use at trial	2.00	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2023]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare exhibits for use at trial	1.30	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2024]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Correspondence w/ Lexington counsel re deposition testimony and stipulation to errata	0.70	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2025]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.

01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re certificates of insurance and subcontractor exclusion	3.80	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2031]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re use of video deposition testimony	1.80	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2032]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare deposition testimony for use at trial	1.50	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2033]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare exhibits for use at trial	1.10	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2034]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare deposition testimony for use at trial	1.50	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2053]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re foundation for admission of exhibits	2.10	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2054]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research and draft memorandum re one occurrence rule	3.80	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2055]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re authentication of photographs	1.30	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2056]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re certificates of insurance and subcontractor exclusion	2.00	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2074]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re certificates of insurance and subcontractor exclusion	3.20	0.00		Duplicate Entry [2092]	Entry deducted. Duplicate.
01/28/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re FRE 702 in support of opposition to Lexington's motion to strike	2.50	625.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft opposition to Lexington's motion to strike DeBonis testimony	1.90	475.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft trial memorandum re occurrence, your work exclusion, and insuring language	1.50	375.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re FRE 702 in support of opposition to Lexington's motion to strike	2.00	500.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft opposition to Lexington's motion to strike DeBonis testimony	1.50	375.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft trial memorandum re occurrence, your work exclusion, and insuring language	5.20	1,300.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze Lexington's Motion for Directed Verdict	1.50	375.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze trial testimony re Lexington's Motion for Directed Verdict	2.50	625.00			

01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft opp. to Lexington's Motion for Directed Verdict	1.80	450.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze trial testimony re Lexington's Motion for Directed Verdict	2.00	500.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft opp. to Lexington's Motion for Directed Verdict	8.00	2,000.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re motion for attorneys' fees and non-taxable expenses	1.70	425.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re offsets	1.10	275.00			
01/29/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re offset issue	1.40	350.00			
01/30/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re offset issue	3.80	950.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum re offsets	2.00	500.00			
01/30/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Revised offset brief	1.70	425.00			
01/30/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze and revise legal citations re offset brief	1.20	300.00			
01/30/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze Lexington's Brief re offsets	2.10	525.00			
01/30/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze Lexington's offset brief and draft memorandum re legal authorities	1.20	300.00			
01/30/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Analyze JAM time entries for completeness in preparation of motion for fees	2.10	525.00			
01/30/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re costs allowable in AZ	1.50	375.00			
01/30/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re form of judgment	0.50	125.00			
01/31/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re reasonableness of attorney fee/contingent fee	1.30	325.00			
01/31/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Legal research re availability of non-taxable expenses	1.60	400.00			
01/31/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare exhibits re documentation of non-taxable expenses	0.70	175.00			
01/31/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Follow up re taxable costs and documentation re costs for witnesses	0.40	100.00			
01/31/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Review taxable costs for cost bill	1.80	450.00			

01/31/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Research availability of contingency fee as attorneys' fee award	1.70	425.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Calculate taxable costs re expert documentation	1.00	250.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft bill of costs	1.50	375.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum of costs	3.00	750.00			
	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft bill of costs	0.50	125.00			
01/02/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Draft memorandum of costs	1.00	250.00			
01/06/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Research availability of contingency fee as attorneys' fee award	1.10	275.00			
01/07/2014	JAM (JOSHUA A. MALTZER)	Prepare exhibits for cost bill	2.00	500.00			
		Total	301.13				