

Itemized Statement of Attorneys' Fees and Related Non-Taxable Expenses						
1. Legal Services Rendered						
	SRK	- Sandra R. Kane, Assistant Attorney General				
	BKK	- Brad K. Keogh, Assistant Attorney General				
	LAR	- Leslie A. Ross, Assistant Attorney General				
	CH	- Charlotte Haught, Paralegal				
<u>DATE</u>	<u>USER</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>TIME</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>OBJECTIONS</u>	<u>COURT'S RULING (a blank entry indicates the objection was overruled)</u>
06/22/2010	SRK	Draft and edit complaint.	5.40	\$ 1,593.00		
06/22/2010	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker regarding preparation of complaint.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/23/2010	SRK	Communications with Jinjer Cooke, Bill Walker, and Bill Richards regarding Southside Irrigation Co., Inc. backhoe bill in connection with the Cookes' interference claim.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
06/23/2010	SRK	Revise complaint in consultation with Bill Walker.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
06/24/2010	SRK	Revise complaint in consultation with Bill Walker.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
06/24/2010	SRK	Communications with Jinjer Cooke, Jethro Barlow, and Bill Richards regarding Southside Irrigation Co., Inc. backhoe bill in connection with the Cookes' interference claim.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
06/25/2010	SRK	Review and revise complaint, civil cover sheet, summonses, certificate of compulsory arbitration in consultation with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, and the Cookes.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
07/13/2010	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker, Erin Byrnes, and Blake Hamilton regarding obtaining Ms. Byrnes' and Mr. Hamilton's agreement to accept service.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
07/13/2010	SRK	Draft Acceptance of Service forms for Blake Hamilton and Erin Byrnes.	1.00	\$ 295.00		

07/13/2010	SRK	Draft Notice of Filing of Acceptance of Service forms for Blake Hamilton and Erin Byrnes.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
07/13/2010	SRK	Prepare for and participate in telephonic conference with Blake Hamilton concerning his association with Arizona counsel and pro hac vice admission, and consolidation of the State's and the Cookes' lawsuits in federal court.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
07/14/2010	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Jinjer Cooke, Jethro Barlow, and Bill Richards regarding grainary incident and injunction against Shane Stubbs.	0.90	\$ 265.50	Not related to claims.
07/16/2010	SRK	Review email and attachments from Jethro Barlow regarding the Shane Stubbs granary dispute.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Not related to claims.
07/16/2010	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow requesting copy of leases with Stubbs.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.
07/16/2010	SRK	Telephone call from Erin Byrnes regarding status of acceptance of service.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
07/26/2010	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Jinjer Cooke regarding videos of harassment incidents in Colorado City and Hildale.	0.90	\$ 265.50	
07/27/2010	SRK	Telephone conversation with Jinjer Cooke regarding videos of harassment incidents in Colorado City.	0.50	\$ 147.50	
07/27/2010	SRK	Review media coverage of Hainline arrests and injunction.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims.
07/28/2010	SRK	Telephone conversations with Erin Byrnes regarding acceptance of service, no stay of superior court action, and mitigation of damages through water connection.	0.60	\$ 177.00	

07/28/2010	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker and Jinjer Cooke concerning a mitigation of damages proposal of a water connection.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
07/28/2010	SRK	Review documents relating to the Hainline injunction faxed from Hainline.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
07/28/2010	SRK	Review transcript of July 22, 2010 telephonic hearing before Judge Lindberg in UEP case.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
07/28/2010	SRK	Review Judge Lindberg's Order partially lifting stay to do discovery, etc. in UEP case due to interference with the UEP.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
07/28/2010	SRK	Review Minute Entry partially lifting stay to do discovery, etc in UEP case.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
07/30/2010	SRK	Review police report of the Hainline arrest.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
07/30/2010	SRK	Draft letters to Blake Hamilton and Erin Byrnes concerning Acceptance of Service.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
08/02/2010	SRK	Draft email to Erin Byrnes concerning Acceptance of Service and providing water service to the Cookes pending litigation.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/03/2010	SRK	Conduct legal research on available reasonable accommodation defenses for municipalities.	3.70	\$ 1,091.50	Reasonable accomodation claims dismissed.	
08/03/2010	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker summarizing reasonable accommodation defenses research.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Reasonable accomodation claims dismissed.	
08/03/2010	SRK	Review Andrew Chatwin's video of Hainline arrest and impounding of truck.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
08/03/2010	SRK	Review video of 3 TV interview with Jinjer Cooke and discuss the same telephonically with Ms. Cooke.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Unreasonable to bill for media	

08/09/2010	SRK	Review letter from Blake Hamilton and Mr. Hamilton's Motion and Proposed Order to Associate Counsel Pro Hac Vice.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
08/09/2010	SRK	Review Notice of Appearance from Erin Byrnes.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/09/2010	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker regarding police report concerning planting at Berry Knoll Farm.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims; internal conference.	
08/09/2010	SRK	Draft letter to Blake Hamilton and Erin Byrnes concerning answer dates and intervention in federal action.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/09/2010	SRK	Draft Response to Mr. Hamilton's Motion for Admission Pro Hac Vice.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/09/2010	SRK	Review information on water availability received from Jethro Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/12/2010	SRK	Review videos of irrigation water incident and DVD of Cooke Family.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
08/12/2010	SRK	Telephone Bill Walker concerning Cooke Family DVD.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/13/2010	SRK	Draft email to Erin Byrnes and Blake Hamilton concerning Acceptance of Service and timing of Defendants' Answers.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/13/2010	SRK	Review Acceptance of Service from Erin Byrnes.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/13/2010	SRK	Draft Notice of Filing Acceptance of Service.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/17/2010	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker regarding a joint prosecution agreement between the State and the Cookes.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
08/19/2010	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow regarding possible discrimination against John Cook.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/19/2010	SRK	Supervise staff to obtain Mohave County water records.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
08/19/2010	SRK	Supervise staff to obtain Corporation Commission water records.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	

08/19/2010	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton regarding Acceptance of Service.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
08/26/2010	SRK	Supervise staff to obtain Arizona Corporation Commission records concerning Twin City Water Works.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
08/26/2010	SRK	Telephone Mohave County Deputy Gary Engles concerning police issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
08/26/2010	SRK	Draft Letter to Mr. Engles regarding police issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
08/26/2010	SRK	Draft letter to Gary Maschner of AZ POST regarding police issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
08/26/2010	SRK	Review Joint Management Agreement for Water in Twin Cities.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
08/26/2010	SRK	Supervise staff to obtain Mohave County Recorder records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
08/26/2010	SRK	Review documents from Arizona Corporation Commission reflecting cancellation of Twin Cit Water Works' CC&N.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
09/08/2010	SRK	Review email from Erin Byrnes regarding the stipulation for the State to intervene in the Cookes' federal court action and draft reply to Ms. Burns.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
09/08/2010	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker summarizing legal research on intervening in federal actions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/21/2010	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Dana Mulhauser of the DOJ regarding locating federal records for Twin City Water Works.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Not related to claims.	
09/23/2010	SRK	Legal research on federal Fair Housing Act provisions on intervention in federal court.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
09/23/2010	SRK	Legal research on permissive intervention under the Federal Rules of Civil Procedure.	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
09/23/2010	SRK	Begin to draft stipulated motion for the State to intervene in the Cookes' federal law suit.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
09/23/2010	SRK	Draft complaint in intervention.	1.20	\$ 354.00		

09/24/2010	SRK	Legal research on intervention in federal court.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
09/24/2010	SRK	Continue to draft stipulated motion to intervene.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
09/25/2010	SRK	Continue to draft stipulated motion to intervene.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
09/27/2010	SRK	Draft proposed Order granting stipulated motion to intervene.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
09/27/2010	SRK	Revise stipulated motion to intervene.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
09/27/2010	SRK	Confer with AGO Section Chief Ann Hobart regarding stipulated motion.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/27/2010	SRK	Exchange emails with Erin Byrnes regarding motion to intervene.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
09/27/2010	SRK	Draft email to Erin Byrnes, Blake Hamilton, and Bill Walker regarding stipulated motion to intervene and order.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Excessive.	
09/28/2010	SRK	Review police report regarding 6/26/10 bulldozer incident.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
09/28/2010	SRK	Meet with Jinjer and Ron Cooke to discuss case status.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
09/29/2010	SRK	Telephone call from Erin Byrnes and Blake Hamilton regarding the stipulated motion to intervene.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/29/2010	SRK	Revise motion to intervene and proposed order.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
09/29/2010	SRK	Email Erin Byrnes, Blake Hamilton, and Bill Walker the revised motion to intervene and proposed order.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
09/29/2010	SRK	Review Defendants' Answers to the Cookes' federal lawsuit.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Not a party of the Federal lawsuit on this date.	
09/29/2010	SRK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker about Defendants' Answers to the Cookes' federal lawsuit.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not a party of the Federal lawsuit on this date.	
09/29/2010	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart regarding Defendants' Answers to the Cookes' federal lawsuit.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not a party of the Federal lawsuit on this date.	

09/30/2010	SRK	Review emails from Erin Byrnes and Blake Hamilton authorizing filing the stipulated motion to intervene and proposed order.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
09/30/2010	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke concerning motion to intervene.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/01/2010	SRK	Review case management conference order in Cooke federal action and docket deadlines.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Not a party of the Federal lawsuit on this date.	
10/01/2010	SRK	Confer with Bill Walker and his staff regarding preparing joint amended complaint.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/07/2010	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Bill Walker, Erin Byrnes, and Blake Hamilton regarding the Rule 16 Conference Order.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
10/07/2010	SRK	Draft stipulation to reschedule the Rule 16 Conference.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/08/2010	SRK	Draft proposed order rescheduling Rule 16 Conference.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/08/2010	SRK	Revise stipulation to reschedule the Rule 16 Scheduling Conference.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/08/2010	SRK	Draft email to all counsel forwarding proposed Stipulation and Order to reschedule the Rule 16 Scheduling Conference.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/08/2010	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker regarding drafting the joint amended complaint.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
10/08/2010	SRK	Draft Joint Amended Complaint.	4.20	\$ 1,239.00		
10/12/2010	SRK	Draft email to Erin Byrnes, Lisa Wahlin, Blake Hamilton, and Bill Walker regarding stipulation and proposed order regarding the Rule 16 Scheduling Conference.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/12/2010	SRK	Telephone conversation with Jinjer Cooke regarding intimidation by helicopter overhead.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
10/12/2010	SRK	Email Bill Walker and Bill Richards regarding Jinjer Cooke's allegations of intimidation by helicopter.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	

10/13/2010	SRK	Email and telephonic communications with Bill Walker, Erin Byrnes, and Blake Hamilton approving finalizing and filing the stipulation and proposed order to reschedule the Rule 16 Conference.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/15/2010	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker and Jinjer Cooke regarding drafting Joint Amended Complaint.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/15/2010	SRK	Draft Joint Amended Complaint.	4.90	\$ 1,445.50		
10/18/2010	SRK	Confer with Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Division Chief Counsel Melanie Pate, and Ann Hobart regarding revisions to draft Joint Amended Complaint and revise draft accordingly.	1.60	\$ 472.00	Internal conference.	
10/20/2010	SRK	Review orders relating to the scheduling conference.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/20/2010	SRK	Review applicable federal rules for scheduling conference, scheduling order, and initial disclosures.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
10/20/2010	SRK	Docket deadlines.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
10/21/2010	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Bill Walker regarding the case management plan.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
10/21/2010	SRK	Email all counsel about scheduling the Rule 26(f) case management meeting.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/22/2010	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Bill Walker, Erin Byrnes, and Blake Hamilton regarding scheduling the Rule 26(f) conference.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
10/25/2010	SRK	Review Defendants' Answers to the Joint Amended Complaint.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/26/2010	SRK	Draft stipulation and proposed order to dismiss superior court action.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
10/26/2010	SRK	Prepare for interview of witness John Cooke.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

10/26/2010	SRK	Begin to draft email to Blake Hamilton, Erin Byrnes, and Lisa Wahlin about the stipulation and proposed order to dismiss the superior court action.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/27/2010	SRK	Continue to draft email to defense counsel, Erin Byrnes, Lisa Wahlin, and Blake Hamilton concerning stipulation and proposed order to dismiss superior court action.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/27/2010	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton concerning stipulation to dismiss.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/27/2010	SRK	Telephone interview of John Cook.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/27/2010	SRK	Revise stipulation to dismiss superior court action.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/01/2010	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Erin Byrne concerning conference call.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/02/2010	SRK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker regarding Rule 16 meeting.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/04/2010	SRK	Meet with Bill Walker to discuss Case Management Plan.	3.00	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
11/05/2010	SRK	Review video of FLDS.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
11/08/2010	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Erin Byrnes concerning scheduling initial disclosure deadline.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
11/10/2010	SRK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker to discuss Colorado City onsite.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/11/2010	SRK	Exchange emails with Erin Byrnes about the Joint Case Management Plan.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/12/2010	SRK	Draft Joint Case Management Plan.	2.30	\$ 678.50		
11/12/2010	SRK	Meet with Bill Walker to discuss Joint Case Management Plan and Joint Prosecution Agreement.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
11/12/2010	SRK	Conference call with all counsel to discuss Joint Case Management Plan.	1.50	\$ 442.50		

11/15/2010	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker concerning the Joint Case Management Plan.	1.40	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.	
11/15/2010	SRK	Review email from Erin Byrnes attaching proposed revised draft Joint Case Management Plan.	1.60	\$ 472.00		
11/15/2010	SRK	Review Judge Teilborg's standing Rule 16 scheduling order.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
11/15/2010	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Richards concerning related cases to include in Joint Case Management Plan.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
11/15/2010	SRK	Revise draft Joint Case Management Plan.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
11/16/2010	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker containing Cooke Plaintiffs' statement of the case.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
11/16/2010	SRK	Telephone Bill Walker to discuss Joint Case Management Plan.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/16/2010	SRK	Revise Joint Case Management Plan.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
11/16/2010	SRK	Email Defendants' attorneys with Plaintiffs' dates for Joint Case Management Plan.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/16/2010	SRK	Telephone call from Erin Byrnes to discuss dates for Joint Case Management Plan.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/17/2010	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker to discuss on site to Colorado City and Joint Case Management Plan.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
11/17/2010	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards to discuss Joint Case Management Plan.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/17/2010	SRK	Review Joint Amended Complaint to prepare to draft the nature of the case statement for the Joint Case Management Plan.	2.10	\$ 619.50		
11/18/2010	SRK	Continue to draft Joint Case Management.	3.10	\$ 914.50		
11/18/2010	SRK	Review emails and attached documents from Jinjer Cooke.	2.50	\$ 737.50		

11/18/2010	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker concerning the documents received from Ms. Cooke.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.
11/19/2010	SRK	Email Erin Byrnes with Plaintiffs' inserts for Joint Case Management Plan.	1.30	\$ 383.50	
11/19/2010	SRK	Continue to draft Joint Case Management Plan.	5.80	\$ 1,711.00	
11/22/2010	SRK	Review email from Jinjer Cooke concerning Warren Jeffs' October 2009 revelation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
11/22/2010	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker to discuss witness interviews.	1.40	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.
11/22/2010	SRK	Email Bill Walker concerning various categories of documents.	2.20	\$ 649.00	Internal conference.
11/22/2010	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker concerning meeting with Zach Renstrom.	0.50	\$ 147.50	
11/22/2010	SRK	Prepare for conference call with Zach Renstrom.	0.60	\$ 177.00	
11/22/2010	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart concerning Joint Prosecution Agreement and related legal issues.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.
11/23/2010	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and water expert Zachary Renstrom.	1.00	\$ 295.00	
11/23/2010	SRK	Review water agreements and related documents.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00	
11/23/2010	SRK	Email Bill Walker concerning water agreements and related documents.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Excessive; internal conference.
11/24/2010	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about onsite observations of new buildings and water connections in Colorado City and Hildale.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
11/24/2010	SRK	Review water agreements.	1.10	\$ 324.50	
11/24/2010	SRK	Email Bill Walker concerning water agreements.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.
11/28/2010	SRK	Prepare for Rule 16 hearing.	1.70	\$ 501.50	
11/28/2010	SRK	Legal research on elements of Plaintiffs' causes of action.	3.10	\$ 914.50	
11/29/2010	SRK	Meet with Bill Walker to prepare for Rule 16 Scheduling Conference.	0.60	\$ 177.00	

11/29/2010	SRK	Appear at Rule 16 Scheduling Conference.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/29/2010	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker concerning Ron Cooke's medical information and housing needs.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed.	
11/29/2010	SRK	Review Jethro Barlow interview summary.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/29/2010	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker attaching CV from potential consultant or expert.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Vague, if related to reasonable accommodation claims, they were dismissed; internal conference.	
11/29/2010	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart regarding Rule 16 Scheduling Conference.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed; internal conference.	
11/29/2010	SRK	Review Ron Cooke's medical records.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed.	
11/29/2010	SRK	Review interview of Dr. Alcott, one Mr. Cooke's doctors	0.40	\$ 118.00	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed.	
11/30/2010	SRK	Prepare initial disclosures.	4.20	\$ 1,239.00		
11/30/2010	SRK	Email Bill Walker about an FLDS proclamation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
12/01/2010	SRK	Review videos of Thanksgiving day water pump problems for the Cookes.	1.10	\$ 324.50		
12/01/2010	SRK	Begin to review administrative file to prepare initial disclosures.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/02/2010	SRK	Review videos of Thanksgiving day water pump problems for the Cookes.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
12/02/2010	SRK	Confer with Charlotte Haught about editing videos.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/03/2010	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke about a police report.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
12/07/2010	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart regarding initial disclosure statement.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Internal conference.	
12/07/2010	SRK	Review administrative file to prepare initial disclosures and begin to draft initial disclosure statement.	2.50	\$ 737.50		

12/08/2010	SRK	Review administrative file to prepare initial disclosures.	2.80	\$ 826.00		
12/08/2010	SRK	Draft initial disclosure statement.	3.80	\$ 1,121.00		
12/08/2010	SRK	Confer with investigator for the administrative investigation to prepare for witness interviews	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/08/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of Richard Holm.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
12/09/2010	SRK	Supervise staff to prepare audio and video recordings for initial disclosure.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
12/09/2010	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker to discuss initial disclosures and damages.	1.80	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.	
12/09/2010	SRK	Continue to review administrative file to prepare initial disclosures.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
12/09/2010	SRK	Review emails from Blake Hamilton and Lisa Wahlin regarding initial disclosures.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
12/09/2010	SRK	Draft initial disclosure statement.	7.00	\$ 2,065.00		
12/10/2010	SRK	Continue to review administrative file to prepare initial disclosures.	6.70	\$ 1,976.50		
12/10/2010	SRK	Supervise staff to prepare audio and video recordings for initial disclosure.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
12/10/2010	SRK	Confer with Melanie Pate and Ann Hobart regarding disclosures.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
12/11/2010	SRK	Draft State of Arizona's Rule 26(a) Initial Disclosure Statement.	6.80	\$ 2,006.00		
12/12/2010	SRK	Draft State of Arizona's Rule 26(a) Initial Disclosure Statement.	8.80	\$ 2,596.00	Excessive.	
12/13/2010	SRK	Continue to review administrative file to prepare initial disclosures.	4.30	\$ 1,268.50		
12/13/2010	SRK	Draft State of Arizona's Rule 26(a) Initial Disclosure Statement.	6.70	\$ 1,976.50	Excessive.	
12/14/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of Katie Cox.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/14/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of Jethro Barlow.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/14/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of Richard Holm.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
12/14/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of Travis Fox.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
12/14/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of Jeff Vaughn.	0.70	\$ 206.50		

12/14/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of John Cook.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/14/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of Jinjer Cooke.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/14/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of Andrew Chatwin.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
12/14/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of Isaac Wyler.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
12/16/2010	SRK	Supervise creating DVDs of administrative interviews for production.	1.40	\$ 413.00	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
12/16/2010	SRK	Review documents relating to criminal citation of Shane Cooke.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
12/16/2010	SRK	Review transcript of ruling from Judge Benson in the FLDS's Utah District Court action against the UEP.	2.10	\$ 619.50	Not related to claims.	
12/16/2010	SRK	Continue to review administrative file to prepare initial disclosures.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
12/17/2010	SRK	Begin to review Colorado City's Initial Disclosure Statement.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
12/17/2010	SRK	Review recorded interviews from the the administrative investigation for disclosure.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
12/17/2010	SRK	Meet with Melanie Pate and Ann Hobart to discuss disclosures.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/17/2010	SRK	Legal research regarding disclosure obligations.	3.20	\$ 944.00		
12/17/2010	SRK	Supervise creating DVDs of administrative interviews for production.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
12/20/2010	SRK	Telephonic interview of Shane Stubbs.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
12/20/2010	SRK	Supervise creating DVDs of administrative interviews for production.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
12/21/2010	SRK	Supervise creating DVDs of administrative interviews for production.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
12/22/2010	SRK	Review recorded interviews from the administrative investigation for disclosure.	0.80	\$ 236.00		

12/22/2010	SRK	Review Defendant Town of Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum to Bush & Gudgell.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/22/2010	SRK	Telephonic communications with Bill Walker and Jeff Shields concerning the subpoenas duces tecum to Bush & Gudgell and to Aqual Engineering.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
12/22/2010	SRK	Review Defendant Town of Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum to Aqual Engineering.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/22/2010	SRK	Review supplemental disclosure from Plaintiffs Ron and Jinjer Cooke.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/22/2010	SRK	Review documents attached to disclosure statement of Hildale Defendants.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
12/27/2010	SRK	Review Mohave County Sheriff's Dept. Report of the Shane Stubbs July 2010 incident.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.	
12/27/2010	SRK	Draft First Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	3.70	\$ 1,091.50		
12/28/2010	SRK	Review materials received from Jinjer Cooke.	2.20	\$ 649.00		
12/28/2010	SRK	Draft First Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
12/28/2010	SRK	Meet with Melanie Pate and Ann Hobart to discuss disclosures.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
12/28/2010	SRK	Draft letter to counsel regarding State's First Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/28/2010	SRK	Revise Joint Prosecution Agreement.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Clerical.	
12/28/2010	SRK	Review DVD for production with First Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
12/29/2010	SRK	Revise Joint Prosecution Agreement.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Clerical.	
12/29/2010	SRK	Email Bill Walker attaching and explaining draft Joint Prosecution Agreement.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/29/2010	SRK	Plan discovery.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Vague.	

01/11/2011	SRK	Review minute entry on hearing on Bush & Gudgell objection to Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/13/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker regarding disclosures.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/18/2011	SRK	Review and sign Joint Prosecution Agreement.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Clerical.	
01/18/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker and the Cookes enclosing Joint Prosecution Agreement.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
01/18/2011	SRK	Review Notices of Deposition for Ron and Jinjer Cooke.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/18/2011	SRK	Review email from Erin Byrnes requesting color version of map produced with initial disclosures.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/18/2011	SRK	Review file for color maps to supplement disclosures.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
01/19/2011	SRK	Email communications with Erin Byrnes providing her with a color overlay map that she requested.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/19/2011	SRK	Written communications with Lisa Wahlin regarding interviews with Jerry Barlow during the administrative investigation.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/19/2011	SRK	Review recordings of Jerry Barlow's administrative interviews to respond to Ms. Wahlin's inquiry.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
01/19/2011	SRK	Draft interrogatories and request for production of documents.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
01/19/2011	SRK	Review documents disclosed by Colorado City.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
01/19/2011	SRK	Review Town of Colorado City's First Request for Production and First Set of Non-Uniform Interrogatories to Plaintiffs.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/19/2011	SRK	Review Town of Colorado City's First Request for Production to State of Arizona.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/24/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Jinjer Cooke regarding responding to discovery requests.	1.30	\$ 383.50		

01/25/2011	SRK	Review records relating to Jerry Barlow.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/25/2011	SRK	Review legal memorandum from law clerk David Amundsen on elements of proof for a disparate treatment claim against a municipality.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/25/2011	SRK	Telephone conversations with Jinjer Cooke about responding to Defendants' discovery requests.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/26/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker and attached medical records from Dr. Klebe.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference; reasonable accomodation claim dismissed.	
01/27/2011	SRK	Telephone communications with Jinjer Cooke about responding to Colorado City's document request.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/27/2011	SRK	Supervise gathering documents responsive to Colorado City's document request.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
01/28/2011	SRK	Supervise gathering documents responsive to Colorado City's document request.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
02/01/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City's initial disclosures.	6.30	\$ 1,858.50		
02/02/2011	SRK	Supervise gathering documents responsive to Colorado City's document request.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
02/02/2011	SRK	Review documents that may be responsive to Colorado City's document request.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
02/02/2011	SRK	Review UEP Special Fiduciary's 12/31/10 Report and attachments.	5.80	\$ 1,711.00	Not related to claims.	
02/02/2011	CH	respond to Sandra Kane's e-mail requesting documents related to the Deft's RFP for communications re subject property	2.5	\$ 312.50	Internal conference.	
02/04/2011	SRK	Call Matt Evans of Ray Quinney to request copy of transcript showing available city water records.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
02/04/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate law clerk's research on proving discriminatory animus of governmental defendants.	2.10	\$ 619.50		

02/04/2011	SRK	Telephonic and written communications with Bush & Gudgell attorneys regarding the UEPs objections to Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum to Bush & Gudgell.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
02/04/2011	SRK	Review Town of Colorado City's First Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	1.10	\$ 324.50		
02/04/2011	SRK	Review UEP's Motion to Quash Subpoena Duces Tecum to Bush & Gudgell.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
02/04/2011	SRK	Review Town of Colorado City's Motion to Strike the UEP's Motion to Quash.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
02/05/2011	SRK	Draft Interrogatories and Requests for Production of Documents to Defendants.	6.50	\$ 1,917.50		
02/07/2011	SRK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker to prepare for hearing on Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum to Bush & Gudgell.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
02/07/2011	SRK	Appear at the hearing on UEP's Motion to Quash Subpoena Duces Tecum to Bush & Gudgell.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
02/07/2011	SRK	Draft Interrogatories and Requests for Production of Documents to Defendants.	4.90	\$ 1,445.50	Excessive.	
02/08/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker regarding topics for written discovery to Defendants and preparing for the depositions of Ron and Jinjer Cooke.	4.50	\$ 1,327.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/08/2011	SRK	Draft interrogatories and requests for production of documents to Defendants.	2.80	\$ 826.00	Excessive.	
02/09/2011	SRK	Visit Texas anti-FLDS website for information on recent expulsion of top FLDS officials.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Not related to claims.	
02/10/2011	SRK	Email communications with Lisa Wahlin regarding report from Lou Rivera.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed	

02/10/2011	SRK	Revise Interrogatories to Defendants.	1.10	\$ 324.50		
02/10/2011	SRK	Review fax from SCF of Arizona.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed	
02/10/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker attaching Dr. Alcott's medical records.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed	
02/10/2011	SRK	Email Lisa Wahlin regarding unredacted document from SCF of Arizona.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed	
02/11/2011	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker regarding preparing for Ron and Jinjer Cooke's depositions.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
02/11/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker with Ron Cooke's handwritten notes.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/11/2011	SRK	Review documents disclosed by Town of Colorado City in preparation for depositions of Ron and Jinjer Cooke.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
02/12/2011	SRK	Review documents disclosed by Defendant Colorado City.	3.20	\$ 944.00		
02/12/2011	SRK	Meet with Bill Walker, Ron Cooke and Jinjer Cooke to prepare for the Cookes' depositions.	6.70	\$ 1,976.50		
02/12/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker to discuss the Cookes' depositions.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
02/13/2011	SRK	Meet with Bill Walker and Plaintiffs Ron and Jinjer Cooke to prepare for their depositions.	9.00	\$ 2,655.00		
02/16/2011	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker about finalizing discovery requests to Defendants and scheduling depositions.	1.40	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.	
02/16/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Bill Walker's office regarding scheduling depositions.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
02/16/2011	SRK	Confer with Melanie Pate about scheduling depositions.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
02/17/2011	SRK	Review letter from Bill Walker's office about scheduling depositions and discovery responses.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

02/17/2011	SRK	Revise Interrogatories, Request for Production of Documents, and Request for Admissions to Defendants.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
02/17/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Erin Byrnes about an extension to respond to Colorado City's discovery requests.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/18/2011	SRK	Supervise assembling electronic documents for response to Defendant Colorado City's Request for Production of Documents.	2.40	\$ 708.00	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
02/18/2011	SRK	Draft First Set of Non-Uniform Interrogatories, First Request for Production of Documents, and First Requests for Admission to Defendants.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Excessive.	
02/19/2011	SRK	Draft Requests for Production to Defendants.	3.20	\$ 944.00	Excessive.	
02/19/2011	SRK	Revise First Set of Non-Uniform Interrogatories, First Request for Production of Documents, and First Requests for Admission to Defendants.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Excessive.	
02/19/2011	SRK	Draft separate Notices of Service of discovery requests to Defendant Colorado City and to the Hildale Defendants	1.10	\$ 324.50		
02/20/2011	SRK	Review file to prepare to respond to Colorado City's First Set of Requests for Production to State of Arizona.	4.10	\$ 1,209.50		
02/20/2011	SRK	Draft Response to Colorado City's First Set of Requests for Production.	2.70	\$ 796.50		
02/21/2011	SRK	Draft Response to Colorado City's Request for Production.	5.10	\$ 1,504.50		
02/21/2011	SRK	Review file to prepare to respond to Colorado City's First Set of Requests for Production to State of Arizona.	2.90	\$ 855.50		
02/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about discovery issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	

02/22/2011	SRK	Revise and finalize State of Arizona's Requests for Admissions, Requests for Production of Documents, and First Set of Non-Uniform Interrogatories to Defendant Town of Colorado City and to Hildale Defendants.	5.20	\$ 1,534.00	Excessive.	
02/22/2011	SRK	Review file to prepare response to Colorado City's Request for Production.	2.60	\$ 767.00		
02/23/2011	SRK	Review file for documents responsive to Colorado City's First Request for Production of Documents.	11.00	\$ 3,245.00		
02/24/2011	SRK	Review file for documents responsive to Colorado City's First Request for Production of Documents.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
02/24/2011	SRK	Revise Response to Defendant Town of Colorado City's Request for Production.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
02/25/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker's Office attaching copies of Plaintiffs' Answer to Defendant Town of Colorado City's First Set of Non-Uniform Interrogatories, Plaintiffs' Response to Defendant Town of Colorado City's First Set of Requests for Production of Interrogatories, and Plaintiffs' Response to Defendant Town of Colorado City's First Set of Requests for Production of Documents.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
02/26/2011	SRK	Review Joint Amended Complaint.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/26/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about amendment deadline.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
02/28/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about developments in FLDS federal lawsuit, amendment of complaint, and discovery.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Not related to claims.	

03/07/2011	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker regarding deposition scheduling and FLDS warning dated 2/5/11.	1.70	\$ 501.50	Not related to claims.
03/07/2011	SRK	Review FLDS Warning dated 2/5/11.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Not related to claims.
03/10/2011	SRK	Review original Warning to the Nation and Petition to the President issued by FLDS to Gov. Brewer with signature pages.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Not related to claims.
03/10/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker attaching letter from Erin Byrnes about proposed depositions in Colorado City.	0.80	\$ 236.00	
03/10/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke about dismissal of City employee after removed from FLDS.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.
03/10/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke about new developments following FLDS warning.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.
03/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jethro Barlow;	0.30	\$ 88.50	
03/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Isaac Wyler;	0.40	\$ 118.00	
03/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Doug Nick;	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
03/11/2011	SRK	Meeting with Gerald Richard re warning;	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.
03/11/2011	SRK	Conference with Melanie Pate re Warning;	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
03/14/2011	SRK	Confer with Melanie Pate re incidents in Colorado City since adverse ruling in the FLDS case against the UEP.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
03/14/2011	SRK	Review "attention squatters" notice.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.
03/14/2011	SRK	Communications with AAG Mike Hinson about vineyard in back of Cookes' home and other incidents.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
03/14/2011	SRK	Review email from Erin Byrnes about scheduling depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
03/14/2011	SRK	Review email from Bruce Wisan about lawsuit filed against UEP and Bruce Wisan by Town of Colorado City.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.

03/14/2011	SRK	Confer with Melanie Pate Colorado City's lawsuit against UEP and Wisan.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
03/14/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Mike Hinson about Colorado City's lawsuit against UEP and Wisan.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.
03/14/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker Colorado City's lawsuit against UEP and Wisan and surface water rights.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
03/14/2011	SRK	Review pleadings concerning surface water rights.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
03/14/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about UEP surface water rights;	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
03/14/2011	SRK	Email Melanie Pate about Colorado City lawsuit against UEP and Bruce Wisan.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.
03/14/2011	SRK	Email Bill Richards about Colorado City lawsuit against UEP and Bruce Wisan.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.
03/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke regarding the vineyard and incidents of rock throwing.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
03/15/2011	SRK	Review letter from Erin Byrnes with courtesy copies of subpoenas to Ron Cooke's doctors.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed
03/15/2011	SRK	Draft emails to Bill Walker and Jinjer Cooke regarding Ron Cooke's doctors.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed
03/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Melanie Pate about Colorado City's lawsuit against UEP and Bruce Wisan.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
03/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker regarding preparing for depositions.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
03/17/2011	SRK	Review affidavits of Service of Subpoenas on Drs. Shama, Worthington, Klebe, Wang, Alcott, Fernando, and Francis.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed
03/17/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker concerning depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
03/17/2011	SRK	Confer with Melane Pate regarding deposition scheduling.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
03/22/2011	SRK	Email Jethro Barlow regarding public records request.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.

03/23/2011	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow regarding public records request.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
03/23/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Erin Byrnes regarding her request for additional time to respond to discovery.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
03/23/2011	SRK	Review DVDs received from Jinjer Cooke.	4.50	\$ 1,327.50		
03/23/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City's declaratory judgment complaint against the UEP and Wisan.	1.70	\$ 501.50	Not related to claims.	
03/23/2011	SRK	Memorandum to Melanie Pate and Ann Hobart re Hildale water bottling plant.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/24/2011	SRK	Review emails from Jinjer Cooke attaching video logs.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
03/24/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke to discuss video logs.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/24/2011	SRK	Review Judge Teilborg decision in earlier UEP case and email Bill Walker regarding same.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.	
03/28/2011	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Response to the State's First Requests for Admission.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
03/28/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City's Response to the State's first set of discovery requests.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/28/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker about Defendants' discovery responses.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/29/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker about discovery issues.	2.70	\$ 796.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
03/29/2011	SRK	Continue to review and evaluate Hildale Defendants' Response to the State's First Requests for Admission.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
03/29/2011	SRK	Research federal rules on responding to discovery.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
03/29/2011	SRK	Telephone conversations with Blake Hamilton regarding Hildale Defendants' deficient discovery responses.	1.80	\$ 531.00		

03/29/2011	SRK	Draft letter to Blake Hamilton regarding Hildale Defendants' deficient discovery responses.	1.60	\$ 472.00		
03/31/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate Colorado City's reservation of rights letter.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
04/01/2011	SRK	Review and consider article about control of the FLDS Church.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
04/01/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker about Colorado City's discovery responses.	0.90	\$ 265.50	Internal conference.	
04/10/2011	SRK	Review police report about theft of Cooke's 4-wheeler and discuss same with Jinjer Cooke.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/26/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Mike Parrish's Office to inquire about status of Colorado City lawsuit against the UEP and Bruce Wisan.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
05/02/2011	SRK	Review and analyze the Answer and pre-trial conference Order in Colorado City's lawsuit against the UEP and Bruce Wisan.	2.10	\$ 619.50	Not related to claims.	
05/02/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker regarding the Answer and pre-trial conference Order in Colorado City's lawsuit against the UEP and Bruce Wisan.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
05/04/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Mike Parrish to discuss status of Colorado City lawsuit against UEP and Bruce Wisan.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims.	
05/10/2011	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Shields and Bill Walker about new water report from Zach Renstrom.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
05/24/2011	CH	meet with S. Kane to discuss status of case, case organization, discovery needs	1.4	\$ 175.00	Internal conference.	
05/24/2011	CH	emails with Sandra; edits to document index	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
05/24/2011	CH	create document index	1.0	\$ 125.00	Clerical.	
05/27/2011	SRK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker about discovery strategy.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/27/2011	SRK	Review Notice of Withdrawal of Lisa Wahlin.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

05/31/2011	SRK	Review and analyze Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum to the Attorney General's Office.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
05/31/2011	SRK	Research appropriateness of use of subpoena duces tecum with a party.	2.20	\$ 649.00		
05/31/2011	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart about responding to Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum to the Attorney General's Office.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
05/31/2011	SRK	Draft letter to Jeff Matura and Erin Byrnes objecting to Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum.	1.60	\$ 472.00		
06/01/2011	SRK	Written communications with Jeff Matura and Erin Byrnes concerning the State's objections to Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
06/01/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker about planning for depositions.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
06/01/2011	SRK	Email all counsel to propose a telephonic meeting to schedule depositions and discuss Defendants' responses to the State's discovery requests.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/01/2011	CH	organize documents on I drive; locate disclosures; begin indexing documents disclosed by State	3.4	\$ 425.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/02/2011	CH	index documents	0.7	\$ 87.50	Clerical.	
06/02/2011	CH	index documents	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical.	
06/02/2011	CH	index documents	1.1	\$ 137.50	Clerical.	
06/03/2011	SRK	Meet with Ann Hobart to discuss producing documents from the administrative investigation file.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/03/2011	SRK	Review administrative file to respond to Colorado City's request for documents.	5.70	\$ 1,681.50		
06/03/2011	SRK	Email Jeff Matura about disclosing additional documents from the administrative file.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/03/2011	SRK	Email Blake Hamilton about the meeting to discuss discovery issues relating to the Hildale Defendants.	0.40	\$ 118.00		

06/07/2011	SRK	Research likelihood of sanctions for making general objections to interrogatories.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
06/07/2011	CH	prepare for supplemental disclosure: determine last bates number used; bates docs and index	0.4	\$ 50.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/07/2011	CH	telephone call with S. Kane re supplemental disclosure	0.1	\$ 12.50	Internal conference.	
06/07/2011	CH	index documents	1.7	\$ 212.50	Clerical.	
06/09/2011	SRK	Supervise staff regarding responding to Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum.	0.90	\$ 265.50	Excessive.	
06/09/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate Defendants' discovery responses.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
06/09/2011	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker about discovery issues.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
06/09/2011	SRK	Revise Second Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
06/09/2011	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton about discovery meeting.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/09/2011	CH	finish indexing documents for the 2nd supplemental disclosure; draft 2nd supplemental disclosure	1.1	\$ 110.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
06/09/2011	CH	index documents	2.6	\$ 325.00	Clerical.	
06/09/2011	CH	respond to S. Kane's email re transcript	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
06/10/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate law clerk Sean Berens legal research on the sufficiency of Defendants' discovery responses.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
06/10/2011	SRK	Confer with Charlotte Haught about Second Supplemental Disclosure Statement and producing related documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/10/2011	SRK	Revise Second Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
06/10/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate Colorado City's answers to State's Request for Production and Non-Uniform Interrogatories.	3.20	\$ 944.00		

06/10/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Jeff Matura, and Blake Hamilton to schedule depositions and discuss deficiencies in Defendants' responses to the State's requests for admission, and email communications with Mr. Matura and Mr. Hamilton relating to the same.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
06/10/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker to plan discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/10/2011	SRK	Draft Notice of Service of Second Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/10/2011	SRK	Draft letter to Jeff Matura responding to Colorado City's subpoena duces tecum.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/10/2011	CH	index documents	2.1	\$ 262.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/10/2011	CH	index documents	1.3	\$ 162.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/10/2011	CH	telephone call with S. Kane re disclosure; edits to disclosure; draft Notice of Service; burn CD's of docs	1.1	\$ 137.50	Internal conference.	
06/13/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker regarding Colorado City's deficient discovery responses.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
06/13/2011	SRK	Conference Call with Jeff Matura concerning Colorado City's insufficient responses to the State's First Set of Non-Uniform Interrogatories and the State's First Request for Production of Documents.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
06/13/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker to plan discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/13/2011	CH	index documents	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/13/2011	CH	index documents	1.3	\$ 162.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/14/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City's Notice of Service of Supplemental Disclosures.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/14/2011	SRK	Email Jeff Matura about deposition scheduling.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

06/14/2011	SRK	Review Defendants' Rule 30(b)(6) Notice of Deposition and subpoena duces tecum to Twin City Water Works.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/14/2011	SRK	Telephone calls from expert Zach Renstrom	0.40	\$ 118.00		
06/14/2011	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Notice of Service, Response to State's First Request for Production, and Response to State's First Set of Non-Uniform Interrogatories.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/14/2011	SRK	Legal research on grounds to quash the subpoena duces tecum and Notice of Deposition to Twin City Water Works.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/14/2011	SRK	Review documents produced by Hildale Defendants in response to State's Request for Production of Documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/14/2011	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Response to State's First Set of Non-Uniform Interrogatories.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/14/2011	CH	index documents	2.9	\$ 362.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/14/2011	CH	index documents	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical; vague.	
06/14/2011	CH	index documents	0.6	\$ 75.00	Clerical; vague.	
06/15/2011	SRK	Confer with Charlotte Haught regarding discovery received from Defendants.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; duplicative.	
06/15/2011	CH	telephone call with S. Kane re case update	0.5	\$ 62.50	Internal conference; duplicative.	
06/15/2011	CH	index documents	1.4	\$ 175.00	Clerical; vague.	
06/15/2011	CH	index documents	1.2	\$ 150.00	Clerical; vague.	
06/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about Hildale Defendants' subpoena duces tecum and Notice of Deposition to Twin City Water Works.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/16/2011	SRK	Email Blake Hamilton about availability for deposition of Twin City Water Works representative.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/16/2011	CH	index documents	2.7	\$ 337.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/16/2011	CH	index documents; telephone call with Sandra	0.6	\$ 60.00	Internal conference; block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.

06/17/2011	CH	index documents	2.0	\$ 250.00	Clerical; vague.	
06/20/2011	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton about revised responses to requests for admission.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
06/20/2011	CH	index documents	2.6	\$ 325.00	Clerical; vague.	
06/21/2011	SRK	Review notice of withdrawal of attorney re Erin Byrnes.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/21/2011	CH	index documents	1.7	\$ 212.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/22/2011	SRK	Review UEP's Motion to Quash Hildale Defendants' Subpoena Duces Tecum.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/22/2011	SRK	Research sufficiency of Subpoena Duces Tecum.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
06/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker about the UEP's Motion to Quash.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Matura's office to follow up on discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/22/2011	CH	index documents	0.4	\$ 50.00	Clerical; vague.	
06/23/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker concerning discovery issues, including deposition scheduling.	0.90	\$ 265.50	Internal conference.	
06/23/2011	SRK	Review documents produced by UEP in response to Hildale Defendants' subpoena duces tecum.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
06/23/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about UEP documents produced to Hildale Defendants.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/23/2011	SRK	Confer with Charlotte Haught about document indexing.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Duplicative; internal conference.	
06/23/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra to discuss progress on indexing documents; review and index documents	0.7	\$ 70.00	Duplicative; block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
06/23/2011	CH	index documents	1.5	\$ 187.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/24/2011	SRK	Email Jeff Matura about incomplete discovery responses.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
06/24/2011	CH	index documents	3.7	\$ 462.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/27/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton concerning discovery.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
06/27/2011	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Walker about discovery strategy.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/27/2011	CH	index documents	2.0	\$ 250.00	Clerical; vague.	

06/27/2011	CH	index documents	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical; vague.	
06/28/2011	SRK	Email exchange with Charlotte Haught concerning updating the file with, among other things, the Western States Water Report.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/28/2011	CH	index documents	0.8	\$ 100.00	Clerical; vague.	
06/29/2011	SRK	Review responses to requests for admission from the Hildale Defendants.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/29/2011	SRK	Supervise creation of spreadsheets capturing the discovery responses of the Hildale Defendants.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
06/29/2011	CH	index documents	1.2	\$ 150.00	Clerical; vague.	
06/30/2011	SRK	Review and analyze Hildale Defendants' responses to the State's Interrogatories.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
06/30/2011	SRK	Meet with paralegal Charlotte Haught to discuss document organization.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
06/30/2011	CH	review documents and index	2.1	\$ 262.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/30/2011	CH	meet with Sandra to discuss status of case and discovery progress	1.6	\$ 200.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
06/30/2011	CH	index documents	1.4	\$ 175.00	Clerical; vague.	
07/01/2011	SRK	Review and consider email from Jeff Matura concerning deposition notices.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
07/01/2011	SRK	Review reply to Mr. Matura from Bill Walker.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/01/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura and Notice of Service of Supplemental Discovery Responses from Town of Colorado City.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/01/2011	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton's office enclosing notice of serving a subpoena duces tecum on the UEP Trust.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
07/04/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate Hildale Defendants' Requests for Admission and Interrogatory Answers.	5.80	\$ 1,711.00		
07/04/2011	SRK	Draft letter to Blake Hamilton regarding discovery issues.	2.70	\$ 796.50		
07/05/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about meeting with Zach Renstrom.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

07/05/2011	SRK	Telephone call to expert Zach Renstrom.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
07/05/2011	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Response to State's First Request for Production of Documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/05/2011	SRK	Review and analyze UEP documents.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
07/06/2011	SRK	Draft consultant agreement for out-of-state consultant.	1.60	\$ 472.00	Clerical.	
07/06/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Zach Renstrom concerning his consultant contract.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Clerical.	
07/06/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Jeff Matura to discuss supplemental discovery responses from Colorado City.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
07/06/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about the consulting agreement with Zach Renstrom.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/06/2011	SRK	Email Blake Hamilton about Twin City Water Works deposition and documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/06/2011	SRK	Review and analyze Hildale Defendants' Response to the State's Interrogatories.	2.40	\$ 708.00		
07/07/2011	SRK	Email communications with Zachary Renstrom concerning his consultant agreement.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Clerical.	
07/07/2011	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Walker about Mr. Renstrom's consultant agreement.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
07/07/2011	SRK	Revise Mr. Renstrom's consultant agreement.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Clerical.	
07/07/2011	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Response to the State's First Request for Production of Documents.	1.60	\$ 472.00		
07/07/2011	SRK	Review and analyze Colorado City's Supplemental Response to the State's First Request for Production of Documents.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
07/07/2011	SRK	Supervise organizing responses to Interrogatories and RFA.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	

07/08/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Zachary Renstrom concerning his consultant agreement and expert report.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Clerical.	
07/08/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate research memorandum from legal clerk Sean Berens on propriety of questioning deposition witnesses about their religious affiliation and beliefs.	0.90	\$ 265.50	Clerical.	
07/08/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate Hildale Defendants' Answer to State's First Request for Production of Documents.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
07/08/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker concerning a discovery issue.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/08/2011	SRK	Research serving subpoena duces tecum on Twin City Water Works.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
07/08/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate Colorado City's First Supplemental Response to the State's First Set of Requests for Admissions.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
07/10/2011	SRK	Email communications with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom regarding Mr. Renstrom's expert report and supporting appendices.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
07/10/2011	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Answers to the State's First Request for Production of Documents and Meter Activity Report.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
07/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker concerning Zachary Renstrom's report and documents produced by Hildale Defendants.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/11/2011	CH	index documents	2.9	\$ 362.50	Clerical; vague.	
07/11/2011	CH	index documents	0.8	\$ 100.00	Clerical; vague.	
07/12/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate revised research memorandum from legal clerk Sean Berens on propriety of questioning deposition witnesses about their religious affiliation and beliefs.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
07/12/2011	CH	index documents	1.5	\$ 187.50	Clerical; vague.	

07/13/2011	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker on discovery issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/13/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate Sean Berens' legal research on admissibility of document produced by Defendants.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
07/13/2011	SRK	Confer with AAG Jennifer Larson about preparing subpoena duces tecum to Twin City Water Works.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/13/2011	CH	index documents	2.5	\$ 312.50	Clerical; vague.	
07/14/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker and Mike Parrish regarding amendment of Colorado City case against the UEP and Bruce Wisan to include the Cookes and possible consolidation of Colorado City's case with this case.	2.40	\$ 708.00	Not related to claims.	
07/14/2011	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart regarding same.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
07/14/2011	SRK	Review Zachary Renstrom's May 2011 Water Report.	4.60	\$ 1,357.00		
07/14/2011	CH	review and index documents	0.8	\$ 100.00	Clerical; vague.	
07/14/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra re update on case	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
07/14/2011	CH	look through atty notes; update Important Docs list; index documents	2.2	\$ 275.00	Block billing; clerical; vague.	Objection overruled.
07/15/2011	SRK	Review Case Management Order in Colorado City v. UEP case.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
07/15/2011	SRK	Review water reports to prepare for meeting with Zachary Renstrom;	2.30	\$ 678.50		
07/15/2011	SRK	Meeting with Zachary Renstrom, Bill Walker, and AAG Jennifer Larson about the water situation in Colorado City and Hildale.	5.30	\$ 1,563.50		
07/15/2011	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught about Robert Black.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/15/2011	CH	update master who's who; index documents; telephone call with Sandra Kane	3.6	\$ 360.00	Internal conference; block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
07/15/2011	CH	review FLDS filings for Robert Black signature	0.3	\$ 37.50		

07/18/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Mike Parrish, Tanya Lewis, and Bill Walker concerning claims against the Cookes in Town of Colorado City v. UEP.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Not related to claims.	
07/18/2011	CH	update Who's Who; index documents; email with Sandra	3.0	\$ 300.00	Internal conference; block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
07/19/2011	CH	index documents	3.7	\$ 462.50	Clerical; vague.	
07/20/2011	SRK	Review file for interviews to transcribe and disclosure of recordings of meetings.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
07/20/2011	SRK	Review recording of 12/28/09 Utility Board hearing.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
07/20/2011	SRK	Meet with Charlotte Haught concerning updating disclosures and preparing deposition exhibits.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
07/20/2011	SRK	Telephone calls from Bill Walker and Jinjer Cooke about updating disclosures.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
07/20/2011	SRK	Confer with Jennifer Larson about preparing the subpoena duces tecum to Twin City Water Works.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/20/2011	CH	meet with Sandra to discuss discovery	1.5	\$ 187.50	Duplicative; internal conference.	
07/20/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra	0.1	\$ 12.50	Internal conference.	
07/20/2011	CH	follow up from meeting with Sandra; begin drafting 3rd Supplemental Disclosure	2.0	\$ 250.00	Block billing,	Objection overruled.
07/21/2011	SRK	Email and telephonic communications with Bill Walker about serving deposition witnesses, and the taxes and occupancy fees on UEP property.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
07/21/2011	SRK	Draft Exhibit A to subpoena duces tecum to Twin City Water Works.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
07/21/2011	SRK	Review Corporation Commission records for Twin City Water Works.	2.40	\$ 708.00		
07/21/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Jethro Barlow and Bill Walker about serving TCWW.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

07/21/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker about the subpoena to TCWW.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
07/21/2011	CH	index documents	2.5	\$ 312.50	Clerical; vague.	
07/21/2011	CH	check on process server to use in Utah; read up on rules of subpoenas served out of district	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical; block billing.	Objection overruled.
07/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about subpoenas duces tecum to TCWW and Robert Black, and preparing for depositions.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
07/24/2011	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton about serving TCWW.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/24/2011	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler about FLDS expropriation of UEP properties and building without building permits.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
07/24/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about reported FLDS expropriation of UEP property.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
07/24/2011	SRK	Review documents to prepare for depositions.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
07/25/2011	CH	index documents	4.5	\$ 562.50	Clerical; vague.	
07/26/2011	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker about discovery issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/26/2011	CH	index documents	7.3	\$ 912.50	Clerical; vague.	
07/27/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker and Jinjer Cooke about discovery issues.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
07/27/2011	CH	index documents	4.5	\$ 562.50	Clerical; vague.	
07/28/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about serving deposition subpoenas and scheduling an additional deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Duplicative; internal conference.	
07/28/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker and Zach Renstrom about water issues and scheduling a conference call to discuss water issues.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

07/28/2011	SRK	Meet with Charlotte Haught to discuss status of document review, indexing, and preparing for depositions.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.
07/28/2011	SRK	Telephone call frm Bill Walker about serving a subpoena duces tecum on Robert Black.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
07/28/2011	SRK	Telephone the Mohave County Sheriff's Office about a process server to serve deposition subpoenas.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
07/28/2011	CH	meet with Sandra Kane to discuss status of reviewing documents	1.7	\$ 212.50	Duplicative; internal conference.
07/29/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Sergeant Hoggard about serving process.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
07/29/2011	SRK	Telephone to Bill Walker about serving subpoenas.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
07/29/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke about threat from Warren Jeffs and tensions in Colorado City.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
07/29/2011	CH	index documents	2.0	\$ 250.00	Clerical; vague.
07/29/2011	CH	index documents	1.0	\$ 125.00	Clerical; vague.
08/01/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker about serving subpoenas.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
08/01/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate AAG Jennifer Larson's legal memorandum on whether Colorado City's lawsuit against the UEP and Cookes could be considered retaliatory and email Ms. Larson's research to Bill Walker.	0.80	\$ 236.00	
08/02/2011	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker regarding discovery issues, including serving witnesses.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
08/02/2011	SRK	Email Blake Hamilton regarding TCW documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
08/02/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom concerning water issues and follow-up call from Bill Walker regarding same.	1.00	\$ 295.00	
08/03/2011	SRK	Prepare for depositions in St. George.	6.70	\$ 1,976.50	

08/03/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom about Hildale Defendants' subpoena duces tecum to Twin City Water Works.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/03/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about service of deposition subpoenas.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/03/2011	SRK	Review and consider emails from Zachary Renstrom about water issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/04/2011	SRK	Review and consider emails from Zach Renstrom about water connections and meter activity report.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
08/04/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker regarding water issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/04/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker regarding service of subpoenas and deposition notices.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/04/2011	SRK	Review documents produced by Defendants in response to State's First Request for Production.	1.10	\$ 324.50		
08/04/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about Robert Black's claims.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
08/04/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about 1998 Restatement of UEP.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/05/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate legal memorandum from Jennifer Larson on elements of disparate treatment claim against municipality and email research to Bill Walker.	1.10	\$ 324.50		
08/05/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about service of subpoenas.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/05/2011	SRK	Review deposition subpoenas to Jake Barlow, Freeman Barlow, and Robert Black.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
08/05/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about difficulty serving witnesses Freeman Barlow and Jake Barlow and about strategy for serving subpoenas.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
08/05/2011	SRK	Research whether Fire Department is a city entity.	0.60	\$ 177.00		

08/07/2011	SRK	Review Defendants' Answers to State's First Request for Production of Documents and documents produced by Defendants to prepare for depositions.	9.50	\$ 2,802.50		
08/08/2011	SRK	Review Defendants' Answers to State's First Request for Production of Documents and documents produced by Defendants to prepare for depositions.	7.30	\$ 2,153.50		
08/08/2011	SRK	Confer with Jennifer Larson about reviewing administrative interviews to prepare for depositions.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Internal conference.	
08/08/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker about preparing for depositions in St. George.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
08/08/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about serving Robert Black.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/08/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about water connection for triplex units.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
08/09/2011	SRK	Confer with Jennifer Larson about facts necessary to support legal theories.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
08/09/2011	SRK	Read and consider recent trial court decision evaluating circumstantial evidence in a fair housing lawsuit involving alleged disability discrimination and email Bill Walker regarding same.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed.	
08/09/2011	SRK	Read article about sentencing of FLDS leader Warren Jeffs and email Bill Walker regarding same.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
08/09/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about deposition preparation.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
08/09/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re status of case and upcoming disclosure	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
08/09/2011	CH	review materials that need to be disclosed	0.9	\$ 112.50		

08/10/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about call from Blake Hamilton concerning sewer issue and Tyler Barlow.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/10/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Katie Cox about serving subpoenas.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/10/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow about serving subpoenas.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/10/2011	SRK	Meet with paralegal Charlotte Haught and review documents for supplemental disclosure.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
08/10/2011	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Zach Renstrom to prepare for depositions.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
08/10/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke about sewer issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/10/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker about water issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/10/2011	CH	prepare 3rd supplemental disclosure	2.1	\$ 262.50		
08/10/2011	CH	meet with Sandra Kane to discuss documents to include for 3rd supplemental disclosure	2.3	\$ 287.50	Duplicative; internal conference.	
08/10/2011	CH	begin preparing 3rd supplemental disclosure	0.8	\$ 100.00		
08/11/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Richard Holm about alleged discrimination.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
08/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Nathan Reeve about alleged discrimination.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
08/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about discovery issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/11/2011	SRK	Review CWS Annual Water Resources Reports for Hildale/Colorado City.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
08/11/2011	SRK	Email Zach Renstrom about CWS Annual Water Resources Reports for Hildale/Colorado City.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/11/2011	SRK	Identify documents for supplemental disclosure.	5.30	\$ 1,563.50		
08/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke about emotional distress, sewer concerns, and workmen's comp.	0.80	\$ 236.00		

08/11/2011	SRK	Telephone Bill Walker about call from Jinjer Cooke.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
08/11/2011	CH	save e-trans to I drive	0.3	\$ 37.50	Clerical.	
08/11/2011	CH	draft 3rd supplemental disclosure	1.8	\$ 225.00		
08/11/2011	CH	continue drafting 3rd supplemental disclosure statement	2.0	\$ 250.00		
08/12/2011	SRK	Review documents produced by Defendants to prepare for depositions.	3.40	\$ 1,003.00		
08/12/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about disclosure.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/12/2011	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Zachary Renstrom about water issues.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
08/12/2011	SRK	Meet with Charlotte Haught about preparing supplemental disclosure statement.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Duplicative; internal conference.	
08/12/2011	CH	prepare 3rd supplemental disclosure statement; meet with Sandra to review disclosure and get more documents	4.5	\$ 562.50	Block billing; internal conference; duplicative.	Objection overruled.
08/13/2011	SRK	Review documents disclosed by Hildale Defendants to prepare for depositions.	6.50	\$ 1,917.50		
08/14/2011	SRK	Meet with Bill Walker to prepare for depositions.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
08/14/2011	SRK	Email Zach Renstrom about water issues.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
08/14/2011	SRK	Review documents to prepare for depositions.	5.80	\$ 1,711.00		
08/15/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker and Zach Renstrom about scheduling a conference call with Zach Renstrom to discuss water issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/15/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Zach Renstrom about water issues.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
08/15/2011	SRK	Supervise providing Bill Walker with requested transcripts.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
08/15/2011	SRK	Email Zach Renstrom about documents disclosed by Hildale Defendants.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

08/15/2011	SRK	Telephone calls from Bill Walker about witnesses, including criminal charges against some witnesses.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
08/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about misuse of water funds.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/15/2011	SRK	Revise and supervise service of State's Third Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.90	\$ 265.50	Unreasonable to bill for Supervising staff.	
08/15/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Jeff Matura concerning State's Third Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/15/2011	SRK	Email communications with Bill Walker and Jeff Matura regarding service and affidavit of service of Robert Black.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
08/15/2011	CH	prepare documents for disclosure	3.0	\$ 375.00		
08/16/2011	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom about water issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/16/2011	SRK	Review file for supplemental disclosures.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
08/16/2011	SRK	Review records for previous depositions of Deputies Curtis Cooke, Sam Johnson, Helaman Barlow, and Jonathan Roundy.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/16/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker deposition transcripts for Deputies Johnson, Barlow, and Roundy.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/16/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker about TCWW's misuse of funds.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards about TCWW.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Charlotte Haught about TCWW.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/16/2011	SRK	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom to prepare for depositions.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
08/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom about water issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/16/2011	SRK	Review documents in preparation for Jerry Barlow's deposition.	2.20	\$ 649.00		

08/16/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker about depositions.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
08/16/2011	SRK	Review Defendant Colorado City's Motion to Consolidate its case against the UEP and the Cookes with this case.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/16/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Mike Parrish about Motion to Consolidate and Transfer.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/16/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Mature about rescheduling depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/16/2011	CH	prepare lists of documents for depo witnesses	2.3	\$ 287.50		
08/17/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about David Darger's testimony.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
08/17/2011	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Darger's criminal lawyer, Colin Campbell, about Darger's testimony.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/17/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Colin Campbell about David Darger's deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/17/2011	SRK	Legal research on legal implications of invoking 5th Amendment in civil case.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
08/17/2011	SRK	Telephone calls from Bill Walker about Robert Black.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
08/17/2011	SRK	Email exchange between Bill Walker and Jeff Matura regarding deposition schedule and questioning David Darger.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/17/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Jeff Matura about supplemental discovery and verifications to interrogatories.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
08/17/2011	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart on case status and research on 5th Amendment issues.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
08/17/2011	SRK	Prepare for Jerry Barlow's deposition.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
08/17/2011	SRK	Telephone call fro Eric Nichols' office concerning Warren Jeffs' trial exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	

08/17/2011	SRK	Telephone call from James Schoppmann about status of records in criminal cases against Darger and Jake Barlow.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.	
08/17/2011	SRK	Review emails from James Schoppmann concerning criminal cases against Darger and Jake Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
08/17/2011	CH	modified spreadsheets for printing; contacted Alphagraphics in St George for copying services	1.8	\$ 180.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
08/18/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker about motion to consolidate, deposition of David Darger, and other depositions of Heleman Barlow and Sam Johnson.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Internal conference.	
08/18/2011	SRK	Prepare for deposition of Jerry Barlow.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
08/18/2011	SRK	Revise stipulated motion and proposed order to extend time to respond to Colorado City's motion to transfer and consolidate.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/18/2011	SRK	Email Jeff Matura asserting right to reserve questions of deponents concerning water documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/18/2011	SRK	Review emails from Colin Campbell and Bill Walker about David Darger testimony.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/18/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Eric Nichols about Warren Jeffs' trial exhibits in Texas.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
08/18/2011	SRK	Email Eric Nichols about priesthood records in Texas.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
08/18/2011	SRK	Email Counsel proposed stipulated motion and order to extend time to respond motion to consolidate.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/18/2011	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Jeff Matura about additional questions for witnesses about water documents.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

08/18/2011	CH	telephone all with Sandra and Kathy re exhibits for Depos; verify exhibits and make corrections to Bates labels	0.5	\$ 62.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
08/18/2011	CH	gather Barlow docs for Sandra	0.2	\$ 25.00		
08/19/2011	CH	emails with Sandra and Kathy re documents to Utah	0.1	\$ 12.50	Internal conference.	
08/20/2011	SRK	Review documents to prepare for the deposition of Jerry Barlow.	6.00	\$ 1,770.00		
08/22/2011	SRK	Prepare for deposition of Jerry Barlow.	16.00	\$ 4,720.00		
08/23/2011	SRK	Prepare for and take deposition of Jerry Barlow.	8.50	\$ 2,507.50		
08/23/2011	SRK	Prepare for deposition of Jonathan Fischer.	7.50	\$ 2,212.50		
08/23/2011	CH	research corporate records of Pure Ph8 Inc. from Hildale	0.5	\$ 62.50		
08/23/2011	CH	research bottled water regulations	2.5	\$ 312.50		
08/24/2011	SRK	Prepare for and take deposition of Jonathan Fischer.	6.00	\$ 1,770.00		
08/24/2011	SRK	Prepare for and appear at deposition of LaVerne Fischer.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
08/24/2011	SRK	Prepare for deposition of Victor Jessop.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
08/25/2011	SRK	Review documents to prepare for depositions of Helaman Barlow and Sam Johnson.	4.30	\$ 1,268.50		
08/25/2011	SRK	Appear at depositions of Helaman Barlow and Sam Johnson.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
08/25/2011	SRK	Appear at deposition of David Darger.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
08/25/2011	SRK	Prepare for deposition of Victor Jessop.	7.70	\$ 2,271.50		
08/26/2011	SRK	Prepare for and appear at deposition of Victor Jessop.	11.50	\$ 3,392.50		
08/26/2011	SRK	Prepare for and appear at deposition of Robert Black.	5.50	\$ 1,622.50		
08/27/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom to prepare for Rule 30(b)(6) deposition of Twin City Water Works.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
08/27/2011	SRK	Meet with Bill Walker to prepare for Twin City Water Works deposition.	2.30	\$ 678.50		

08/27/2011	SRK	Prepare for and appear at deposition of Twin City Water Works representative Scott Jessop.	6.20	\$ 1,829.00		
08/29/2011	CH	index documents	4.2	\$ 525.00	Clerical; vague.	
08/30/2011	CH	index documents	4.3	\$ 537.50	Clerical; vague.	
08/31/2011	SRK	Confer with Bill Walker regarding discovery.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
08/31/2011	CH	respond to Sandra's email requesting documents	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
08/31/2011	CH	research bottled water regulations and summarize for Sandra; search for conciliation agreement	4.2	\$ 420.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
09/01/2011	CH	index documents	4.0	\$ 500.00	Clerical; vague.	
09/02/2011	CH	draft Public records request to Utah Dept of Ag re Pure Ph8 Inc	0.6	\$ 75.00		
09/02/2011	CH	index documents	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical; vague.	
09/02/2011	CH	research Utah Department of Drinking Water regulations and update Sandra	0.2	\$ 25.00		
09/06/2011	CH	respond to Sandra's emails; copy files from recent disclosures to I drive	0.5	\$ 50.00	Block billing; Internal conference; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
09/07/2011	CH	review and index documents	1.9	\$ 237.50	Clerical; vague.	
09/07/2011	CH	index documents	0.6	\$ 75.00	Clerical; vague.	
09/12/2011	SRK	Confer with AAG Jennifer Larson about depositions of Defendants' witnesses and strategy for responding to motion to consolidate.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
09/12/2011	SRK	Confer with Charlotte Haught about TCWW documents.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
09/12/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
09/13/2011	SRK	Confer with civil rights investigator Jesse CUILTY about Colorado City's request for her deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/13/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields about subpoena duces tecum to Callister Nebeker for discovery from UEP.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
09/13/2011	SRK	Confer with Charlotte Haught about depositions and status of document review.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
09/13/2011	CH	meet with Sandra to discuss depositions and upcoming deadlines	1.4	\$ 175.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	

09/14/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Tanya Lewis about subpoena duces tecum to UEP.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
09/14/2011	SRK	Review Blake Hamilton's stipulated motion to extend time for filing motion to compel relating to subpoena duces tecum for UEP records.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/14/2011	SRK	Review letter from Jeff Matura about subpoena for records from Callister, Nebeker.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/14/2011	SRK	Meet with Charlotte Haught about preparing subpoenas to Mohave Areawide Water Quality Group, Canaan Engineering, and Sunrise Engineering.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
09/14/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker about deposition planning and conference call with UEP attorneys.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/14/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Tanya Lewis about conference call with UEP attorneys.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
09/14/2011	SRK	Review privilege log from Tanya Lewis.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
09/14/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields regarding motion to consolidate.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
09/14/2011	SRK	Review and evaluate legal memorandum from Jennifer Larson regarding transfer and consolidation.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/14/2011	CH	update public records request and review Utah statutes re public records	0.2	\$ 25.00		
09/14/2011	CH	check on hyperlinks; review bates issue; meet with Sandra to discuss SDT	1.5	\$ 150.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
09/15/2011	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Shields, Tanya Lewis and Bill Walker re discovery requests to UEP and Callister Nebeker.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
09/15/2011	SRK	Confer with Jennifer Larson about legal arguments in response to Colorado City's Motion to Consolidate.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

09/15/2011	SRK	Draft response to motion to consolidate.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/15/2011	CH	finalize and mail public records request	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical.	
09/19/2011	CH	save transcripts to I drive; research Mohave County Water Quality Planning committee	0.5	\$ 50.00	Block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
09/20/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about deposition scheduling.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/20/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about possible witnesses to support pattern and practice claim.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/20/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City amended complaint against UEP, Cookes, and Robert Black.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
09/20/2011	SRK	Confer with Jesse Cuilty about availability for deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/20/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about amended complaint against UEP, Cookes, and Robert Black, and expert report.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
09/20/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about answer to amended complaint in Colorado City action.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
09/20/2011	SRK	Review emails from Charlotte Haught about subpoenas duces tecum to Sunrise Engineering and Canaan Engineering, and edit subpoenas.	1.80	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.	
09/20/2011	CH	add records from Pltf Atty Bill Walker to index	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical.	
09/20/2011	CH	draft SDT for Canaan Peaks and Sunrise Engineering	2.6	\$ 325.00		
09/20/2011	CH	call Mohave County Planning and Zoning re water committee	0.3	\$ 37.50		
09/20/2011	CH	email to S. Kane re call to Mohave County; correct index	0.2	\$ 20.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
09/21/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Bill Walker about affirmative defenses.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
09/21/2011	SRK	Finalize subpoenas duces tecum and cover letters to Sunrise Engineering and Canaan Engineering in consultation with Charlotte Haught.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

09/21/2011	SRK	Review exhibits from Texas trial of Warren Jeffs.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims.	
09/21/2011	SRK	Review Sam Johnson deposition transcript.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
09/21/2011	CH	review Deft recent disclosures and identify Bates numbering problem; email Sandra	0.3	\$ 30.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
09/21/2011	CH	edits to SDT	0.6	\$ 75.00		
09/21/2011	CH	finalize and submit SDT for service	1.1	\$ 137.50		
09/22/2011	SRK	Review documents produced by Colorado City.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
09/22/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Jeff Matura about duplication of Bates Nos. CC00609-701.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
09/22/2011	SRK	Attempt to locate additional Texas documents concerning the FLDS.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
09/22/2011	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Motion to Compel documents from UEP and docket response date.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
09/22/2011	SRK	Confer with Department of Water Resources about Centennial Park water study.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
09/23/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom about water issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/23/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom Victor Jessop deposition, Scott Jessop deposition, and TCWW documents.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
09/23/2011	SRK	Review Victor Jessop's deposition transcript for documents referenced as exhibits.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
09/23/2011	SRK	Email Charlotte Haught about compiling deposition exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/23/2011	CH	email Kathy Grant re documents	0.1	\$ 12.50	Internal conference.	
09/26/2011	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom about deposition transcripts.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/26/2011	SRK	Review transcript of TCWW witness Scott Jessop and assemble copies of documents referenced during deposition.	1.60	\$ 472.00		

09/26/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom about transcript of Scott Jessop and documents referenced during deposition of TCWW witness Scott Jessop.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/26/2011	SRK	Arrange for Charlotte Haight to transmit documents referenced during Victor Jessop's deposition to Zach Renstrom.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
09/26/2011	SRK	Review Hildale application to extend water right.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/26/2011	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker about preparing joint response to motion to consolidate and discovery issues.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
09/26/2011	CH	gather exhibits for Victor Jessop deposition	1.1	\$ 137.50		
09/26/2011	CH	finish gathering exhibits for deposition	0.4	\$ 50.00		
09/26/2011	CH	look up quit claim deed for TCIA and compare name on deed to Declaration names	0.8	\$ 100.00		
09/27/2011	SRK	Research municipality's duty to provide water service without discrimination under Arizona common law and email Bill Walker results of research.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
09/27/2011	CH	check names from Quit Claim deed on Declaration of Beneficiaries filing	0.7	\$ 87.50		
09/27/2011	CH	Gather exhibits for depos	2.0	\$ 250.00		
09/28/2011	SRK	Review UEP's draft Response to Motion to Transfer/Consolidate.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
09/28/2011	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Jeff Matura about deposition scheduling.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/28/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City's Motion to Transfer/Consolidate and research response.	10.00	\$ 2,950.00		
09/29/2011	SRK	Draft Joint Response to Colorado City's Motion to Transfer/Consolidate	9.00	\$ 2,655.00		

09/29/2011	SRK	Email draft Joint Response to Bill Walker for his comments.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/29/2011	CH	gather exhibits for TCWW deposition	1.7	\$ 212.50		
09/29/2011	CH	gather exhibits from TCWW (Scott Jessop) deposition	0.5	\$ 62.50		
09/29/2011	CH	index TCWW documents	0.4	\$ 50.00		
09/30/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker providing comments on draft Response to Motion to Transfer/Consolidate.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/30/2011	SRK	Revise Response to Motion to Transfer/Consolidate.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
09/30/2011	CH	index documents	0.1	\$ 12.50	Clerical; vague.	
09/30/2011	CH	gather exhibits for Sam Johnson deposition	0.9	\$ 112.50		
09/30/2011	CH	index documents	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical; vague.	
09/30/2011	CH	save depositions to I drive; check on service of SDT	0.2	\$ 20.00	Block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
10/03/2011	SRK	Email Blake Hamilton about missing TCWW documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/03/2011	SRK	Review six emails from Jeff Matura, including 5 forwarding TCWW documents.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
10/03/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Jeff Matura about scheduling depositions in November.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/03/2011	SRK	Email communications with Zachary Renstrom forwarding him TCWW documents and deposition transcripts.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/03/2011	SRK	Review emails from Jeff Matura, Bill Walker, and Blake Hamilton about a conference call to schedule depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/03/2011	SRK	Draft email to counsel scheduling a deposition-scheduling conference call.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/03/2011	SRK	Review Notice of Service of Colorado City's fifth supplemental disclosure statement.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

10/03/2011	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Jeff Shields about subpoena duces tecum to the UEP.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/04/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about deposition schedule and preparation, and experts.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/04/2011	SRK	Email communications with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker regarding water issues and scheduling a conference call.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/04/2011	SRK	Review email from Tanya Lewis's office and attached UEP documents.	2.80	\$ 826.00		
10/04/2011	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Jeff Shields about subpoena duces tecum to the UEP.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
10/04/2011	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker concerning Colorado City lawsuit against the Cookes.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims; internal conference.	
10/04/2011	SRK	Review UEP Motion to Dismiss in Colorado City lawsuit.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.	
10/05/2011	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura and Bill Walker about Mr. Matura's request for an extension of time to file the reply in support of the Motion to Transfer/Consolidate.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/05/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City's Fifth Supplemental Rule 26(a) Disclosure Statement and related documents.	2.30	\$ 678.50		
10/05/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about Aqua Engineering and witness meetings in Salt Lake City.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/05/2011	SRK	Review research memorandum from Leslie Ross regarding subpoenas for records and confer with Leslie Ross regarding her research and case strategy.	1.10	\$ 324.50		
10/05/2011	SRK	Confer with Charlotte Haught regarding Sunrise Engineering's question about our subpoena.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
10/05/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra re call with Sunrise Engineering and SDT	0.1	\$ 12.50	Duplicative; internal conference.	

10/05/2011	CH	hyperlink documents from Master document list	0.2	\$ 25.00		
10/05/2011	CH	update Master document list	0.1	\$ 12.50	Clerical; vague.	
10/05/2011	CH	left message with Sunrise Engineering re subpoena	0.1	\$ 12.50	Clerical.	
10/05/2011	CH	gather depo exhibits for Jonathan Fischer and Jeremiah Barlow; telephone call with Sunrise Engineering	4.1	\$ 410.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
10/06/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker regarding scheduling depositions.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
10/06/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Tanya Lewis regarding Hildale Defendants' Motion to Compel.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/06/2011	CH	gather exhibits for depo	0.8	\$ 100.00		
10/06/2011	CH	update Master Doc List with hyperlinks	0.3	\$ 37.50		
10/07/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Jeff Matura, and Blake Hamilton regarding scheduling depositions in Salt Lake City.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
10/07/2011	SRK	Conference call with Zach Renstrom and Bill Walker regarding water issues.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
10/07/2011	SRK	Telephone call with Charlotte Haught to Texas Investigator's office regarding discovery of FLDS-related records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Duplicative; internal conference; not related to claims.	
10/07/2011	SRK	Telephone call with Charlotte Haught to Brian Thiriot's office regarding discovery on water issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Duplicative; internal conference; not related to claims.	
10/07/2011	SRK	Confer with Bill Walker regarding trip to Salt Lake City to prepare witnesses and deposition strategy.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/07/2011	SRK	Email civil rights investigator Jesse Cuiilty about her availability for deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/07/2011	SRK	Review UEP's Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion to Compel.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/07/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City's Stipulation to Extend Time for Reply re Transfer/Consolidation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

10/07/2011	SRK	Review some documents received from Texas regarding FLDS prosecutions.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims.	
10/07/2011	CH	attend call with Sandra and review discs from Texas trial	0.8	\$ 100.00	Duplicative; internal conference; not related to claims.	
10/07/2011	CH	leave message re SDT; hyperlink documents in Master index; index documents	0.9	\$ 90.00	Block billing; clerical; vague.	Reduced by 20%.
10/11/2011	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Bill Walker about scheduling depositions and witness preparation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/11/2011	SRK	Review and consider email from civil rights investigator Jesse Culty about available dates for her deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/11/2011	SRK	Review Order granting extension to Colorado City on reply in support of Motion to Transfer/Consolidate.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields regarding response to motion to compel.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/11/2011	SRK	Email Jeff Shields research on motion to compel.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call from EZ Messenger regarding difficulty serving Canaan Peaks Engineering.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
10/11/2011	SRK	Confer with Charlotte Haught regarding subpoenas to Canaan Peaks and Sunrise Engineering.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
10/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow regarding Brian Zitting.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/11/2011	SRK	Email Jethro Barlow about discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Brian Thiriot concerning Wilderness Act and water issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke about discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/11/2011	SRK	Review and email from Leslie Ross reflecting research on service of subpoena on corporation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

10/11/2011	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom about draft report and prepare for conference call with Mr. Renstrom and Bill Walker.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
10/11/2011	SRK	Review Town of Colorado City's Second Supplemental Response to State's First Request for Production and email Charlotte Haught regarding the same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/11/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re SDT; telephone call with Sunrise Engineering	0.3	\$ 30.00	Duplicative; internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
10/11/2011	CH	index documents	0.3	\$ 37.50	Clerical; vague.	
10/12/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom about Mr. Renstrom preparing his expert report.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/12/2011	SRK	Review Notice of Deposition for Jesse Cuijly.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/12/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Isaac Wyler about takeover of UEP land by marshal's office.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
10/13/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about claim for discrimination against a municipality for denying water service.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/14/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke about a Utility Board member.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/14/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about information received from Jinjer Cooke.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/14/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about additional theory of discrimination and possible amendment of complaint.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/14/2011	CH	review deposition transcript and index/gather exhibits	1.6	\$ 200.00		
10/14/2011	CH	hyperlink documents in master doc spreadsheet	0.4	\$ 50.00		
10/14/2011	CH	index documents	0.4	\$ 50.00	Clerical; vague.	
10/17/2011	SRK	Meet with AAG Jennifer Larson regarding seeking additional discovery on existing and new water connections.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	

10/17/2011	SRK	Telephone Bill Walker regarding strategy concerning common law discrimination claim.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
10/17/2011	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart regarding strategy concerning common law discrimination claim.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference. Claim dismissed.
10/17/2011	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Reply in Support of Motion to Compel UEP Documents.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
10/17/2011	SRK	Develop issues for expert opinions.	2.00	\$ 590.00	
10/17/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about issues for expert opinions.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
10/18/2011	SRK	Confer with Jennifer Larson regarding discovery issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
10/18/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker regarding expert issues and case strategy.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.
10/18/2011	SRK	Research amending complaint	0.60	\$ 177.00	
10/18/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker research on amending complaint.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
10/18/2011	SRK	Research water service discrimination and city powers.	2.20	\$ 649.00	
10/18/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker research on service discrimination and city powers.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
10/18/2011	SRK	Research possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination.	1.50	\$ 442.50	
10/18/2011	SRK	Telephone calls from Jeff Shields regarding discovery.	0.60	\$ 177.00	
10/18/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker regarding discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
10/18/2011	SRK	Communications with EZ Messenger about problems serving Canaan Peaks Engineering.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Clerical.
10/18/2011	CH	download docs to I drive	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical.
10/18/2011	CH	get CD's from Kathy and download to I drive	0.6	\$ 75.00	Internal conference; clerical.
10/19/2011	SRK	Meet with AAG Jennifer Larson re insufficient written discovery responses from Defendants.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.

10/19/2011	SRK	Calls with process server and Bill Walker re inability to serve Canaan Peaks Engineering.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; clerical.	
10/19/2011	SRK	Research possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination.	1.60	\$ 472.00		
10/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker in preparation for conference call with Zach Renstrom.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
10/19/2011	CH	review CD's of exhibits from Warren Jeffs Texas trial	0.8	\$ 100.00	Not related to claims.	
10/19/2011	CH	gather exhibits for deposition of Laverne Fischer	0.5	\$ 62.50		
10/20/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom and follow-up call to Mr. Walker.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
10/20/2011	SRK	Research possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/20/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker concerning expert issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/20/2011	SRK	Review emails from Zachary Renstrom regarding water issues.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
10/21/2011	SRK	Research comparable discrimination cases in consultation with Bill Walker.	2.70	\$ 796.50		
10/21/2011	SRK	Research possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination in consultation with Bill Walker.	1.60	\$ 472.00		
10/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Gary Engels concerning FLDS records from Texas.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
10/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Brock Belnap concerning a witness.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Ron Whitehead, Washington County Public Works Director, about a water issue.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Washington County Commr. Alan Gardner about water issues.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/21/2011	SRK	Research joint defense doctrine.	1.10	\$ 324.50		

10/21/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields attaching UEP documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/21/2011	SRK	Email to Jeff Shields re deposition date.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/21/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Tanya Lewis re UEP documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/21/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Jennifer Larson about discovery letters.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
10/24/2011	SRK	Telephone communications with Commr. Alan Gardner of WA County about water issues.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
10/24/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker regarding water issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/24/2011	SRK	Email and telephonic communications with Tanya Lewis and Jeff Shields regarding UEP documents and depositions.	1.10	\$ 324.50		
10/24/2011	SRK	Research comparable discrimination cases.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
10/24/2011	SRK	Research possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination in consultation with Bill Walker.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
10/24/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about amending the complaint.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/24/2011	SRK	Review documents from TCWW relating to the UEP.	2.60	\$ 767.00	Not related to claims.	
10/24/2011	CH	review Order, save to I drive; calendar depositions	0.5	\$ 50.00	Block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
10/24/2011	CH	save Sunrise Engineering docs to I drive; drop CD's off to Sandra	0.7	\$ 87.50	Block billing; internal conference; clerical.	
10/25/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Brock Belnap regarding a witness.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/25/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Ron Whitehead, WA County Public Works Director, about a water issue.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/25/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about water issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/25/2011	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Zach Renstrom regarding water issues.	0.10	\$ 29.50		

10/25/2011	SRK	Research possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination.	2.10	\$ 619.50		
10/25/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields regarding discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/25/2011	SRK	Review emails from Charlotte Haught.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/25/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City's Sixth Supplemental Disclosure Statement and attachment.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/25/2011	CH	hyperlink master document list	0.3	\$ 37.50		
10/26/2011	SRK	Conference with AAG Jennifer Larson about discovery enforcement.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/26/2011	SRK	Review file for Defendants' answers to State's First Request for Production of Documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/26/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker concerning expert witness disclosures and possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/26/2011	SRK	Research comparable discrimination cases.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/26/2011	SRK	Review documents submitted with Hildale subdivision pleadings.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
10/26/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom with revised issues list in consultation with Bill Walker.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
10/26/2011	SRK	Confer with Bill Walker about amending complaint re municipal water service discrimination and witness interviews in Salt Lake City.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
10/26/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/26/2011	CH	index documents	1.1	\$ 137.50	Clerical; vague.	
10/26/2011	CH	review Jeffs Texas trial exhibit CD	1.1	\$ 137.50	Not related to claims.	
10/27/2011	SRK	Review documents produced by Colorado City re water issues.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/27/2011	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re missing Colorado City documents.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	

10/27/2011	SRK	Exchange emails with Jeff Matura re missing Colorado City documents needed for expert.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
10/27/2011	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re disclosure of Sunrise Engineering documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
10/27/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re legal basis for state law discrimination complaint and strategy to amend complaint.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed; internal conference.	
10/27/2011	SRK	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker re issues for expert report.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
10/27/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker about possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/27/2011	CH	update PDF files with Bates numbers; meet with Sandra; briefly review Sunrise engineering documents; telephone call with Sandra; telephone call with Jodi at Sunrise Engineering; email Affidavit to her; review documents on other CD's and discuss with Sandra the missing docs	2.7	\$ 270.00	Duplicative; block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
10/27/2011	CH	check August discs for documents; email Sandra about missing docs; Bates Sunrise Engineering documents; make copies of discs; meet with Sandra; review Sunrise correspondence for mentions of water shortage	3.0	\$ 300.00	Duplicative; block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
10/27/2011	CH	hyperlink documents in Master document list; index documents	1.1	\$ 137.50	Block billing; clerical; vague.	Objection overruled.
10/28/2011	SRK	Research possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination in consultation with Bill Walker.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
10/28/2011	SRK	Email Jeff Shields in preparation for SLC meeting.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

10/28/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re Zachary Renstrom's draft expert report.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
10/28/2011	SRK	Review documents produced by Sunrise Engineering pursuant to SDT.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
10/28/2011	SRK	Review water documents from Colorado City.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
10/28/2011	SRK	Locate and email additional documents to Zachary Renstrom.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
10/28/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom re water reconnections.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/28/2011	SRK	Email Jethro Barlow re discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/28/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/28/2011	CH	gather documents for new attorney; transfer documents from CD's to I drive	7.7	\$ 962.50	Block billing; clerical.	Objection overruled.
10/30/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re expert witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/30/2011	SRK	Review email and charts from Zachary Renstrom re existing water connections.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/30/2011	SRK	Locate and analyze additional documents re existing water connections and email them to Zach Renstrom.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
10/30/2011	SRK	Revise list of expert issues for Zachary Renstrom.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
10/30/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker revised list of expert issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/30/2011	SRK	Review and analyze UEP documents to prepare for depositions of UEP witnesses.	5.50	\$ 1,622.50		
10/31/2011	SRK	Reviews emails from Bill Walker and Jeff Matura concerning amending the complaint to add a common law municipal discrimination claim.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
10/31/2011	SRK	Research Arizona statutes on city and town obligations in issuing building permits and in charging fair and just water rates and charges and email Bill Walker research results.	0.40	\$ 118.00		

10/31/2011	SRK	Research whether treating physicians are required to issue expert reports.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
10/31/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re expert witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/31/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City's Reply re Motion to Consolidate.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/31/2011	CH	finish burning CD's for new atty Chris Brancart; meet with Sandra	1.2	\$ 120.00	Block billing; internal conference; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
11/01/2011	SRK	Research possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination in consultation with Bill Walker.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
11/02/2011	SRK	Meeting with Bruce Wisan, Jethro Barlow, Jeff Shields and Bill Walker to prepare for depositions.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		
11/02/2011	SRK	Meeting with Jethro Barlow re documents and potential witnesses.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/02/2011	SRK	Meeting with Jeff Shields and Tanya Lewis re UEP document production.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/02/2011	SRK	Meeting with Seth Cooke and Jethro Barlow re facts and to prepare for depositions.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
11/02/2011	SRK	Prepare for additional meetings with Bruce Wisan, Jethro Barlow and Meeting with Isaac Wyler.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/02/2011	CH	index Sunrise engineering documents	2.0	\$ 250.00		
11/03/2011	SRK	Meeting with Bruce Wisan, Jethro Barlow and Bill Walker to prepare for depositions.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/03/2011	SRK	Meeting with Deloy Bateman and Bill Walker to prepare for deposition.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/03/2011	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker, Jethro Barlow, Isaac Wyler, UEP Housing Advisory Board members Katie Cox, Margaret Cooke, Deloy Batement, and telephonically with Don Timpson and Bob Huddleston to prepare for depositions.	3.00	\$ 885.00		

11/03/2011	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker, Isaac Wyler and Jethro Barlow to prepare for depositions.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/03/2011	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker, Katie Cox and Jethro Barlow re Cooke damages.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/03/2011	SRK	Conference with Jethro Barlow re new practice re existing connections.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/03/2011	CH	index documents	1.0	\$ 125.00	Clerical; vague.	
11/04/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Isaac Wyler re water connections.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/04/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom re expert report.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/04/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom re water issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/04/2011	SRK	Research fair housing issues relating to reasonable accommodation.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
11/04/2011	SRK	Email Zach Renstrom re fair housing issues.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
11/04/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re expert issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/04/2011	CH	index documents	2.3	\$ 287.50	Clerical; vague.	
11/04/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra re Salt Lake City interviews	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
11/05/2011	SRK	Review case notes and plan necessary discovery.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
11/06/2011	SRK	Review draft report from Zachary Renstrom.	6.50	\$ 1,917.50		
11/07/2011	SRK	Research possible expert on fair housing and municipal services discrimination in consultation with Bill Walker.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
11/07/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom re water issues.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/07/2011	SRK	Conference Call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom re water issues.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/07/2011	SRK	Review file for documents re existing connections.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/07/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom re existing connections.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

11/08/2011	SRK	Conference calls with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker re draft expert report.	3.10	\$ 914.50		
11/08/2011	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Zachary Renstrom re export report.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/08/2011	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Jinjer Cooke re CDBG funds, Scott Jessop, and payment of occupancy fees.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
11/09/2011	SRK	Continue to Review Zachary Renstrom's draft expert witness report.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
11/09/2011	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re missing documents from Sunrise Engineering.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Duplicative; internal conference.	
11/09/2011	SRK	Communications with Beehive Legal Processing re status of service on Brian Zitting/Canaan Peaks Engineering.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Clerical.	
11/09/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker with information from Beehive Legal and to propose alternate method to obtain information re Brian Zitting.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/09/2011	SRK	Conference Call with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker re expert report.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
11/09/2011	SRK	Email from Zachary Renstrom with additional issues for report.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/09/2011	SRK	Review documents produced by Defendants to support of Zachary Renstrom's report.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/09/2011	SRK	Conference Call with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker re expert report.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
11/09/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with, Jinjer Cooke, Randy Jenson ad Charlotte Haught re water bottling plant, Pure Ph8.	1.40	\$ 413.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
11/09/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re expert disclosures.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/09/2011	CH	telephone call with Randy Jenson of Utah Dept of Ag	0.4	\$ 50.00	Not related to claims.	

11/09/2011	CH	index sunrise engineering documents	6.3	\$ 787.50		
11/09/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re Sunrise documents	0.2	\$ 25.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
11/10/2011	SRK	Conference calls with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker re expert report.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
11/10/2011	SRK	Review revised draft of expert report from Zachary Renstrom.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
11/10/2011	SRK	Revise Joint Expert Disclosure in consultation with Bill Walker.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
11/10/2011	SRK	Prepare form meeting with Bill Walker re depositions and other discovery needed by Plaintiffs.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
11/10/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re depositions and discovery strategy.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
11/10/2011	SRK	Conference call with all counsel re depositions and amending complaint.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/10/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Defendants' expert witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/10/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom re Defendants' water expert.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/10/2011	CH	index Sunrise engineering documents; prepare 4th supplemental disclosure	0.8	\$ 80.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
11/10/2011	CH	continue drafting 4th supplemental disclosure	2.7	\$ 337.50		
11/11/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura and begin to revise expert report from hydrogeology firm.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/11/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re defendants' expert witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/13/2011	SRK	Review expert reports from Defendants' experts.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/13/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom re expert reports from hydrogeologist and mechanical engineer.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/14/2011	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart re case status, experts, and strategy.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
11/14/2011	CH	download Sunrise documents and email Sandra Kane	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
11/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re expert reports.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

11/15/2011	SRK	Review Defendants' expert reports to prepare for conference call with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
11/15/2011	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom with CV for hydrogeology consultant.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/15/2011	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re developing Navajo Sandstone water.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/15/2011	CH	begin converting emails from Sunrise engineering to pdf files	0.9	\$ 112.50		
11/15/2011	CH	convert emails to PDF; print emails	2.3	\$ 287.50	Block billing; clerical	Objection overruled.
11/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Zachary Renstrom re contact with geology expert.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/16/2011	SRK	Appear at hearing on the Hildale Defendants' Motion to Compel against the UEP.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Not related to claims; did not participate in the hearing.	
11/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Zachary Renstrom expert opinions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re hydrogeology expert, hearing, and discovery.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
11/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call to potential expert witness.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re intimidation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/16/2011	SRK	Email Jinjer Cooke re intimidation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/16/2011	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom re spreadsheet on total water use for year.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/16/2011	SRK	Review additional documents received from Sunrise Engineering.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/17/2011	SRK	Review documents from Zach Renstrom's expert report.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
11/17/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Zachary Renstrom calculations	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/17/2011	SRK	Prepare for and conduct call to potential witness with Bill Walker.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
11/17/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re safe yield.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/17/2011	SRK	Draft letter to Marvin Wilson of Sunrise Engineering.	0.30	\$ 88.50		

11/17/2011	SRK	Email exchange with Bill Walker about letter to Mr. Wilson.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/17/2011	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re discovery.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
11/17/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re amendment of complaint.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/17/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/17/2011	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Bill Walker about his communications with Zachary Renstrom about Mr. Renstrom's expert report.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/17/2011	CH	finish Batesing and indexing Sunrise documents; update 4th supp disclosure	1.7	\$ 170.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
11/17/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re upcoming witness interviews	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
11/17/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane and inspector Randy Jensen; try to review Jeffs' cd	0.5	\$ 50.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
11/18/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with a potential expert.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
11/18/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re Plaintiffs' Fourth Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/18/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields and conference call with Bill Walker and Jeff Shields re SDT to UEP.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/18/2011	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re expert analysis and additional discovery.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
11/18/2011	SRK	Work on State's Fourth Supplemental Disclosure Statement and Notice of Service re same.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
11/18/2011	SRK	Review and docket deposition notices from Defendants.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/18/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields re discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/18/2011	SRK	Telephone communications with Zachary Renstrom about potential experts.	0.60	\$ 177.00		

11/18/2011	CH	edit 4th Supp Disclosure; follow up on Terrill Johnson depo; add people to witness list; finalize 4th Supp Disclosure and NOS; burn 4 cds and deliver to Sandra	1.7	\$ 170.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
11/20/2011	SRK	Review and revise supplemental disclosure statement prepared by Bill Walker for Plaintiffs and Plaintiff/Intervenor.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/20/2011	SRK	Compile information regarding victims re pattern and practice claim.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
11/20/2011	SRK	Review notes of meetings with UEP witnesses to prepare for depositions.	2.20	\$ 649.00		
11/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re draft disclosure statement and expert witnesses.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
11/21/2011	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re evidentiary issues and interviews of potential victims.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
11/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Zach Renstrom re expert report.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields re discovery re petitions for benefits.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/21/2011	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re possible joinder in UEP request for protective order re petitions for benefits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/21/2011	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Shields and Bill Walker re discovery dispute re petitions for benefits.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/21/2011	SRK	Review deposition of Terrill Johnson.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
11/21/2011	CH	telephone call with Jeff Shields re transcripts	0.2	\$ 25.00		
11/21/2011	CH	download emails from Sunrise Eng. to Hummingbird/LF; index documents	1.0	\$ 125.00		
11/22/2011	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker re discovery.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	

11/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Shields to prepare for conference call with defense counsel.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/22/2011	SRK	Conference call with Blake Hamilton, Jeff Matura, Tanya Lewis, Jeff Shields, and Bill Walker re discovery dispute.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
11/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/22/2011	SRK	Review Affidavit from Richard Holm and Memorandum re Sanctions.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
11/22/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re Holm's affidavit.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
11/22/2011	SRK	Review draft memo from Bill Walker re discovery.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
11/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Shields with Bill Walker re representation of witnesses at depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Judge Teilborg's JA re discovery conference.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
11/22/2011	SRK	Email all counsel re conference with Judge Teilborg's JA.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
11/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re conference with Judge's JA.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/22/2011	SRK	Email all counsel about removing Jeff Shields from witness list.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/22/2011	SRK	Review emails from Jeff Matura re discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/22/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields re discovery.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
11/22/2011	SRK	Review emails from Jeff Shields to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura with additional UEP documents.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/23/2011	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re case status and interviews of potential witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Duplicative; internal conference.	
11/23/2011	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Shields, Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re discovery re petitions for benefits.	0.40	\$ 118.00		

11/23/2011	SRK	Review Defendants' Answers to Joint Amended Complaint and Draft email to Jeff Shields re petitions for benefits.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/23/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields re discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/23/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re deposition limits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	internal conference.	
11/23/2011	SRK	Review documents disclosed by Colorado City.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
11/23/2011	CH	respond to Sandra Kane's emails; index documents	0.7	\$ 87.50	Duplicative; internal conference; clerical; vague.	
11/23/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re upcoming depositions	0.3	\$ 37.50	Duplicative; internal conference.	
11/25/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Meeting with potential expert, preparation for depositions, and possible extension of discovery deadline.	0.80	\$ 236.00	internal conference.	
11/25/2011	SRK	Email Jethro Barlow re housing photos.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
11/25/2011	SRK	Review file re water documents and Draft email to Zachary Renstrom re safe yield.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
11/25/2011	SRK	Review file in preparation for depositions.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
11/27/2011	SRK	Research elements for proving disparate treatment against municipality under the Fair Housing Act.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
11/27/2011	SRK	Research fair housing regulations.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
11/27/2011	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker to prepare for depositions.	1.50	\$ 442.50	internal conference.	
11/27/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Shields re deposition preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/28/2011	SRK	Appear at deposition of Bruce Wisan and attend working lunch meeting with Mr. Wisan and Bill Walker.	8.50	\$ 2,507.50		
11/28/2011	SRK	Conference with Jethro Barlow and Isaac Wyler to prepare for depositions.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

11/29/2011	SRK	Meeting with Jethro Barlow, Isaac Wyler and Bill Walker to prepare for their depositions.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/29/2011	SRK	Appear at deposition of Jethro Barlow.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		
11/29/2011	SRK	Appear at deposition of Isaac Wyler.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
11/29/2011	SRK	Meeting with Carolyn Jessop to prepare for her deposition.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
11/30/2011	SRK	Appear at depositions of Seth Cooke, Katie Cox and Margaret Cooke.	9.00	\$ 2,655.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
11/30/2011	CH	review documents pulled by Denise Z from Warren Jeffs exhibits; deliver materials to Sandra K.	1.0	\$ 125.00	Not related to claims; block billing; internal conference.	
12/01/2011	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker, Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re discovery and case management issues.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
12/01/2011	SRK	Appear at depositions of Carolyn Jessop, Don Timpson and Dely Bateman.	9.00	\$ 2,655.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
12/01/2011	SRK	Meeting with Jeff Shields re deposition.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/02/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re depositions of Don Timpson and Dely Bateman.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/02/2011	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re case status, depositions and discovery strategy and resources.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/02/2011	SRK	Review email from Zach Renstrom and prior hydrology report re Shinarump aquifer.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
12/02/2011	SRK	Conference with Jesse Cuiilty re preparation for her deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/02/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom re response to Defendants' experts.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/02/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Richard Obenshein of AZ DWR with Zachary Renstrom.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

12/02/2011	SRK	Review Protective Order in UEP case relating to disclosure in this case.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
12/02/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re EZ Messenger and Sunrise Engineering invoices and protective order.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/02/2011	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re invoices and protective order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/02/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Carolyn Jessop re deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/02/2011	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart about policy re asserting the deliberative process and attorney client privilege at depositions of Division investigators.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/02/2011	CH	index documents	4.0	\$ 500.00	Clerical; vague.	
12/04/2011	SRK	Research re hydrogeology and Darcy equation.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
12/05/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re hydrology and aquifer article.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/05/2011	SRK	Research re SDT in Utah and Draft SDT's to UEP and Pure Ph8.	3.20	\$ 944.00		
12/05/2011	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart re protective order on UEP documents, evidentiary issues, and discovery strategy.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
12/06/2011	SRK	Prepare SDT to UEP, Draft Acceptance of Service form, Draft LT Jeff Shields, Draft LT Bruce Wisan, Telephone call to Jeff Shields' office re SDT for FLDS records from UEP.	3.00	\$ 708.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
12/06/2011	SRK	Conference with AAG Rose Daly-Rooney to prepare for deposition of Jesse Cuiilty.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/06/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Rick Obenshein of Arizona Department of Water Resources re DWR records.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/06/2011	SRK	Email communications with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker about Mr. Renstrom's expert report.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/06/2011	SRK	Email Jethro Barlow re building permits.	0.30	\$ 88.50		

12/06/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re deposition exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/06/2011	SRK	Legal research on deliberative process and attorney client privilege to prepare for Jesse Cuiilty's deposition.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
12/06/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields re SDT to UEP.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/07/2011	SRK	Review draft report from Zachary Renstrom.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/07/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re draft report from Zachary Renstrom.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/07/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom re draft report.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
12/07/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra and Kathy; email to Nancy re access to I drive	0.2	\$ 20.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
12/08/2011	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom re report.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/08/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom re preparation of expert report.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
12/08/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom re expert report.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/08/2011	SRK	Telephone call to potential victims of pattern and practice of discrimination with paralegal Charlotte Haught.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Duplicative.	
12/08/2011	SRK	Email Aaron Timpson re pattern or practice claim.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/08/2011	SRK	Review emails from Charlotte Haught attaching five FLDS warnings.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Not related to claims; internal conference.	
12/08/2011	CH	attend potential witness interviews with Sandra Kane; send follow up emails from interviews	2.5	\$ 312.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
12/09/2011	SRK	Review draft report from Zachary Renstrom.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
12/09/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom re draft report.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/09/2011	SRK	Review revised draft report from Zachary Renstrom.	1.60	\$ 472.00		
12/09/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom re additional issues re report.	1.00	\$ 295.00		

12/09/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom re revised expert report.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/09/2011	SRK	Review exhibits to Renstrom Report.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/09/2011	SRK	Conference with Jesse Cuiilty re preparing for deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/09/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/09/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Joseph Timpson re pattern or practice claim.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/09/2011	SRK	Conference call to Joseph Timpson with Charlotte Haught re pattern or practice claim.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Duplicative.	
12/09/2011	SRK	Review final draft of Renstrom report.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/09/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom re expert report.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/09/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra; prepare consent forms and email to the two potential witnesses	1.4	\$ 140.00	Internal conference; block cilling.	Reduced by 20%.
12/09/2011	CH	Joseph Timpson interview with Sandra Kane	0.3	\$ 37.50	Duplicative.	
12/11/2011	SRK	Meeting with Jesse Cuiilty to discuss administrative investigation to prepare for Ms. Cuiilty's deposition.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
12/11/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker about preparing for Jesse Cuiilty's deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/11/2011	SRK	Review Final Investigative Report and administrative file to prepare for Jesse Cuiilty's deposition.	5.80	\$ 1,711.00		
12/11/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re Cuiilty depositon.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/12/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re deliberative process privilege.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/12/2011	SRK	Telephone call to AAG Rose Daly-Rooney and Conference with Ann Hobart in preparation for Jesse Cuiilty's deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/12/2011	SRK	Meeting with Jesse Cuiilty in preparation for her deposition.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
12/12/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Jesse Cuiilty in preparation for Jesse Cuiilty's deposition.	1.50	\$ 442.50		

12/12/2011	SRK	Review documents in preparation for Jesse Cuilty's deposition.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
12/13/2011	SRK	Review Final Investigative Report in preparation for Jesse Cuilty's deposition.	1.80	\$ 531.00	Excessive.	
12/13/2011	SRK	Meeting with Jesse Cuilty in preparation for deposition.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/13/2011	SRK	Defend Jesse Cuilty's deposition.	8.00	\$ 2,360.00		
12/14/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker, Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re conference call to discuss discovery and scheduling.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/14/2011	SRK	Telephone conversations with Jeff Shields re State's SDT to UEP, applicable protective orders, and procedures.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/14/2011	SRK	Review protective orders in UEP litigation re subpoenaed documents.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
12/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re water development.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/15/2011	SRK	Review SLT article re FLDS in Colorado City.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
12/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Kathy Abbott's Office at BLM and other BLM staff re release of canyon water from wilderness study area.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Centennial Park Water District and District Mgr. Alma Cawley re adequate water from Shinarump aquifer.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/15/2011	SRK	Meeting with Charlotte Haught re preparation of rebuttal expert disclosure report.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
12/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Frank Corkhill, Arizona Department of Water Resources, re Centennial Park water adequacy.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jethro Barlow re water issues including bottling plant and access to property to serve subpoena.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Frank Corkhill of DWR re Centennial Park water adequacy.	0.40	\$ 118.00		

12/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Rick Obenshein's office of DWR re Centennial Park water adequacy.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re expert witness rebuttal and evidentiary issues.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
12/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields re UEP records re FLDS.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.	
12/15/2011	SRK	Review email and LF Jeff Shields re SDT.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/15/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Shields re SDT.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/15/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City's Eighth Supplemental Disclosure Statement and related documents.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/15/2011	SRK	Review Colorado City documents.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/15/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re Eighth Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/15/2011	SRK	Email to Charlotte Haught re preparation of joint expert rebuttal disclosure.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/15/2011	SRK	PF meeting re discovery scheduling.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
12/15/2011	CH	meet with Sandra Kane to discuss expert rebuttal disclosure	1.3	\$ 162.50	Duplicative; internal conference.	
12/16/2011	SRK	Review Defendants' discovery responses in preparation for conference call with counsel re scheduling and discovery.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
12/16/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re scheduling depositions.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/16/2011	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re insufficient discovery responses from Defendants.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/16/2011	SRK	Review letter from Rick Obenshein and DWR comments re Defendants' expert report.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/16/2011	SRK	Email Rick Obenshein re DWR comments.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/16/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re Arizona Department of Water Resources comments.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	

12/16/2011	SRK	Email Zach Renstrom re same.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Alma Cawley re water adequacy in Centennial Park.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/16/2011	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re Expert Rebuttal Disclosure and prepare Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor's Joint Expert Rebuttal Disclosure and Rebuttal Expert Report and Notice of Service.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Objection overruled.
12/16/2011	SRK	Email Blake Hamilton, Jeff Matura and Bill Walker attaching Plaintiffs/Plaintiff-Intervenor Notice of Service and Rebuttal Expert Disclosure and Report.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/16/2011	SRK	Review email Blake Hamilton and attached response from Defendants' Experts to Zachary Renstrom's Report.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields re SDT for UEP records.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/16/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bruce Wisan re access to UEP property to serve SDT.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/16/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bruce Wisan and Jethro re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/16/2011	SRK	Review email and LF Jeff Shields re serving SDT on UEP property.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/16/2011	SRK	Email Charlotte Haught re preparing supplemental disclosures.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/16/2011	CH	draft expert rebuttal disclosure	2.0	\$ 250.00		
12/16/2011	CH	meet with Sandra Kane re disclosure	1.0	\$ 125.00	Internal conference.	
12/17/2011	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re deposition scheduling.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/18/2011	SRK	Work on scheduling depositions for Defendants' witnesses and experts within discovery deadline.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/18/2011	SRK	Review records memorializing communications to and from Warren Jeffs.	3.00	\$ 885.00	Not related to claims.	
12/18/2011	SRK	Review deposition of Jonathan Roundy.	3.00	\$ 885.00		

12/18/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re discovery issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/19/2011	SRK	Email Charlotte Haught re supplementing disclosures.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Commissioner Alan Gardner re availability of water from Water Canyon.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/19/2011	SRK	Email Commissioner Gardner re water availability.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Alma Cawley re Centennial Park water	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/19/2011	SRK	Email Alma Cawley re Centennial Park water.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/19/2011	SRK	Review email and attachments from Alma Cawley re Centennial Park assured water supply.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re same.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/19/2011	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re documents from Arizona Department of Water Resources re Centennial Park water.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Rick Obenshein of Arizona Dept. of Water Resources re Centennial Park water adequacy.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Ken Slowinski of Arizona Dept. of Water Resources re witness from DWR.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Gary Engels re discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Frank Craddock of ADWR re Centennial Park File.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Zachary Renstrom re water issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/19/2011	SRK	Review ADWR Centennial Park file and hydrology report.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
12/19/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Centennial Park water.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/19/2011	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re ADWR records re Centennial Park.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

12/19/2011	SRK	Review submittals to ADWR re water studies in Centennial Park.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/19/2011	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re same.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
12/19/2011	CH	draft shells for 2nd NUI and 2nd RFP	0.8	\$ 100.00		
12/19/2011	CH	telephone calls with Sandra re water reports	0.4	\$ 50.00	Internal conference.	
12/19/2011	CH	respond to emails from Sandra; download documents for disclosure	0.8	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
12/19/2011	CH	draft 5th disclosure	1.5	\$ 187.50		
12/20/2011	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re response from Steven Bateman re pattern or practice claim.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/20/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Marion Timpson re pattern or practice claim.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/20/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re contact information for other potential victims.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
12/20/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Gary Engels re discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
12/20/2011	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom re scheduling conference call and Draft reply to Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/20/2011	SRK	Review email from Gary Engels and attachment re Jeremiah Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
12/20/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Alma Cawley re disclosure of water study.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/20/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Andrew Craddock of Arizona Dept. of Water Resources re Centennial Park water study.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/20/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Michael Bradford of Alliance Consulting re Colorado City knowledge of Shinarump Aquifer water adequacy.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/20/2011	SRK	Email Charlotte Haught re contacting Mohave County re subdivision notices in Centennial Park and contacting victim.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

12/20/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Michael Bradshaw of Alliance Consulting re Colorado City involvement in Centennial Park subdivision plat.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
12/20/2011	SRK	Review email from Gary Engels re authentication of Texas documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
12/20/2011	SRK	Review Nick Hanna affidavit and attached FLDS documents.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/20/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Michelle Moreno of ADWR re certification of file.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/20/2011	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re contact with Mohave County Development Services re Centennial Park subdivision comments.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/20/2011	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom re response to Defendants' expert reports.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/20/2011	SRK	Review emails from Michael Bradshaw and attached documents from Mohave County file re Centennial Park subdivision.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/20/2011	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re contact with Karl Taylor of Mohave County Development Services re Centennial Park subdivision documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/20/2011	SRK	Review email from Michelle Moreno of ADWR and attached certification form and ADWR file re Water Report on Centennial Park Unit II Tract 3530.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/20/2011	SRK	Research re authentication requirements for public records.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/20/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re ADWR certification form and file.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/20/2011	CH	call with Sandra; call to Carl Taylor at Mohave Co. re subdivision approvals and comment period; e-mail to Sandra of recap of call	1.0	\$ 100.00	Internal conference; Block billing; Duplicative of entry on pg. 88	Reduced by 20%.

12/20/2011	CH	telephone call with Sandra re witness interviews; e-mail consent form to Marion Timpson and follow up calls and emails; update disclosure; call potential witnesses - no answer, left message	3.0	\$ 300.00	Internal conference; Block billing; Duplicative of entry on pg. 88	Reduced by 20%.
12/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Isaac Wyler re pictures of construction of triplexes and deposition of Hyrum Roundy.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re ADWR Records and depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/21/2011	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Hildale triplexes.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re ADWR records and related evidence.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
12/21/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields re police incident in Hildale re Holm School community building.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/21/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/21/2011	SRK	Review email from Michelle Moreno of ADWR re documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/21/2011	SRK	Draft public records request and email to Michelle Moreno to obtain ADWR records.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/21/2011	CH	telephone call with Karl Taylor of Mohave County re documents from Colorado City having notice of subdivision; email to Sandra Kane	0.7	\$ 70.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
12/21/2011	CH	e-mails and telephone calls with Sandra Kane	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
12/22/2011	SRK	Email Zachary Renstrom re Hildale Water Right 81-1638.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/22/2011	SRK	Review Western States Water Report of 2006.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/22/2011	SRK	Review reply from Renstrom re water right.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/22/2011	SRK	Review file re Hildale Water Right 81-1638.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re obtaining certified copy of Utah file on Hildale Water Right 81-1638.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

12/22/2011	SRK	Email Charlotte Haught re form of certification needed and request for public records re Hildale Water Right 81-1638.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; duplicative entry on page 92	
12/22/2011	SRK	Meeting with Charlotte Haught re disclosure of witnesses and documents, documents received from Mohave County development services re Centennial Park subdivision, locating and contacting victims of pattern practice.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference; duplicative entry on page 92	
12/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Don Timpson re pattern or practice claim.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re victims of pattern or practice.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/22/2011	SRK	Review documents re TRO to protect and preserve UEP property filed by Richard Holm re Holm School building.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re evidentiary issues re Church records and Hildale water right.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/22/2011	SRK	Review deposition notices re Rule 30(b)(6) depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/22/2011	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re discovery by State re pattern and practice victims.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/22/2011	SRK	Email Bill Walker re disclosure of documents seized in Texas, incident re Holm School, and certification of water records from Utah.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call to David Johnson of Arizona Dept. of Water Resources re witness to water adequacy report.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/22/2011	SRK	Telephone call from David Johnson re witness re water adequacy report re Centennial Park.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/22/2011	CH	meet with Sandra Kane to discuss disclosure	2.5	\$ 312.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on page 91	
12/22/2011	CH	contact Dept of Natural Resources, Utah for certified copies of documents	0.3	\$ 37.50		

12/22/2011	CH	contact possible witnesses	0.2	\$ 25.00		
12/22/2011	CH	prepare consent forms and email to Matthew Musser and Aaron Timpson	0.2	\$ 25.00		
12/23/2011	SRK	Obtain certified documents re adequate water supply in aquifer from the Arizona Department of Water Resources.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/23/2011	SRK	Meeting with Charlotte Haught re disclosure of ADWR documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 93	
12/23/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re FLDS control of city government.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/23/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re disclosures and Holm school issue.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/23/2011	SRK	Review TRO re Holm School.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/23/2011	SRK	Review emails from Gary Engels and newspaper articles re Holm School incident.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/23/2011	SRK	Review documents from Mike Bradshaw re subdivision comments by Colorado City.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
12/23/2011	SRK	Email Mike Bradshaw re documents re Centennial Park water adequacy and subdivision.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/23/2011	SRK	Review email from Mike Bradshaw and draft reply.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/23/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re disclosure.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
12/23/2011	SRK	Review documents for disclosure.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/23/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re frozen pipe and water situation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/23/2011	CH	edits to disclosure statement	0.2	\$ 25.00		
12/23/2011	CH	edits to disclosure statement	3.5	\$ 437.50		
12/23/2011	CH	meet with Sandra re disclosure; continue editing disclosure	1.4	\$ 175.00	Internal conference; block billing; duplicative of entry on pg. 92	Objection overruled.
12/27/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re planning for UT/Colorado City trip, Renstrom reply expert report, and deposition notices.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

12/27/2011	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Application for Attorneys' Fees re UEP Motion to Compel and Draft email to Jeff Shields re same.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/27/2011	SRK	Review and revise Plaintiff/Intervenor's Sixth Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/27/2011	CH	index documents	4.0	\$ 500.00	Clerical; vague.	
12/27/2011	CH	index documents	2.5	\$ 312.50	Clerical; vague.	
12/28/2011	SRK	Review documents in preparation for Telephone call to Michael Bradshaw.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/28/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re water issues.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/28/2011	SRK	Email Jinjer Cooke re water issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/28/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Mike Bradshaw re water comments by Colorado City.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/28/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Alma Cawley re Colorado City knowledge re water adequacy determination.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/28/2011	SRK	Revise Sixth Supplemental Disclosure Statement; Review documents for disclosure; Draft email to Charlotte Haught re finalizing disclosure statement.	6.00	\$ 1,770.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Objection overruled.
12/28/2011	SRK	Review Warren Jeffs' Christmas sermon.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
12/28/2011	CH	call to Mohave Co. Planning Dept re certified records	0.4	\$ 50.00		
12/28/2011	CH	begin next supplemental disclosure	0.6	\$ 75.00		
12/29/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re disclosure statement and discovery letter.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/29/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re additions to disclosure statement;	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/29/2011	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re contact from Matthew Musser.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
12/29/2011	SRK	Revise Sixth Supplemental Disclosure Statement and E-file Notice of Service.	2.70	\$ 796.50		

12/29/2011	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura requesting copy of disclosure statement, and reply to Mr. Matura.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/29/2011	CH	telephone call with Karl at the Mohave Co. planning dept. re certifying documents; bates documents for disclosure; edit disclosure; phone calls with Sandra re disclosure	4.5	\$ 450.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
12/29/2011	CH	continue making edits to disclosure; burn CD's of documents for disclosure	0.4	\$ 50.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
12/30/2011	SRK	Telephone call to Payson re water policy mentioned in Defendants' expert's report; Review Payson website and brochures re water policy.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/30/2011	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re increasing tensions in Colorado City.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/30/2011	SRK	Review file and begin to Draft LT Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re discovery issues.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
12/31/2011	SRK	Review discovery requests and work on LT Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re deficient discovery responses.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		
01/01/2012	SRK	Review discovery responses and continue to work on Draft LT Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re deficient discovery responses.	5.50	\$ 1,622.50		
01/02/2012	SRK	Review file and Draft LT Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re deficient discovery responses.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		
01/02/2012	SRK	Email Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura with letter re incomplete discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/02/2012	SRK	Review rebuttal expert witness reports from Defendants' experts in preparation for conference call with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/02/2012	SRK	Conference call with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker re additional rebuttal expert report.	1.00	\$ 295.00		

01/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Mike Ploughe of Payson re discontinued water policy.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
01/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Mike Ploughe re Payson's former water policy.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Katie Cox re police incidents in Colorado City.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/03/2012	SRK	Email Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re conference call to discuss discovery scheduling.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/03/2012	SRK	Review response email from Jeff Matura.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
01/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re email from Jeff Matura, deposition scheduling, and hearing re Holm School injunction.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/03/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re discovery issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re discovery issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/03/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re discovery.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
01/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Mike Ploughe from Town of Payson re water policy.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/03/2012	SRK	Review news story re FLDS restrictions.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
01/03/2012	SRK	Review Salt Lake Tribune polygamy columns re FLDS restrictions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
01/03/2012	SRK	Email Bill Walker re video depositions, and Review reply.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re SDT to UEP for FLDS records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Katie Cox re incidents of harassment in Colorado City.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Tonya Tewell of Holding Out Help re harassment incidents.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	

01/03/2012	SRK	Review answers of the Hildale Defendants and the Town of Colorado City to Second Joint Amended Complaint.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/03/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re video of trenching at Most Wanted Jeans, and Hiram Roundy audio recorded deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/03/2012	SRK	Review Hildale/Colorado City Standard Specifications for Design & Construction of Utilities.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/03/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re disclosures	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
01/03/2012	CH	burn CD and deliver to Sandra	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
01/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re video, photographs and meetings in Colorado City.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re water issues.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
01/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re incident in Colorado City and water from Maxwell Canyon.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Ken Slowinski, Arizona Dept. of Water Resources re discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Alma Cawley, Centennial Park DWID re deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Ken Slowinski re deposition of ADWR representative.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/04/2012	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re disclosure of ADWR witness.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker requesting documents with Joseph Allred's signature.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/04/2012	SRK	Conference with Jethro Barlow re UEP housing issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/04/2012	SRK	Review file for Joseph Allred signatures and Draft email to Bill Walker with same.	0.80	\$ 236.00		

01/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re school board meeting re water connection, Review file, Draft email to Bill Walker re school board meeting re new water connection.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/04/2012	SRK	Draft email to Zachary Renstrom re Maxwell Canyon water supply.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/04/2012	SRK	Review depositions notices e-filed by Bill Walker.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
01/04/2012	SRK	Review records re Cooke damages.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/04/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re disclosures	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
01/05/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re water issue.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
01/05/2012	SRK	Draft reply to Bill Walker re Maxwell Canyon water.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/05/2012	SRK	Review email from Michael Ploughe of Payson Water Dept.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
01/05/2012	SRK	Draft reply to Michael Ploughe.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
01/05/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Buzz Walker of Payson Water Dept. re Payson water ordinance referred to by Defendants' expert.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/05/2012	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re disclosure of Alma Cawley as witness.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/05/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re documents with Joseph Allred's signature.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/05/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re damages receipts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/05/2012	SRK	Work on new SDT to UEP re additional FLDS documents seized by law enforcement.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/05/2012	SRK	Draft new LT Jeff Shields, SDT and Exhibit, Acceptance of Service, and LT Bruce Wisan.	2.90	\$ 855.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
01/05/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Buzz Walker of Payson Water Dept. re public record request for Payson water ordinance.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/05/2012	SRK	Draft email to Buzz Walker with certified language for public records.	0.40	\$ 118.00		

01/05/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Buzz Walker re public record request.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/05/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields re discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/05/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Meeting with Richard Holm and review of houses in Colorado City.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/06/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Jesse Cuiilty re reviewing deposition transcript.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/06/2012	SRK	Review email from Buzz Walker of Payson Water Dept re public record request.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/06/2012	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re records from Mohave County.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/06/2012	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom with draft expert report.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/06/2012	SRK	Conference with Zachary Renstrom re expert report.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/06/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker and Draft email to Bill Walker re expert report.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
01/06/2012	SRK	Review expert rebuttal reports and Renstrom intitial expert report.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
01/06/2012	CH	index documents	0.8	\$ 100.00	Clerical; vague.	
01/06/2012	CH	draft public records request	2.2	\$ 275.00		
01/09/2012	SRK	TF Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom re arranging conference call re preparation Addendum and Reply re expert report.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/09/2012	SRK	TT Zachary Renstrom re preparation of draft expert report.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/09/2012	SRK	TF Bill Walker re preparation of supplemental disclosure.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/09/2012	SRK	RV Mohave County Records and work with paralegal Charlotte Haught on getting certified copies of Mohave County subdivision re cords re water development.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
01/09/2012	SRK	TF Jinjer Cooke re scheduling meeting in Phoenix with additional photos for disclosure.	0.40	\$ 118.00		

01/09/2012	SRK	TF Bill Walker re outstanding discovery.	1.70	\$ 501.50	Internal conference.	
01/09/2012	SRK	RV email from Charlotte Haught re certification of Mohave County subdivision documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/09/2012	SRK	TF Bill Walker re irrigation water issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/09/2012	CH	prepare 7th supp disclosure	3.0	\$ 375.00		
01/09/2012	CH	index documents	4.0	\$ 500.00	Clerical; vague.	
01/10/2012	SRK	Research hydrology articles cited in Arizona Department of Water Resources report, criticizing conclusions and methodology of Defendants' expert Southwest Groundwater Consultants.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/10/2012	SRK	Conference call with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker re preparation of Addendum and Reply to expert report.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/10/2012	SRK	Review Intergovernmental Agreement and Operation and Maintenance Agreement re Water System regarding obligation to develop water.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
01/10/2012	SRK	Draft email to Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker regarding hydrology articles and water agreements and telephone conversation with Zachary Renstrom re same.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
01/10/2012	SRK	Review Order denying Motion to Dismiss in Town of Colorado City lawsuit against United Effort Plan Trust and Cookes.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.	
01/10/2012	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker regarding insufficient discovery responses from Defendants.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
01/10/2012	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart regarding strategy to obtain discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/10/2012	SRK	Emails to and from Zachary Renstrom with relevant hydrology articles and water-related documents disclosed by Defendants.	0.60	\$ 177.00		

01/10/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker confirming telephone conversation regarding insufficient discovery responses from Defendants.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/10/2012	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught regarding newly issued FLDS warnings.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference; duplicative.	
01/10/2012	CH	edits to PRR; telephone call with Sandra re discovery	0.7	\$ 70.00	Block billing; internal conference; duplicative.	Reduced by 20%.
01/11/2012	SRK	Review emails from Jeff Matura and Bill Walker regarding discovery.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/11/2012	SRK	Review email from and draft email to Zachary Renstrom regarding preparation of expert report.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/11/2012	SRK	Review Zachary Renstrom's draft report.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
01/11/2012	SRK	Conference call with Zachary Renstrom regarding draft report.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
01/11/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding Zachary Renstrom's draft report.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/11/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding preparation of additional disclosures.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/11/2012	SRK	Meeting with Ron and Jinjer Cooke and Charlotte Haught regarding additional photos for disclosure.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
01/11/2012	SRK	Review additional documents, photos and videos for disclosure and draft email to Bill Walker regarding same.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
01/11/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker regarding Jinjer Cooke's medical records.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/11/2012	SRK	Review evidence regarding wasting of water by Defendants.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/11/2012	SRK	Review news videos of Cookes and draft email to Bill Walker regarding the videos.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/11/2012	CH	download pictures from the Cooke's	1.0	\$ 125.00		
01/11/2012	CH	meet with Sandra, Ron and Jinjer Cooke	1.2	\$ 150.00		

01/11/2012	CH	index documents; update Who's Who	1.1	\$ 137.50	Clerical; vague.	
01/11/2012	CH	print documents from the To Be Produced folder	1.0	\$ 125.00	Clerical.	
01/12/2012	SRK	Review email and proposed stipulation and order from Bill Walker regarding extending deadlines for discovery and dispositive motions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/12/2012	SRK	Review email responses from Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton, and draft email to Bill Walker regarding proposed stipulation and order extending deadlines for discovery and dispositive motions.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/12/2012	SRK	Review Stipulation to Extend Discovery Deadline and Dispositive Motiion Deadline and Proposed Order filed by Bill Walker.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/12/2012	SRK	Review email and revised draft expert report from Zachary Renstrom and review Southwest Groundwater's Rebuttal Report.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
01/12/2012	SRK	Telephone to Zachary Renstrom regarding draft report.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/12/2012	SRK	Review email and new draft report and exhibit from Zachary Renstrom, and telephone conference with Zachary Renstrom regarding draft report.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
01/12/2012	SRK	Review file for contact information for defendants' witnesses.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/12/2012	CH	index documents	2.0	\$ 250.00	Clerical; vague.	
01/12/2012	CH	index documents	0.3	\$ 37.50	Clerical; vague.	
01/13/2012	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker re contacting Defendants' former employee/witnesses to schedule depositions.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
01/13/2012	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker regarding depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

01/13/2012	SRK	Telephone conference with Zachary Renstrom and review emails from Zachary Renstrom with draft expert report and attachments.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
01/13/2012	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom with final expert report.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/13/2012	SRK	Work with paralegal Charlotte Haught regarding preparation of expert disclosure, draft Plaintiffs/Plaintiff-Intervenor's Joint Expert Disclosure and Notice of Service, and e-file Notice of Service.	2.10	\$ 619.50		
01/13/2012	SRK	Draft emails to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with Joint Expert Disclosure and Expert Report.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/13/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura with Defendants' Final Expert Witness Disclosures and Expert Reports.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/13/2012	SRK	Draft email to Zachary Renstrom with Defendants' Final Expert Reports.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/13/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/13/2012	SRK	Draft email to court reporter Marty Herder regarding St. George depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
01/13/2012	SRK	Review email from Katie Cox regarding problems with local law enforcement and forward information to Bill Walker.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/13/2012	SRK	Review United Effort Plan objection filed in Utah State Court to State of Arizona's subpoena duces tecum for records subject to protective order.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/13/2012	CH	prepare PDF of expert report and burn to CD's	0.5	\$ 62.50		
01/13/2012	CH	index documents	1.5	\$ 187.50	Clerical; vague.	
01/17/2012	SRK	Review email and letter from Mike Piccarretta's office regarding Jake Barlow's deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/17/2012	SRK	Review file in preparation for Jake Barlow's deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		

01/17/2012	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker regarding telephonic deposition of Jake Barlow, and emails to Bill Walker regarding Jake Barlow's deposition.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
01/17/2012	SRK	Review emails from Jeff Matura regarding Jake Barlow deposition.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
01/17/2012	SRK	Telephone from Charlotte Haught regarding Mohave County certified documents showing Colorado City's involvement in Centennial Park's subdivision proceeding.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; duplicative entry on pg. 105.	
01/17/2012	SRK	Telephone conferences with Jinjer Cooke regarding problems with law enforcement.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/17/2012	SRK	Telephone calls with United Effort Plan Trust Attorney Jeff Shields regarding filing of UEP Notice and Objection to SDT from State of Arizona for FLDS documents subject to protective order.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
01/17/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura regarding deposition of Brian Zitting, and telephone conference with Bill Walker regarding Brian Zitting deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/17/2012	SRK	Draft emails to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton regarding conference call for deposition scheduling, review email response from Jeff Matura, and draft reply.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/17/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields regarding protective order for documents State subpoenaed from UEP.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/17/2012	CH	telephone calls and e-mails with Sandra Kane re documents; index last of Col City documents; revise and finalize the Mohave County Public Records Request	2.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference; block billing; duplicative of entry on pg. 104.	Reduced by 20%.

01/18/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields regarding need for service on Warren Jeffs of UEP objection to State's subpoena duces tecum for documents covered by protective order.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/18/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton regarding deposition scheduling.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/18/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker regarding deposition scheduling.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/18/2012	SRK	Telephone conference with Angela Goodwin of Texas Attorney General's Office regarding logistics of obtaining documents seized from FLDS Ranch, and draft email to Angela Goodwin regarding request for FLDS documents.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Not related to claims.	
01/18/2012	SRK	Review audio interviews of Hyrum Roundy and other police officers taken by Darcy Volbrecht regarding prosecution of UEP employee, and draft letter to Bill Walker regarding the audio interviews of Defendants' police officers.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/18/2012	SRK	Review emails from Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker regarding potential deposition dates, and draft email to Bill Walker, Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura regarding February depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/18/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields forwarding ruling and order from Judge Lindberg regarding potential Rule 11 sanctions against Blake Hamilton for frivolous lawsuit against non-FLDS Richard Holm.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
01/19/2012	SRK	Review email from Angela Goodwin of Texas Attorney General's Office regarding obtaining FLDS documents seized in Texas, and draft reply to Angela Goodwin re same.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	

01/19/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields regarding need for service on Warren Jeffs of UEP objection to State of Arizona's subpoena duces tecum for FLDS documents in accordance with protective order, and draft reply to Jeff Shields.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/19/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding depositions and discovery.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/19/2012	SRK	Review court order extending discovery and dispositive motion deadlines.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/19/2012	SRK	Review documents from Utah Division of Water Rights concerning Power Plant Well, and draft email to Utah Utility Agency regarding use of water from Power Plant Well.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
01/20/2012	SRK	Review email from Angela Goodwin of Texas Attorney General's Office regarding Warren Jeffs' address, and draft email to Jeff Shields with Warren Jeffs' address for service of UEP objection to State's subpoena duces tecum pursuant to protective orders.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/20/2012	SRK	Arrange for court reporter and videographer for depositions in UT with Marty Herder, resolve procurement issues related to UT depositions with procurement director Jerry Connolly, telephone conversations and emails with Bill Walker regarding depositions and procurement issues.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Clerical.	
01/20/2012	SRK	Review Colorado City documents in preparation for Rule 30(b)(6) depositions of Defendant witnesses.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
01/22/2012	SRK	Review additional file documents in preparation for depositions of Rule 30(b)(6) witnesses.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
01/23/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

01/23/2012	SRK	Telephone calls to Bill Walker regarding depositions.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/23/2012	SRK	Review deposition of Victor Jessop in preparation for Rule 30(b)(6) deposition.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
01/24/2012	SRK	Review email from Gary Engels regarding Holm School incident and failure of police to enforce Richard Holm's occupancy agreement with UEP, and draft email to Bill Walker regarding Holm School incident.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/24/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding water availability.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker regarding 10th Circuit oral argument in FLDS v. Wisan regarding control of UEP land.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
01/24/2012	SRK	Review documents regarding power plant well production capacity in preparation for Rule 30(b)(6) depositions.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
01/24/2012	SRK	Telephone to Zachary Renstrom regarding power plant water rights in preparation for depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/24/2012	SRK	Draft outline for Victor Jessop's Rule 30(b)(6) deposition.	2.80	\$ 826.00		
01/25/2012	SRK	Continue to prepare for depositions of Rule 30(b)(6) witnesses of Hildale and Colorado City, including review of documents produced by Twin City Water Works, Colorado City and the Utility Defendants.	8.00	\$ 2,360.00		
01/25/2012	SRK	Work with Charlotte Haught on disclosure of photos.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/25/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura regarding Attorney Ken Brendel's participation in upcoming depositions, and draft email to Bill Walker regarding same.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/25/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re disclosure documents and deposition transcript	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
01/25/2012	CH	prepare documents for disclosure	1.0	\$ 125.00		

01/26/2012	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Jeff Matura regarding Ken Brendel's attendance at depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/26/2012	SRK	Continue to prepare for depositions of Rule 30(b)(6) witnesses, including reviewing Twin City Water Works contracts and depositions of Victor Jessop and Scott Jessop.	9.00	\$ 2,655.00		
01/26/2012	CH	prepare documents for Cooke disclosure	0.7	\$ 87.50		
01/27/2012	SRK	Telephone conference with Jesse Cuilty regarding deposition corrections.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/27/2012	SRK	Continue to prepare for Rule 30(b)(6) depositions.	7.00	\$ 2,065.00	Excessive.	
01/27/2012	SRK	Review objection from Seth Steed Jeffs to State's subpoena duces tecum to UEP for FLDS documents, and telephone conference to Jeff Shields regarding same.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/27/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding deposition preparation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/27/2012	SRK	Review and edit State's 7th Supplemental Disclosure Statement and Notice of Service.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/27/2012	SRK	Telephone to Alma Cawley regarding deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/27/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura with Supplemental Discovery Responses from Town of Colorado City.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/27/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields with Transcript of Hearing in Holm School case.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Not related to claims.	
01/27/2012	CH	draft disclosure; prepare documents	2.1	\$ 262.50		
01/28/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding deposition preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/28/2012	SRK	Review research from AAG Jennifer Larson regarding FRCP 30(b)(6) issues.	1.30	\$ 383.50		

01/28/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura regarding Colorado City's supplemental discovery and status of verification of interrogatory answers.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/28/2012	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton regarding status of supplemental discovery from Hildale Defendants, and draft reply to Blake Hamilton regarding same.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/28/2012	SRK	Prepare documents for witness depositions.	4.80	\$ 1,416.00		
01/28/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields re State's SDT to UEP, and draft reply to Jeff Shields.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/29/2012	SRK	Prepare deposition exhibits.	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
01/29/2012	SRK	Meeting with Isaac Wyler and Bill Walker in preparation for depositions of Jonathan Roundy and Hyrum Roundy of Marshal's Office.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
01/30/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker in preparation for Rule 30(b)(6) witness depositions.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
01/30/2012	SRK	Review deposition transcripts of Victor Jessop and Jonathan Fischer in preparation for depositions of 30(b)(6) witnesses	4.50	\$ 1,327.50		
01/30/2012	SRK	Prepare for depositions of Jonathan Roundy and Hyrum Roundy.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		
01/31/2012	SRK	Prepare for Rule 30(b)(6) depositions.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
01/31/2012	SRK	Attend depositions of Rule 30(b)(6) witnesses Victor Jessop and Jonathan Fischer.	7.50	\$ 2,212.50		
01/31/2012	SRK	Prepare for deposition of Guy Timpson.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
02/01/2012	SRK	Continue to prepare for deposition of Guy Timpson.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
02/01/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Jonathan Roundy.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
02/01/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Hyrum Roundy.	2.00	\$ 590.00		

02/01/2012	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker in preparation for deposition of Jake Barlow.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/01/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Guy Timpson..	1.50	\$ 442.50		
02/01/2012	SRK	Attend telephonic deposition of Jake Barlow.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
02/02/2012	SRK	Meet with Ron and Jinjer Cooke and Bill Walker in Colorado City re depositions and case status, and tour Maxwell Canyon and Water Canyon and relevant locations in Colorado City and Hildale.	2.80	\$ 826.00		
02/03/2012	SRK	Telephone from Videographer Don Upham regarding video for Rule 30(b)(6) depositions, and confer with Charlotte Haught regarding video specifications.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/03/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker regarding tax status of UEP property, draft reply to Bill Walker regarding same.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
02/03/2012	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught regarding status of oral argument in 10th Circuit regarding control of UEP property.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference; not related to claims.	
02/03/2012	CH	respond to e-mails from Donna re traveling with documents	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
02/06/2012	SRK	Review email from Marty Herder regarding depositions.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Clerical.	
02/06/2012	SRK	Review disclosure statements regarding undeposed witnesses and assess need for additional depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/06/2012	SRK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker regarding scheduling expert and non-expert depositions, and draft email to Bill Walker with proposed dates for expert witness depositions.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/06/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton regarding scheduling depositions and status of discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

02/06/2012	SRK	Review letter from Angela Goodwin regarding status of Texas FLDS documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
02/06/2012	SRK	Telephone from Don Upham regarding video depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
02/06/2012	SRK	Research regarding federal and state remedies for deprivation of rights by police agencies.	4.90	\$ 1,445.50	
02/07/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura regarding depositions, and draft reply regarding a telephone call to plan depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
02/07/2012	SRK	Work with Charlotte Haught on additional disclosures.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference; duplicative.
02/07/2012	CH	meet with Sandra Kane re disclosures; follow up on meeting	3.3	\$ 412.50	Internal conference.
02/08/2012	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Jeff Matura and Bill Walker regarding scheduling depositions.	0.80	\$ 236.00	
02/08/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding Cooke conciliation issues, and draft email to Ann Hobart regarding conciliation issues discussed with Bill Walker.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.
02/09/2012	SRK	Telephone conversation with Jinjer Cooke re police issues in Colorado City, and confer with Ann Hobart re police issues in Colorado City	0.80	\$ 236.00	
02/09/2012	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton regarding status of supplemental discovery from Hildale Defendants.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
02/09/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura and Bill Walker regarding having a conference call to schedule expert witness depositions	0.60	\$ 177.00	
02/09/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura with proposed subpoena duces tecum to Zachary Renstrom.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
02/10/2012	SRK	Telephone conversations with Bill Walker regarding deposition of Zachary Renstrom and strategy for additional depositions.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.

02/14/2012	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Walker in preparation for conference call regarding deposition scheduling.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/14/2012	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Bill Walker, and Blake Hamilton regarding scheduling additional depositions.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
02/14/2012	SRK	Review research regarding Rule 26 on expert witness disclosures.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
02/14/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker regarding expert witness disclosures under Rule 26.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton regarding documents available from Zachary Renstrom.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
02/14/2012	SRK	Draft letter to Bill Walker with flash drive containing indexed documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker regarding Helaman Barlow impeachment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2012	SRK	Review Judge Lindberg's ruling noting civil rights issues affecting UEP.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
02/15/2012	SRK	Email communications with Zachary Renstrom regarding status of copying file in response to SDT.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/15/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding discovery issues.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
02/15/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker regarding existing water connection.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/15/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Jinjer Cooke regarding water connections.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/15/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker regarding status of criminal cases against Jake Barlow and David Darger.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims; internal conference.	
02/15/2012	SRK	Work on locating current contact information for John Cook to schedule deposition, including contacting relatives and Jethro Barlow of UEP.	1.00	\$ 295.00		

02/15/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communication with Matthew Musser regarding deposition.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/15/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Shields with written consents from witnesses for release of their UEP petitions for benefits.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/16/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker and Jeff Shields regarding UEP objection to Defendants' subpoenas duces tecum to UEP and Zachary Renstrom, and UEP release of petitions for benefits based on consents provided by petitioners.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
02/16/2012	SRK	Email communications with Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura regarding Aaron Timpson deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/16/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications to Aaron Timpson regarding deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/16/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Paula of Washington County, Bill Walker, Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura to schedule deposition of Washington County Commissioner Alan Gardner.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
02/16/2012	SRK	Telephone to Alma Cawley regarding scheduling deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/16/2012	SRK	Telephone to Michael Bradshaw regarding scheduling deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/16/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Jethro Barlow, Jinjer Cook and Emily Cook to locate current contact information for witness John Cook to schedule deposition.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
02/16/2012	SRK	Efforts to reach John Cook by letter, email and telephone regarding deposition.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
02/16/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding locating key documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

02/16/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding video evidence.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/16/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jeff Shields regarding file review by counsel for Seth Jeffs of documents subpoenaed from UEP by State and covered by protective order.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/16/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields with four UEP petitions for benefits regarding pattern or practice witnesses for the State, and draft reply to Jeff Shields.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
02/16/2012	CH	start 8th Supp disclosure; telephone call with Sandra Kane	0.3	\$ 30.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
02/16/2012	CH	review pictures for Sandra, email to Sandra	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
02/17/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Jeff Shields regarding pattern and practice claims, UEP efforts to trade an existing water connection for Cookes, and recent incidents involving FLDS encroachment on UEP occupancy agreements.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
02/17/2012	SRK	Review file for documents regarding UEP offers to trade an existing water connection for new connection for Cookes.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/17/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding contact with UT Insurance Adjuster Diane Moreno regarding settlement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/17/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Mike Bradshaw regarding availability for deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/17/2012	SRK	Telephone to Randy Jenson regarding availability for deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

02/17/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton regarding update on deposition witnesses, revised deposition schedule due to St. George court appearance for defense counsel, and deposition witnesses from Garkane.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
02/17/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/17/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields regarding FLDS dictations concerning control of city government.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/21/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re office closure, disclosure, document request	0.5	\$ 62.50	Internal conference.	
02/22/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom regarding responding to SDT to Zachary Renstrom.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
02/22/2012	SRK	Telephone communication to Jeff Matura regarding response to SDT to Zachary Renstrom.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/22/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker, Jeff Shields and Jethro Barlow regarding witnesses and conciliation issues.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
02/22/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Attorney Richard Clark regarding deposition of Randy Jenson.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
02/22/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Attorney Dan Smith regarding Smith's request for extension of time for response to State's SDT to UEP.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/22/2012	SRK	Telephone to Jeff Shields regarding Dan Smith's request to delay State's receipt of subpoenaed documents from UEP.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/22/2012	SRK	Make travel arrangements and hotel reservations for depositions in St. George.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Clerical.	

02/22/2012	CH	meet with Sandra re docs for disclosure. print out documents for Sandra	0.5	\$ 62.50	Internal conference; clerical.	
02/23/2012	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom with list of topics and email communications, and review Renstrom documents for privilege and Rule 26 issues.	3.80	\$ 1,121.00		
02/23/2012	SRK	Telephone communication with Jeff Shields regarding witnesses for pattern or practice claim and status of 10th Circuit appeal.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
02/23/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding retaliatory car incident and videos.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/23/2012	SRK	Telephone communication with Bill Walker regarding document disclosures and meetings with Cookes.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/23/2012	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Dan Smith regarding reasons for requesting extension to respond to State's SDT to UEP.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
02/23/2012	SRK	Review and docket deposition notices from defendants.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Clerical.	
02/24/2012	SRK	Conference Call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom regarding documents in response to SDT.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
02/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton regarding Zachary Renstrom's SDT and deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/24/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re Zachary Renstrom SDT and Deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re SDT to Zachary Renstrom.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/24/2012	SRK	Telephone to Matthew Musser re deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/24/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications to Joseph Young re treatment by Defendants and deposition.	0.80	\$ 236.00		

02/24/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton regarding additional pattern or practice witness Joseph Young and deposition.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/24/2012	SRK	Telephone to Attorney Roger Hoole to identify potential additional witnesses for pattern or practice claim.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/24/2012	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton with deposition subpoenas for witnesses.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Richard Clark regarding subpoena for Randy Jenson.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/24/2012	SRK	Review email from Roger Hoole with order from Judge Lindberg regarding Holm School incident.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
02/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught regarding preparation of next supplemental disclosure statement.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/27/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Zachary Renstrom regarding documents to produce to Defendants.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/27/2012	SRK	Review emails and documents provided by Zachary Renstrom for privilege.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
02/27/2012	CH	index documents from recent disclosures and discovery responses	4.5	\$ 562.50		
02/27/2012	CH	index documents	0.9	\$ 112.50	Clerical; vague.	
02/27/2012	CH	index documents	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical; vague.	
02/27/2012	CH	index documents	0.8	\$ 100.00	Clerical; vague.	
02/28/2012	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker regarding SDT to Renstrom.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
02/28/2012	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Zachary Renstrom and Jeff Shields regarding SDT to Zachary Renstrom.	1.10	\$ 324.50		

02/28/2012	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom with documents and privilege log.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
02/28/2012	SRK	Email communications with Charlotte Haught regarding disclosure of Renstrom documents. And preparation of supplemental disclosure statement.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
02/28/2012	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Walker regarding planning for upcoming depositions.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/28/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura regarding deposition witnesses.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
02/28/2012	SRK	Telephone to Aaron Timpson in preparation for deposition.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
02/28/2012	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Jinjer Cooke regarding law enforcement issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/28/2012	SRK	Review emails from Isaac Wyler regarding law enforcement issues in Colorado City.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/28/2012	CH	meet with Sandra Kane to discuss upcoming disclosure	0.4	\$ 50.00	Internal conference.	
02/29/2012	SRK	Telephonic and email communications with Zachary Renstrom regarding privilege log.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/29/2012	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught regarding privilege log and production of documents from Zachary Renstrom in response to SDT.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/29/2012	SRK	Telephone to Lorin Holm regarding Holm School incident and law enforcement.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/29/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding discovery issues and preparation for conference call with Alan Gardner.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/29/2012	SRK	Conference calls with Alan Gardner, Eric Clarke, Chris of Alan Gardner's office, and Bill Walker in preparation for Alan Gardner's deposition.	1.30	\$ 383.50		

02/29/2012	SRK	Confer with Charlotte Haught regarding preparation of 8th Supp. Disclosure Statement.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/29/2012	SRK	Review and edit 8th Supp. Disclosure Statement.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
02/29/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton, and Bill Walker regarding disclosure statement, documents from Zachary Renstrom, and privilege log.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
02/29/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura regarding disclosure statement concerning Joseph Young.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/29/2012	SRK	Telephone to Matthew Musser re deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/29/2012	CH	prepare 8th Supp disclosure	3.1	\$ 387.50		
02/29/2012	CH	prepare disclosure	1.5	\$ 187.50		
03/01/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom regarding scope of documents subject to SDT and revised privilege log.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
03/01/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker regarding Rule 26 amendment concerning disclosure of communications with experts.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/01/2012	SRK	Draft 8th Supplemental Disclosure Statement and e-file Notice of Service of 8th Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	2.20	\$ 649.00		
03/01/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Shields and Dan Smith regarding objection to State's SDT for UEP documents subject to protective order.	0.40	\$ 118.00		

03/01/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Gary Engels and James Schoppmann of Mohave County Attorney's Office regarding availability for discovery of Colorado City and Hildale records and communications seized by Mohave County and related privilege log.	1.10	\$ 324.50		
03/01/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re status of obtaining Mohave County's seized records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/01/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura re document in State's disclosure statement.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/01/2012	SRK	Email communications with Bill Walker regarding draft notice of deposition of Defendants' expert witnesses.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/01/2012	SRK	Draft email to court reporter Marty Herder regarding attendance at upcoming depositions of Defendants' expert witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
03/01/2012	CH	update Master Document list; index Col City documents; discuss with Sandra	1.3	\$ 130.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
03/01/2012	CH	prepare documents for disclosure	1.5	\$ 187.50		
03/01/2012	CH	finalize disclosure, burn CD's; prepare cover letter and NOS	1.8	\$ 180.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
03/02/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding fraud issues and additional harassment.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
03/02/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Mike Bradshaw regarding deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/02/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with John Cook and Bill Walker in preparation for John Cook's deposition.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
03/02/2012	SRK	Meeting with Pam Culwell, Ann Hobart, and Mark Bookholder regarding obtaining access to searchable FLDS documents from Texas AG's Office.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	

03/02/2012	SRK	Telephone to Jeff Shields regarding status of obtaining documents in response to State's SDT to UEP.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
03/02/2012	CH	get boxes and materials for S. Kane for her upcoming travel depos	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical.	
03/03/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker regarding depositions in St. George.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/03/2012	SRK	Telephone from Isaac Wyler regarding depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/03/2012	SRK	Telephone communications to witnesses Joseph Young, Mathew Musser, Alma Cawley, Michael Bradshaw, and Garkane employees regarding depositions.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
03/03/2012	SRK	Prepare for depositions of Joseph Young, Mathew Musser, Alma Cawley, Michael Bradshaw, Aaron Timpson, John Cook, Randy Jenson, Alan Gardner, Zachary Renstrom and Garkane employees Travis Fox and Jeff Vaughn.	10.00	\$ 2,950.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
03/04/2012	SRK	Meeting with Joseph Young in St. George UT in preparation for deposition.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
03/04/2012	SRK	Telephone to Matthew Musser regarding deposition preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/04/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker regarding depositions.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
03/05/2012	SRK	Prepare for and attend meeting with Matthew Musser in preparation for deposition.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/05/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding depositions for herself and son.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/05/2012	SRK	Meeting with John Cook in preparation for his deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/05/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of John Cook.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
03/05/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Joseph Young.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
03/05/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Matthew Musser.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
03/05/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Aaron Timpson.	1.50	\$ 442.50		

03/05/2012	SRK	Telephone to Jeff Shields regarding status of UEP response to State's SDT.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
03/05/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Mike Bradshaw and Attorney John Braithwaite's office regarding preparation for Mike Bradshaw's deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/05/2012	SRK	Telephone to Alma Cawley in preparation for deposition.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/06/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with John Braitwaite regarding meeting in preparation for Michael Bradshaw's deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/06/2012	SRK	Telephone calls to Jeff Vaughn and Travis Fox of GarKane Energy regarding meeting to prepare for depositions.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
03/06/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Alma Cawley.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
03/06/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Randy Jenson.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
03/06/2012	SRK	Review expert reports in preparation for Zachary Renstrom's deposition.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
03/06/2012	SRK	Attend meeting with Jinjer Cooke and George Morales in preparation for their depositions.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
03/06/2012	SRK	Attend meeting with Jeff Vaughn and Travis Fox in preparation for their depositions.	2.20	\$ 649.00		
03/06/2012	SRK	Organize documents in preparation for depositions of Jeff Vaughn and Travis Fox.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/07/2012	SRK	Confer with Bill Walker in preparation for depositions of Jinjer Cooke, George Morales and Garkane witnesses.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/07/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Shields regarding response to State's SDT to UEP.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/07/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Jinjer Cooke.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/07/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of George Morales.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/07/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Jeff Vaughn.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
03/07/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Travis Fox.	2.00	\$ 590.00		

03/07/2012	SRK	Review expert witness reports in preparation for Zachary Renstrom's deposition.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/08/2012	SRK	Meeting with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker in preparation for Zachary Renstrom's deposition.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
03/08/2012	SRK	Meeting with Michael Bradshaw and John Braithwaite in preparation for Michael Bradshaw's deposition.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
03/08/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Michael Bradshaw.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
03/08/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Zachary Renstrom - part 1.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
03/09/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Alan Gardner.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
03/09/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Zachary Renstrom - part 2.	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
03/12/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bruce Wisan and Jeff Shields regarding objection to SDT for petitions for benefits.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/12/2012	SRK	Email communications with Bill Walker, Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton regarding arranging a telephone call.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/12/2012	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Walker regarding obtaining disclosure from Defendants' expert witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/13/2012	CH	meet with Sandra Kane re: depos in St. George	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
03/14/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker regarding disclosure from Defendants' expert witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/14/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Shields regarding correspondence with Colorado City Attorney Ken Brendel about city policy of not honoring UEP occupancy agreements without court order.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
03/14/2012	SRK	Review Notice of Disclosure of Colorado City's 10th Supp. Disclosure Statement.	0.10	\$ 29.50		

03/14/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker to Jeff Matura requesting witness disclosure regarding former Colorado City Attorney Steve Horton.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
03/16/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding scheduling a meeting to discuss completion of discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/16/2012	SRK	Review Defendants' supplemental interrogatory answers and documents, and draft email to Bill Walker regarding same.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/19/2012	SRK	Review file and analyze status of discovery in preparation for telephonic meeting with Bill Walker.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/19/2012	SRK	Telephone conference with Bill Richards (newly retained by State to assist in this case pursuant to HUD grant) regarding status of discovery and preparation for meeting.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
03/19/2012	SRK	Review CD and DVD's from Jinjer Cooke regarding Cookes hauling water.	1.90	\$ 560.50		
03/19/2012	SRK	Review Town of Colorado City's 9th Supplemental Disclosure Statement and related documents.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
03/19/2012	SRK	Draft update to attorney notes regarding chronology of events.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
03/20/2012	SRK	Prepare for and attend telephonic meeting with Bill Walker regarding discovery planning.	2.30	\$ 678.50	Internal conference.	
03/20/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Charlotte Haught regarding overview of legal claims and evidence, and assignment regarding developing evidence regarding FLDS control of cities.	3.00	\$ 885.00	Internal conference; duplicative.	
03/20/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding videos of police and hauling of water by Cookes.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/20/2012	CH	burn CD's of case documents for Bill	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical.	

03/20/2012	CH	meet with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane to discuss status of case	3.7	\$ 462.50	Internal conference; duplicative.	
03/21/2012	SRK	Review Defendants' expert witness reports in preparation for conference call with Zachary Renstrom.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/21/2012	SRK	Conference call with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker in preparation for depositions of Defendants' expert witnesses.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/21/2012	SRK	Review Warren Jeffs' Dictations for evidence of control of Defendants and shunning of apostates.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
03/21/2012	CH	prepare cover letter and mail disc and drive to Bill	1.2	\$ 150.00	Clerical.	
03/23/2012	SRK	Locate documents and draft email to Bill Richards documents evidencing FLDS control of cities.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/23/2012	SRK	Draft email to Angela Goodwin in Texas Attorney General's Office regarding Texas FLDS documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
03/23/2012	SRK	Review expert witness reports regarding water issues in preparation for depositions of Defendants' expert witnesses.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/23/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom in preparation for depositions of Defendants' expert witnesses.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/25/2012	SRK	Prepare for depositions of Defendants' expert witnesses from Southwest Groundwater Consultants, including review of initial and rebuttal reports from Zachary Renstrom and Southwest Groundwater Consultants.	9.50	\$ 2,802.50		
03/26/2012	SRK	Prepare for depositions of Defendants' experts from Southwest Groundwater Consultants.	6.70	\$ 1,976.50		

03/26/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker regarding court reporter and preparation for depositions of Southwest Groundwater Consultant witnesses.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/26/2012	SRK	Email communication from Angela Goodwin regarding authenticating FLDS documents from Texas.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
03/26/2012	SRK	Review online testimony of Rebecca Musser in laying foundation for admission of FLDS documents in Texas litigation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
03/26/2012	SRK	Email and telephone communication with Bill Richards regarding authenticating FLDS documents from Texas and rules of evidence regarding authentication.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/26/2012	SRK	Email communications with Charlotte Haught regarding preparation of next disclosure statement.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/26/2012	CH	update Master Doc List with latest disclosures; respond to Sandra's e-mail; communicate with Donna re duplicate bates numbering	0.7	\$ 70.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
03/27/2012	SRK	Confer with Bill Walker and prepare documents for depositions of Southwest Groundwater expert witnesses.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/27/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of William Greenslade.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		
03/27/2012	SRK	Attend partial deposition of Stephen Noel.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
03/27/2012	SRK	Review Defendant Colorado City's Second Set of Requests for Production to Plaintiffs' Ronald and Jinjer Cooke, and Colorado City's Second Set of Requests for Production to the State of Arizona.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/27/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding Colorado City's discovery request.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

03/27/2012	SRK	Prepare for deposition of Defendants' expert witness David Komm and draft email to Bill Walker regarding same.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
03/28/2012	SRK	Attend completion of deposition of Stephen Noel.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
03/28/2012	SRK	Prepare for and attend deposition of David Komm.	4.80	\$ 1,416.00		
03/28/2012	SRK	Confer with Jeff Matura, Bill Walker and Blake Hamilton to schedule conference call regarding discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/28/2012	SRK	Confer with Bill Walker regarding settlement demand.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/29/2012	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Zachary Renstrom regarding depositions of Defendants' expert witnesses and invoice to Defendants for Zachary Renstrom's deposition.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
03/29/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with Zachary Renstrom's invoice, and review reply from Jeff Matura.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/29/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding expert witness depositions and discovery.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/29/2012	SRK	Email communications with Bill Richards regarding documents from State's SDT to UEP.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/29/2012	CH	meeting with Sandra Kane, Armando Hernandez and other CRD employees re review of Trial Director	1.1	\$ 137.50	Internal conference.	
04/02/2012	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Bill Richards regarding additional witnesses and admissibility of FLDS documents.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
04/02/2012	SRK	Review email from Jinjer Cooke with partial transcript of 6/2/10 police incident.	0.30	\$ 88.50		

04/02/2012	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow regarding potential victims of pattern or practice.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/02/2012	SRK	Review letter from Jeff Shields with documents compiled by Jethro Barlow regarding FLDS control of cities.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
04/03/2012	SRK	Telephone from Chris Brancart (newly retained to assist State in this case under HUD grant) regarding preparation of jury instructions, defenses, supplementing discovery, and admissibility of evidence.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
04/03/2012	SRK	Review police documents produced by Colorado City.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
04/03/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker regarding Sunrise Engineering invoice for expert witness deposition testimony.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/03/2012	SRK	Telephone to Jethro Barlow regarding subdivision plats, FLDS documents, witness regarding FLDS record-keeping, potential witnesses, and impact of transfer of irrigation water rights.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
04/04/2012	SRK	Prepare for and participate in series of telephonic communications first with Bill Walker and then with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker regarding additional discovery needed in case.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
04/04/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Richards and Chris Brancart and Elizabeth Brancart regarding conference call on remaining discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/04/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Bill Richards and Chris Brancart to discuss completion of discovery	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
04/04/2012	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart regarding subpoenas for Texas documents, UEP petitions for benefits, and protective order for petitions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

04/04/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards regarding protective order for certain UEP documents.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/04/2012	SRK	Review articles by Defendants' witness Stephen Dark regarding Colorado City, and draft emails to Bill Walker regarding same.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
04/04/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke (N/C); Email communications with Isaac Wyler regarding Most Wanted Jeans water connection.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/04/2012	SRK	Review Defendant Colorado City's 11th Supp. Disclosure Statement and new document involving allegations against Attorney General Tom Horne.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/04/2012	SRK	Review FLDS Revelation dated March 17, 2012.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/05/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Chris Brancart, Elizabeth Brancart, and Bill Richards re discovery issues and planning.	1.90	\$ 560.50	Internal conference.	
04/05/2012	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart regarding additional discovery.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/05/2012	SRK	Telephone from Kelly Pond of Sunrise Engineering regarding potential Invoice for communication with Marvin Wilson regarding water issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/05/2012	SRK	Draft email to Zachary Renstrom, Bill Walker and Chris Brancart regarding discovery issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/05/2012	SRK	Telephone to Ken Slowinski of Arizona Department of Water Resources regarding ADWR witness for deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/05/2012	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler regarding water connection for Most Wanted Jeans.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/05/2012	SRK	Telephone with Bill Walker regarding Zachary Renstrom's contract.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
04/05/2012	SRK	Docket proposed depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	

04/05/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker regarding deposition of Robert Black.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/05/2012	SRK	Draft SDT to UEP for petitions for benefits.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
04/06/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Zach Renstrom and Chris Brancart regarding water issues.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
04/06/2012	SRK	Research regarding rules on protective order and draft Stipulation for Protective Order regarding UEP Petitions for Benefits.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
04/06/2012	SRK	Telephone to Jeff Shields' regarding subpoena for UEP Petitions for Benefits.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/06/2012	SRK	Research regarding Twin City Improvement Association Corporate Records and officers and statutory agents.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
04/06/2012	SRK	Review portions of audiotape of 12/28/09 utility board meeting regarding new water connections for triplexes, and telephone conference with Bill Walker regarding audiotape and strategies for admissibility of evidence.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
04/06/2012	CH	get sample protective orders for Sandra	0.3	\$ 37.50		
04/09/2012	SRK	Telephone with Bill Walker regarding additional depositions and witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/09/2012	SRK	Draft Stipulated Motion for Protective Order and Protective Order regarding SDT for UEP Petitions for Benefits.	4.50	\$ 1,327.50		
04/09/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with UEP Attorney Jeff Shields regarding draft Stipulated Motion for Protective Order and Protective Order involving UEP petitions for benefits, acceptance of service, and disclosure regarding Steven Horton.	1.00	\$ 295.00		

04/09/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Shields with draft SDT for UEP petitions for benefits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/09/2012	SRK	Research regarding authentication of UEP petitions for benefits and draft Affidavit of Custodian of Records for subpoena to UEP.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/09/2012	SRK	Review notes regarding additional pattern or practice witnesses to be deposed, Marion Timpson and Steven Bateman.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/09/2012	SRK	Telephone to Bill Richards regarding status of locating witnesses concerning pattern or practice and authentication of FLDS records.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/10/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker regarding discovery issues and letter to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura regarding discovery.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
04/10/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker with letter to Hamilton and Matura regarding discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/10/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Jeff Shields regarding UEP acceptance of service and protective order for UEP petitions for benefits and arrangements to deliver previously subpoenaed documents covered by protective order to State.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
04/10/2012	SRK	Edit stipulated motion for protective order and protective order based on comments from Jeff Shields.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/10/2012	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura requesting approval of stipulation for protective order and protective order.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/10/2012	SRK	Confer with Leslie Ross regarding drafting of second set of non-uniform interrogatories to Defendant Town of Colorado City, and review and edit interrogatories and notice of service drafted by Leslie Ross.	1.70	\$ 501.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.

04/10/2012	SRK	Telephone to Isaac Wyler regarding witness contact information.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/10/2012	SRK	Telephone conversations with Jinjer Cooke regarding discriminatory utility practices by defendants and Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) funding projects in City.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/10/2012	SRK	Telephone to Bill Richards regarding discriminatory utility practices by defendants.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/10/2012	SRK	Review UEP Annual Report regarding interference by defendants and draft email to Bill Walker regarding UEP annual report.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.	
04/10/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Zachary Renstrom and Bill Walker regarding water issues and obtaining information from Sunrise Engineering.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/10/2012	LAR	Draft Notice of Service and Plaintiffs Second Set of Non-Uniform Interrogatories.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
04/11/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Zachary Renstrom and Bill Richards and Charlotte Haught re Sunrise Engineering.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/11/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Elizabeth Brancart in preparation for conference call regarding jury instructions and related evidence, and review sample fair housing jury instructions from Elizabeth Brancart.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; duplicative.	
04/11/2012	SRK	Prepare for and attend Conference Call regarding jury instructions and related evidence with Elizabeth Brancart, Bill Richards, Bill Walker and Charlotte Haught.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference; duplicative.	

04/11/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Bill Walker regarding evidentiary issues and witnesses.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
04/11/2012	SRK	Confer with Bill Richards regarding defenses.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
04/11/2012	SRK	Review news article regarding removal of local FLDS Bishop Lyle Jeffs.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
04/11/2012	SRK	Telephone conversation with Ann Hobart regarding extending contract limit with Zachary Renstrom, and draft email to Bill Walker regarding Renstrom contract limit and Sunrise Engineering.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
04/11/2012	SRK	Telephone to Elizabeth Brancart regarding key witnesses and agency issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/11/2012	SRK	Draft Cast of Characters list.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
04/11/2012	CH	meeting with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Sandra Kane and Elizabeth re jury instructions and evidence needed	2.0	\$ 250.00	Internal conference; duplicative.	
04/12/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards regarding sending Rule 30(b)(6) subpoena to Twin City Water Works and confer with Ann Hobart re Rule 30(b)(6) subpoena.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Objection overruled.
04/12/2012	SRK	Email communications with Bill Walker regarding contacting Marvin Wilson at Sunrise, increasing Zachary Renstrom's contract amount, and article re FLDS Bishop Lyle Jeffs.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
04/12/2012	SRK	Work on drafting cast of characters list with information regarding key witnesses.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
04/12/2012	SRK	Telephone to Bill Richards re Rule 30(b)(6) deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/13/2012	SRK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Marvin Wilson of Sunrise Engineering and Bill Walker regarding Sunrise Engineering's water reports.	0.90	\$ 265.50		

04/13/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding deposition of Sunrise Engineering.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/13/2012	SRK	Meeting at Arizona Department of Water Resources with Andrew Craddock, Rick Obenshain, and attorneys Ken Slowinski and Nicole Klobas in preparation for Andrew Craddock's deposition.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
04/13/2012	SRK	Telephone from Nancy Potter of Jeff Shields' office regarding documents seized during Warren Jeffs' arrest.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/13/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/13/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Jeff Shields regarding petitions for benefits, and edit and revise stipulated motion for protective order and protective order.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
04/13/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker regarding stipulated motion for protective order and order regarding petitions for benefits, and e-file stipulated motion for protective order and protective order regarding UEP petitions for benefits.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
04/13/2012	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Walker regarding protective order, preparation for Dr. Alcott's deposition, preparation for Andrew Craddock's deposition, and Zachary Renstrom's contract amount.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed..	
04/13/2012	SRK	Email communications with Ann Hobart regarding approval to increase Renstrom expert witness agreement.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/13/2012	SRK	Email letter to Zachary Renstrom regarding contract increase.	0.30	\$ 88.50		

04/13/2012	SRK	Email communications with Bill Richards regarding conference call with Angela Goodwin, searching records seized in Texas, and authenticating documents.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
04/13/2012	CH	respond to e-mails; review deposition exhibits and determine if new or disclosed, if new, copy To Be Disclosed folder	4.4	\$ 440.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
04/15/2012	SRK	Email communications with Marv Wilson of Sunrise Engineering regarding conference call.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/15/2012	SRK	Review documents regarding denial of water connection to Cookes, International Residential Code, and discovery responses regarding expiration of building permits.	4.50	\$ 1,327.50		
04/16/2012	SRK	Conference call with Marvin Wilson, Dao Yang and Bill Walker regarding Sunrise Engineering's findings and reports.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
04/16/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding discovery letter, demand letter, disclosures, deposition of Marvin Wilson, and laying foundation for audio recordings.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
04/16/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker to defense counsel regarding scheduling deposition of Marvin Wilson and other witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/16/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications from Jinjer Cooke regarding departure of Marshal Jonathan Roundy and related events in Colorado City.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/16/2012	SRK	Email communications with Bill Richards regarding contacting Angela Goodwin of Texas AG's Office regarding FLDS documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/16/2012	SRK	Conference call with Angela Goodwin and Bill Richards.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	

04/16/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Richards regarding contacting potential witnesses from Texas law enforcement and former FLDS members regarding record keeping to lay foundation for FLDS records seized in Texas and for FLDS letters seized in Seth Jeffs' vehicle.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference; not related to claims.	
04/16/2012	SRK	Review file for potential witness to lay foundation for Seth Jeffs' documents.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
04/16/2012	SRK	Prepare for and attend meeting with AAG Leslie Ross regarding overview of case and assignment to summarize depositions in preparation for dispositive motions and trial.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
04/16/2012	SRK	Email communications with Bill Walker regarding depositions in St. George.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/16/2012	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught regarding supplemental disclosures.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/16/2012	SRK	Review documents relating to Richard Holm in preparation for depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/16/2012	SRK	Review Town of Colorado City's Twelfth Supplemental Disclosure Statement and draft email to Bill Walker regarding same.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
04/16/2012	CH	review deposition exhibits; begin the 9th Supp disclosure; review documents to disclose	2.3	\$ 230.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
04/17/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding authentication of documents, Colorado City disclosure regarding Dr. Hannallah.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Reasonable accommodation claims dismissed.	
04/17/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker regarding Sunrise Engineering.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/17/2012	SRK	Locate discs of FLDS documents seized in Texas.	0.30	\$ 88.50		

04/17/2012	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Richards regarding contacting Texas Ranger Nick Hanna to lay foundation for FLDS documents seized in Texas.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/17/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Isaac Wyler re lack of water connection for Most Wanted Jeans.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/17/2012	SRK	Review and organize documents for supplemental disclosure.	1.70	\$ 501.50		
04/17/2012	SRK	Telephone from Nancy Potter of Jeff Shields' office regarding status and cost of subpoenaed documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/17/2012	SRK	Prepare for and attend meetings with Paralegal Charlotte Haught and Bill Richards regarding preparation of supplemental disclosures.	2.30	\$ 678.50	Internal conference; duplicative.	
04/17/2012	SRK	Telephone to Marion Timpson regarding deposition in Salt Lake City.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
04/17/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Steven Bateman regarding deposition in Salt Lake City.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/17/2012	SRK	Make arrangements for Salt Lake City depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
04/17/2012	LAR	Format deposition summary document.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
04/17/2012	CH	meet with Sandra Kane and Bill R. re discovery/disclosures	2.7	\$ 337.50	Internal conference; duplicative.	
04/17/2012	CH	copy CD's from Texas raid; prepare for delivery to Bill R.	0.8	\$ 100.00	Not related to claims.	
04/18/2012	SRK	Prepare for and participate in telephonic meeting with Steven Bateman in preparation for his deposition.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
04/18/2012	SRK	Draft email to Steven Bateman with his petition for benefits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/18/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards and Bill Walker regarding new information from Steven Bateman.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

04/18/2012	SRK	Email communications from Bill Richards and Bill Walker regarding overcoming anticipated hearsay objections to admissibility of evidence from non-parties, including FLDS records.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
04/18/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker regarding discovery scheduling and admissibility of FLDS documents from Texas.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/18/2012	SRK	Telephone communication from Marion Timpson and email to Carol Kunz of Mr. Timpson's office regarding preparation for Marion Timpson's deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/18/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke regarding medical providers.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/18/2012	LAR	Prepare Jeremiah Barlow deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	4.6	\$ 920.00		
04/18/2012	LAR	Review of Cooke file, complaint and reasonable cause determination in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
04/19/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker regarding drafting supplemental disclosure, scheduling depositions, deposition notices, and research regarding authentication of evidence.	1.60	\$ 472.00	Internal conference.	
04/19/2012	SRK	Confer with Ann Hobart regarding strategy for additional depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/19/2012	SRK	Research regarding authentication of writings.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/19/2012	SRK	Review transcript of deposition of Aaron Timpson in preparation for additional witness depositions.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
04/19/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura regarding witnesses and depositions.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/19/2012	SRK	Review notices of deposition received from Defendants.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

04/19/2012	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton regarding conference call on deposition schedule.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/19/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Andrew Chatwin regarding deposition preparation.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
04/19/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Richards regarding review of FLDS documents from Texas.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/19/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards regarding research re authenticity of writings.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/19/2012	SRK	Review letter from Jeff Shields with subpoenaed documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/19/2012	SRK	Draft email to Zachary Renstrom regarding recording of utility board meeting.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
04/19/2012	SRK	Email communications with Court Reporter Marty Herder regarding depositions in St. George.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
04/19/2012	LAR	Prepare Jeremiah Barlow deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	5.2	\$ 1,040.00		
04/20/2012	SRK	Telephone to Marion Timpson in preparation for deposition.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
04/20/2012	SRK	Draft email to Carol Kunz and Marion Timpson with Mr. Timpson's petition for benefits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/20/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding Marion Timpson deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/20/2012	CH	edits to 9th supp disclosure, bates exhibits	2.0	\$ 250.00		
04/22/2012	SRK	Review UEP petitions for benefits to identify potential additional victims of defendants' alleged pattern or practice of discrimination.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		

04/22/2012	SRK	Attempt to reach seven (7) potential additional victims to pattern or practice claim by telephone and two (2) by email.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
04/22/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields regarding protective order for UEP petitions for benefits, and draft reply with copy of executed protective order.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/22/2012	SRK	Email exchange with Chris Brancart regarding assignment to assist in preparation of jury instructions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/22/2012	SRK	Telephone to Richard Holm regarding identity and contact information for potential foundation witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/22/2012	SRK	Telephone to Thomas Holm regarding foundation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/22/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards regarding foundation witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/22/2012	SRK	Telephone to Danny Stubbs regarding deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/22/2012	SRK	Telephone to Shane Stubbs regarding deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/23/2012	SRK	Confer with Legal Extern Andreanna Smith regarding review of electronic documents seized during Colorado traffic stop of Seth Jeffs.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2012	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Walker regarding scheduling of depositions.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/23/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Blake Hamilton, and Jeff Matura regarding scheduling of depositions.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
04/23/2012	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Walker regarding using Jeff Shields as witness.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker regarding withdrawal of Jeff Shields as witness.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

04/23/2012	SRK	Telephone to Bill Richards regarding witnesses for foundation of documents and possible telephonic depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Shane Stubbs and Danny Stubbs regarding disclosure of contact information.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/23/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker regarding new contact info for witnesses Shane Stubbs, Danny Stubbs and Richard Holm.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/23/2012	SRK	Email communications with Bill Richard regarding possible foundation witness for FLDS documents seized in Escalade during arrest of Warren Jeffs.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2012	SRK	Review Town of Colorado City's 13th Supplemental Rule 26(a) Disclosure Statement and related documents.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/23/2012	SRK	Review Plaintiffs' 6th Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
04/23/2012	SRK	Review regarding documents obtained during Seth Jeffs arrest and draft email to Bill Richards regarding contacting potential foundation witness for those documents.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/23/2012	SRK	Draft email to Chris Brancart regarding anticipated damages issues for deposition of defense expert witness Daniel Rondeau.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2012	LAR	Prepare Jeremiah Barlow deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	3.3	\$ 660.00		
04/23/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re disclosure	0.5	\$ 62.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2012	CH	continue preparing exhibits for disclosure	0.6	\$ 75.00		
04/23/2012	CH	prepare exhibits for disclosure	0.6	\$ 75.00		

04/23/2012	CH	edits to disclosure statement; prepare exhibits for disclosure	2.7	\$ 337.50		
04/24/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Charlotte Haught and IT staff regarding problems viewing electronic data received from UEP per subpoena.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference; clerical.	
04/24/2012	SRK	Conference with Legal Extern Dana Boxmeyer regarding summarizing depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/24/2012	SRK	Review Ron Cooke's medical records in preparation for meeting with Dr. Alcott, and attend meeting with Dr. Sally Alcott and Bill Walker in preparation for Dr. Alcott's deposition.	2.70	\$ 796.50	Not related to claims. Claims dismissed.	
04/24/2012	SRK	Confer with Bill Walker regarding disclosure of Cooke family photos and depositions of Shane and Danny Stubbs.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
04/24/2012	SRK	Conference call to Bill Richards with Bill Walker regarding custodians of records for FLDS documents.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/24/2012	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton regarding service of subpoenas on Shane and Danny Stubbs.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Elizabeth and Chris Brancart regarding damages issues research issues in preparation for deposition of Daniel Rondeau.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/24/2012	SRK	Review legal memo regarding fair housing damages from Elizabeth and Chris Brancart, draft reply to Brancarts, and forward legal memo and cases to Bill Walker.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
04/24/2012	SRK	Telephone to Shane Stubbs regarding deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/24/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Richard Holm and Bill Walker regarding undue burden regarding subpoena for Richard Holm's deposition.	0.70	\$ 206.50		

04/24/2012	SRK	Confer with AAG Leslie Ross regarding review of electronic documents produced by UEP from Seth Jeffs incident , and review records on disc.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
04/24/2012	SRK	Review Summary of Ron Cooke's Deposition in preparation for Dr. Alcott's deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims. Claims dismissed.	
04/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re response to email from Blake Hamilton.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/24/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Richards regarding status of locating witnesses to authenticate FLDS documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/24/2012	LAR	Prepare Jeremiah Barlow deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.6	\$ 320.00		
04/24/2012	LAR	Review documents retrieved from Seth Steed Jeff's vehicle in preparation for Vincen Barlow, Vance Barlow, and George Barlow's depositions.	1.3	\$ 260.00		
04/24/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane; pick up hard drive and discs; continue making edits to disclosure and preparing exhibits for disclosure; review Stubbs videos and prepare for disclosure	7.1	\$ 710.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
04/25/2012	SRK	Meetings with Charlotte Haight, Leslie Ross and Law Clerk Andreanna Smith regarding review of electronic FLDS documents subpoenaed from UEP.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal communications; duplicative of entry on pg. 150.	
04/25/2012	SRK	Telephone conversations with IT employee Ken Holtkamp regarding accessing FLDS electronic data seized from Escalade.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference; clerical.	
04/25/2012	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Walker regarding depositions in St. George.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

04/25/2012	SRK	Email communications from Bill Richards regarding FLDS documents from Texas and evidence room protocol.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/25/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Marvin Wilson of Sunrise Engineering.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/25/2012	SRK	Telephone from Bill Walker regarding email to defense counsel regarding depositions of Shane and Danny Stubbs, and review email from Bill Walker to defense attorneys re depositions of Shane and Danny Stubbs.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/25/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with AZ POST Attorney Diana Stabler regarding obtaining Colorado City Town Clerk Vance Barlow's police decertification records.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
04/25/2012	SRK	Review e-filed deposition notices from Bill Walker for Daniel Rondeau and plaintiffs' St. George witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/25/2012	SRK	Draft Response to Defendant Colorado City's Second Request for Production of Documents to State of Arizona.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
04/25/2012	SRK	Review documents from Texas seizure of FLDS records at YFZ Ranch.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.	
04/25/2012	SRK	Review emails from Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker regarding access to Bruce Wisan's backup documents on Twin City Water Works expenditures.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/25/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker regarding preparation of Response to Request for Production.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/25/2012	SRK	Review Texas Rangers reports on seizure of documents from YFZ Ranch.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Not related to claims.	

04/25/2012	SRK	Review Texas FLDS documents from Bill Richards, and forward to Bill Walker.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims; internal conference.	
04/25/2012	LAR	Review documents retrieved from Seth Steed Jeff's vehicle in preparation for Vincen Barlow, Vance Barlow, and George Barlow's depositions.	5.9	\$ 1,180.00		
04/25/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane; meet with her and collect discs to be reviewed; review CD's from Seth Jeffs; meet with Ken H. re hard drive and other discs that are unplayable	7.8	\$ 780.00	Internal conference; block billing; duplicative of entry on pg. 148.	Reduced by 20%.
04/26/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Dr. Sally Alcott.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
04/26/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker and Bill Richards regarding admissibility of FLDS records.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
04/26/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Andrew Craddock of Arizona Dept. of Water Resources.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
04/26/2012	SRK	Review and edit Notice of Service of State's Response to Defendant Colorado City's Request for Production of Documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/26/2012	SRK	Confer with Charlotte Haught regarding FLDS documents and disclosure.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/26/2012	SRK	Telephone communications with Richard Holm regarding preparation for deposition, and email to Bill Walker regarding same.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
04/26/2012	SRK	Review Vance Barlow's decertification file from AZ POST.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/26/2012	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker regarding disclosure of Vance Barlow's file and FLDS documents from Texas.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	

04/26/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Bill Richards and Chris and Liz Brancart regarding FLDS documents and depositions of custodians of records.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/26/2012	SRK	Telephone from Jinjer Cooke regarding case status.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/26/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker with summaries of Cooke depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/26/2012	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re status of review of Seth Jeffs documents, and view part of video interview of Seth Jeffs.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
04/26/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker regarding preparing Richard Holm for his deposition.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/26/2012	LAR	Review documents retrieved from Seth Steed Jeff's vehicle in preparation for Vincen Barlow, Vance Barlow, and George Barlow's depositions.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
04/26/2012	CH	mail response to RFP to counsel; prepare and file NOS; made edits to 9th Supp disclosure; index documents that Bill reviewed/highlighted	7.0	\$ 700.00	Block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
04/27/2012	SRK	Email communications with Bill Walker regarding potential foundation witness.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/27/2012	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton to Jeff Shields regarding access to TCWW spending documents.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
04/27/2012	SRK	Review and edit State's 9th Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
04/27/2012	LAR	Review documents retrieved from Seth Steed Jeff's vehicle in preparation for Vincen Barlow, Vance Barlow, and George Barlow's depositions.	0.9	\$ 180.00		
04/27/2012	CH	prepare exhibits and update disclosure statements; review videos	3.3	\$ 330.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
04/27/2012	CH	bates and index documents; add to disclosure	1.4	\$ 175.00		

04/27/2012	CH	prepare materials for Bill; telephone call with Sandra	0.8	\$ 80.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
04/30/2012	CH	telephone calls with Bill; review TX documents and Bates stamp; prepare CD's for Nick Hanna and Bill Williams - deliver to Fed Ex office	5.5	\$ 550.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
04/30/2012	CH	review e-mails; telephone call with Sandra; review documents	1.5	\$ 150.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/01/2012	LAR	Review documents retrieved from Seth Steed Jeff's vehicle in preparation for Vincen Barlow, Vance Barlow, and George Barlow's depositions.	2.8	\$ 560.00	Excessive; duplicative.	
05/01/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane; edits to NOD	0.3	\$ 30.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/01/2012	CH	drop off CD to Copy center; return Sandra's call; prepare NOD for Nick Hanna	1.7	\$ 170.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/01/2012	CH	finish NOD for Hanna and Foster; print copies of documents to be used for Hanna deposition and work with Donna on getting both NOD and documents to all parties	2.5	\$ 250.00	Block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
05/01/2012	CH	prepare Notice of appearance for Bill Richards; discuss TX documents with Bill	1.3	\$ 130.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/02/2012	LAR	Review documents retrieved from Seth Steed Jeff's vehicle in preparation for Vincen Barlow, Vance Barlow, and George Barlow's depositions.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
05/02/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary for Jethro Barlow in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.7	\$ 540.00		
05/02/2012	CH	follow up from filing of NOD; telephone call with S. Kane and B. Richards	1.0	\$ 100.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/02/2012	CH	finalize 9th Supplemental disclosure; burn CD's, assist Sandra and Donna with documents for depositions	2.0	\$ 200.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.

05/03/2012	SRK	Attend telephonic deposition of FBI Agent Robert Foster.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/03/2012	SRK	Confer with AAG Leslie Ross re locating letter from Vance Barlow in Texas FLDS documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal confernce.	
05/03/2012	SRK	Draft email to Texas Ranger John Nick Hanna re authenticating letter from Vance Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/03/2012	SRK	Review documents in preparation for deposition of Texas Ranger John Nick Hanna.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/03/2012	SRK	Review email from John Nick Hanna re document review.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/03/2012	SRK	Review and edit Plaintiff-Intervenor's Notice of Service of 9th Supplemental Disclosure Statement and Notice of Service.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
05/03/2012	SRK	Attend telephonic deposition of John Nick Hanna, locate Ranger Hanna's affidavit and previously disclosed authenticated Texas FLDS documents from Natalie Malonis, Draft email to John Nick Hanna re same, Draft email to Blake Hamilton, Jeff Matura and Bill Walker re same.	4.00	\$ 944.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/03/2012	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards re depositions and strategy.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re upcoming depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Ron Cooke re upcoming depositions.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
05/03/2012	LAR	Review Vance Barlow's letter to Warren Jeffs in preparation for Vance Barlow's deposition.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
05/03/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary for Jethro Barlow in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
05/03/2012	CH	prepare 10th Supp disclosure	1.6	\$ 200.00		
05/03/2012	CH	burn CD's for disclosure; prepare documents for Hanna deposition	1.4	\$ 140.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.

05/03/2012	CH	finalize 10th Supp disclosure and exhibits; assist Donna with disclosures; index exhibits on Master Doc List	3.2	\$ 320.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re depositions of custodians of records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re preparation for depositions in St. George.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Internal conference.	
05/04/2012	SRK	Review email from court reporter Marty Herder re depositions, Draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
05/04/2012	SRK	Review and edit Plaintiff-Intervenor's 10th Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
05/04/2012	SRK	Review email from John Nick Hanna re deposition exhibits.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
05/04/2012	SRK	Draft email to John Nick Hanna re authenticating additional documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/04/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker re Plaintiff-Intervenor's 9th and 10th Supplemental Disclosure Statements.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/04/2012	SRK	Review email from Gary Engels re Jeremiah Barlow and Sam Barlow documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
05/04/2012	SRK	Review email from Randy Dryler with documents for Stephen Dark's deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/04/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re documents for Stephen Dark's deposition.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/04/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura with additional documents for Brian Zitting deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re disclosure of documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/04/2012	SRK	Conference with AAG Leslie Ross re additional disclosure.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/04/2012	SRK	Draft email to Chris and Liz Brancart re pattern or practice claim.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	

05/04/2012	LAR	Research documents retrieved from Seth Steed Jeff's vehicle in preparation for Vincen Barlow, Vance Barlow, and George Barlow's depositions.	2.1	\$ 420.00		
05/04/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary for Jethro Barlow in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.1	\$ 220.00		
05/04/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra re identifying other parties disclosures in our own disclosure; discussion with Rachel re: Fed rules on disclosures; e-mails and phone calls with Leslie Ross re 11th Supp disclosure	1.4	\$ 140.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/04/2012	CH	update Master Document List	2.1	\$ 262.50		
05/05/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Craig Neeley in preparation for Mr. Neeley's deposition.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/05/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields re Craig Neeley and Draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/05/2012	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught and Leslie Ross re additional items for 11th disclosure statement.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/05/2012	SRK	Prepare for depositions of Andrew Chatwin, Marvin Wilson, David Zitting, Brian Zitting, Vance Barlow, Vincen Barlow, and George Barlow.	9.30	\$ 2,743.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/05/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Craig Neeley of Aqua Engineering in preparation for Craig Neeley's deposition.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/05/2012	SRK	PF depositions in St George UT of Andrew Chatwin, Shane Stubbs, Danny Stubbs, Richard Holm, Brian Zitting, David Zitting, Marvin Wilson, Vincen Barlow, Vance Barlow, and George Barlow, and Download electronic case file in preparation for depositions.	11.00	\$ 3,245.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.

05/07/2012	SRK	Meeting with Andrew Chatwin and Isaac Wyler with Bill Walker in preparation for Andrew Chatwin's deposition.	2.30	\$ 678.50		
05/07/2012	SRK	Meeting with Ron and Jinjer Cooke with Bill Walker regarding case status.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
05/07/2012	SRK	PF deposition of Andrew Chatwin.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
05/07/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields re arrangements for deposition of Robert Huddleston, protective order re petitions for benefits, and disclosure of TCWW checks.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
05/07/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker re strategy for depositions in general, and preparation for deposition of Brian Zitting.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
05/07/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Andrew Chatwin.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
05/07/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Brian Zitting.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
05/07/2012	SRK	PF deposition of David Zitting.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
05/07/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re documents to review for David Zitting's deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/07/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards with documents to review for David Zitting's deposition.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
05/07/2012	CH	prepare 11th Supp disclosure; search for documents	0.9	\$ 112.50		
05/07/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane; bate new document	0.5	\$ 62.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2012	SRK	Review email from Gary Engels re information regarding former FLDS Bishop William Jessop.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.	
05/08/2012	SRK	Draft reply to Gary Engels re former FLDS Bishop William Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
05/08/2012	SRK	Attend continuation of Andrew Chatwin's deposition.	2.80	\$ 826.00		
05/08/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Robert Huddleston re meeting for deposition preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/08/2012	SRK	Meeting with Robert Huddleston in preparation for deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		

05/08/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Robert Huddleston.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/08/2012	SRK	Attend telephonic deposition of Peggy Sue Taylor.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/08/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Stephen Dark.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/08/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker in preparation for deposition of Richard Holm.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/08/2012	SRK	Conference call with Richard Holm and Bill Walker in preparation for Richard Holm's deposition.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
05/08/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re deposition of David Zitting.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/08/2012	SRK	Review documents in preparation for deposition of David Zitting.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/08/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re exhibits for deposition of David Zitting.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2012	SRK	Review email and attachments from Bill Richards in preparation for deposition of David Zitting.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
05/08/2012	CH	review M. Bradshaw subpoena documents for Darger email; updates to 11th Supp	1.2	\$ 120.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/09/2012	SRK	PF Deposition of David Zitting.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
05/09/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker in preparation for Deposition of David Zitting.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/09/2012	SRK	Telephonic Deposition of Richard Holm.	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
05/09/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Craig Neeley.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
05/09/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of David Zitting.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
05/09/2012	SRK	Review emails from Bill Richards and attachments re preparation of supplemental disclosure statement.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
05/09/2012	LAR	Review retrieved documents from Seth Steed Jeff's vehicle in preparation for Vincen Barlow, Vance Barlow, and George Barlow's depositions.	6.5	\$ 1,300.00	Excessive; duplicative.	
05/09/2012	CH	telephone call with Leslie re disclosure	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
05/10/2012	SRK	PF Deposition of Vincen Barlow.	2.00	\$ 590.00		

05/10/2012	SRK	Review documents and emails from Charlotte Haught in preparation of State's 11th supplemental disclosure.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/10/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Vincen Barlow.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
05/10/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of Vance Barlow.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/10/2012	SRK	Attend deposition of George Barlow.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/10/2012	SRK	Review and edit Plaintiff-Intervenor's 11th Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
05/10/2012	LAR	Email communications with Bill Richards regarding documents to be included in the State's 11th Supplemental Disclosure.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
05/10/2012	LAR	Review 11th Supplemental Disclosure and email proposed revisions to Charlotte Haught.	1.4	\$ 280.00	Internal conference.	
05/10/2012	LAR	Finalize revised 11th Supplemental Disclosure.	1.7	\$ 340.00		
05/10/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary for Jethro Barlow in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Excessive; duplicative.	
05/10/2012	CH	finalize 11th Supp Disclosure; prepare exhibits for disclosure; telephone calls with Bill R. and Sandra K. re exhibits; assist Donna with service	8.5	\$ 850.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/11/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary of Seth Cooke in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	3.6	\$ 720.00		
05/11/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary for Jethro Barlow in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.3	\$ 460.00	Excessive; duplicative.	
05/14/2012	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart with legal memo re pattern and practice claim.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/14/2012	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart re depositions in St. George and strategy re motion for summary judgment.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	

05/14/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re evidence supporting reasonable accommodation claim.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
05/14/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Elizabeth and Chris Brancart re evidence obtained from depositions and legal research assignment re agency issues and reasonable accommodation in preparation of motions for summary judgment.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/14/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Bill Richards re scheduling conference call to discuss motions for summary judgment (msj) with Brancarts and Review replies from Bill Walker, Bill Richards and Brancarts.	0.40	\$ 94.40	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/14/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Bill Richards and Elizabeth and Chris Brancart re scheduling conference call.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/14/2012	SRK	Conference with Law Clerk Andreanna Smith re summarizing deposition of Jonathan Fischer.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/14/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra to discuss deposition summary progress in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
05/14/2012	LAR	Prepare Seth Cooke's deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	4.1	\$ 820.00		
05/14/2012	LAR	Prepare David Darger's deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
05/15/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re depositions in St. George.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/15/2012	SRK	Review emails from Charlotte Haight re Town of Colorado City disclosure statements.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

05/15/2012	LAR	Prepare Victor Jessop's October 29, 2009 deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.4	\$ 480.00		
05/15/2012	LAR	Prepare Ronald Cooke's deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.6	\$ 320.00		
05/15/2012	CH	review files that CRM pulled from TX documents	0.1	\$ 12.50		
05/15/2012	CH	index documents	1.0	\$ 125.00	Clerical; vague.	
05/16/2012	SRK	Review FLDS Proclamations.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims.	
05/16/2012	SRK	Review Pueblo County Sheriff's Office records re arrest of Seth Jeffs and search of Seth Jeffs' vehicle.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/16/2012	SRK	Review Town of Colorado City's Fourteenth Supplemental Disclosure Statement and related documents.	8.00	\$ 2,360.00		
05/16/2012	LAR	Prepare Victor Jessop's October 29, 2009 deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	3.2	\$ 640.00		
05/17/2012	SRK	Draft email to Mary Herder re inclusion of statement in transcript of George Barlow's deposition.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Clerical.	
05/17/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re inclusion of statement in transcript of George Barlow's deposition.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
05/17/2012	SRK	Draft reply to Jeff Matura re transcript of George Barlow's deposition.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
05/17/2012	SRK	Review email from Marty Herder re correction to transcript of George Barlow's deposition.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Clerical.	
05/17/2012	SRK	Review legal standard for reasonable accommodation.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/17/2012	SRK	Review defendants' defenses to reasonable accommodation claim.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/17/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Chris and Elizabeth Brancart re motions for summary judgment.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	

05/17/2012	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards re strategy for religious discrimination claim and evidence obtained from recent depositions.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.
05/17/2012	SRK	Draft notes re religious discrimination.	3.00	\$ 885.00	
05/17/2012	SRK	Review emails from Elizabeth Brancart with cases on reasonable accommodation.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference; claim dismissed; not related to claims.
05/17/2012	SRK	Review Notice of Service re Colorado City's Response to the State's Second Set of NUT's.	0.10	\$ 29.50	
05/17/2012	LAR	Prepare Victor Jessop's October 29, 2009 deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.5	\$ 300.00	
05/18/2012	SRK	Review case law re reasonable accommodation under the fair housing laws.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
05/18/2012	SRK	Review email from Jinjer Cooke with link to ADOT report on Colorado City transportation plan.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.
05/18/2012	SRK	Review ADOT report on Colorado City transportation plan.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Not related to claims.
05/18/2012	SRK	Review deposition of Marion Timpson.	1.00	\$ 295.00	
05/18/2012	SRK	Research re building permits and water impact fee.	0.60	\$ 177.00	
05/18/2012	SRK	Review documents and chronology re no new water connection policy.	4.60	\$ 1,357.00	
05/18/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re documents and chronology re no new water connection policy.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
05/18/2012	LAR	Prepare Victor Jessop's October 29, 2009 deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.7	\$ 340.00	
05/21/2012	SRK	Review file disclosures and deposition of Jinjer Cooke in preparation for MSJ re reasonable accommodation.	10.70	\$ 3,156.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.

05/21/2012	LAR	Prepare Victor Jessop's October 29, 2009 deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	3.1	\$ 620.00		
05/21/2012	LAR	Prepare Victor Jessop's January 31, 2012 deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.7	\$ 340.00	Excessive; duplicative.	
05/22/2012	SRK	Work on Draft Statement of Facts for MSJ on reasonable accommodation.	8.00	\$ 2,360.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/22/2012	SRK	Review demand letters from Bill Walker to defense counsel, and Conference with Ann Hobart re same.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/22/2012	LAR	Prepare Victor Jessop's January 31, 2012 deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	4.9	\$ 980.00	Excessive; duplicative.	
05/22/2012	LAR	Research regarding relevant portions of deposition designations and exhibits for inclusion in the statement of facts in support of the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment and meeting with Sandra Kane about same.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/22/2012	LAR	Research depositions for information pertaining to water added to the Colorado City and Hildale water system after 1996 in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.4	\$ 480.00		
05/23/2012	SRK	Review deposition summaries for Jonathan Fischer, Jeremiah Barlow and related exhibits in preparation of statement of facts for msj re reasonable accommodation.	6.30	\$ 1,858.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/23/2012	SRK	Conference with Andreanna Smith and Leslie Ross re deposition summaries.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

05/23/2012	SRK	Draft email to Law Clerk Arman Nafesi re verifying accuracy of administrative interview transcripts disclosed by Jeff Matura in 14th Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/23/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Isaac Wyler re trailer connected to new utilities for FLDS at site where Danny Stubbs had occupancy agreement from UEP.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/23/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Isaac Wyler re expired building permits.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
05/23/2012	SRK	Conference with Arman Nafesi re discrepancies in transcripts of administrative interviews.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/23/2012	SRK	Review orders from Judge Benson re pro hac vice admissions in connection with discovery dispute re Utah deposition in Cooke case.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/23/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re reasonable accommodation case law.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
05/23/2012	LAR	Prepare David Zitting's deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.8	\$ 560.00		
05/23/2012	LAR	Prepare Victor Jessop's January 31, 2012 deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.6	\$ 520.00	Excessive; duplicative.	
05/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re status of msj and rescheduling meeting .	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Chris and Elizabeth Brancart and Bill Richards re status of msj and meeting.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Chris and Elizabeth Brancart re agency issues and Jerry Barlow's deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/24/2012	SRK	Review meeting minutes, transcripts and Ron Cooke deposition for msj.	4.70	\$ 1,386.50		
05/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Elizabeth and Chris Brancart re transcript of meeting.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

05/24/2012	LAR	Prepare David Zitting's deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	3.4	\$ 680.00		
05/25/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re deposition testimony relating to msj.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/25/2012	SRK	Review file for recording of 9/14/09 Colorado City Town Council Meeting.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
05/25/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Order to Show Cause re Monica Kapskos and motion for protective order re bank records.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/25/2012	SRK	Review Motion for Order to Show Cause re Monica Kapskos.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/25/2012	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re Motion for OSC re Monica Kapskos and strategy re MSJ.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
05/25/2012	SRK	Review LF AZ Litigation Services re signature pages for Foster and Hanna depositions; Draft emails to Robert Foster and J. Nick Hanna re signature and correction pages for depositions.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
05/25/2012	SRK	Review emails from Robert Foster and Nick Hanna Hanna re signature and correction pages for depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/25/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re research memo re evidence issues and case law, agency issues, and assignment re religious discrimination background facts.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/25/2012	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart with case law re reasonable accommodation, draft reply, and Telephone call from Elizabeth Brancart.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
05/25/2012	SRK	Research (research) re reasonable accommodation.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Not related to claims. Claims dismissed.	
05/25/2012	LAR	Prepare David Zitting's deposition summary in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.2	\$ 240.00		

05/25/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary for Brian Zitting in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.1	\$ 420.00		
05/25/2012	LAR	Conference with Sandra Kane regarding deposition testimony needed to support the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment and research same.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
05/26/2012	SRK	Research re reasonable accommodation under the Fair Housing Amendments Act.	7.30	\$ 2,153.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/27/2012	SRK	Research re reasonable accommodation.	5.90	\$ 1,740.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/28/2012	SRK	Research re reasonable accommodation.	4.30	\$ 1,268.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/28/2012	SRK	Review deposition of Seth Cooke in preparation of msj.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
05/29/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re reasonable accommodation case law and additional research re element re necessity.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
05/29/2012	SRK	Review emails from Charlotte Haught re disclosures and respond.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/29/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re duplicate bates numbers on Colorado City documents.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/29/2012	SRK	Draft statement of facts for msj on reasonable accommodation.	6.00	\$ 1,770.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/29/2012	SRK	Review and edit LT Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re Chatwin pictures used at Andrew Chatwin's deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/29/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Research on reasonable accommodation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
05/29/2012	SRK	Review email and memo from Elizabeth Brancart re reasonable accommodation and Draft reply.	2.10	\$ 619.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
05/29/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary for Brian Zitting in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.2	\$ 40.00		

05/29/2012	LAR	Case law research on reasonable accommodations for fair housing in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.9	\$ 380.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/29/2012	LAR	Review Good Shepherd and Giebeler cases, Analyze fair housing reasonable accommodation standards for ninth circuit in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/29/2012	CH	respond to Sandra's emails; telephone call with Sandra and Donna; bates the Chatwin photos and draft cover letter	1.5	\$ 150.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/30/2012	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart re conference call re msj.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/30/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re conference call re msj.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/30/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re conference call re msj.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/30/2012	SRK	Conference call with Elizabeth Brancart, Bill Richards and Bill Walker re msj.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
05/30/2012	SRK	Begin to Review legal memo from Bill Richards re vicarious liability for msj.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/30/2012	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart to Bill Richards re vicarious liability.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/30/2012	SRK	Draft email to Elizabeth Brancart re research re reasonable accommodation and Review reply.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
05/30/2012	SRK	Review Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash SDT re TCWW bank records.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/30/2012	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re Motion to Quash and strategy for msj re reasonable accommodation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
05/30/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re facts for msj.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

05/30/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re Hildale Joinder in Motion to Quash SDT re TCWW bank records and facts for msj.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
05/30/2012	SRK	Draft email to Brancarts, Richards and Walker re facts for msj.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
05/30/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Leslie Ross re additional assignments for msj.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
05/31/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re facts for msj.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
05/31/2012	SRK	Review facts and Draft reply to Bill Walker re msj.	0.50	\$ 147.50	
05/31/2012	SRK	Review Joinder in Motion to Quash SDT re TCWW bank records and incomplete excerpt of deposition of Vance Barlow attached to Blake Hamilton's Joinder in Motion to Quash Subpoena.	0.80	\$ 236.00	
05/31/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re strategy re Hildale's Motion to Modify Scheduling Order to Add Expert Witness, Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash, and conference call with Bill Walker to Craig Ganz's office re Motion to Quash.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.
05/31/2012	SRK	Conference with Law Clerk Arman Nafesi re research re response to Motion to Modify Scheduling Order.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
05/31/2012	SRK	Review file re State's disclosures to Defendants re Dr. Alcott for Response to Motion to Modify Scheduling Order.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
06/01/2012	SRK	Conference with Law Clerk Arman Nafesi re research and issues to raise in response to Motion to Amend Scheduling Order to Allow the Disclosure of Defendants' Expert Dr. Jayne Clark.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.
06/01/2012	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re Motion to Amend Scheduling Order and Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash SDT pending in Utah.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.

06/01/2012	SRK	Research legal issues in response to Blake Hamilton's motion to modify scheduling order to add new expert witness and Conference with Ann Hobart re legal issues.	3.00	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
06/01/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re strategy in responses to Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash SDT.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/01/2012	SRK	Review Notice of Plaintiffs' Failure to File an Opposition to Non-Party TCWW's Objection and Motion to Quash Plaintiffs' Subpoena to Testify at a Deposition, Etc.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/01/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards, Telephone call from Bill Richards re response to Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
06/01/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re pro hac vice admission to respond to Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; duplicative.	
06/01/2012	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re response to Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/01/2012	LAR	Case law research on vicarious liability in fair housing cases in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
06/01/2012	CH	telephone call with Sandra re: subpoena for TCWW	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference; duplicative.	
06/02/2012	SRK	Review Final Investigative Report in preparation of Statement of Facts for MSJ.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
06/02/2012	SRK	Draft Statement of Facts.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
06/03/2012	SRK	Work on Statement of Facts for MSJ, including Review Depositions of Ron and Jinjer Cooke, Dr. Alcott, Jeremiah Barlow, Jonathan Fischer, and Bruce Wisan.	11.40	\$ 3,363.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
06/04/2012	SRK	Draft Statement of Facts re MSJ re reasonable accommodation.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	

06/04/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re supporting citations for statement of facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Judge Benson's Judicial Assistant re procedure for filing Response to Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash SDT.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
06/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Utah District Court Clerk's Office re procedure for filing Response to Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash SDT.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
06/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Utah District Court Clerk's Office re pro hac vice requirement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
06/04/2012	SRK	Research re Utah District Court website re pro hac vice procedures.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Clerical.	
06/04/2012	SRK	Conference with AAG Leslie Ross re preparation of pro hac vice forms.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call to UT AAG Randy Hunter's Office re appearing as local counsel for pro hac vice motion, Telephone call from Randy Hunter re same.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/04/2012	SRK	Draft Response to Joinder in Motion to Quash SDT and prepare exhibits.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		
06/04/2012	SRK	Review email and legal memo from Elizabeth Brancart re Avoidable Consequences and Contributory Negligence defenses.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Response to Joinder in Motion to Quash SDT and Response to Motion to Modify Scheduling Order.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/04/2012	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker with exhibits for Response to Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/04/2012	SRK	Draft email to Pam Culwell and Ann Hobart re Response to Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

06/04/2012	SRK	Review and edit pro hac vice notices of appearance, motion for pro hac vice admission and consent of local counsel, application for pro hac vice admission, ECF registration form, and order to respond to Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
06/04/2012	SRK	Draft email to paralegal Charlotte Haught re pro hac vice filing to respond to Hildale's Joinder in Motion to Quash.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/04/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary of Brian Zitting in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.2	\$ 240.00		
06/04/2012	LAR	Locate deposition excerpts in support of facts pertaining to Ronald Cooke's disability-related housing needs in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.7	\$ 540.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
06/04/2012	LAR	Review Pro Hac Vice rules for Utah. Complete Pro Hac Vice forms for Sandra Kane to respond to Twin City Water Works, Inc's Objection and Motion to Quash Plaintiffs' Subpoena to Testify at a Deposition in a Civil Action (Duces Tecum).	1.9	\$ 380.00		
06/05/2012	SRK	Finalize pro hac vice admission pleadings and response to Hildale Defendants' joinder in motion to quash subpoena re TCWW bank records.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
06/05/2012	SRK	Work on response to Hildale Defendants' motion to modify scheduling order and add new expert witness.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/05/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Hildale Defendants' Motion for OSC re Monica Kapskos deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

06/05/2012	SRK	Review legal memo from Law Clerk Arman Nafesi re response to Hildale Defendants' motion to modify scheduling order and add new expert witness.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/05/2012	SRK	Work on response to Hildale Defendants' motion to modify scheduling order and add new expert witness .	8.00	\$ 2,360.00		
06/05/2012	SRK	Review email from UT Attorney Randy Hunter re pro hac vice motion and Draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/05/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary for Brian Zitting in preparation for the State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.4	\$ 280.00		
06/05/2012	CH	respond to Sandra's emails re PHV application; follow up telephone calls with Donna re PHV app	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/06/2012	SRK	Review court order denying motion for OSC re Monica Kapscos.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/06/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re supplemental discovery, and Draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/06/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke, Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke, Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re case status.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/06/2012	SRK	Review Utah docket re pro hac vice motion for TCWW motion to quash SDT re TCWW bank records.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/06/2012	SRK	Draft email to Randy Hunter re status of response to joinder in motion in Utah.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/06/2012	SRK	Review Town of Colorado City's Amended Fourteenth Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/06/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re Town of Colorado City's Amended Fourteenth Supplemental Disclosure Statement.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/06/2012	SRK	Draft Statement of Facts re MSJ on reasonable accommodation claim.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	

06/06/2012	LAR	Review and revise controverting and supplemental statement of facts in preparation for the State's response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.9	\$ 180.00		
06/07/2012	SRK	Draft Statement of Facts re MSJ on reasonable accommodation claim.	8.00	\$ 2,360.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
06/07/2012	CH	organize CC docs; index 14th supplemental docs	2.3	\$ 287.50		
06/08/2012	SRK	Draft Statement of Facts re MSJ on reasonable accommodation claim.	9.00	\$ 2,655.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
06/08/2012	CH	index Col City documents	1.2	\$ 150.00		
06/09/2012	SRK	Draft statement of facts for msj on reasonable accommodation claim.	10.80	\$ 3,186.00	Not related to claims. Claims dismissed.	
06/10/2012	SRK	Draft Statement of Facts for MSJ on reasonable accommodation claim.	13.00	\$ 3,835.00	Not related to claims. Claims dismissed.	
06/10/2012	SRK	Draft email to Christopher and Elizabeth Brancart, Bill Richards, Bill Walker and Leslie Ross re conference call on msj.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/11/2012	SRK	Conference call with Christopher and Elizabeth Brancart, Bill Walker, Leslie Ross and Bill Richards re statement of facts and motions for summary judgment.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
06/11/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re statement of facts on reasonable accommodation claim.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
06/11/2012	SRK	Review memo from Bill Richards re motion for partial summary judgment re agency, and Draft email to Bill Richards re agency msj.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
06/11/2012	SRK	Draft and edit statement of facts for msj on reasonable accommodation claim.	10.40	\$ 3,068.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
06/11/2012	LAR	Review exhibits and deposition excerpts cited in Joint Statement of Facts in Support of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motions for Summary Judgment and revise Joint Statement of Facts.	7.3	\$ 1,460.00		

06/11/2012	LAR	Prepare for and participate in conference with Sandra Kane to discuss delegation of tasks in preparation for Plaintiffs' motions for summary judgment and joint statement of facts.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Internal conference.	
06/11/2012	CH	update Master Document Index	1.1	\$ 137.50		
06/12/2012	SRK	Draft Statement of Facts for MSJ on reasonable accommodation claim, Review comments from Christopher and Elizabeth Brancart and edit Statement of Facts on reasonable accommodation claim.	10.90	\$ 3,215.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
06/12/2012	SRK	Review and edit insert to Joint Statement of Facts from Bill Walker for Plaintiffs' common law water claim.	2.70	\$ 796.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
06/12/2012	SRK	Draft email to Brancarts, Bill Richards, Bill Walker and Leslie Ross with revised SOF.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/12/2012	LAR	Review, edit and revise Joint Statement of Facts in Support of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motions for Summary Judgment.	5.1	\$ 1,020.00		
06/13/2012	SRK	Review Research re reasonable accommodation .	2.00	\$ 590.00		
06/13/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of Statement of Facts and Exhibits.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
06/13/2012	SRK	Conference call with Christopher Brancart, Elizabeth Brancart, Bill Walker, Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re Statement of Facts and MSJ re reasonable accommodation.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
06/13/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Christopher Brancart and Elizabeth Brancart re preparation of MSJ on reasonable accommodation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/13/2012	SRK	Draft Motion for Partial Summary Judgment re Reasonable Accommodation.	11.00	\$ 3,245.00		

06/13/2012	LAR	Draft, review, and revise Joint Statement of Facts in Support of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motions for Summary Judgment.	9.5	\$ 1,900.00		
06/14/2012	SRK	Draft Motion for Partial Summary Judgment re Reasonable Accommodation.	16.30	\$ 4,808.50		
06/14/2012	LAR	Draft Jinjer Cooke's declaration for inclusion as an exhibit for the Joint Statement of Facts in Support of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motions for Summary Judgment.	3.2	\$ 640.00		
06/15/2012	SRK	Draft Motion for Partial Summary Judgment re Reasonable Accommodation, Review email comments on MSJ from Elizabeth and Christopher Brancart, Edit MSJ, Review and edit Joint Statement of Facts, work with AAG Leslie Ross re Joint Statement of Facts, Telephone call from Bill Walker re coordination of Joint Statement of Facts, Telephone call to Bill Richards re including facts re Motion for Partial Summary Judgment on Vicarious Liability.	14.80	\$ 3,492.80	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed; block billing; excessive.	Reduced by 20%.
06/15/2012	LAR	Telephone communications with Jinjer Cooke regarding accuracy of her declaration in preparation for State's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.1	\$ 20.00		
06/15/2012	LAR	Draft, review, and revise Joint Statement of Facts in Support of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motions for Summary Judgment.	2.3	\$ 460.00		
06/16/2012	LAR	Draft, review, and revise Joint Statement of Facts in Support of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motions for Summary Judgment.	2.5	\$ 500.00		

06/18/2012	SRK	Review Defendant Colorado City's motion for summary judgment and Research re cases cited in the motion and 9th Circuit standard.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
06/18/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Colorado City's msj.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/18/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker with Seth Cooke deposition.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/18/2012	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler re new trailer hookup at existing connection, Draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/18/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke re msj.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/18/2012	CH	index documents	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/19/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields re msj's and declaration from Bruce Wisan.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/19/2012	SRK	Draft reply to Jeff Shields re msj's and declaration from Bruce Wisan.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/19/2012	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re briefing deadlines, Draft reply to Leslie Ross re deadline for responses to msj's and scheduling.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/19/2012	SRK	Draft email to Christopher and Elizabeth Brancart, Bill Richards, Bill Walker and Leslie Ross re defendants' msj's.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/19/2012	SRK	Review and analyze MSJ from Colorado City.	2.70	\$ 796.50		
06/19/2012	SRK	Conference with Law Clerk Arman Nafesi re factual background and Research assignment re disparate treatment issue.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
06/19/2012	CH	index documents	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical; vague.	
06/20/2012	SRK	Review email from Ranger John Nick Hanna with signature sheet, and Draft email to Nick Hanna.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

06/20/2012	SRK	Analyze Colorado City's msj, and Meeting with Leslie Ross and Arman Nafesi re facts and legal issues for response to msj, Meeting with Andreanna Smith re Research re pattern or practice claim; Telephone call from Bill Richards re disparate treatment and disparate impact theories.	5.00	\$ 1,180.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
06/20/2012	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton requesting stipulation re motion to amend scheduling order and add new expert witness.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/20/2012	SRK	Draft response to Blake Hamilton rejecting stipulation.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/20/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re stipulation.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/20/2012	SRK	Draft another email to Blake Hamilton re availability for conference.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/20/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re email from Blake Hamilton, and Draft reply to Bill Richards.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/20/2012	LAR	Draft controverting and additional statement of facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	1.7	\$ 340.00		
06/20/2012	LAR	Conference with Sandra Kane and Arman Nafesi regarding facts and legal issues in preparation for the State's response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
06/21/2012	SRK	Review Defendants' motions for summary judgment in preparation for conference call.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
06/21/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Christopher Brancart, Elizabeth Brancart, Leslie Ross and Arman Nafesi re Statements of Facts in Defendants' msj's and legal arguments in msj's.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	

06/21/2012	SRK	Review unofficial transcript of 12/28/09 Utility Board Meeting.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
06/21/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re facts re pattern or practice claim.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/21/2012	SRK	Conference with Arman Nafesi re Research re reasonable accommodation msj.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
06/21/2012	LAR	Review Defendants' motions for summary judgment and statement of facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
06/21/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane to discuss legal arguments and delegations of tasks in preparation for the State's response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Internal conference.	
06/21/2012	LAR	Draft controverting and additional statement of facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
06/24/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Controverting Statement of Facts in Response to Colorado City's MSJ	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		
06/25/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Controverting Statement of Facts in Response to Colorado City's MSJ.	5.90	\$ 1,740.50		
06/25/2012	LAR	Draft controverting and additional statement of facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	2.3	\$ 460.00		
06/25/2012	CH	send documents to Bill R. for SOF	1.0	\$ 125.00		
06/26/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re case law supporting pattern or practice claim and related case.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/26/2012	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross and Donna ChrisJohn re preparation of exhibits for response to defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

06/26/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Controverting Statement of Facts in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	4.80	\$ 1,416.00		
06/26/2012	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re conference call with court re Hildale Defendants' Motion to Amend Scheduling Order, Draft reply to Blake Hamilton.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/26/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re draft insert re Statement of Additional Facts in Response to MSJ.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/26/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re comments on draft insert re Statement of Additional Facts in Response to MSJ.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
06/26/2012	SRK	Draft email to Christopher Brancart, Elizabeth Brancart, Bill Richards, Bill Walker and Leslie Ross re conference call.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/26/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Donna Chrisjohn regarding the preparation of exhibits for the State's response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
06/26/2012	LAR	Draft and revise controverting and additional statement of facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
06/27/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Leslie Ross re fact citations in support of Joint Controverting Statement of Facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/27/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re conference call, Draft email to Bill Walker, Christopher and Elizabeth Brancart, Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re conference call to work on response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

06/27/2012	SRK	Prepare for conference call with Judge Teilborg re Hildale Defendants' motion to amend scheduling order and disclose expert Dr. Jayne Clark.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/27/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker with draft response to Defendants' motion to amend scheduling order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/27/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re argument in opposition to motion to amend scheduling order.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/27/2012	SRK	Conference call to Judge Teilborg's judicial assistant with all counsel re scheduling hearing on Defendants' motion to amend scheduling order.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/27/2012	SRK	Edit Joint Response to Motion to Amend in accordance with court order on page limits.	3.60	\$ 1,062.00		
06/27/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker with revised draft Response to Motion to Amend.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/27/2012	SRK	Conference call with Elizabeth Brancart, Bill Richards, Bill Walker and Leslie Ross re responses to defendants' motions for summary judgment, and controverting and additional statements of facts in opposition to those motions for summary judgment.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
06/27/2012	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re facts from recent depositions for additional statement of facts.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/27/2012	SRK	Review emails from Elizabeth Brancart re case law for response to defendants' motions for summary judgment, Draft reply to Elizabeth Brancart.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/27/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Controverting Statement of Facts in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		

06/27/2012	LAR	Prepare for and participate in meeting regarding updates and delegation of assignments for the State's response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Internal conference.	
06/27/2012	LAR	Draft and revise controverting and additional statement of facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	6.6	\$ 1,320.00		
06/28/2012	SRK	Outline Joint Statement of Additional Facts and Conference with Leslie Ross re same.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/28/2012	SRK	Review Defendants' motion for summary judgment.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
06/28/2012	SRK	Research re disparate treatment under Arlington Heights proof method.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
06/28/2012	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re preparation of Joint Statement of Additional Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/28/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Joint Statement of Additional Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/28/2012	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart re legal argument for response to defendants' motions for summary judgment and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/28/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane to outline additional statement of facts in support of the State's response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	1.2	\$ 240.00	Internal conference.	
06/28/2012	LAR	Review Pinchback case for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
06/28/2012	LAR	Draft and revise controverting and additional statement of facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	4.7	\$ 940.00		

06/28/2012	LAR	Research for pattern or practice claim for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
06/28/2012	LAR	Research and review Village of Arlington Heights case (facts to determine motivating factor) and Pinchback case (futile gesture doctrine) for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.6	\$ 320.00		
06/29/2012	SRK	Research re Disparate Treatment under Arlington Heights standard for Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
06/29/2012	SRK	Review Legal Memo re from Elizabeth Brancart re disparate treatment.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
06/29/2012	SRK	Analyze facts needed for Plaintiffs' Response to Defendants' MSJ.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
06/29/2012	LAR	Draft and revise controverting and additional statement of facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	2.3	\$ 460.00		
06/29/2012	LAR	Review Brancart's memorandum on the State's pattern or practice claim in preparation for State's Response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
06/29/2012	LAR	Prepare Joseph Young deposition designations for the State's response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
06/29/2012	LAR	Conference with Andreanna Smith (extern) regarding necessary deposition excerpts to support the State's pattern or practice claim in preparation for the State's response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	

06/30/2012	SRK	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Controverting Statement of Facts.	8.50	\$ 2,507.50		
07/01/2012	SRK	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Controverting Statement of Facts.	9.30	\$ 2,743.50		
07/02/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re citations supporting Plaintiffs' Joint Controverting Statement of Facts.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
07/02/2012	SRK	Conference with Arman Nafesi re facts supporting Joint Controverting Statement of Facts.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
07/02/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Controverting Statement of Facts and locate factual citations.	10.00	\$ 2,950.00		
07/02/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Elizabeth Brancart re disparate impact and disparate treatment theories.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/02/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Christopher and Elizabeth Brancart and Leslie Ross re Draft Joint Controverting Statement of Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/02/2012	LAR	Prepare for and attend two meetings with Sandra Kane regarding research needed to support Plaintiffs and the State's additional statement of facts.	2.3	\$ 460.00	Internal conference.	
07/02/2012	LAR	Draft and revise controverting and additional statement of facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	6.9	\$ 1,380.00		
07/03/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Joint Controverting Statement of Facts and Additional Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Controverting Statement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/03/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Christopher Brancart, Elizabeth Brancart, Bill Walker and Leslie Ross re Controverting Statement.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
07/03/2012	SRK	Review and edit Draft Notice of Related Case.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

07/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards with Leslie Ross re Additional Facts in Opposition to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
07/03/2012	SRK	Edit Joint Controverting Statement and Additional Facts.	2.20	\$ 649.00		
07/03/2012	LAR	Review and Revise controverting and additional statement of facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	3.4	\$ 680.00		
07/03/2012	LAR	Prepare for an attend conference with Sandra Kane, Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Christopher Brancart, and Elizabeth Brancart regarding Plaintiffs' responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	1.1	\$ 220.00	Internal conference.	
07/03/2012	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane regarding additional facts in support of Plaintiffs and State's responses to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.9	\$ 180.00	Internal conference.	
07/04/2012	SRK	Review and cite check second draft from Bill Richards re additional facts re FLDS for response to defendants' motion for summary judgment.	5.20	\$ 1,534.00		
07/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re revisions to draft re additional facts re FLDS for response to defendants' motion for summary judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/04/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re additional facts re FLDS for response to defendants' motion for summary judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

07/04/2012	LAR	Review Bill Richards' draft insert for additional facts regarding the history of FLDS Church in Colorado City and Hildale for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
07/05/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards with revised draft of additional facts re FLDS for response to defendants' motion for summary judgment.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
07/05/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re FLDS section of statement of additional facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/05/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards with Leslie Ross re comments on latest draft of additional facts re FLDS and plan for new draft.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
07/05/2012	SRK	Locate additional facts for insert to FLDS section and Draft email to Bill Richards re same.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
07/05/2012	SRK	Work on outline for additional facts in support of response to defendants' msj.	3.40	\$ 1,003.00		
07/05/2012	LAR	Draft additional facts regarding Andrew Chatwin, Katie Cox, and Centennial Park/Colorado City and Hildale split for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	4.3	\$ 860.00		
07/05/2012	LAR	Review additional facts from Sandra Kane and Bill Richards for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00		

07/05/2012	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane regarding additional facts regarding the history of FLDS Church in Colorado City and Hildale for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
07/06/2012	SRK	Work on outlining additional facts in support of response to defendants' msj.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
07/06/2012	SRK	Review and edit email and new draft from Bill Richards and Conference with Leslie Ross re further edits to FLDS facts section.	2.20	\$ 649.00		
07/06/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Elizabeth Brancart re additional facts in support of response to defendants' msj.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/06/2012	SRK	Work on additional non-FLDS facts for response to defendants' motions for summary judgment.	5.50	\$ 1,622.50		
07/06/2012	SRK	Conference with Arman Nafesi re Research re inferences from invoking 5th Amendment in civil case.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/06/2012	SRK	Conference with Arman Nafesi re cites for additional facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/06/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re case status.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/06/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re additional edits to additional facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/06/2012	SRK	Draft Email to Bill Richards re draft of additional facts re FLDS.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/06/2012	LAR	Review Bill Richards' revised additional statement of facts for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	0.5	\$ 100.00		

07/06/2012	LAR	Review Isaac Wyler's notes regarding Warren Jeffs's proclamation on January 2004 in preparation for Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
07/06/2012	LAR	Review Warren Jeffs's dictations from December 3, 2005 in preparation for Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
07/06/2012	LAR	Revise additional facts in support of Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment regarding the January 2004 proclamation and the December 3, 2005 Priesthood Record.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
07/06/2012	LAR	Prepare for and participate in meeting with Sandra Kane and Bill Richards regarding additional statement of facts for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference.	
07/06/2012	LAR	Revise Bill Richards's proposed additional statement of facts for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
07/06/2012	LAR	Review Jeffs v. Stubbs case and revise related facts in the additional fact section of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00		

07/06/2012	LAR	Revise facts in the additional fact section of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment related to FLDS v. Lindberg.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
07/07/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Statement of Additional Facts for Response to MSJ.	9.00	\$ 2,655.00		
07/08/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Statement of Additional Facts in response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	12.30	\$ 3,628.50		
07/09/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Statement of Additional Facts in response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	11.20	\$ 3,304.00		
07/09/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Lori Wagner and Jessica Crockett re case law in response to Defendants' MSJ.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
07/09/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re case law re response to msj on Section 1983 claim.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
07/09/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re additional facts re FLDS.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
07/09/2012	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom re invoice to Defendants, Draft reply to Zachary Renstrom , Review email response from Zachary Renstrom.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/09/2012	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton re Renstrom invoice.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
07/10/2012	SRK	Draft Statement of Additional Facts for response to Defendants' MSJ.	9.80	\$ 2,891.00		
07/10/2012	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Motion to Amend Scheduling Order and Plaintiffs' Joint Response in preparation for telephonic hearing on Hildale Defendants' Motion to Amend.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
07/10/2012	SRK	Attend telephonic hearing on Hildale Defendants' Motion to Amend Scheduling Order.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

07/10/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re hearing and status of preparing responses to motion for summary judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/10/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re water connection.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/11/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts for Response to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment.	6.20	\$ 1,829.00		
07/11/2012	SRK	Review draft of FLDS Section to Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts from Bill Richards .	3.00	\$ 885.00		
07/11/2012	SRK	Conference Call with Bill Walker, Christopher Brancart and Elizabeth Brancart re strategy for Statement of Facts and Response to Defendants' MSJ's.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
07/12/2012	SRK	Work on Joint Statement of Controverting and Additional Facts in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	13.50	\$ 3,982.50		
07/12/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re his section of Joint Statement.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
07/12/2012	SRK	Review DOJ Motion to Transfer case.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/12/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re DOJ Motion to Transfer case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/13/2012	SRK	Work on Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts in response to Defendants' MSJ.	7.60	\$ 2,242.00		
07/13/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re status of response and stipulation for extension.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/13/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re stipulation for extension.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/15/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	6.40	\$ 1,888.00		
07/16/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	9.30	\$ 2,743.50		

07/16/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re historical section of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
07/16/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re witness declarations to support response to msj, and case law re inferences from assertion of Fifth Amendment.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/16/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re historical section of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
07/16/2012	SRK	Review insert to Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts from Bill Richards.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/16/2012	LAR	Telephone and in-person communications with Sandra Kane and Bill Richards regarding the section of the additional facts involving the history leading up to the adoption of government policies and practice to discourage non-FLDS from living on UEP land for Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.7	\$ 340.00	Internal conference.	
07/16/2012	LAR	Draft facts for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment about John Cook and Marion Timpson to support the State's pattern or practice claim.	0.9	\$ 180.00		
07/16/2012	LAR	Meeting with Bill Walker regarding additional facts required to support Plaintiffs' Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
07/16/2012	LAR	Draft and revise Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	4.0	\$ 800.00		

07/17/2012	SRK	Conference with AAG Leslie Ross re additional work needed for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
07/17/2012	SRK	Review emails from Bill Richards with exhibits for FLDS portion of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/17/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re declarations from Jethro Barlow and Richard Holm.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/17/2012	SRK	Draft Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	10.50	\$ 3,097.50		
07/17/2012	LAR	Review and revise portions of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment regarding Warren Jeffs's directive to "answer them nothing" and FLDS control over elected and non-elected municipal officers who invoked the fifth amendment during depositions in this case.	2.4	\$ 480.00		
07/17/2012	LAR	Review and revise portions of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment regarding Andrew Chatwin and new buildings constructed since Hildale and Colorado City passed the new water connection ordinance.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
07/17/2012	LAR	Prepare for and participate in meeting with Sandra Kane and Bill Walker regarding Jethro Barlow and Richard Holm declarations in preparation for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	

07/18/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts and preparation of Richard Holm's Declaration.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/18/2012	SRK	Meeting with AAG Leslie Ross and Law Clerks Andreanna Smith and Arman Nafesi to assign remaining portions of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts and related declarations and table of contents.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
07/18/2012	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow re declaration.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/18/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jethro Barlow re declaration.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
07/18/2012	SRK	Work on Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	7.30	\$ 2,153.50		
07/18/2012	SRK	Review and edit declaration of Jethro Barlow.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
07/18/2012	SRK	Review and edit declaration of Zachary Renstrom.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
07/18/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re FLDS section of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/18/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re Declaration of Richard Holm.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
07/18/2012	SRK	Edit declaration of Jethro Barlow.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
07/18/2012	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re preparation of exhibits for FLDS section of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts and edited declaration of Jethro Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; duplicative.	
07/18/2012	LAR	Revise Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	7.5	\$ 1,500.00		
07/19/2012	SRK	Work with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re citations for FLDS portion of Joint Statement of Additional Facts.	1.50	\$ 442.50		

07/19/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re inserts to Joint Statement of Additional Facts and preparation of declarations.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
07/19/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re table of contents and inserts to remainder of Joint Additional Statement of Facts and preparation of declarations.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference; duplicative.	
07/19/2012	SRK	Draft inserts to Joint Additional Statement of Facts.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		
07/19/2012	SRK	Review and edit declarations for Jethro Barlow and Richard Holm.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
07/19/2012	LAR	Prepare for and participate in meeting with Sandra Kane regarding tasks that need to be completed before filing the State's Response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	4.3	\$ 860.00	Internal conference.	
07/19/2012	LAR	Review and revise Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	5.9	\$ 1,180.00		
07/20/2012	SRK	Review and edit Declaration of Jethro Barlow.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
07/20/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re Declaration.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
07/20/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Declaration of Jethro Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/20/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Declarations of Richard Holm and Jinjer Cooke.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/20/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re status of FLDS Additional Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/20/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re additional facts re Pattern and Practice victims.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/20/2012	SRK	Review and edit declarations for Bruce Wisan, Isaac Wyler, Richard Holm and Jethro Barlow.	3.60	\$ 1,062.00		

07/20/2012	SRK	Review email from Jinjer Cooke re harassment of Cookes for Jinjer Cooke declaration.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/20/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke re harassment of Cookes for Jinjer Cooke declaration.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/20/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Jinjer Cooke declaration.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/20/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards with new draft of FLDS section of Joint Statement of Additional Facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/20/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re draft of FLDS section of Joint Statement of Additional Facts and preparation of exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/20/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Leslie Ross, law clerks and Brancarts with latest draft of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts, and strategy for next steps toward preparation of response.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
07/20/2012	LAR	Draft additional facts for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment regarding unlawful treatment of non-FLDS members and UEP members.	5.3	\$ 1,060.00		
07/21/2012	SRK	Review email from Jinjer Cooke re preparation of declaration.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
07/21/2012	SRK	Review Draft Declaration of Jinjer Cooke.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/21/2012	SRK	Research re disparate treatment, McDonnell Douglas proof method, disparate impact, reasonable accommodation.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00	Block billing; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	Objection overruled.
07/21/2012	SRK	Review Defendant Colorado City's MSJ and Statement of Facts.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
07/21/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re preparation of declarations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

07/21/2012	LAR	Review and revise declarations for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
07/22/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re Declarations and Statement of Facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/22/2012	SRK	Draft response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	11.30	\$ 3,333.50		
07/22/2012	LAR	Revise Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
07/23/2012	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross and Bill Richards re preparation of declarations and Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
07/23/2012	SRK	Research re fair housing claims of making housing unavailable.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
07/23/2012	SRK	Work on declarations of Jinjer Cooke, Jethro Barlow, Bruce Wisan, and Isaac Wyler.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
07/23/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re new incidents in Colorado City.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
07/23/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bruce Wisan and Isaac Wyler re declarations, and Draft email to Jeff Shields for revisions re draft Wisan declaration.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
07/23/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Shields re revisions to Bruce Wisan's declaration, and revise Wisan declaration.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/23/2012	SRK	Meeting with Bruce Wisan and Isaac Wyler to finalize declarations.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/23/2012	SRK	Draft Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	4.80	\$ 1,416.00		

07/23/2012	LAR	Prepare for and participate in meeting with Sandra Kane and Bill Richards regarding preparation of declarations for the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Internal conference.	
07/23/2012	LAR	Revise Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.7	\$ 340.00		
07/23/2012	LAR	Draft and revise declarations for Jinjer Cooke, Richard Holm, and Jethro Barlow for the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	8.0	\$ 1,600.00		
07/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re medical evaluation of Ron Cooke for declaration.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
07/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re his arguments in response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/24/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re updates to Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/24/2012	SRK	Draft Reponse to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	4.80	\$ 1,416.00		
07/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re declarations and status of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/24/2012	SRK	Review and edit declaration of Richard Holm.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
07/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Richard Holm re declaration.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

07/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Richard Holm with proposed declaration.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/24/2012	SRK	Review and edit Jinjer Cooke's declaration.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
07/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Jinjer Cooke's draft declaration.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Jinjer Cooke's declaration.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/24/2012	SRK	Review file documents and edit Jinjer Cooke's declaration.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
07/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke and Bill Walker re revised declaration.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re declaration.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re declaration.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
07/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke and Bill Walker re revised declaration of Jinjer Cooke.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/24/2012	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re revised declaration of Jinjer Cooke and revision to Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/24/2012	SRK	Work on Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
07/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re declaration.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/24/2012	SRK	Review and edit draft declaration for Jethro Barlow.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
07/24/2012	LAR	Research declaration of beneficiaries for Jeremiah Barlow's signature for inclusion in the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	0.2	\$ 40.00		

07/24/2012	LAR	Discussion with Arman Nafesi (extern) and Donna Chrisjohn to get an update on their progress in compiling exhibits for the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
07/24/2012	LAR	Revise the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment to include facts from Jinjer Cooke's declaration.	1.3	\$ 260.00		
07/24/2012	LAR	Revise Richard Holm's declaration for the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	2.4	\$ 480.00		
07/24/2012	LAR	Review and revise Jethro Barlow's declaration for the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	4.1	\$ 820.00		
07/24/2012	LAR	Revise and incorporate Bill Richards's and Sandra Kane's revisions and updates into the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
07/25/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Jethro Barlow's declaration and status of preparation of Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

07/25/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re working with witnesses on declarations and completing Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/25/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards with Richard Holm's draft declaration and contact info.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
07/25/2012	SRK	Draft email to Richard Holm re Bill Richards.	0.10	\$ -	Duplicative of entry below.	Not awarded.
07/25/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re Bill Richards.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Duplicative of entry above.	
07/25/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re Jethro Barlow's contact info for finalization of declaration.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
07/25/2012	SRK	Review file re places of refuge dictation and forward to Bill Richards.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
07/25/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Liz Brancart re structure of response to Defendants' msj.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/25/2012	SRK	Review email from Liz Brancart re structure of response to Defendants' msj.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/25/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Liz Brancart re response to Defendants' msj.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/25/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re FLDS section for response to Defendants' msj.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/25/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards with FLDS section for response to Defendants' msj.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/25/2012	SRK	Draft response to defendants' motions for summary judgment.	15.00	\$ 4,425.00	Excessive time charged on this date.	
07/25/2012	LAR	Meeting with Bill Richards regarding including additional facts pertaining to Warren Jeffs's dictations about rejecting short creek in the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	

07/25/2012	LAR	Revise content and formatting in the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	10.6	\$ 2,120.00		
07/26/2012	SRK	Draft response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	11.00	\$ 3,245.00		
07/26/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re exceeding page limit for response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/26/2012	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re exceeding page limit.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/26/2012	SRK	Review responses from Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re stipulation to exceed page limit.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/26/2012	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart re Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
07/26/2012	LAR	Review and revise the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	15.0	\$ 3,000.00		
07/27/2012	SRK	Draft Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
07/27/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Elizabeth Brancart re edits to Response.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
07/27/2012	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart re edits to Response.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/27/2012	SRK	Revise Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
07/27/2012	SRK	Review Bill Walker's Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment re reasonable accommodation issue.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
07/27/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re count numbers for response to motion for summary judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

07/27/2012	SRK	Identify and insert in Response paragraph references from Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	9.50	\$ 2,802.50		
07/27/2012	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re status of exhibits to Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/27/2012	SRK	Draft Motion for Leave to Late File Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
07/27/2012	SRK	Draft Order re Motion for Leave to Late File Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/27/2012	LAR	Revise and finalize the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	18.0	\$ 3,600.00	Excessive time billed	
07/29/2012	SRK	Work on preparing exhibits for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	11.40	\$ 3,363.00		
07/29/2012	LAR	Work on preparing exhibits for filing and revise the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment to include exhibit numbers.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
07/30/2012	SRK	Work with Leslie Ross on exhibit preparation.	4.30	\$ 1,268.50	Internal conference.	
07/30/2012	SRK	Input exhibit numbers into Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts (JCAF) and prepare JCAF and exhibits for filing.	3.80	\$ 1,121.00		
07/30/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re late filing.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/30/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re late filing.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

07/30/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Blake Hamilton re stipulation to late filing of JCAF and Exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/30/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Blake Hamilton re decision not to stipulate.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/30/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Matura re possible stipulation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/30/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Matura re possible stipulation after seeing revised JCAF.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
07/30/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with revised JCAF and request for stipulation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/30/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Matura's office re possible stipulation .	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/30/2012	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re stipulation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/30/2012	SRK	Draft Motion for Leave to Late File JCAF and Exhibits and Order.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
07/30/2012	LAR	Finalize exhibits for Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment, and input exhibit numbers into the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	10.5	\$ 2,100.00		
07/31/2012	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants Motion to Strike Testimony of Dr. Sally Alcott.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
07/31/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re strategy in response to Motion to Strike.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
07/31/2012	SRK	Research re Hildale Defendants' Motion to Strike .	1.20	\$ 354.00		
07/31/2012	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow re defense witnesses David Darger and Jake Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50		

07/31/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re defense witnesses David Darger and Jake Barlow.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
07/31/2012	LAR	Develop Cooke timeline of events for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	0.8	\$ 160.00		Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
07/31/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding how to respond to Hildale's motion to strike.	1.0	\$ 200.00		Internal conference.
08/01/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Motion for Leave to Late File Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts and Exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		Internal conference.
08/01/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re response to Motion for Leave to Late File Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts and Exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		Internal conference.
08/01/2012	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re Response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	0.40	\$ 118.00		Internal conference.
08/01/2012	SRK	Conference with law clerk Andreanna Smith re Research in response to the Hildale Defendants' motion to strike Dr. Alcott's testimony.	0.40	\$ 118.00		Internal conference.
08/01/2012	SRK	Review deposition testimony of Dr. Alcott cited in the State's motion for partial summary judgment.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
08/01/2012	SRK	Conference with Andreanna Smith re Research re requirements for expert disclosure.	0.50	\$ 147.50		Internal conference.
08/01/2012	SRK	Review Plaintiffs' Joinder in State's Motion for Leave to Late File JCAF and Exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/01/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Utah AG Motion to Stay Colorado City's lawsuit against the UEP and the Cookes.	0.30	\$ 88.50		Internal conference; not related to claims.
08/01/2012	SRK	Review UT AG's Motion to Stay.	0.30	\$ 88.50		Not related to claims.

08/01/2012	SRK	Research re disparate treatment under Arlington Heights standards.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/01/2012	SRK	Draft email to Elizabeth Brancart re Motion for Leave to Late File JCAF and Exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/01/2012	SRK	Review email response from Elizabeth Brancart re Motion for Leave to Late File JCAF and Exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/02/2012	SRK	Review Defendants' Responses to Plaintiffs' Motions for Summary Judgment from Hildale Defendants.	6.30	\$ 1,858.50		
08/02/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion to Strike Testimony of Dr. Alcott.	3.00	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
08/02/2012	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross with proposed Notice of Appearance.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/02/2012	SRK	Research re Appearance by Attorney.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/02/2012	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross with proposed edits to Notice of Appearance .	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/02/2012	SRK	Review file for documents related to disclosures of Dr. Alcott's testimony and Draft email to Bill Walker re same.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Objection overruled.
08/02/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re David Darger and Jake Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/02/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Elizabeth Brancart re Defendants' motion to strike Dr. Alcott's testimony.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/02/2012	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re motion to strike Dr. Alcott's testimony.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/02/2012	LAR	Review Rule for Notice of Association of Counsel and draft Notice of Association of Counsel.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
08/03/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re locating documents related to response to Hildale Defendants' motion to strike Dr. Alcott's testimony.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

08/03/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker with requested documents for response to motion to strike.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/03/2012	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re research assignment re reasonable accommodation for reply in support of Plaintiffs partial msj on reasonable accommodation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
08/03/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re status of stipulating to allow State to late file the JCAF and exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/03/2012	SRK	Research re expert disclosures.	3.30	\$ 973.50		
08/04/2012	LAR	Research reasonable accommodation cases for legal bases for necessity of an accommodation and effect on individual who endures despite having not received the accommodation for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	2.5	\$ 500.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/05/2012	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' response to State's motion for partial summary judgment re reasonable accommodation, Hildale Defendants' controverting statement and additional facts, and Research re cases cited by Hildale Defendants.	4.80	\$ 1,416.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/05/2012	LAR	Research reasonable accommodation cases for legal bases for necessity of an accommodation and effect on individual who endures despite having not received the accommodation for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	

08/06/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re analysis of Defendants' response to State's motion for partial summary judgment re reasonable accommodation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.
08/06/2012	SRK	Begin to Review Colorado City's response to State's motion for partial summary judgment re reasonable accommodation.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
08/06/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re reply re motion for partial summary judgment re reasonable accommodation, response to motion to strike Dr. Alcott's testimony, and preparation of response re vicarious liability.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
08/06/2012	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Christopher and Elizabeth Brancart and Leslie Ross re Defendants' responses to motion for partial summary judgment re reasonable accommodation.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
08/06/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re research re costs to disabled person of complying with policy.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
08/06/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re draft memo re motion for partial summary judgment re vicarious liability.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.
08/06/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re vicarious liability portion of reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
08/06/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker to Bill Richards re vicarious liability portion of reply, and response from Bill Richards.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
08/06/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re reply re vicarious liability.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
08/06/2012	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re unsupported facts in Defendants' responses.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.

08/06/2012	SRK	Review draft table and response to motion to strike Dr. Alcott's testimony prepared by Andreanna Smith and forward to Bill Walker for inclusion in joint response.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
08/06/2012	LAR	Conference with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, Christopher Brancart, and Elizabeth Brancart regarding Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	1.1	\$ 220.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
08/06/2012	LAR	Conference with Sandra Kane to review Defendants' responses to the State's motion for partial summary judgment and discuss additional research necessary for the State's Reply.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Internal conference.	
08/06/2012	LAR	Research reasonable accommodation cases for legal bases for necessity of an accommodation and effect on individual who endures despite having not received the accommodation for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	6.0	\$ 1,200.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/06/2012	LAR	Review Christopher Brancart's memorandum on reasonable accommodation for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/07/2012	SRK	Review State's motion for partial summary judgment and statement of facts in preparation for reply.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
08/07/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re motion to strike Dr. Alcott.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/07/2012	SRK	Review revised draft of vicarious liability reply from Bill Richards.	0.30	\$ 88.50		

08/07/2012	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re refusal to stipulate re late filing of JCAF and exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/07/2012	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart, Bill Richards, Bill Walker and Leslie Ross re email from Jeff Matura, and Review responses from Bill Richards and Ann Hobart.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/07/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re arguments in response to Hildale Defendants' motion to strike testimony of Dr. Alcott.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/07/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Research re reasonableness of reasonable accommodation and fundamental alteration.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
08/07/2012	SRK	Research re reasonable accommodation and Conference with Rose Daly-Rooney re legal arguments for reply.	9.00	\$ 2,655.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
08/07/2012	LAR	Research cases regarding reasonable accommodation requirements under FHAA for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/07/2012	LAR	Research Hildale Defendants' jurisdictional argument as pertaining to AFHA for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/08/2012	SRK	Analyze Colorado City's Response to the State's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment re Reasonable Accommodation.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/08/2012	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re Colorado City's Response to the State's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment re Reasonable Accommodation.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	

08/08/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Elizabeth Brancart re legal arguments for reply re State's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment re Reasonable Accommodation.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.
08/08/2012	SRK	Research re reasonable accommodation.	2.80	\$ 826.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
08/08/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Legal Intern Andreanna Smith re their reasonable accommodation research.	3.30	\$ 973.50	Internal conference; not related claims; claim dismissed.
08/08/2012	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re issues raised in Defendants' responses to State's motion for partial summary judgment re reasonable accommodation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; not related claims; claim dismissed.
08/08/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker's office and review and edit draft joint response re Hildale Defendants' motion to strike Dr. Alcott's testimony.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.
08/08/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re comments on joint response re Hildale Defendants' motion to strike Dr. Alcott's testimony.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
08/08/2012	SRK	Review file for comments by Jeremiah Barlow re undue burden.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
08/08/2012	SRK	Review Plaintiffs' Response to Defendants' MSJ re Reasonable Accommodation.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
08/08/2012	LAR	Review cited cases from Defendants' Responses to Plaintiff-Intervenor's Partial Motion for Summary Judgment for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.

08/08/2012	LAR	Research legal determinations regarding what constitutes a genuine hardship for a reasonable accommodation claim for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/08/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane to analyze Colorado City Response to the State's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
08/09/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re response to motion to strike Dr. Alcott's testimony.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/09/2012	SRK	Research re rules governing sanctions for not disclosing a witness.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
08/09/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re modification to joint response to motion to strike.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/09/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Research for reply to Defendants' arguments in response to motion for reasonable accommodation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
08/09/2012	SRK	Research re cases cited by Defendants and outline Reply in support of MSJ re reasonable accommodation.	8.50	\$ 2,507.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/09/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re motions for summary judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/09/2012	LAR	Research and review 9th Circuit cases/rule on reasonable accommodation such as McGary and Crowder, as compared to cited cases in Defendants' Responses to the State's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	4.5	\$ 900.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	

08/09/2012	LAR	Research issues pertaining to extraterritoriality, subject matter jurisdiction for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/10/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Research re Defendants' extraterritorial jurisdiction and legal theories.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/10/2012	SRK	Conference with Legal Intern Andreanna Smith re Research re necessity of accommodation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
08/10/2012	SRK	Research re reasonable accommodation.	6.40	\$ 1,888.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/10/2012	LAR	Research issues pertaining to extraterritoriality, subject matter jurisdiction for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	5.5	\$ 1,100.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/11/2012	SRK	Draft reply in support of State's motion for partial summary judgment re reasonable accommodation.	8.00	\$ 2,360.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/12/2012	SRK	Draft reply in support of motion for summary judgment re reasonable accommodation.	12.20	\$ 3,599.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/13/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re status of and strategy for joint replies in support of motions for summary judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/13/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re research re subject matter jurisdiction and necessity of reasonable accommodation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
08/13/2012	SRK	Draft reply in support of motion for partial summary judgment re reasonable accommodation.	9.50	\$ 2,802.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/13/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re motions for summary judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

08/13/2012	LAR	Research issues pertaining to extraterritoriality, subject matter jurisdiction and damages on reasonable accommodation Claims for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	9.3	\$ 1,860.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/14/2012	SRK	Draft and edit reply re motion for partial summary judgment re reasonable accommodation, with input from Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross.	5.80	\$ 1,711.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/14/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re DOJ lawsuit and status of filing reply re vicarious liability of defendants.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/14/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re research on motion to strike multiple facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/14/2012	SRK	Review Defendant Town of Colorado City's Reply in support of its MSJ against State of Arizona, Defendant Town of Colorado City's Reply in support of its MSG against the Cooke Plaintiffs, and the Cooke Plaintiffs' reply in support of their motion for partial summary judgment.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
08/14/2012	LAR	Research issues pertaining to extraterritoriality, subject matter jurisdiction for Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Reply in Support of Motion for Partial Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	2.4	\$ 480.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
08/14/2012	LAR	Keycite cases relied upon for Plaintiff-Intervenor's Reply in Support of Partial Motion for Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	

08/14/2012	LAR	Review and revise draft of Plaintiff-Intervenor's Reply in Support of Partial Motion for Summary Judgment Re: Reasonable Accommodation.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
08/15/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re Augspurger statement and Draft reply with copy of statement.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
08/15/2012	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Reply in Support of its Motions for Summary Judgment against the State of Arizona and the Cooke Plaintiffs.	0.50	\$ 147.50	
08/15/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re copies of pleadings.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
08/15/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke with recent pleadings.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
08/15/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Defendants' objections to facts in Plaintiff's JCAF and preparation of Excel spreadsheet re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
08/15/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Shields re Order re UEP payment of attorneys' fees.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
08/15/2012	SRK	Review unopposed motion by Hildale Defendants to extend time for all defendants to respond to DOJ motion to transfer case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
08/15/2012	SRK	Draft email to Lori Wagner of DOJ re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
08/15/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re DOJ motion to transfer case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
08/20/2012	LAR	Read Hildale Defendants' Reply in Support of its Motion to Strike Testimony of Sally Alcott along with Plaintiffs' Joint Response.	2.4	\$ 480.00	
08/21/2012	CH	review Pltf Intv MSJ and SOF	1.2	\$ 150.00	
08/22/2012	CH	review MSJ's, responses and SOF	2.3	\$ 287.50	
08/23/2012	LAR	Review Motions and Orders determining timing of discovery relating to Hildale Defendant's Reply in Support of its Motion to Strike Testimony of Sally Alcott.	0.7	\$ 140.00	

08/27/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re email from Bill Richards re demonstrative exhibit and Defendants' objections to JCAF.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
08/27/2012	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow re Colorado City Mayor George Barlow's signature.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/27/2012	SRK	Review and compare George Barlow's deposition exhibit and new signature.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/27/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re deposition exhibit and signature re Colorado City Mayor George Barlow.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
08/27/2012	LAR	Review Hildale's Reply to Strike Testimony of Sally Alcott and review Plaintiffs' Joint Expert Disclosure on 11/10/11 and Plaintiff-Intervenor's Initial Disclosure in preparation for oral argument.	1.4	\$ 280.00		
08/27/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding strategy to address Hildale's objections to the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment and Bill Walker's email regarding a possible demonstrative Exhibit for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
08/27/2012	LAR	Research regarding requirements for affidavits in support of Motions for Summary Judgment.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
08/27/2012	LAR	Research FRCP 26(e)(2) requirements, Rule 37 objections, FRCP 26(a)(2)(C) case law, LRCiv56.1, motions to strike, and objections to facts in preparation for oral argument on Hildale's Motion to Strike Dr. Alcott.	1.9	\$ 380.00		
08/27/2012	CH	review Replies to MSJ	1.0	\$ 125.00		
08/28/2012	SRK	Conference with AAG Leslie Ross re Research re objections to facts supporting msj.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

08/28/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re outstanding invoice from Defendants' expert Augspurger Komm invoice.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/28/2012	SRK	Review documents re existing water connections.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
08/28/2012	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker re Augspurger Komm invoice and motion to dismiss DOJ lawsuit.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference; clerical; block billing; not related to claims.	Objection overruled.
08/28/2012	SRK	Meeting with Charlotte Haught and Leslie Ross re trial preparation.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
08/28/2012	SRK	Review State's response to Defendants' motions for summary judgment.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
08/28/2012	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart re preparation of case for trial, potential focus jury presentations.	0.50	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
08/28/2012	LAR	Research and review Judge Teilborg's standard order for final pretrial conference in preparation for final pretrial order, jury instruction, proposed voir dire, deposition designations, trial exhibits, and final pretrial conference.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
08/28/2012	LAR	Research Defendants' objections to Plaintiff and the State's facts in support of their motions for summary judgment in preparation for oral argument on dispositive motions.	1.4	\$ 280.00		
08/28/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding trial exhibits and pretrial scheduling and preparation.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Internal conference.	
08/28/2012	LAR	Meet with Charlotte Haught and Sandra Kane regarding brainstorming for trial preparation and scheduling of tasks prior to trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference.	
08/28/2012	CH	meet with Sandra and Leslie re prepping for trial	2.0	\$ 250.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
08/28/2012	CH	review Judge Teilborg's standing JT Pretrial order	0.5	\$ 62.50		

08/29/2012	SRK	Review emails from Isaac Wyler re people who were kicked out of the FLDS Church and discrimination by police.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
08/29/2012	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross, Ann Hobart and Bill Richards re people who were kicked out of FLDS.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.	
08/29/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re strategy for trial preparation.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
08/29/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane to discuss strategy for trial preparation.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
08/30/2012	SRK	Review Research re Defendants' objections to facts re motion for summary judgment, Conference with Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re Research, Draft email to Bill Walker re Research re Defendants' objections re motion for summary judgment.	4.00	\$ 944.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
08/30/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re Research re Defendants' objections re motion for summary judgment.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
08/30/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding Defendants' objections to the Joint Controverting and Additional Statement of Facts of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor in Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment.	6.1	\$ 1,220.00	Internal conference.	
08/30/2012	LAR	Reviewed and analyzed Defendants' objections to the Joint Statement of Facts in Support of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motions for Summary Judgment. Converted the Joint Statement of Facts in Support of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motions for Summary Judgment to excel.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
09/04/2012	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler re new FLDS housing.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.	

09/04/2012	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler re Andrew Chatwin videos and Draft email to Bill Walker re new FLDS housing.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.
09/04/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re pretrial preparation memo from Bill Richards.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/04/2012	SRK	Review email and memo from Bill Richards re pretrial preparation.	1.50	\$ 442.50	
09/04/2012	SRK	Review Judge Teilborg's standing orders re final pretrial statement and trial preparation.	2.10	\$ 619.50	
09/04/2012	SRK	Review file re photos and maps.	1.50	\$ 442.50	
09/04/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Isaac Wyler re new residential water connections.	0.50	\$ 147.50	
09/04/2012	LAR	Research 9th Circuit Model Jury Instructions in preparation for drafting jury instructions.	0.2	\$ 40.00	
09/04/2012	LAR	Prepare for and participate in meeting with Sandra Kane regarding Bill Richards's pretrial memo suggesting trial preparation deadlines.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Internal conference.
09/04/2012	LAR	Analyze Joint Statement of Facts in Support of Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motions for Summary Judgment, objections and controverting facts.	3.3	\$ 660.00	
09/04/2012	LAR	Review Judge Teilborg's standard pretrial order and develop outline of requirements and deadlines.	1.9	\$ 380.00	
09/04/2012	CH	read Replies to MSJ	1.0	\$ 125.00	
09/05/2012	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re meeting re trial preparation and Draft reply.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
09/05/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re trial preparation and Draft reply.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/05/2012	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re correspondence with Bill Richards re trial preparation.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
09/06/2012	SRK	Review order granting State's motion to late file JCAF.	0.20	\$ 59.00	

09/06/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart and Review email from Bill Richards re order granting State's motion to late file JCAF.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
09/06/2012	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler and New Times article re Colorado City.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims.	
09/06/2012	SRK	Review spreadsheet of controverted and additional facts, and Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of opening statement.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
09/06/2012	LAR	Review Rule 16 Scheduling Order.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
09/06/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane to discuss preparing for opening statements.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
09/07/2012	LAR	Review Colorado City and Hildale's statement of facts, additional facts, and controverting facts in support of Defendants' motions for summary judgment and responses in preparation for oral argument.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
09/07/2012	LAR	Research map of Colorado City and Hildale to use as a demonstrative exhibit at trial.	0.9	\$ 180.00		
09/10/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re trial preparation and focus juries.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
09/10/2012	SRK	Review TCWA Supplemental Interrogatories and related documents re new water connections, Conference with Leslie Ross re same, and Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re same.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference., block billing	Objection overruled.
09/10/2012	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Response to DOJ Motion to Transfer Case, Draft email to Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re same.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
09/10/2012	SRK	Review Colorado City's Response to DOJ Motion to Transfer Case.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
09/10/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding Twin City Water Authority's supplemental interrogatories and related documents pertaining to new water connections in preparation for trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	

09/11/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jethro Barlow re Defendants' supplemental interrogatory answers.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
09/11/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re Defendants' supplemental interrogatory answers.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
09/11/2012	CH	meeting with Sandra Kane re: organizing documents	2.5	\$ 312.50	Internal conference.	
09/12/2012	SRK	Locate and Review ADOT Transportation Report for Colorado City with maps and photos for trial presentation, Draft email to Charlotte Haught re maps and photos for trial presentation.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
09/12/2012	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re additional questions from documents produced by Defendants.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
09/13/2012	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow with map of Colorado City for use at trial, and Draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/13/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re ADOT report maps of Colorado City.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/13/2012	LAR	Review map of Colorado City/Hildale area developed by ADOT to determine the maps usefulness as a demonstrative exhibit at trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
09/14/2012	LAR	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane regarding trial preparation and focus jury.	0.7	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
09/18/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re trial in Colorado City criminal case against Bruce Wisan and Jethro Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims.	
09/18/2012	SRK	Research re fair housing remedies against municipalities.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
09/19/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re trial of Bruce Wisan, and focus juries for our case.	0.40	\$ -	Internal conference; not related to claims.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
09/19/2012	SRK	Review article re dismissal of prosecution against Bruce Wisan.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	

09/19/2012	SRK	Draft email to Liz and Chris Brancart re remaining work on case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/20/2012	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re meeting re obtaining additional litigation resources.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/20/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re obtaining additional resources for trial.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/20/2012	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re additional resources and strategy for trial preparation.	1.40	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.	
09/20/2012	LAR	Two meetings with Sandra Kane regarding pretrial planning and allocation of resources.	1.7	\$ 340.00	Internal conference.	
09/20/2012	LAR	Research and review Ninth Circuit jury instructions for civil rights violations in housing, procedural jury instructions, and vicarious liability in preparation for trial	0.4	\$ 80.00		
09/21/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re staffing for trial and case strategy.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/21/2012	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re staffing for trial.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/24/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Telephone call from Jethro Barlow and status conference in Colorado City declaratory action against UEP and Cookes.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
09/27/2012	SRK	Conference call with Chris and Elizabeth Brancart and Leslie Ross re preparation of jury instructions and memo re demonstrative exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
09/27/2012	SRK	Draft email to Chris and Elizabeth Brancart re maps and visuals from ADOT study of Colorado City.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/27/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re medical records from Dr. Alcott and Draft email to Jinjer Cooke re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/27/2012	LAR	Telephone conference with the Brancarts regarding jury instructions and demonstrative exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	

10/02/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Utah Supreme Court decision re FLDS v. Wisan rejecting FLDS challenge to UEP reformation.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.
10/02/2012	SRK	Review email from Mark Bookholder with Utah Supreme Court decision re FLDS v. Wisan.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Not related to claims.
10/02/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Jinjer Cooke with Utah Supreme Court decision.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
10/02/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re Utah Supreme Court ruling.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
10/02/2012	LAR	Draft e-mail to David Weinzweig regarding trial preparation.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.
10/02/2012	LAR	Meeting with David Weinzweig, Sandra Kane and Ann Hobart regarding trial preparation.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference.
10/03/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of proof plan.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
10/03/2012	SRK	Review Utah Supreme Court ruling re finality of its previous decision re constitutional challenge to UEP reformation.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Not related to claims.
10/03/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane about developing a proof outline for trial preparation.		\$ -	Internal conference.
10/04/2012	LAR	Review State's partial motion for summary judgment to draft proof outline in preparation for trial.	0.1	\$ 20.00	
10/04/2012	LAR	Draft proof outline for reasonable accommodations claim in preparation for trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
10/04/2012	LAR	Read Utah Supreme Court decision, FLDS v. Horne et al., 2012 UT 66 to determine whether decision affects upcoming trial.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Not related to claims.
10/05/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re status of witnesses, effect of recent FLDS proclamations re restrictions on medical services, and new agricultural and industrial water usage in Colorado City.	0.40	\$ 118.00	

10/05/2012	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re photos of new irrigated fields in Colorado City.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/05/2012	LAR	Review and revise proof outline regarding reasonable accommodations claim in preparation for trial.	0.9	\$ 180.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
10/09/2012	SRK	Meeting with Charlotte Haught and Donna ChrisJohn re file organization, documents for demonstrative exhibits, and use of trial director software.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference; duplicative.	
10/09/2012	CH	attend meeting with Sandra Kane and Donna re status of case; review documents and organize	2.5	\$ 250.00	Internal conference; block billing; duplicative of entry above.	Reduced by 20%.
10/09/2012	CH	review email from Sandra re: Col City transportation report; review report and Master Doc List; research rules on demonstrative exhibits; reply to email	1.5	\$ 150.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
10/10/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker enclosing copy of UEP Fiduciary's Emergency Motion.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Not related to claims.	
10/10/2012	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart, Pam Culwell, Mark Bookholder, Leslie Ross and Charlotte Haught re memo.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/11/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re harassment by neighbors.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/11/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re harassment by neighbors.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
10/11/2012	SRK	Review emails from Jethro Barlow re city map and Pure PH8 delivery truck.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/11/2012	SRK	Draft emails to Jethro Barlow re same.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/15/2012	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler re police incidents in Colorado City.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
10/15/2012	LAR	Draft proof outline for all claims in preparation for Colorado City/Hildale trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00		

10/15/2012	LAR	Review expert witness' reports and organize map of Colorado City/Hildale water sources to use as a demonstrative exhibit at trial.	3.5	\$ 700.00		
10/15/2012	LAR	Research civil rules regarding demonstrative exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.8	\$ 160.00		
10/16/2012	CH	review depositions to identify which depositions did not have official exhibits admitted; begin drafting letter to Defendant re stipulating to the documents as exhibits	2.0	\$ 250.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
10/16/2012	CH	continue edits to letter re deposition exhibits	0.5	\$ 62.50		
10/16/2012	CH	meet with Sandra Kane and Donna Chrisjohn re status of Cooke case	0.7	\$ 87.50	Internal conference.	
10/17/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re video relating to harassment of Cookes.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.	
10/17/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re status of harassment by neighbors.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
10/17/2012	LAR	Review Zachary Renstrom's reply to Defendants' expert reports in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
10/17/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summaries for electricity issues - Travis Fox and Jeff Vaughn in preparation for trial.	5.0	\$ 1,000.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
10/18/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary for Jeff Vaughn in preparation for trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
10/18/2012	CH	meet with Pam Culwell re; time needed for trial	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
10/19/2012	SRK	Research re recent municipal fair housing decision in New Orleans re denial of services and building permits.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/19/2012	LAR	Prepare deposition summary for Jeff Vaughn in preparation for trial.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
10/22/2012	SRK	Conference call with Christopher and Elizabeth Brancart, Leslie Ross and Charlotte Haught re jury instructions and demonstrative exhibits.	1.60	\$ 472.00	Internal conference.	

10/22/2012	LAR	Conference call with Brancarts regarding jury instructions and demonstrative exhibits.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Internal conference.	
10/22/2012	CH	attend meeting re: jury instructions and demonstratives	1.0	\$ 125.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2012	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re proof plan for religious discrimination.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2012	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross and Charlotte Haught re demonstrative exhibits.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
10/23/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding proof plan for religious discrimination in preparation for trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Charlotte Haught to discuss demonstrative exhibits for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2012	CH	meet with Sandra and Leslie to discuss demonstratives	1.0	\$ 125.00	Internal conference.	
10/25/2012	LAR	Meeting with David Weinzweig and Sandra Kane regarding key facts to develop at trial.	4.2	\$ 840.00	Internal conference.	
10/25/2012	CH	attend meeting re case and trial strategy	1.0	\$ 125.00	Internal conference.	
10/26/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re harassment incidents.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/26/2012	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker with legal analysis re Robert Black's claims.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/26/2012	LAR	Revise proof plan and develop Colorado City/Hildale pertinent witnesses list in preparation for trial.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
10/26/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding pre-trial brainstorming and proof plan.	3.3	\$ 660.00	Internal conference.	
10/29/2012	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re proof plan.	3.30	\$ 973.50	Internal conference.	
10/30/2012	CH	attend staff meeting with Donna and Sandra	1.2	\$ 150.00	Internal conference.	

11/06/2012	SRK	Review email from Bruce Wisan with Exhibit 4 from UEP proceeding involving letter from Colorado City Mayor George Barlow refusing to honor UEP Occupancy Agreements, Draft email to Bill Walker re same.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.
11/07/2012	CH	review Jeremiah Barlow depo and add exhibits to letter	4.5	\$ 562.50	
11/08/2012	SRK	Review minute entry scheduling oral argument on pending MSJ's and Motion to Strike Testimony of Dr. Sally Alcott.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
11/08/2012	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re minute entry scheduling oral argument.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
11/08/2012	SRK	Review State's Motion for Partial Summary Judgment re reasonable accommodation and Reply in support of that motion.	1.70	\$ 501.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
11/08/2012	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re hearing on MSJ's and 10th Cir. decision rejecting FLDS challenge to UEP reformation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.
11/08/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re UEP issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.
11/08/2012	CH	review Jeremiah Barlow exhibits	0.8	\$ 100.00	
11/08/2012	CH	update letter re exhibits for depositions	0.4	\$ 50.00	
11/13/2012	SRK	Review emails from Chris and Elizabeth Brancart re jury instructions and demonstrative exhibits; Draft reply.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
11/13/2012	CH	draft 12th supplemental disclosure	2.2	\$ 275.00	
11/13/2012	CH	continue working on letter to stipulate to exhibits used at depositions	2.0	\$ 250.00	
11/14/2012	SRK	Review and edit LT Judge Teilborg with copies of pleadings and exhibits requested by Court.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
11/14/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re status of hearing on motions for summary judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	

11/14/2012	CH	continue drafting letter to stipulate to exhibits from August 2011 depositions	3.4	\$ 425.00		
11/15/2012	SRK	Review emails from Isaac Wyler and Jinjer Cooke re end of world warnings given to FLDS, and Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re same.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
11/16/2012	SRK	Review Order denying DOJ motion to transfer case.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
11/16/2012	CH	finished letter to counsel re stipulation of exhibits used in Aug 2011 depositions	2.9	\$ 362.50	Internal conference.	
11/26/2012	LAR	Review Colorado City town council meeting minutes in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
11/27/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and David Weinzweig regarding trial preparation - themes and key facts.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Internal conference.	
11/27/2012	LAR	Research Colorado City/Hildale public records such as building permits, meeting minutes, police reports in preparation for trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
11/28/2012	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding deposition designations for use at trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
11/28/2012	LAR	Research affidavits for Texas search warrant re YFZ Ranch in preparation for trial.	1.7	\$ 340.00		
11/29/2012	LAR	Research Vance Barlow's involvement in Colorado City/Hildale cases in preparation for trial.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
11/29/2012	LAR	Review discovery for exhibits pertaining to Vance Barlow in preparation for trial.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
11/30/2012	LAR	Research Colorado City ordinances in preparation for trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
11/30/2012	CH	index review	4.3	\$ 537.50	Clerical; vague.	
12/07/2012	CH	index Col City documents	3.9	\$ 487.50		
12/07/2012	CH	index documents	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical; vague.	
12/17/2012	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re possible tampering with jeep.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

01/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re hearing on msj.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/04/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane to discuss oral argument and tasks that need to be accomplished before oral argument on 1/14/2013.	0.9	\$ 180.00	Internal conference.	
01/04/2013	LAR	Draft Table of Authorities for 1/14/2013 oral argument.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
01/07/2013	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re oral argument on msj.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
01/07/2013	SRK	Conference with Donna ChrisJohn re status of missing exhibits filed with court.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re hearing and motion for guidance.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
01/07/2013	LAR	Drafted table of authorities as required by Judge Teilborg's 11/8/2012 Order for Oral Argument.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
01/07/2013	CH	meet with Sandra and Donna re MSJ oral argument next week	1.0	\$ 125.00	Internal conference.	
01/08/2013	SRK	Review court order re schedule for hearing on msj's.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re allocation of arguments at hearing.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/09/2013	SRK	Review emails from Jinjer Cooke re newspaper articles re TCWW, and Draft reply to Jinjer Cooke re same.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
01/09/2013	SRK	Review additional emails from Jinjer Cooke re newspaper articles re UEP, building permits, and city practices.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
01/09/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re preparation for hearing on motions for summary judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/10/2013	SRK	Begin to Review pleadings in preparation for oral argument on MSJ's.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/12/2013	LAR	Review pleadings and draft outline for oral argument on motions for summary judgment.	3.4	\$ 680.00		
01/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re preparation for oral argument on msj's.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

01/13/2013	SRK	Review file and PF oral argument re plaintiffs' msj's and defendants' msj's.	11.50	\$ 3,392.50		
01/13/2013	LAR	Review contested and accepted facts in preparation for oral argument on motions for summary judgment.	3.5	\$ 700.00		
01/14/2013	SRK	PF oral argument re MSJ.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
01/14/2013	SRK	Attend oral argument re MSJ.	2.30	\$ 678.50		
01/14/2013	LAR	Attend oral argument for motions for summary judgment.	3.5	\$ 700.00		
01/14/2013	CH	attend oral argument on MSJ	2.5	\$ 312.50		
01/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Katie Cox re history of Colorado City.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Elizabeth Brancart re case status and additional work in preparation for trial.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/23/2013	LAR	Conference with Sandra Kane and Elizabeth Brancart regarding trial preparation.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
01/23/2013	CH	meet with Sandra Kane and Donna Chrisjohn	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
01/24/2013	CH	begin researching Judge Teilborg's cases re time to rule after OA on MSJ and trial setting dates	1.0	\$ 125.00		
01/25/2013	CH	research Judge Teilborg's docket for summary judgment and trial dates	2.7	\$ 337.50		
01/28/2013	SRK	Review emails from Jinjer Cooke re flood in street from broken water pipe.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/28/2013	CH	finish researching Judge Teilborg - WL search, additional Pacer searching, t/c with Jon Weisbard, t/c Bill Richards - e-mail summarizing search to Sandra Kane	3.5	\$ 437.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
01/29/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re possibility of reopening discovery to take deposition of Joseph Allred.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/29/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/29/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

01/29/2013	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/30/2013	SRK	Review documents re efforts to depose Joseph Allred and TCWW documents re information needed from Joseph Allred.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
01/30/2013	SRK	Review Salt Lake Tribune articles and video re Cookes and Richard Holm.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/31/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton, with copy to Bill Walker re deposition of Joseph Allred.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/04/2013	SRK	Review article about plea agreement by witness Jacob "Jake Barlow".	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
02/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re plea agreement by witness Jacob "Jake Barlow".	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.	
02/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call to James Schoppmann re status of pleas by Jake Barlow and Colorado City Town Manager David Darger.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
02/08/2013	LAR	Research jury instructions in preparation for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
02/11/2013	CH	finish trial deadline checklist notebooks	0.9	\$ 112.50		
02/13/2013	SRK	Review Order re Defendants' Motion to Strike Dr. Alcott's Testimony.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/13/2013	SRK	Review and analyze Order re ruling on Motions for Summary Judgment.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
02/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re ruling.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
02/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Paula Bickett re mandamus issue involving Cookes' claim.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/13/2013	SRK	Draft email to Paula Bickett re mandamus issue.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/13/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re ruling on motions for summary judgment.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	

02/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re ruling on motions for summary judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/13/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke with ruling on motions for summary judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jethro Barlow re Colorado City mayoral change and removal of Guy Timpson from Utility Board.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/13/2013	LAR	Review orders regarding motions for summary judgment and motion to strike Dr. Alcott.	3.5	\$ 700.00		
02/13/2013	CH	review judge's order re MSJ's	1.0	\$ 125.00		
02/14/2013	SRK	Conference call to Bill Richards with Leslie Ross re rulings on motions for summary judgment.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Paula Bickett re mandamus issue.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/14/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Leslie Ross, Ann Hobart and Chris Brancart re rulings, mandamus issue and strategy.	1.40	\$ 413.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/14/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re potential legal action in response to ruling on msj's and motion to strike, Draft reply.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/14/2013	LAR	Research burden on movant for Local Rule 7.2(g) (Motions for Reconsideration). Nissan v. Fritz.	1.8	\$ 360.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/14/2013	LAR	Review ruling on reasonable accommodation claim and order granting Hildale's motion to strike re Dr. Alcott.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/14/2013	LAR	Research burden of proof for motion for summary judgment in preparation for possible Motion for Reconsideration.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	

02/14/2013	LAR	Conference call regarding Judge Teilborg's rulings re motions for summary judgment and order granting Hildale's Motion to Strike Dr. Alcott to determine strategy going forward.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
02/15/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re decision re potential legal action in response to ruling for motions for summary judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
02/15/2013	SRK	Review order setting final pretrial conference.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
02/15/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re facts relating to writ of mandamus for Count 10.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.
02/15/2013	LAR	Research Sabin case and municipal responsibility for providing utilities to its citizens. Compile facts pertaining to Count 10 trial memo.	5.6	\$ 1,120.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
02/16/2013	SRK	Draft email to Paula Bickett re mandamus issue in msj ruling.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.
02/16/2013	SRK	Research re writ of mandamus.	1.80	\$ 531.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
02/17/2013	SRK	Review Research by Legal Extern CB Misbach re writ of mandamus for utility services and additional Research re mandamus.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
02/17/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re research re mandamus.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
02/19/2013	SRK	Conference with AAG Paula Bickett re writ of mandamus v. injunction.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.
02/19/2013	SRK	Research re mandamus.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
02/19/2013	SRK	Review email from Chris Brancart re mandamus.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.
02/19/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Brancart email re mandamus.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.
02/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re mandamus argument.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.

02/19/2013	SRK	Additional Research re mandamus.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/19/2013	SRK	Conference with Legal Extern John Yi re Research re mandamus.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
02/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re mandamus research.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/19/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re mandamus research.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re digging incident.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/19/2013	SRK	Review email from Jinjer Cooke re digging incident.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/19/2013	CH	attend meeting with Sandra Kane and Donna Chrisjohn re final pretrial order	0.5	\$ 62.50	Internal conference.	
02/20/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re mandamus facts and legal issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
02/20/2013	SRK	Research re mandamus.	3.00	\$ 885.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Chris and Liz Brancart re mandamus and injunctions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
02/20/2013	SRK	Research re affirmative injunctive relief by federal court against city in fair housing case and Draft email to Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/20/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra cane regarding facts and legal issues related to writ of mandamus.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
02/20/2013	LAR	Research mandamus legal issue and review writ of mandamus trial memo.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/21/2013	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re mandatory injunction in fair housing case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/21/2013	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker with Fifth Amendment research.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/21/2013	SRK	Review email from John Yi with mandamus research.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	

02/21/2013	CH	meeting with Sandra Kane and Donna Chrisjohn	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
02/22/2013	SRK	Conference Call with Bill Walker, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re strategy re Count 10 trial memo, and writ of mandamus.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
02/22/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Research re mandamus.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
02/22/2013	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re ruling re motions for summary judgment, and computer software and additional staff resources for trial.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
02/22/2013	CH	meet with Donna, Sandra, Leslie re Case Map and trial	0.8	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
02/22/2013	CH	review of Master Document list and update items	3.5	\$ 437.50		
02/22/2013	CH	update trial deadline chart	0.5	\$ 62.50		
02/28/2013	CH	telephone call with Donna re meeting	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
03/01/2013	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart, Leslie Ross, Donna ChrisJohn and Charlotte Haught re strategy for preparation of joint final pretrial order.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
03/01/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re case status and events in Colorado City.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/01/2013	CH	attend trial prep meeting and follow up from meeting; create spreadsheet for exhibit tasks	2.8	\$ 350.00	Internal conference.	
03/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re trial memo re mandamus issue.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
03/04/2013	SRK	Research re affirmative injunctive to city officials and Review Research from law clerk John Yi re writ of mandamus.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
03/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Research re affirmative injunctions to cities in civil rights cases.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re injunction cases.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

03/04/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Bill Walker re water facts in support of trial brief re writ of mandamus.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed	
03/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Isaac Wyler re new construction and water bills.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re continuing leaks at side of her property.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/05/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re legal issues re trial memorandum re mandamus relief for Count 10.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed	
03/05/2013	SRK	Review Cookes' trial brief re mandamus.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
03/05/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re Cookes' trial brief re mandamus.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
03/05/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re trial brief on mandamus.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
03/05/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding facts pertaining to mandamus issue.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
03/05/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding writ of mandamus issue.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference; not related to claims; claim dismissed.	
03/06/2013	SRK	Review Cooke's Notice of Errata re Trial Memorandum re Mandamus.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims. Claim dismissed.	
03/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh, and Draft email to Brad Keogh re consulting in preparation for trial.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
03/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re case status.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re trial preparation, motions in limine and focus juries.	0.80	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
03/06/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re trial preparation procedures.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/06/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategies.	0.2	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/06/2013	BKK	Review pleadings re liability issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50		
03/08/2013	BKK	Review pleadings re liability and damages issues.	5.5	\$ 1,622.50		
03/08/2013	BKK	Legal research re Title 41 issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00		

03/11/2013	SRK	Conference with paralegal Charlotte Haught re graphic consultant for demonstrative exhibits at trial re water issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
03/11/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re graphic consultant for demonstrative exhibits at trial.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
03/11/2013	CH	meet with Donna re supplies and exhibit organization; meet with Sandra re demonstratives	1.0	\$ 125.00	Internal conference.
03/12/2013	BKK	Review Order and Complaint.	0.9	\$ 265.50	
03/12/2013	BKK	Legal research re AFHA.	2.1	\$ 619.50	
03/13/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart, and Leslie Ross re trial preparation.	4.50	\$ 1,327.50	Internal conference; duplicative.
03/13/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re litigation strategies.	5.5	\$ 1,622.50	Internal conference.
03/13/2013	LAR	Prepare for and participate in meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding trial preparation.	4.5	\$ 900.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.
03/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re demonstrative exhibits and planning.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
03/19/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re research re motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
03/19/2013	SRK	Review emails from Jinjer Cooke and Isaac Wyler re incidents in Colorado City.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
03/19/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with paralegal Charlotte Haught, secretary Donna ChrisJohn and AAG Leslie Ross re pretrial preparation.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.
03/19/2013	SRK	Work with Leslie Ross re witness identification for pretrial order.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.
03/19/2013	LAR	Research adverse inference jury instructions in preparation for trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00	
03/19/2013	LAR	Research sample verdict forms in preparation for trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00	

03/19/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Donna ChrisJohn and Charlotte Haught re trial preparation.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
03/19/2013	CH	prepare possible language for letters to potential witnesses	1.0	\$ 125.00		
03/19/2013	CH	attend trial meeting with Sandra, Donna and Leslie	1.5	\$ 187.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
03/19/2013	CH	telephone call with Donna re notebooks, trial dates and meeting this afternoon; review Isaac Wyler's latest emails;	0.5	\$ 62.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
03/20/2013	SRK	Review order re motions for summary judgment for relevant legal issues, facts and witnesses.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
03/20/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh re findings of fact and conclusions of law, demonstrative exhibits, and witnesses.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
03/20/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re scheduling conference call.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/20/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategies.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
03/20/2013	LAR	Prepare Brian Zitting's deposition designations in preparation for trial.	1.2	\$ 240.00		
03/20/2013	CH	t/c with Donna re case	0.4	\$ 50.00	Internal conference.	
03/21/2013	SRK	Review emails from Jeff Matura and Bill Walker re scheduling conference call.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
03/21/2013	SRK	Draft reply to Jeff Matura re conference call for scheduling of joint pretrial deadlines.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
03/21/2013	SRK	Review emails from Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re procedure on exchanging exhibits.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
03/21/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Charlotte Haught re jury instructions and preparation of exhibits.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry below.	
03/21/2013	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re conference call.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
03/21/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re pretrial preparation.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	

03/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re documents for Bill Walker.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
03/21/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re conference call with Bill Walker.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
03/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re pretrial procedures.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
03/21/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding trial preparation and organization to complete required pleadings prior to final pretrial conference.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
03/21/2013	LAR	Research sample jury instructions and draft template for proposed jury instructions to be used in this case.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
03/21/2013	CH	prepare discs of all documents for Bill Walker	2.2	\$ 275.00		
03/21/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra re exhibits	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
03/22/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re trial procedures.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entries below.	
03/22/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re discovery issues and themes for closing argument.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
03/22/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re pretrial procedures.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/22/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke with order setting final pretrial conference.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/22/2013	SRK	Review deposition of Helaman Barlow and email from Jinjer Cooke re digging incident.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
03/22/2013	SRK	Research re use of depositions due to unavailability of witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/22/2013	SRK	Work on theme for closing argument.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
03/22/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategies.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entries below.	
03/22/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker and Sandra Kane re litigation strategies.	0.6	\$ 177.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entries below.	

03/22/2013	LAR	Prepare for and participate in meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding trial preparation.	1.2	\$ 240.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entries below.	
03/22/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designation's for Randy Jenson in preparation for trial.	1.2	\$ 240.00		
03/22/2013	LAR	Research impeachment evidence for Jake Barlow and David Darger in preparation for trial.	1.3	\$ 260.00		
03/22/2013	CH	prepare cover letter and mail discs to Bill Walker	0.4	\$ 50.00	Clerical.	
03/24/2013	SRK	Research re jury instructions.	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
03/24/2013	SRK	Review and edit draft jury instructions from Elizabeth Brancart.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
03/24/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Elizabeth Brancart re jury instructions, voir dire and jury verdict.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
03/24/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re jury instructions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/24/2013	SRK	Review Joint Second Amended Complaint and Order re MSJ's.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
03/25/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re jury instructions and witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry below.	
03/25/2013	SRK	Work on pretrial identification of witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re jury instructions and witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/25/2013	SRK	Review emails from Chris Brancart re jury instructions, voir dire, and reply to Chris Brancart.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/25/2013	SRK	Review court records re David Darger and Jacob Barlow for possible impeachment and Research re evidentiary standard for admissibility.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/25/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker with draft jury instructions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/25/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding trial witnesses and jury instructions in preparation for trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	

03/25/2013	LAR	Prepare Brian Zitting's affirmative deposition designations in preparation for trial.	2.6	\$ 520.00		
03/25/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designation for Randy Jenson in preparation for trial.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
03/26/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re demonstrative exhibits, motions in limine, and jury instructions.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/26/2013	SRK	Review disclosure statements re witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/26/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re anticipated motions in limine.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/26/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend team meeting with Ann Hobart, Charlotte Haught, and Donna ChrisJohn re preparation of joint pretrial statement.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entries below.	
03/26/2013	SRK	Conference with CB Misbach re Research for anticipated motions in limine re religious communications and Jeremiah B. Allred letter.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/26/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Donna ChrisJohn and Charlotte Haught regarding preparation of joint pretrial statement.	0.8	\$ 160.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
03/26/2013	CH	attend trial meeting with Sandra, Ann, Donna	1.5	\$ 187.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
03/27/2013	SRK	Review Order setting final pretrial conference and attachments.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
03/28/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re preparation for conference call with defense counsel.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/28/2013	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker re exchanging exhibits and preparation of final pretrial order.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
03/28/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re conference call on exchanging exhibits and preparation of final pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

03/28/2013	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards re evidentiary issues for motions in limine.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
03/28/2013	SRK	Conference with CB Misbach re motion in limine re Jethro Barlow.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
03/28/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Jethro Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/28/2013	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and CB Misbach re Jethro Barlow, and admissibility of FLDS evidence.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/28/2013	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards re strategy for trial.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/29/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re drafting fact section of Joint Pretrial Order and status of meetings with counsel re pretrial statement preparation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/29/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re exhibits for trial.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/29/2013	SRK	Review exhibits for preparation of final pretrial order.	3.20	\$ 944.00		
03/29/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker re exhibits for trial.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/29/2013	SRK	Draft fax and emails to Bill Walker re exhibits and facts.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
03/29/2013	SRK	Review email from Liz Brancart re jury instruction on pretext.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/29/2013	SRK	Draft email to Liz and Chris Brancart re jury instruction on pattern or practice claim.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
03/29/2013	LAR	Review and prepare facts for trial to determine which witnesses are necessary for trial to establish the State's claims.	3.6	\$ 720.00		
03/29/2013	LAR	Draft fact section of joint pretrial order.	4.0	\$ 800.00		
03/30/2013	SRK	Review email from Jinjer Cooke re camera surveillance by FLDS Church and cities and link to Salt Lake Tribune article and video interview of Guy Timpson re same.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	

03/30/2013	SRK	Review online article from KUTV Channel 2 re camera surveillance by FLDS and cities and statements from Guy Timpson, Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.
03/30/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke re camera surveillance article.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
03/30/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re camera surveillance.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
03/30/2013	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart, Leslie Ross and Brad Keogh re new camera surveillance info.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
03/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re camera surveillance and need to research pretrial disclosure.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
03/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Leslie Ross re telephone conversation with Bill Walker, supplemental disclosure of camera surveillance info, deposition designations, and research re contacting Guy Timpson.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
03/30/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re supplemental disclosure.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
03/30/2013	SRK	Review and analyze undisputed fact list from Leslie Ross.	2.00	\$ 590.00	
03/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Research re supplemental disclosure and strategy.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
03/30/2013	SRK	Research re cases cited by Bill Walker and additional Research re discovery of new evidence after expiration of discovery deadline.	2.30	\$ 678.50	
03/31/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Leslie Ross re preparation of facts for pretrial statement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
03/31/2013	SRK	Review exhibits for inclusion in pretrial statement.	4.30	\$ 1,268.50	
04/01/2013	SRK	Review file for exhibits for inclusion in pretrial statement.	1.50	\$ 442.50	
04/01/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re ethics issue re contacting Guy Timpson.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.

04/01/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re ethics issue.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/01/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re preparation of exhibit list, issues re admission of camera surveillance evidence from Guy Timpson and incident re Cookes, and strategy for conference call with counsel for defendants.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
04/01/2013	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart re preparation of exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/01/2013	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker re pretrial conference, deadlines and evidentiary issues.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
04/01/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re deadlines for pretrial conference.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/01/2013	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re camera surveillance evidence, pretrial statement, motions in limine, and other legal issues.	3.00	\$ 885.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry below.	
04/01/2013	SRK	Review exhibits for pretrial statement.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
04/01/2013	BKK	Review Order from court.	0.1	\$ 29.50		
04/01/2013	BKK	Review newspaper article and video interview of trial witness.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
04/01/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	3.4	\$ 1,003.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
04/01/2013	LAR	Prepare Guy Timpson's affirmative deposition designations in preparation for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
04/01/2013	CH	telephone calls with Sandra and Donna re formatting exhibit list	0.8	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
04/02/2013	SRK	Review first exhibit list from Bill Walker.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/02/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re exhibits and other pretrial issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/02/2013	SRK	Meeting with team - Leslie Ross, Ann Hobart, Charlotte Haught and Donna ChrisJohn - re pretrial preparation and deadlines.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry below.	

04/02/2013	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re exhibits and pretrial deadlines and procedures, Conference with Ann Hobart re same, Telephone call to Brad Keogh re same.	6.80	\$ 2,006.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
04/02/2013	LAR	Prepare Helaman Barlow's affirmative deposition designations in preparation for trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
04/02/2013	LAR	Prepare Helaman Barlow's affirmative deposition designations in preparation for trial.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
04/02/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Ann Hobart, Charlotte Haught and Donna Chrisjohn regarding joint pretrial statement and trial preparation deadlines.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
04/02/2013	LAR	Add and revise facts organized by witness in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
04/02/2013	LAR	Prepare Helaman Barlow's affirmative deposition designations in preparation for trial.	1.3	\$ 260.00		
04/02/2013	CH	attend trial prep meeting	1.5	\$ 187.50	Internal conference; duplicative of the entry above	
04/03/2013	SRK	Review documents for exhibits for pretrial statement.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
04/03/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re camera surveillance new evidence.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/03/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re potential motion in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/03/2013	SRK	Draft email to Chris and Liz Brancart re jury instructions, pattern or practice claim, special verdict and injunctive relief.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/03/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re status of deposition designations and file organization.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/03/2013	SRK	Research re retaliation and new evidence.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
04/03/2013	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re camera surveillance and motion in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference,	

04/03/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re additional exhibit list.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Brad Keogh re motion in limine re ruling.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; duplicative.	
04/03/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re motion in limine re ruling.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/03/2013	SRK	Review documents for exhibits.	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
04/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re status of exhibit review, motions in limine, and exchange of facts.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
04/03/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re exchange of facts, and Draft email to Bill Walker re proposed method to exchange facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
04/03/2013	SRK	Review draft designations for Brian Zitting's deposition.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
04/03/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re designations for Brian Zitting's deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/03/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	0.2	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; duplicative of the entry above	
04/03/2013	BKK	legal research re 11th Amendment issues.	1.3	\$ 383.50		
04/03/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategies.	1.1	\$ 324.50	Internal conference.	
04/03/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits and TCWW documents.	1.6	\$ 472.00		
04/03/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Helaman Barlow, Brian Zitting, and Guy Timpson in preparation for trial.	2.8	\$ 560.00		
04/03/2013	LAR	Prepare Richard Holm's affirmative deposition designations in preparation for trial.	1.9	\$ 380.00		
04/03/2013	LAR	Prepare John Cook's affirmative deposition designations in preparation for trial.	4.5	\$ 900.00		
04/03/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Matthew Musser in preparation for trial.	4.5	\$ 900.00		

04/03/2013	CH	prepare exhibit list, review exhibits listed by Bill Walker and update list	5.0	\$ 625.00		
04/04/2013	SRK	Coordinate with Leslie Ross re exhibit identification.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Donna ChrisJohn re exhibits identified.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re exhibits to locate.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/04/2013	SRK	Review documents for exhibits from Zachary Renstrom reports.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
04/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Chris Brancart re findings of fact and conclusions of law.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re status of exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/04/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/04/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re exhibit exchange and facts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re facts to review for stipulation.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/04/2013	SRK	Review documents for exhibits from JCAF.	6.00	\$ 1,770.00		
04/04/2013	LAR	Review John Cook and Matthew Musser's deposition exhibits in preparation for trial.	3.7	\$ 740.00		
04/04/2013	CH	review and edit exhibit list	6.0	\$ 750.00		
04/05/2013	SRK	Review documents for exhibits.	2.40	\$ 708.00		
04/05/2013	SRK	Conferences with Leslie Ross re status of exhibit list and Charlotte Haught re status of exhibit list and pretrial order components.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
04/05/2013	SRK	Conference with Donna ChrisJohn re preparation of exhibit list and process to prepare exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/05/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re exhibit list.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/05/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re fact review methodology, and Draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

04/05/2013	SRK	Review email from Donna ChrisJohn with partial exhibit list.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/05/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re deposition designations and assistance with fact merger.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/05/2013	SRK	Review initial exhibit list.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
04/05/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re draft Motion for Limited Amendment to Scheduling Order to Permit Continued Deposition of Guy Timpson, and Review and edit motion, and declaration.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
04/05/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re stipulations re pretrial order.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/05/2013	SRK	Draft email to paralegal Charlotte Haught re email from Jeff Matura.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/05/2013	SRK	Review emails from Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re facts, and Draft reply to Blake Hamilton.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/05/2013	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re merger of facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/05/2013	SRK	Review revised plaintiff's initial exhibit list.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/05/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re Plaintiffs' initial exhibit list.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/05/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and work on merging facts to send to Defendants.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	
04/05/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Alan Gardner in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
04/05/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Matthew Musser in preparation for trial.	1.6	\$ 320.00		
04/05/2013	LAR	Revise stipulated facts section for joint pretrial order.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
04/06/2013	SRK	Review file for exhibits.	13.00	\$ 3,835.00		
04/06/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re fact list.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; duplicative.	
04/06/2013	LAR	Draft exhibit list for joint pretrial order.	6.1	\$ 1,220.00		

04/06/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding fact section of pretrial order.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference; duplicative of the entry above.	
04/07/2013	SRK	Review documents for preparation of exhibit list.	14.00	\$ 4,130.00		
04/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re designating deposition, exhibit status and issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/07/2013	LAR	Draft and revise exhibit list in preparation for trial.	6.0	\$ 1,200.00		
04/07/2013	CH	review and edit exhibit list	6.5	\$ 812.50		
04/08/2013	SRK	Work on exhibits for pretrial order, including Review additional documents for exhibits, Coordinate with paralegal and other attorneys in preparation of second exhibit list, Conference with Bill Walker re exhibit list, and Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re second exhibit list.	16.00	\$ 3,776.00	Excessive; block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
04/08/2013	LAR	Determine which exhibits are necessary for trial, and draft and revise exhibit list for joint pretrial order.	12.0	\$ 2,400.00		
04/08/2013	CH	review and edit exhibit list	7.5	\$ 937.50		
04/09/2013	SRK	Work on exhibits for pretrial order, including Review documents for exhibits, Conference with Leslie Ross re additional exhibits, Review videos for inclusion in exhibit list, Review email from Bill Walker re exhibits, Telephone call to Brad Keogh re disclosure of depositions from other cases, Conference with Charlotte Haught re preparation of exhibit list; Telephone call to Bill Richards re disclosure of Texas FLDS documents; Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re final exhibit list.	8.50	\$ 2,006.00	Excessive; block billing, internal conference; duplicative of entry below.	Reduced by 20%.

04/09/2013	LAR	Determine which exhibits are necessary for trial, and draft and revise exhibit list for joint pretrial order.	12.0	\$ 2,400.00		
04/09/2013	CH	review and edit exhibit list	0.3	\$ 37.50		
04/09/2013	CH	review and edit exhibit list	2.3	\$ 287.50		
04/09/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra re exhibits	0.4	\$ 50.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
04/10/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re exhibits for pretrial statement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/10/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Ann Hobart, Leslie Ross, Donna ChrisJohn and Charlotte Haught re deadlines and logistics re pretrial order.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 258.	
04/10/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker in preparation for conference call with JA re Guy Timpson deposition, status of exhibits and other issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/10/2013	SRK	Conference call with Judge Teilborg's JA and all counsel re hearing on discovery dispute re Guy Timpson deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/10/2013	SRK	Conference call with all counsel re issues relating to pretrial order including exhibits, joint pretrial statement.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/10/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/10/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re deposition designations and stipulations among counsel, and reply.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/10/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re conversation with Guy Timpson.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/10/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Guy Timpson.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
04/10/2013	SRK	Review and edit exhibit list.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
04/10/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re exhibit list.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	

04/10/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re discovery issues.	2.8	\$ 826.00	Internal conference.
04/10/2013	BKK	Review Utah Supreme Court Opinion and Salt Lake Tribune articles re FLDS issues.	2.7	\$ 796.50	Not related to claims.
04/10/2013	LAR	Revise stipulated facts section of joint proposed final pretrial order.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00	
04/10/2013	CH	attend trial team meeting	0.8	\$ 100.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 257.
04/10/2013	CH	separate exhibits and prepare to exchange with opposing counsel	3.0	\$ 375.00	
04/11/2013	SRK	Begin to Draft voir dire.	1.00	\$ 295.00	
04/11/2013	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re drafting facts and findings of fact and conclusions of law.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
04/11/2013	SRK	Work on finalizing exhibit list.	0.60	\$ 177.00	
04/11/2013	SRK	Attend telephonic hearing re Plaintiffs' request to extend scheduling order to depose Guy Timpson.	0.50	\$ 147.50	
04/11/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re ruling on re Plaintiffs' request to extend scheduling order to depose Guy Timpson.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
04/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re scheduling deposition of Guy Timpson.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
04/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Guy Timpson re availability for deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
04/11/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re potential dates for deposition, and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
04/11/2013	SRK	Review emails from Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura , and reply.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
04/11/2013	SRK	Arrange for court reporter for video deposition of Guy Timpson in St. George UT.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.

04/11/2013	SRK	PF and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh re voir dire, Guy Timpson deposition, and new incidents involving police and Church.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry below.	
04/11/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re voir dire.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Mary Jo O'Neill of EEOC with Brad Keogh re voir dire in religious discrimination cases.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry below.	
04/11/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re potential motion in limine.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
04/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Court Reporter Marty Herder re video deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
04/11/2013	SRK	Work on exhibit list.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
04/11/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategies.	3.3	\$ 973.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
04/11/2013	BKK	Review Salt Lake Tribune articles re FLDS issues.	0.7	\$ 206.50	Not related to claims.	
04/11/2013	LAR	Review and revise exhibit list for joint pretrial order.	6.5	\$ 1,300.00		
04/11/2013	CH	order video clip re security cameras	0.5	\$ 62.50		
04/11/2013	CH	Prepare exhibits	2.4	\$ 300.00		
04/11/2013	CH	Prepare exhibits	0.4	\$ 50.00		
04/11/2013	CH	Prepare exhibits	0.9	\$ 112.50		
04/11/2013	CH	pull exhibits; follow up with Leslie on redactions; Donna on slip sheets; emails re I drive access for Ann	1.8	\$ 180.00	Internal conference; block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
04/12/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re witness list, jury instructions, voir dire, and scheduling deposition of Guy Timpson.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/12/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re forms for preparation of voir dire and jury instructions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/12/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Charlotte Haught re questions on exhibit list.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 262.	
04/12/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker with 11th Supplemental Disclosure Statement for drafting witness list.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

04/12/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re admission of video from Guy Timpson interview.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re admission of video from Guy Timpson interview.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Review Amended Order Setting Final Pretrial Conference.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
04/12/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re need to confirm dates and joint telephone call to Jeff Matura's office.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re new Order and change re scheduling trial dates.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re possible error re submission of pretrial order and efforts to resolve.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re trial location and date.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re court reporter for Guy Timpson's deposition and scheduling conference call with counsel.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker, Blake Hamilton, Jeff Matura re conference call.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross, Charlotte Haught and Donna ChrisJohn re new pretrial deadlines.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Draft email to Nancy Beck re Research re motion in limine re FLDS communications and beliefs.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Conference with CB Misbach re research re evidentiary issues re FLDS communications and beliefs.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
04/12/2013	SRK	Research re authenticity of FLDS communications.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
04/12/2013	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re use of video of Guy Timpson's TV interview during deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.

04/12/2013	BKK	Review Order from Court re pretrial issues.	0.1	\$ 29.50		
04/12/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Ann Hobart re discovery issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/12/2013	BKK	Review proposed voir dire and jury instructions.	1.5	\$ 442.50		
04/12/2013	LAR	Review and revise exhibit list for joint pretrial order.	3.8	\$ 760.00		
04/12/2013	LAR	Email communications with Charlotte Haught regarding revisions to the exhibit list and deposition designations.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
04/12/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Daniel Rondeau in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
04/12/2013	LAR	Phone call with Bill Walker regarding delegation of deposition designations in preparation for trial. Draft email memorializing agreed delegation of deposition designations with attachment containing finalized deposition designations.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Internal conference.	
04/12/2013	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane regarding proposed revisions to exhibit list.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
04/12/2013	LAR	Review Amended Order Setting Final Pretrial Conference in preparation for trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
04/12/2013	LAR	Review Bill Walker's draft jury instructions and proposed voir dire.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
04/12/2013	LAR	Review Order regarding reconsideration of Amended Order Setting Pretrial Conference.	0.1	\$ 20.00		
04/12/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding trial location and dates.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
04/12/2013	LAR	Conference with Sandra Kane regarding preparation of voir dire and jury instructions.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
04/12/2013	LAR	Revise proposed voir dire and jury instructions and include Bill Walker's proposed language in both.	3.5	\$ 700.00		

04/12/2013	CH	update exhibit list; telephone call with Sandra Kane; emails re exhibit list and video	3.0	\$ 375.00	Internal conference; block billing; duplicative of entry on pg. 260.	Objection overruled.
04/12/2013	CH	emails re new order from Judge Teilborg re deadlines; burn DVD and help Sandra play DVD	1.0	\$ 100.00	Clerical; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
04/15/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re new deadlines for preparation of joint proposed final pretrial order.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
04/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re court reporter/videographer for deposition of Guy Timpson.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; clerical.	
04/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re deposition of Guy Timpson.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/15/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Steven Bateman in preparation for trial.	5.0	\$ 1,000.00		
04/15/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Alma Cawley in preparation for trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
04/15/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Craig Neeley in preparation for trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
04/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re objections re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re court reporter arrangements and research re Fifth Amendment issue for motion in limine,	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/16/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re deadlines.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/16/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re team meeting.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/16/2013	SRK	PF and attend Meeting with with Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross, Charlotte Haught and Donna ChrisJohn re deadlines for joint proposed final pretrial order, motions in limine, and legal theories.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 264.	

04/16/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 263.	
04/16/2013	BKK	Review order from court and FLDS documents.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Not related to claims.	
04/16/2013	LAR	Prepare for and participate in trial preparation meeting with Brad Keogh, Sandra Kane, Charlotte Haught and Donna Chrisjohn regarding deadlines for joint proposed final pretrial order, motions in limine, and legal theories.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 263.	
04/16/2013	CH	attend trial meeting	2.0	\$ 250.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 263.	
04/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re Guy Timpson statement at UEP probate court.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Margaret Cooke re Guy Timpson statement.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
04/17/2013	SRK	Jeff Shields' office re statement by Guy Timpson.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bruce Wisan re Guy Timpson statement.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re Guy Timpson statement in probate court.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/17/2013	SRK	Research re confidentiality of meetings in executive session.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
04/18/2013	SRK	Review research memo from John Yi re discarding Fifth Amendment protection after close of discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/18/2013	SRK	Research re issuance of subpoena to Arizona resident for deposition in Utah.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
04/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re service of subpoena on Guy Timpson.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re service of subpoena on Guy Timpson.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/18/2013	SRK	Draft subpoena to Guy Timpson from US District Court of Utah.	0.40	\$ 118.00		

04/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re subpoena.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
04/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re subpoena.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
04/18/2013	SRK	Review video of Guy Timpson interview to prepare photo exhibits for deposition of Guy Timpson.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
04/18/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding Guy Timpson deposition and evidence in preparation for Guy Timpson's deposition.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
04/18/2013	LAR	Review Guy Timpson prior deposition and exhibits in preparation for Guy Timpson's second deposition.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
04/18/2013	CH	respond to voice mails and emails re photos from video and bates numbering	0.3	\$ 37.50		
04/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Margaret Cooke re Guy Timpson's statement at probate hearing.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/19/2013	SRK	PF Deposition of Guy Timpson.	6.00	\$ 1,770.00		
04/19/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
04/19/2013	LAR	Review and prepare exhibits for Guy Timpson's deposition.	4.2	\$ 840.00		
04/19/2013	LAR	Draft and revise joint pretrial order.	1.3	\$ 260.00		
04/19/2013	CH	redact exhibits	1.0	\$ 125.00		
04/20/2013	SRK	PF Deposition of Guy Timpson.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
04/21/2013	SRK	Conference call to Guy Timpson with Bill Walker in preparation for deposition.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
04/21/2013	SRK	PF deposition of Guy Timpson.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
04/22/2013	SRK	PF deposition of Guy Timpson.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
04/22/2013	SRK	Attend deposition of Guy Timpson.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
04/22/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents re trial evidentiary issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00		
04/22/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Travis Fox in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		

04/22/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Jeff Vaughn and Travis Fox in preparation for trial.	1.6	\$ 320.00	Block billing	Objection overruled.
04/22/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for George Barlow in preparation for trial.	0.9	\$ 180.00		
04/22/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Andrew Craddock in preparation for trial.	0.9	\$ 180.00		
04/22/2013	LAR	Revise fact section of the joint pretrial order.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
04/22/2013	CH	redact exhibits	3.1	\$ 387.50		
04/23/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re Guy Timpson's deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross, Charlotte Haught and Donna ChrisJohn re exhibits.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry below.	
04/23/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re admissibility of letters to FLDS leader.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry below.	
04/23/2013	SRK	Review exhibits and Draft email to Bill Walker re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/23/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Charlotte Haught re modification of exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re maps, and Draft reply.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re redaction of exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/23/2013	SRK	Review Research from John Yi re accessing ACJIS for license plates, and forward to Bill Walker.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/23/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 267.	
04/23/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Andrew Chatwin in preparation for trial.	1.7	\$ 340.00		
04/23/2013	LAR	Obtain custodian of records declaration impeachment exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
04/23/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Jeff Vaughn's deposition in preparation for trial.	4.0	\$ 800.00		

04/23/2013	LAR	Prepare for and participate in meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh re admissibility of letters to FLDS leaders in preparation for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 266.	
04/23/2013	CH	attend trial team meeting	1.5	\$ 187.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 266.	
04/24/2013	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards re Guy Timpson deposition, authenticity of letters from city officials to Warren Jeffs, and remote testimony of witnesses.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
04/24/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re email from Jinjer Cooke and demonstrative exhibit.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/24/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re redaction of letters from city officials to Warren Jeffs.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/24/2013	LAR	Review trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
04/24/2013	LAR	Research disclosure of ADOT map as possible demonstrative exhibit in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
04/24/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Andrew Chatwin in preparation for trial.	2.5	\$ 500.00		
04/24/2013	LAR	Review AZ and UT POST related exhibits in preparation for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
04/25/2013	SRK	Review emails from Liz Brancart re jury instructions.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
04/25/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re mitigation of damages defense.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re mitigation of damages.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/25/2013	SRK	Work on legal issue list.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
04/25/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh re strategy for jury instructions, identifying witnesses, and issue coding exhibits.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference; duplicative of entry on pg. 269.	
04/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re meeting re witness list and status of jury instructions.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	

04/25/2013	SRK	Coordinate with Charlotte Haught and Donna ChrisJohn re preparation of exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/25/2013	SRK	Review Affidavit of Custodian of Record Lyle Mann re AZ POST records, and Conference with Brad Keogh re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
04/25/2013	SRK	Draft email to Elizabeth Brancart re joint and several liability in fair housing cases.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/25/2013	SRK	Review reply from Elizabeth Brancart re joint and several liability in fair housing cases.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/25/2013	SRK	Research re damages in fair housing cases.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
04/25/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re joint and several liability in fair housing cases.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re sale of Twin City Improvement Association (TCIA) property.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/25/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re sale of TCIA property.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/25/2013	SRK	Review emails from Leslie Ross re jury instructions re mitigation of damages and forward to Bill Walker.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/25/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.2	\$ 354.00	Internal conference; duplicate entry at pg. 268.	
04/25/2013	LAR	Research 5th amendment privilege (Handbook of Federal Evidence and The New Wigmore: Evidentiary Privileges) and adverse inference jury instructions in preparation for trial.	1.2	\$ 240.00		
04/25/2013	LAR	Research jury instructions for adverse inference in preparation for trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
04/25/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Marion Timpson in preparation for trial.	3.4	\$ 680.00		

04/25/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane re pretrial organization.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
04/25/2013	LAR	Research joint and several liability jury instructions.	0.9	\$ 180.00		
04/25/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Andrew Chatwin in preparation for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
04/26/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/26/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re vicarious liability and joint and several liability.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/26/2013	SRK	Review email from Jinjer Cooke with transcript of UEP probate hearing with statement allegedly made by Guy Timpson.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/26/2013	SRK	Research re joint and several liability.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
04/26/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re joint and several liability.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/26/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re joint and several liability.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/26/2013	LAR	Format pretrial documents in preparation for filing them.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
04/26/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Don Timpson in preparation for trial.	3.5	\$ 700.00		
04/28/2013	SRK	Work on jury instructions, including Review jury instructions drafted by Bill Walker , Draft jury instructions relating to fair housing issues, and Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re jury instructions.	6.10	\$ 1,799.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
04/29/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Bill Walker, Leslie Ross and Brad Keogh re plaintiffs' witnesses.	7.00	\$ 2,065.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry below.	
04/29/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re strategy re presentation of plaintiffs' case.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/29/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of witness list and coding exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

04/29/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Bill Walker re litigation strategies.	7.0	\$ 2,065.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
04/29/2013	BKK	Review jury instructions and witness list.	2.5	\$ 737.50		
04/29/2013	LAR	Prepare for and participate in meeting with Brad Keogh and Sandra Kane re organization of State's witness list with determinations as to an estimated amount of time each witness will take to testify.	7.0	\$ 1,400.00	Internal conference; duplicative of entry above.	
04/29/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor's witness list in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
04/29/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Aaron Timpson in preparation for trial.	3.5	\$ 700.00		
04/29/2013	CH	make updates to exhibits and master list; burn DVD's of latest set of exhibits for Bill Walker	2.0	\$ 250.00	Block billing	Objection overruled.
04/30/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re plaintiffs' witness list and review deposition of Jonathan Roundy.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
04/30/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re witness list and deposition of Guy Timpson.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/30/2013	SRK	Review depositions of Aaron Timpson and Marion Timpson.	2.20	\$ 649.00		
04/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re witness list.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/30/2013	SRK	Work on final revision to witness list with Leslie Ross.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/30/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenors' Witness List.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/30/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re Defendants' Joint Witness and Exhibit Lists.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/30/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re Defendants' Witness and Exhibit Lists.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

04/30/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenors' List of Witnesses.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/30/2013	BKK	Review witness and exhibit lists.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Duplicative.	
04/30/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane to finalize Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor's witness list.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
04/30/2013	LAR	Revise Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor's witness list.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Duplicative of 4/30/13 BKK entry.	
04/30/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Guy Timpson in preparation for trial.	2.9	\$ 580.00		
04/30/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor's witness list, review of John Roundy's deposition, discuss Guy Timpson's deposition.	2.0	\$ 320.00	Internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
04/30/2013	CH	telephone call with Donna re meeting	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
05/01/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Defendants' witness and exhibit list and possible motions in limine.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/01/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re new developments in Colorado City re UEP and police activities.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/01/2013	SRK	Draft email to Elizabeth Brancart re damages jury instruction.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/01/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Ann Hobart re preparation of facts.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/01/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents and trial exhibits.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50	Duplicative.	
05/01/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding Defendants' witness list and exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
05/01/2013	CH	review defendant exhibit list and witness lists for both sides	0.4	\$ 50.00		
05/02/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re scope of facts for pretrial order.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/02/2013	SRK	Review pretrial orders issued by Judge Teilborg re scope of facts and legal issues.	0.60	\$ 177.00		

05/02/2013	SRK	Draft jury instructions re damages and religious discrimination.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
05/02/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie re motions in limine, jury instructions, stipulated facts, and Review Defendants' list of exhibits.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00	Internal conference.	
05/02/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re acceptance of service for subpoenas.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/02/2013	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart re fair housing damages jury instruction.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/02/2013	SRK	Draft reply to Elizabeth Brancart and request re pattern or practice damages instruction.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/02/2013	SRK	Continue to Review exhibits listed by Defendants.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
05/02/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re litigation strategies.	7.5	\$ 2,212.50	Internal conference.	
05/02/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Marion Timpson, Randy Jenson and Robert Huddleston in preparation for trial.	2.1	\$ 420.00		
05/02/2013	LAR	Research effect of facts listed in final pretrial order (Dohn Oil Tool, Inc. v. Cooper Cameron Corp., Rockwell Intern. Corp. v. U.S., Federal Practice & Procedure)	2.2	\$ 440.00		
05/02/2013	LAR	Prepare affirmative deposition designations for Marion Timpson in preparation for trial.	1.2	\$ 240.00	Duplicative of 5/2/2013.	
05/02/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
05/02/2013	CH	review Deft exhibit list and compare to Pltf list	2.5	\$ 312.50	Duplicative of 4/30/2013 BKK & 4/30/2013 LAR.	
05/03/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re stipulation to subpoena witnesses.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	

05/03/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re motions in limine and defendants' exhibit list.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/03/2013	SRK	Draft jury instructions re mitigation of damages.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
05/03/2013	SRK	Review defendants' exhibit list and related exhibits.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
05/03/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re Defendants' exhibit list and motions in limine.	2.30	\$ 678.50	Internal conference.	
05/03/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re impeachment exhibits and strategy re defendants' evidence.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
05/03/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re limiting witnesses and upcoming deadlines.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/03/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re impeachment of witness for assertion of 5th Amendment.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/03/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Mike Benchoff, Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re impeachment of witness for assertion of 5th Amendment .	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference; duplicative of prior entry.	
05/03/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Ann Hobart, Mike Benchoff, Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re Fifth Amendment issues and litigation strategies.	6.3	\$ 1,858.50	Internal conference; duplicative of 5/3/2013 SRK; excessive.	
05/03/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re discovery issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/03/2013	BKK	Review pleadings.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Vague as to purpose.	
05/03/2013	LAR	Conference re motions in limine, defendants' exhibit list, impeachment exhibits, stipulations, and upcoming deadlines.	4.5	\$ 900.00	Internal conference; vague as to with whom.	

05/03/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Duplicative of 5/2/2013 LAR.
05/03/2013	CH	compare Deft exhibit list to Plaintiffs	6.1	\$ 762.50	Excessive; duplicative of 5/2/2013 CH.
05/04/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re issue coding of exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
05/04/2013	SRK	Revise draft Jury Instructions.	0.80	\$ 236.00	
05/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re assignments relating to pretrial order.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.
05/04/2013	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart with Research re impeachment with prior conviction.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
05/04/2013	SRK	Research re plea bargains of Jake Barlow and David Darger.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
05/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Mike Benchoff re documents needed for impeachment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
05/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to James Schoppmann to request documents needed for impeachment of Jake Barlow and David Darger.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re documents needed for impeachment of witnesses Jake Barlow and David Darger.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference; excessive.
05/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re witness addresses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/04/2013	SRK	Work on elements of proof issues.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00	
05/04/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane re jury instructions and exhibits in preparation for trial.	1.3	\$ 260.00	Internal conference.
05/04/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims.	4.5	\$ 900.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/2/2013 LAR & 5/3/2013 LAR.
05/05/2013	SRK	Work on proof plan.	5.30	\$ 1,563.50	Excessive; vague & duplicative of 5/4/2013 SRK.

05/05/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re motions in limine and impeachment of witnesses on criminal convictions.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/05/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/2/2013 LAR, 5/3/2013 LAR & 5/4/2013 LAR.	
05/06/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross with motion in limine re ruling on reasonable accommodation claim.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/06/2013	SRK	Edit motion in limine re ruling on reasonable accommodation claim.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/06/2013	SRK	Review email from James Schoppmann re certified copies of conviction records for Jake Barlow and David Darger.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call to James Schoppmann re elements of crime and copies of records, and Draft email to Bill Walker re conviction records.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
05/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Brad Keogh re meetings re exhibits, voir dire, jury instructions, motions in limine.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Rondeau expert report.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/06/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker with Rondeau expert report.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/06/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re checking deposition exhibits for impeachment and issue coding.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/06/2013	SRK	Review and issue code plaintiffs' exhibits.	9.60	\$ 2,832.00	Excessive; work for paralegal, not lawyer.	
05/06/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh re voir dire, jury verdict and jury instructions.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/06/2013	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re jury instruction on vicarious liability.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/06/2013	SRK	Draft email to Elizabeth Brancart re jury instructions on vicarious liability and joint and several liability.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

05/06/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re pretrial issues.	2.3	\$ 678.50	Internal conference.
05/06/2013	BKK	Review jury instructions.	0.8	\$ 236.00	
05/06/2013	BKK	Draft voir dire and jury verdict forms.	2.0	\$ 590.00	
05/06/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents.	0.9	\$ 265.50	
05/06/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims.	5.0	\$ 1,000.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/2/2013 LAR, 5/3/2013 LAR, 5/4/2013 LAR & 5/5/2013 LAR.
05/06/2013	CH	review/compare Pltf and Deft exh list	5.0	\$ 625.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/2/2013 CH & 5/3/2013 CH.
05/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re computer problem with motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims.
05/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Telephone call to Defense Counsel and JA re computer problem with motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; not related to claims.
05/07/2013	SRK	Review stipulation for extension for plaintiffs to file motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/07/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re revisions to Plaintiffs' Motion in Limine re Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
05/07/2013	SRK	Edit Motion in Limine, and email and telephone communications with Bill Walker re filing Motion in Limine.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.
05/07/2013	SRK	Review initial motions in limine from Hildale.	0.50	\$ 147.50	
05/07/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Litigation Team Leslie Ross, Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh, Charlotte Haught, and Donna ChrisJohn re duplicate exhibits, motions in limine, stipulated facts, issues of law, statement of case, and witness lists.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.
05/07/2013	SRK	Draft proposed order re motion in limine.	0.30	\$ 88.50	

05/07/2013	BKK	Draft voir dire and jury verdict forms.	6.3	\$ 1,858.50	Excessive; duplicative of 5/6/2013 BKK.	
05/07/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re voir dire and jury verdict forms.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/07/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits.	1.0	\$ 295.00		
05/07/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane, Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh, Charlotte Haught and Donna Chrisjohn regarding duplicate exhibits, motions in limine, stipulated facts, issues of law, statement of the case, and witness lists.	2.5	\$ 500.00	Internal conference.	
05/07/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims. Review Plaintiffs' exhibits.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/2/2013 LAR, 5/3/2013 LAR, 5/4/2013 LAR, 5/5/2013 LAR & 5/6/2013 LAR.	
05/07/2013	LAR	Revise Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims and exhibit list.	2.5	\$ 500.00	Excessive; duplicative of prior entry.	
05/07/2013	CH	review and compare Deft exhibit list	0.9	\$ 112.50		
05/07/2013	CH	update exhibit list	0.2	\$ 25.00		
05/07/2013	CH	attend Trial team meeting	1.9	\$ 237.50	Internal conference.	
05/07/2013	CH	prepare list of duplicate exhibits for Sandra Kane	1.7	\$ 212.50		
05/08/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re potential additional trial exhibits and review exhibits.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bruce Wisan and Jethro Barlow re UEP unfinished houses.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Review emails from Brad Keogh re jury instructions and damages and other relief in pattern or practice case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Research re damages and other relief in pattern or practice cases.	0.60	\$ 177.00		

05/08/2013	SRK	Review email and case law from Ann Hobart re damages and other relief in pattern or practice case.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh with proposed jury verdict form.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Research re pattern or practice cases.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
05/08/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart, and Leslie Ross re jury instructions and jury verdict form.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re pattern or practice issue on verdict form and jury instructions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re response to motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught with list of duplicate exhibits from Defendants, and Review exhibits.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re analysis of duplicate exhibit list.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross with possible additional exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re expert witness reports and exhibits .	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re police interference with minor based on religion.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	SRK	Edit jury instructions.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
05/08/2013	BKK	Draft voir dire and jury verdict forms.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Excessive; duplicative of 5/6/2013 BKK & 5/7/2013 BKK.	
05/08/2013	BKK	Review jury instructions and revise same.	1.0	\$ 295.00		
05/08/2013	BKK	Legal research re evidentiary issues.	1.2	\$ 354.00		
05/08/2013	BKK	With Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, and Leslie Ross re pretrial evidentiary issues.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	0.1	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	

05/08/2013	LAR	Review deposition exhibits and add additional trial exhibits to Plaintiffs' exhibit list.	1.9	\$ 380.00		
05/08/2013	LAR	Revise Plaintiffs' witness list on joint pretrial order in preparation for trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
05/08/2013	LAR	Review facts for final pretrial order.	6.0	\$ 1,200.00	Excessive.	
05/08/2013	CH	finish list for Sandra of Defendants' duplicate exhibits; finish redacting exhibits, add additional exhibits to list	3.7	\$ 462.50		
05/09/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re pattern or practice claim and deposition designations.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/09/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re jury verdict form re pattern or practice claims.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/09/2013	SRK	Review emails from Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re motion in limine re Robert Black.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/09/2013	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re damages and other relief for pattern or practice claim.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/09/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re jury verdict form for pattern or practice claim.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/09/2013	SRK	Review revised jury verdict form and edit draft voir dire questions.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
05/09/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re deposition designations and motion in limine re Robert Black.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/09/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re unfinished houses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
05/09/2013	SRK	Edit jury instructions.	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
05/09/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re jury instruction on vicarious liability and preparing responses to motions in limine..	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/09/2013	SRK	Review and edit draft motion in limine re excluding information re Robert Black's alleged legal right to the Cookes' home.	0.90	\$ 265.50		

05/09/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re motions in limine, changes to damages instruction, status of other jury instructions.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
05/09/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker with statute re searching license plates.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; not related to claims.
05/09/2013	SRK	Edit jury instructions.	3.80	\$ 1,121.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/9/2013 SRK.
05/09/2013	BKK	Revise voir dire and jury verdict form and jury instructions.	1.1	\$ 324.50	Duplicative of 5/6/2013 BKK, 5/7/2013 BKK & 5/8/2013 BKK.
05/09/2013	BKK	Review Order from Judge Campbell.	0.1	\$ 29.50	
05/09/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents re trial evidentiary issues.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Excessive, vague as to what reviewed.
05/09/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/2/2013 LAR, 5/3/2013 LAR, 5/4/2013 LAR, 5/5/2013 LAR & 5/7/2013 LAR.
05/09/2013	LAR	Review and revise witness list and issues of fact and law in preparation for trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00	
05/09/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re exhibit list; changes and additions to exhibits	3.0	\$ 375.00	Internal conference.
05/10/2013	SRK	Review emails from Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re pattern or practice claim.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
05/10/2013	SRK	Review and edit motions in limine from Bill Walker re David Darger, Jake Barlow and Jethro Barlow.	0.50	\$ 147.50	
05/10/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart, and Leslie Ross re jury verdict form, motions in limine, voir dire, Count 10 issues, and jury instructions.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.
05/10/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re demonstrative exhibits, expert testimony and exhibit list.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.

05/10/2013	SRK	Review and edit Bill Walker's motion in limine re expert witness Dan Rondeau.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/10/2013	SRK	Edit voir dire.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
05/10/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re motion in limine, jury verdict form, and Count 10 claims.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/10/2013	SRK	Review and edit jury instructions.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
05/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re plaintiffs' proposed voir dire.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/10/2013	SRK	Email communications with Jeff Matura re proposed voir dire.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/10/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' Joint Motion to seal motion in limine materials.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh, Bill Walker and Bill Richards re Defendants' Joint Motion to seal motion in limine materials.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/10/2013	SRK	Review reply from Bill Richards re motion to seal, and respond.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/10/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh with draft Statement of the Case, and edit same.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/10/2013	BKK	Revise jury instructions, voir dire and jury verdict forms.	0.5	\$ 147.50		
05/10/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re pretrial evidentiary issues.	4.7	\$ 1,386.50	Internal conference.	
05/10/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Internal conference; vague as to what discussed.	
05/10/2013	BKK	Draft stipulated statement of the case.	0.9	\$ 265.50		
05/10/2013	BKK	Legal research re trial evidentiary issues.	3.2	\$ 944.00	Vague as to issues.	

05/11/2013	SRK	Work on jury instructions, including edit jury instructions, insert instructions received from Bill Walker and Bill Richards, Draft email to Brad Keogh, Bill Walker, Ann Hobart, Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re vicarious liability instruction, Telephone call to Bill Walker re additional jury instructions.	5.20	\$ 1,534.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/12/2013	SRK	Edit jury instructions.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
05/12/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross with draft jury instructions.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/12/2013	SRK	Review draft stipulated facts and issues of fact and law.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
05/12/2013	SRK	Review draft statement of case.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/13/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re Research regarding Defendants' non jural entity claim.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/13/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re proposed jury instruction re 5th Amendment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/13/2013	SRK	Edit jury instructions to include 5th Amendment jury instruction.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/13/2013	SRK	Review emails from Leslie Ross re proposed stipulated facts and status of witness list.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/13/2013	SRK	Review and edit jury instructions re 5th amendment and joint and several liability, and Draft statement of jurisdiction.	3.60	\$ 1,062.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/13/2013	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow re UEP unfinished houses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
05/13/2013	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards re research for motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/13/2013	BKK	Revise jury instructions and joint pretrial order.	1.5	\$ 442.50		
05/13/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents and trial exhibits.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Vague.	
05/13/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Guy Timpson's deposition volume 2 in preparation for trial.	2.5	\$ 500.00		

05/13/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' proposed list of witnesses with paragraphs explaining expected testimony in joint pretrial order.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
05/13/2013	CH	prepare exhibits for exchange with Defendants - slip sheets, document review	2.5	\$ 312.50		
05/14/2013	SRK	Review court order re motions for summary judgment in preparation of issues of facts and law, and Draft issues of fact and law.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/14/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh re issues of fact and law, jury instructions, jury verdict form, and statement of the case.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/14/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re jury instructions and jury verdict form.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/14/2013	SRK	Edit jury instructions.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/14/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re duplicate exhibits and Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re same.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference; block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/14/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re revising jury verdict form, and finalize jury verdict form.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/14/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross and Ann Hobart re upcoming deadlines.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/14/2013	SRK	Edit Stipulated Statement of Case, and Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart re same.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/14/2013	SRK	Edit Contested Issues of Fact and Law, and Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart re same.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/14/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re pretrial evidentiary issues.	2.2	\$ 649.00	Internal conference; block billing.	
05/14/2013	BKK	Revise jury instructions, voir dire and jury verdict forms.	0.8	\$ 236.00		
05/14/2013	LAR	Review deposition designation for Carolyn Jessop's deposition in preparation for trial.	1.3	\$ 260.00	Excessive because it was not used at trial.	

05/14/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Ann Hobart regarding pretrial deadlines for Cooke.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
05/14/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designation for Michael Bradshaw's deposition in preparation for trial.	4.5	\$ 900.00	Excessive because it was not used at trial.	
05/14/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Kathryn Cox's deposition in preparation for trial.	1.8	\$ 360.00		
05/14/2013	CH	revise Defendant duplicate exhibit list; emails with Sandra Kane; emails with Stephanie Paine and t/c with Brad Keogh re UEP files	1.5	\$ 150.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/15/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Katie Cox in preparation for trial.	4.5	\$ 900.00	Duplicative of 5/14/2013 LAR.	
05/15/2013	LAR	Review contested issues of fact & law in joint pretrial order.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
05/15/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Deloy Bateman and Sam Johnson in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/15/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Sam Johnson in preparation for trial.	3.1	\$ 620.00		
05/15/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Margaret Cooke and Deloy Bateman in preparation for trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Block billing; excessive because it was not used at trial.	Objection overruled.
05/15/2013	CH	prepare exhibits	1.2	\$ 150.00		
05/15/2013	CH	review exhibits, update list; add cover sheets	2.2	\$ 275.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/16/2013	SRK	Review emails from Ann Hobart and Bill Walker re Issues of Fact and Law.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re deposition designations for law enforcement officers.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re deposition designations.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/16/2013	SRK	Review exhibits and Conference with Brad Keogh re exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re preparation of exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/16/2013	SRK	Edit Issues of Fact and Law.	4.50	\$ 1,327.50	Excessive; vague.	
05/16/2013	BKK	Review DOJ pleadings and FLDS documents.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	

05/16/2013	BKK	Revise joint pretrial order.	1.5	\$ 442.50		
05/16/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Sam Johnson in preparation for trial.	3.6	\$ 720.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/15/2013 LAR.	
05/16/2013	CH	prepare exhibits to exchange with opposing counsel	2.6	\$ 325.00		
05/17/2013	SRK	Work on witnesses list.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
05/17/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re demonstrative exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/17/2013	SRK	Meeting with Dennis Martin, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re preparation of demonstrative exhibits.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/17/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re pretrial preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/17/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re using ADOT map as demonstrative exhibit.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re use of demonstrative exhibits and depositions from other cases.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/17/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re mapping locations of water connections and unfinished houses for preparation of demonstrative exhibits.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
05/17/2013	BKK	Review contested issues of fact and law.	0.9	\$ 265.50		
05/17/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross and Dennis Martin re trial exhibit issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
05/17/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits.	0.7	\$ 206.50		
05/17/2013	LAR	Review issues of fact & law in joint pretrial order in preparation for trial.	1.2	\$ 240.00		
05/17/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Sam Johnson in preparation for trial.	1.2	\$ 240.00	Duplicative of 5/15/2013 LAR & 5/16/2013 LAR.	
05/17/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Jonathan Roundy in preparation for trial.	2.5	\$ 500.00		
05/17/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding demonstrative exhibits in preparation for trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference.	

05/17/2013	CH	prepare exhibits for exchange with opposing counsel	7.0	\$ 875.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/15/2013 LAR, 5/16/2013 LAR & 5/17/2013 LAR.
05/19/2013	SRK	Review Hildale defendants' motions in limine.	4.10	\$ 1,209.50	
05/19/2013	SRK	Edit issues of fact and law.	1.50	\$ 442.50	
05/19/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Sam Johnson in preparation for trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00	
05/20/2013	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow with maps of locations of water connections and unfinished UEP houses .	0.30	\$ 88.50	
05/20/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields re maps of locations of water connections and unfinished UEP houses .	0.10	\$ 29.50	
05/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re maps of locations of water connections and unfinished UEP houses .	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/20/2013	SRK	Email communications with Dennis Martin re preparing demonstrative exhibits of locations of water connections and unfinished UEP houses using maps.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
05/20/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re Defendants' revised exhibit list.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/20/2013	SRK	Draft reply to Jeff Matura re exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re designation of depositions for Terrill Johnson and Curtis Cooke.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
05/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re Defendants' revised exhibit list.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
05/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re maps from Jethro Barlow.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
05/20/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re Twin City Improvement Association.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
05/20/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re additional information re TCIA properties.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.

05/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re additional info re TCIA properties on Map.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/20/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re deadlines and scheduling team meeting.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re team meeting.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/20/2013	SRK	Review draft response to motion for sanctions from Legal Extern Shasta Inman, and Draft email to Shasta Inman re same.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/20/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Karen Nemence of Bill Richards' office re status of deposition designations, info on motion to seal exhibits, and responses to motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/20/2013	SRK	Review email from Jinjer Cooke re new FLDS business with water connection and other issues, and reply.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/20/2013	SRK	Edit contested issues of fact and law section.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
05/20/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross, Ann Hobart and law clerks Shasta Inman and Adrian Saenz re responses to Defendants' motions in limine, responses to motion for sanctions re Guy Timpson deposition, motion for summary judgment, and motion to seal privileged exhibits, exhibit deadline, and first draft of joint proposed pretrial statement.	2.30	\$ 678.50	Internal conference.	
05/20/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re deposition designations and responses to motions in limine assigned to him.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/20/2013	SRK	Review Colorado City's motion in limine No. 7 re Fred Barlow letter and decertification, and Draft email to Bill Richards re same.	1.10	\$ 324.50		

05/20/2013	SRK	Review draft response to Hildale motion in limine to exclude evidence re disability..	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/20/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross and Bill Walker re pretrial evidentiary issues.	6.0	\$ 1,770.00	Internal conference.	
05/20/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents re trial exhibits.	1.5	\$ 442.50		
05/20/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Sam Johnson in preparation for trial.	7.7	\$ 1,540.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/15/2013 LAR, 5/16/2013 LAR, 5/17/2013 LAR & 5/18/2013 LAR.	
05/20/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart re coordinating responses to Defendants' motions in limine, response to motion for sanctions, response to motion to seal privileged exhibits, exhibit deadline, and first draft of the joint proposed pretrial order.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference.	
05/20/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Robert Huddleston and Andrew Craddock in preparation for trial.	5.0	\$ 1,000.00	Excessive because it was not used at trial.	
05/20/2013	CH	prepare exhibits	7.2	\$ 900.00	Excessive; vague.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh to work on witness list.	4.50	\$ 1,327.50	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re status of deposition designations, responses to motions due this week, and status of exhibits.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Charlotte Haught and Leslie Ross re additional exhibits needed.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re additional exhibits needed.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Meeting with Dennis Martin, Leslie Ross, and Brad Keogh re new demonstrative exhibits.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	

05/21/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re water fixtures in triplexes and Jeffs' compound for demonstrative exhibit.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/21/2013	SRK	Calculate water fixtures from Jethro Barlow's information .	0.40	\$ 118.00		
05/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke re water fixtures in Cooke house.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re water fixtures calculation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re water fixtures calculation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/21/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re unidentified exhibits to Defendants' motion to seal privileged exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re identity of exhibits for motion to seal privileged exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura requesting list of deleted exhibits and non-pdf version of revised exhibit list.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/21/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re defendants' motion to seal exhibits and deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Leslie Ross re response to motion for sanctions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re water fixtures for demonstrative exhibit, and Draft email to Jinjer Cooke re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
05/21/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re demonstrative exhibit.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Draft reply to Bill Walker re demonstrative exhibit.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Dennis Martin re demonstrative exhibit re requested water usage chart.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/21/2013	SRK	Review depositions of Victor Jessop, Sam Johnson, and Terrill Johnson.	0.80	\$ 236.00		

05/21/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.
05/21/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits and witness lists.	2.3	\$ 678.50	
05/21/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Dennis Martin re trial exhibit issues.	3.2	\$ 944.00	Internal conference.
05/21/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Defendants' Joint Motion to Seal Privileged Motion in Limine Exhibits.	12.4	\$ 2,480.00	Excessive as to time.
05/21/2013	LAR	Prepare Andrew Craddock deposition designations in preparation for trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Excessive because it was not used at trial.
05/21/2013	CH	meet with Sandra and Leslie re exhibits	1.0	\$ 125.00	Internal conference.
05/21/2013	CH	exhibit prep	1.0	\$ 125.00	Vague.
05/21/2013	CH	exhibit preparation	4.0	\$ 500.00	Vague.
05/22/2013	SRK	Review emails and photos from Jinjer Cooke re new car dealership with water connection.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/22/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re new car dealership with water connection.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
05/22/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re additional demonstrative exhibit.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
05/22/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re legal analysis for response to motion to seal privileged exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
05/22/2013	SRK	Conference with law clerk Shasta Inman re authenticity of Guy Timpson deposition exhibit.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
05/22/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re deposition designations, exhibits, and discovery of new water connections.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
05/22/2013	SRK	Conference with Donna ChrisJohn re preparation of joint pretrial statement.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.

05/22/2013	SRK	Review videos and documents for addition to exhibit list, Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re same, and Draft email to Charlotte Haught re additional exhibits.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/22/2013	SRK	Review email from Jinjer Cooke re photos of new water connection at shop on Hainline property.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/22/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re new evidence of water connections at shop and car dealership.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/22/2013	SRK	Review emails from Jeff Matura re sealed exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/22/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re deposition designations for Nick Hanna.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/22/2013	SRK	Work on exhibits, including Review emails from Brad Keogh re additional exhibits, Draft email to Charlotte Haught re additional exhibits, Review emails from Jeff Matura re deleted exhibits and new exhibit list, Review emails from Jeff Matura's office with copies of motions and their proposed sealed exhibits.	1.80	\$ 531.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/22/2013	SRK	Continue to Review and edit witness list.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
05/22/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/22/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re additional information needed from Bill Walker re his deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/22/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/22/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

05/22/2013	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross, Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re deposition designations, and Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/22/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re exhibits received from Defendants via email re motion to seal.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
05/22/2013	SRK	Review deposition designations.	6.90	\$ 2,035.50	Vague.	
05/22/2013	BKK	Legal research re pre-trial order evidentiary issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00		
05/22/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits and FLDS documents.	2.0	\$ 590.00		
05/22/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Defendants' Joint Motion to Seal Privileged Motion in Limine Exhibits.	10.1	\$ 2,020.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/21/2013 LAR.	
05/22/2013	CH	prepare exhibits and lists	7.3	\$ 912.50	Vague.	
05/23/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re response to Defendants' motion to seal documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/23/2013	SRK	Conference call with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re response to Defendants' motion to seal documents.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/23/2013	SRK	Conference with Shasta Inman and Adrian Saenz re deposition designations.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/23/2013	SRK	Continue drafting witness list.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
05/23/2013	SRK	Review deposition designations from Bill Walker, and Draft emails to Bill Walker about deposition designations.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
05/23/2013	SRK	Review demonstrative exhibits prepared by Dennis Martin, request revisions, forward to paralegal and Bill Walker.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Objection overruled.
05/23/2013	SRK	Work on drafting Joint Pretrial Statement.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
05/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re status of deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

05/23/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re status of Defendants' exhibits and proposed final pretrial statement.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
05/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross and Ann Hobart re Draft Pretrial Order.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/23/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re litigation strategy issues.	2.4	\$ 708.00	Internal conference.	
05/23/2013	BKK	Review motions in limine and trial exhibits.	0.9	\$ 265.50		
05/23/2013	BKK	Revise deposition designations.	2.7	\$ 796.50	Vague.	
05/23/2013	LAR	Conference with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding Defendants' motion to seal documents.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Internal conference.	
05/23/2013	CH	work on exhibit list	3.0	\$ 375.00		
05/23/2013	CH	burn CD's of exhibits; update exhibit list; prepare new additional exhibits	2.0	\$ 250.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/23/2013	CH	email; time	1.0	\$ 125.00	Vague.	
05/24/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re arguments for response to Defendants' Motion to Seal Privileged Exhibits to Motions in Limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/24/2013	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re status of preparing exhibits to exchange with Defendants and inserts to Plaintiffs' Draft Joint Proposed Pretrial Order..	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
05/24/2013	SRK	Research re motion to seal, Review Leslie Ross' draft response to motion to seal, and work with Leslie Ross re edits to Response to Motion to Seal Privileged Motion in Limine Exhibits.	8.00	\$ 2,360.00	Block billing; Internal conference; excessive.	Objection overruled.
05/24/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and law clerks Shasta Inman and Adrian Saenz re status of pretrial deadlines, preparation of Joint pretrial statement and witness list.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	

05/24/2013	SRK	Review and edit response to Defendants' Motion for Sanctions re Guy Timpson deposition.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
05/24/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Blake Hamilton's office re overnight delivery of exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/24/2013	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re overnight delivery of exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/24/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Matura re delivery of exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/24/2013	SRK	Review and edit Plaintiffs' Draft Proposed Joint Pretrial Statement.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/24/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with Plaintiffs' Draft Joint Proposed Pretrial Statement, and Draft email to Bill Walker with pdf version of same.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/24/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, and Leslie Ross re evidentiary issues.	1.2	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
05/24/2013	BKK	Revise deposition designations.	1.3	\$ 383.50	Vague.	
05/24/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane to review and revise Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Defendants' Joint Motion to Seal Privileged Motion in Limine Exhibits.	8.0	\$ 1,600.00	Internal conference.	
05/24/2013	CH	update to exhibit list; burn CD's of exhibits; edits to pretrial order	5.0	\$ 500.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
05/27/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' Motions in Limine, and status of responses to Defendants' Motions in Limine.	8.70	\$ 2,566.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/28/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re status of responses to motions in limine and deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/28/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re findings of fact and conclusions of law, counter deposition designations, objections to deposition designations, and motions in limine.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

05/28/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re deposition designations.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/28/2013	SRK	Review emails from Brad Keogh re impeachment witnesses and coordination of pretrial assignments.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/28/2013	SRK	Conference with Shasta Inman re responses to motions in limine re legislation, Guy Timpson deposition, and disability issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/28/2013	SRK	Meeting with Adrian Saenz re responses to motions in limine re grand jury and the Cookes' son, GLM.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/28/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh re deposition designations, objections to depositions, counter deposition designations, and responses to motions in limine.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
05/28/2013	SRK	Review deposition designations of Deloy Bateman, Steven Bateman, Michael Bradshaw and Alma Cawley.	7.50	\$ 2,212.50	Excessive because it was not used at trial; block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/28/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura with plaintiffs' draft joint pretrial statement.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/28/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker re conference call, and Review reply from Jeff Matura.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/28/2013	SRK	Meeting with Charlotte Haught re deposition designations and exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/28/2013	BKK	Review responses to motions in limine.	0.8	\$ 236.00		
05/28/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	2.7	\$ 796.50	Internal conference.	
05/28/2013	BKK	Revise deposition designations.	3.8	\$ 1,121.00	Vague.	
05/28/2013	LAR	Research in preparation for drafting Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion in Limine to Limit Testimony or Evidence of the Utah and Arizona POST investigations.	3.4	\$ 680.00		

05/28/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Curtis Cooke in preparation for trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Excessive because it was not used at trial.	
05/28/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Hyrum and Jonathan Roundy in preparation for trial.	5.0	\$ 1,000.00	Excessive because it was not used at trial.	
05/28/2013	CH	meeting with Sandra Kane re deposition designations; download Deft exhibits to I drive; begin preparing list for Deft of deposition designations	3.5	\$ 350.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
05/29/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/29/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re status of deposition designations and responses to motions in limine.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/29/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Jeff Matura re pretrial statement.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
05/29/2013	SRK	Review deposition designations of Andrew Chatwin's depositions.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Excessive because it was not used at trial.	
05/29/2013	SRK	Research re admissibility of FLDS training document used in depositions of Helaman Barlow and Sam Johnson.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
05/29/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re motion in limine re Holm v. Jeffs case.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/29/2013	SRK	Review motion in limine re Holm v. Jeffs case.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
05/29/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re motion in limine re Holm v. Jeffs case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/29/2013	SRK	Research re exhibits re Holm v. Jeffs case.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
05/29/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re response to motion in limine re Holm v. Jeffs case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/29/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re responses to motions in limine.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	

05/29/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re responses to motions in limine, and Draft emails to Bill Richards with interrogatory answers, depositions and exhibits needed to respond to motions in limine.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.
05/29/2013	SRK	Review file for Judge Lindberg's preliminary injunction in Holm v. Jeffs.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
05/29/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re preliminary injunction.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
05/29/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Brad Keogh re exhibit.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
05/29/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re exhibit.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
05/29/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re additional exhibit.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/29/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re Plaintiffs' First Set of Deposition Designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/29/2013	SRK	Review transcript of Jeremiah Barlow's deposition for deposition designations.	1.00	\$ 295.00	
05/29/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re response to motions in limine.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
05/29/2013	SRK	Review and edit draft response to Hildale's Motion in Limine re Guy Timpson's Deposition and exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
05/29/2013	BKK	Telephone conferences with Sandra Kane and David Weinzweig re evidentiary issues.	0.8	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.
05/29/2013	BKK	Revise deposition designations.	5.9	\$ 1,740.50	Excessive; vague.
05/29/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits.	1.8	\$ 531.00	
05/29/2013	LAR	Research in preparation for drafting Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion in Limine to Limit Testimony or Evidence of the Utah and Arizona POST investigations.	9.6	\$ 1,920.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/28/2013 LAR.
05/29/2013	LAR	Review Bill Richards's outlines for motion in limine responses.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.

05/29/2013	CH	deposition designations	0.4	\$ 50.00	Vague.	
05/29/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra re exhibit list; try to recover MAIN exhibit list, prepare new exhibit, update lists; prepare final list of depo designations for today	1.0	\$ 125.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Objection overruled.
05/29/2013	CH	deposition designations	0.3	\$ 37.50	Vague.	
05/29/2013	CH	deposition designations	0.5	\$ 62.50	Vague.	
05/29/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra re depo designations	0.1	\$ 12.50	Internal conference.	
05/30/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Shasta Inman re responses to motions in limine.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/30/2013	SRK	Review Hildale's motion in limine to exclude Guy Timpson's deposition and exhibits and Draft response.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
05/30/2013	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Brad Keogh re arguments for response to motions in limine.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
05/30/2013	SRK	Conference with Shasta Inman re revisions to draft response to motion in limine re Guy Timpson's deposition and exhibits.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/30/2013	SRK	Conference with Adrian Saenz and Shasta Inman re Research re premature motion in limine and improper use of motions in limine.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re response to motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/30/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re issue to include in response to motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/30/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits and motions in limine.	1.9	\$ 560.50		
05/30/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane re litigation strategies.	3.1	\$ 914.50	Internal conference.	
05/30/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion in Limine to Limit Testimony or Evidence of the Utah and Arizona POST investigations.	4.3	\$ 860.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/28/2013 LAR & 5/29/2013 LAR.	

05/30/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend conference with Sandra Kane and Shasta Inman (law clerk) re responses to Defendants' motions in limine.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Internal conference.
05/30/2013	LAR	Research in preparation for revising Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion in Limine to Limit Testimony or Evidence of the Utah and Arizona POST investigations.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/28/2013 LAR, 5/29/2013 LAR & 5/30/2013 LAR.
05/31/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re response to motion in limine re AZ POST and Review outline of response from Leslie Ross.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
05/31/2013	SRK	Review Research from Shasta Inman re scope of motion in limine.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
05/31/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re Research re motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
05/31/2013	SRK	Review Bill Richards' draft response to Motion in Limine No. 1.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
05/31/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richard re response to Motion in Limine No. 1.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
05/31/2013	SRK	Review Colorado City's motion to dismiss Count 10.	0.50	\$ 147.50	
05/31/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Colorado City's motion to dismiss Count 10 .	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
05/31/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re exhibits and deposition designations, and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/31/2013	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re overlapping and duplicate deposition designations, draft combined joint pretrial statement,.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
05/31/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re exhibits and deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
05/31/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh, Bill Richards and Bill Walker re hearsay exceptions re city official letters to Warren Jeffs.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
05/31/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re hearsay exceptions re city official letters to Warren Jeffs.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.

05/31/2013	SRK	Review deposition designations for Andrew Craddock, Marion Timpson, Peggy Taylor and Craig Neeley, and forward to Charlotte Haught.	1.60	\$ 472.00	Block billing; excessive because it was not used at trial.	Objection overruled.
05/31/2013	SRK	Review email from Rachel Ruthenberg and correct deposition designations.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
05/31/2013	SRK	Conference with Adrian Saenz re motion in limine re GLM's damages and Research re motions in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/31/2013	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re preparation of conclusions of law.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/31/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re response to motion in limine.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/31/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re motion in limine and Review reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/31/2013	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re first draft combined final pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/31/2013	SRK	Review and edit draft responses to motions in limine re GLM's damages, AZ POST investigations, Guy Timpson's deposition, and disability..	4.80	\$ 1,416.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
05/31/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Leslie Ross re pre-trial issues.	2.7	\$ 796.50	Internal conference.	
05/31/2013	BKK	Review motions in limine and responses thereto.	1.6	\$ 472.00		
05/31/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re Joint pretrial order	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
05/31/2013	CH	deliver Def Exh discs to Donna; additions to Joint Pretrial statement	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
05/31/2013	CH	edits to joint pretrial order; deposition designations	3.0	\$ 375.00		
06/01/2013	SRK	Review and edit draft responses to motions in limine from Bill Walker re Holms v. Jeffs and evidence of religion, and from Bill Richards re polygamy, Joseph Allred's letters, communications with clergy,.	6.50	\$ 1,917.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.

06/02/2013	LAR	Revise Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion in Limine to Limit Testimony or Evidence of the Utah and Arizona POST investigations.	9.5	\$ 1,900.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/28/2013 LAR, 5/29/2013 LAR & 5/30/2013 LAR.	
06/03/2013	SRK	Draft revised response to motion in limine re G.L.M.'s damages and Review and edit responses to Defendants' motions in limine; Conference with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross and Bill Walker re responses..	13.50	\$ 3,186.00	Excessive; block billing; Internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
06/03/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Bill Richards re litigation strategy issues.	3.3	\$ 973.50	Internal conference.	
06/03/2013	BKK	Revise responses to motions in limine.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Duplicative of 5/31/2013 BKK.	
06/03/2013	BKK	Legal research re evidentiary issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Vague.	
06/03/2013	BKK	Review deposition designations.	1.2	\$ 354.00	Vague.	
06/03/2013	LAR	Revise Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion in Limine to Limit Testimony or Evidence of the Utah and Arizona POST investigations.	2.5	\$ 500.00	Excessive; duplicative of 5/28/2013 LAR, 5/29/2013 LAR, 5/30/2013 LAR & 6/2/2013 LAR.	
06/03/2013	LAR	Review Brad Keogh's revisions to Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion in Limine to Limit Testimony or Evidence of the Utah and Arizona POST investigations.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Excessive review of work.	
06/03/2013	LAR	Revise Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion in Limine to Limit Testimony or Evidence of the Utah and Arizona POST investigations.	5.2	\$ 1,040.00	Excessive time.	
06/03/2013	CH	update to Joint PT Order	0.2	\$ 25.00		

06/04/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Defendants' response to Plaintiffs' motion in limine re testimony of David Darger and Jacob Barlow, Research in preparation for response to Defendants' motion to withdraw Darger's invocation of 5th amendment, and coordination re completion of tasks for pretrial order.	1.50	\$ 354.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Objection overruled.
06/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker's Asst. re status of deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/04/2013	SRK	Review deposition designations for 13 witnesses and Draft email to Charlotte Haught for transmittal to Defendants.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/04/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re Defendants' revisions to Statement of Case, compare drafts, and Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Statement of Case.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/04/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re legal research re Defendants' effort to recant 5th amendment and avoid mention of assertion of 5th at trial, discuss response to Defendants' version of Statement of Case.	1.70	\$ 501.50	Internal conference.	
06/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to James Schoppmann re Darger sentencing records, Review response from James Schoppmann, Draft reply.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/04/2013	SRK	Work on deposition designations.	8.00	\$ 2,360.00	Vague.	
06/04/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Charlotte Haught re deposition designations.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/04/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Bill Walker re deposition designations.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/04/2013	SRK	Review email and attached edits to pretrial statement from Jeff Matura , and Draft email to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re same..	0.50	\$ 147.50		

06/04/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re in limine issues.	2.8	\$ 826.00	Internal conference.	
06/04/2013	BKK	Revise responses to motions in limine.	5.5	\$ 1,622.50	Excessive; vague.	
06/04/2013	BKK	Legal research re evidentiary issues.	0.7	\$ 206.50	Vague.	
06/04/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents and trial exhibits.	0.5	\$ 147.50		
06/04/2013	LAR	Research required oath of office for Arizona and Utah police officers for Plaintiffs' Joint Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion in Limine to Limit Testimony or Evidence of the Utah and Arizona POST investigations and in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
06/04/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding Defendants' Responses to Plaintiffs' and Plaintiff-Intervenor's motions in limine regarding David Darger and Jacob Barlow's testimonies.	1.8	\$ 360.00	Internal conference.	
06/04/2013	CH	prepare deposition designations	1.0	\$ 125.00	Vague.	
06/05/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' exhibits with Brad Keogh for objections.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00	Internal conference.	
06/05/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re conference call with JA re Colorado City motion to withdraw Darger plea of 5th Amendment.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/05/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re conference call with JA re Colorado City motion to withdraw Darger plea of 5th Amendment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/05/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re conference call with JA.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/05/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re comments on Defendants' draft of Stipulated Statement of Case.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
06/05/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re additional deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

06/05/2013	SRK	Review additional Defendant exhibits with Brad Keogh for objections.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	
06/05/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re deposition designation status.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/05/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re legal arguments in preparation for conference call with JA.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/05/2013	SRK	Review deposition designations for Guy Timpson's deposition..	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/05/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re pretrial issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	
06/05/2013	BKK	Revise joint pretrial statement.	5.7	\$ 1,681.50	Excessive; vague.	
06/05/2013	BKK	Draft objections to defendants' trial exhibits.	1.8	\$ 531.00		
06/05/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding status of pretrial documents.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
06/05/2013	CH	cut and paste deposition designations to the 3 lists	1.8	\$ 225.00	Excessive; clerical work.	
06/05/2013	CH	deposition designations - update lists	0.6	\$ 75.00	Vague.	
06/06/2013	SRK	Review and edit Plaintiffs' affirmative deposition designations.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/06/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re extension of joint proposed pretrial order deadline.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re extension of joint proposed pretrial order deadline.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/06/2013	SRK	Review emails from Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker re extension of joint proposed pretrial order deadline.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/06/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re extension of joint proposed pretrial order deadline.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/06/2013	SRK	Draft reply to Jeff Matura re extension of joint proposed pretrial order deadline.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

06/06/2013	SRK	Conference with Law Clerk Shasta Inman and Brad Keogh re Research re withdrawal of 5th Amendment and impeachment with assertion of 5th Amendment in preparation for hearing with Judge Teilborg's JA.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
06/06/2013	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Bill Walker, Blake Hamilton re preparation of pretrial statement.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/06/2013	SRK	Attend telephonic conference call with Judge Teilborg's JA and other counsel re requested withdrawal of 5th Amendment assertion by Darger.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
06/06/2013	SRK	Review order re hearing on discovery issue re withdrawal of 5th Amendment.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re conference call and preparation for hearing.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Judge Teilborg's JA re deposition designation procedure.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/06/2013	SRK	Review summaries of administrative interviews of David Darger and Conference with Adrian Saenz re same.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
06/06/2013	SRK	Review and edit affirmative deposition designations for Plaintiffs' witnesses.	8.00	\$ 2,360.00		
06/06/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Bill Walker re questions on his deposition designations.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/06/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught with additional deposition designations.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/06/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re pretrial issues.	3.3	\$ 973.50	Internal conference.	
06/06/2013	BKK	Conference call with judicial assistant re Fifth Amendment issues.	0.1	\$ 29.50		
06/06/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits.	1.6	\$ 472.00	Vague.	
06/06/2013	CH	update lists with depo designations	1.0	\$ 125.00	Vague.	

06/06/2013	CH	create joint master witness list; update depo designation lists; emails with Rachel at Jeff Matura office re deposition issues; telephone calls with Sandra re depositions and witness lists	4.5	\$ 562.50	Block billing; excessive.	Objection overruled.
06/07/2013	SRK	Review and edit deposition designation for Hyrum Roundy.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Excessive because it was not used at trial.	
06/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re pretrial order issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re strategy re exhibit objections and deposition designation questions.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
06/07/2013	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton with revised draft of Stipulated Statement of Case.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/07/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re revised draft of Stipulated Statement of Case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/07/2013	SRK	Review emails from Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re revised draft of Stipulated Statement of Case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/07/2013	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re Stipulated Statement of Case.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/07/2013	SRK	Review and edit Curtis Cooke Deposition Designation.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Excessive because it was not used at trial.	
06/07/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' proposed Issues of Facts and Law and Witnesses.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
06/07/2013	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re coordination re pretrial order, and deposition designations, objections and counter-designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/07/2013	SRK	Conference with Adrian Saenz re deposition counter-designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/07/2013	SRK	Review Order granting extension to pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/07/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re deposition counter-designations and other preparation for pretrial order.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/07/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with revised pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

06/07/2013	SRK	Work on deposition designations.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Vague.	
06/07/2013	BKK	Draft deposition designations.	7.5	\$ 2,212.50	Excessive; vague.	
06/07/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re deposition issues.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
06/07/2013	CH	deposition designations; telephone call and emails with Rachel, Sandra, Donna, updates to Joint Pretrial Order; update Voir Dire with witness names; finalize Statement of Case	3.5	\$ 350.00	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
06/07/2013	CH	deposition designations; edits to Joint Pretrial Order	2.6	\$ 260.00	Block billing; vague.	Reduced by 20%.
06/09/2013	SRK	Review and edit deposition designations for Hyrum Roundy, Isaac Wyler, Seth Cooke, and Victor Jessop.	5.10	\$ 1,504.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/09/2013	SRK	Draft mails to Bill Walker re Seth Cooke and Victor Jessop deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/09/2013	SRK	Draft email to Donna ChrisJohn re additional deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/09/2013	SRK	Draft email to schedule meeting re deposition counter-designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re meeting re deposition counter-designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Leslie Ross, Shasta Inman, Adrian Saenz, and Donna ChrisJohn re deposition counter -designations and remaining preparation for pretrial statement.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re defendants TCP, HCC Utilities, and TCWA.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re defendants TCP, HCC Utilities, and TCWA.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re defendants TCP, HCC Utilities, and TCWA.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	

06/10/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re preparation of trial memos re injunctive relief and civil penalties.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Elizabeth and Chris Brancart re preparation of trial memos.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Review reply from Elizabeth Brancart re preparation of trial memos.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re preparation of trial memos.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Review court order scheduling final pretrial conference, Conference with Ann Hobart re trial memo requirements, and Draft email to Elizabeth Brancart with more detail re trial memos.	0.40	\$ 94.40	Block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
06/10/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Darger sentencing and opposition to Darger withdrawal of 5th Amendment invocation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re deposition counter -designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Review revised deposition designations from Bill Walker for Victor Jessop.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re deposition designations for Seth Cooke.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	SRK	Review and edit deposition designations for Victor Jessop, Seth Cooke and Terrill Johnson.	3.00	\$ 885.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/10/2013	SRK	Research and Draft Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment re HCC Utilities.	8.30	\$ 2,448.50		
06/10/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross evidentiary issues.	1.1	\$ 324.50	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	BKK	Draft deposition designations.	2.4	\$ 708.00	Vague.	
06/10/2013	LAR	Prepare counter deposition designations for Robert Black in preparation for trial.	2.5	\$ 500.00		

06/10/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, Shasta Inman, Adrian Saenz, and Donna Chrisjohn re counter designations and documents for final pretrial order.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Internal conference.	
06/10/2013	LAR	Prepare deposition designations for Terrell Johnson in preparation for trial.	2.5	\$ 500.00	Excessive because it was not used at trial.	
06/11/2013	SRK	Review email from Donna ChrisJohn re questions about deposition designations for Bruce Wisan and resolve questions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/11/2013	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re trial briefs on injunctive relief and statutory civil penalties.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Elizabeth Brancart re preparation of trial briefs re injunctive relief and statutory civil penalties.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
06/11/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with Plaintiffs' 6/11/13 deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/11/2013	SRK	Review and edit draft brief re opposition to withdrawal of David Darger's invocation of the 5th Amendment.	1.90	\$ 560.50		
06/11/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re arguments re withdrawal of David Darger's invocation of 5th Amendment and impeachment exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/11/2013	SRK	Work on Plaintiffs' objections to Defendants' exhibits.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/11/2013	SRK	Conference with Shasta Inman re deposition counter-designations.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
06/11/2013	SRK	Conference with Adrian Saenz re file organization.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/11/2013	SRK	Review LT court re documents delivered pursuant to court order.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/11/2013	SRK	Review Brad Keogh's edits to brief re withdrawal of 5th Amendment invocation by David Darger, and Draft email to Brad Keogh re same..	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	

06/11/2013	BKK	Review summary judgment pleadings.	0.9	\$ 265.50		
06/11/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re pre-trial statement issues.	3.6	\$ 1,062.00	Internal conference.	
06/12/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross and Donna ChrisJohn to coordinate remaining tasks for preparation of final pretrial order.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
06/12/2013	SRK	Review and edit draft response to motion to withdraw Darger's invocation of 5th amendment.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
06/12/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re status of counter-designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/12/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re comments on draft response re motion to withdraw Darger's invocation of 5th amendment.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/12/2013	SRK	Review and edit draft response to motion to withdraw Darger's invocation of 5th amendment.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
06/12/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' comments on jury instructions.	4.80	\$ 1,416.00		
06/12/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re pretrial issues.	0.7	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
06/12/2013	BKK	Revise deposition designations.	0.3	\$ 88.50		
06/12/2013	LAR	Prepare Craig Neeley's deposition designations for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
06/12/2013	LAR	Prepare Brian Zitting's designations in preparation for trial.	6.5	\$ 1,300.00		
06/12/2013	LAR	Prepare Bruce Wisan's deposition designations in preparation for trial.	3.5	\$ 700.00		
06/13/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re assignment re deposition counter-designations for pretrial order.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re preparation of pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re deposition designations and preparation of pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re jury instructions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

06/13/2013	SRK	Transmit emails to Leslie Ross for all of Plaintiffs' deposition counter-designations.	2.80	\$ 826.00	Internal conference.
06/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re counter-designation re Robert Foster.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
06/13/2013	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart re guidance on trial memo, Conference with Ann Hobart re same, Draft reply to Elizabeth Brancart.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
06/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Matura re logistical problems re conversion of pretrial orders to Word Perfect.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
06/13/2013	SRK	Review email from Karen McElroy re use of Word for filing pretrial order, and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
06/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Defendants' revisions to jury instructions.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.
06/13/2013	SRK	Review draft trial brief from Elizabeth Brancart re civil penalty and Conference with Ann Hobart re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
06/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re trial brief re civil penalties.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
06/13/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re potential documents for impeachment envelope, reply to Brad Keogh, and Draft email to Charlotte Haught re same.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
06/13/2013	SRK	Work on pretrial order with Leslie Ross re objections to witnesses, statement of objections to deposition designations, additional issue of law, counter-designations for depositions, and questions re objections to exhibits.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.
06/13/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re revised issue of law and status of pretrial order.	0.30	\$ 88.50	

06/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re Research re objection to proposed jury instruction re religious affiliation and Draft email to Bill Richards re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re status of Research re religious affiliation jury instruction.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/13/2013	SRK	Research re religious affiliation jury instruction and Draft email to Bill Richards re same.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
06/13/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re jury instruction issues.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
06/13/2013	BKK	Revise jury instructions.	0.5	\$ 147.50		
06/13/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding delegation of tasks for counter-designations in preparation for trial.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
06/13/2013	LAR	Work with Sandra Kane on objections to Proposed Final Pretrial Order, including objections to witnesses, objections to deposition designations, additional issue of law, and objections to exhibits.	1.3	\$ 260.00	Internal conference.	
06/13/2013	LAR	Review emails from Bill Walker and revise Plaintiffs' proposed counter-designations to include Bill Walker's edits for Laverne Fischer, Victor Jessop, David Zitting, and Zach Renstrom into the proposed Final Pretrial Order.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
06/13/2013	LAR	Review emails from Sandra Kane regarding counter designations for Steven Bateman, Michael Bradshaw, and Alma Cawley and revise Plaintiffs' proposed counter-designations in proposed Final Pretrial Order.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Objection overruled.

06/13/2013	LAR	Review Sandra Kane's email regarding objections to administrative interviews listed by Defendants as exhibits, objection to Fred Barlow as a witness, and counter-designations for Jeremiah Barlow and Steven Dark, and revise to include objections and counter-designations to proposed Final Pretrial Order.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Objection overruled.
06/13/2013	LAR	Review Sandra Kane's email about additional legal issue for contested issues of law section of proposed Final Pretrial Order and revise final pretrial order with same.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Objection overruled.
06/13/2013	LAR	Review Sandra Kane's forward email from Adrian Saenz for counter-designations for Margaret Cooke, Travis Fox, Richard Holm, Sam Johnson, George Morales, Matthew Musser, and Don Timpson and revise final pretrial order to include same.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Objection overruled.
06/13/2013	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane regarding Deloy Bateman's counter-designations, and revise Final Pretrial Order accordingly.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Objection overruled.
06/13/2013	LAR	Review Bill Richards's email regarding counter-designations for Robert Foster's deposition and objections to Defendants' designations and revise Final Pretrial Order accordingly.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Objection overruled.
06/13/2013	LAR	Review Shasta Inman's email regarding counter-designations for Stephen Noel and revise Final Pretrial Order accordingly.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Objection overruled.
06/13/2013	LAR	Review Shasta Inman's email regarding corrections to Craig Neeley and Joseph Young's counter-designations and revise Final Pretrial Order accordingly.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Block billing; Internal conference.	Objection overruled.

06/13/2013	LAR	Review Defendants' deposition designations for Scott Jessop, Craig Neeley, Matthew Musser, Bruce Wisan, and Carolyn Jessop.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/13/2013	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane about incorrect citations from Defendants' deposition designations proposed for Final Pretrial Order.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards with revised objection and alternate jury instruction re religious affiliation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Draft reply to Bill Richards re revised objection and alternate jury instruction re religious affiliation.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Draft email to Adrian Saenz re Research re religious affiliation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re GLM's damages, and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart with draft trial brief re injunctive relief, and reply re additional components to include.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re checklist and questions re preparation for filing draft proposed joint pretrial order.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Draft revised jury instructions.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00	Vague.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Review emails from Blake Hamilton re draft joint pretrial order, voir dire, possible dismissal of certain defendants.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
06/14/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh with edits to trial memo on civil penalties, and reply.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re defendants' voir dire revisions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re defendants' voir dire revisions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re revisions to voir dire and new draft.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	

06/14/2013	SRK	Review legal memo from law clerk Adrian Saenz re religious affiliation research.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re status of revised voir dire and jury instructions.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
06/14/2013	SRK	Work on stipulations re exhibits for pretrial order, Telephone call to Brad Keogh re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
06/14/2013	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton with Plaintiffs' Draft Pretrial Order.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/14/2013	SRK	Continue to work on revision to draft jury instructions.	4.50	\$ 1,327.50		
06/14/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re trial brief issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	BKK	Draft Trial Brief re civil penalties.	1.0	\$ 295.00		
06/14/2013	BKK	Revise voir dire questions.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Vague.	
06/14/2013	LAR	Review email from Bill Richards regarding objection to Defendants' proposed jury instruction on religious affiliation and alternative instruction on same.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	LAR	Review email from Bill Walker re Bruce Wisan and William Greenslade's counter-designations, and add counter-designations to Proposed Final Pretrial Order.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	LAR	Review email from Blake Hamilton re response to legal issue number 2 included in the proposed final pretrial order and revised proposed final pretrial order to add same.	0.4	\$ 80.00		
06/14/2013	LAR	Review email from Rachel Ruthenberg about changed to Defendants' deposition designations.	0.1	\$ 20.00		
06/14/2013	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane with Defendants' proposed jury verdict forms and make corrections to same.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	LAR	Review Defendants' proposed verdict forms.	0.4	\$ 80.00		

06/14/2013	LAR	Review email from Bill Richards with revised objection to Defendants' proposed jury instruction on religious affiliation and revised alternative instruction on same.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	LAR	Review email from Blake Hamilton with Defendants' proposed voir dire.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
06/14/2013	LAR	Review email from Brad Keogh regarding proposed objections to Defendants' proposed voir dire.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane re revisions to proposed voir dire.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	LAR	Review Bill Walker's email re response to Defendants' proposed voir dire.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
06/14/2013	LAR	Revise proposed pretrial order and incorporate Defendants' voir dire into proposed voir dire pleading.	4.0	\$ 800.00		
06/14/2013	LAR	Revise proposed final pretrial order to include Defendants' objections to Plaintiffs' exhibits and counter-designations, as well as separate Plaintiffs' witness list into shall, may, and unlikely categories.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Duplicative of prior entry.	
06/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re procedure for jury instruction revision.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/15/2013	SRK	Compare Defendants' revisions to Plaintiffs' proposed jury instructions and prepare chart re Defendants' revisions to Plaintiffs' jury instructions.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
06/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re preparation of revised jury instruction.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
06/15/2013	SRK	Review revised draft of proposed voir dire.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
06/15/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re case law re defendants' predominant factor jury instruction and Research re pretext.	0.90	\$ 265.50	Internal conference.	
06/15/2013	SRK	Draft revisions to jury instructions.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		

06/15/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re revised jury instructions.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/15/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re jury instruction.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re jury instruction and voir dire.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/15/2013	SRK	Review and edit revised voir dire prepared by Leslie Ross and incorporate additional objections, and Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with draft revised voir dire.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
06/16/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' draft of final joint pretrial order, and draft combined final joint proposed pretrial order.	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
06/16/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' draft joint proposed final pretrial order.	3.00	\$ 885.00		
06/17/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Leslie Ross and Brad Keogh re exhibits in pretrial order.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/17/2013	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re pretrial order and related issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/17/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re conference call and Draft pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/17/2013	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Brad Keogh re pretrial order.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
06/17/2013	SRK	Work on, coordinate, and file pretrial order, voir dire, statement of case, verdict form, findings of fact and conclusions of law, trial memos on injunctive relief and civil penalties.	13.00	\$ 3,835.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/17/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re pretrial issues.	4.0	\$ 1,180.00	Internal conference.	
06/17/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with defense counsel.	0.2	\$ 59.00		
06/17/2013	BKK	Revise voir dire and jury instructions.	4.3	\$ 1,268.50	Vague.	

06/17/2013	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane re questions and issues about the proposed final pretrial order and respond.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
06/17/2013	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane with attachment of proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
06/17/2013	LAR	Review email from Jeff Matura with attached proposed voir dire.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
06/17/2013	LAR	Review and revise Proposed Final Pretrial Order, voir dire, statement of the case, and verdict forms.	6.3	\$ 1,260.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
06/17/2013	CH	call Judge Teilborg's JA with various questions related to the Pretrial order; various emails and telephone calls with Leslie, Sandra and Donna; prepare a separate Witness List; fix formatting problems with documents	2.0	\$ 200.00	Block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
06/17/2013	CH	conference call with Sandra, Leslie and Donna	0.8	\$ 100.00	Vague; internal conference.	
06/18/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Donna ChrisJohn re discovery of exhibits deleted from final proposed pretrial order, Review final pretrial order re deleted exhibits, Telephone call to Bill Walker re exhibits deleted from final proposed pretrial order, Telephone call to Ann Hobart re same , and Telephone call to Judge Teilborg's JA re procedure re amendment of final pretrial order.	1.10	\$ 259.60	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
06/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker re deleted exhibits and amendment of final pretrial order , and Draft email to Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker re information needed to amend final pretrial order.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

06/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker in preparation for hearing re Colorado City Motion to Withdraw David Darger's Invocation of Fifth Amendment, Etc..	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/18/2013	SRK	Attend hearing on Colorado City Motion to Withdraw David Darger's Invocation of Fifth Amendment, Etc..	1.00	\$ 295.00		
06/18/2013	SRK	Review emails from Blake Hamilton re proposed stipulation to amend pretrial order and previous drafts of pretrial order.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/18/2013	SRK	Draft Stipulation to Amend Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/18/2013	SRK	Review Amended Proposed Final Pretrial Order.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
06/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Leslie Ross re Amended Proposed Final Pretrial Order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/18/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend hearing on motion to withdraw Fifth Amendment invocation.	3.2	\$ 944.00	Excessive because did not participate in the hearing.	
06/18/2013	BKK	Draft memorandum re Fifth Amendment issues.	1.8	\$ 531.00		
06/18/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re pretrial statement issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
06/18/2013	LAR	Review filed proposed pretrial order for errors; observed 22 exhibits deleted from proposed final pretrial order, and determined which exhibits were missing and where the error occurred.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
06/18/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Donna Chrisjohn regarding deleted exhibits.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	

06/18/2013	LAR	Review Blake Hamilton's email in response to Sandra Kane's email requesting Defendants' stipulation to amend the final pretrial order to correct errors regarding exhibits, and review pleadings discussed in email.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
06/18/2013	LAR	Revise amended final pretrial order to include missing exhibits and related objections.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
06/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re status of filing stipulation to amend pretrial order, strategy re adverse instruction re 5th Amendment, final pretrial hearing, and trial preparation.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
06/19/2013	SRK	Review amended proposed final pretrial order.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/19/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re stipulation to amend pretrial order.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/19/2013	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re approval of stipulation to amend pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/19/2013	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Blake Hamilton with stipulation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Matura re status of stipulation.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/19/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re stipulation.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/19/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re final pretrial hearing.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/19/2013	SRK	Draft proposed order re stipulation for leave to amend final pretrial order.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/19/2013	SRK	E-file stipulation, proposed amended final pretrial order, and proposed order.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Clerical.	
06/19/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re pre-trial issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	

06/19/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh regarding preparation for final pretrial conference.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
06/20/2013	LAR	Review Colorado City's Motion to Dismiss Count Ten of the Joint Second Amended Complaint Due to Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction to determine whether arguments are substantive or procedural.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
06/20/2013	LAR	Review Hildale's Motion in Limine Regarding Admission of Statements of Disability with related Response, Reply, and exhibits.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
06/20/2013	LAR	Review Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude Any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims and related Response, Reply, and exhibits.	0.8	\$ 160.00		
06/20/2013	LAR	Review Daniel Rondeau's deposition in preparation for trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
06/21/2013	SRK	Conference with Mary Jo Foster re ethics issue re proposed communication with former member of Utility Board. Conference with Bill Walker re same.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
06/21/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re preparation for oral argument on motions in limine.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/21/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re email from Jeff Matura re contents of Amended Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
06/21/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re contents of Amended Joint Proposed Final Pretrial Order, and Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re same.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
06/21/2013	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re proposal for dismissal of Defendants TCP, HCC Utilities and TCWA, and Draft email to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re same.	0.50	\$ 147.50		

06/21/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane re content included in amended joint proposed pretrial order and missing exhibits.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
06/23/2013	SRK	Review motions in limine and responses in preparation for final pretrial conference..	5.30	\$ 1,563.50		
06/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re information from Jinjer Cooke re stalking of Cookes.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
06/23/2013	LAR	Review Hildale's Limine Regarding Admission of Statements of Disability and Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude Any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims and related evidence.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
06/23/2013	LAR	Research caselaw related to Hildale's Limine Regarding Admission of Statements of Disability and Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude Any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation	2.0	\$ 400.00		
06/24/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation for joint final pretrial conference.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/24/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re info received from Jinjer Cooke re stalking, and Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re same.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
06/24/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, and Leslie Ross re preparation for joint final pretrial conference and requested dismissal of certain defendants.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
06/24/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re oral argument re motions in limine and insurance company motion to intervene, and Telephone call from Bill Walker re insurance co motion to intervene.	0.90	\$ 265.50	Internal conference.	

06/24/2013	SRK	Review Travelers' motion to intervene.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
06/24/2013	SRK	Review Colorado City's disclosures re insurance and reservation of rights.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/24/2013	SRK	Review Research re impeachment evidence and cases cited by Hildale Defendants re motion for sanctions re Guy Timpson deposition.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
06/24/2013	SRK	PF hearing re motions in limine.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Duplicative of 6/22/2013 SRK.	
06/24/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re litigation strategy.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
06/24/2013	BKK	Legal research re evidentiary issues.	1.2	\$ 354.00	Vague.	
06/24/2013	BKK	Prepare for final pretrial conference.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Excessive because did not participate in the conference.	
06/24/2013	LAR	Create outline of arguments in response to Hildale's Limine Regarding Admission of Statements of Disability and Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude Any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims in preparation for final pretrial conference.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
06/24/2013	LAR	Compile book including all necessary documents in preparation for the final pretrial conference.	3.1	\$ 620.00	Clerical.	
06/24/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding preparation for final pretrial conference.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
06/24/2013	LAR	Meeting with Bill Richards, Bill Waker and Sandra Kane re preparation for final pretrial conference and Defendants' request to dismiss certain defendants.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	

06/24/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh in preparation for oral arguments on Motions in Limine and discussion of St. Paul Guardian Insurance Company and the Travelers Indemnity Company's Motion to Intervene.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
06/24/2013	CH	call Utah St Court re certified copies	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical.	
06/25/2013	SRK	PF and attend final joint pretrial conference..	6.00	\$ 1,770.00		
06/25/2013	SRK	Review minute entry order re final pretrial conference.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
06/25/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend final pretrial conference.	5.5	\$ 1,622.50	Excessive because did not participate in conference.	
06/25/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
06/25/2013	LAR	Revise outline of arguments in response to Hildale's Limine Regarding Admission of Statements of Disability and Plaintiffs' Joint Motion in Limine to Exclude Any Reference to Court's Ruling on Reasonable Accommodation Claims and prepare for final pretrial conference.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Excessive; duplicative of 6/24/2013 LAR.	
06/25/2013	LAR	Attend Final Pretrial Conference.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Excessive because did not participate in conference.	
06/25/2013	CH	print final pretrial order and associated documents and prepare in a notebook	1.2	\$ 150.00	Clerical.	
06/25/2013	CH	attend final pre-trial conference with Judge Tielborg	4.0	\$ 500.00	Excessive because did not participate in conference.	
06/26/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Bill Richards re strategy re jury instructions, expert witnesses, trial preparation, and additional information.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	

06/26/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re ethical issues re contacting witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/26/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re 5th Amendment claims and review reply.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/26/2013	SRK	Meeting with Jinjer Cooke and Ron Cooke re case status, and Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re case status.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
06/26/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ron and Jinjer Cooke re litigation issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00		
06/26/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Richards and Bill Walker.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
06/26/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Vague.	
06/26/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra; pick up USB drive from Jinjer, download photos to I drive; scan documents from pretrial conference to I drive; email to Sandra re location of docs and photos	0.5	\$ 50.00	Block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
06/28/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Charlotte Haught re preparation of trial exhibits.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/28/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re Prescott jury information.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/28/2013	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Reply re MSJ re Hildale-Colorado City Utilities, and Review email from Brad Keogh re same.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/28/2013	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton with proposed Stipulated Motion to Dismiss Certain Defendants, Review email from Bill Walker re same , Draft reply to Bill Walker re same, and Telephone call to Brad Keogh re same.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
06/28/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
06/28/2013	BKK	Review pleadings from defendants.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Vague.	
06/28/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra and email	0.3	\$ 37.50	Vague; internal conference.	

07/01/2013	SRK	Telephone communications from Jinjer Cooke re Patrick Barlow.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
07/01/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Patrick Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/01/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Isaac Wyler re Patrick Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/01/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re motion to intervene, response to motion to intervene, response to stipulated motion to dismiss, 5th amendment jury instructions, transcripts and jury pool..	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/01/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re copies of deposition transcripts, and Review reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/01/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton rejecting proposed stipulated motion for dismissal of certain defendants.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/01/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Research re mandamus.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/02/2013	SRK	Research re mandamus and sovereign immunity.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
07/02/2013	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker re strategy in response to Colorado City's motion to dismiss Count 10.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/02/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re legal issues re mandamus and sovereign immunity re Count 10, and Conference with Ann Hobart and Paula Bicket re same.	1.40	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.	
07/02/2013	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re proposed dismissal of TCWW, HCC Utilities and TCWA.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/02/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Blake Hamilton's email re vicarious liability and sovereign immunity issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/02/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re response to motion to dismiss Count 10 and response to Blake Hamilton re dismissal of defendants.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	

07/02/2013	SRK	Research re sovereign immunity and federal court jurisdiction, and Draft emails to Bill Walker, Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re same.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
07/02/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50	Internal conference.	
07/02/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits and pleadings from defendants.	1.8	\$ 531.00	Vague.	
07/02/2013	BKK	Legal research re federal jurisdiction issues.	1.7	\$ 501.50		
07/05/2013	BKK	Review motion to intervene.	0.1	\$ 29.50		
07/05/2013	BKK	Legal research re Rule 24, FRCP.	0.7	\$ 206.50		
07/05/2013	BKK	Review Fifth Amendment and AZ POST documents.	0.2	\$ 59.00		
07/05/2013	LAR	Research cases in preparation for response to Travelers Motion to Intervene.	3.1	\$ 620.00	Not related to claims.	
07/05/2013	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane regarding the results of my research re Travelers Motion to Intervene.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Not related to claims.	
07/08/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re insurance company motion to intervene.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/08/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re insurance company motion to intervene.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
07/08/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re reservation of rights letter.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Brad Keogh re information needed re Colorado City insurance policies and reservation of rights by insurance companies.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Telephone call to Amy Samberg's office re Traveler's motion to intervene.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

07/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re scheduling a conference call with Jeff Matura re insurance company intervention, Review emails communications from Bill Walker and Jeff Matura re conference call, and Telephone call from Bill Walker in preparation for conference call with Jeff Matura.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Block billing; internal conference.	Objection overruled.
07/08/2013	SRK	Attend conference call with Bill Walker and Jeff Matura re insurance coverage, reservation of rights, and Travelers' motion to intervene.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
07/08/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re information from consultant re insurance issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/08/2013	SRK	Review Notice of Errata from Travelers.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
07/08/2013	BKK	Conference call with Sandra Kane and Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	1.2	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
07/08/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents and trial exhibits, ROR letter and insurance Policy.	5.3	\$ 1,563.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
07/08/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane, Brad Keogh and Bill Walker regarding response to motion to intervene filed by Travelers insurance.	1.3	\$ 260.00	Not related to claims; internal conference.	
07/09/2013	SRK	Review emails approving Bill Walker's proposed stipulation to extend time for response to Traveler's motion to intervene.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/09/2013	BKK	Review intervention literature.	0.8	\$ 236.00	Not related to claims.	
07/09/2013	BKK	Legal research re Rule 24, FRCP and related issues.	2.2	\$ 649.00	Not related to claims.	
07/10/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Attorney Darius Nickerson re experience with Prescott jury pool, LDS jurors, and religious issues encountered in recent jury selection in civil rights case.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	

07/10/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re status of response to insurance company motion to intervene.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
07/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re response to motion to intervene and review of questions in which witnesses asserted the 5th Amendment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
07/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re response to insurance company motion to intervene and review of questions in which witnesses asserted the 5th Amendment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
07/10/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker's office re proposed stipulation and order re extension of time to respond to insurance company's motion to intervene, and Draft email to Bill Walker's office re same.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
07/10/2013	SRK	Review emails from Blake Hamilton, Bill Walker's office, and Jeff Matura re proposed order, and Draft reply to Bill Walker's office approving same.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
07/10/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts re Fifth Amendment issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	
07/10/2013	CH	telephone call with Rachel at Jeff Matura's office re wrong date for Wisan deposition designation; email to Sandra and Leslie	0.2	\$ 25.00	
07/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re Patrick Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
07/11/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re deposition designations, and draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
07/11/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
07/11/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re correcting deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.

07/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re notice of errata to correct deposition designations and meeting re 5th amendment designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/11/2013	SRK	Draft notice of errata to correct deposition designations.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
07/11/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura, Bill Walker and Blake Hamilton re notice of errata.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/11/2013	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Jeff Matura re notice of errata.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
07/11/2013	LAR	Revise document containing possible fifth amendment adverse inference jury instructions to include factors discussed in Nationwide v. Life Ins. Co. v. Richards, 541 F. 3d 903 (9th Cir. 2008).	3.5	\$ 700.00		
07/12/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re 5th Amendment questions and trial preparation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/12/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh re potential meeting with newly discovered witness Patrick Barlow.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
07/12/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re cancellation of potential meeting with newly discovered witness, legal argument re response to insurance company motion to intervene, and strategy re jury selection.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
07/12/2013	SRK	Review Research memo from Shasta Inman re standard to amend scheduling order based on newly discovered evidence after pretrial conference.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/12/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re admissibility of newly discovered evidence .	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/12/2013	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re notice of errata.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
07/12/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker to Blake Hamilton re dismissal of certain defendants.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

07/12/2013	BKK	Review documents from DOJ.	0.2	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
07/12/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re DOJ documents.	0.8	\$ 236.00	Not related to claims; internal conference.	
07/12/2013	LAR	Complete document containing possible fifth amendment adverse inference jury instructions to include factors discussed in Nationwide.	6.5	\$ 1,300.00	Excessive; duplicative of 7/11/2013 LAR.	
07/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Colorado City Town Council agenda and possible retention of White Berberian law firm in Cooke case, Research re White Berberian firm, Review Colorado City notice and agenda, Draft email to Bill Walker re same..	1.60	\$ 377.60	Block billing; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
07/14/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re scheduling meeting with potential witness Patrick Barlow..	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re scheduling meeting with Patrick Barlow and Cookes in Las Vegas.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/15/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re meeting with Patrick Barlow, evidentiary and disclosure issues re Patrick Barlow, and 5th Amendment adverse inference instruction.	1.70	\$ 501.50	Internal conference.	
07/15/2013	SRK	Review LF Jeff Matura re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/15/2013	SRK	Review email and LF Bill Walker to Jeff Matura re insurance policies and letters.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/15/2013	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker re meeting in Las Vegas with Patrick Barlow.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
07/15/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	0.8	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
07/15/2013	BKK	Conference call with Bill Walker re pretrial issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/15/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts and Fifth Amendment issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00		

07/15/2013	CH	prepare exhibits for copying - burn to DVD and deliver to copy center	1.5	\$ 187.50	Clerical.	
07/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re meeting in Las Vegas with Patrick Barlow and Cookes.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/16/2013	SRK	Review LF Jeff Matura with questions re Plaintiffs' deposition designations.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
07/16/2013	SRK	Research re adverse inference from 5th Amendment invocation.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
07/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh in preparation for meeting with Patrick Barlow.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
07/16/2013	LAR	Research disclosure requirements for impeachment evidence in preparation for trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
07/16/2013	CH	prepare order form for transcripts	0.6	\$ 75.00	Clerical.	
07/17/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend meeting in Las Vegas with Patrick Barlow, Bill Walker and Ron and Jinjer Cooke.	7.00	\$ 2,065.00	Internal conference.	
07/17/2013	BKK	Travel to and from Las Vegas.	5.0	\$ 1,475.00	Duplicative of 7/17/2013 SRK.	
07/17/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker and Patrick Barlow re trial testimony issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
07/17/2013	LAR	Review and revise Plaintiffs and Plaintiff Intervenor's Response in Opposition to St. Paul Guardian Insurance Company's and the Travelers Indemnity Company's Motion to Intervene.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Not related to claims.	
07/18/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh with revisions to draft response to motion to intervene.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims; internal conference.	

07/18/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re response to insurance company motion to intervene, response to Blake Hamilton's email requesting proposal re settlement with certain Hildale Defendants, and preparation of affidavit for Patrick Barlow.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims; internal conference.
07/18/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re response to motion to intervene.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
07/18/2013	SRK	Review Traveler's motion to intervene and cases cited therein.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00	Not related to claims.
07/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton re proposed dismissal of TCP, HC Utilities and TCWA.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
07/18/2013	LAR	Research and revise Plaintiffs and Plaintiff Intervenor's Response in Opposition to St. Paul Guardian Insurance Company's and the Travelers Indemnity Company's Motion to Intervene.	1.2	\$ 240.00	Not related to claims.
07/18/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane about Plaintiffs and Plaintiff Intervenor's Response in Opposition to St. Paul Guardian Insurance Company's and the Travelers Indemnity Company's Motion to Intervene.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Not related to claims; internal conference.
07/18/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker and Brad Keogh on Plaintiffs and Plaintiff Intervenor's Response in Opposition to St. Paul Guardian Insurance Company's and the Travelers Indemnity Company's Motion to Intervene.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Not related to claims; internal conference.
07/18/2013	LAR	Review Brad Keogh's revisions to Plaintiffs and Plaintiff Intervenor's Response in Opposition to St. Paul Guardian Insurance Company's and the Travelers Indemnity Company's Motion to Intervene.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Not related to claims; internal conference.

07/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re meeting with Patrick Barlow and insurance company motion to intervene.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Not related to claims.	
07/19/2013	SRK	Draft notes re meeting with Patrick Barlow.	1.60	\$ 472.00	Clerical.	
07/19/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' Response to Travelers' Motion to Intervene.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
07/19/2013	SRK	Review Colorado City's Reply re Motion to Dismiss Count 10.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/19/2013	BKK	Review documents from Colorado City re trial exhibit issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00		
07/19/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re trial exhibit issues.	0.6	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
07/22/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re preparation of affidavit for Patrick Barlow, and Draft reply to Bill Walker.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/22/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re deposition designation questions from Jeff Matura.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/22/2013	SRK	Review email from Marty Herder's office re original deposition transcripts, and Draft email to Charlotte Haught and Donna ChrisJohn re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/22/2013	SRK	Begin drafting declaration of Patrick Barlow.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
07/22/2013	SRK	Review emails from Leslie Ross and Donna ChrisJohn re deposition designations and transcripts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/22/2013	LAR	Review and revise Plaintiffs' deposition designations for Helaman Barlow, Jeremiah Barlow, Richard Holm, Curtis Cooke, Brian Zitting, Nick Hanna, Victor Jessop, Marion Timpson, and Stephen Noel.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
07/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re review of highlighted depositions designations prepared by Jeff Matura's office.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

07/23/2013	SRK	Meeting with Charlotte Haight re trial preparation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/23/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re answers to Jeff Matura's questions re plaintiffs' deposition designations and deposition transcripts, and Draft email to Bill Walker re Jeff Matura's questions re plaintiffs' deposition designations.	0.90	\$ 265.50	Internal conference.	
07/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re Patrick Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/23/2013	SRK	Draft declaration of Patrick Barlow.	3.40	\$ 1,003.00		
07/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re draft declaration of Patrick Barlow.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
07/23/2013	CH	meet with Sandra Kane re impeachment exhibits and deposition designations and trial assistance	1.5	\$ 187.50	Internal conference.	
07/24/2013	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross and Bill Walker re draft declaration of Patrick Barlow.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Internal conference.	
07/24/2013	SRK	Review emails from Donna ChrisJohn and Marty Herder's office re location of original deposition transcripts, and Draft email to Donna ChrisJohn re same.	1.70	\$ 501.50	Internal conference.	
07/24/2013	BKK	Review and revise declaration of Patrick Barlow.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Duplicative of 7/23/2013 SRK.	
07/24/2013	LAR	Review Patrick Barlow's declaration in preparation for Plaintiffs' Request to Reopen Discovery.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Duplicative of 7/23/2013 SRK & 7/24/2013 SRK.	
07/25/2013	SRK	Review emails from Charlotte Haight and Donna Chrisjohn re original deposition transcripts for trial.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/25/2013	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re conference call with Patrick Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

07/25/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re order concerning trial time, and Draft email to Bill Walker re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/25/2013	SRK	Review transcript of Alma Cawley's deposition and deposition designations re same.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Excessive because not used at trial.	
07/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Alma Cawley re status of Centennial Park subdivision and water issues, and Draft notes to file re Telephone call to Alma Cawley.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
07/25/2013	SRK	Complete drafting file notes re Meeting with Patrick Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
07/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re potential witness Patrick Barlow, deposition transcripts, and trial preparation.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
07/25/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re impeachment evidence from Jinjer Cooke.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/25/2013	CH	telephone call with court clerk re deposition designations; telephone call with Rachel at Matura's office re transcripts	0.8	\$ 100.00	Clerical.	
07/25/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra re depositions and Judge's pending order re trial time, also discussion about possible uses for HUD money	0.5	\$ 62.50	Internal conference.	
07/26/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Patrick Barlow as potential witness.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/26/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Patrick Barlow and 5th Amendment issues.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/28/2013	SRK	Review Nationwide case re elements of adverse inference from invocation of 5th amendment.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
07/28/2013	SRK	Begin to Review and analyze questions where defense witnesses asserted 5th amendment for Nationwide elements.	2.50	\$ 737.50		

07/29/2013	SRK	Review and analyze additional questions where witnesses invoked 5th amendment for Nationwide factors for adverse inference..	3.00	\$ 885.00		
07/29/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re requesting adverse inference on questions in which witnesses invoked 5th amendment.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
07/29/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Patrick Barlow re revisions to draft declaration.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
07/29/2013	SRK	Draft revised declaration and Draft email to Patrick Barlow requesting signature.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
07/29/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re discovery issues.	0.8	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
07/29/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re discovery issues.	0.7	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
07/29/2013	LAR	Review adverse inference jury instructions in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
07/29/2013	LAR	Conference call with Sandra Kane, Brad Keogh, and Bill Walker regarding whether to pursue an adverse inference jury instruction.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
07/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Patrick Barlow declaration.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/31/2013	BKK	Review correspondence to and from defense counsel.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Vague.	
07/31/2013	BKK	Review TCWW documents.	0.7	\$ 206.50	Vague.	
07/31/2013	LAR	Review transcript from final pretrial conference, and revise jury instructions accordingly.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
08/02/2013	BKK	Review motion to intervene, response and reply thereto.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
08/02/2013	BKK	Legal research re Rule 24, FRCP issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Not related to claims.	
08/02/2013	LAR	Review Consolidated Reply in Support of Motion to Intervene.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Not related to claims.	

08/05/2013	LAR	Draft revised jury instructions in accordance with requirements set forth during the final pretrial conference and revise verdict forms.	4.0	\$ 800.00		
08/06/2013	BKK	Conference call with Bill Walker and defense counsel re evidentiary issues.	0.2	\$ 59.00		
08/06/2013	BKK	Review documents from Texas AG.	1.3	\$ 383.50		
08/07/2013	BKK	Review documents from Texas Attorney General.	2.7	\$ 796.50	Duplicative of 8/7/2013 BKK.	
08/07/2013	BKK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/08/2013	BKK	Conference call with Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/08/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	1.6	\$ 472.00		
08/08/2013	LAR	Revise jury instructions and email revised jury instructions to Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh for review.	1.4	\$ 280.00		
08/09/2013	BKK	Review revised jury instructions.	2.1	\$ 619.50		
08/09/2013	BKK	Review documents from Texas AG.	1.9	\$ 560.50	Duplicative of 8/7/2013 BKK.	
08/09/2013	CH	verify deposition designations and review designations to make sure complete	3.2	\$ 400.00	Clerical.	
08/09/2013	CH	verify deposition designations and review designations to make sure complete	3.7	\$ 462.50	Clerical.	
08/12/2013	BKK	Review documents from Texas Attorney General.	4.0	\$ 1,180.00	Duplicative of 8/7/2013 BKK & 8/9/2013 BKK.	
08/12/2013	CH	verify deposition designations	0.8	\$ 100.00	Vague; clerical.	
08/12/2013	CH	verify deposition designations	4.5	\$ 562.50	Vague; clerical.	
08/13/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re draft revised jury instructions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/13/2013	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re Willie Jessop.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
08/13/2013	SRK	Conference with Donna ChrisJohn and Charlotte Haught re status of preparing trial exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	

08/13/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts re evidentiary issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Vague.	
08/13/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
08/13/2013	CH	verify deposition designations	1.0	\$ 125.00	Vague; clerical.	
08/13/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra re exhibits and deposition designations; telephone call with Donna re exhibits; verify deposition designations	2.0	\$ 250.00	Internal conference.	
08/14/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh in preparation for conference call with Bill Walker re Willie Jessop.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/14/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Willie Jessop and Patrick Barlow as witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/14/2013	SRK	Review Research memo re impeachment evidence.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/14/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Research re impeachment evidence.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/14/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re contacting court to request additional discovery to depose and/or add trial witnesses Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop, status of preparation of amended jury instructions, and possible focus jury.	1.00	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
08/14/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re strategy re focus group.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/14/2013	SRK	Review LF Blake Hamilton and attachments with belated disclosure of Utah Government Trust reservation of rights letters re insurance, and Draft email to Bill Walker re same.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
08/14/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.4	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.	

08/14/2013	BKK	Review documents from Texas Attorney General.	2.3	\$ 678.50	Duplicative of 8/7/2013 BKK, 8/9/2013 BKK & 8/12/2013 BKK.	
08/14/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/15/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh re Willie Jessop as witness .	1.60	\$ 472.00	Internal conference.	
08/15/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re Willie Jessop as witness.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/15/2013	SRK	Add documents and witnesses to impeachment file.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
08/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re Willie Jessop as potential witness.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
08/15/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	4.0	\$ 1,180.00	Internal conference.	
08/15/2013	CH	verify deposition designations	3.5	\$ 437.50	Vague; clerical.	
08/16/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker and Research re conspiracy issue.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re case status.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
08/16/2013	SRK	PF and participate in conference call with Zach Renstrom and Bill Walker re anticipated costs for trial.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
08/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Willie Jessop.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
08/16/2013	SRK	Communications re arranging focus jury, including Telephone call to David Wenner re services provided and estimated costs of focus jury. Telephone call to Brad Keogh re logistics of focus jury. Telephone call to Bill Walker re logistics of focus jury. Telephone call to David Wenner with Bill Walker re logistics and costs of focus jury.	2.00	\$ -	Block billing; Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
08/16/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
08/16/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

08/16/2013	BKK	Legal research re evidentiary RICO issues.	2.2	\$ 649.00	Not related to claims.	
08/16/2013	CH	verify deposition designations	3.8	\$ 475.00	Vague; clerical.	
08/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re contacting defense counsel re using Willie Jessop as trial witness.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/19/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re focus jury and theme.	0.60	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
08/19/2013	SRK	Email communications with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re draft email to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re adding Willie Jessop as a witness.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
08/19/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart, Karen Hartman-Tellez and Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	0.6	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
08/19/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	0.9	\$ 265.50	Internal conference.	
08/21/2013	CH	verify depo designations	0.8	\$ 100.00	Vague; clerical.	
08/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re witness Isaac Wyler's hospitalization, procedure re contacting court to request additional witnesses, jury focus group cost, jury instruction revisions, and 5th amendment adverse instructions.	0.70	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
08/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re conference call and jury instruction revisions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
08/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to David Wenner re focus group costs.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
08/23/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Zachary Renstrom forwarding deposition transcripts and exhibits..	0.30	\$ 88.50		

08/27/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re requesting to add Willie Jessop and Patrick Barlow as witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/27/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re revisions to jury instructions and Fifth Amendment adverse instruction.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
08/27/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.6	\$ 472.00	Internal conference.	
08/27/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
08/27/2013	LAR	Conference call with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker and Brad Keogh regarding revised jury instructions and the adverse inference jury instruction.	1.6	\$ 320.00	Internal conference.	
08/27/2013	LAR	Review revised jury instructions and draft notice of withdrawal of 5th amendment adverse inference jury instruction.	2.8	\$ 560.00	Excessive.	
08/27/2013	CH	verify deposition designations	6.5	\$ 812.50	Vague; clerical.	
08/28/2013	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re jury instruction revisions, depositions of Ron and Jinjer Cooke, and Willie Jessop.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
08/28/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	0.7	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
08/28/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
08/28/2013	LAR	Conference call with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding revised jury instructions.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
08/28/2013	LAR	Draft email to Defendants regarding proposed revisions to jury instructions.	0.6	\$ 120.00		

08/28/2013	LAR	Draft Notice of Filing Amended Stipulated Jury Instructions and Plaintiffs' and Defendants' Additional Proposed Jury Instructions.	0.4	\$ 80.00		
08/29/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re revisions to jury instructions, Edit draft proposed revisions to jury instructions, and Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with draft proposed revisions to jury instructions.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Block billing; internal conference.	Objection overruled.
08/30/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re revisions to jury instructions..	0.20	\$ 59.00		
08/30/2013	CH	index UTIL documents and update Master Document list	0.4	\$ 50.00	Clerical.	
09/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re service of subpoena on Joseph Allred and status of revisions to jury instructions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re email to Defendants re insufficient time to review proposed revisions to jury instructions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re jury instructions.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
09/03/2013	SRK	Review court order re jury instructions and proposed jury instructions.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
09/03/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re draft jury instructions.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
09/03/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re draft jury instructions.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
09/03/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura with revised proposed jury instructions.	2.00	\$ 590.00		
09/03/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with Plaintiffs' comments on revised proposed jury instructions .	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/03/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re accepting Plaintiffs' comments on revised proposed jury instructions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

09/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re revised proposed jury instructions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/03/2013	SRK	Review and e-file revised proposed jury instructions.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Clerical.	
09/03/2013	SRK	Review and e-file Plaintiffs' Joint Notice of Withdrawal of Plaintiffs/Plaintiff-Intervenors' Proposed Non-Standard Jury Instructions Nos. 1 and 2.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/03/2013	SRK	Review Hildale's pleading re Daniel Rondeau's testimony.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
09/03/2013	SRK	Review transcript of final pretrial conference re Daniel Rondeau's testimony.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/03/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re revised jury instruction.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
09/03/2013	SRK	Review response from Jeff Matura re revised jury instruction.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
09/03/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
09/03/2013	BKK	Revise jury instructions.	1.0	\$ 295.00		
09/04/2013	SRK	Review Consolidated Reply of Travelers Insurance in support of its motion to intervene.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
09/04/2013	SRK	Review insurance information received from Colorado City re reservation of rights.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re whereabouts of 5/13/13 reservation of rights letter from Travelers.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/04/2013	SRK	Telephone communications with Patrick Barlow re declaration and serving as witness.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
09/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura requesting copy of updated reservation of rights letter.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/06/2013	LAR	Review Willie Jessop's declarations in preparation for filing Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
09/06/2013	CH	verify deposition designations	3.9	\$ 487.50	Vague; clerical.	

09/09/2013	SRK	Telephone communication with Bill Walker re Willie Jessop's Declarations and trial subpoena to Joseph Allred..	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
09/09/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re language of subpoena to Joseph Allred and meeting to prepare for trial.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/09/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re service of subpoena by Jethro Barlow, estimated date of Joseph Allred's testimony and language for subpoena.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/09/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re admissibility of George Barlow letters to Warren Jeffs.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.
09/09/2013	CH	telephone calls with Sandra Kane and Donna	0.2	\$ 25.00	Vague; internal conference.
09/10/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re disclosure issues.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
09/10/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker with Subpoena for Joseph Allred.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
09/10/2013	SRK	Research re service of trial subpoenas.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
09/10/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re legal authority for requesting new witnesses and evidence after close of discovery..	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/11/2013	SRK	Work on impeachment witnesses and exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
09/11/2013	SRK	Research re destruction of public records.	0.50	\$ 147.50	
09/11/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh re trial planning and strategy..	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.
09/12/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	4.0	\$ 1,180.00	Internal conference.
09/13/2013	SRK	Email and telephone communications from Charlotte Haught re correcting deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.

09/13/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught to Rachel Ruthenberg re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/13/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/13/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re conference call on trial planning and strategy.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/13/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00		
09/13/2013	CH	verify deposition designations; prepare list of highlighting problems and list of designation problems; email and telephone call with Sandra Kane	7.0	\$ 875.00	Block billing; internal conference; clerical.	Objection overruled.
09/16/2013	SRK	Research re First Amendment Privilege and Interlocutory Appeal re same.	2.20	\$ 649.00		
09/16/2013	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re trial preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/16/2013	SRK	Review declarations of Willie Jessop, signatures of George Barlow, and deposition of George Barlow.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
09/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re contacting Willie Jessop re testifying, and Telephone call to Willie Jessop with Brad Keogh.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
09/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re remedies for retaliation and protection of material witness.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
09/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re incident involving Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/16/2013	SRK	Research re federal criminal statute for retaliation against witness.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
09/16/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re research on retaliation against witnesses.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
09/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jethro Barlow re service of subpoena .	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/16/2013	LAR	Review errors in deposition designations in the Amended Pretrial Order.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Clerical.	

09/16/2013	CH	verify Wisan depo designations	0.8	\$ 100.00	Clerical.	
09/16/2013	CH	check UEP files for Receivership documents; telephone call with Sandra	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical; not related to claims.	
09/17/2013	SRK	Meeting with paralegal Charlotte Haught and legal assistant Donna ChrisJohn re compliance with amended pretrial order and trial preparation re subpoenas, exhibits, witness lists, exhibit lists, list of terms, deposition transcripts, and impeachment exhibit .	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
09/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re service on Joseph Allred and conference call .	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/17/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re conference call.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/17/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Law Clerk Arman Nafisi re .	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
09/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re vandalism to Willie Jessop's property.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/17/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh and Arman Nafisi re intimidation of witness.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
09/17/2013	SRK	Review emails from Jethro Barlow and Bill Walker re service of subpoena on Joseph Allred.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/17/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re declaration of Willie Jessop.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/17/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re trial issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/17/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
09/17/2013	BKK	Review deposition designations.	1.7	\$ 501.50		
09/17/2013	CH	meeting with Sandra Kane and Donna Chrisjohn re trial prep	1.3	\$ 162.50	Internal conference.	
09/17/2013	CH	review Rachel's notes re deposition designations and verify the issues she highlighted and respond to her email	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical.	

09/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Willie Jessop.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Christie of Judge Teilborg's court with Brad Keogh and Bill Walker requesting guidance re procedure to bring issue involving Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop to the Court's attention.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
09/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re scheduling conference with Judge Teilborg's JA.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re additional harassment and intimidation of in Colorado City.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
09/18/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re conference call with Judge Teilborg's JA.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
09/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re conference call with Judge Teilborg's JA..	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/18/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	3.9	\$ 1,150.50	Internal conference.	
09/18/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Judge Teilborg's clerk.	0.1	\$ 29.50		
09/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re conference call re Willie Jessop and Patrick Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re availability for conference call.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/19/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re conference call and docket.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/19/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Texas FLDS documents.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/19/2013	SRK	Review Order denying St Paul and Travelers Insurance Co's motion to intervene.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Not related to claims.	
09/19/2013	SRK	Review DVD's from Jinjer Cooke for designations.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
09/19/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re Willie Jessop's deposition..	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

09/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Brad Keogh re contact with Custodian of Records at Texas Prison re authentication of letters to Jeffs.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/19/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re authentication of Texas letters.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/19/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.
09/19/2013	BKK	Review deposition designations.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Vague.
09/20/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re authentication of Texas mail to Warren Jeffs, and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
09/20/2013	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart re 9th Circuit decision in Newport Beach disparate treatment fair housing case against municipality.	3.50	\$ 1,032.50	Excessive; internal conference.
09/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Elizabeth and Chris Brancart re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
09/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Newport Beach case.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
09/20/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re use of technology in trial presentation in federal court.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
09/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re use of technology in trial presentation in federal court .	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
09/20/2013	SRK	Review potential erroneous deposition designations located by Charlotte Haught.	2.00	\$ 590.00	
09/20/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	3.4	\$ 1,003.00	Internal conference.
09/20/2013	BKK	Review Order from court.	0.1	\$ 29.50	
09/20/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Tom Chenal re trial issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.
09/20/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents re admissibility issues.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Vague; excessive.
09/23/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re depo designations.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.

09/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Judge Teilborg's JA Alicia re status of scheduling conference call.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.
09/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re scheduling conference call.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
09/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re scheduling conference call.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
09/23/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re scheduling conference call with Judge Teilborg re Willie Jessop and Patrick Barlow.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
09/23/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re scheduling conference call, and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	
09/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Judge Teilborg's court and Draft email to Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton, Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re new time for conference call.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.
09/23/2013	SRK	Review additional deposition designation questions from Charlotte Haught against highlighted deposition transcripts.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00	Internal conference.
09/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught, Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/23/2013	SRK	Conference with Donna ChrisJohn re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
09/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Brad Keogh re deposition designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/23/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh in preparation for conference call with court.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
09/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
09/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
09/23/2013	SRK	Conference with Donna ChrisJohn re info from Court re deposition designations and arranging for conference call re same..	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.

09/23/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	1.4	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.	
09/23/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Vague; excessive.	
09/23/2013	BKK	Conference call with Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	0.6	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
09/24/2013	SRK	Review emails from Brad Keogh re Response to Motion to Strike.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/24/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re contacting Willie Jessop.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/24/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re Bill Richards' email and Willie Jessop.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
09/24/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/24/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
09/24/2013	BKK	Review documents from Bill Richards and Texas AG.	3.8	\$ 1,121.00	Vague; excessive.	
09/24/2013	BKK	Legal research re Utah UEP Trust evidentiary issues.	1.7	\$ 501.50	Not related to claims.	
09/24/2013	LAR	Review David Darger's depositions to prepare for cross examination of David Darger in preparation of trial.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
09/24/2013	CH	telephone call with Donna re status of deposition designations	0.5	\$ 62.50	Internal conference.	
09/25/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re conference call.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
09/25/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and other counsel re conference call.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
09/25/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re trial preparation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re telephonic hearing re additional witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re telephonic hearing re additional witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
09/25/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker forwarding email from Blake Hamilton re protective order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

09/25/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re email from Blake Hamilton re protective order.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
09/25/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
09/25/2013	BKK	Review documents from Texas Attorney General.	4.8	\$ 1,416.00	Vague; excessive.	
09/25/2013	BKK	Prepare for discovery hearing.	0.7	\$ 206.50		
09/26/2013	SRK	Telephonic Conference Call with Judge Teilborg's Clerk (Alicia), Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re Plaintiffs' Request to Reopen Discovery re Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop. Telephone call from Bill Walker re same. Telephone call to Brad Keogh re same.	1.60	\$ 472.00		
09/26/2013	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re Plaintiffs' Request to Reopen Discovery re Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.	0.90	\$ 265.50	Internal conference.	
09/26/2013	SRK	Review and docket Court Order re briefing schedule and hearing re Plaintiffs' Request to Reopen Discovery re Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
09/26/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Research re good cause and diligence standard.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/26/2013	SRK	Conference with Law Clerk Arman Nafisi re Research re Rule 26 disclosure standard.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/26/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re hearing.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
09/26/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re scheduling conference call.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/26/2013	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re declarations and protective order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/26/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh re motion to reopen discovery.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	

09/26/2013	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re issues re motion to reopen discovery.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.
09/26/2013	SRK	Review Research memo from Arman Nafisi re FRCP 26 disclosure requirements.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/26/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend discovery hearing.	1.7	\$ 501.50	
09/26/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	7.1	\$ 2,094.50	Excessive; Internal conference.
09/26/2013	LAR	Research good cause standard for reopening discovery in preparation for filing Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery.	1.5	\$ 300.00	
09/27/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re motion to reopen discovery.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
09/27/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re case law re legal standard for motion to reopen discovery, preparation of affidavit in support of motion, and logistics for arguing motion.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/27/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Willie Jessop.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/27/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Arman Nafisi re Research re futility.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
09/27/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00	
09/27/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Research re good cause standard.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
09/27/2013	SRK	Review depositions of Jeremiah Barlow, David Darger and Jacob Barlow, and discovery responses from Defendants in preparation of motion to reopen discovery.	2.50	\$ 737.50	
09/27/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re motion to reopen discovery.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
09/27/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re arguments re motion to reopen discovery.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.

09/27/2013	SRK	Review Brad Keogh's draft affidavit in support of motion to reopen discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/27/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	1.4	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.	
09/27/2013	BKK	Draft affidavit in support of Motion for Pre-Trial Relief.	0.8	\$ 236.00		
09/27/2013	BKK	Review documents from Texas AG.	5.7	\$ 1,681.50	Vague; excessive.	
09/27/2013	BKK	Legal research re newly discovered evidence issues.	1.1	\$ 324.50		
09/27/2013	LAR	Conference call with Sandra Kane, Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
09/27/2013	LAR	Meeting with Brad Keogh and Sandra Kane re Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery.	0.8	\$ 160.00	Internal conference.	
09/28/2013	SRK	Review research memo and attachments from Leslie Ross re good cause legal standard for reopening discovery and analyze new evidence under that standard.	3.60	\$ 1,062.00	Internal conference.	
09/29/2013	SRK	Review file for relevant facts and Research re good cause for motion to reopen discovery..	12.50	\$ 3,687.50	Block billing; excessive.	Objection overruled.
09/30/2013	SRK	Review Court order denying Hildale Defendants' Motion to Dismiss HCC Utilities and granting Colorado City's Motion to Dismiss Count 10 without prejudice.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re preparation for depositions of Ron and Jinjer Cooke.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
09/30/2013	SRK	Review order re time for trial.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
09/30/2013	SRK	Draft Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery For Limited Purpose and Amend Final Pretrial Order, Draft Declaration of Sandra Kane, Prepare related Exhibits.	12.70	\$ 3,746.50	Block billing; excessive.	Objection overruled.
09/30/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50	Internal conference.	

09/30/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents and trial exhibits.	5.0	\$ 1,475.00	Vague; excessive.	
09/30/2013	LAR	Draft memorandum for Sandra Kane on case research done to support Motion to reopen discovery.	2.2	\$ 440.00	Internal conference.	
09/30/2013	CH	telephone call with Leslie re: recent orders; review of orders; add trial to calendar	0.8	\$ 100.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
10/01/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re trial time and key witnesses.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
10/01/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re trial strategy based on time allowed in court order.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
10/01/2013	SRK	Review and edit Notice of Errata, Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery, and Exhibits.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
10/01/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re deposition schedule, ruling on Count 10, notice of errata re motion to reopen discovery, and oral argument re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/01/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re strategy for use of Priesthood Records at trial.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/01/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re case status.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/01/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Internal conference.	
10/01/2013	BKK	Review motion to reopen discovery and exhibits thereto.	0.4	\$ 118.00		
10/01/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	4.1	\$ 1,209.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/01/2013	LAR	Review Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
10/01/2013	LAR	Draft Notice of Errata re exhibits and typo in Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Excessive.	
10/02/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Donna ChrisJohn re organization of trial exhibits.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
10/02/2013	SRK	Review documents produced by Colorado City re water.	3.20	\$ 944.00		

10/02/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke, and Draft email to Jinjer Cooke re Motion to Reopen Discovery, etc..	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/02/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re exhibits for closing argument.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
10/02/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	
10/02/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/02/2013	LAR	Meeting with Donna Chrisjohn and Sandra Kane regarding exhibit organization in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
10/02/2013	LAR	Review exhibits included in Amended Proposed Final Pretrial Form of Order.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
10/03/2013	SRK	Meeting with Litigation Team.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
10/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re trial planning and declaration of Willie Jessop.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/03/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/03/2013	SRK	Add to impeachment exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/03/2013	SRK	Review Willie Jessop's deposition.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
10/03/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' Joint Response to Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
10/03/2013	SRK	Draft email to Law Clerk Arman Nafisi re Research re Defendants' Joint Response.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/03/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re evidentiary issues.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
10/03/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Brad Keogh, Sandra Kane, Donna Chrisjohn, and Charlotte Haught regarding exhibits for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
10/03/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh about trial witnesses.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
10/03/2013	CH	attend team trial meeting	1.0	\$ 125.00	Internal conference.	
10/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Defendants' response to Plaintiffs' motion to reopen discovery.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

10/04/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Defendants' arguments in response to Plaintiffs' motion to reopen discovery and additional research re Rule 16(e) standard.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/04/2013	SRK	Research re Rule 16(e).	0.50	\$ 147.50		
10/04/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Defendants' arguments in Response to Plaintiffs' Motion to Reopen Discovery.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
10/04/2013	BKK	Review documents from Texas AG.	3.8	\$ 1,121.00	Vague; excessive.	
10/04/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	2.2	\$ 649.00	Internal conference.	
10/04/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding Defendants' argument in response to Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Internal conference.	
10/05/2013	LAR	Review Amended Final Pretrial Order for allegations made by Defendants claiming that the marshal's office is not controlled by the FLDS in preparation for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
10/07/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation for hearing on Motion to Reopen Discovery and Amend Pretrial Order.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/07/2013	SRK	PF hearing on Motion to Reopen Discovery and Amend Pretrial Order.	4.20	\$ 1,239.00		
10/07/2013	SRK	Telephonic hearing with Judge Teilborg re Plaintiffs' Motion to Reopen Discovery and Amend Pretrial Order.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
10/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re scheduling depositions and obtaining handwriting expert.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/07/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re locating handwriting samples for George Barlow.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Willie Jessop's number for deposition arrangements.	0.10	\$ 29.50		

10/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Telephone call to Patrick Barlow and deposition arrangements.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/07/2013	SRK	Review documents with George Barlow's signature.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/07/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re supplemental final pretrial order and exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/07/2013	SRK	Draft email to Donna ChrisJohn and Charlotte Haught re new deadlines and exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re ruling on Motion to Reopen Discovery and Amend Pretrial Order.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/07/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
10/07/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend hearing on motion to reopen discovery.	1.9	\$ 560.50		
10/07/2013	BKK	Review DOJ documents re trial issues.	3.6	\$ 1,062.00	Not related to claims.	
10/07/2013	LAR	Research Fed. R. Civ. P. 16(e) standards and discuss same with Sandra Kane.	1.2	\$ 240.00		
10/07/2013	LAR	Review HydroLOGIC study and Defendants' knowledge of the study in preparation for trial. Review water experts' reports and expert depositions in preparation for trial.	2.4	\$ 480.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
10/07/2013	LAR	Locate and email Brad Keogh letters from George Barlow to Utah AG Shurtleff.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
10/07/2013	LAR	Review Willie Jessop's depositions in preparation for hearing on Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery.	2.3	\$ 460.00		
10/07/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane re preparation for hearing on Plaintiffs' Joint Motion to Reopen Discovery.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
10/07/2013	LAR	Draft Supplement to Final Pretrial Order.	1.8	\$ 360.00		

10/07/2013	CH	telephone call with Donna re exhibits	0.2	\$ 25.00	Internal conference.	
10/08/2013	SRK	Review Order re MSJ re HCC Utilities.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
10/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re George Barlow signature and deposition schedule.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Willie Jessop's number with Brad Keogh re deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re George Barlow's signature.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/08/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re 2013 letters from George Barlow to Warren Jeffs.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/08/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re George Barlow's signature.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/08/2013	SRK	Review letters from George Barlow to Warren Jeffs.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/08/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re admissibility of George Barlow Allred letters.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/08/2013	SRK	Prepare documents for impeachment folder.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/08/2013	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow with George Barlow signature.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/08/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re private handwriting expert.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/08/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught and Donna ChrisJohn re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/08/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	4.7	\$ 1,386.50	Internal conference.	
10/08/2013	BKK	Review DOJ documents re trial issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Not related to claims.	
10/08/2013	BKK	Legal research re Federal Rules of Evidence admissibility issues.	1.3	\$ 383.50	Excessive.	

10/09/2013	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow re discovery.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/09/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/09/2013	SRK	Draft text message to Willie Jessop re deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/09/2013	SRK	Review deposition designation re errors.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
10/09/2013	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Motion for Leave to File Motion to Dismiss for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction and Hildale Defendants' Lodged Motion to Dismiss for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
10/09/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re Hildale Motion and Draft response.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/09/2013	SRK	Review transcript of hearing re Ruth Steed.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
10/09/2013	SRK	Review transcript of hearing on 6/18/13.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/09/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits.	7.5	\$ 2,212.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/09/2013	BKK	Draft memorandum re trial exhibits.	0.5	\$ 147.50		
10/10/2013	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker re Hildale motion to dismiss.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Hildale motion to dismiss re notice of claim statute.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Hildale motion to dismiss and applicable case law.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Hildale motion to dismiss and scheduling depositions of Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Judge Teilborg's court with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re procedure for parties to request additional time for depositions in Judge Teilborg's absence.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical	

10/10/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Matura with Bill Walker re scheduling depositions and requesting extension from court.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/10/2013	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re conference call.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to all counsel re conference call re scheduling depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/10/2013	SRK	Email communications with Bill Richards re case status.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Coulson re obtaining original signature of George Barlow from ADOT records.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Coulson re commercial drivers license forms from George Barlow with additional signatures.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Coulson re affidavit from custodian of records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	SRK	Research re admissibility of records.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/10/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re admissibility of MVD records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re response to Hildale motion for leave to file motion to dismiss.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Bill Walker re litigation strategy.	0.7	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	BKK	Review defendants' motion to dismiss.	0.3	\$ 88.50		
10/10/2013	BKK	Legal research re notice of claim issues.	1.5	\$ 442.50		
10/10/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re litigation strategy.	5.5	\$ 1,622.50	Internal conference.	
10/10/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meetings with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh re Hildale Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Counts 6, 8, and 9 Against the Hildale Defendants for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Internal conference.	

10/10/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Sandra Kane regarding Hildale Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Counts 6, 8, and 9 Against the Hildale Defendants for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction and scheduling depositions for Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Duplicative of prior entry; internal conference.	
10/10/2013	LAR	Research notice of claim issues argued in Hildale Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Counts 6, 8, and 9 Against the Hildale Defendants for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction.	3.1	\$ 620.00	Duplicative of 10/10/2013 BKK.	
10/10/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding Hildale Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Counts 6, 8, and 9 Against the Hildale Defendants for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction and hiring a handwriting expert to determine the authenticity of the George Barlow letters.	0.5	\$ -	Duplicative of prior entry; internal conference.	Not awarded.
10/10/2013	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Counts 6, 8, and 9 Against the Hildale Defendants for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction.	1.8	\$ 360.00		
10/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker in preparation for conference call with counsel for Defendants.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/11/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re conference call re depositions of Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/11/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re admissibility of MVD records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/11/2013	SRK	Review deposition designation questions and related depositions.	3.40	\$ 1,003.00	Vague; excessive.	
10/11/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Jeff Matura re scheduling depositions of Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.	0.70	\$ 206.50		

10/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re depositions of Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re conversation with Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/11/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton, Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re conference call re deposition scheduling .	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/11/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	3.8	\$ 1,121.00	Internal conference.	
10/11/2013	BKK	Conference call with defense counsel.	0.1	\$ 29.50		
10/11/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits.	2.8	\$ 826.00	Vague; excessive.	
10/11/2013	BKK	Legal research re evidentiary issues.	2.3	\$ 678.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/11/2013	CH	prepare exhibits for trial	6.0	\$ 750.00	Vague; excessive.	
10/15/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re response to motion for leave to file motion to dismiss and status of depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/15/2013	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler re intimidation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/15/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re witness intimidation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re deposition scheduling and Willie Jessop.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/15/2013	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton, Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re scheduling depositions for Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
10/15/2013	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re witness intimidation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/15/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of business record affidavit from Custodian of Records.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

10/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Alicia of Judge Teilborg's court re motion to extend time for depositions and response to Hildale motion for leave to file a motion to dismiss state law fair housing counts.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical	
10/15/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re witness intimidation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/15/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re witness intimidation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re witness intimidation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/15/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re witness intimidation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/15/2013	SRK	Review and edit draft affidavit of custodian of records re MVD records.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/15/2013	SRK	Research re business record exception.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/15/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	5.0	\$ 1,475.00	Internal conference.	
10/15/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Bill Walker and defense counsel.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
10/15/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/15/2013	LAR	Research notice of claim requirements, and revise Plaintiffs' Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Counts 6, 8, and 9 Against the Hildale Defendants for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Duplicative of 10/10/2013 BKK & 10/10/2013 LAR.	
10/15/2013	LAR	Research evidentiary requirements for custodian of records 803(6), 902(11) for drafting affidavit of custodian of records for documentation containing George Barlow signatures.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
10/15/2013	LAR	Draft Declaration of Custodian of Records documents for sample George Barlow signatures.	1.0	\$ 200.00		

10/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re damage to vehicle.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Court Reporter Marty Herder re scheduling video depositions in St. George.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
10/16/2013	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re scheduling depositions.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re scheduling depositions of Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re certification of MVD records for handwriting expert .	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/16/2013	SRK	Draft email to Marty Herder.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
10/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re custodian of records affidavit re MVD records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/16/2013	SRK	Research re subpoenas for Utah depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re service of subpoenas.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re subpoenas and status of testimony from Willie Jessop.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/16/2013	SRK	Review affidavit of custodian of records of MVD and Conference with Leslie Ross and Brad Keogh re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of Joint Proposed Supplemental Final Pretrial Order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Isaac Wyler and Jethro Barlow re harassment.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/16/2013	SRK	Draft text message to Willie Jessop, and Telephone call from Willie Jessop.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/16/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	3.3	\$ 973.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/16/2013	BKK	Office conferences with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	4.7	\$ 1,386.50	Internal conference.	

10/16/2013	LAR	Research notice of claim requirements in Utah and Arizona for Plaintiffs' Response to Hildale Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Counts 6, 8, and 9 Against the Hildale Defendants for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction.	2.5	\$ 500.00	Excessive; duplicative of 10/10/2013 BKK, 10/10/2013 LAR & 10/15/2013 LAR.	
10/16/2013	LAR	Draft Second Supplement to Final Pretrial Order including designations for video exhibits and deposition designations for Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.	2.5	\$ 500.00		
10/17/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re deposition of Willie Jessop.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re deposition of Willie Jessop and logistics.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/17/2013	SRK	Draft Acceptance of Service of Deposition Subpoena for signature by Willie Jessop's attorney Mark James and forward to Bill Walker via email.	1.60	\$ 472.00	Excessive.	
10/17/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh with proposed edits of supplemental joint final pretrial order.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re Hildale Defendants' motion to dismiss.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/17/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents.	2.9	\$ 855.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/17/2013	BKK	Revise amended joint pretrial order.	2.0	\$ 590.00		
10/17/2013	BKK	Office conferences with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	2.1	\$ 619.50	Internal conference.	
10/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re supplemental joint final pretrial order and motion to dismiss state law claims.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/18/2013	SRK	Review court order denying Hildale Defendants' motion for leave to file motion to dismiss.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/18/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Ron and Jinjer Cooke and Katie Cox re order denying Hildale Defendants' motion for leave to file motion to dismiss.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

10/18/2013	SRK	Review subpoena to Patrick Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/18/2013	SRK	PF deposition of Willie Jessop.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/18/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re preparation for Willie Jessop's deposition and admissibility of Priesthood records.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re conference call re admissibility of Priesthood Records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/18/2013	SRK	Review transcript of 10/7/13 hearing re Plaintiffs' motion to reopen discovery.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
10/18/2013	SRK	Draft Subpoena for Deposition of Willie Jessop and email to AY Mark James re acceptance of service.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Clerical.	
10/18/2013	SRK	Research re service of subpoena.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re amending notice of deposition.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re trial preparation, deposition designations, video designations, and docket deadlines.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
10/18/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents and trial exhibits.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/18/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
10/21/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re deposition designations.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
10/21/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of expert disclosure re handwriting analysis.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/21/2013	SRK	Review and edit draft supplement to pretrial order.	3.40	\$ 1,003.00		
10/21/2013	SRK	Review second amended deposition notice for Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Mark James re deposition notice for Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/21/2013	SRK	Review email from Mark James and executed Acceptance of Service, and Draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

10/21/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re filing Acceptance of Service.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/21/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re handwriting analysis.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/21/2013	SRK	Research re standard for expert opinions and contents of expert report.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
10/21/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re meeting re admissibility of evidence, and reply .	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross with Plaintiffs' draft proposed supplement to final pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/21/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	6.8	\$ 2,006.00	Internal conference.	
10/21/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	2.2	\$ 649.00	Vague; excessive.	
10/21/2013	LAR	Review Brian Meldrum's deposition regarding information pertaining to surveillance systems in preparation for Patrick Barlow's deposition.	1.2	\$ 240.00		
10/21/2013	LAR	Read Order denying Hildale Defendants' Motion to Dismiss Counts 6, 8, and 9 Against the Hildale Defendants for Lack of Subject Matter Jurisdiction.	0.1	\$ 20.00		
10/21/2013	LAR	Review Brad Keogh's revisions to draft of Second Supplement to Final Pretrial Order.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
10/21/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding preparation of expert disclosure for handwriting expert.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
10/21/2013	LAR	Review transcript from 10/4/2013 hearing to reopen discovery to ensure compliance.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
10/21/2013	LAR	Review Vincen Barlow's deposition testimony in preparation for Patrick Barlow's deposition.	0.8	\$ 160.00		
10/21/2013	LAR	Draft Notice of Filing acceptance of service for Willie Jessop's deposition.	2.8	\$ 560.00	Excessive.	

10/21/2013	LAR	Review Vincen Barlow's and Helaman Barlow's depositions in preparation for Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop's depositions.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
10/22/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re Plaintiffs' draft Supplement to Pretrial Order and arrangements for depositions.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/22/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of expert disclosure.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/22/2013	SRK	Prepare documents for deposition of Willie Jessop.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
10/22/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re preparation for deposition of Willie Jessop.	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	
10/22/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re draft Supplement to Final Pretrial Order.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
10/22/2013	SRK	PF deposition of Willie Jessop.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
10/22/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	7.0	\$ 2,065.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
10/22/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	2.4	\$ 708.00	Vague; excessive.	
10/22/2013	BKK	Legal research re admissibility of handwriting expert opinions.	0.6	\$ 177.00		
10/22/2013	LAR	Review Second Supplement to Final Pretrial Order and Sandra Kane's e-mail to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura regarding same.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
10/22/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra re exhibits and deposition designations	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
10/22/2013	CH	work on additional exhibits	1.0	\$ 125.00	Vague; clerical.	
10/23/2013	SRK	PF deposition of Willie Jessop.	4.30	\$ 1,268.50	Duplicative of 10/22/2013 SRK.	
10/23/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re applicable evidentiary rules re admissibility of Priesthood Records and correspondence to Church leaders.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

10/23/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re evidentiary rules re admissibility of Priesthood Records and correspondence to Church leaders and deposition of Willie Jessop.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re witness intimidation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re witness intimidation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	SRK	Review emails from Leslie Ross re documents and exhibits in preparation for Willie Jessop's deposition.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re handwriting analysis of George Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re handwriting analysis of George Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re trial strategy.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re Order denying Hildale Defendants' Motion to Dismiss.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	SRK	Review Texas deposition of Willie Jessop in preparation for deposition.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re evidentiary issues.	4.8	\$ 1,416.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
10/23/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Richards re evidentiary issues.	0.8	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	BKK	Legal research re Rule 803, FRE.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/23/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	LAR	Research trial exhibits and disclosed documents to locate references to George Barlow in preparation for Willie Jessop and Patrick Barlow's depositions.	1.1	\$ 220.00		

10/23/2013	LAR	Conference with Bill Walker, Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding evidentiary issues and Willie Jessop's deposition.	1.2	\$ 240.00	Internal conference.	
10/23/2013	LAR	Review Willie Jessop's deposition from Texas and other UEP related depositions regarding Willie Jessop in preparation for his deposition.	0.9	\$ 180.00	Duplicative of 10/23/2013 SRK.	
10/24/2013	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler re additional harassment of non-FLDS in Colorado City.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
10/24/2013	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re additional harassment of non-FLDS in Colorado City.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
10/24/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re coordinating trip to St. George for depositions.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
10/24/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh and potential exhibits for Willie Jessop's deposition, and prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re same.	4.60	\$ 1,357.00	Block billing; internal conference.	Objection overruled.
10/24/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	3.9	\$ 1,150.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/24/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	4.7	\$ 1,386.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
10/24/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding preparation for Willie Jessop's deposition.	3.5	\$ 700.00	Internal conference.	
10/24/2013	LAR	Research affidavits and declarations filed on behalf of Willie Jessop in preparation for his deposition.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
10/25/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of exhibits for Willie Jessop's deposition.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Charlotte Haight re Telephone call to Rachel Ruthenberg of Jeff Matura's Office re errors in deposition designations and highlighting.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

10/25/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Arman Nafisi re video and audio exhibit designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
10/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re handwriting analysis.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
10/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Rose Urbanski of Drake Group re expert handwriting analysis.	0.30	\$ 88.50	
10/25/2013	SRK	Prepare documents for handwriting analysis by Drake Group.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Clerical.
10/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re expert witness agreement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
10/25/2013	SRK	Telephone call to procurement director Jerry Connolly re expert witness agreement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
10/25/2013	SRK	Meeting with handwriting expert Rosemarie Urbanski in Scottsdale.	0.80	\$ 236.00	
10/26/2013	SRK	Prepare for deposition of Willie Jessop.	8.50	\$ 2,507.50	Duplicative of 10/22/2013 SRK & 10/23/2013 SRK.
10/27/2013	SRK	Meeting with Willie Jessop and Bill Walker in St. George UT in preparation for deposition of Willie Jessop.	6.50	\$ 1,917.50	
10/28/2013	SRK	PF deposition of Willie Jessop.	4.00	\$ 1,180.00	Duplicative of 10/22/2013 SRK, 10/23/2013 SRK & 10/26/2013 SRK.
10/28/2013	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker and Patrick Barlow in preparation for deposition of Patrick Barlow .	5.50	\$ 1,622.50	
10/28/2013	LAR	Review Sandra Kane's e-mail regarding expert and George Barlow related exhibits and gather same.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.
10/28/2013	LAR	Draft email to handwriting expert Rosemarie Urbanski explaining Fed. R. Civ. P. 26 requirements for expert reports.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Clerical.
10/28/2013	LAR	Review Joseph Allred's deposition in preparation for trial.	0.7	\$ 140.00	
10/28/2013	LAR	Draft expert witness disclosure for handwriting expert Rosemarie Urbanski.	0.6	\$ 120.00	

10/29/2013	SRK	Meeting with Patrick Barlow and Bill Walker in preparation for deposition.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/29/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Patrick Barlow's deposition and Meeting with Patrick Barlow and Bill Walker.	10.00	\$ 2,950.00	Duplicative of prior entry; block billing.	Objection overruled.
10/29/2013	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker in preparation for deposition of Willie Jessop and related exhibits.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/29/2013	SRK	PF deposition of Willie Jessop.	2.20	\$ 649.00	Duplicative of 10/22/2013, 10/23/2013 SRK, 10/26/2013 SRK & 10/28/2013.	
10/29/2013	LAR	Revise expert witness disclosure for handwriting expert Rosemarie Urbanski.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
10/29/2013	LAR	E-mail draft of expert disclosure to Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh for review.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
10/30/2013	SRK	PF deposition of Willie Jessop.	4.50	\$ 1,327.50	Duplicative of 10/22/2013, 10/23/2013 SRK, 10/26/2013 SRK, 10/28/2013 & 10/29/2013.	
10/30/2013	SRK	Deposition of Willie Jessop.	7.40	\$ 2,183.00		
10/30/2013	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker re deposition of Willie Jessop.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
10/30/2013	SRK	Review emails from Leslie Ross re status of expert report from Rosemarie Urbanski.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
10/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Leslie Ross re status of expert report and depositions.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Rosemarie Urbanski re status of expert report.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
10/30/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Vague; excessive.	
10/30/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Leslie Ross re evidentiary issues.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	

10/30/2013	LAR	Draft email to handwriting expert, Rosemarie Urbanski re case caption.	0.1	\$ 20.00		
10/30/2013	LAR	Research Fed.R.Civ.P. 26(a)(2)(B) requirements.	0.1	\$ 20.00		
10/30/2013	LAR	Draft email to Rosemarie Urbanski regarding Fed.R.Civ.P. 26(a)(2)(B) requirements.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
10/30/2013	LAR	Draft email to Brad Keogh regarding Fed.R.Civ.P. 26(a)(2)(B) requirements.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
10/31/2013	SRK	Review email with draft expert report from Rosemarie Urbanski.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
10/31/2013	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross and Brad Keogh re draft expert report.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
10/31/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re draft expert report.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
10/31/2013	BKK	Review handwriting expert report.	1.2	\$ 354.00		
10/31/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Vague; excessive.	
10/31/2013	BKK	Draft memorandum to Sandra Kane re trial issues.	0.9	\$ 265.50	Internal conference.	
10/31/2013	BKK	Office conference with Ann Hobart re trial issues.	1.9	\$ 560.50	Internal conference.	
11/01/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of new exhibits and expert witness report.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/01/2013	SRK	Review email from Rosemarie Urbanski and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/01/2013	SRK	Review expert report re handwriting analysis and attachments from Rosemarie Urbanski.	1.20	\$ 354.00		
11/01/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re handwriting analysis and attachments from Rosemarie Urbanski.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/01/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh re handwriting analysis and attachments from Rosemarie Urbanski.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
11/01/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Rosemarie Urbanski re expert report with Brad Keogh.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/01/2013	SRK	Work with Leslie Ross re drafting Rule 26 expert witness disclosure.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	

11/01/2013	SRK	Review and edit notice of service of expert witness disclosure.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/01/2013	SRK	Review and edit supplement to final pretrial order.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/01/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton requesting Defendants' additions to supplement to final pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/01/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re Defendants' additions to supplement to final pretrial order.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
11/01/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' draft additions to supplement to final pretrial order.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
11/01/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Bill Walker re objections to Defendants' additional witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/01/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re objections to Defendants' additional witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/01/2013	SRK	Draft objections to Defendants' additional witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/01/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with revised supplement to final pretrial order for review.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/01/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura approving revisions to supplement to final pretrial order.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
11/01/2013	SRK	Review email from Rosemarie Urbanski with final expert report.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
11/01/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' expert disclosure and expert report.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/01/2013	SRK	Draft email to Rosemarie Urbanski forwarding Defendants' expert report.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/01/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re litigation strategy issues.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/01/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
11/01/2013	BKK	Review expert reports re cross-examination issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50		

11/01/2013	LAR	Review Rosemarie Urbanski's expert report regarding Mayor George Barlow's signatures.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Duplicative of 11/1/2013 SRK.	
11/01/2013	LAR	Draft Notice of Disclosure of Expert Witness report.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Excessive.	
11/01/2013	LAR	Draft Notice of Service of trial exhibits.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Excessive.	
11/01/2013	LAR	Draft Supplement to Pretrial Order.	2.5	\$ 500.00	Excessive.	
11/01/2013	LAR	Draft email to Defendants' regarding exhibits and expert witness report.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
11/01/2013	CH	prepare exhibits	4.5	\$ 562.50	Vague; excessive.	
11/04/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross in preparation for Meeting with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh on trial preparation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re trial preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/04/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re depositions in St. George and trial strategy.	3.00	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
11/04/2013	SRK	Review email from Rosemarie Urbanski.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
11/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Rosemarie Urbanski re Defendants' expert report.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/04/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re litigation strategy issues.	3.8	\$ 1,121.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/04/2013	BKK	Review defendants' expert handwriting report.	0.4	\$ 118.00		
11/04/2013	BKK	Review documents re Bruce Wisan testimony.	4.3	\$ 1,268.50	Excessive; not used at trial.	
11/04/2013	LAR	Review Cooke videos that are trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	2.2	\$ 440.00		
11/04/2013	LAR	Prepare for meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh to review expert report.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
11/04/2013	LAR	Prepare for trial preparation meeting.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
11/05/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re meeting.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	

11/05/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Leslie Ross re meeting.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
11/05/2013	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re trial preparation.	6.20	\$ 1,829.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/05/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re strategy for use of live witnesses at trial.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/05/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Sandra Kane and Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	7.5	\$ 2,212.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/05/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Richards re litigation strategy issues.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
11/06/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re trial preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call to jury consultant David Wenner with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Bill Richards.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
11/06/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re trial preparation meeting.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/06/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re litigation strategy issues.	3.8	\$ 1,121.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/06/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with David Wenner.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/06/2013	BKK	Review Nick Hanna and Helaman Barlow deposition transcripts.	3.1	\$ 914.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
11/06/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re evidentiary issues.	1.8	\$ 531.00		
11/06/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
11/07/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re article re Willie Jessop, her current physical and mental situation, and trial.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
11/07/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re jury consultant and preparation for focus groups.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/07/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re focus jury groups.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/07/2013	SRK	Review and edit deposition designation correction memo.	2.70	\$ 796.50		

11/07/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re deposition designations questions.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/07/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts and trial exhibits.	3.0	\$ 885.00		
11/07/2013	BKK	Legal research re admissibility issues.	1.9	\$ 560.50	Vague; excessive.	
11/07/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re evidentiary issues.	3.1	\$ 914.50	Vague; excessive.	
11/07/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	3.8	\$ 760.00		
11/07/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra; edits to page/line errors	1.0	\$ 125.00	Internal conference.	
11/08/2013	SRK	Review pretrial order.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/08/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Zachary Renstrom re trial schedule and availability.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/08/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits and deposition transcripts.	4.1	\$ 1,209.50	Vague; excessive.	
11/08/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re evidentiary issues.	2.4	\$ 708.00	Vague; excessive.	
11/08/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
11/10/2013	SRK	Review Plaintiff-Intervenor's Response to Defendants' MSJ and Order re MSJ in preparation for trial.	6.20	\$ 1,829.00		
11/11/2013	SRK	Review Deposition of Willie Jessop.	5.50	\$ 1,622.50	Excessive.	
11/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re opening statements and preparation for focus jury.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/11/2013	SRK	Work on issues to raise in opening statement.	2.20	\$ 649.00		
11/11/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits. Import exhibits into Trial Director in preparation for trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Clerical.	
11/12/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross in preparation for trial.	6.00	\$ 1,770.00	Internal conference.	
11/12/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts.	3.6	\$ 1,062.00	Vague; excessive.	
11/12/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross and Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	

11/12/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re evidentiary issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00		
11/12/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	5.3	\$ 1,060.00		
11/12/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend trial preparation meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, and Brad Keogh.	4.6	\$ 920.00	Internal conference.	
11/13/2013	SRK	Conference with Donna ChrisJohn re preparation of exhibits and related tasks.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re trial preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/13/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re trial witnesses and exhibits.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re Colorado City incidents.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/13/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re jury consultant.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/13/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re deposition designation line error corrections.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/13/2013	SRK	Update impeachment file.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/13/2013	SRK	Review deposition of Brian Meldrum.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
11/13/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Vague; excessive.	
11/13/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
11/13/2013	BKK	Legal research re injunctive relief issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00		
11/13/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	1.4	\$ 280.00		
11/13/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding Cooke exhibits and determining which exhibits should be used with specific witnesses.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
11/13/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00		

11/14/2013	SRK	Meeting with paralegal Charlotte Haught, secretary Donna ChrisJohn and AAG Leslie Ross re preparation of trial exhibits, deposition designations, courtroom technology, subpoenas, costs.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
11/14/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re trial witnesses and subpoenas.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/14/2013	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Rose Urbanski and Bill Walker re expert invoice.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
11/14/2013	SRK	Draft expert witness agreement for David Wenner.	1.70	\$ 501.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
11/14/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcript of Willie Jessop.	1.0	\$ 295.00		
11/14/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy.	5.5	\$ 1,622.50	Internal conference.	
11/14/2013	LAR	Prepare and attend trial preparation meeting with Sandra Kane, Donna Chrisjohn, and Charlotte Haught.	1.4	\$ 280.00	Internal conference.	
11/14/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	5.0	\$ 1,000.00		
11/14/2013	CH	attend meeting with Sandra, Leslie and Donna	2.0	\$ 250.00	Internal conference.	
11/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Judge Teilborg's court re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
11/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Patrick Barlow's testimony.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/15/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Patrick Barlow testimony.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re focus jury preparation, and Nick Hanna availability for trial.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Nick Hanna with Bill Richards.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/15/2013	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards re status of focus jury.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/15/2013	SRK	Email communications with Nick Hanna re trial preparation and logistics.	0.30	\$ 88.50		

11/15/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re Helaman Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/15/2013	SRK	Email communications with procurement director Jerry Connolly re expert witness agreement with David Wenner.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
11/15/2013	SRK	Draft reply to Brad Keogh re Helaman Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re deposition designations for Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re meeting and focus jury status.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to David Wenner re focus jury status and agreement .	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/15/2013	SRK	Draft email to David Wenner with draft agreement.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Leslie Ross re materials for David Wenner.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/15/2013	SRK	Draft email to David Wenner re case materials.	0.40	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/15/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re miscellaneous designation issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/15/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Brad Keogh re deposition of Willie Jessop.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/15/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts re trial issues.	7.5	\$ 2,212.50	Vague; excessive.	
11/15/2013	LAR	Compile Judge Teilborg's Order on dispositive motions, Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Response to Defendants' Motions for Summary Judgment, fact and legal issue sections of the Amended Final Pretrial Order, and Stipulated Statement of the Case for jury focus group consultant.	1.0	\$ -	Clerical.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/16/2013	SRK	Draft response to Brad Keogh re Willie Jessop's deposition testimony.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/16/2013	SRK	Analyze key events to include in trial and Draft email to Bill Walker re same.	0.80	\$ 236.00		

11/16/2013	SRK	Review exhibits re ruling in related litigation re Robert Black, and Draft email to Leslie Ross re evidence re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/16/2013	SRK	Research re Rules of Evidence re admission of Priesthood records in preparation for Telephone call to Nick Hanna.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
11/16/2013	SRK	Review Helaman Barlow's deposition testimony.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
11/17/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
11/18/2013	SRK	Review email from Zach Renstrom.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
11/18/2013	SRK	Review emails from Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Nick Hanna.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
11/18/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re assembling exhibits for Nick Hanna.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/18/2013	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker re video and audio designations, deposition designations, contact with witnesses, subpoenas, focus jury, and legal arguments.	0.70	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Matura re deposition designations.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
11/18/2013	SRK	Review Brian Zitting's deposition for key issue. Conference with Leslie Ross re Priesthood Records.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/18/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re identifying Priesthood Records to use at trial.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re subpoenas and trial exhibit.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton re Jerry Barlow's address and attendance at trial.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re addresses for witness subpoenas .	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re meeting in preparation for mock jury presentations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

11/18/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Willie Jessop deposition designations and issues raised in deposition.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
11/18/2013	SRK	Review emails between Bill Walker and Jeff Matura re acceptance of subpoenas for trial witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/18/2013	SRK	Work on identifying Priesthood Records for trial, including Review file for Priesthood Records, Draft emails to Donna ChrisJohn re Priesthood Records, Draft email to Leslie Ross re Priesthood Records.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Block billing; internal conference.	Objection overruled.
11/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re deposition designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/18/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re Curtis Cooke occupancy agreement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/18/2013	SRK	Review part of audio of 12/28/09 Utility Board Meeting.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
11/18/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts re trial issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Vague; excessive.	
11/18/2013	BKK	Draft memorandum of designations.	3.2	\$ 944.00	Vague; excessive.	
11/18/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re trial issues.	1.8	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.	
11/18/2013	LAR	Compile and review Nick Hanna exhibits for Nick Hanna to review in preparation for his trial preparation sessions.	5.0	\$ 1,000.00	Excessive.	
11/19/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re designation of excerpts of video depositions for trial, and exhibits relating to Nick Hanna testimony,.	1.70	\$ 501.50	Internal conference.	
11/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re status and procedure for preparation of subpoenas, status of focus jury, acceptance of service of subpoenas, and witness preparation.	0.50	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call to David Wenner's office with Bill Walker re focus jury specifications and arrangements.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.

11/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Marvin Wilson's office with Bill Walker to arrange conference call.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Matura's office re designations of depositions and use of video and audio excerpts of depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/19/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re identification of exhibits for Nick Hanna testimony.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/19/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re impeachment exhibit for Vance Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/19/2013	SRK	Email communications with Brad Keogh re impeachment of Joseph Allred.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/19/2013	SRK	Review deposition designations for Willie Jessop.	2.10	\$ 619.50		
11/19/2013	SRK	Review response email from Blake Hamilton re Jerry Barlow's whereabouts and acceptance of service, and Draft email to Bill Walker re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/19/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts and trial exhibits.	1.1	\$ 324.50	Vague; excessive.	
11/19/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	3.4	\$ 1,003.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/19/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re cross-examination issues.	1.5	\$ 442.50		
11/19/2013	LAR	Review Brian Zitting's statements at the 12/28/2009 utility board meeting to ensure that audio section pertaining to discussion of infill situation is included in Final Pretrial Order.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
11/19/2013	LAR	Review and compile Nick Hanna exhibits containing Warren Jeffs's priesthood records and letters to Warren Jeffs for Nick Hanna to review in preparation for his trial preparation sessions.	4.5	\$ 900.00	Excessive; duplicative of 11/18/2013 LAR.	

11/19/2013	LAR	Review and prepare for meeting with Sandra Kane regarding designation of video depositions, and exhibits relating to Nick Hanna's testimony in preparation for witness preparation sessions with Nick Hanna.	1.7	\$ 340.00	Duplicative of prior entry; internal conference.	
11/20/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re trial preparation meeting.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/20/2013	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Jeff Matura re designations for depositions, and video and audio exhibits.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
11/20/2013	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re trial preparation, and Telephone call to David Wenner by group re jury focus groups.	2.50	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/20/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh and Bill Richards re Nick Hanna trial testimony and trial strategy.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
11/20/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross, Bill Richards and Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	4.6	\$ 1,357.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/20/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Diana Stabler, Gary Maschner, and Sandra Kane.	3.4	\$ 1,003.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/20/2013	LAR	Trial preparation meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, and Bill Richards.	4.5	\$ 900.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/20/2013	LAR	Review and prepare exhibits relating to Nick Hanna's testimony for Nick Hanna to review in preparation for his trial preparation sessions.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Duplicative of 11/18/2013 LAR & 11/19/2013 LAR.	
11/21/2013	SRK	Review email and video from Bill Walker re Willie Jessop.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/21/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re subpoenas and preparation for focus groups and trial.	0.70	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross and Bill Richards re preparation for focus groups.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.

11/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re format for video exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/21/2013	SRK	Conference with Arman Nafisi re excerpts of video exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
11/21/2013	SRK	Review email from Marvin Wilson.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
11/21/2013	SRK	Conference call to Marvin Wilson with Bill Walker re arrange telephonic meeting in preparation for trial.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
11/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re date for designating video and audio and deposition excerpts.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
11/21/2013	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re serving witness subpoenas .	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
11/21/2013	SRK	Review invoices for video depositions and Draft email to Marty Herder re same.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
11/21/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Guy Timpson re trial preparation.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
11/21/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents.	1.6	\$ 472.00	Vague; excessive.	
11/21/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.4	\$ 413.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/21/2013	LAR	Review and prepare exhibits pertaining to Nick Hanna's testimony for Nick Hanna to review in preparation for his trial preparation sessions.	5.6	\$ 1,120.00	Excessive; duplicative of 11/18/2013 LAR, 11/19/2013 LAR & 11/20/2013 LAR.	
11/22/2013	SRK	Review Salt Lake Tribune articles and video interview of Bruce Wisan re Colorado City issues in preparation for trial testimony.	1.80	\$ 531.00	Excessive because it was not used at trial.	
11/22/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re jury focus group presentation.	0.50	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/22/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re Willie Jessop letter.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/22/2013	SRK	Email communications with Brad Keogh re Helaman Barlow testimony.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
11/22/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross to Review trial exhibits for Nick Hanna.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	

11/22/2013	SRK	Telephone call from David Wenner re jury focus groups.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/22/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re jury focus groups.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/22/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re jury focus groups.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/22/2013	SRK	Telephone call to David Wenner with Brad Keogh re jury focus groups.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/22/2013	SRK	Conference with Donna ChrisJohn re hotel accommodations for trial witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/22/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re hotel accommodations for trial witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
11/22/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Bill Richards re status of jury focus group.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/22/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Rick Bistrow, Tom Chenal and Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/22/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts.	3.2	\$ 944.00	Vague; excessive.	
11/22/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re cross-examination issues.	0.8	\$ 236.00		
11/22/2013	LAR	Review and prepare exhibits relating to Robert Foster's testimony for Robert Foster's review in preparation for his trial preparation sessions.	3.3	\$ 660.00		
11/22/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding arguments to make and exhibits to present to jury focus group.	0.5	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/22/2013	LAR	Listen to and prepare designations of audio clips for the 9/18/2009 and 12/28/2009 utility board meetings to compare to Jethro Barlow's demonstrative exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
11/24/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker with research re need for search warrant to investigate easement.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	

11/24/2013	SRK	Edit Letters to witnesses re trial logistics, travel expenses and procedures, and service of subpoenas..	1.70	\$ 501.50	Clerical.	
11/24/2013	LAR	Listen to and prepare designations of audio clips for the 9/18/2009 and 12/28/2009 utility board meetings to compare to Jethro Barlow's demonstrative exhibits in preparation for trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Excessive; duplicative of 11/22/2013 LAR.	
11/25/2013	SRK	PF jury focus group.	4.30	\$ -	Excessive; internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
11/25/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/25/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits and FLDS documents.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Vague; excessive.	
11/25/2013	LAR	Listen to and prepare designations of audio clips for the 9/18/2009 and 12/28/2009 utility board meetings to compare to Jethro Barlow's demonstrative exhibits in preparation for trial.	8.4	\$ 1,680.00	Excessive; duplicative of 11/22/2013 LAR & 11/24/2013 LAR.	
11/26/2013	SRK	Prepare for telephone communications with Marv Wilson of Sunrise Engineering re water reports and opinions.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
11/26/2013	SRK	Telephone communications with Marv Wilson and Bill Walker re water reports and opinions.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
11/26/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	2.7	\$ 796.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
11/26/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	0.8	\$ 236.00		
11/26/2013	LAR	Draft email to Dennis Martin regarding issues displaying video files in Trial Director.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Clerical.	

11/26/2013	LAR	Review notes and draft emails concerning proposed designations for 9/18/2009 and 12/28/2009 utility board meetings to compare to Jethro Barlow's demonstrative exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Clerical.	
11/26/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	4.6	\$ 920.00		
11/26/2013	LAR	Review and prepare Nick Hanna and Robert Foster related exhibits for their review prior to their trial preparation sessions.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
11/26/2013	CH	follow up on problem with Exhibit 216; leave message for Brian Lalley re technology overview	0.7	\$ 87.50	Clerical.	
11/27/2013	BKK	Legal research re evidentiary issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50		
11/27/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	0.7	\$ 206.50		
11/29/2013	BKK	Legal research re evidentiary issues.	1.4	\$ 413.00		
11/29/2013	BKK	Review FLDS documents.	3.1	\$ 914.50	Vague; excessive.	
11/29/2013	LAR	Draft designations for audio recordings of utility board meetings for trial.	7.0	\$ 1,400.00	Clerical.	
11/29/2013	CH	prepare exhibits	7.5	\$ 937.50	Clerical; vague; excessive.	
12/01/2013	SRK	Work on presentation for focus jury.	4.20	\$ -	Excessive.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/02/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re audio designations for Utility Board Meeting.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/02/2013	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Nick Hanna's trial testimony and related FLDS documents.	2.20	\$ 649.00	Internal conference.	
12/02/2013	SRK	Conference with Donna ChrisJohn re preparation of trial witness subpoenas and travel arrangements.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/02/2013	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Charlotte Haught re identifying and redacting FLDS-related trial exhibits.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
12/02/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross to Review and categorize FLDS-related trial exhibits for Nick Hanna testimony.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	

12/02/2013	SRK	Review email from David Wenner re focus jury group.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/02/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Ann Hobart re focus jury group.	0.10	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/02/2013	SRK	Telephone call to David Wenner re jury focus group.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/02/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re emergency situation.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/02/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re proposed stipulation to Phoenix jury pool.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/02/2013	SRK	Draft reply to Jeff Matura re proposed stipulation to Phoenix jury pool.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/02/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re proposed stipulation to Phoenix jury pool.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
12/02/2013	SRK	Draft notes re FLDS related trial exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/02/2013	SRK	Review emails from Ann Hobart and Bill Walker re waiver of Prescott Jury Pool, and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/02/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re evidentiary issues.	1.6	\$ 472.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
12/02/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re Nick Hanna testimony issues.	2.4	\$ 708.00		
12/02/2013	LAR	Categorize and review selected Nick Hanna and Robert Foster related trial exhibits for their review prior to their trial preparation sessions.	5.3	\$ 1,060.00	Clerical.	
12/02/2013	LAR	Draft designations for audio recordings of utility board meetings for trial.	1.4	\$ 280.00	Clerical.	
12/02/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane	0.3	\$ 37.50	Vague; internal conference.	
12/02/2013	CH	emails for Sandra Kane	0.1	\$ 12.50	Vague; internal conference.	
12/03/2013	SRK	Review Leslie Ross' memo re Priesthood Records.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/03/2013	SRK	Identify exhibits for Nick Hanna's testimony.	2.30	\$ 678.50		

12/03/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re redacting exhibits, and Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re exhibits for Nick Hanna's testimony and redacting.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Nick Hanna re trial preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/03/2013	SRK	Draft letters to witnesses re trial date, subpoenas and procedures re travel expenses.	2.10	\$ 619.50	Clerical; excessive.	
12/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re jury focus group preparation.	0.40	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re service of trial subpoenas.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/03/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Isaac Wyler re service of trial subpoenas.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/03/2013	BKK	Telephone conferences with Bruce Wisan and Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	0.8	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
12/03/2013	BKK	Legal research re search warrant issues.	3.7	\$ 1,091.50	Excessive; not related to claims.	
12/03/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re cross-examination issues.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50		
12/03/2013	LAR	Phone call with Sandra Kane regarding questions my notations regarding trial exhibits for Nick Hanna's testimony.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
12/03/2013	LAR	Review unofficial transcript from 9/18/2009 utility board meeting and Exhibit 350 (audio recording of same) to determine audio designations for trial.	4.2	\$ 840.00	Excessive.	
12/03/2013	LAR	Categorize and review selected exhibits for Nick Hanna's testimony in preparation for Nick Hanna's trial preparation sessions.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
12/03/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane and Charlotte Haught regarding redactions necessary for Nick Hanna trial exhibits.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference.	

12/03/2013	CH	telephone call with ISS tech re courtroom tech visit	0.4	\$ 50.00	Clerical.	
12/03/2013	CH	telephone call with Leslie re exhibits; telephone call with Clerk Teddy re exhibits	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical.	
12/04/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re presentation for focus group and audio designations for trial exhibit.	0.40	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/04/2013	SRK	Prepare focus jury presentation.	1.30	\$ -	Excessive.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/04/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re focus jury presentation.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call to David Wenner re focus jury event.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/04/2013	SRK	Telephone call to procurement director Jerry Connolly re focus jury group agreement.	0.30	\$ -	Clerical.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/04/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Bill Richards re focus jury group agreement.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/04/2013	BKK	Redact inadmissible material from trial exhibits.	1.2	\$ 354.00		
12/04/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.8	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.	
12/04/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts re evidentiary issues preparation.	4.0	\$ 1,180.00	Vague; excessive.	
12/04/2013	LAR	Review unofficial transcript from 9/18/2009 utility board meeting and Exhibit 350 (audio recording of same) to determine audio designations for trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Excessive; duplicative of 12/3/2013 LAR.	
12/04/2013	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane detailing review of 9/18/2009 utility board and recommended designations.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
12/04/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
12/05/2013	SRK	Work on focus jury presentation.	3.00	\$ -	Excessive.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/05/2013	SRK	Conference call with David Wenner, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Bill Richards in preparation for focus jury presentation.	1.00	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.

12/05/2013	SRK	Communications with David Wenner and Jerry Connolly re contract for focus jury presentation.	1.40	\$ -	Clerical; internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/05/2013	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Donna Chrisjohn re preparation of travel expense checks to accompany witness subpoenas.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
12/05/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re order of witnesses and dates of trial testimony for subpoenas.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
12/05/2013	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross to Bill Walker's office re color version of Patrick Barlow's photos.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/05/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re focus jury presentation.	1.00	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/05/2013	SRK	Review pleadings in preparation for focus jury presentation.	2.30	\$ -	Excessive; duplicative.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/05/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding focus jury presentation.	1.0	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/05/2013	LAR	Meeting with Brad Keogh regarding Nick Hanna trial exhibits and redactions for those exhibits.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
12/06/2013	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re issues of concern re focus jury.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/06/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Brad Keogh re questions for focus jurors.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/06/2013	SRK	Draft email to David Wenner re questions for focus jurors.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/06/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re additional jury instructions to send to David Wenner.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/06/2013	SRK	Draft email to David Wenner re jury instructions.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/06/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Bill Richards re verdict form and jury instructions.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/06/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Ann Hobart re service of witness subpoenas.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/06/2013	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re focus jury.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.

12/06/2013	SRK	Work on presentation for focus jury.	3.60	\$ -	Excessive; duplicative.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/06/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	
12/06/2013	BKK	Prepare demonstrative exhibits for trial.	1.5	\$ 442.50		
12/06/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re cross-examination issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50		
12/06/2013	LAR	Import trial exhibits into Trial Director in preparation for trial.	2.3	\$ 460.00	Clerical.	
12/06/2013	LAR	Review and prepare trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
12/06/2013	LAR	Create PowerPoint presentation for jury focus group.	4.0	\$ -	Clerical.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/06/2013	CH	e-mails	0.2	\$ 25.00	Vague.	
12/06/2013	CH	prepare exhibits	5.1	\$ 637.50	Vague; excessive.	
12/07/2013	LAR	Create Trial Director presentation for jury focus group.	3.5	\$ -	Clerical.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/08/2013	SRK	Draft presentation for focus jury group.	10.40	\$ -	Excessive; duplicative.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/08/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re editing presentation and preparation of exhibits for focus jury group presentation.	5.30	\$ -	Excessive; duplicative; internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/08/2013	LAR	Prepare printed and video exhibits for jury focus group.	3.0	\$ -	Clerical; excessive.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/08/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane to develop and practice opening statement for jury focus group.	5.0	\$ -	Duplicative; internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/09/2013	SRK	Participate in all day jury focus group session with trial consultant David Wenner, Bill Walker and Bill Richards at Focus Market Research Center in preparation for trial.	9.50	\$ -	Excessive.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/09/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend jury focus group presentation.	12.0	\$ -	Excessive; duplicative.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/09/2013	LAR	Trial preparation: attend jury focus group.	10.5	\$ -	Excessive; duplicative.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/10/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re result of focus jury group and trial preparation.	1.50	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.

12/10/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re documents to send to Nick Hanna for review, witnesses and trial preparation.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/10/2013	SRK	Email and telephone communications with Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re scheduling moot court session for openings and closings .	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/10/2013	SRK	Email communications with Bill Walker re Research on obligation of municipalities to post supersedeas bond.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
12/10/2013	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Motion for Reconsideration, and Order denying Motion as untimely.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
12/10/2013	SRK	Review email from Nick Hanna re affidavit and identifying exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/10/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re new developments re FLDS leadership and potential impact upon litigation.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
12/10/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
12/10/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	3.1	\$ 914.50	Vague; excessive.	
12/10/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re cross-examination issues.	0.9	\$ 265.50		
12/10/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding jury focus group and trial preparation.	4.5	\$ -	Excessive; internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/10/2013	CH	telephone calls with Donna and to Judge Teilborg chambers	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical.	
12/11/2013	SRK	Work on designations of video and audio exhibits.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Clerical.	
12/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re new developments in Colorado City.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/11/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker with proposed designations of video, audio and depositions.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	

12/11/2013	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re exhibits to send to Nick Hanna in preparation for trial testimony, and Draft email to Nick Hanna, Draft LT Nick Hanna, Draft Subpoena to Nick Hanna.	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
12/11/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re evidentiary rules for admission of documents through Nick Hanna.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/11/2013	SRK	Review trial exhibits re FLDS documents seized in Colorado, and Review exhibits from Helaman Barlow's deposition.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
12/11/2013	SRK	Meeting with Brian Lalley re use of technology in courtroom.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Clerical.	
12/11/2013	SRK	Telephone call from David Wenner re trial presentation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/11/2013	BKK	Draft Patrick Barlow deposition designations.	1.7	\$ 501.50		
12/11/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	2.6	\$ 767.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
12/11/2013	BKK	Attend courtroom technology meeting.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Clerical.	
12/11/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	2.7	\$ 796.50	Vague; excessive.	
12/11/2013	LAR	Review Nick Hanna exhibits to ensure that we have included all exhibits relevant to Nick Hanna's testimony. Categorize Nick Hanna exhibits.	2.5	\$ 500.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
12/11/2013	LAR	Trial preparation: Attend meeting with courtroom IT personnel Brian regarding technology in Judge Teilborg's courtroom.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Clerical; duplicative.	
12/11/2013	CH	attend courtroom technology overview	1.8	\$ 225.00	Clerical; duplicative.	
12/12/2013	SRK	Review video and audio exhibits for designations.	4.20	\$ 1,239.00	Clerical.	
12/12/2013	SRK	Telephone and email communications with Bill Walker re video and audio exhibit designations.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	

12/12/2013	SRK	Draft witness list and email to Ann Hobart.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/12/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re trial preparation and exhibits.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/12/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re video and audio exhibit designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/12/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
12/12/2013	BKK	Draft deposition designations.	5.0	\$ 1,475.00	Vague; excessive.	
12/12/2013	CH	telephone call with Rachel Ruthenberg and follow up emails to Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross, Donna Chrisjohn	0.4	\$ 50.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
12/13/2013	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Charlotte Haught re video and audio exhibit designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Charlotte Haught re exhibits.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/13/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re new focus jury presentations, revised opening and closing and service of subpoenas.	0.40	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/13/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re scheduling witnesses for trial.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/13/2013	SRK	Work on designations of video and audio exhibits, and email Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor's affirmative designations of video and audio exhibits to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton.	5.00	\$ 1,475.00		
12/13/2013	BKK	Draft deposition designations.	7.2	\$ 2,124.00	Vague; excessive.	
12/13/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re cross-examination issues.	0.8	\$ 236.00		
12/13/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Charlotte Haught video and audio exhibit designations.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
12/13/2013	CH	burn discs for exhibits; prepare drafts of 2nd supplement to final pretrial order	6.0	\$ 600.00	Excessive; clerical; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
12/14/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' page and line deposition designation errors.	1.00	\$ 295.00		

12/14/2013	SRK	Review deposition of Stephen Noel .	0.70	\$ 206.50		
12/15/2013	SRK	Draft email re witness travel arrangements, subpoenas and witness prep for Patrick Barlow and Richard Holm.	1.10	\$ 324.50	Excessive.	
12/15/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' designations.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Defendants' designations of video, audio and depositions, scheduling witnesses for trial, meeting with witnesses in Colorado City for trial preparation, and additional focus groups.	0.70	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re preparation of subpoena to Helaman Barlow and declaratory judgment action against Colorado City.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re witness address.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re service of subpoena on Helaman Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re scheduling witness preparation and focus group, and subpoena to Helaman Barlow, and counter-designations to Willie Jessop's deposition.	0.40	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re scheduling new focus jury and format.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re service of subpoena on Helaman Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to David Wenner's office to schedule focus jury group.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re focus jury group and subpoena to Helaman Barlow.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.

12/16/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re exchange of counter-designations of video and audio exhibits, and newly taken depositions.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call from David Wenner re scheduling additional jury focus group.	0.30	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/16/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re proposed counter-designations for Willie Jessop's deposition, Helaman Barlow, focus jury group presentations, and Defendants' designations.	0.40	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/16/2013	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re format for additional focus jury presentations.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re focus Jury presentations.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/16/2013	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler re Warren Jeffs.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/16/2013	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re Defendants' designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Defendants' designations, subpoena to Helaman Barlow, and format for jury focus groups.	0.50	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/16/2013	SRK	Conference call to Jethro Barlow with Bill Walker re service on Helaman Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/16/2013	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re subpoenas and witness fees.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
12/16/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re subpoenas and witness fees and focus jury format.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/16/2013	SRK	Email communications with Bill Walker re presenting closing arguments to AG panel.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/16/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
12/16/2013	BKK	Draft excerpts of trial exhibits.	1.1	\$ 324.50		

12/16/2013	BKK	Draft counter-designations to Willie Jessop's deposition.	4.4	\$ 1,298.00	Excessive.	
12/16/2013	CH	update Master Exhibits List; begin adding Deft designations to 2nd Supp	1.0	\$ 125.00	Clerical; block billing.	Objection overruled.
12/17/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Defendants' video and audio exhibit designations, and preparation of counter-designations.	2.40	\$ 708.00	Internal conference.	
12/17/2013	SRK	Review court order re opening statements.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/17/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re trial preparation, including: staffing, coordination and preparation of witnesses, court order re opening statements, subpoena for Helaman Barlow, and counter-designations.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
12/17/2013	SRK	Issue subpoena to Helaman Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/17/2013	SRK	Meeting with paralegal Charlotte Haught re trial preparation, and coordination during trial.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
12/17/2013	SRK	Work on subpoenas for additional witnesses.	0.40	\$ 118.00		
12/17/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re conference call with Defendants re video and audio designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/17/2013	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker and Blake Hamilton re conference call to discuss video and audio designations, and Draft email to Blake Hamilton re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/17/2013	SRK	Review deposition of Don Timpson.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
12/17/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re evidentiary issues.	3.3	\$ 973.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
12/17/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
12/17/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re cross-examination issues.	4.0	\$ 1,180.00	Vague; excessive.	

12/17/2013	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, and Brad Keogh regarding Defendants' video and audio exhibit designations, new deposition designations, and preparation of counter-designations.	2.4	\$ 480.00	Internal conference.	
12/17/2013	LAR	Prepare for and attend trial preparation meeting with Sandra Kane and Charlotte Haught to discuss trial and impeachment exhibits.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Internal conference.	
12/17/2013	CH	meeting with Sandra Kane re trial prep	2.0	\$ 250.00	Internal conference.	
12/17/2013	CH	add DF designations to the 2nd Supplement; review jury questionnaires	1.5	\$ 187.50	Clerical; block billing.	Objection overruled.
12/17/2013	CH	look for missing exhibit 712	0.5	\$ 62.50	Clerical.	
12/18/2013	SRK	Review email from Donna Chrisjohn re hotel arrangements for witnesses, and Telephone call to Donna Chrisjohn re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
12/18/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re addresses for witnesses and Colorado City Town Council meeting.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/18/2013	SRK	Review focus jury questionnaires and notes.	1.30	\$ -	Excessive.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/18/2013	SRK	Draft email to David Wenner re focus jury questionnaires and notes and forms.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/18/2013	SRK	Draft LT Jethro Barlow re subpoena to Helaman Barlow, and Draft email to Jethro Barlow re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/18/2013	SRK	Review Don Timpson's deposition in preparation for witness meetings.	1.40	\$ 413.00		
12/18/2013	BKK	Draft deposition designations.	5.2	\$ 1,534.00	Vague; excessive.	
12/18/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	0.8	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
12/19/2013	SRK	Draft key exhibits and topics to cover with Richard Holm in preparation for trial.	1.00	\$ 295.00		

12/19/2013	SRK	Review additional items from Defendants' list of line/page errors on deposition designations.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
12/19/2013	SRK	Review Don Timpson's deposition and outline key points to cover at trial.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
12/19/2013	SRK	Begin to Review Katie Cox's deposition in preparation for trial.	1.00	\$ 295.00		
12/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker in preparation for conference call re video and audio exhibit designation, and regarding witness preparation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/19/2013	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Brad Keogh re problems with Defendants' video exhibit designations.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
12/19/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re scheduling witnesses for trial preparation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker with Brad Keogh re scheduling witnesses for trial preparation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/19/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Defendants' designations of Willie Jessop's deposition testimony, anticipated defense arguments, and preparation for Bruce Wisan's trial testimony.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
12/19/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re acceptance of service of subpoena to Jesse CUILTY.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/19/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Deborah Johnson re witness preparation for Jinjer Cooke.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/19/2013	SRK	Review motion in limine re ruling on Plaintiffs' msj.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/19/2013	SRK	Conference with Jesse CUILTY re trial subpoena .	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/19/2013	SRK	Draft emails to Jeff Matura re acceptance of service and testimony by Ms. CUILTY.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

12/19/2013	SRK	Review emails from Jeff Matura re acceptance of service and testimony by Ms. CUILTY.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/19/2013	SRK	Email communications with Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re trial witness preparation in Colorado City.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
12/19/2013	SRK	Edit subpoena packets for Richard Holm and Isaac Wyler.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Clerical.	
12/19/2013	SRK	Review transcript of final pretrial conference.	0.80	\$ 236.00		
12/19/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	4.0	\$ 1,180.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
12/19/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with defense counsel re trial issues.	0.1	\$ 29.50		
12/19/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts re evidentiary issues.	2.9	\$ 855.50	Vague; excessive.	
12/19/2013	CH	prepare disc of converted video segments for Rachel	0.8	\$ 100.00	Clerical.	
12/19/2013	CH	telephone call with Rachel re deposition designations, videos, etc.	0.3	\$ 37.50	Clerical.	
12/20/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re hotel arrangements during trial and trip to Colorado City to prepare witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
12/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Donna Chrisjohn re hotel arrangements for trial witnesses.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
12/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re trip to Colorado City for witness preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
12/20/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re trip to Colorado City, Review email from Brad Keogh re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
12/20/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bruce Wisan and Jeff Shields re trial preparation for Bruce Wisan.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/20/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re opening statement, and preparation for Jesse CUILTY, Bruce Wisan and Nick Hanna trial testimony.	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	

12/20/2013	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re Defendants video and audio exhibit designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Nick Hanna re trial preparation.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/20/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Deborah Johnson re witness preparation for Jinjer Cooke.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/20/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re witness preparation for Jinjer Cooke.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/20/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re witness preparation for Jinjer Cooke.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/20/2013	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re trial schedule.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
12/20/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
12/20/2013	BKK	Review defendants' trial exhibits.	0.5	\$ 147.50		
12/20/2013	CH	telephone call with Teddy re trial schedule; prepare form for trial witness schedule	1.0	\$ 125.00	Clerical.	
12/21/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' video exhibit designations for counter-designations and objections.	6.30	\$ 1,858.50		
12/21/2013	SRK	Review Priesthood Records in preparation for Nick Hanna's direct exam.	4.10	\$ 1,209.50		
12/22/2013	SRK	Continue to Review exhibits re Priesthood Records and letters in preparation for Nick Hanna's direct exam.	8.00	\$ 2,360.00	Excessive; duplicative.	
12/22/2013	SRK	Begin outline of direct exam of Nick Hanna.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
12/23/2013	SRK	Conference with Donna Chrisjohn re status of subpoenas and checks for witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re trip to prepare witnesses.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call to John Cook re witness preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to John Cook.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

12/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Guy Timpson re witness preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to Guy Timpson.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re travel arrangements, scope of trial preparation for Guy Timpson, and exhibits for Nick Hanna's testimony.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re trial preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/23/2013	SRK	Review jury focus group materials in preparation for Meeting with David Wenner re opening statement and jury selection..	0.40	\$ -		Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/23/2013	SRK	Meeting with David Wenner re opening statement and jury selection.	3.30	\$ 973.50	Internal conference.	
12/23/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re service on Helaman Barlow.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
12/23/2013	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow with proof of service on Helaman Barlow and Draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/23/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re video exhibit counter-designations.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
12/23/2013	SRK	Review and edit letters to Jethro Barlow and Isaac Wyler re service of subpoenas and execute subpoenas to Guy Timpson and John Cook.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/23/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts and trial exhibits re evidentiary issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Vague; excessive.	
12/23/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re cross-examination issues.	6.0	\$ 1,770.00	Vague; excessive.	
12/24/2013	SRK	Telephone communications with Bill Walker re opening statement and counter-designations.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
12/24/2013	SRK	Review and execute subpoenas for Jethro Barlow, Don Timpson, Kathryn Cox, Claude Seth Cooke, Isaac Wyler and Bruce Wisan.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/24/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re preparation of opening statements for AG Panel.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

12/24/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re counter-designations.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
12/24/2013	SRK	Review and Draft email to Bill Walker re transcripts of recorded interviews referenced in Defendants' designations.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/24/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re focus group questionnaires.	0.20	\$ -	Internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/24/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Shields re acceptance of service of subpoena to Bruce Wisan.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/24/2013	SRK	Continue to review Defendants' video and audio designations for counter-designations.	3.60	\$ 1,062.00		
12/24/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura requesting clarification on Defendants' video and audio designations.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
12/24/2013	BKK	Review defendants' trial exhibits re evidentiary issues.	2.7	\$ 796.50	Vague; excessive.	
12/24/2013	BKK	Trial preparation re cross-examination issues.	5.3	\$ 1,563.50	Vague; excessive.	
12/26/2013	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker re legal research on authenticating documents produced by opposing party.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/26/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re inputting Defendants' affirmative video and audio exhibit designations into draft second supplement to joint pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/26/2013	SRK	Review and edit Defendants' deposition designation line and page errors.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
12/26/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re Nick Hanna's evidence log.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/26/2013	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re including corrections to enumerated deposition designation line/page errors on second supplement to joint pretrial order.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	

12/26/2013	SRK	Continue to Review Defendants' video and audio exhibit designations for counter-designations.	4.20	\$ 1,239.00		
12/26/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re transcript and audio/video designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/26/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re Defendants' designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/26/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re additional time for designations.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/26/2013	BKK	Draft deposition designations.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Vague; excessive.	
12/26/2013	CH	edit 2nd supplement to final pretrial order	0.6	\$ 75.00	Clerical.	
12/26/2013	CH	update 2nd supplemental disclosure statement	1.5	\$ 187.50	Clerical.	
12/27/2013	SRK	Continue to Review Defendants' audio and video exhibit designations for counter-designations.	1.60	\$ 472.00		
12/27/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re designations and Jinjer Cooke witness preparation.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/27/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Deborah Johnson with Bill Walker re Jinjer Cooke witness preparation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/27/2013	SRK	Arrange for copies of focus group DVD for Deborah Johnson, meeting with Jinjer Cooke, and Review and edit draft agreement with Deborah Johnson.	1.10	\$ -	Block billing; clerical; internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/27/2013	SRK	Review Jinjer Cooke's deposition.	0.60	\$ 177.00		
12/27/2013	SRK	Draft email to Deborah Johnson re draft contract and materials to review for witness preparation meeting.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
12/27/2013	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re witness preparation meeting, and Review reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/27/2013	SRK	Review audio exhibit designations from Defendants.	1.50	\$ 442.50		
12/27/2013	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re Defendants' designations of interviews and video and audio exhibits.	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	

12/27/2013	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re video and audio designations and strategy for opening statement.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
12/27/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke with Brad Keogh re trial preparation.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/27/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Deborah Johnson re trial preparation of Jinjer Cooke.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/27/2013	SRK	Draft Plaintiffs' counter-designations to Defendants' video and audio exhibit, and Draft emails to Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re same.	5.50	\$ 1,622.50		
12/27/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	1.4	\$ 413.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
12/27/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	0.2	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
12/27/2013	BKK	Draft counter-designations to defendants' deposition designations.	5.4	\$ 1,593.00	Vague; excessive.	
12/27/2013	CH	burn DVD of jury focus	1.6	\$ -	Excessive; clerical.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
12/28/2013	SRK	Review Defendants' audio exhibit designations and select counter-designations.	6.70	\$ 1,976.50		
12/29/2013	SRK	Review key documents disclosed by Defendants.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
12/29/2013	SRK	Work on evidence for opening statement.	1.30	\$ 383.50		
12/29/2013	SRK	Outline key points for Jethro Barlow and Bruce Wisan testimony.	1.80	\$ 531.00		
12/29/2013	SRK	Review recordings of Jinjer and Ron Cooke's administrative interviews and related designations by Defendants.	4.50	\$ 1,327.50		
12/30/2013	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards re strategy and arguments for opening statement.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
12/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re audio and video designations and Jinjer Cooke testimony.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re materials for Deborah Johnson to review re Jinjer Cooke interview.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

12/30/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re counter-designations to Defendants audio and video designations.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
12/30/2013	SRK	Begin to Draft Plaintiffs' Counter designations to Defendants' audio and video exhibit designations.	2.60	\$ 767.00		
12/30/2013	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	1.6	\$ 472.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
12/30/2013	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Vague; excessive.	
12/30/2013	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
12/30/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra; burn DVD of Jinjer interviews (exhibit 737);	0.4	\$ 50.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
12/31/2013	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re new witnesses listed by Defendants.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/31/2013	SRK	Continue to Draft Plaintiffs' Counter-designations to Defendants' audio and video exhibits.	6.00	\$ 1,770.00		
12/31/2013	SRK	Review administrative interview designations cited by Defendants.	2.50	\$ 737.50		
12/31/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura and Defendants' Counter-designations.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
12/31/2013	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re draft second supplement to pretrial order.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/31/2013	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Craig Neeley re potential trial testimony.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
12/31/2013	SRK	Review email from Jeff Shields re acceptance of service for Bruce Wisan, and Draft reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
12/31/2013	BKK	Review deposition transcripts.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50	Vague; excessive.	
12/31/2013	BKK	Draft deposition designations.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Vague; excessive.	
12/31/2013	CH	telephone call with Sandra Kane re 2nd supplement to final PTO; prepare a To Do list for trial; talk with Nancy Bridges re: my move on Monday	1.0	\$ 100.00	Block billing; clerical; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
12/31/2013	CH	email to Rachel Ruthenberg re: deposition designations	0.3	\$ 37.50	Clerical.	

01/01/2014	SRK	Trial preparation - Review recorded interviews of Defendants' witnesses Jeremiah Barlow, Jonathan Fischer, Victor Jessop and David Darger	2.50	\$ 737.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
01/02/2014	SRK	Trial preparation - Review Depositions of George Morales and Jinjer Cooke Vol. 2	2.00	\$ 590.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
01/02/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.6	\$ 472.00	Internal conference.	
01/02/2014	BKK	Review supplement to joint pretrial orders.	0.2	\$ 59.00		
01/02/2014	BKK	Telephone conference with Gary Engels re evidentiary issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50		
01/02/2014	BKK	Review deposition transcripts of Jinjer Cooke and prepare for meeting with Deborah Johnson.	3.9	\$ 1,150.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
01/02/2014	LAR	Review Brad Keogh's email regarding possible impeachment evidence to be used during trial and attachments.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
01/02/2014	CH	telephone call with Sandra re filing of aff of service	0.2	\$ 25.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
01/03/2014	SRK	Trial preparation - Review Deposition of Jinjer Cooke Vol. 1	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/03/2014	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh re trial strategy re Cooke direct examination	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/03/2014	SRK	Conference with Deborah Johnson re preparation of Jinjer Cooke for trial	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/03/2014	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haight re status of trial preparation	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/03/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Isaac Wyler re service of witness subpoenas for trial	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/03/2014	SRK	Meeting with Deborah Johnson, Jinjer Cooke, Ron Cooke, Bill Walker and Brad Keogh to begin preparing Jinjer Cooke for trial	1.80	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.	

01/03/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re witness preparation meetings in St. George	0.90	\$ 265.50	Duplicative of prior entry; internal conference.
01/03/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re service of subpoenas for trial	0.20	\$ 59.00	
01/03/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bruce Wisan re trial preparation	0.20	\$ 59.00	
01/03/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re Nick Hanna trial preparation	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
01/03/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend meeting with Cookes, Bill Walker, Sandra Kane and Deborah Johnson re trial issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Excessive; internal conference.
01/03/2014	LAR	Trial preparation: Attend Trial Director training in preparation for using trial director at trial.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Clerical; internal conference.
01/03/2014	CH	attend Trial Director review with Dennis Martin	1.5	\$ 187.50	Clerical.
01/03/2014	CH	telephone call with Rachel re depo designations	0.3	\$ 37.50	Clerical.
01/04/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re meeting with Colorado City witnesses	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
01/04/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' trial exhibits	10.60	\$ 3,127.00	Vague; excessive.
01/04/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re rescheduling trip to meet with Colorado City witnesses and meeting dates and times	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
01/05/2014	SRK	Trial preparation – Continue to Review Jinjer Cooke's deposition and exhibits	2.50	\$ 737.50	
01/05/2014	SRK	Work on opening statement	4.20	\$ 1,239.00	
01/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re trial strategy, exhibits and trip to meet with witnesses	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.
01/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re working with Deborah Johnson to prepare for trial	0.30	\$ 88.50	
01/06/2014	SRK	Meeting with Charlotte Haught re trial preparation issues	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.
01/06/2014	SRK	Draft emails to Bill Walker re witnesses	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.

01/06/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re conference call	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re witness preparation and exhibits	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/06/2014	SRK	Review and edit LT Nick Hanna re trial	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/06/2014	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re jury selection and reply	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/06/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re demonstrative exhibit deadline and other issues	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Brad Keogh re witnesses	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re chronology, demonstrative exhibits and conference call with counsel for Defendants	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/06/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/06/2014	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	0.6	\$ 177.00		
01/06/2014	CH	update To Do list; add Sandra's descriptions to Counter designations of non-depo audio and video files in the Master Exh List	2.0	\$ 250.00	Clerical.	
01/06/2014	CH	review PowerPoint jury focus presentation	0.2	\$ -	Clerical.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
01/06/2014	CH	load Willie Jessop video files; review Trial Director to see if it can edit non depo video	2.5	\$ 312.50	Clerical.	
01/06/2014	CH	meet with Sandra to discuss To Do list; follow up from meeting; review Final Pretrial Order	1.3	\$ 162.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
01/07/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re contacting witnesses, sending materials to witnesses for trial preparation meetings, creation of witness files, and computer issues for trial	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
01/07/2014	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re reason for requesting conference call, and Draft reply	0.30	\$ 88.50		

01/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re schedule of witness preparation meetings in St. George	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/07/2014	SRK	Work on exhibits for Nick Hanna to authenticate	9.60	\$ 2,832.00		
01/07/2014	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross and Charlotte Haught re exhibits for Nick Hanna to authenticate	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/07/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and Bill Richards re Nick Hanna exhibits	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
01/07/2014	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re creation of video clips, and reply	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/07/2014	SRK	Review and edit LT Nick Hanna re exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Guy Timpson re witness preparation meeting	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/07/2014	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00		
01/07/2014	LAR	Draft emails to John Cook and Jinjer Cooke with information for their trial preparation sessions.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
01/07/2014	LAR	Compile and email trial exhibits and related documents for John Cook and Jinjer Cooke to review prior to their trial preparation sessions.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Clerical.	
01/07/2014	LAR	Phone call with Bill Walker regarding emails to witnesses and scheduling upcoming witness preparation meetings.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
01/07/2014	LAR	Meeting with Donna Chrisjohn and Charlotte Haught regarding "to do" list.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
01/07/2014	LAR	Compile trial exhibits and related documents for Jethro Barlow to review before his trial preparation sessions and draft email to Jethro Barlow with information for his trial preparation session.	1.6	\$ 320.00	Clerical.	

01/07/2014	LAR	Compile trial exhibits and related documents for Isaac Wyler to review before for his trial preparation sessions and draft email to Isaac Wyler with information regarding his trial preparation sessions.	0.9	\$ 180.00	Clerical.	
01/07/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding emailing witnesses and sending materials to witnesses for trial preparation meetings, creation of witness files, and computer issues for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
01/07/2014	LAR	Compile trial exhibits and related documents for Guy Timpson and Patrick Barlow to review prior to their trial preparation sessions and draft emails to Guy Timpson and Patrick Barlow with information for their trial preparation sessions.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Clerical.	
01/07/2014	CH	meet with Leslie re To Do list; sign up for notifications from DofA cases; call and leave message for Brian (tech guy) at court; create the video clips of non-depo exhibits;	3.7	\$ 370.00	Block billing; clerical; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
01/07/2014	CH	create the audio clips of exhibits; check Rachel's newest disc and verify the designations for Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop; begin checking the corrections	4.0	\$ 500.00	Clerical; block billing.	Objection overruled.
01/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker in preparation for conference call with Defendants' attorneys	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/08/2014	SRK	Conference call to Bill Walker with Brad Keogh re issues to discuss with Defendants' attorneys	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Defendants' subpoena of Craig Neeley and Steven Dark	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re deposition and exhibit designations	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/08/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Shields re Craig Neeley	0.30	\$ 88.50		

01/08/2014	SRK	Review Aqua Engineering Documents in preparation for anticipated testimony of Craig Neeley	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re jury selection consultant and witness updates	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/08/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Telephone call from Bill Walker re jury selection consultant and witness updates	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/08/2014	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton, Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re demonstrative exhibits, how goes it form, withdrawing objections to depositions and exhibits, and other pretrial issues	1.50	\$ 442.50		
01/08/2014	SRK	Review emails from Leslie Ross re David Wenner and Bruce Wisan meetings, and reply	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/08/2014	SRK	Review emails from Leslie Ross to witnesses in preparation for trial	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
01/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re trial preparation	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/08/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re trial issues.	2.1	\$ 619.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
01/08/2014	BKK	Telephone conference with defense counsel re evidentiary issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50		
01/08/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	4.6	\$ 1,357.00	Vague; excessive.	
01/08/2014	LAR	Compile and trial exhibits and related documents for Richard Holm and Don Timpson to review prior to their trial preparation sessions and draft emails to Richard Holm and Don Timpson with information for their trial preparation sessions.	1.4	\$ 280.00	Clerical.	
01/08/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane to discuss updates on trial and witness preparation.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	

01/08/2014	LAR	Compile trial exhibits and related documents for Ronald Cooke and Seth Cooke to review prior to their trial preparation sessions and draft emails to Ronald Cooke and Seth Cooke with information for their trial preparation sessions.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Clerical.	
01/08/2014	LAR	Draft and send additional emails to John Cook, Jinjer Cooke, and Jethro Barlow with further information about witness preparation.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
01/08/2014	LAR	Phone call with Bruce Wisan regarding trial preparation.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
01/08/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bruce Wisan containing trial exhibits and related documents for his review prior to his trial preparation sessions.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
01/08/2014	CH	check corrections to depo designations; create disc of depositions to be printed by copy room; prepare W. Jessop depo designations on computer; work on the objection issue with video; check all exhibit discs to ensure they can play; create Master Depo chart and begin to populate; conf call with Sandra, Bill W, Brad; meet with Leslie re Trial Director; scan Nick H	8.0	\$ 800.00	Block billing; clerical; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
01/09/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re jury selection consultant and preparing deposition testimony and exhibits for witnesses to review	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/09/2014	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haight re highlighting of depositions and electronic equipment in courtroom	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/09/2014	SRK	Telephone conversation with Bill Richards and Brad Keogh re trial testimony of Nick Hanna	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
01/09/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re strategy for authentication of Priesthood records through Nick Hanna, opening statement, and Defendants' water expert witnesses	1.80	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.	

01/09/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re Pure Ph8 water	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/09/2014	SRK	Draft email to Nick Hanna re evidence reference numbers to authenticate exhibits	0.10	\$ 29.50		
01/09/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Nick Hanna and jury selection	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/09/2014	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re redacting Priesthood Records	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/09/2014	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross and Donna Chrisjohn re impeachment folder	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/09/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' Motions in Limine re Priesthood Records and Warren Jeffs	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/09/2014	SRK	Work on Opening Statement	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/09/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Nick Hanna with Bill Richards re trial preparation	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/09/2014	SRK	Email to Nick Hanna with exhibits to review in preparation for trial	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/09/2014	SRK	Review email from Nick Hanna re exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/09/2014	SRK	Draft email to Nick Hanna re trial preparation	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/09/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re redacting Priesthood Records	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/09/2014	SRK	Telephone call to David Wenner re providing jury selection consulting services	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/09/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	2.8	\$ 826.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
01/09/2014	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Richards re litigation strategy issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/09/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding deposition testimony of trial witnesses, selected trial exhibits for trial witnesses, and jury selection by David Wenner.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
01/09/2014	LAR	Compile trial exhibits related to Patrick Barlow and Katie Cox in preparation for their trial preparation sessions.	1.4	\$ 280.00	Clerical.	

01/09/2014	LAR	Compile impeachment exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.4	\$ 80.00		
01/09/2014	LAR	Compile trial exhibits relating to Richard Holm in preparation for his trial preparation session.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Clerical.	
01/09/2014	LAR	Review deposition designations for trial witnesses in preparation for witness trial preparation sessions.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
01/09/2014	LAR	Compile trial exhibits relating to Isaac Wyler and Jethro Barlow in preparation for their trial preparation sessions.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Clerical.	
01/09/2014	LAR	Create trial exhibit chart for Don Timpson and Nick Hanna in preparation for their trial preparation sessions.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Clerical.	
01/09/2014	LAR	Compile trial exhibits relating to Guy Timpson in preparation for his trial preparation sessions.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Clerical.	
01/09/2014	CH	add W. Jessop depo video to laptop Trial Director and create designations; work with Leslie and Dennis re audio and video files running on laptop; fix exhibit cover sheets; add deposition designations to Master list	8.0	\$ 800.00	Clerical; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
01/10/2014	LAR	Compile additional trial exhibits related to Jinjer Cooke in preparation for trial and trial preparation sessions.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Clerical.	
01/10/2014	LAR	Discuss administrative needs for trial with Charlotte Haught and Donna Chrisjohn and email same to Sandra Kane.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Internal conference.	
01/10/2014	LAR	Create witness files for Ronald Cooke, Jinjer Cooke, and Seth Cooke in preparation for trial.	1.7	\$ 340.00	Clerical.	
01/10/2014	LAR	Test courtroom technology with Brian Lalley in Judge Teilborg's courtroom.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Clerical.	

		fix DF Exh 805; RV Teilborg e-court requirements and make list of items for tech run through and discuss with Leslie; add witnesses to master depo chart; organize the deposition designations (label, etc.); review the witnesses Sandra wants to take to Col City and indicate which ones have duplicate designations; go to Teilborg courtroom and have trial run thru				
01/10/2014	CH		9.0	\$ 900.00	Clerical; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
01/12/2014	SRK	Work on Opening Statement	6.30	\$ 1,858.50	Excessive.	
01/12/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re Mathew Musser	2.00	\$ 590.00		
01/12/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re contract with David Wenner	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/12/2014	SRK	Draft emails to Leslie Ross, Bill Richards, Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re contract with David Wenner	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/12/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re opening statements	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/12/2014	SRK	Review deposition of Mathew Musser in preparation for trial	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/12/2014	SRK	Prepare materials for trial preparation meetings with witnesses in St. George	1.10	\$ 324.50		
01/12/2014	SRK	Trial preparation - Review deposition of Nick Hanna	3.10	\$ 914.50		
01/12/2014	LAR	Create jury focus group presentation in preparation for focus jury.	4.0	\$ -	Excessive.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
01/13/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	2.4	\$ 708.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
01/13/2014	BKK	Telephone conferences with Nick Hanna and Bill Richards re trial issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50		
01/13/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	6.3	\$ 1,858.50	Vague; excessive.	
01/13/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Brad Keogh, and Charlotte Haught regarding opening statements.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	

01/13/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding trial preparation sessions.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Internal conference.	
01/13/2014	LAR	Compile jury instructions and verdict forms for jury focus group.	0.5	\$ -		Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
01/13/2014	LAR	Review Jethro Barlow's deposition transcript in preparation for his trial preparation session.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
01/13/2014	LAR	Draft notes on expected trial issues pertaining to Jethro Barlow, recommended questions to be asked during Jethro's trial preparation session, and related trial exhibits in preparation for Jethro Barlow's trial preparation sessions.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Clerical.	
01/13/2014	CH	retrieve documents for Sandra; re-label Court depositions and review to ensure accuracy; review and verify court and attorney exhibits; listen to S. Kane opening arguments; prepare chart of master deposition designations	8.0	\$ 800.00	Block billing; clerical; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
01/14/2014	SRK	PF trial - Attend jury focus group presentation, deliberations, debriefing and strategy session	9.00	\$ -	Excessive; internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
01/14/2014	SRK	Trial preparation - Review deposition of Isaac Wyler	2.40	\$ 708.00		
01/14/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend mock opening/closings.	8.8	\$ -	Excessive; duplicative; internal conference.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
01/14/2014	BKK	Prepare for witness meetings.	5.2	\$ 1,534.00	Vague; excessive.	
01/14/2014	CH	attend jury focus group	8.0	\$ -	Duplicative; vague; excessive.	Focus group/mock trial fees disallowed.
01/15/2014	SRK	Meeting with Isaac Wyler and Jethro Barlow with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh in St. George UT in preparation for trial	6.00	\$ 1,770.00		
01/15/2014	SRK	Meeting with Richard Holm with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh in preparation for trial	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
01/15/2014	SRK	Meeting with Don Timpson with Bill Walker in preparation for trial	1.50	\$ 442.50		
01/15/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meetings.	9.0	\$ 2,655.00	Excessive; internal conference.	

01/15/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits relating to Matthew Musser, Richard Holm, and Alma Cawley and their deposition designations in preparation for their trial.	6.5	\$ 1,300.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
01/15/2014	CH	Review Court and Atty exhibits for accuracy; load non-depo video and audio clips on to laptop; e-mails with Rachel re process; meet with Leslie re witnesses	8.0	\$ 800.00	Block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
01/16/2014	SRK	Review email from Nick Hanna re documents and Draft reply	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/16/2014	SRK	Meeting with Patrick Barlow with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh in preparation for trial	3.00	\$ 885.00		
01/16/2014	SRK	Meeting with John Cook with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh in preparation for trial	1.00	\$ 295.00		
01/16/2014	SRK	Meeting with Guy Timpson with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh in preparation for trial	2.50	\$ 737.50		
01/16/2014	SRK	Meeting with Katie Cox with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh in preparation for trial	2.30	\$ 678.50		
01/16/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re witness order and length of testimony	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	
01/16/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught to Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re witness order and length	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/16/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meetings.	9.0	\$ 2,655.00	Excessive; vague; internal conference.	
01/16/2014	LAR	Review Alma Cawley and Jeff Vaughn's possible trial exhibits and deposition designations in preparation for trial.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.

01/16/2014	CH	finish reviewing the exhibits for court and atty copies; telephone call to Teddy re exhibits; make redactions on Jeffs exhibits; prepare exhibit and witness lists for court clerk; begin reviewing exhibits in Judge's notebooks and prepare cover sheets; telephone call with Sandra, prepare list of witnesses	8.0	\$ 800.00	Clerical; internal conference; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
01/17/2014	SRK	PF meeting with Jinjer Cooke, Ron Cooke and Seth Cooke	1.50	\$ 442.50		
01/17/2014	SRK	Witness preparation meeting with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, and Jinjer, Ron and Seth Cooke	7.50	\$ 2,212.50	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
01/17/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh re Defendant witnesses and trial strategy	3.00	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
01/17/2014	SRK	Review emails from Jeff Matura re Defendants' witnesses	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/17/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meetings.	13.0	\$ 3,835.00	Excessive; vague; internal conference.	
01/17/2014	LAR	Review possible trial exhibits for Jeff Vaughn and deposition designations in preparation for trial.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
01/17/2014	CH	finish reviewing Judge's exhibit notebooks; update Master Deposition chart; telephone call with Rachel re clean copies of depositions to court;	8.0	\$ 800.00	Clerical; block billing.	Reduced by 20%.
01/18/2014	SRK	Review notes re Chronology of Events and related Exhibits in preparation for trial	7.80	\$ 2,301.00	Excessive; clerical.	
01/18/2014	SRK	Begin to Review Defendants' new list of stipulated exhibits	4.10	\$ 1,209.50		
01/18/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re mock opening statements, testimony of Jinjer Cooke, coordination re Review of Defendants' new list of stipulated exhibits, and adjustment to Plaintiffs' witness list and time allocations	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	

01/18/2014	LAR	Review Michael Bradshaw deposition designations in preparation for trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
01/18/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' stipulated exhibit list.	1.7	\$ 340.00		
01/19/2014	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re scheduling mock openings and examination of Nick Hanna and Robert Foster	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/19/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards with draft examination of Nick Hanna	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
01/19/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Leslie Ross re update on trial preparation and additional assignments re Jerry Barlow and the Cookes	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
01/19/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Ann Hobart re witness preparation, preparation of openings and logistics at trial	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/19/2014	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re objections to exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/19/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re allocation of time for witness cross examination, and Defendants' stipulated exhibit list	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/19/2014	SRK	Review notes re opening statement	0.70	\$ 206.50		
01/19/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards and Draft email to Bill Richards re testimony of Nick Hanna	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/19/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' proposed list of stipulated exhibits	3.20	\$ 944.00		
01/19/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re draft examination of Nick Hanna	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/19/2014	LAR	Review Jeremiah Barlow deposition designations in preparation for trial.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
01/19/2014	LAR	Phone call with Sandra Kane regarding update on trial preparation and additional trial preparation assignments regarding Jeremiah Barlow and the Cookes.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Internal conference.	
01/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re Nick Hanna trial examination	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	

01/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re witness order, demonstrative exhibits and Defendants' proposed stipulated exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
01/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re responding to Defendants re demonstrative exhibit disclosure	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
01/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re witness preparation meeting and exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00	
01/20/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards re opening statements	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
01/20/2014	SRK	Conference call to Jinjer Cooke with Bill Walker re scheduling witness preparation	0.30	\$ 88.50	
01/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re Jinjer Cooke witness preparation	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
01/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Deborah Johnson re Meeting with Jinjer Cooke	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
01/20/2014	SRK	Draft email to Blake Hamilton and Jeff Matura re demonstrative exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00	
01/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re scheduling Meeting with Marv Wilson	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
01/20/2014	SRK	Conference call with Blake Hamilton, Jeff Matura and Bill Walker re cross examination time and changes to How Goes It List	0.50	\$ 147.50	
01/20/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards and Nick Hanna in preparation for trial	1.80	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.
01/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Meeting with Jinjer Cooke	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
01/20/2014	SRK	Conference call to David Wenner with Bill Walker re scheduling mock opening statements	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
01/20/2014	SRK	Draft email to Donna Chrisjohn re witness travel arrangements and conference rooms for witness preparation meetings	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical; internal conference.

01/20/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards and David Wenner re mock opening statements	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re scheduling witnesses for meetings and travel to court	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Charlotte Haught, Donna Chrisjohn, Leslie Ross and Brad Keogh re travel arrangements and meetings with witnesses, demonstrative exhibits, status of exhibit preparation	0.70	\$ 206.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
01/21/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker in preparation for Telephone call to Marv Wilson of Sunrise Engineering	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Marv Wilson with Bill Walker and Brad Keogh	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/21/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' draft stipulation re exchanging demonstrative exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/21/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura with Defendants' demonstrative exhibits	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/21/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re Defendants' demonstrative exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	SRK	PF witness preparation meeting with Bruce Wisan and Bill Walker	2.00	\$ 590.00		
01/21/2014	SRK	Draft email to David Wenner re signed contract, and review reply from David Wenner	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	SRK	Meeting with Charlotte Haught re preparation of weekly How Goes It Form	0.70	\$ 206.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
01/21/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re trial schedule	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	SRK	Email communications with Nick Hanna and Bill Richards re exhibits	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/21/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re email communications with Nick Hanna	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re stipulation re demonstrative exhibits	0.10	\$ 29.50		

01/21/2014	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re Plaintiffs' demonstrative exhibits	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re David Wenner's contract	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re litigation strategy issues.	4.2	\$ 1,239.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
01/21/2014	BKK	Telephone conference with Bill Walker and Marv Wilson.	0.3	\$ 88.50		
01/21/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding trial schedule and brainstorming on opening statement.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	LAR	Review Jeff Vaughn deposition designations and trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	3.1	\$ 620.00		
01/21/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Charlotte Haught, Donna Chrisjohn, and Brad Keogh regarding witness preparation and trial preparation.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Internal conference.	
01/21/2014	CH	meeting with Sandra, Donna, Brad, Leslie; work on designations of Jeremiah Barlow; prepare demonstrative exhibits; telephone calls with Teddy and Alicia re depositions, stipulated exhibits, testing out laptop; prepare How Goes it Form	8.0	\$ 800.00	Block billing; clerical; internal conference.	Reduced by 20%.
01/22/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bruce Wisan and Bill Walker to prepare Bruce for trial	7.00	\$ 2,065.00	Excessive because was not used at trial.	
01/22/2014	SRK	Telephone email communications with Bill Richards re revisions to opening statement	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
01/22/2014	SRK	Draft opening statement	8.50	\$ 2,507.50	Excessive.	
01/22/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Tom Chenal and Ann Hobart re litigation strategy issues.	3.3	\$ 973.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
01/22/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Sandra Kane and Bill Walker re evidentiary issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
01/22/2014	BKK	Draft Bruce Wisan preparation materials.	2.7	\$ 796.50	Excessive because was not used at trial.	

01/22/2014	LAR	Create PowerPoint in preparation for mock opening statement.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Clerical.	
01/22/2014	LAR	Review Matthew Musser and Jeff Vaughn's deposition designations and trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	6.8	\$ 1,360.00	Excessive.	
01/22/2014	CH	finish up Jeremiah Barlow depo designations; prepare Peggy Sue Taylor depo designations; make corrections to redacted exhibits; print out plain (non highlighted) depositions for court); prepare the redacted and demonstrative exhibits	8.0	\$ 800.00	Block billing; clerical.	Reduced by 20%.
01/23/2014	SRK	Work with Charlotte Haught re PowerPoint slides for opening statement	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
01/23/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend moot opening statement and receive input	3.00	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
01/23/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/23/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Defendants' request for new Jury Instruction on easement and curtilage, opening statements, and other trial preparation issues	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
01/23/2014	SRK	Email communications with Charlotte Haught and Ann Hobart re status of filing exhibits and preparation of impeachment envelope	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
01/23/2014	SRK	Edit opening statement	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/23/2014	SRK	Meeting with Deborah Johnson, Ron Cooke, Jinjer Cooke, Bill Walker and Brad Keogh in preparation for trial	1.80	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.	
01/23/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re preparation of witnesses and opening statements	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/23/2014	BKK	Review draft opening presentations.	0.9	\$ 265.50		
01/23/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Excessive; internal conference.	

01/23/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meeting with Cookes.	5.6	\$ 1,652.00	Vague; excessive.	
01/23/2014	LAR	Test laptop in Judge Teilborg's courtroom in preparation for trial.	1.2	\$ 240.00	Clerical.	
01/23/2014	LAR	Trial preparation: Attend mock opening statement.	2.5	\$ 500.00	Duplicative.	
01/23/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' proposed stipulated exhibits list as compared to Final Pretrial Order in preparation for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
01/23/2014	CH	finish prepping boxes for delivery to Teddy; prepare PowerPoint slides for Sandra; attend mock openings; trip to courtroom to test laptops; add exhibits to laptop; telephone call with Rachel; burn CD of clips for Rachel; burn CD of exhibits for court reporter; prepare list of terms for court reporter.	10.0	\$ 1,000.00	Block billing; clerical; excessive.	Reduced by 20%.
01/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Deborah Johnson re opening statement and preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/24/2014	SRK	Conference with Donna Chrisjohn re status of travel arrangements and trial preparation meetings with witnesses	0.40	\$ 118.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
01/24/2014	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re shuttle arrangements during trial, impeachment exhibits, and stipulated exhibits	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
01/24/2014	SRK	Email communications with Bill Richards re revisions to opening statements	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/24/2014	SRK	Email communications with Ann Hobart re opening statements	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
01/24/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' motion in limine re fifth amendment	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/24/2014	SRK	Review exhibits with Leslie Ross in response to Defendants' proposed list of stipulated exhibits	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	

01/24/2014	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker re How Goes It Form, Demonstrative Exhibits, Deposition testimony	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/24/2014	SRK	Work on impeachment exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re computer presentation problems in courtroom and witness preparation	0.50	\$ 147.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
01/24/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re using maps for opening statement	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/24/2014	SRK	Prepare materials for Isaac Wyler trial testimony	0.50	\$ 147.50		
01/24/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re stipulated exhibits	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re impeachment exhibits and expert witness	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Don Timpson re trial	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re strategy for opening statements, and new defense motion in limine re fifth amendment	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/24/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	2.2	\$ 649.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
01/24/2014	BKK	Review depositions transcripts.	3.1	\$ 914.50	Vague; excessive.	
01/24/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re evidentiary issues.	1.7	\$ 501.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
01/24/2014	LAR	Finalize list of witness names and terms to supply to Court in preparation for trial.	2.6	\$ 520.00	Clerical.	
01/24/2014	LAR	Review deposition designations and trial exhibits for Steven Bateman in preparation for trial.	2.6	\$ 520.00		
01/24/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' proposed stipulated exhibits list as compared to Final Pretrial Order in preparation for trial.	3.8	\$ 760.00		

01/24/2014	LAR	Review Motion in Limine re David Darger and Jake Barlow in preparation for trial.	0.9	\$ 180.00		
01/24/2014	CH	work on impeachment exhibits; work on laptop problem; pack up boxes and deliver to court; work on more laptop problems;	9.0	\$ 900.00	Block billing; excessive.	Reduced by 20%.
01/25/2014	SRK	Edit opening statement	1.40	\$ 413.00		
01/25/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker to coordinate re opening statement	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/25/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross to work on opening statement	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
01/25/2014	SRK	Work with Leslie Ross on creating PowerPoint slides for opening	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/25/2014	SRK	Conference with Dennis Martin re computer technology problems with courtroom presentation	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
01/25/2014	SRK	Work with Leslie Ross re exhibits to remove from Defendants' stipulated list	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/25/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re removing objectionable exhibits from proposed stipulated list	0.60	\$ 177.00		
01/25/2014	SRK	Review exhibits and PF examination of Isaac Wyler, Telephone call from Leslie Ross re same	5.20	\$ 1,534.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
01/25/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Katie Cox re travel schedule and witness preparation	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
01/25/2014	LAR	Review deposition designations and trial exhibits for Steven Bateman in preparation for trial.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Duplicative of 1/24/2014 LAR.	
01/25/2014	LAR	Create PowerPoint for opening statement in preparation for trial.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Clerical.	
01/26/2014	SRK	Work on Isaac Wyler's direct examination	2.30	\$ 678.50		
01/26/2014	SRK	Meeting with Isaac Wyler, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, and Bill Richards to prepare Isaac Wyler for trial	7.30	\$ 2,153.50		

01/26/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/26/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend Isaac Wyler witness preparation meeting.	6.5	\$ 1,917.50	Excessive; duplicative.	
01/26/2014	LAR	Review and prepare exhibits in preparation for trial.	3.3	\$ 660.00		
01/26/2014	LAR	Review deposition designations and trial exhibits for Steven Bateman in preparation for trial. Propose limited deposition designations to be used at trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Duplicative of 1/24/2014 LAR & 1/25/2014 LAR.	
01/26/2014	CH	work on impeachment exhibits	5.0	\$ 625.00	Vague; excessive.	
01/27/2014	SRK	Meeting with Isaac Wyler in preparation for trial	5.50	\$ 1,622.50	Duplicative of 1/26/2014 SRK.	
01/27/2014	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re stipulated and demonstrative exhibits	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/27/2014	SRK	Edit and revise PowerPoint for Opening Statement with Leslie Ross	3.30	\$ 973.50	Clerical.	
01/27/2014	BKK	Review trial exhibits re admissibility issues.	3.3	\$ 973.50	Vague; excessive.	
01/27/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re evidentiary issues.	5.2	\$ 1,534.00	Vague; excessive.	
01/27/2014	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane re exhibit pertaining to Jethro Barlow and Issac Wyler's public records request. Locate exhibit and respond to Sandra's email.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
01/27/2014	LAR	Review Charlotte Haught's email regarding possible impeachment witnesses.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
01/27/2014	LAR	Review Bill Walker's PowerPoint for opening statements, suggest revisions, review revised documents and import final PowerPoint into trial computer.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
01/27/2014	LAR	Test trial laptops in Judge Teilborg's courtroom.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Clerical.	
01/27/2014	LAR	Review Bill Walker's emails regarding opening statement and exhibits needed Richard Holm trial testimony and print related documents.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	

01/27/2014	LAR	Review Jeff Matura's email regarding proposed stipulated exhibit list for foundation and admission and review stipulated exhibits.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
01/27/2014	LAR	Trial preparation: Review trial exhibits.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
01/27/2014	LAR	Trial preparation: Review and prepare trial exhibits for first week of trial.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
01/27/2014	LAR	Test new laptop in Judge Teilborg's courtroom.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Clerical.	
01/27/2014	LAR	Meet with Sandra Kane to review and revise PowerPoint for opening statement.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Internal conference.	
01/27/2014	LAR	Trial preparation: Review Jeff Matura's proposed trial exhibits with foundation and admissibility stipulated.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
01/27/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
01/28/2014	SRK	PF and attend first day of trial including jury selection and meeting re miscellaneous issues including Defendants' motion in limine re assertion of Fifth Amendment	9.80	\$ 2,891.00		
01/28/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Bill Richards and Ann Hobart re Fifth Amendment issue	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re outline of Patrick Barlow's testimony	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Matthew Musser deposition designations for trial	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re designations for Matthew Musser and objections	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	SRK	Review minute entry re Fifth Amendment assertion	0.20	\$ 59.00		

01/28/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re deposition designations for Matthew Musser's testimony and withdrawing objections	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/28/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Matura re status of stipulated exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/28/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re Defendants' Motion in Limine re Fifth Amendment Assertion	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart, Bill Richards, Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re scope of Fifth Amendment ruling	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re proposed stipulated exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/28/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re withdrawing deposition objections	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	SRK	Review opening statement	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/28/2014	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross re opening statement	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	SRK	Draft email to Leslie Ross, Charlotte Haught re status of stipulated exhibits	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	SRK	Review exhibits for Guy Timpson trial testimony	0.30	\$ 88.50		
01/28/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.5	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
01/28/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meetings.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Vague; excessive.	
01/28/2014	LAR	Locate and review pleadings and related research for Colorado City's Motion to Withdraw Fifth Amendment Privilege Assertion of Witness David Darger.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
01/28/2014	LAR	Review email regarding Bill Walker's revised Power Point presentation for opening.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane re revised stipulated exhibit list and make necessary changes to list.	0.1	\$ 20.00		
01/28/2014	LAR	Review email from Jeff Matura re revised stipulated exhibit list.	0.2	\$ 40.00		

01/28/2014	LAR	Review revised stipulated exhibits list as compared to earlier version in preparation for trial.	2.5	\$ 500.00		
01/28/2014	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Donna Chrisjohn, and Charlotte Haught re Defendants' revised stipulated exhibit list.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
01/28/2014	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane regarding Defendants' revised stipulated exhibit list.	0.1	\$ 20.00		
01/28/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
01/28/2014	CH	trial	12.0	\$ 1,500.00	Vague; excessive.	
01/29/2014	SRK	PF and attend trial, present opening statement, Review Defendants' revised proposed stipulated exhibit list and work out objections, direct and redirect examination of Isaac Wyler, observe testimony of Richard Holm	9.30	\$ 2,743.50		
01/29/2014	SRK	Meeting with Guy Timpson in preparation for trial testimony	2.00	\$ 590.00		
01/29/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.5	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
01/29/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meetings.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Vague; excessive.	
01/29/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00	Excessive.	
01/29/2014	LAR	Review email from Charlotte Haught/Sandra Kane regarding Defendants' stipulated exhibit list.	4.1	\$ 820.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
01/29/2014	LAR	Review Brad Keogh's email regarding Judge Teilborg's Order regarding David Darger and Jake Barlow.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
01/29/2014	LAR	Email communications with Sandra Kane to Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh, Bill Richards and Bill Walker regarding issue raised in Blake Hamilton's opening statement regarding conciliation efforts.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
01/29/2014	LAR	Prepare trial exhibits for Guy Timpson's testimony.	3.4	\$ 680.00		

01/29/2014	LAR	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re printing exhibits for Guy Timpson's testimony.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
01/29/2014	CH	trial	11.0	\$ 1,375.00	Vague; excessive.	
01/30/2014	SRK	PF and attend trial, present testimony of Guy Timpson	9.00	\$ 2,655.00		
01/30/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bruce Wisan with Bill Walker	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/30/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.5	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
01/30/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meetings.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Vague; excessive.	
01/30/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
01/30/2014	LAR	Review Charlotte Haught's email regarding trial time used by all parties.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
01/30/2014	LAR	Review Brad Keogh's email regarding Guy Timpson's trial testimony.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
01/30/2014	LAR	Prepare exhibits for Guy Timpson and Robert Foster.	3.8	\$ 760.00		
01/30/2014	CH	trial	10.0	\$ 1,250.00	Vague; excessive.	
01/31/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Bruce Wisan re demonstrative exhibits	1.50	\$ 442.50		
01/31/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh and Robert Foster in preparation for Robert Foster's testimony	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' motion in limine re precluding evidence of witness assertion of Fifth Amendment at depositions	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/31/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh, Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re Defendants' Motion in Limine re Fifth Amendment	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

01/31/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re How Goes It Form, upcoming demonstrative exhibits, and deposition designations for next week	0.80	\$ 236.00		
01/31/2014	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haught re preparation of updated trial schedule	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re cross-examination of witnesses	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart, Leslie Ross, Bill Walker and Bill Richards re motion in limine re conciliation discussions	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re cross examination of Helaman Barlow	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	SRK	Work on examination of Steven Bateman, Jeff Vaughn and Katie Cox	0.40	\$ 118.00		
01/31/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker to confirm witness assignments	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Telephone call to Bruce Wisan	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re updated trial schedule	0.20	\$ 59.00		
01/31/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Robert Foster, Bill Richards, Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re trial witness issues.	6.7	\$ 1,976.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
01/31/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re evidentiary issues.	2.3	\$ 678.50	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, and Ann Hobart regarding preparation of a motion in limine to preclude evidence regarding conciliation discussions.	0.8	\$ 160.00	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	LAR	Trial preparation for Robert Foster's testimony.	3.0	\$ 600.00		

01/31/2014	LAR	Draft Motion in Limine to exclude conciliation efforts.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
01/31/2014	LAR	Review email from Charlotte Haught regarding changes to witness schedule for following week and attachment.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	LAR	Review emails from Charlotte Haught regarding preparation for Robert Foster's trial testimony.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	LAR	Review email from Charlotte Haught re trial time used by all parties.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	LAR	Email communications with Bill Walker and Sandra Kane regarding demonstrative exhibits for following week.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane regarding trial exhibits for Bruce Wisan and Helaman Barlow.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
01/31/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/01/2014	SRK	Draft ideas for Closing Argument	1.50	\$ 442.50		
02/01/2014	SRK	Review email from Donna Chrisjohn re travel arrangements and trial preparation meetings for witnesses	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
02/01/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Leslie Ross re preparation of motion in limine re conciliation discussions, and Fifth Amendment issues	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/01/2014	SRK	Review testimony of Guy Timpson in preparation for additional direct, cross and redirect exam	3.20	\$ 944.00		
02/01/2014	SRK	Review Andrew Chatwin deposition designations	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/01/2014	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross and edit Draft Motion for Leave to File Motion in Limine to Preclude Reference to Conciliation	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/01/2014	SRK	Draft email to Zach Renstrom re water issues in Defendants' opening statement	1.30	\$ 383.50		

02/01/2014	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross and reply re statements about conciliation for preparation of motion in limine	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
02/01/2014	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Joint Motion in Limine to Preclude any Reference to, Evidence of, or Testimony about Anything Said or Done in the Course of Conciliation, and Finalize Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Joint Motion for Expedited Consideration of Motion for Leave to File their Motion in Limine to Preclude any Reference to, Evidence of, or Testimony about Anything Said or Done in the Course of Conciliation.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
02/02/2014	SRK	Review deposition of Guy Timpson	4.60	\$ 1,357.00		
02/02/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re deposition of Guy Timpson and rescheduling witnesses for next week	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards re Guy Timpson testimony	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re Guy Timpson	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re same	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Michael Morrissey re Guy Timpson representation	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Michael Morrissey re conflict	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re new witness schedule for next week	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re religious discrimination memorandum from Elizabeth Brancart	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	SRK	Review email from Elizabeth Brancart re religious discrimination theory and reply	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	

02/02/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Elizabeth Brancart re religious discrimination theory and evidence	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	SRK	Draft email to Michael Morrissey re Guy Timpson with attachments	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	LAR	Meeting with Bill Richards regarding trial exhibits for Nick Hanna and Robert Foster.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference.	
02/02/2014	LAR	Prepare redactions and highlighting of Nick Hanna and Robert Foster exhibits and import exhibits into Trial Director in preparation for trial.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Clerical.	
02/03/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Patricia Gitre re Guy Timpson's testimony	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/03/2014	SRK	Draft email to Patricia Gitre transmitting Guy Timpson's deposition, Randy Jenson's deposition and exhibits	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/03/2014	SRK	Review email from Zachary Renstrom re Defendants' opening statement	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/03/2014	SRK	Work on designations for Willie Jessop's trial testimony	2.30	\$ 678.50		
02/03/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re revisions to How Goes It Form	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/03/2014	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross and Bill Richards to finalize Plaintiffs' Motion in Limine to Preclude Evidence of Conciliation	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
02/03/2014	SRK	Attend part of trial preparation with Nick Hanna	1.50	\$ 442.50		
02/03/2014	SRK	Meeting with Guy Timpson and Patricia Gitre re trial preparation	2.40	\$ 708.00		
02/03/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re designations for Willie Jessop's trial testimony	0.70	\$ 206.50		
02/03/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re testimony of Nick Hanna and Robert Foster, and response to Defendants' Motion in Limine re Fifth Amendment	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	

02/03/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re Guy Timpson issues	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/03/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend Nick Hanna witness preparation meeting.	5.0	\$ 1,475.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/03/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re evidentiary issues.	1.8	\$ 531.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/03/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Vague; excessive.	
02/03/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane re trial issues.	2.7	\$ 796.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/03/2014	LAR	Research cases discussing counsel's duty to discuss information to Court and opposing counsel.	3.3	\$ 660.00	Excessive.	
02/03/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Bill Richards regarding Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Joint Motion in Limine to Preclude any Reference to, Evidence of, or Testimony about Anything Said or Done in the Course of Conciliation.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Internal conference.	

02/03/2014	LAR	Finalize Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Joint Motion for Expedited Consideration of Motion for Leave to File their Motion in Limine to Preclude any Reference to, Evidence of, or Testimony about Anything Said or Done in the Course of Conciliation, Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Joint Motion for Leave to File Motion in Limine to Preclude any Reference to, Evidence or, or Testimony about Anything Said or Done in the Course of Conciliation, and Plaintiffs and Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Joint Motion in Limine to Preclude any Reference to, Evidence or, or Testimony about Anything Said or Done in the Course of Conciliation.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Block billing.	Objection overruled.
02/03/2014	LAR	Communicate through email with Bill Richards regarding Nick Hanna exhibits with specific highlighting, and prepare highlighting and redactions to Nick Hanna's exhibits in preparation for Nick Hanna's trial testimony.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
02/03/2014	LAR	Email communications with Charlotte Haught regarding all exhibits needed for Guy Timpson, Robert Foster, Nick Hanna, and Bruce Wisan in preparation for their trial testimony.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
02/03/2014	LAR	Review and forward email from Sandra Kane with proposed exhibits for Guy Timpson's testimony in preparation for trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/03/2014	LAR	Prepare additional highlighting and redactions on documents in preparation for Nick Hanna's trial testimony. .	4.0	\$ 800.00	Clerical.	
02/03/2014	CH	trial prep	9.0	\$ 1,125.00	Vague; excessive.	

02/04/2014	SRK	PF and attend trial	8.50	\$ 2,507.50		
02/04/2014	SRK	Meeting with Katie Cox for Review of relevant documents and witness preparation	4.20	\$ 1,239.00		
02/04/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	9.0	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
02/04/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re trial issues.	4.0	\$ 1,180.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/04/2014	LAR	Attend trial	8.5	\$ 1,700.00		
02/04/2014	LAR	Email communications with Bill Richards regarding outline and proposed trial exhibits for Robert Foster's testimony from Bill Richards.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
02/04/2014	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane regarding preparation for Helaman Barlow's testimony at trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/04/2014	LAR	Redact exhibits 364 and 357 in preparation for trial.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Clerical.	
02/04/2014	LAR	Review Charlotte Haught's email on trial time used by all parties.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/04/2014	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane and Bill Walker regarding Jeff Vaughn, Steven Bateman, and Peggy Sue Taylor deposition designations in preparation for trial.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/04/2014	LAR	Review proposed trial outline for Nick Hanna and finalize trial exhibits to be used during Nick Hanna's testimony at trial.	2.8	\$ 560.00	Internal conference.	
02/04/2014	CH	trial	12.0	\$ 1,500.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/05/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	9.0	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
02/05/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Tom Chenal and Ann Hobart re trial issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/05/2014	LAR	Attend trial	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
02/05/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Walker re items needed in preparation of Jethro Barlow's trial testimony.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	

02/05/2014	LAR	Review email from Charlotte Haught requesting exhibits for Kathryn Cox's testimony.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/05/2014	LAR	Prepare trial exhibits for Kathryn Cox in preparation for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
02/05/2014	LAR	Prepare trial exhibits and audio file trial exhibits in preparation for Jethro Barlow's testimony.	1.7	\$ 340.00		
02/05/2014	CH	trial and prep	12.5	\$ 1,562.50	Vague; excessive.	
02/06/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.5	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
02/06/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Rick Bistrow, Tom Chenal and Ann Hobart re trial issues.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/06/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
02/06/2014	LAR	Trial Preparation and Debrief meeting.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
02/06/2014	CH	trial	10.0	\$ 1,250.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/07/2014	BKK	Telephone conferences with Bill Richards and Ann Hobart re litigation strategy issues.	1.3	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
02/07/2014	BKK	Office conference with Tom Chenal re trial issues.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
02/07/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	7.2	\$ 2,124.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/07/2014	LAR	Review email and attachments from Charlotte Haught regarding redacted exhibits requested by the Court.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
02/07/2014	LAR	Review email from Charlotte Haught regarding amount of trial time used by each party.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/07/2014	LAR	Draft email to Charlotte Haught to include the list of stipulated and admitted exhibits into the Excel document containing all trial exhibits.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/07/2014	LAR	Review email and attachment from Charlotte Haught with audio file regarding Seth Cooke's interaction with the Colorado City/Hildale Marshal's Office relating to the Stubbs' field.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	

02/07/2014	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Brad Keogh, Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Charlotte Haught, and Donna Chrisjohn regarding how goes it form for following week.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference.	
02/07/2014	LAR	Email communications with Brad Keogh, Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Charlotte Haught, and Donna Chrisjohn regarding witness schedule for trial testimony, demonstrative exhibits, and trial preparation schedule for following week.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
02/07/2014	LAR	Meet with Sandra Kane to discuss issues with content within Exhibit 712.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
02/07/2014	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane regarding attorney scheduling for direct and cross examination for the following week.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/07/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits and develop exhibit list in preparation for Bruce Wisan's trial testimony.	6.0	\$ 1,200.00		
02/07/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Guy Timpson	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/08/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re expert witness agreement and trial resources, and Draft reply	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
02/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Leslie Ross re exhibits for testimony of Bruce Wisan, Zachary Renstrom and the Cookes	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/08/2014	SRK	Review pretrial order re Zachary Renstrom, and Draft email to Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/08/2014	SRK	Review email from Katie Cox re water right	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/08/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re Zachary Renstrom	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/08/2014	SRK	Draft expert witness agreement for Zachary Renstrom	0.50	\$ 147.50	Clerical.	

02/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re trial preparation	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/08/2014	SRK	Review exhibits in preparation for testimony of Jethro Barlow, Zachary Renstrom, Bruce Wisan and Ron and Jinjer Cooke	4.70	\$ 1,386.50		
02/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Deborah Johnson and email re trial preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/08/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Zachary Renstrom re trial preparation	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
02/08/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	7.7	\$ 2,271.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/08/2014	LAR	Telephone and email communications with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Sandra Kane, and Brad Keogh regarding exhibits in preparation for Bruce Wisan, Zach Renstrom and the Cookes' testimony.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
02/08/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits and revise exhibit list in preparation of Bruce Wisan's testimony at trial.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
02/08/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits and create exhibit list for Zach Renstrom, Jinjer Cooke and Ronald Cooke in preparation for their testimonies at trial.	2.7	\$ 540.00		
02/09/2014	BKK	Telephone conference with Ann Hobart re trial issues.	2.1	\$ 619.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/09/2014	BKK	Revise draft memorandum to Rick Bistrow.	1.9	\$ 560.50	Internal conference.	
02/09/2014	LAR	Email Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Sandra Kane, and Brad Keogh regarding trial exhibit 337 and a discussion mentioned in the exhibit about UEP subdivision in preparation for trial.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	

02/09/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits and revise trial exhibit lists for Zach Renstrom, Jinjer Cooke, Seth Cooke, and Ronald Cooke in preparation for trial.	4.0	\$ 800.00		
02/09/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits included on stipulated list for upcoming issues with substance of stipulated exhibits.	1.9	\$ 380.00		
02/10/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re trial preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	Draft email to Deborah Johnson re trial preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	Review email from Deborah Johnson re trial preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re trial preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re trial preparation	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/10/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re trial exhibits for Jinjer Cooke	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	work with Leslie Ross on designations for Willie Jessop testimony	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	Meeting with Jinjer Cooke, Ron Cooke and Deborah Johnson re preparation of Jinjer Cooke	3.00	\$ 885.00		
02/10/2014	SRK	Meeting with Katie Cox in preparation for trial testimony	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/10/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re testimony of Zachary Renstrom and Jethro Barlow	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re motion in limine re conciliation	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	SRK	Continue to Review Willie Jessop's deposition and prepare designations	2.30	\$ 678.50		

02/10/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re deposition designations for Willie Jessop	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/10/2014	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re exhibits for Jethro Barlow	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	BKK	Telephone conferences with Ann Hobart re litigation strategy issues.	1.9	\$ 560.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/10/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Rick Bistrow, Tom Chenal and Ann Hobart re litigation strategy issues.	2.6	\$ 767.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/10/2014	BKK	Draft memorandum to Tom Chenal re trial issues.	6.5	\$ 1,917.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/10/2014	LAR	Draft email containing Bruce Wisan's depositions and deposition exhibits to Bill Richards in preparation of Bruce Wisan's trial testimony.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Walker, Sandra Kane, and Bill Richards regarding trial exhibits needed for Kathryn Cox, Zach Renstrom, Jethro Barlow, and Bruce Wisan.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits and revise exhibit sheets for Jinjer Cooke, Seth Cooke, Ronald Cooke, and Jethro Barlow in preparation for trial.	6.0	\$ 1,200.00		
02/10/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding trial exhibits for Jinjer Cooke.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding revisions to Willie Jessop's deposition designations to be used at trial.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Internal conference.	
02/10/2014	LAR	Prepare trial exhibits for Zach Renstrom.	2.8	\$ 560.00		
02/10/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/11/2014	SRK	PF and attend trial	8.50	\$ 2,507.50		
02/11/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Brad Keogh re Bruce Wisan testimony	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
02/11/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend Bruce Wisan preparation meeting.	5.5	\$ 1,622.50	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	

02/11/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Bill Richards re litigation strategy issues.	0.8	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
02/11/2014	BKK	Draft memorandum to Tom Chenal re trial issues.	6.7	\$ 1,976.50	Excessive; duplicative of 2/10/2014 BKK; internal conference.	
02/11/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	8.5	\$ 1,700.00		
02/11/2014	LAR	Review emails from Bill Richards and Bill Walker regarding preparation for Jethro Barlow's testimony.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/11/2014	LAR	Review email from Bill Richards regarding exhibits containing signed petition of beneficiaries in preparation for upcoming trial witnesses.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/11/2014	LAR	Review email and attachment from Bill Richards regarding outline for Bruce Wisan's testimony.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
02/11/2014	LAR	Research trial exhibits which are signed declaration of beneficiary pages for upcoming trial witnesses.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
02/11/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Richards with bates numbers and exhibits numbers for signed declaration of beneficiaries pages which are trial exhibits.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/11/2014	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane regarding revised witness list.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/11/2014	LAR	Review week 3 trial schedule as emailed by Charlotte Haught.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/11/2014	CH	trial	10.5	\$ 1,312.50	Vague; excessive.	
02/12/2014	SRK	Attend trial	9.50	\$ 2,802.50		
02/12/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re trial schedule and time allotted for witnesses	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/12/2014	BKK	Draft memorandum to Tom Chenal re trial issues.	3.8	\$ 1,121.00	Excessive; duplicative of 2/10/2014 BKK & 2/11/2014 BKK; internal conference.	
02/12/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.0	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.

02/12/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re litigation strategy issues.	1.2	\$ 354.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/12/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.5	\$ 1,900.00		
02/12/2014	LAR	Conference call with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Sandra Kane regarding scheduling of Plaintiffs' witnesses.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
02/12/2014	LAR	Review email from Bill Richards regarding Zach Renstrom's trial testimony.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/12/2014	LAR	Review email and attachment from Bill Richards containing revised outline in preparation for Bruce Wisan's testimony.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
02/12/2014	LAR	Review email from Jeff Matura regarding deposition objections they will maintain, add, or withdraw for Willie Jessop's deposition designations.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
02/12/2014	LAR	Prepare trial exhibits for Jethro Barlow's trial testimony.	1.2	\$ 240.00		
02/12/2014	CH	trial and prep	10.5	\$ 1,312.50	Vague; excessive.	
02/13/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend trial.	9.00	\$ 2,655.00		
02/13/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re trial preparation for Ronald, Jinjer and Seth Cooke	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
02/13/2014	SRK	Work on trial preparation for John Cook	2.20	\$ 649.00		
02/13/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	9.0	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
02/13/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane re litigation strategy issues.	4.0	\$ 1,180.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/13/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
02/13/2014	LAR	Review Bill Walker's email regarding trial preparation for Seth Cooke, Ronald Cooke, and Jinjer Cooke.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/13/2014	LAR	Review revised trial outline for Bruce Wisan.	0.3	\$ 60.00		

02/13/2014	LAR	Trial preparation for John Cook and Jethro Barlow's testimony.	2.5	\$ 500.00		
02/13/2014	CH	trial	10.0	\$ 1,250.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/14/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross and Bill Walker re strategy re witnesses and witness scheduling	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
02/14/2014	SRK	Draft email to Deborah Johnson re witness preparation for Jinjer Cooke	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2014	SRK	Review and edit designations for Steven Bateman's testimony	1.20	\$ 354.00		
02/14/2014	SRK	Review file and Draft email to Charlotte Haught re exhibits for John Cook testimony	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2014	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura and Bill Walker re How Goes It Form for next week	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/14/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re trial exhibits	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/14/2014	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re exhibits for John Cook testimony	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2014	SRK	Review Jeff Vaughn's deposition and prepare designations for trial	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/14/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Bill Richards re evidentiary issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/14/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	5.5	\$ 1,622.50	Vague; excessive.	
02/14/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits in preparation for trial testimony of Jesse Culty and Steven Bateman.	2.2	\$ 440.00		
02/14/2014	LAR	Phone call with Bill Walker regarding Jethro Barlow's travel plans.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
02/14/2014	LAR	Draft email to Donna Chrisjohn and Sandra Kane regarding Jethro's travel plans.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
02/14/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Richards, Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding issues related to deposition readers.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	

02/14/2014	LAR	Review Sandra Kane's email and attachment for Steven Bateman's deposition designations.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2014	LAR	Review email from Charlotte Haught with draft schedules for weeks 4 and 5.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2014	LAR	Review email from Charlotte Haught regarding scheduling for deposition readers.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2014	LAR	Review email from Jeff Matura with Defendants counter-designations for Willie Jessop.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
02/14/2014	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane regarding exhibits for John Cook.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits for references to Jesse Cuiilty in preparation for her trial testimony.	2.9	\$ 580.00		
02/14/2014	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, Bill Walker, Sandra Kane regarding trial preparation for week 4 of trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Internal conference.	
02/14/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/15/2014	SRK	Review Jeff Vaughn's deposition and work on Jeff Vaughn deposition designations for trial.	4.30	\$ 1,268.50		
02/15/2014	LAR	Revise Steven Bateman's trial deposition designations.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
02/16/2014	SRK	Draft trial designations for Jeff Vaughn	2.40	\$ 708.00		
02/16/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re trial designations re Jeff Vaughn	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/16/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker, Seth Cooke, Ron Cooke, Jinjer Cooke, Deborah Johnson, Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re preparation of Ron, Jinjer and Seth Cooke trial testimony	7.00	\$ 2,065.00	Internal conference.	
02/16/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re Jinjer Cooke trial preparation	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/16/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re Jeff Vaughn trial designations	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

02/16/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura with counter-designations for Steven Bateman	0.70	\$ 206.50		
02/16/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re Steven Bateman trial designations and counter-designations by Defendants	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/16/2014	SRK	Work on John Cook direct exam for trial	1.40	\$ 413.00		
02/16/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend Cookes witness preparation meeting.	8.0	\$ 2,360.00	Excessive; duplicative; internal conference.	
02/16/2014	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Bill Walker, Seth Cooke, Ron Cooke, Jinjer Cooke Deborah Johnson, Bill Richards and Sandra Kane regarding trial preparation for Ronald Cooke, Jinjer Cooke, and Seth Cooke.	5.0	\$ 1,000.00	Duplicative; internal conference.	
02/17/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re redirect of Jethro Barlow	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/17/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh and Bill Richards re Jethro Barlow redirect, Jinjer Cooke trial preparation, and status of deposition testimony and trial exhibits for Jeff Vaughn, Matthew Musser and Steven Bateman	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
02/17/2014	SRK	Work on John Cook trial examination	5.30	\$ 1,563.50		
02/17/2014	SRK	Attend part of Seth Cooke witness preparation	0.50	\$ 147.50		
02/17/2014	SRK	Meeting with John Cook in preparation for testimony	1.80	\$ 531.00		
02/17/2014	SRK	Review Matthew Musser deposition designations and counter-designations	0.60	\$ 177.00		
02/17/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards and Bill Walker re Jethro Barlow redirect	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/17/2014	SRK	Review DOJ Deposition for John Cook in preparation for trial testimony of John Cook	2.30	\$ 678.50		

02/17/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meetings.	7.8	\$ 2,301.00	Excessive; vague; internal conference.	
02/17/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	0.7	\$ 206.50	Vague.	
02/17/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' designations for Willie Jessop and determine whether we will retain or withdraw our objections.	2.5	\$ 500.00		
02/17/2014	LAR	Discuss Plaintiffs' objections to Defendants' counter-designations for Willie Jessop with Bill Richards.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
02/17/2014	LAR	Draft email to Jeff Matura regarding objection in Jeff Vaughn's deposition.	0.1	\$ 20.00		
02/17/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' counter designations to Jeff Vaughn's deposition and determine whether Plaintiffs will retain or withdraw their objections.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
02/17/2014	LAR	Discuss Plaintiffs' objections to Defendants' counter-designations for Jeff Vaughn with Bill Richards.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
02/17/2014	LAR	Draft email to Jeff Matura regarding Plaintiffs' objections within Defendants' counter-designations for Jeff Vaughn.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
02/17/2014	LAR	Prepare designations for Jeff Vaughn for trial.	4.0	\$ 800.00		
02/17/2014	LAR	Prepare trial exhibits for Jethro Barlow, Willie Jessop, and Seth Cooke.	3.5	\$ 700.00		
02/17/2014	CH	trial prep	12.0	\$ 1,500.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/18/2014	SRK	Attend trial	7.50	\$ 2,212.50		
02/18/2014	SRK	Meeting with Jinjer Cooke, Ron Cooke, Seth Cooke, Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Leslie Ross, and Brad Keogh re trial preparation	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
02/18/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, and Leslie Ross re trial strategy	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
02/18/2014	SRK	Review deposition of Peggy Sue Taylor	0.90	\$ 265.50		

02/18/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re Peggy Sue Talor deposition designations	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/18/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Peggy Sue Talor deposition designations	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/18/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.5	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
02/18/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meetings.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/18/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	7.5	\$ 1,500.00		
02/18/2014	LAR	Meeting with Jinjer Cooke, Ronald Cooke, Seth Cooke, Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Sandra Kane, and Brad Keogh regarding trial preparation.	0.7	\$ 140.00	Internal conference.	
02/18/2014	LAR	Meeting with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Sandra Kane regarding trial strategy.	0.8	\$ 160.00	Internal conference.	
02/18/2014	LAR	Review email from Charlotte Haught regarding time used by each party.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/18/2014	LAR	Review Peggy Sue Taylor's deposition designations in preparation for trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Duplicative of 2/18/2014 SRK.	
02/18/2014	LAR	Prepare Seth Cooke exhibits for trial.	0.8	\$ 160.00		
02/18/2014	CH	trial	11.0	\$ 1,375.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/19/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend trial	9.80	\$ 2,891.00		
02/19/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross and Bill Walker re direct exam of Seth Cooke	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
02/19/2014	SRK	Review video exhibits from Stubbs Field incident and Draft email to Bill Walker re same	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
02/19/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.5	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
02/19/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meetings.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Vague; excessive.	
02/19/2014	LAR	Meeting with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, Sandra Kane, and Bill Walker regarding Seth Cooke's direct examination.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	

02/19/2014	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane, Brad Keogh, Bill Richards, and Bill Walker regarding getting exhibits 436 and 437 admitted during Willie Jessop's deposition.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/19/2014	LAR	Review of Stubbs' videos that are trial exhibits in preparation for trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
02/19/2014	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane regarding trial exhibit videos of Stubbs' field.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/19/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
02/19/2014	CH	trial	11.0	\$ 1,375.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/20/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend trial	8.80	\$ 2,596.00		
02/20/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross, and Ann Hobart re Seth Cooke testimony and possible designations from Jeremiah Barlow's deposition	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
02/20/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re trial strategy	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/20/2014	SRK	Begin to review Jeremiah Barlow's deposition for possible trial designations	0.80	\$ 236.00		
02/20/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.0	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
02/20/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend witness preparation meetings.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/20/2014	LAR	Prepare for and attend meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, and Ann Hobart regarding Seth Cooke's testimony and Jeremiah Barlow's deposition designations.	1.3	\$ 260.00	Internal conference.	
02/20/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	8.7	\$ 1,740.00		
02/20/2014	CH	trial	9.0	\$ 1,125.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/21/2014	SRK	Review deposition of Jeremiah Barlow for possible trial testimony	3.00	\$ 885.00		
02/21/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re Fifth Amendment research and possible motion	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	

02/21/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re trial strategy re Fifth Amendment invocation and tape recording involving Helaman Barlow and Seth Cooke	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
02/21/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, and Leslie Ross re trial strategy re Fifth Amendment invocation and tape recording involving Helaman Barlow and Seth Cooke	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.
02/21/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re cross examination of Helaman Barlow, and areas for redirect of Seth Cooke	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.
02/21/2014	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart re strategy for redirect and Fifth Amendment, and litigation invoices	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
02/21/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re tape recording of alleged threat by Seth Cooke	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
02/21/2014	SRK	Conference call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton, Bill Richards, and Brad Keogh re How Goes it Form	0.70	\$ 206.50	
02/21/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, and Bill Walker re cross examination of Defendants' witnesses	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
02/21/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re exhibits for trial preparation	0.30	\$ 88.50	
02/21/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jesse Cuiilty re witness preparation for trial	0.30	\$ 88.50	
02/21/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.8	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.
02/21/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	4.2	\$ 1,239.00	Vague; excessive.
02/21/2014	LAR	Meeting with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane regarding trial strategy.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.
02/21/2014	LAR	Prepare Jinjer Cooke trial exhibits, Seth Cooke audio exhibit, and possible trial exhibits for Jesse Cuiilty.	6.4	\$ 1,280.00	

02/21/2014	LAR	Conference call with Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, and Sandra Kane regarding trial preparation, jury instructions regarding adverse inference jury instruction, and tape recording involving Helaman Barlow and Seth Cooke.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Internal conference.	
02/21/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Brad Keogh regarding the cross examination of Helaman Barlow and areas for Seth Cooke's redirect.	0.8	\$ 160.00	Internal conference.	
02/21/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/22/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re preparation for Seth Cooke redirect	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/22/2014	SRK	Review documents re Seth Cooke redirect	2.30	\$ 678.50		
02/22/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Seth Cooke redirect	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/23/2014	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re status of Seth Cooke redirect and various other issues	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/23/2014	SRK	Draft reply to Leslie Ross re status of Seth Cooke redirect and various other issues	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/23/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re stipulation on Exhibit 6 – General Plan Submittal Requirements	0.10	\$ 29.50		
02/23/2014	SRK	Review deposition of Vincen Barlow in preparation for cross examination	4.20	\$ 1,239.00		
02/24/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re trial preparation	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Conference with Jesse Cuiilty re trial preparation	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re trial preparation	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Review Warren Jeffs dictation re Joseph Allred for trial examination of Joseph Allred	0.30	\$ 88.50		

02/24/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Warren Jeffs dictation re Joseph Allred	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re research re impeachment of witnesses for answering questions at trial that they previously refused to answer	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re impeachment of witnesses for answering questions at trial that they previously refused to answer	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call to David Wenner re trial status and invoice	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re David Wenner invoice	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards re Vincen Barlow testimony, and Defendants' interrogatory answers	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards and Bill Walker re strategy for cross examination of defense witnesses	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Draft notes re Vincen Barlow cross examination	0.70	\$ 206.50		
02/24/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend meetings with Bill Walker, Bill Richards and Brad Keogh re information from Jeff Matura regarding Joseph Allred's intent to invoke the Fifth Amendment	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	SRK	Conference call to Jeff Matura re Joseph Allred's intent to invoke the Fifth Amendment	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/24/2014	SRK	Review emails from Bill Richards to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re invocation of the 5th Amendment, and, testimony of Vance Barlow	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/24/2014	SRK	Attend witness preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.60	\$ 177.00		
02/24/2014	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow re witness preparation of Jinjer Cooke	0.10	\$ 29.50		

02/24/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re service of trial subpoena upon Joseph Allred	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
02/24/2014	SRK	Work on insert to motion to compel testimony of Joseph Allred	2.00	\$ 590.00	
02/24/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re insert to motion to compel testimony of Joseph Allred	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
02/24/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re exhibits for Vincen Barlow deposition, and Draft email to Bill Richards re same	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.
02/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Leslie Ross re insert to motion to compel testimony of Joseph Allred re list of relevant areas that Allred cannot justify invoking 5th Amendment privilege	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.
02/24/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re preparation for Vance Barlow cross examination and Vance Barlow deposition	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
02/24/2014	SRK	Review Vance Barlow's deposition	0.30	\$ 88.50	
02/24/2014	SRK	Locate subpoena to Joseph Allred for emergency motion	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.
02/24/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow re Joseph Allred proof of service	0.10	\$ 29.50	
02/24/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re drafting motion to compel Joseph Allred's testimony	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
02/24/2014	BKK	legal research re Rule 607, FRE.	1.8	\$ 531.00	Vague; excessive.
02/24/2014	BKK	Draft memorandum to team re evidentiary issues.	0.9	\$ 265.50	
02/24/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re evidentiary issues.	2.3	\$ 678.50	Excessive; internal conference.
02/24/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding impeachment of trial witnesses that refused to answer questions during depositions.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.
02/24/2014	LAR	Meeting with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane regarding motion to compel Joseph Allred's testimony.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.

02/24/2014	LAR	Research whether the refusal of a deponent to answer a question can be used to impeach that witness's trial testimony.	2.3	\$ 460.00		
02/24/2014	LAR	Research for Plaintiffs' Emergency Motion to Compel Testimony from Joseph Allred, Mayor of Colorado City and For Instruction of the Jury on Adverse Inferences to be Drawn from Joseph Allred's Invocation of Fifth Amendment Rights.	2.3	\$ 460.00	Duplicative of prior entry.	
02/24/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding insert for Plaintiffs' Emergency Motion to Compel Testimony from Joseph Allred, Mayor of Colorado City and For Instruction of the Jury on Adverse Inferences to be Drawn from Joseph Allred's Invocation of Fifth Amendment Rights.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
02/24/2014	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Emergency Motion to Compel Testimony from Joseph Allred, Mayor of Colorado City and For Instruction of the Jury on Adverse Inferences to be Drawn from Joseph Allred's Invocation of Fifth Amendment Rights.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
02/24/2014	LAR	Draft email for Derek Funk (intern) for research on whether a refusal to answer questions during deposition can be used for impeachment during trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	LAR	Review Brad Keogh's email on same whether a refusal to answer questions during deposition can be used for impeachment during trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/24/2014	LAR	Research whether a person, who was not a witness but was attending a deposition, can be asked questions at trial about the substance discussed during the deposition in preparation for trial	1.0	\$ 200.00		
02/24/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/25/2014	SRK	Attend trial	9.00	\$ 2,655.00		

02/25/2014	SRK	Meeting with Plaintiffs' counsel re preparation of motion to compel and preparation for witness examinations of Joseph Allred and Vincen Barlow	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
02/25/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Deborah Johnson re redirect of Jinjer Cooke	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/25/2014	SRK	Review deposition of Joseph Allred in DOJ case in preparation of direct examination of Joseph Allred	2.90	\$ 855.50		
02/25/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re redirect of Jinjer Cooke	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/25/2014	SRK	Draft Outline for Joseph Allred witness examination	2.50	\$ 737.50		
02/25/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Jinjer Cooke re redirect	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/25/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.5	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
02/25/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Vague; excessive.	
02/25/2014	LAR	Highlight Vance Barlow's deposition to be read into the record during trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Clerical.	
02/25/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Richards in preparation for Helaman Barlow and Vincen Barlow's trial testimony.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/25/2014	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Motion for Leave to File Plaintiffs' Emergency Motion to Compel Testimony from Joseph Allred, Mayor of Colorado City and For Instruction of the Jury on Adverse Inferences to be Drawn from Joseph Allred's Invocation of Fifth Amendment Rights.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
02/25/2014	LAR	Draft Proposed Order for Plaintiffs' Motion for Leave for Motion to Compel.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Excessive.	
02/25/2014	LAR	Draft Plaintiffs' Motion for Expedited Consideration of Plaintiffs' Emergency Motion to Compel.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
02/25/2014	LAR	Draft Proposed Order on Motion to Expedite Motion for Leave.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Duplicative of 2/23/2014 LAR.	

02/25/2014	LAR	Review Jeff Matura's proposed deposition designations for both of Jonathan Fischer's depositions.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
02/25/2014	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane regarding Vance Barlow's deposition designations.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/25/2014	LAR	Review emails from Sandra Kane regarding Vance Barlow's deposition designations.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
02/25/2014	LAR	Revise Plaintiffs' Emergency Motion to Compel Testimony from Joseph Allred, Mayor of Colorado City and For Instruction of the Jury on Adverse Inferences to be Drawn from Joseph Allred's Invocation of Fifth Amendment Rights.	1.7	\$ 340.00		
02/25/2014	LAR	Meeting with Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Brad Keogh and Sandra Kane regarding preparation of motion to compel.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
02/25/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
02/25/2014	CH	trial	11.0	\$ 1,375.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/26/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	9.0	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
02/26/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re litigation strategy issues.	4.0	\$ 1,180.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/26/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
02/26/2014	LAR	Review and finalize Plaintiffs' Emergency Motion to Compel Testimony from Joseph Allred, Mayor of Colorado City and For Instruction of the Jury on Adverse Inferences to be Drawn from Joseph Allred's Invocation of Fifth Amendment Rights with related Motion for Leave, Motion for Expedited Consideration and proposed orders.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
02/26/2014	CH	trial	10.5	\$ 1,312.50	Vague; excessive.	
02/27/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.5	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.

02/27/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/27/2014	LAR	Review email and attachment from Bill Richards regarding outline for Joseph Allred cross examination.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
02/27/2014	LAR	Review Sandra Kane's email regarding topics to be covered with Joseph Allred during trial testimony.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/27/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Sandra Kane, and Brad Keogh regarding Vincen Barlow's deposition testimony in preparation for Vince Barlow's cross examination.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
02/27/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
02/27/2014	CH	Trial	10.0	\$ 1,250.00	Vague; excessive.	
02/28/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re planning conference call today	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/28/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re agenda for planning conference call	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/28/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re conference call and case status	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
02/28/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Leslie Ross and Brad Keogh re planning conference call	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/28/2014	SRK	Meeting with Ron and Jinjer Cooke re preparation for Vincen Barlow cross examination	1.50	\$ 442.50		
02/28/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re hearing on motion for directed verdict and cross examination of Vincen Barlow	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
02/28/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Shields re information needed in preparation for cross examination of Vincen Barlow	0.20	\$ 59.00		
02/28/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross, Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re cross examination of Defendants' witnesses, preparation of Jesse Cuiilty, and deliberative process privilege issues	1.40	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.	

02/28/2014	SRK	Conference Call with Jeff Matura, Blake Hamilton and Bill Walker re trial status and preparation for next week	0.40	\$ 118.00		
02/28/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart and Bill Richards re trial strategy and witnesses	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
02/28/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jeff Shields re UEP contact with cities re sale of water in preparation for cross examination of Vincen Barlow	0.30	\$ 88.50		
02/28/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Bill Richards re preparation for cross examination of Defendants' trial witnesses	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
02/28/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross re litigation strategy issues.	4.7	\$ 1,386.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
02/28/2014	BKK	Telephone conferences with Bill Richards and Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	1.2	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
02/28/2014	BKK	Review deposition transcripts of Helaman Barlow.	3.1	\$ 914.50		
02/28/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding motion for directed verdict and the cross examination of Vincen Barlow.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
02/28/2014	LAR	Conference call with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane regarding cross examination of Defendants' witnesses, trial preparation for Jesse Cuilty, and deliberative process privilege.	1.4	\$ 280.00	Internal conference.	
02/28/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits pertaining to Vincen Barlow in preparation for Vincen Barlow's cross examination.	1.4	\$ 280.00		
02/28/2014	LAR	Review Helaman Barlow and Vincen Barlow's depositions in preparation for cross examination of Helaman Barlow and Vincen Barlow.	0.6	\$ 120.00		

02/28/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits relating to Lorin Fischer in preparation for Lorin Fischer's cross examination.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
02/28/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' affirmative deposition designations for Jonathan Fischer and related exhibits..	1.0	\$ 200.00		
02/28/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/01/2014	SRK	Review Vincen Barlow's deposition in the DOJ case in preparation for cross examination	4.50	\$ 1,327.50		
03/01/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' affirmative deposition designations for Jonathan Fischer and related exhibits.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
03/01/2014	LAR	Email communications with Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, Bill Richards, and Brad Keogh regarding issues with Defendants' designations.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
03/01/2014	LAR	Review email from Bill Richards re issues with Defendants' designations.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
03/02/2014	LAR	Email communciations with Defendants regarding problems with Defendants' affirmative designations for Jonathan Fischer.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
03/02/2014	LAR	Review Jonathan Fischer's depositions, and Defendants' affirmative designations, and select Plaintiffs' counter-designations.	4.0	\$ 800.00		
03/02/2014	LAR	Email communications with Jeff Matura, Sandra Kane, and Bill Walker regarding demonstrative exhibits for David Komm.	0.4	\$ 80.00		
03/02/2014	LAR	Locate exhibits for Bill Richards and Bill Walker in preparation for Vincen Barlow's cross examination.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Clerical.	
03/02/2014	LAR	Review Bill Walker's email about the Bulk Water Agreement in preparation for Vincen Barlow's cross examination.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
03/03/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re trial preparation and readers for deposition designations	1.70	\$ 501.50	Internal conference.	

03/03/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Matura re designations for Jonathan Fischer, Bruce Wisan and David Zitting.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/03/2014	SRK	Draft (2) emails to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re designations for Jonathan Fischer, Bruce Wisan and David Zitting	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/03/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re Jonathan Fischer deposition designations for trial	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/03/2014	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re demonstrative exhibits that Defendants plan to use	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/03/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker, Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re demonstrative exhibits that Defendants plan to use	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/03/2014	SRK	Review email from Blake Hamilton re Bruce Wisan trial designations	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/03/2014	SRK	Draft reply to Blake Hamilton re objections to proposed demonstrative exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/03/2014	SRK	Contact potential readers for deposition designations	0.50	\$ 147.50	Clerical.	
03/03/2014	SRK	Work on designations for Jonathan Fischer's testimony	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/03/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re cross examination re utility applications	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/03/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Leslie Ross and Bill Walker re trial preparation and cross examination of Vincen Barlow	2.50	\$ 737.50	Internal conference.	
03/03/2014	SRK	Conference with Craig Soland re reading deposition designations	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/03/2014	SRK	Review email from Bryan Perry re reading deposition designations and reply	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/03/2014	SRK	Work on Jonathan Fischer's trial designations	7.50	\$ 2,212.50		
03/03/2014	BKK	Review deposition transcripts re cross-examination issues.	5.0	\$ 1,475.00	Vague; excessive.	

03/03/2014	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane, Bill Richards, Bill Walker, and Brad Keogh regarding Victor Jessop's cross examination.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/03/2014	LAR	Email communications with Sandra Kane regarding proposed counter-designations for Jonathan Fischer.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/03/2014	LAR	Review email from Charlotte Haught with election results for Hildale as mentioned by Defendants during trial.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
03/03/2014	LAR	Review email from Blake Hamilton with additional demonstrative exhibits for David Komm.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
03/03/2014	LAR	Review Jeff Matura's email with revised affirmative designations for Jonathan Fischer and Defendants' revised affirmative designations.	2.1	\$ 420.00		
03/03/2014	LAR	Review email from Blake Hamilton regarding affirmative deposition designations for Bruce Wisan.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
03/03/2014	LAR	Review and revise Charlotte Haught's pretrial notes on Lorin Fischer.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
03/03/2014	LAR	Highlight Jonathan Fischer's depositions with Plaintiffs' trial designations in preparation for trial	1.5	\$ 300.00	Clerical.	
03/03/2014	LAR	Email communications with Sandra Kane and Bill Richards regarding problems with Plaintiffs' counter-designations for Jonathan Fischer and proposed highlighting.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/03/2014	LAR	Review Jeff Matura's email regarding objections to Jonathan Fischer's depositions that Defendants withdraw, alter depositions to be used at trial to indicate withdrawn objections.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
03/03/2014	LAR	Prepare trial exhibits for Vincen Barlow.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
03/03/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits in preparation for William Greenslade's cross examination.	1.7	\$ 340.00		

03/03/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/04/2014	SRK	Attend trial	8.00	\$ 2,360.00		
03/04/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' designations re Bruce Wisan testimony	2.80	\$ 826.00		
03/04/2014	SRK	Review Bruce Wisan deposition transcript and Draft designations of Bruce Wisan testimony for Plaintiffs	4.60	\$ 1,357.00		
03/04/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re Bruce Wisan designations	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/04/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Willie Jessop re preparation for new witnesses expected to be called by Defendants	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/04/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	9.0	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
03/04/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re litigation strategy issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Excessive; internal conference.	
03/04/2014	LAR	Attend trial	9.5	\$ 1,900.00		
03/04/2014	LAR	Revise highlights on Jonathan Fischer's deposition designations in preparation for trial.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
03/04/2014	LAR	Review Blake Hamilton's email containing Defendants' affirmative designations for David Zitting.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
03/04/2014	LAR	Email communications with Ann Hobart regarding exhibits for Jonathan Fischer's deposition in preparation for trial, research trial exhibits to locate exhibits referenced and prepare exhibits for trial.	1.1	\$ 220.00	Internal conference.	
03/04/2014	LAR	Review deposition exhibits for Bruce Wisan as compared to trial exhibits and create a correlation table showing which trial exhibit is related to which deposition exhibit and whether that trial exhibit is on the stipulated exhibits list in preparation for trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
03/04/2014	CH	trial	11.0	\$ 1,375.00	Vague; excessive.	

03/05/2014	SRK	Review emails from Bill Richards, Leslie Ross and Ann Hobart re Wisan designations	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
03/05/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Leslie Ross re revisions to Wisan designations	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/05/2014	SRK	Conference call with Leslie Ross and Bill Richards re Wisan designations	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/05/2014	SRK	Attend trial	7.30	\$ 2,153.50		
03/05/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re settlement issues	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/05/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' designations for David Zitting, and begin to Draft Plaintiffs' designations for David Zitting	4.50	\$ 1,327.50		
03/05/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re designations for David Zitting	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/05/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re status of designations for David Zitting	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/05/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.5	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
03/05/2014	BKK	prepare for and attend office conference with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane re trial issues.	1.7	\$ 501.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
03/05/2014	BKK	Office conference with Tom Chenal and Ann Hobart.	1.8	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.	
03/05/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.5	\$ 1,900.00		
03/05/2014	LAR	Review Vincen Barlow's depositions and related exhibits, and revise trial preparation notes regarding Vincen Barlow in preparation for Vincen Barlow's cross examination.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
03/05/2014	CH	trial	10.5	\$ 1,312.50	Vague; excessive.	
03/06/2014	SRK	Continue to Draft designations for David Zitting deposition	1.30	\$ 383.50		
03/06/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re revisions to David Zitting deposition designations	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re revisions to David Zitting deposition designations	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

03/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Charlotte Haught re preparation of transcript for David Zitting designations	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/06/2014	SRK	Attend trial	7.00	\$ 2,065.00		
03/06/2014	SRK	Meeting with Defendants' insurance adjuster re settlement	0.70	\$ 206.50		
03/06/2014	SRK	Meeting with Judge Teilborg re jury instructions	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/06/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re settlement and adverse inference instruction	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
03/06/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	9.0	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
03/06/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross, Bill Richards and Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	2.5	\$ 737.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
03/06/2014	BKK	Office conference with Tom Chenal re litigation issues.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/06/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' affirmative deposition designations for David Zitting and Bruce Wisan and propose counter-designations..	5.0	\$ 1,000.00		
03/06/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits pertaining to Victor Jessop and compile list of possible exhibits to be used during Victor Jessop's direct examination in preparation for cross examination.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
03/06/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
03/06/2014	CH	trial	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/07/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re settlement terms	0.90	\$ 265.50	Internal conference.	
03/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re adverse inference instruction, settlement status and strategy re witnesses	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/07/2014	SRK	Review emails and case law re injunctive relief re settlement proposals	2.30	\$ 678.50		

03/07/2014	SRK	Conference call with Blake Hamilton, Brad Keogh, Bill Walker and Leslie Ross re settlement, adverse inference instruction and trial witnesses	0.60	\$ 177.00		
03/07/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Sandra Kane, Bill Richards, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re litigation strategy issues.	5.3	\$ 1,563.50	Excessive; internal conference.	
03/07/2014	BKK	Review proposed jury instructions and monitor documents.	3.7	\$ 1,091.50	Vague; excessive.	
03/07/2014	LAR	Meeting with Bill Richards, Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh, and Sandra Kane regarding possible settlement discussions.	0.9	\$ 180.00	Internal conference.	
03/07/2014	LAR	Conference call with Blake Hamilton, Brad Keogh, Bill Walker and Sandra Kane regarding settlement discussion adverse inference jury instruction and trial witnesses.	0.6	\$ 120.00		
03/07/2014	LAR	Research federal appointment of a receiver and federal appointment of a monitor.	4.3	\$ 860.00	Not related to claims.	
03/07/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane regarding results from research regarding federally appointed monitors.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/07/2014	LAR	Email Bill Richards depositions in preparation for Brian Meldrum, Brian Zitting, Andrew Chatwin, and Stephen Dark's depositions in preparation for cross examinations of same witnesses.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
03/07/2014	LAR	Draft email to Brad Keogh regarding results from research on ninth circuit caselaw Fed. R. Civ. P. 66 and the appointment of a receiver.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
03/07/2014	LAR	Research the right to appeal on a jury instruction when it has been stipulated.	0.2	\$ 40.00		

03/07/2014	LAR	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton with proposed language for the adverse inference jury instruction.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
03/07/2014	LAR	Research for adverse inference jury instruction.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
03/07/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/09/2014	SRK	Research re case law re adverse inference instruction for invocation of Fifth Amendment	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
03/09/2014	SRK	Review proposed jury instructions and compare to original	3.30	\$ 973.50		
03/09/2014	LAR	Research for adverse inference jury instruction.	4.0	\$ 800.00		
03/10/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re adverse inference instruction and jury instructions	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards, Leslie Ross, Ann Hobart and Bill Walker re adverse inference instruction, proposed jury instructions, and jury verdict form	2.30	\$ 678.50	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	SRK	Draft revised jury verdict form	0.40	\$ 118.00		
03/10/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re mock closing argument	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re designations for Andrew Chatwin, and Review Andrew Chatwin deposition re same	0.60	\$ 177.00		
03/10/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Andrew Chatwin designations	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	SRK	Review emails from Leslie Ross re Andrew Chatwin designations and preparation for Justin Barlow and Brian Meldrum cross examination	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	SRK	Draft revised jury verdict form and email same to Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Leslie Ross, Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart	1.20	\$ 354.00		
03/10/2014	SRK	Research re jury instructions re determination of amount of civil penalties and issue of general public importance	2.50	\$ 737.50		

03/10/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards, Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re civil penalties	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re jury instruction and verdict form re general public importance	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re Research re general public importance issue	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re Brian Zitting audio clips and evidence	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' affirmative deposition designations for Andrew Chatwin.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
03/10/2014	LAR	Determine deposition counter-designations for Andrew Chatwin.	0.7	\$ 140.00		
03/10/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding Andrew Chatwin counter-designations.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Richards and Sandra Kane regarding proposed counter-designations for Andrew Chatwin.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits relating to Justin Barlow in preparation for cross-examination.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
03/10/2014	LAR	Conference call with Bill Richards, Sandra Kane, Ann Hobart, and Bill Walker regarding adverse inference jury instruction, proposed jury instructions, and jury verdict form.	2.5	\$ 500.00	Internal conference.	
03/10/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits relating to Justin Barlow. Compile information on exhibits in preparation for cross-examination of Justin Barlow.	1.6	\$ 320.00		
03/10/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits relating to Brian Meldrum. Compile information on exhibits in preparation for cross-examination of Brian Meldrum.	1.8	\$ 360.00		

03/10/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits relating to Justin Barlow and Brian Zitting and compile information on exhibits in preparation for cross-examination of Justin Barlow and Brian Zitting.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
03/10/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Ann Hobart re jury instructions and jury verdict form	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Ann Hobart, Leslie Ross and Bill Walker re jury instructions, jury verdict forms, witnesses, and other trial preparation issues	2.30	\$ 678.50	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Draft revisions to jury instructions and jury verdict forms	1.20	\$ 354.00		
03/11/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re revisions to jury instructions and jury verdict forms	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Meeting with Leslie Ross re presentation of David Zitting testimony and exhibits	0.90	\$ 265.50	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re Defendants' Jonathan Fischer video excerpts	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re stipulation to Defendants' Jonathan Fischer video excerpts	0.10	\$ 29.50		
03/11/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Leslie Ross, Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re proposed revisions to plaintiffs jury instructions and jury verdict form	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Review email from David German requesting transcripts of Plaintiffs' designations from depositions	0.10	\$ 29.50	Clerical.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Conference with Charlotte Haight re transcripts of designations for David Zitting, Matthew Musser, Jeff Vaughn and Steven Bateman	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Draft email to David German re transcripts of Plaintiffs' designations from depositions	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	

03/11/2014	SRK	Review email from Charlotte Haught re remaining paralegal services for case	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart re remaining paralegal services for case	0.10	\$ 29.50	Clerical; internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re objection to Defendants' exhibit	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re hearing on jury instructions	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Draft email to Charlotte Haught re remaining paralegal services for case	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Work on designations for Craig Neeley	1.70	\$ 501.50		
03/11/2014	SRK	Draft emails to Bill Richards re Plaintiffs' designations for Craig Neeley	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' designations for Jeremiah Barlow	3.50	\$ 1,032.50		
03/11/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re transcript of Craig Neeley deposition	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	LAR	Phone call with Bill Richards and Bill Walker regarding trial exhibits for upcoming witnesses and exhibits to be used during closing argument.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	LAR	Email communications and meeting with Sandra Kane regarding the use of trial exhibits during the reading of David Zitting's counter-designations at trial.	1.1	\$ 220.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	LAR	Conference call with Sandra Kane regarding Defendants' excepts for Jonathan Fischer's designations.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	LAR	Review email from Sandra Kane regarding sample jury instructions and jury interrogatories.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	LAR	Review email from Jeff Matura with additional designations for Andrew Chatwin's deposition.	0.2	\$ 40.00		
03/11/2014	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane regarding Defendants' additional designations for Andrew Chatwin.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	

03/11/2014	LAR	Highlight Andrew Chatwin's depositions to be read at trial.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Clerical.	
03/11/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' and Plaintiffs' audio clips for the September 14, 2009 Utility Board Meeting and highlight the unofficial transcript to show the designations in preparation for trial.	2.3	\$ 460.00		
03/11/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Walker with the unofficial transcript for the September 14, 2009 Utility Board meeting in preparation for Brian Zitting's cross-examination.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
03/11/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' audio transcript for Willie Jessop's video deposition for accuracy.	3.0	\$ 600.00		
03/11/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' audio transcript for Willie Jessop's video deposition for accuracy.	1.0	\$ 200.00		
03/11/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits relating to Brian Zitting in preparation for Brian Zitting's cross examination.	1.5	\$ 300.00		
03/11/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/12/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards with transcript of Craig Neeley deposition	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
03/12/2014	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re computer problem re trial exhibits	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/12/2014	SRK	Attend hearing re jury instructions	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/12/2014	SRK	Attend trial	4.00	\$ 1,180.00		
03/12/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Leslie Ross and Ann Hobart re trial strategy and preparation for upcoming witnesses	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	
03/12/2014	SRK	Review revised jury verdict forms from Court	0.50	\$ 147.50		
03/12/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' transcript for their video designations of Willie Jessop's deposition which was played during trial..	0.5	\$ 100.00		

03/12/2014	LAR	Email Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Sandra Kane, and Brad Keogh regarding missing Defendants' how goes it form for the week and explaining my review of Defendants' transcript for Willie Jessop's video designations.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
03/12/2014	LAR	Email Bill Richards, Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Donna Chrisjohn, and Charlotte Haught regarding Judge Teilborg's instructions regarding post-trial briefing on injunctive relief at the pretrial conference.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
03/12/2014	LAR	Email Defendants about missing how goes it form and about their proposed transcript for Willie Jessop's video deposition.	0.3	\$ 60.00		
03/12/2014	LAR	Email Bill Richards, Sandra Kane, and Charlotte Haught highlighted depositions for Jeremiah Barlow in preparation for reading Jeremiah Barlow's deposition at trial, and Robert Black's deposition along with impeachment exhibits in preparation for Robert Black's cross-examination.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
03/12/2014	LAR	Preparation of exhibits for Victor Jessop and Robert Black in preparation for their cross-examinations.	2.5	\$ 500.00		
03/12/2014	CH	trial	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/13/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	9.0	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
03/13/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/13/2014	LAR	Review email from Bill Richards regarding counter-designations for Craig Neeley's deposition to be used at trial and highlight Craig Neeley's deposition in preparation for trial.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Internal conference.	

03/13/2014	LAR	Email communications with Sandra Kane, Bill Richards, Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh regarding issues with counter-designations, proposed revisions, and the highlighted version of Craig Neeley's transcript to be used at trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/13/2014	LAR	Review Bill Richards's and Sandra Kane's emails regarding proposed changes to the futile act jury instruction and other jury instructions.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
03/13/2014	LAR	Review Bill Richards's outline for Victor Jessop's cross-examination in preparation for trial and prepare exhibits.	1.1	\$ 220.00	Internal conference.	
03/13/2014	LAR	Review Bill Richards's email containing revised counter-designations for Jeremiah Barlow's deposition to be read at trial.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Internal conference.	
03/13/2014	LAR	Draft email Bill Richards, Bill Walker, and Sandra Kane the Supplement to Final Pretrial Order with information about scope of witness disclosure and specific objections noted in Supplement.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/13/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Richards and Sandra Kane regarding Jeremiah Barlow's counter-designations with proposed revisions.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
03/13/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
03/13/2014	LAR	Review proposed counter-designations for Jeremiah Barlow's deposition and highlight counter-designations in Jeremiah Barlow's transcript to be used at trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
03/13/2014	CH	trial	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/14/2014	SRK	Review text message from Bill Richards re scheduling conference call planning meeting	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	

03/14/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross, Ann Hobart and Bill Richards re scheduling conference call planning meeting	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
03/14/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross, Ann Hobart and Bill Richard re preparation for closing arguments and remaining witnesses	0.60	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.
03/14/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re conference call and call in number re completion of trial	0.20	\$ 59.00	
03/14/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re conference call and call in number re completion of trial	0.10	\$ 29.50	
03/14/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re witnesses, exhibits, closing argument, jury deliberation, jury instructions, jury verdict forms	0.40	\$ 118.00	
03/14/2014	SRK	Review proposed graphics for closing from Leslie Ross	0.30	\$ 88.50	
03/14/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re graphics and trial evidence	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.
03/14/2014	SRK	Review email court reporter from David German with transcript of J. Nicholas Hanna	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.
03/14/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re Hanna transcript	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.
03/14/2014	SRK	Review email from Leslie Ross re Hanna transcript	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.
03/14/2014	SRK	Work on arguments for closing	7.30	\$ 2,153.50	
03/14/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend telephone conferences with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Bill Richards and Bill Walker re litigation strategy issues.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Excessive; internal conference.
03/14/2014	BKK	Draft cross-examination of Helaman Barlow.	6.0	\$ 1,770.00	Excessive.

03/14/2014	LAR	Preparation and attend conference call with Bill Walker, Brad Keogh, Sandra Kane, Ann Hobart and Bill Richards regarding preparation for closing arguments and coordinating tasks for remaining witnesses.	0.6	\$ 120.00	Internal conference.	
03/14/2014	LAR	Develop sample PowerPoint presentations for closing arguments.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Clerical.	
03/14/2014	LAR	Draft email to Bill Richards and Sandra Kane regarding draft PowerPoint presentations, and alternative options for presenting the closing argument.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/14/2014	LAR	Draft emails to Bill Richards with Helaman Barlow and Sam Johnson's depositions in preparation for cross-examination of Helaman and Sam.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/14/2014	LAR	Review trial exhibits for priesthood records in preparation for closing arguments and email same to Bill Walker, Bill Richards, and Sandra Kane.	2.2	\$ 440.00		
03/14/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding graphics to use during closing argument, and exhibits which were admitted during trial.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/14/2014	LAR	Locate reference in Nick Hanna's testimony to a specific priesthood record, and draft email to Sandra Kane, Donna Chrisjohn, Charlotte Haught, Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, Bill Walker, and Ann Hobart about that reference, in preparation for Helaman Barlow's cross examination.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
03/14/2014	LAR	Review email from Rachel Ruthenberg with Defendants' trial schedule for week 8.	0.1	\$ 20.00		
03/14/2014	LAR	Review counter-designations of Jeremiah Barlow's deposition to be read at trial.	2.0	\$ 400.00		
03/14/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	

03/15/2014	LAR	Research UT and AZ POST findings and search for priesthood records in preparation for cross examination of Samuel Johnson and Helaman Barlow.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
03/15/2014	LAR	Review email from Bill Richards with ideas for closing argument.	0.3	\$ 60.00	Internal conference.	
03/15/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' opening statements in preparation for closing arguments and email same to Bill Richards and Sandra Kane.	1.3	\$ 260.00		
03/15/2014	LAR	Review Bill Richards's outline for closing argument and coordinate PowerPoint with outline.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
03/15/2014	LAR	Develop PowerPoint presentation for closing arguments.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Clerical.	
03/16/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards with draft outline of closing argument	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/16/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re closing argument	1.80	\$ 531.00	Internal conference.	
03/16/2014	SRK	Work with Leslie Ross re slides for closing statement	1.90	\$ 560.50	Internal conference.	
03/16/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards and Bill Walker re jury verdict forms and closing argument	1.30	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
03/16/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Bill Richards re slides for closing, and preparation for cross examination of Helaman Barlow and Sam Johnson	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/16/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re stipulated facts and non-contested facts	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/16/2014	SRK	Review and edit Draft revised jury verdict forms from Bill Richards	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/16/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Richards re edits to revised jury verdict forms	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/16/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re revised jury verdict forms	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/16/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re revised jury verdict form	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

03/16/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross and Ann Hobart re revised jury verdict form	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/16/2014	SRK	Review file for AZ POST deposition of Helaman Barlow, and email to Bill Richards	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/16/2014	SRK	Revise designations for Jeremiah Barlow, and Draft email to Charlotte Haught re same	0.60	\$ 177.00		
03/16/2014	LAR	Conference with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane regarding PowerPoint presentation for closing arguments and cross-examinations of Helaman Barlow and Samuel Johnson.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
03/16/2014	LAR	Meeting with Bill Richards and Sandra Kane regarding closing argument.	1.8	\$ 360.00	Internal conference.	
03/16/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding development of PowerPoint presentation for closing argument.	1.9	\$ 380.00	Internal conference.	
03/17/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards with draft closing argument	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/17/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re slides for closing argument	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/17/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re closing argument	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/17/2014	SRK	Draft revised jury verdict form	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/17/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re revised jury verdict form	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/17/2014	SRK	Attend Mock Closing Arguments	2.80	\$ 826.00	Excessive.	
03/17/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re closing arguments	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/17/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re preparation for cross examination of Helaman Barlow and Sam Johnson	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
03/17/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re trial issues.	4.5	\$ 1,327.50	Excessive; internal conference.	

03/17/2014	BKK	Attend mock closings.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Excessive; duplicative.	
03/17/2014	BKK	Trial preparation work re cross-examination issues.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Vague; excessive.	
03/17/2014	LAR	Conference with Sandra Kane regarding PowerPoint presentation for closing arguments	0.4	\$ 80.00	Internal conference.	
03/17/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and Bill Richards regarding closing arguments.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
03/17/2014	LAR	Conference with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Sandra Kane regarding closing arguments and preparation for Cross-examination of Helaman Barlow and Sam Johnson.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Internal conference.	
03/17/2014	LAR	Revise PowerPoint presentation for Bill Richards's closing argument.	3.6	\$ 720.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
03/17/2014	LAR	Attend mock closing arguments.	2.8	\$ 560.00	Duplicative.	
03/17/2014	LAR	Create closing argument PowerPoint presentation for Bill Richards's closing argument.	4.0	\$ 800.00	Clerical.	
03/17/2014	CH	trial prep	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/18/2014	SRK	Attend trial	8.00	\$ 2,360.00		
03/18/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	8.5	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
03/18/2014	BKK	Draft cross-examination of Helaman Barlow.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Duplicative of 4/14/2014 BKK.	
03/18/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	8.0	\$ 1,600.00		
03/18/2014	LAR	Review Bill Richards's outline for Helaman Barlow's cross examination and prepare trial exhibits for cross examination.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference.	
03/18/2014	CH	trial	8.0	\$ 1,000.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/19/2014	SRK	Attend trial	9.00	\$ 2,655.00		
03/19/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Bill Walker and Leslie Ross re closing arguments	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/19/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend trial.	9.0	\$ -	Excessive because did not participate in trial.	Disallowed.
03/19/2014	BKK	Office conference with Sandra Kane and Bill Richards re trial issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	

03/19/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Richards and Bill Walker in preparation for closing argument.	0.5	\$ 100.00	Internal conference.	
03/19/2014	LAR	Work with Bill Richards on revising closing argument presentation.	1.0	\$ 200.00	Internal conference.	
03/19/2014	LAR	Attend trial.	9.0	\$ 1,800.00		
03/19/2014	CH	trial	9.0	\$ 1,125.00	Vague; excessive.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re settlement offer from Defendants	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Ann Hobart and Donna ChrisJohn re settlement offer	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re settlement offer	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Donna Chrisjohn re settlement offer	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re settlement letter to State from Jeff Matura	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re settlement status	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Conference with Jinjer Cooke	0.30	\$ 88.50		
03/20/2014	SRK	Review LF Jeff Matura to Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re settlement offer	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/20/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re settlement offer	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Review LF Jeff Matura to Bill Walker re settlement	0.20	\$ 59.00		
03/20/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Bill Walker, Cookes, and Ann Hobart re settlement proposals and response	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Leslie Ross re trial	3.00	\$ 885.00	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Judge Teilborg's Clerk Teddy Bengsten re jury verdict	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
03/20/2014	SRK	Attend announcement of jury verdict	1.00	\$ 295.00		
03/20/2014	BKK	Telephone conferences with Ann Hobart re litigation issues.	1.3	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	BKK	review injunctive relief documents.	6.7	\$ 1,976.50	Excessive.	
03/20/2014	LAR	Attend reading of verdict.	0.5	\$ 100.00		

03/20/2014	LAR	Meeting with Bill Walker, Bill Richards, Sean Keveney, and Sandra Kane regarding trial.	3.0	\$ 600.00	Internal conference.	
03/20/2014	CH	attend reading of verdict	0.4	\$ 50.00		
03/21/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re injunctive relief	0.50	\$ 14.75	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/21/2014	SRK	Review court orders re jury verdict form, jury instructions, witnesses, and injunctive relief	0.70	\$ 206.50		
03/21/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re injunction issues.	3.8	\$ 112.10	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/21/2014	BKK	Review injunctive relief documents.	4.2	\$ 123.90	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/24/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re research re injunctive relief	2.20	\$ 64.90	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/24/2014	SRK	Review emails from Bill Walker, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re conference call re injunctive relief	0.20	\$ 5.90	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/24/2014	SRK	Draft reply to Bill Walker re conference call	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
03/24/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re injunctive relief	0.20	\$ 5.90	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

03/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re injunctive relief	0.30	\$ 8.85	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re meeting re injunctive relief	0.10	\$ 2.95	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re meeting re injunctive relief	0.10	\$ 2.95	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/24/2014	SRK	Meeting with Tom Chenal, Bill Richards, Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re injunctive relief	1.50	\$ 44.25	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/24/2014	BKK	Review injunctive relief pleadings.	4.0	\$ 118.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/24/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Tom Horne, Tom Chenal, Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane and Bill Richards re litigation strategy issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
03/25/2014	SRK	Review email from Jethro Barlow re injunctive relief	0.40	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/25/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jethro Barlow and Bill Walker re conference call on injunctive relief		\$ -	Incomplete entry; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	

03/25/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re injunctive relief	0.40	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/25/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards, Ann Hobart, Bill Walker Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re contact with Jeff Matura, and procedure re injunctive relief	1.50	\$ 44.25	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/25/2014	SRK	Draft email to Isaac Wyler re injunctive relief	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/25/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Bill Richards, Leslie Ross and Bill Walker injunctive relief issues.	1.8	\$ 53.10	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/25/2014	BKK	Review injunctive relief pleadings.	1.9	\$ 56.05	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/25/2014	CH	review Court's exhibits list and make sure a copy of such exhibits are in the admitted folder	0.6	\$ 75.00	Clerical.	
03/26/2014	BKK	Telephone conference with Ann Hobart re leave issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
03/26/2014	BKK	review injunctive relief pleadings .	2.2	\$ 64.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/26/2014	BKK	Legal research re injunctive relief issues.	1.4	\$ 41.30	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/27/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend conference call with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross, Bill Richards and Bill Walker re post trial issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	

03/27/2014	BKK	Review injunctive relief pleadings.	2.5	\$ 73.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/27/2014	LAR	Prepare for and attend conference call with Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Bill Richards and Bill Walker regarding injunctive relief pleadings.	3.5	\$ 70.00	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
03/28/2014	LAR	Review Plaintiff-Intervenor's Brief Re: Actions to be Taken on Liability Finding Under A.R.S. § 41-1491.35(A)(2), Interim Injunctive Relief for the Cookes, Assessment of Penalties, and Briefing on Requests for Permanent Affirmative and Prohibitory Injunctive Relief.	2.9	\$ 58.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/01/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Defendants' agreement to provide a water connection for the Cookes	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/01/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Tom Chenal re water connection for Cookes and injunctive relief	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/01/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re planning for injunctive relief filing	1.10	\$ 32.45	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/01/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re water connection for Cookes	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/01/2014	LAR	Conference with Sandra Kane regarding Plaintiff-Intervenor's Brief Re: Actions to be Taken on Liability Finding Under A.R.S. § 41-1491.35(A)(2), Interim Injunctive Relief for the Cookes, Assessment of Penalties, and Briefing on Requests for Permanent Affirmative and Prohibitory Injunctive Relief.	1.0	\$ 20.00	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

04/02/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re water connection for Cookes and Colorado City Town Council meeting	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference,	
04/02/2014	SRK	Review Research from Leslie Ross re findings of fact and conclusions of law	0.50	\$ 147.50		
04/02/2014	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane regarding Colorado City/Hildale Marshal's Office	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
04/02/2014	LAR	Research requirements for findings of fact and conclusions of law.	0.4	\$ 80.00		
04/03/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Colorado City Town Council Meeting, status of Cookes receiving water connection, and conversation with Jeff Matura re injunctive relief	0.40	\$ 11.80	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/03/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re injunctive relief re Marshal's office	0.20	\$ 5.90	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/03/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke with jury verdict	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/03/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re insurance issues.	1.4	\$ 413.00	Internal conference; not related to claims.	
04/03/2014	BKK	Telephone conference with Ian Fisher re insurance issues.	0.1	\$ 29.50	Not related to claims.	
04/04/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re settlement discussions	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
04/04/2014	SRK	Draft notes re injunctive relief	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/08/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re post trial issues.	2.3	\$ 678.50	Internal conference.	
04/08/2014	BKK	Office conference with Chuck Johnson re post trial issues.	0.7	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
04/10/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re water connection	0.30	\$ 88.50		

04/10/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re potential mediation conference	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
04/10/2014	SRK	Work on draft of injunctive relief provisions	1.50	\$ 44.25	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/10/2014	BKK	Review injunctive relief pleadings.	2.5	\$ 73.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/11/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' joint briefs in response to Cooke Plaintiffs and the State's briefs re injunctive relief.	0.90	\$ 265.50		
04/11/2014	BKK	Legal research re injunctive relief issues.	4.8	\$ 141.60	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/11/2014	BKK	Review defendants' responses to injunctive relief procedural statements.	0.2	\$ 59.00		
04/16/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Richard Holm re injunctive relief	0.80	\$ 23.60	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/16/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jinjer Cooke with Defendants' responses to Plaintiffs' briefs on procedure re injunctive relief	0.10	\$ 2.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/17/2014	CH	review DF responses to request for injunctive relief	0.5	\$ 6.25	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/22/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re mediation	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/22/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend Meeting with Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re settlement	2.00	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	

04/22/2014	SRK	Review Plaintiff-Intervenors' trial briefs re injunctive relief and statutory civil penalties	0.50	\$ 14.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/22/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re Telephone call from Jeff Matura re mediation	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
04/22/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re settlement meeting	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/22/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re injunctive relief issues.	2.0	\$ 59.00	Internal conference; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/23/2014	SRK	Review Jeff Matura's transcript requests	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
04/23/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re settlement	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2014	SRK	Work on injunctive relief provisions	1.00	\$ 29.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/23/2014	SRK	Conference with Jesse Culty re injunctive relief	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/23/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re post trial issues.	3.5	\$ 1,032.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Tom Chenal re post trial issues.	1.3	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
04/23/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re post trial issues.	2.2	\$ 649.00	Internal conference; duplicative.	
04/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re conference call for mediation	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

04/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re meeting, status of settlement, and impact of new evidence from Helaman Barlow deposition	0.30	\$ 8.85	Internal conference; unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/24/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re meeting	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Helaman Barlow deposition in DOJ case	0.30	\$ 8.85	Internal conference; unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/24/2014	SRK	Review emails from Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re settlement meeting	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/24/2014	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re Helaman Barlow's deposition in DOJ case, injunctive relief and mediation	2.20	\$ 64.90	Internal conference; unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/24/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re Meeting with Tom Chenal re settlement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
04/24/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura re mediation	0.80	\$ 236.00		
04/24/2014	BKK	Review deposition transcript of Helaman Barlow.	0.9	\$ 26.55	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

04/24/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re post trial issues.	3.1	\$ 914.50	Internal conference.	
04/25/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re mediation	0.20	\$ 59.00		
04/25/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Isaac Wyler re injunctive relief	0.40	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/25/2014	SRK	Continue to Review Helaman Barlow's deposition	2.50	\$ 73.75	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/25/2014	SRK	Draft reply to Jeff Matura re mediation	0.10	\$ 29.50		
04/25/2014	BKK	Review deposition transcript of Helaman Barlow.	1.0	\$ 29.50	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/28/2014	SRK	Continue to Review DOJ deposition of Helaman Barlow	1.50	\$ 44.25	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/28/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re mediation strategy	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
04/28/2014	SRK	Review notices of filing trial transcripts	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
04/28/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bruce Meyerson and attorneys for insurance companies and all parties re mediation	1.00	\$ 295.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
04/28/2014	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re conference call with Bruce Meyerson and all parties re mediation	0.10	\$ 29.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference.	

04/28/2014	SRK	Telephone communications with Bruce Meyerson re mediation	0.30	\$ 88.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
04/28/2014	SRK	Emails with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re scheduling pre-mediation appointment with Bruce Meyerson	0.40	\$ 118.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference.	
04/28/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re mediation	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference.	
04/28/2014	BKK	Telephone conference with mediator.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
04/28/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re post trial issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	
04/29/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re pre-mediation meeting	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
04/29/2014	SRK	Work on mediation memorandum	6.00	\$ 1,770.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
04/29/2014	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re Telephone call from Bruce Meyerson and pre-mediation meeting	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference.	
04/29/2014	SRK	Telephone call to John Cook re injunctive relief	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/29/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re injunctive relief	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

04/30/2014	SRK	Continue to Draft mediation memoranda	5.60	\$ 1,652.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
04/30/2014	SRK	Meeting with Tom Chenal, Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re mediation and injunctive relief	1.30	\$ 38.35	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference; excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
04/30/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Tom Chenal, Ann Hobart, and Sandra Kane re post trial issues.	1.4	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.	
05/01/2014	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re costs in mediation	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference; clerical.	
05/01/2014	SRK	Review email from mediator Bruce Meyerson, mediation agreement, mediation article, and mediation scheduling letter	1.00	\$ 295.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
05/01/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bruce Meyerson re scheduling letter	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
05/01/2014	SRK	Review email from Bruce Meyerson re scheduling letter	0.10	\$ 29.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
05/01/2014	SRK	Review notices from court re filing of 12 transcripts	0.30	\$ 88.50	Clerical.	
05/01/2014	SRK	Review cost spreadsheets for HUD and non-HUD Partnership Initiative expenses in preparation of mediation memorandum	0.30	\$ 88.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; clerical.	

05/01/2014	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re costs to include in mediation memorandum	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference; clerical.	
05/01/2014	SRK	Work on mediation memorandum	1.60	\$ 472.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
05/02/2014	SRK	Research re state funding for police departments and disbanding police departments in Arizona	0.80	\$ 23.60	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/02/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re Research re funding for sheriff's services in incorporated areas	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/02/2014	SRK	Research re government funding for police, sheriff's duty to provide law enforcement in unincorporated areas, intergovernmental agreements	5.10	\$ 150.45	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/02/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re post trial issues.	0.7	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	
05/05/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re strategy for mediation	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
05/06/2014	SRK	Review order from Judge Teilborg re briefing schedule	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/06/2014	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart, Leslie Ross and Brad Keogh re order re briefing schedule	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/06/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker re order re briefing schedule	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/06/2014	SRK	Conference call with Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re strategy re Judge Teilborg's order	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re strategy in responding to Judge Teilborg's order	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	

05/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Steven Bateman re injunctive relief	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/06/2014	SRK	Review emails from Bill Richards, Brad Keogh and Bill Walker re Teilborg order	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards' office re Judge Teilborg's order.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/06/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Walker and AG team re Judge Teilborg's order.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re responding to Judge Teilborg's order.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/06/2014	SRK	Review notice of change of law firm for Blake Hamilton.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Clerical.	
05/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Steven Bateman and Draft email to Steven Bateman re injunctive relief.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/06/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane and Leslie Ross re post trial issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/06/2014	BKK	Legal research re newly discovered evidence issues.	1.5	\$ 44.25	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/06/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Ann Hobart, and Brad Keogh regarding Court's 5/6/2014 Order re proposed form of judgment in preparation for proposed injunctive relief.	1.0	\$ 20.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/07/2014	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh, Leslie Ross, Ann Hobart and Bill Richards re Judge Teilborg's order re judgment, Defendants' request for stay, and newly discovered evidence.	1.10	\$ 32.45	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

05/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Judge Teilborg's law clerk with Bill Walker for clarification re citation to record and joint judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
05/07/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re preparing judgment and additional evidence to support judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/07/2014	SRK	Review and edit summary of Helaman Barlow deposition in DOJ case.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	
05/07/2014	SRK	Review amended order re judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
05/07/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re amended order re judgment.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re amended order re judgment and drafting facts supporting injunctive relief.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re judgment for attorneys' fees and costs.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/07/2014	SRK	Research re injunctive relief in fair housing cases.	0.60	\$ 17.70	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re Judge Teilborg's order and Defendants' request for stay.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
05/07/2014	SRK	Review email from Bruce Meyerson re Fireman's Fund and email from office of Fireman's Fund attorney, and Draft email to Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re same.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference.	
05/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Jeff Shields re injunctive relief.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

05/07/2014	SRK	Draft reply to Ann Hobart re amended order re judgment and Conference with Ann Hobart re judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/07/2014	SRK	Research re findings of fact.	1.80	\$ 53.10	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/07/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross and Bill Richards re post trial issues.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
05/07/2014	BKK	Review trial evidence.	1.1	\$ 32.45	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/07/2014	BKK	Draft findings for proposed form of judgment.	2.9	\$ 85.55	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/07/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh, and Bill Richards regarding Court's 5/6/2014 Order re injunctive relief and discussion regarding injunctive relief in preparation for proposed form of judgment.	1.1	\$ 220.00	Internal conference.	
05/08/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Jethro Barlow re injunctive relief.	0.50	\$ 14.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re stay of time for filing proposed judgment .	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
05/08/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re stay.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re stay and reply.	0.10	\$ 29.50		

05/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re injunctive relief.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/08/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re consent judgment terms and stipulation for extension on filing judgment.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re judgment and injunctive relief.	0.50	\$ 14.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/08/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re stay.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
05/08/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura and Blake Hamilton re stay.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
05/08/2014	SRK	Review Stirba motion to withdraw as counsel.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
05/08/2014	SRK	Research re injunctive relief.	1.50	\$ 44.25	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/08/2014	BKK	Review deposition transcript of Helaman Barlow.	1.8	\$ 53.10	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/08/2014	BKK	Draft findings for proposed form of judgment.	3.2	\$ 94.40	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/09/2014	SRK	Conference with Bill Walker re injunctive relief.	0.40	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

05/09/2014	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re injunctive relief and Telephone call to Mohave County Sheriff Sheahan and Leslie Santos re injunctive relief and costs of Sheriff patrol.	1.50	\$ 44.25	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/09/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re Meeting with AG re injunctive relief.	0.10	\$ 2.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/09/2014	SRK	Draft list of injunctive relief for mediation.	2.90	\$ 85.55	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/09/2014	SRK	Meeting with Attorney General Tom Horne, Chief Deputy Rick Bistrow, Division Chief Tom Chenal, Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re injunctive relief.	0.70	\$ 20.65	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/09/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re motion for leave to reopen evidentiary record due to newly discovered evidence.	0.40	\$ 11.80	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/09/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Tom Horne, Rick Bistrow, Tom Chenal, Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re post trial issues.	1.3	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
05/09/2014	BKK	Further drafting of findings for proposed form of judgment.	6.2	\$ 182.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

05/12/2014	SRK	Draft emails to Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh and Leslie Ross re disbandment of other police department.	0.60	\$ 17.70	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/12/2014	BKK	Draft motion for leave to reopen evidentiary record.	3.1	\$ 91.45	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/12/2014	BKK	Legal research re newly discovered evidence standard of review.	0.9	\$ 26.55	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/12/2014	LAR	Research authority regarding disbandment of police force.	1.0	\$ 20.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/13/2014	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re Mohave County Sheriff's Office cost projections for law enforcement in Colorado City.	0.40	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/13/2014	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re costs projections for Sheriff's patrol of Colorado City .	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/13/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re injunctive relief re Marshal's Office and copies of transcripts.	0.40	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/13/2014	SRK	Order transcripts for Helaman Barlow and Sam Johnson.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
05/13/2014	SRK	Research re injunctive relief.	4.30	\$ 126.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

05/13/2014	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re Sheriff's cost projections and reply.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/13/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re preparation of findings in support of judgment re police.	0.40	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/13/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re injunctive relief re Marshal's Office and copies of transcripts.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/13/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re injunctive relief issues.	1.6	\$ 47.20	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/13/2014	BKK	Legal research re Title 9 issues.	1.0	\$ 29.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/13/2014	BKK	Draft findings for proposed form of judgment.	4.4	\$ 129.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/14/2014	SRK	Research re injunctive relief.	3.20	\$ 94.40	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/14/2014	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re mediation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference.	
05/14/2014	SRK	Review Hildale Defendants' Response to State's Opening Brief re Injunctive Relief.	0.30	\$ 88.50		

05/14/2014	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re injunctive relief re police.	0.80	\$ 23.60	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/14/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re injunctive relief re police.	1.20	\$ 35.40	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/14/2014	SRK	Review emails from Bill Richards re injunctive relief re police.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/14/2014	BKK	Legal research re newly discovered evidence issues.	0.8	\$ 23.60	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/14/2014	BKK	Draft motion for leave to reopen evidentiary record.	3.3	\$ 97.35	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/14/2014	BKK	Draft findings for proposed form of judgment.	2.9	\$ 85.55	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/15/2014	SRK	Review emails from Bill Richards re injunctive relief and preparation of judgment.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/15/2014	SRK	Research re attorney duty to notify court of client's perjury.	1.50	\$ 44.25	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/15/2014	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh with proposed findings of fact re police and draft motion for leave to reopen evidentiary record.	0.70	\$ 20.65	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

05/15/2014	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart, Leslie Ross and Bill Richards re meeting to discuss proposed findings of fact.	0.10	\$ 2.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/15/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re preparation of judgment.	0.10	\$ 2.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/15/2014	SRK	Research re injunctive and affirmative relief in fair housing cases.	2.40	\$ 70.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/15/2014	BKK	Further drafting of motion for leave and findings for proposed form of judgment.	5.2	\$ 153.40	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/15/2014	BKK	Review deposition transcript of Helaman Barlow re same.	0.8	\$ 23.60	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/16/2014	SRK	work on gathering attorneys fee information from Leslie Ross, Brad Keogh and Charlotte Haught.	0.70	\$ 206.50		
05/16/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart re recovery of attorney fees.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
05/16/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re State's mediation memoranda.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference.	
05/16/2014	SRK	work on mediation terms and memoranda.	2.40	\$ 708.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	

05/16/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re injunctive relief issues.	1.0	\$ 29.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/16/2014	BKK	Legal research re injunctive relief issues.	3.0	\$ 88.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
05/16/2014	CH	return Sandra Kane call re hours worked on case and rate	0.3	\$ 37.50	Internal conference.	
05/20/2014	BKK	Review mediation statements.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
05/20/2014	BKK	Revise Arizona's mediation statement.	1.5	\$ 442.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
05/27/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend meeting with mediator Bruce Meyerson, Ann Hobart, and Sandra Kane.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
05/28/2014	BKK	Review declaratory judgment complaint filed by Colorado City's insurer.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
05/30/2014	BKK	Review mediation statements.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
05/30/2014	BKK	Prepare for Cooke mediation.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
06/02/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend mediation to attempt to resolve case.	9.00	\$ 2,655.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; duplicative.	

06/02/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend mediation.	11.0	\$ 3,245.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; duplicative.
06/03/2014	SRK	Prepare for and attend mediation to attempt to resolve case.	11.50	\$ 3,392.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.
06/03/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend mediation.	12.0	\$ 3,540.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; duplicative.
06/04/2014	BKK	Revise motion to reopen evidentiary record.	3.0	\$ 885.00	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.
06/05/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bruce Meyerson re mediation.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.
06/05/2014	SRK	Review emails from Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re mediation inquiry.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation; internal conference.
06/05/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re mediation and proposed judgment.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.
06/05/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bruce Meyerson re mediation.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.
06/05/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bruce Meyerson re mediation inquiry re receiver and review process for decision-making.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.
06/05/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bruce Meyerson re mediation.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.

06/05/2014	BKK	Draft memorandum re settlement issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
06/06/2014	SRK	Conference with Legal Extern Ethan Bernardone and Ann Hobart re research re Colorado City receivership and municipality's inability to operate police force due to lack of insurance.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/06/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bruce Meyerson re mediation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
06/06/2014	SRK	Review Bill Richards' draft of proposed judgment.	0.50	\$ 14.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/09/2014	SRK	Review research memo from Legal Extern Ethan Bernardone re disbanding police and judicial powers.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/09/2014	SRK	Conference with Ethan Bernardone re research re disbanding police and judicial powers.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/09/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re preparation of judgment.	1.00	\$ 29.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

06/09/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards re strategy, legal issues and evidence related to preparation of judgment.	1.50	\$ 44.25	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/09/2014	BKK	Review deposition of Helaman Barlow.	0.8	\$ 23.60	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/09/2014	BKK	Revise motion for leave to re-open evidentiary record.	1.1	\$ 32.45	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/09/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane and Bill Richards re judgment issues.	2.1	\$ 61.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/10/2014	SRK	Review and edit draft judgment.	1.20	\$ 35.40	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/10/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Walker and Bill Richards re preparation of judgment and injunctive relief issues.	0.70	\$ 20.65	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/10/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards with partially edited judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/10/2014	BKK	Revise motion for leave to re-open evidentiary record.	1.4	\$ 41.30	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/10/2014	BKK	Revise proposed form of Judgment.	2.1	\$ 61.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

06/11/2014	SRK	Review email from Court Reporter David German with trial transcripts, and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Clerical.	
06/11/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Walker re draft notice of settlement by Cookes and Defendants.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/11/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re preparation of judgment and Cookes' draft notice of settlement.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/11/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh re settlement notice.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/11/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re drafting judgment.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/11/2014	SRK	Review and edit draft judgment.	4.00	\$ 118.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/11/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re coordination of drafting judgment.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/11/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bill Richards re ordering trial transcripts for use in proposed judgment and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/11/2014	SRK	Research re supplemental jurisdiction after settlement of federal claims.	0.50	\$ 147.50		
06/12/2014	SRK	Draft inserts to proposed judgment.	2.00	\$ 59.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/12/2014	SRK	Work with Bill Richards on preparation of proposed judgment.	7.00	\$ 206.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/12/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re evidentiary issues.	0.6	\$ 177.00	Internal conference.	

06/12/2014	BKK	Revise proposed form of Judgment.	1.4	\$ 41.30	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/13/2014	SRK	Work on drafting and editing sections of proposed judgment re injunctive and affirmative relief, and draft fact sections re building permits and ROW permits.	8.50	\$ 250.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/13/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re motion to reopen evidentiary record.	0.40	\$ 11.80	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/13/2014	SRK	Review and edit draft motion to reopen evidentiary record.	2.60	\$ 76.70	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/13/2014	BKK	Review exemplar injunctions.	3.2	\$ 94.40	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/13/2014	BKK	Review proposed form of Judgment from Bill Richards.	0.8	\$ 23.60	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/14/2014	SRK	Review and edit sections of proposed judgment drafted by Bill Richards.	3.00	\$ 88.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/14/2014	SRK	Work with Bill Richards on motion to reopen evidentiary record and proposed judgment.	1.30	\$ 38.35	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

06/14/2014	SRK	Finish editing motion to reopen evidentiary record.	2.80	\$ 82.60	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/14/2014	SRK	Draft fact section of proposed judgment re police issues.	2.30	\$ 67.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/14/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re status of preparation of judgment and Telephone call from Ann Hobart re injunctive relief.	0.80	\$ 23.60	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/15/2014	SRK	Draft fact section of proposed judgment re water conspiracy.	10.30	\$ 303.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/16/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards re additional work needed on proposed judgment and motion to reopen evidentiary record.	0.80	\$ 23.60	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/16/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards with revised motion to reopen evidentiary record.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/16/2014	SRK	Conference with Legal Extern Ethan Bernardone re cite checking cases in motion.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	

06/16/2014	SRK	Draft pattern or practice and water portions of proposed judgment, Draft Notice of Filing Proposed Judgment, Review emails from Brad Keogh, Ann Hobart, Leslie Ross and Bill Richards re proposed revisions to Motion for Leave to Reopen Evidentiary Record, Motion for Leave to File Motion for Leave to Reopen Evidentiary Record, Work with Bill Richards and Review and Edit proposed Judgment and Draft Notice of Filing Proposed Judgment.	13.20	\$ 389.40	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; block billing; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/16/2014	BKK	Revise proposed form of Judgment.	2.4	\$ 708.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	
06/16/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart re injunctive relief issues.	1.9	\$ 560.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	
06/16/2014	BKK	Revise Motion for Leave to Re-Open Evidentiary Record.	1.2	\$ 35.40	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

06/16/2014	LAR	Review Final Pretrial Conference transcript for information on whether a motion for leave is necessary for motions filed after trial ended. Draft same to Bill Richards and Sandra Kane.	1.3	\$ 26.00	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/16/2014	LAR	Revise Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motion for Leave to File Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motion for Leave to Re-Open Evidentiary Record and related orders.	0.5	\$ 10.00	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/16/2014	LAR	Draft Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motion for Leave to File Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motion for Leave to Re-Open Evidentiary Record, the Proposed Order on the Motion for Leave, and Proposed Order on the Motion to Re-Open the Evidentiary Record. Email same to Sandra Kane, Bill Richards, Ann Hobart, and Brad Keogh.	2.0	\$ 40.00	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; block billing.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/16/2014	LAR	Review and revise Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motion for Leave to File Plaintiff-Intervenor State of Arizona's Motion for Leave to Re-Open Evidentiary Record, Plaintiff-Intervenor's Motion to Re-Open Evidentiary Record, and related orders.	3.0	\$ 60.00	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/17/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re Research in preparation for reply in support of proposed judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/17/2014	SRK	Meeting with Legal Externs Ethan and Daniel Bernardone re research assignments, Draft email to Ethan and Daniel Bernardone re research.	0.70	\$ 206.50	Internal conference.	

06/17/2014	SRK	Research re injunctive relief.	0.50	\$ 14.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/17/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conferences with Attorney General Horne.	0.2	\$ 59.00	Vague; internal conference.	
06/17/2014	BKK	Draft memorandum to Attorney General Horne re post-trial issues.	0.3	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/18/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Brad Keogh re proposed judgment and legal issues.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/18/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re meeting to discuss research issues re injunctive relief.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/18/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re proposed judgment and identification of potential monitors.	0.50	\$ 14.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/18/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re missing paragraphs in proposed judgment.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/18/2014	SRK	Draft reply to Jeff Matura.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/18/2014	SRK	Draft email to insurance attorney Alan Hyde with requested documents re pleadings .	0.50	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.	
06/18/2014	SRK	Draft email to Donna Chrisjohn and AG team re missing paragraphs.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/18/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart.	1.0	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
06/18/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane regarding research needed to support request for injunctive relief.	0.3	\$ 6.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

06/18/2014	LAR	Research requirements for trial memos regarding requests for injunctive relief and research related cases.	4.0	\$ 80.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/19/2014	SRK	Review emails from Brad Keogh and Donna Chrisjohn re Defendants' email re missing paragraphs in proposed judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/19/2014	SRK	Review filed version of proposed judgment re missing paragraphs.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Clerical.	
06/19/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re no missing paragraphs in proposed judgment.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/19/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re additional missing paragraphs.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
06/19/2014	SRK	Review email from Jeff Matura re computer problem re missing paragraphs, and reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/19/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re Research re anticipated defenses re police dept..	1.20	\$ 35.40	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/19/2014	SRK	Conference with Jennifer Larson re research assignment in support of affirmative relief requested by State.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/19/2014	SRK	Draft emails to John Cook, Patrick Barlow, Richard Holm and Jeff Shields re status of injunctive relief.	1.00	\$ 29.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/19/2014	SRK	Email communications with Bill Richards re issues relating to circumvention of proposed judgment	0.70	\$ 20.65	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

06/19/2014	SRK	Review draft judgment.	0.10	\$ 2.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/19/2014	SRK	Draft email to Jeff Matura with duplicate copy of filed version of proposed judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
06/19/2014	SRK	Meeting with Daniel Bernardone re research on affirmative relief.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/19/2014	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re UT AG support for action re Hildale police disbandment.	0.10	\$ 2.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/20/2014	SRK	Review articles in Salt Lake Tribune re Willie Jessop's purchase of TCIA water rights, Willie Jessop's arrest in Texas, and Helaman Barlow's statements about FLDS control of Marshal's office.	0.80	\$ 23.60	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; not related to claims.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/20/2014	SRK	Review Research memos from Legal Externs Daniel Bernardone and Ethan Bernardone in preparation for meeting re legal research re anticipated objections to State's proposed judgment.	0.70	\$ 20.65	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/20/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, Jennifer Larson, and Ethan and Daniel Bernardone re legal research re anticipated objections from Defendants re State's proposed judgment.	2.00	\$ 59.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/20/2014	BKK	Review memoranda from Bill Richards re injunctive relief issues.	0.1	\$ 2.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

06/20/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane and Bill Richards re injunctive relief issues.	2.1	\$ 61.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/23/2014	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re UT AG support for injunctive relief.	0.10	\$ 2.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/23/2014	SRK	Review email from Isaac Wyler re possible dissipation of assets by Hildale.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
06/24/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re case status and assistance with reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
06/24/2014	SRK	Meeting with Legal Externs Daniel Bernardone and Ethan Bernardone re legal research re injunctive and affirmative relief.	1.50	\$ 44.25	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/25/2014	SRK	Conference with Daniel Bernardone re legal research re injunctive relief.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/25/2014	SRK	Review Research memo from Daniel Bernardone re injunctive and affirmative relief.	0.50	\$ 14.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/25/2014	SRK	Draft email to Daniel Bernardone for additional information re research memo.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/26/2014	SRK	Conference with Ethan Bernardone re employment of peace officers.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
06/26/2014	SRK	Review email from Jennifer Larson re Research on affirmative relief against cities under the Fair Housing Act, and Draft email to Jennifer Larson requesting additional research.	0.70	\$ 20.65	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

06/27/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' joint response to proposed judgment, and work on related research including effect of jury verdict on court's findings and law of the case doctrine, and Draft email to Leslie Ross re research.	2.30	\$ 67.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/27/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re strategy for preparation of reply and new evidence of subornation of perjury.	0.70	\$ 20.65	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/27/2014	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh re reply to police issues raised in defendants' response.	0.60	\$ 17.70	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/27/2014	SRK	Review Research memo from Daniel Bernardone re legal test for affirmative injunctive relief.	0.40	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/27/2014	SRK	Draft email to AG team re meeting to discuss defendants' response and preparation of reply re proposed judgment.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/27/2014	BKK	Review defendants' response to proposed form of judgment.	2.5	\$ 73.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/27/2014	BKK	Legal research re same.	2.1	\$ 61.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/27/2014	BKK	Review final pretrial order.	0.4	\$ 118.00		
06/27/2014	BKK	Draft memorandum to Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross, and Bill Richards re evidentiary issues.	2.0	\$ 590.00	Internal conference.	

06/27/2014	LAR	Draft email to Sandra Kane regarding U.S. v. Balistreri, which indicates that a court is bound by the jury's determination of a pattern or practice of discrimination in a fair housing case.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
06/27/2014	LAR	Review Defendants' Joint Response to the State of Arizona's Proposed Judgment.	0.5	\$ 100.00		
06/27/2014	LAR	Research injunctive relief requirements and to what extent Court may be bound by jury's ruling.	1.5	\$ 30.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/27/2014	LAR	Review transcripts and locate support for the State's facts to respond to allegation put forward in Defendants' Joint Response to the State of Arizona's Proposed Judgment that the State's facts are unsupported by the evidence.	0.5	\$ 10.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/28/2014	SRK	Begin to Review Defendants' joint response to State of Arizona's proposed judgment.	1.90	\$ 56.05	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/30/2014	SRK	Review remainder of Defendants' joint response to State of Arizona's proposed judgment.	1.60	\$ 47.20	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/30/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re approach to replying to Defendants' response.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
06/30/2014	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart, Leslie Ross and Bill Richards re issues raised in Defendants' response and preparation of reply.	1.50	\$ 442.50	Internal conference.	
06/30/2014	SRK	Meeting with Brad Keogh, Bill Richards and rest of AG team re strategy for reply re State's proposed judgment.	2.00	\$ 59.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/30/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' joint response to proposed judgment re alternate facts proposed and claims of no evidence presented.	1.20	\$ 35.40	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

06/30/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re preparation of reply re State's proposed Judgment.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
06/30/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross, and Bill Richards re injunction issues.	2.4	\$ 70.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/30/2014	BKK	Legal research re injunctive relief issues.	0.6	\$ 17.70	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
06/30/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Ann Hobart, and Bill Richards regarding issues raised in Defendants' Joint Response to the State of Arizona's Proposed Judgment in preparation for the State's reply.	1.5	\$ 300.00	Internal conference.	
06/30/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Ann Hobart, Brad Keogh, and Bill Richards regarding strategy for Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment.	2.0	\$ 400.00	Internal conference.	
06/30/2014	LAR	Draft sections of Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment where Defendants' alleged that the evidence does not support the State's fact.	2.0	\$ 40.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/01/2014	SRK	Meeting with Bill Richards and AG Team re outline for reply re proposed judgment.	1.20	\$ 354.00	Internal conference.	
07/01/2014	SRK	Meeting with legal externs Daniel and Ethan Bernardone re Research needed for reply.	0.50	\$ 147.50	Internal conference.	
07/01/2014	SRK	Draft portion of reply re disputed facts and lack of evidence.	1.20	\$ 35.40	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

07/01/2014	SRK	Work with Leslie Ross on response to fact issues raised by Defendants.	3.50	\$ 103.25	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/01/2014	SRK	Draft emails to AG team re Research for reply re proposed judgment.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/01/2014	BKK	Legal research re Title 41 and federal precedent issues.	2.3	\$ 678.50	Not related to claims.	
07/01/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart, Sandra Kane, Leslie Ross, and Bill Richards re post trial issues.	1.3	\$ 383.50	Internal conference.	
07/01/2014	BKK	Commence drafting reply in support of proposed form of judgment.	0.4	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/01/2014	LAR	Phone call with Sandra Kane regarding pagination issue with non-appellate record transcripts versus appellate record transcripts.	0.1	\$ 20.00	Internal conference.	
07/01/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane, Bill Richards, Brad Keogh, and Ann Hobart regarding outline for Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment	1.2	\$ 240.00	Internal conference.	
07/01/2014	LAR	Phone call with David German (court reporter) regarding obtaining excerpts of the appellate transcript in preparation for Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment.	0.2	\$ 40.00	Clerical.	
07/01/2014	LAR	Draft sections of Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment supported by Richard Holm's testimony and Isaac Wyler's testimony.	1.2	\$ 240.00	Internal conference.	
07/01/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane to work on responses to fact issues raised by Defendants for the State's Reply in support of proposed judgment.	3.5	\$ 70.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

07/01/2014	LAR	Draft responses for Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment to paragraphs in Defendants' Joint Response to the State of Arizona's Proposed Judgment where Defendants propose alternative language to the proposed judgment.	0.7	\$ 14.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/01/2014	LAR	Draft responses for Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment to paragraphs in Defendants' Joint Response to the State of Arizona's Proposed Judgment where Defendants propose alternative language to the proposed judgment.	3.0	\$ 60.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/02/2014	SRK	Conference with Donna Chrisjohn re preparation of exhibits for reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/02/2014	SRK	Review email from mediator Bruce Meyerson.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
07/02/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards' office re status of reply.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/02/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Ann Hobart re ordering trial transcript, and Telephone call to David German re same.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Clerical; internal conference.	
07/02/2014	SRK	Review Research re injunctive relief from legal externs and forward to team.	0.40	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/02/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bruce Meyerson re mediation.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	
07/02/2014	SRK	Draft email to Bruce Meyerson re mediation.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Unnecessary because the State of Arizona refused to negotiate at mediation.	

07/02/2014	SRK	Draft reply section re alternative facts.	0.90	\$ 26.55	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/02/2014	SRK	Work on fact issues for reply with Leslie Ross.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/02/2014	SRK	Draft portion of reply re proposed judgment re Defendants' alternate facts.	4.50	\$ 132.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/02/2014	BKK	Legal research re injunctive relief issues.	1.0	\$ 29.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/02/2014	BKK	Further drafting of reply in support of proposed form of judgment.	7.5	\$ 221.25	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/02/2014	LAR	Draft responses for Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment to paragraphs in Defendants' Joint Response to the State of Arizona's Proposed Judgment where Defendants propose alternative language to the proposed judgment.	1.3	\$ 26.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/02/2014	LAR	Order transcripts in preparation for Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment.	0.4	\$ 80.00	Clerical.	

07/02/2014	LAR	Draft responses for Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment to paragraphs in Defendants' Joint Response to the State of Arizona's Proposed Judgment where Defendants claim there is no evidence to support the State's facts.	6.0	\$ 120.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/02/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane coordinating tasks for Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment.	2.0	\$ 40.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/03/2014	SRK	Continue to Draft section of reply re proposed judgment re Defendants' alternate facts.	2.00	\$ 59.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/03/2014	SRK	Work with Leslie Ross on reply re Defendants' alternate facts, Meeting with Leslie Ross and legal externs Daniel and Ethan Bernardone re reply re injunctive relief issues.	2.00	\$ 59.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/03/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards and AG Team re coordination of drafting of reply and legal issues.	1.00	\$ 295.00	Internal conference.	
07/03/2014	SRK	Conference with Ann Hobart and Leslie Ross re section of reply re statutory civil penalties, attorneys' fees and costs.	0.80	\$ 236.00	Internal conference.	
07/03/2014	SRK	Work on drafting and editing reply.	2.00	\$ 59.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/03/2014	SRK	Review section of reply re police and permanent injunction.	0.40	\$ 11.80	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

07/03/2014	BKK	conferences call with Bill Richards re post trial issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/03/2014	BKK	Legal research re injunctive relief issues.	1.0	\$ 29.50	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/03/2014	BKK	Further drafting of reply in support of proposed form of judgment.	7.1	\$ 209.45	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/03/2014	LAR	Email communications with Sandra Kane regarding the Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment.	0.3	\$ 6.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/03/2014	LAR	Review and revise draft Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment.	0.2	\$ 4.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/03/2014	LAR	Research federal cases allowing for broad injunctive relief to include in Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment.	6.1	\$ 122.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/03/2014	LAR	Meeting with Sandra Kane and externs regarding drafting and revising Reply in support of proposed judgment.	2.0	\$ 40.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/04/2014	SRK	Draft section of reply in support of proposed judgment re alternate facts proposed by Defendants.	4.50	\$ 132.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/04/2014	SRK	Review Defendants' response to proposed judgment re objections based on no evidence.	4.30	\$ 126.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/04/2014	SRK	Research re court's authority to issue injunctive relief.	1.40	\$ 41.30	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

07/04/2014	SRK	Review and edit partial draft reply from Bill Richards.	2.30	\$ 67.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/05/2014	SRK	Additional Research re injunctive relief and outline reply re injunctive relief.	9.40	\$ 277.30	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/05/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross and Bill Richards re preparation of reply.	0.70	\$ 20.65	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/05/2014	LAR	Draft sections of Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment.	4.0	\$ 80.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/05/2014	LAR	Review Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment and revise citations to the record.	3.0	\$ 60.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/06/2014	LAR	Telephone and email communications with Sandra Kane to discuss tasks that need to be completed for the Reply.	0.6	\$ 12.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/06/2014	LAR	Draft sections of Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment pertaining to paragraphs 79, 90, and 350 where Defendants claimed there was no evidence to support the factual finding.	2.7	\$ 54.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/06/2014	LAR	Revise sections of Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment.	3.0	\$ 60.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/07/2014	SRK	Continue to Draft reply in support of proposed judgment.	2.60	\$ 76.70	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

07/07/2014	SRK	Conference call with Bill Richards and Leslie Ross re coordination of reply.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/07/2014	SRK	Review email from Joni Jones re UT AG support of disbandment of Hildale Marshal's Office.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Joni Jones re UT AG letter of support.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Richards re article about questions for Sam Johnson re arrest of non-FLDS Tom Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
07/07/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Ann Hobart re re article about questions for Sam Johnson re arrest of non-FLDS Tom Barlow.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Not related to claims.	
07/07/2014	SRK	Review email from Bruce Wisan re injunctive relief re subdivision issues.	0.10	\$ 2.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/07/2014	SRK	Continue to Draft reply.	12.50	\$ 368.75	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/07/2014	LAR	Review and finalize Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment.	16.0	\$ 320.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/08/2014	LAR	Review Reply Brief in Support of Proposed Judgment for any errors.	2.0	\$ 40.00	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/17/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Leslie Ross re leave issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims; internal conference.	

07/17/2014	BKK	Draft Notice of Supplement of Motion for Leave to Re-Open Evidentiary Record.	0.1	\$ 29.50	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	
07/21/2014	SRK	Review State's Reply in Support of Judgment.	3.10	\$ 91.45	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/21/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re reply to Defendants' response to motion to reopen evidentiary record.	0.10	\$ 2.95	Excessive and unnecessary because injunctive relief sought was not granted; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/21/2014	SRK	Draft reply to Bill Richards re reply to Defendants' response to motion to reopen evidentiary record.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/22/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Jinjer Cooke re status of judgment.	0.30	\$ 88.50		
07/22/2014	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh and AnnHobart re meeting re filing response/reply re motion to reopen evidentiary record.	0.10	\$ 2.95	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/22/2014	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh and reply.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	
07/22/2014	SRK	Review email from Brad Keogh with draft reply re motion for leave to file motion to reopen evidentiary record.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

07/22/2014	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart and Brad Keogh re reply re motion for leave to file motion to reopen evidentiary record and new police incidents.	1.80	\$ 53.10	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/22/2014	SRK	Conference with Legal Externs Ethan and Daniel Bernardone re legal research in support of reply re motion for leave to file motion to reopen evidentiary record.	0.20	\$ 5.90	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/22/2014	SRK	Review motion for leave to file motion to reopen evidentiary record and Defendants' Response in preparation for reply.	2.60	\$ 76.70	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/22/2014	BKK	Review defendants' response to motion for leave.	0.3	\$ 8.85	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/22/2014	BKK	Legal research re leave issues.	0.9	\$ 26.55	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/22/2014	BKK	Draft reply in support of motion for leave to file motion for leave to reopen evidentiary record.	4.7	\$ 138.65	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/22/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re leave issues.	1.6	\$ 47.20	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.

07/23/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Richards re State's reply re motion to reopen discovery, preparation of attorney fee petition, and Colorado City's subpoena to the Attorney General's Office.	0.40	\$ 11.80	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference; not related to claims; block billing.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/23/2014	SRK	Review emails from Legal Extern Ethan Bernardone re Research to support reply re motion for leave to file motion to reopen evidentiary record.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/23/2014	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh re research to support reply to Defendants' response to motion to reopen evidentiary record.	0.10	\$ 2.95	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/23/2014	SRK	Review additional email from Ethan Bernardone re additional legal Research for reply re motion for leave to reopen evidentiary record and forward to Brad Keogh.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/23/2014	BKK	Revise reply in support of motion for leave.	3.1	\$ 91.45	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/23/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re evidentiary issues.	1.4	\$ 413.00	Internal conference.	
07/24/2014	SRK	Conference with Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re reply to motion for leave to move to reopen evidentiary record.	0.30	\$ 8.85	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony; internal conference.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/24/2014	SRK	Review email from Ann Hobart re draft reply.	0.10	\$ 29.50	Internal conference.	

07/24/2014	SRK	Review and edit reply re motion for leave to move to reopen evidentiary record.	2.00	\$ 59.00	Unnecessary because did not obtain relief sought regarding Helaman Barlow's post-trial testimony.	Relates to proposed judgment or motion to reopen evidentiary record; reduced by 90%.
07/25/2014	SRK	Draft email to Ann Hobart, Karen Hartman-Tellez re preparation of fee petition.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/25/2014	SRK	Draft reply to Ann Hobart.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/25/2014	BKK	Telephone conference with Ann Hobart.	0.2	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/25/2014	BKK	Legal research re fee application issues.	0.6	\$ 177.00	No basis for fees sought to prepare fee application.	
07/25/2014	BKK	Draft memorandum to Ann Hobart and Sandra Kane re fee issues.	0.2	\$ 59.00	No basis for fees sought to prepare fee application.	
07/28/2014	SRK	Draft email to Brad Keogh and Ann Hobart re recovering attorneys' fees and costs.	0.30	\$ 88.50	No basis for fees sought to prepare fee application.	
07/28/2014	SRK	Review Order from Judge Teilborg re settlement with Cookes.	0.20	\$ 59.00		
07/28/2014	SRK	Telephone call to Bill Walker re status of Cooke settlement.	0.20	\$ 59.00	Internal conference.	
07/28/2014	SRK	Meeting with Ann Hobart, Leslie Ross and Donna Chrisjohn re preparation of attorney fee award.	1.20	\$ 354.00	No basis for fees sought to prepare fee application; internal conference.	
07/28/2014	SRK	Review email from Bill Richards re Order from Judge Teilborg.	0.10	\$ 29.50		
07/28/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re auditor letter issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00	Not related to claims.	
07/29/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re stipulation to dismiss Cooke claims.	0.30	\$ 88.50	Internal conference.	
07/30/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Bill Walker re status of notice of dismissal, Cooke settlement, injunctive relief and UEP issues.	0.40	\$ 118.00	Internal conference.	
07/30/2014	SRK	Review Stipulation for Dismissal with Prejudice of Plaintiffs Cookes' Personal Claims and proposed order.	0.20	\$ 59.00		

07/30/2014	BKK	Review televised interview with Roger Hoole and Blake Hamilton.	0.5	\$ 147.50	Not related to claims.
08/04/2014	SRK	Conference with Leslie Ross re preparation of attorneys fee petition.	0.20	\$ 59.00	No basis for fees sought to prepare fee application.
08/04/2014	BKK	Prepare for and attend office conference with Sandra Kane re attorneys' fees issues.	0.4	\$ 118.00	No basis for fees sought to prepare fee application; internal conference.
08/13/2014	SRK	Telephone call from Leslie Ross re preparation of fee petition.	0.20	\$ 59.00	No basis for fees sought to prepare fee application; internal conference.
			9341.30	\$ 2,165,039.30	
2. Non-Taxable Expenses					
DATE	DESCRIPTION			AMOUNT	
01/14/2011	Brett L. John: State's share of expert witness fee for consulting services during investigation into location of municipal water connection near the Cooke residence.			\$ 550.00	
08/08/2011	Driver and Nix, Invoice #81330: Transcriptions of Arizona Civil Rights Division's administrative interviews with Jonathan Fischer, Victor Jessop, Tyler Barlow, Jeremiah Barlow, David Darger Vol. 1, David Darger, Vol. 2, and Freeman Barlow.			\$ 2,177.00	
10/03/2011	Zachary D. Renstrom, P.E., Invoice #567: State's share of expert witness consulting fees regarding municipal water system and culinary water. (Total invoice \$3037.00)			\$ 1,518.50	
10/18/2011	Zachary D. Renstrom, P.E., Invoice #653: State's share of expert witness consulting fees regarding municipal water system and culinary water, review of depositions and records, and preparation of expert report. (Total invoice \$7315.25)			\$ 3,657.63	
11/16/2011	Southwest Airlines: Sandra Kane's travel to Utah for depositions of UEP witnesses.			\$ 363.40	
12/15/2011	Zachary D. Renstrom, P.E., Invoice #675: State's share of expert witness consulting fees regarding municipal water system and culinary water, review of and research related to Defendant's two expert reports, and preparation of rebuttal expert report. (Total invoice \$1305.00)			\$ 652.50	

02/16/2012	AZ Litigation Support, LLC, Invoice #17214 - Video depositions of Victor Jessop and Jonathan Fischer taken on 1/31/12.	\$ 1,252.60		
03/29/2012	Executive Process, LLC dba EZ Messenger: Cost for delivery of documents to Bill Richards.	\$ 20.00		
04/04/2012	Augspurger Komm Engineering, Inc., Invoice #15769: State's share of David Komm's expert witness fees for deposition.	\$ 444.94		
04/06/2012	Zachary D. Renstrom, P.E., Invoice #750: State's share of expert witness consulting fees for review of Defendants' expert's report, preparation of reply rebuttal report, and preparation for deposition. (Total Invoice \$1986.50)	\$ 993.25		
04/18/2012	Executive Process, LLC dba EZ Messenger: Cost for delivery of documents to Bill Richards.	\$ 20.00		
04/23/2012	Southwest Airlines: Sandra Kane's travel for depositions to Salt Lake City, UT and Las Vegas, NV.	\$ 484.40		
05/01/2012	Executive Process, LLC dba EZ Messenger: Cost for delivery of documents to Bill Richards	\$ 24.00		
05/02/2012	Executive Process, LLC dba EZ Messenger: Cost for delivery of documents to Jeffrey C. Matura.	\$ 8.00		
05/04/2012	Executive Process, LLC dba EZ Messenger: Cost for delivery of documents to Jeffrey C. Matura.	\$ 8.00		
04/25/2013	Total News Tracking, Invoice #74780: Copy of news recording regarding FLDS church security cameras.	\$ 50.00		
05/06/2013	Joel Hilkert ccvs, Invoice #4002-4-28-13: State's share of video deposition of Guy Timpson Volume II.	\$ 185.00		
06/20/2013	Executive Process, LLC dba EZ Messenger: Cost for delivery of pretrial documents in binders to Judge Teilborg, United States District Court, District of Arizona.	\$ 12.00		
08/07/2013	Merilyn Sanchez, RMR, CRR, Invoice #20130089: Cost for transcript of 6/25/13 Final Pretrial Conference.	\$ 51.30		
08/21/2013	Merilyn Sanchez, RMR, CRR, Invoice #20130103: Cost for transcript of hearing pertaining to Colorado City's request to reopen discovery as to David Darger.	\$ 109.50		

11/19/2013	Premier Investigation/Drake Group, Invoice #2013155: State's share of expert witness Rosemarie Urbanski's costs relating to verification of George Barlow's signatures on letters written to Warren Jeffs.		\$ 575.00		
01/07/2014	K-Video Productions, Invoice #15341: Video depositions of Patrick Barlow and Willie Jessop.		\$ 4,140.68		
	Total for Non-Taxable Costs		\$ 17,297.70		
TOTAL for Attorneys Fees and Non-Taxable Costs			\$2,182,337.00		