

EXHIBIT B

RISTER - PRINGLE**Time Detail**

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Dollars
03/16/11	CUMMINS, TB	CONFERENCES WITH B. SLOTNICK AND T. DICKSTEIN RE: ADVERSARY'S ATTEMPT TO SERVICE PROCESS UPON CLIENT.	0.40	128.00
03/16/11	DICKSTEIN, T	RESEARCH TIME LIMITS ON SERVICE OF PROCESS ABROAD.	0.20	110.00
03/17/11	SLOTNICK, B I	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. DICKSTEIN	0.10	67.50
03/17/11	DICKSTEIN, T	DRAFT, REVIEW AND REVISE LETTER TO PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL RE: ATTEMPTED SERVICE ON RISTER EDITIONS AND SQUARE RIVOLI VIA SHAPIRO BERNSTEIN.	1.30	715.00
03/18/11	DICKSTEIN, T	REVIEW LETTERS FROM PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL RE: SERVICE ON RIESTERER, RISTER EDITIONS AND SQUARE RIVOLI.	0.20	110.00
03/18/11	SLOTNICK, B I	REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO D. DICKIE; EMAIL TO D. DICKIE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. DICKSTEIN	0.30	202.50
03/21/11	SLOTNICK, B I	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. DICKSTEIN; EMAILS TO M. BRETTLER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. CENA; CONFERENCE WITH T. DICKSTEIN.	0.90	607.50
03/21/11	DICKSTEIN, T	CALL WITH BARRY SLOTNICK RE: RECENT IMPROPER SERVICE ATTEMPTS ON RISTER EDITIONS, SQUARE RIVOLI AND FRED RIESTERER. (.2) REVIEW LETTERS FROM PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL RE: SAME. (1) DRAFT, REVIEW AND REVISE LETTERS IN RESPONSE. (2.7)	3.90	2,145.00
03/21/11	NOLAN, T D	REVIEW PAST CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING IMPROPER SERVICE ON RISTER EDITIONS.	0.80	400.00
03/21/11	PEPPER, A	ASSEMBLING CASE FILES FOR DOCUMENTS RECEIVED REGARDING IMPROPER SERVICE; CONFERENCE WITH T. DICKSTEIN REGARDING SAME.	0.30	106.50
03/22/11	SLOTNICK, B I	CONFERENCE WITH T. NOLAN, T. DICKSTEIN; EMAIL TO CLIENTS	1.00	675.00
03/22/11	DICKSTEIN, T	MEET WITH BARRY SLOTNICK AND TOM NOLAN RE: MOTION TO DISMISS BASED ON IMPROPER SERVICE, DISCOVERY STRATEGY.	0.40	220.00
03/23/11	DICKSTEIN, T	REVIEW PROOF OF SERVICE ON RISTER EDITIONS AND SQUARE RIVOLI. EMAIL TO B. SLOTNICK RE: SAME.	0.20	110.00

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Dollars
03/24/11	SLOTNICK, B I	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. DICKSTEIN REGARDING SERVICE OF PROCESS	0.20	135.00
03/24/11	DICKSTEIN, T	EMAILS WITH PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL RE: MEET AND CONFER ON ANTICIPATED TO MOTION TO DISMISS RISTER EDITIONS FOR IMPROPER SERVICE. MEET WITH TOM NOLAN RE: SAME.	0.40	220.00
03/24/11	NOLAN, T D	DRAFT RISTER EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS FOR IMPROPER SERVICE; LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING SAME; RESEARCH REGARDING PROCEDURAL REQUIREMENTS FOR SAME.	3.80	1,900.00
03/25/11	SLOTNICK, B I	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING SERVICE OF PROCESS ON F. RIESTERER	0.20	135.00
03/25/11	DICKSTEIN, T	RESEARCH SERVICE ON CORPORATE "MANAGING AGENT". (.7) PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN MEET AND CONFER CALL WITH PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL RE: ANTICIPATED MOTION TO DISMISS BASED ON IMPROPER SERVICE ON RISTER EDITIONS. (1.2) REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT MOTION TO DISMISS. (1.7) MEET WITH TOM NOLAN RE: SAME. (.5)	4.10	2,255.00
03/25/11	NOLAN, T D	DRAFT RISTER EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS FOR IMPROPER SERVICE; RESEARCH REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE OF COUNSEL REGARDING SAME; RESEARCH REGARDING SERVICE OF PROCESS IN FRANCE UNDER THE HAGUE CONVENTION AND THROUGH OTHER METHODS.	5.60	2,800.00
03/26/11	DICKSTEIN, T	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO DISMISS FOR IMPROPER SERVICE ON RISTER EDITIONS.	0.50	275.00
03/26/11	SLOTNICK, B I	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO DISMISS	0.40	270.00
03/26/11	NOLAN, T D	REVISE RISTER EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS FOR IMPROPER SERVICE.	1.10	550.00
03/28/11	NOLAN, T D	REVISE, FINALIZE, AND COORDINATE FILING OF RISTER EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS FOR IMPROPER SERVICE.	2.10	1,050.00
03/28/11	CUMMINS, TB	ATTEND TO DOCKET AND FILING DEADLINES. CONFERENCES WITH T. DICKSTEIN RE: SERVICE OF PROCESS UPON CLIENT IN FRANCE.	0.40	128.00
03/28/11	SLOTNICK, B I	EMAIL TO M. BRETTLER AND C. PIOT	0.20	135.00
03/28/11	MILLER, D	REVIEW OF MOTION TO DISMISS PAPERS AND EMAILS WITH T. NOLAN AND T. DICKSTEIN RE SAME	0.50	275.00

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Dollars
04/04/11	DICKSTEIN, T	PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF PLAINTIFF'S PAPERS IN OPPOSITION TO RISTER EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS FOR IMPROPER SERVICE; EMAIL TO B. SLOTNICK AND T. NOLAN RE: SAME.	0.30	165.00
04/05/11	SLOTNICK, B I	REVIEW PLAINTIFFS' OPPOSITION PAPERS; CONFERENCE WITH T. DICKSTEIN AND T. NOLAN	0.80	540.00
04/05/11	DICKSTEIN, T	MEET WITH BARRY SLOTNICK AND TOM NOLAN RE: PLAINTIFF'S OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISMISS RISTER EDITIONS FOR IMPROPER SERVICE, AND SERVICE ON FRED RIESTERER; EMAILS WITH MICHAEL BRETTLER RE: SAME.	1.10	605.00
04/05/11	NOLAN, T D	LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING METHODS OF SERVICE IN FRANCE UNDER THE HAGUE CONVENTION AND FEDERAL RULES.	1.80	900.00
04/06/11	DICKSTEIN, T	CALL WITH MICHAEL BRETTLER RE: SERVICE ON RISTER EDITIONS. (.7) REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT DECLARATION. (.8)	1.50	825.00
04/06/11	NOLAN, T D	DRAFT AND REVISE REPLY IN SUPPORT OF RISTER EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS AND BRETTLER DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF SAME.	3.90	1,950.00
04/07/11	SLOTNICK, B I	REVIEW DRAFT BRETTLER DECLARATION	0.10	67.50
04/07/11	NOLAN, T D	REVISE REPLY IN SUPPORT OF RISTER EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS; RESEARCH REGARDING SAME; REVISE AND SEND BRETTLER DECLARATION.	4.10	2,050.00
04/08/11	NOLAN, T D	DRAFT AND REVISE REPLY IN SUPPORT OF RISTER EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS; LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING SAME.	2.90	1,450.00
04/08/11	DICKSTEIN, T	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT CLIENT DECLARATION ON IMPROPER SERVICE ON RISTER EDITIONS.	0.20	110.00
04/10/11	DICKSTEIN, T	REVIEW, ANALYZE AND REVISE REPLY BRIEF ON MOTION TO DISMISS RISTER EDITIONS FOR IMPROPER SERVICE.	2.50	1,375.00
04/10/11	NOLAN, T D	REVISE REPLY IN SUPPORT OF RISTER EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS; RESEARCH REGARDING SAME.	2.80	1,400.00
04/10/11	SLOTNICK, B I	REVIEW DRAFT MEMORANDUM; EMAIL TO T. NOLAN; EMAIL TO CLIENTS	0.30	202.50

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Dollars
04/11/11	NOLAN, T D	REVISE, CITE-CHECK, AND COORDINATE FILING OF REPLY IN SUPPORT OF RISTER EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS.	3.70	1,850.00
04/11/11	MILLER, D	REVIEW OF REPLY IN SUPPORT OF R.EDITIONS' MOTION TO DISMISS AND EMAIL WITH T. NOLAN RE SAME; FILING OF SAME	0.50	275.00
04/12/11	CUMMINS, TB	ATTEND TO DOCKET AND FILING DEADLINES.	0.20	64.00
04/12/11	NOLAN, T D	DRAFT ANSWER FOR FREDERIC RIESTERER TO PLAINTIFF'S COMPLAINT; DRAFT TIMELINE AND SUMMARY OF KEY CASE EVENTS.	4.10	2,050.00
04/14/11	SLOTNICK, B I	REVIEW COURT DECISION; EMAIL TO T. DICKSTEIN	0.30	202.50
04/14/11	MILLER, D	EMAIL AND CONFERENCE WITH T. DICKSTEIN RE APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES	0.20	110.00
04/15/11	SCHWARTZ, E B	CALL WITH T. DICKSTEIN AND CONFERENCE WITH D. MILLER RE APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES; EMAIL WITH ACCOUNTING RE SAME.	0.40	140.00
04/15/11	DICKSTEIN, T	CALL WITH ERIC SCHWARTZ RE: APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS FEES	0.30	165.00
04/17/11	SCHWARTZ, E B	ANALYZE BILLING RECORDS IN SUPPORT OF ATTORNEYS' FEES APPLICATION; EMAIL WITH T. DICKSTEIN RE SAME.	0.60	210.00
04/18/11	SCHWARTZ, E B	PREPARE DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF AWARD FOR ATTORNEYS FEES; RESEARCH RE REASONABLE ATTORNEYS FEES IN CALIFORNIA.	3.00	1,050.00
04/19/11	SCHWARTZ, E B	RESEARCH RE COMPARABLE BILLING RATES FOR DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF ATTORNEYS' FEES; REVISE DECLARATION; EMAIL WITH T. DICKSTEIN RE SAME.	1.30	455.00
04/20/11	DICKSTEIN, T	REVIEW, ANALYZE AND REVISE DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF ATTORNEYS FEES APPLICATION AND SUPPORTING BILLING ENTRIES. (1.4) CALL WITH ERIC SCHWARTZ RE: SAME. (.2)	1.60	880.00
04/20/11	SCHWARTZ, E B	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH T. DICKSTEIN RE REVISIONS TO DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF ATTORNEYS FEES.	0.30	105.00
04/21/11	SCHWARTZ, E B	EMAILS AND CALLS WITH T. DICKSTEIN RE DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES; REVIEW, ANALYZE, AND REDACT BILLING RECORDS IN SUPPORT OF APPLICATION; REVISE DECLARATION.	2.40	840.00

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Dollars
04/21/11	DICKSTEIN, T	REVIEW AND REVISE DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF APPLICATION FOR ATTORNEYS FEES. (.4) MEET WITH BARRY SLOTNICK AND CALL WITH ERIC SCHWARTZ RE: SAME. (.2)	0.60	330.00
Total			71.30	36,091.50