

EXHIBIT A



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

June 25, 2010
Invoice # 9877126
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated	\$	0.00	
Payments and Other Credits		0.00	
BALANCE FORWARD		\$	0.00

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629 Copyright Infringement Litigation Re: Bryan Pringle Fees for Legal Services	\$	594.00	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE		\$	594.00
STATEMENT TOTAL		\$	594.00

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

<p>PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER) PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976 THANK YOU</p>

For Legal Services Rendered Through May 31, 2010

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

05/28/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Review I. Gould Email regarding status of settlement for the Pringle I got a feeling matter; confer with I. Gould regarding issues in his email and confer with R. Greely and I. Gould regarding additional materials needed from Mr. Pringle to consider his claim; confer with R. Rosoff regarding Ira Gould email and additional materials needed; draft and send email to R. Greely requesting the additional information regarding underlying basis for the claim.
05/31/10	K. E. Cenar	0.10 hrs.	54.00	Communication with R. Greely regarding status of receipt of requested information regarding Mr. Pringle's claim/

Total Hours 1.10

Total Fees for Legal Services \$ 594.00

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER \$ 594.00



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

June 25, 2010
Invoice # 9877126
Client # C073033
Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated	\$	0.00	
Payments and Other Credits		0.00	
BALANCE FORWARD		\$	0.00

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	594.00	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE		\$	594.00
STATEMENT TOTAL		\$	594.00

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

July 22, 2010
Invoice # 9883512
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated June 25, 2010	\$	594.00	
Payments and Other Credits		(594.00)	
BALANCE FORWARD		\$	0.00

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629 Copyright Infringement Litigation Re: Bryan Pringle			
Fees for Legal Services	\$	14,498.00	
Expenses and Other Charges		9.80	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$		14,507.80
STATEMENT TOTAL	\$		14,507.80

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through June 30, 2010File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

06/01/10	K. E. Cengar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Confer with R. Greely regarding Pringle external sound bank usage and source; confer with R. Rosoff regarding same.
06/08/10	J. S. Pink	5.90 hrs.	2,360.00	Further research and drafting of memo re legal issues in connection with defense of copyright action.
06/09/10	A. H. Siddiqi	2.00 hrs.	550.00	Research and analysis on copyright infringement issues for J. S. Pink on Black Eyed Peas Matter.
06/10/10	J. S. Pink	1.80 hrs.	720.00	Further drafting of legal issues memo and related research.
06/11/10	J. S. Pink	1.87 hrs.	748.00	Further drafting of analysis memorandum.
06/14/10	K. E. Cengar	0.50 hrs.	270.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding Pringle matter.
06/14/10	J. S. Pink	2.50 hrs.	1,000.00	Further drafting, review and editing of memo re claims and defenses; additional legal research re independent creation defense.
06/15/10	K. E. Cengar	0.50 hrs.	270.00	Review legal issues regarding I got a Feeling and Pringle claims and confer with R. Rosoff.
06/15/10	J. S. Pink	3.00 hrs.	1,200.00	Communicate with K. Cengar re revisions to memos re infringement and drafting of memos re damages; legal research re same; revise memos re infringement; draft memos re

				damages.
06/16/10	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,620.00	Review ASR-10 capabilities; confer with R. Rosoff regarding technical claims of Pringle.
06/16/10	J. S. Pink	0.70 hrs.	280.00	Finalize damages memo; forward same to K. Cenar.
06/16/10	M. M. Seale	2.00 hrs.	620.00	Review information in case file; review and compile research and data relating to Pringle matter; draft claims chart.
06/17/10	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,620.00	Confer with R. Greely about the sound files and additional information needed; confer with R. Rosoff regarding same; review ASR-10 capabilities.
06/29/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Review I. Gould email; confer with R. Rosoff regarding response and communication of preservation; confer with R. Rosoff regarding computer forensic expert analysis and interview computer forensic experts; communicate with E. McPherson and L. Burrow and S. Dallas regarding latest email from I. Gould.
06/30/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding

REDACTED

meet with R. Rosoff to discuss matter and status and strategy.

Total Hours 32.77

Total Fees for Legal Services \$ 14,498.00

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

Long Distance Telephone Charges 9.80

Black Eyed Peas

July 22, 2010
Invoice # 9883512
Client # C073033
Page 4

Total Expenses and Other Charges \$ 9.80

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER \$ 14,507.80



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | 澳門 | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

July 22, 2010
Invoice # 9883512
Client # C073033
Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated June 25, 2010	\$	594.00	
Payments and Other Credits		(594.00)	
BALANCE FORWARD	\$		0.00

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	14,498.00	
Expenses and Other Charges		9.80	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$		14,507.80
STATEMENT TOTAL	\$		14,507.80

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

August 12, 2010
Invoice # 9888958
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated July 22, 2010	\$	14,507.80
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	14,507.80

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629 Copyright Infringement Litigation Re: Bryan Pringle		
Fees for Legal Services	\$	12,904.00
Expenses and Other Charges		321.92
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	13,225.92

STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	27,733.72
-----------------	----	-----------

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

<p>PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER) PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976 THANK YOU</p>

For Legal Services Rendered Through July 31, 2010File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

07/05/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Review and confer with R. Rosoff regarding the various claims of Pringle on creation and the equipment used.
07/06/10	K. E. Cenar	1.50 hrs.	810.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding claim of Pringle and equipment used and public information regarding dates the equipment Pringle claimed he used came into existence; confer with R. Rosoff regarding Guetta independent development
07/06/10	J. S. Pink	0.10 hrs.	40.00	Exchange emails with K. Cenar re declaratory relief action.
07/06/10	M. M. Seale	0.70 hrs.	217.00	Conduct preliminary legal research regarding venue and jurisdiction.
07/07/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding Guetta approval for forensic review of NRG file; confer with computer expert regarding NRG file; detailed call with R. Rosoff regarding her investigation with Guetta folks and status of the work prepared by Guetta folks.
07/12/10	M. M. Seale	0.60 hrs.	186.00	Prepare for and attend call with I. Gould regarding possible settlement.
07/13/10	K. E. Cenar	1.50 hrs.	810.00	Confer with R. Greely regarding information requested; confer with R. Rosoff regarding status and various issues regarding Pringle claims.

07/14/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Multiple conference with R. Greely regarding NRG file and the corrupt information on the disc; confer with R. Rosoff regarding offer of Pringle to meet; hold call with R. Greely regarding various data on dates of creation; confer with R. Rosoff regarding the various issues.
07/17/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding information received on ability to change dates.
07/19/10	K. E. Cenar	1.50 hrs.	810.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding Pringle matter and Guetta and information regarding independent creation.
07/20/10	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,620.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding additional materials to be requested from I. Gould and R. Greely; confer with R. Greely regarding the materials requested; multiple communications with R. Greely regarding Pringle date issue.
07/21/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Multiple communications with R. Rosoff regarding Pringle chord progression and reverse copying; confer with L. Burrow regarding status and next steps.
07/23/10	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,620.00	Review and consider Pringle improper altered computer dates; confer with R. Rosoff regarding these issues and proof; prepare for and attend negotiation meeting with I. Gould regarding Pringle matter; confer with R. Rosoff regarding negotiations and dates; prepare preservation of evidence letter and send to I. Gould; provide status to E. McPherson and L. Burrow.

07/23/10	M. M. Seale	7.10 hrs.	2,201.00	Revise letter for I. Gould regarding allegedly claims; attend meeting with I. Gould, R. Greely and R. Rosoff regarding potential settlement.
07/28/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Review and consider communication from I. Gould regarding metadata on songs provided from I. Gould's office Prepare response.
07/30/10	K. E. Cenar	0.50 hrs.	270.00	Confer with I. Gould regarding his potential claims and the lack of reliability of the dates; confer with R. Rosoff regarding the same.

Total Hours 27.50

Total Fees for Legal Services \$ 12,904.00

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

Long Distance Telephone Charges	57.40
Scanning PDF Charges	1.00
Westlaw Computerized Research	263.52
Total Expenses and Other Charges	\$ 321.92

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER \$ 13,225.92



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
 Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
 c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
 Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
 450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
 Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

August 12, 2010
 Invoice # 9888958
 Client # C073033
 Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated July 22, 2010	\$	14,507.80
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	14,507.80

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	12,904.00
Expenses and Other Charges		321.92
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	13,225.92
STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	27,733.72

OUR RECORDS SHOW THESE INVOICES OUTSTANDING AS OF August 12, 2010

Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9883512	(Dated 07/22/10)	14,507.80
-----------------------------	---------	------------------	-----------

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
 PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
 BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
 THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

September 21, 2010
Invoice # 9899881
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated August 12, 2010	\$	27,733.72
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	27,733.72

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629 Copyright Infringement Litigation Re: Bryan Pringle		
Fees for Legal Services	\$	2,142.00
Expenses and Other Charges		50.09
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	2,192.09

STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	29,925.81
-----------------	----	-----------

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through August 31, 2010

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

08/09/10	M. M. Seale	0.20 hrs.	62.00	Review and compile correspondence from I. Gould and R. Greely relating to the Pringle matter.
08/31/10	J. S. Pink	5.20 hrs.	2,080.00	Review and respond to emails from colleague re settlement, statute of limitations and related matters; review correspondence from opposing counsel re settlement and musicologist and computer expert's report; legal research re specific statute of limitations issues; draft brief memo re same.

Total Hours	5.40
-------------	------

Total Fees for Legal Services	\$	2,142.00
-------------------------------	----	----------

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

Express Package Delivery	20.04
Long Distance Telephone Charges	29.05
Scanning PDF Charges	1.00
Total Expenses and Other Charges	\$ 50.09

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER	\$	2,192.09
-------------------------------	----	----------



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

September 21, 2010
Invoice # 9899881
Client # C073033
Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated August 12, 2010	\$	27,733.72	
Payments and Other Credits		0.00	
BALANCE FORWARD	\$		27,733.72

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	2,142.00	
Expenses and Other Charges		50.09	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$		2,192.09
STATEMENT TOTAL	\$		29,925.81

OUR RECORDS SHOW THESE INVOICES OUTSTANDING AS OF September 21, 2010

Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9883512	(Dated 07/22/10)	14,507.80
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9888958	(Dated 08/12/10)	13,225.92

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

October 18, 2010
Invoice # 9908086
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated September 21, 2010	\$	29,925.81
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	29,925.81

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629 Copyright Infringement Litigation Re: Bryan Pringle		
Fees for Legal Services	\$	7,762.50
Expenses and Other Charges		0.20
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	7,762.70

STATEMENT TOTAL \$ 37,688.51

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through September 30, 2010

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

09/01/10	J. S. Pink	2.50 hrs.	1,000.00	Legal research, analysis and drafting of memo re intrinsic and extrinsic analysis as it relates to elements no subject to protection by the plaintiff; communicate with K. Cenar re same.
09/02/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding Pringle matter and B. Pringle potential criminal background.
09/02/10	J. S. Pink	3.70 hrs.	1,480.00	Further research and drafting of analysis re extrinsic/intrinsic test and related topic.
09/02/10	T. T. Brittain	0.50 hrs.	92.50	Docket and litigation research concerning Bryan Pringle. Requested by Merili Seale.
09/03/10	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review and revise memo re substantial similarity.
09/06/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding various Pringle matters.
09/07/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding rejection of demand and confer with all other parties regarding their position on demand; confer with J. Pink on research on presumptions and various issues regarding substantial similarity.
09/07/10	J. S. Pink	0.70 hrs.	280.00	Review and revise memo; conduct brief additional research re most recent law on issue; confirm holding in Second Circuit case in connection with drafting analysis.

09/10/10	K. E. Cenar	1.50 hrs.	810.00	Consider various emails on investigation into independent creation by Guetta folks; confer with R. Rosoff regarding the same; telephone call with L. Burrow regarding UMG email to others to contact I. Gould; confer with R. Rosoff regarding the same.
09/13/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding Guetta independent creation responses.
09/13/10	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review and respond to emails from colleague re I Gotta Feeling" alleged sample claim; review samples from creator of work, Fredriesterer
09/15/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Review article; confer with J. Pink and R. Rosoff regarding pre-filing publicity.
09/15/10	J. S. Pink	0.20 hrs.	80.00	Exchange emails with K. Cenar re recent pre-litigation press seemingly coordinated by plaintiff's counsel.
09/30/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Monthly and daily review of national docket and report to R. Rosoff regarding status of filing against Black Eyed Peas by Pringle and report to R. Rosoff.

Total Hours	16.70
-------------	-------

Total Fees for Legal Services	\$	7,762.50
-------------------------------	----	----------

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

Long Distance Telephone Charges		0.20
Total Expenses and Other Charges	\$	0.20

Black Eyed Peas

October 18, 2010
Invoice # 9908086
Client # C073033
Page 4

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER

\$ 7,762.70



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
 Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
 c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
 Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
 450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
 Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

October 18, 2010
 Invoice # 9908086
 Client # C073033
 Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated September 21, 2010	\$	29,925.81	
Payments and Other Credits		0.00	
BALANCE FORWARD	\$		29,925.81

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	7,762.50	
Expenses and Other Charges		0.20	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$		7,762.70

STATEMENT TOTAL	\$		37,688.51
-----------------	----	--	-----------

OUR RECORDS SHOW THESE INVOICES OUTSTANDING AS OF October 18, 2010

Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9883512	(Dated 07/22/10)	14,507.80
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9888958	(Dated 08/12/10)	13,225.92
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9899881	(Dated 09/21/10)	2,192.09

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
 PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
 BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
 THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
 Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
 c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
 Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
 450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
 Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

November 5, 2010
 Invoice # 9913672
 Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
 Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated October 18, 2010	\$	37,688.51	
Payments and Other Credits		(37,688.51)	
BALANCE FORWARD		\$	0.00

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629			
Copyright Infringement Litigation			
Re: Bryan Pringle			
Fees for Legal Services	\$	3,086.00	
Expenses and Other Charges		615.72	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$		3,701.72

STATEMENT TOTAL	\$		3,701.72
-----------------	----	--	----------

Bryan Cave LLP is a cash basis partnership with a December 31st year-end. Consequently, receipt of your payment for this statement before year-end would be appreciated.

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
 PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
 BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
 THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through October 31, 2010

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

09/08/10	K. Anderson	1.00 hrs.	75.00	Researched case history and personal information on an individual. Requested by Kara Cenar.
10/28/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding new complaint filed by Pringle; review and consider complaint and inform counsel for other defendants.
10/29/10	K. E. Cenar	1.50 hrs.	810.00	Review and consider complaint filed by Pringle and confer with J. Pink regarding approach and strategy.
10/29/10	J. S. Pink	2.70 hrs.	1,080.00	Legal research in connection with possible defenses founded on plaintiff's compilation copyright (17 USC 103), and failure to register derivative work at issue in this particular lawsuit; communicate with K. Cenar re motion to dismiss and related topics; research possible motion
10/31/10	L. L. Wood	0.70 hrs.	581.00	Review Pringle complaint, press release comments and Internet article to render opinion on defamation issues.

Total Hours 6.90

Total Fees for Legal Services \$ 3,086.00

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

Audio Conferencing		6.61
Computerized Research		296.07
Lexis Computerized Research		542.00
Westlaw Computerized Research		-228.96
Total Expenses and Other Charges	\$	615.72
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER	\$	3,701.72



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

November 5, 2010
Invoice # 9913672
Client # C073033
Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated October 18, 2010	\$	37,688.51	
Payments and Other Credits		(37,688.51)	
BALANCE FORWARD	\$		0.00

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	3,086.00	
Expenses and Other Charges		615.72	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$		3,701.72
STATEMENT TOTAL	\$		3,701.72

Bryan Cave LLP is a cash basis partnership with a December 31st year-end. Consequently, receipt of your payment for this statement before year-end would be appreciated.

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Miami | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

December 10, 2010
Invoice # 9924417
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated November 5, 2010	\$	41,390.23
Payments and Other Credits		(37,688.51)
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	3,701.72

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629 Copyright Infringement Litigation Re: Bryan Pringle		
Fees for Legal Services	\$	69,097.85
Expenses and Other Charges		664.69
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	69,762.54
STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	73,464.26

Bryan Cave LLP is a cash basis partnership with a December 31st year-end. Consequently, receipt of your payment for this statement before year-end would be appreciated.

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through November 30, 2010

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

11/01/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Review complaint filed and confer with J. Pink regarding potential issues for dismissing and striking; confer with L. Burrow and E. McPherson regarding complaint; confer with R. Rosoff regarding complaint.
11/01/10	L. L. Wood	0.40 hrs.	332.00	Email memo to K. Cenar regarding conclusion on attorney's media comments.
11/01/10	J. S. Pink	3.70 hrs.	1,480.00	Further legal research and commence drafting of motion to dismiss.
11/02/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Confer with J. Pink regarding service of the complaint and G. Hampton's attempt to get service.
11/02/10	J. S. Pink	1.70 hrs.	680.00	Further drafting of motion to strike and motion to dismiss.
11/03/10	K. E. Cenar	5.00 hrs.	2,700.00	Review and consider the press release and Pringle posting of his "take a dive" version without lyrics; multiple conversations regarding approach and strategy; draft letter to opposing counsel regarding removal of the misrepresenting postings; confer with L. wood and L. lanetta regarding defamation issues and claims.
11/03/10	M. M. Seale	0.90 hrs.	279.00	Review documents filed by Pringle in connection with prior settlement representations.

11/04/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Draft letter regarding the You Tube posting and the press release; review issues regarding service and acts of opposing counsel.
11/04/10	L. L. Wood	0.60 hrs.	498.00	Review letter to I. Gould; review Gould response; email to K. Cenar regarding same.
11/04/10	J. S. Pink	0.60 hrs.	240.00	Communicate with K. Cenar re 17 USC Section 512, and compliance with Digital Millennium Copyright Act and further outlining of items to strike from complaint.
11/04/10	M. M. Seale	1.10 hrs.	341.00	Revise meet and confer letter to opposing counsel regarding Pringle.
11/05/10	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,620.00	Confer with L. Woods regarding response of D. Dickie to letter regarding defamatory acts; review judge assigned and local practice and rules of that judge; confer with L. Burrow and E. McPherson regarding potential motions and other issues related to the complaint filed; confer with J. Pink regarding substantive issues upon which motion should be filed.
11/08/10	K. E. Cenar	2.25 hrs.	1,215.00	Review service issues for complaint; confer with R. Rosoff regarding the pulling of the infringing materials from the DRDR313; review B. Pringle letter and forward to other attorneys; confer with R. Rosoff regarding the complaint. service and other related issues.
11/08/10	J. S. Pink	2.10 hrs.	840.00	Drafting of motion to strike and further drafting of motion to dismiss.
11/09/10	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,620.00	Prepare a meet and confer letter regarding motion to dismiss in

				accordance with the local rules; confer with J. Pink regarding issues to be raised; confer with R. Rosoff regarding same.
11/09/10	J. S. Pink	2.00 hrs.	800.00	Research and drafting of motions to strike and motion to dismiss.
11/09/10	T. J. Allen	8.79 hrs.	2,505.15	Research regarding California authority that supports proposition that other infringement lawsuits cannot for the basis of plaintiff's present lawsuit.
11/10/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Prepare for and attend strategy call with L. Burrow regarding complaint and response and next steps; confer with R. Rosoff regarding same; confer with J. Pink regarding same.
11/10/10	J. S. Pink	3.40 hrs.	1,360.00	Revise motion to dismiss and motion to strike; telephone conference with K. Cenar; review and respond to emails in connection with same.
11/10/10	M. M. Seale	0.80 hrs.	248.00	Prepare for and attend call with K. Cenar and co-defendants regarding case strategy on which motions to file and timing of such motions.
11/10/10	T. J. Allen	3.23 hrs.	920.55	Draft motion to dismiss.
11/12/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Confer with G. Hampton regarding service issues and negotiating a common response date.
11/12/10	J. S. Pink	8.09 hrs.	3,236.00	Further drafting, legal research and revisions to combined motion to strike, motion to dismiss and motion for definitive statement.
11/14/10	J. S. Pink	1.00 hrs.	400.00	Review and revise motion to dismiss, motion to strike and motion for more definitive

				statement.
11/15/10	J. S. Pink	1.00 hrs.	400.00	Further revisions to motion to dismiss, motion to strike and motion for more definitive statement; communicate with K. Cenar re same; .
11/15/10	M. M. Seale	0.30 hrs.	93.00	Review research regarding LA judge assigned to the case.
11/16/10	K. E. Cenar	1.50 hrs.	810.00	Confer with J. Pink on motion to strike and dismiss; review and edit .motion.
11/16/10	J. S. Pink	0.90 hrs.	360.00	Review and edit K. Cenar's proposed changes to motion to dismiss.
11/16/10	M. M. Seale	1.70 hrs.	527.00	Review documents provided by I. Gould during settlement discussions; review demand letter for impeachment data.
11/17/10	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,620.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding various issues on representation of defendants; confer with S. Dallas; confer with L. Gurrow regarding service issues; evaluate representation issues and various client contacts; review and consider service issues.
11/17/10	J. S. Pink	7.00 hrs.	2,800.00	Further revisions to K. Cenar's draft/revisions to Motion to Dismiss; review responsive correspondence from opposing counsel; communicate with co-counsel re same.
11/18/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Review and edit motion to dismiss; confer with R. Rosoff regarding status.
11/18/10	J. S. Pink	2.00 hrs.	800.00	Further revisions to motion to dismiss and motion to strike; communicate with K. Cenar re same; review series of emails and correspondence between counsel.
11/19/10	M. A. Paskar	0.50 hrs.	250.00	Conference with M. Seale

				regarding possible regulatory and litigation challenge to copyright application for derivative work of original registration basis of lawsuit.
11/19/10	K. E. Cenar	6.00 hrs.	3,240.00	Receive first amended complaint; confer with co-counsel and send to R. Rosoff; read and consider changes in the first amended complaint; evaluate impact on motion to dismiss; prepare and send request for actual tracks involved in amended complaint; confer with R. Rosoff regarding same.
11/19/10	J. S. Pink	0.50 hrs.	200.00	Review First Amended Complaint; exchange emails with colleagues and client re same.
11/19/10	M. M. Seale	6.30 hrs.	1,953.00	Draft stipulation for additional time to respond to complaint; review and revise motion to dismiss and strike Pringle's complaint; conduct legal research regarding potentially filing an objection to a copyright application; conduct legal research regarding whether a copyright application is a sufficient "filing" to bring a copyright lawsuit.
11/22/10	K. E. Cenar	12.00 hrs.	6,480.00	Telephone call to G. Hampton regarding waiver of service issues and meet and confer issues; detailed call with J. Pink regarding deficiencies in complaint; read and consider ex parte TRO papers served after 5 pm; telephone call with R. Rosoff; call with J. Pink regarding TRO; telephone call with B. Slotnik; telephone call with L. Burrow; confer with R. Rosoff regarding TRO and next steps; confer with J. Pink regarding issues for response.

11/22/10	J. S. Pink	6.82 hrs.	2,728.00	Review, analyze and begin drafting opposition to to ex parte application; discussion with colleagues re same.
11/22/10	M. M. Seale	2.90 hrs.	899.00	Review TRO documents filed by Pringle.
11/22/10	T. J. Allen	5.35 hrs.	1,524.75	Draft opposition to plaintiff's ex part application for temporary restraining order.
11/23/10	K. E. Cenar	15.00 hrs.	8,100.00	Prepare response to TRO papers; work with B. Slotnik regarding declaration on independent reaction; REDACTED confer with R. Rosoff; confer with L. Burrow; review and edits papers; confer with S. Dallas and with counsel for EMI regarding response and status.
11/23/10	J. S. Pink	4.30 hrs.	1,720.00	Review and revise opposition to plaintiff's ex parte TRO and request for preliminary injunction; numerous communications with colleagues in connection with same, and incorporating changes from co-counsel; coordinate filing of same; coordinate filing of amended brief to ad EMI to parties represented.
11/23/10	M. M. Seale	9.10 hrs.	2,821.00	Review TRO filings by Plaintiff; review expert reports for possible impeachment points; conduct research regarding Pringle; contact copyright office regarding obtaining rush deposit copies; draft opposition to TRO motion.
11/23/10	J. P. Litwinovich	2.50 hrs.	712.50	Assist in preparation of opposition to application for temporary restraining order
11/23/10	T. J. Allen	9.14 hrs.	2,604.90	Draft and file opposition to

				plaintiff's ex parte application for a temporary restraining order.
11/24/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Review court order denying TRO; communicate same to clients; confer with J. Pink regarding same.
11/24/10	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review court's ruling re TRO and preliminary injunction; communicate with clients and colleagues re same.
11/29/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Review proof of service and evaluate response date.
	Total Hours		162.77	
	Total Fees for Legal Services			\$ 69,097.85

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

11/04/10	Search Fee - LexisNexis Risk Data Management Inc Accurint Billable - September 2010 No Tax Paid 1342155		25.15
11/18/10	Search Fee - Pacer Service Center Pacer Searches		0.08
11/18/10	Search Fee - Pacer Service Center Pacer Searches		0.24
	Computerized Support Services		131.00
	Copy Charges		0.20
	Lexis Computerized Research		220.00
	Long Distance Telephone Charges		52.50
	Scanning PDF Charges		11.60
	Westlaw Computerized Research		223.92
	Total Expenses and Other Charges		\$ 664.69
	TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER		\$ 69,762.54



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
 Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
 c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
 Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
 450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
 Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

December 10, 2010
 Invoice # 9924417
 Client # C073033
 Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated November 5, 2010	\$	41,390.23	
Payments and Other Credits		(37,688.51)	
BALANCE FORWARD	\$		3,701.72

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	69,097.85	
Expenses and Other Charges		664.69	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$		69,762.54

STATEMENT TOTAL \$ 73,464.26

OUR RECORDS SHOW THESE INVOICES OUTSTANDING AS OF December 10, 2010

Balance Outstanding on Inv. 9913672 (Dated 11/05/10) 3,701.72

Bryan Cave LLP is a cash basis partnership with a December 31st year-end. Consequently, receipt of your payment for this statement before year-end would be appreciated.

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
 PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
 BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
 THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

January 12, 2011
Invoice # 9931423
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated December 10, 2010	\$	73,464.26
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	73,464.26

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

Fees for Legal Services	\$	31,937.25
Expenses and Other Charges		1,077.60
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	33,014.85

STATEMENT TOTAL \$ 106,479.11

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through December 31, 2010

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

12/01/10	S. G. Watkins	0.50 hrs.	137.50	Review and analysis of proofs of service of complaint on all parties and prepare memorandums to ensure timely responses.
12/02/10	J. S. Pink	3.40 hrs.	1,360.00	Review and revise motion to strike to include motion to dismiss arguments
12/02/10	S. G. Watkins	0.90 hrs.	247.50	Prepare memorandum regarding proofs of service of complaint on all parties and stipulation for extension to respond.
12/03/10	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	540.00	Confer with J. Pink regarding motion and draft for all counsel to review.
12/03/10	J. S. Pink	2.10 hrs.	840.00	Final revisions to motion to strike and motion to dismiss, as well as to notice re same.
12/06/10	J. S. Pink	2.40 hrs.	960.00	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer re motion to strike and motion to dismiss; confer with colleagues re same.
12/06/10	M. M. Seale	2.10 hrs.	651.00	Review and revise draft motion to strike; meet & confer call with opposing counsel regarding upcoming filing.
12/07/10	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,620.00	Review and edit motion to dismiss and strike; confer with R. Rosoff regarding status.
12/07/10	J. S. Pink	1.40 hrs.	560.00	Revise motion to dismiss and motion to strike consistent with changes made in tandem brief (in Batts); insert page/line

				numbers into relevant sections of brief.
12/07/10	M. M. Seale	1.20 hrs.	372.00	Revise motion to strike.
12/08/10	K. E. Cenar	4.00 hrs.	2,160.00	Confer with B. Slotnik regarding their being retained and the draft briefs; confer with L. Burrow regarding drafts; edit brief; communicate with K. Hauprich regarding case and draft motions; confer with S. Dallas regarding case and motions.
12/08/10	J. S. Pink	2.90 hrs.	1,160.00	Further revisions to motion to dismiss and strike; draft declaration of J. Pink in support of same; review and notate draft of brief from colleague.
12/08/10	M. M. Seale	0.50 hrs.	155.00	Review correspondence between K. Cenar and I. Gould and locate support for pleadings.
12/09/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Review and edit briefs; confer with B. Slotnik regarding comments and strategy regarding brief.
12/09/10	J. S. Pink	5.10 hrs.	2,040.00	Draft declaration of K. Cenar in support of motion to strike and/or dismiss; communicate with Deborah Burroughs re changes to motion; communicate with K. Cenar re same.
12/09/10	J. S. Pink	0.60 hrs.	240.00	Legal research and drafting of section in motion to strike re striking prayer for fees and costs.
12/10/10	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,620.00	Review and edits drafts and confer with B. Slotniks and L. Burrow and consider comments; confer with S. Dallas regarding drafts.
12/10/10	J. S. Pink	2.60 hrs.	1,040.00	Revise motion to strike as requested by D. Guetta's counsel; communicate with colleague re proposed changes

				and possible restructure as to identification of paragraphs to be stricken; draft notice of joinder; draft proposed order
12/10/10	J. S. Pink	2.90 hrs.	1,160.00	Review motion for more definite statement and to strike prepared by co-defendants; revise portions of client's brief to incorporate changes where appropriate; draft notice of joinder; draft proposed order; review changes proposed by co-defense counsel, L. Borroughs
12/10/10	M. M. Seale	2.20 hrs.	682.00	Review and revise draft motion.
12/11/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Confer with L. Burrow regarding brief and approach; review and consider edits.
12/11/10	M. M. Seale	2.10 hrs.	651.00	Revise Pringle motion to incorporate L. Burrow's comments and changes.
12/12/10	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,080.00	Edit motion to strike; confer with L. Burrow regarding same.
12/12/10	J. S. Pink	1.60 hrs.	640.00	Extensive communication between colleagues and co-defendants re revisions to draft motion to dismiss and to strike; review series of drafts and draft argument section of brief re access.
12/12/10	M. M. Seale	1.00 hrs.	310.00	Revise K. Cenar's declaration in support of the motion.
12/13/10	K. E. Cenar	5.00 hrs.	2,700.00	Edit and finalize motion to strike and dismiss, confer with R. Rosoff regarding same.
12/13/10	K. E. Cenar	5.00 hrs.	2,700.00	Edit and finalize briefs on motion to strike; confer with R. Rosoff regarding same.
12/13/10	J. S. Pink	4.50 hrs.	1,800.00	Series of phone calls and emails with colleagues and co-defendants' counsel re changes to briefs; review and revise motion to dismiss (includes

				conversation with colleagues re same), modify notice of joinder and declaration; review motion filed by co-defendants for purposes of joinder; verify page/line to be stricken based on comparison between motion/memorandum of points and authorities and first amended complaint; draft notice of interested parties; oversee filing of motions.
12/13/10	M. M. Seale	4.90 hrs.	1,519.00	Revise motion; compile exhibits and documents in support of the motion.
12/14/10	K. T. Hemphill	0.20 hrs.	41.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and deadlines re: appearances.
12/14/10	S. G. Watkins	0.10 hrs.	27.50	Prepare memorandum regarding service of first amended complaint and related court filing deadlines.
12/15/10	S. G. Watkins	0.20 hrs.	55.00	Attention to motion to dismiss first amended complaint and prepare memorandum regarding pertinent pre-hearing deadlines and filings.
12/16/10	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review order from court re joinder; discussion with K. Cenar re same; review court's scheduling order and discuss same with colleagues.
12/16/10	S. G. Watkins	0.25 hrs.	68.75	Attention to Shapiro, Rister & Guetta's motion to dismiss first amended complaint and prepare memorandum regarding pertinent pre-hearing deadlines and filings.
12/17/10	J. S. Pink	0.20 hrs.	80.00	Review order from court re proposed joinder; conversation with colleague re same.
12/23/10	L. S. Mensch	0.50 hrs.	200.00	Work regarding author of song and producer credits.

12/23/10	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00
----------	------------	-----------	--------

REDACTED

12/30/10	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review and analyze email posting by plaintiff with respect to infringement action; communicate with K. Cener re same.
----------	------------	-----------	--------	-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

Total Hours	74.25
-------------	-------

Total Fees for Legal Services	\$	31,937.25
-------------------------------	----	-----------

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

12/02/10	Miscellaneous Fees - Clerk, U.S.District Court, Northern District of Illinois Good Standing Certificate for Kara Cener	15.00
12/02/10	Miscellaneous Fees - Clerk, U.S.District Court, Northern District of Illinois Good Standing Certificate for Merili Seale	15.00
	Audio Conferencing	41.80
	Computerized Support Services	143.00
	Copy Charges	89.60
	Local Delivery - External Service	758.92
	Postage	1.83
	Long Distance Telephone Charges	5.25
	Scanning PDF Charges	7.20
	Total Expenses and Other Charges	\$ 1,077.60

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER	\$	33,014.85
-------------------------------	----	-----------



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

January 12, 2011
Invoice # 9931423
Client # C073033
Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated December 10, 2010	\$	73,464.26
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	73,464.26

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	31,937.25
Expenses and Other Charges		1,077.60
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	33,014.85
STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	106,479.11

OUR RECORDS SHOW THESE INVOICES OUTSTANDING AS OF January 12, 2011

Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9913672	(Dated 11/05/10)	3,701.72
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9924417	(Dated 12/10/10)	69,762.54

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

February 25, 2011
Invoice # 9943447
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated January 12, 2011	\$	106,479.11	
Payments and Other Credits		(106,479.11)	
BALANCE FORWARD	\$		0.00

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

Fees for Legal Services	\$	102,538.50	
Expenses and Other Charges		8,661.86	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$		111,200.36
STATEMENT TOTAL	\$		111,200.36

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through January 31, 2011

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

01/03/11	J. S. Pink	0.70 hrs.	280.00	REview filing of preliminary injunction; discuss same with K. Cenar; legal research in connection with same.
01/03/11	T. J. Allen	0.50 hrs.	142.50	Research how to apply for a continuance of a hearing on motion for preliminary injunction.
01/04/11	K. E. Cenar	5.00 hrs.	2,800.00	Review declarations filed in new preliminary injunction motion.
01/04/11	J. S. Pink	0.60 hrs.	240.00	Telephone conference with B. Slotnick and L. Burrows re opposition to Motion for Preliminary Injunction and reply in support of motion to dismiss; review and respond to series of emails re same from co-counsel; discuss same with K. Cenar.
01/05/11	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,680.00	Review declarations to motion for preliminary injunction.
01/05/11	J. S. Pink	6.80 hrs.	2,720.00	Review and notate opposition to motion to dismiss and motion strike; review and notate motion for preliminary injunction and supporting declarations; legal research in connection with drafting reply to motion to dismiss and strike; outline and begin drafting same.
01/06/11	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,120.00	Prepare and review motion for preliminary injunction and issues for response; prepare and review points for reply motion.

01/06/11	J. S. Pink	7.50 hrs.	3,000.00	Further research and drafting of reply to motion to dismiss and motion to strike.
01/07/11	K. E. Cenar	4.00 hrs.	2,240.00	Prepare outline for motion opposing request for preliminary injunction.
01/07/11	J. S. Pink	8.80 hrs.	3,520.00	Revisions to and further drafting of reply brief; additional research re cases cited in plaintiff's opposition to motion to strike; series of emails and other communications with client re assorted issues involving opposition to preliminary injunction.
01/08/11	K. E. Cenar	14.00 hrs.	7,840.00	Draft opposition to motion to dismiss and to strike and opposition to motion for preliminary injunctions.
01/08/11	J. S. Pink	11.10 hrs.	4,440.00	Review and revise reply in support of motion to strike and dismiss; series of communications with K. Cenar re same; draft additional sections in same with respect to invalidity of Plaintiff's 2010 registration vis-a-vis the work at issue; review and revise draft of opposition to Motion for Preliminary Injunctio
				REDACTED
01/08/11	M. M. Seale	6.10 hrs.	2,043.50	Calls with expert regarding comparison of works; strategize regarding opposition brief; draft opposition brief.
01/09/11	K. E. Cenar	18.00 hrs.	10,080.00	Draft, review and edit opposition to motion for preliminary Injunction, reply to motion to dismiss and strike.
01/09/11	J. S. Pink	7.90 hrs.	3,160.00	Review and revise opposition to motion for preliminary injunction; series of telephone

				conferences with colleagues re same.
01/09/11	M. M. Seale	11.10 hrs.	3,718.50	Conduct legal research in support of opposition to motion for preliminary injunction; revise K. Cemar declaration; revise opposition; revise and edit reply brief in support of motion to dismiss and motion to strike.
01/10/11	K. E. Cemar	6.50 hrs.	3,640.00	Edit, draft and begin finalization process on opposition to motion for preliminary injunction and reply to motion to dismiss.
01/10/11	J. S. Pink	15.10 hrs.	6,040.00	Further revisions to and drafting of opposition to motion for preliminary injunction; series of telephone conferences with colleagues re same.
01/10/11	M. M. Seale	3.30 hrs.	1,105.50	Revise reply brief.
01/10/11	M. M. Seale	5.10 hrs.	1,708.50	Revise opposition to motion for preliminary injunction; revise K. Cemar declaration.
01/10/11	J. M. Righettoni	18.60 hrs.	6,510.00	Review and analyze response to motion to dismiss, strike, and for a more definite statement; review and analyze motion for preliminary injunction and supporting declarations; research concerning willful copyright infringement, nature of habit evidence, and whether it can serve as an end-run around prohibition on character evidence to prove conformity; draft portion of reply in support of motion to dismiss and strike; research effect on a copyright plaintiff's burden of production when he or she does not have the benefit of a copyright registration; review and analyze complaint and prior pleadings in anticipation of draft of opposition to motion for

preliminary injunction:

REDACTED

telephone conference concerning strategy behind response to plaintiff's motion for preliminary injunction; listen to works at issue and transcribe "guitar twang" as well as certain harmonic characteristics of the works; draft of opposition to motion for preliminary injunction; related research; telephone conference with J. Pink concerning strategy; revise and edit brief.

01/11/11	J. S. Pink	0.70 hrs.	280.00	Communicate with K. Cenar re evidence and argument for use at hearing on motion; draft notice of joinders.
01/11/11	M. M. Seale	3.90 hrs.	1,306.50	Review and revise reply brief in support of motion to strike and dismiss.
01/11/11	J. M. Righettini	16.30 hrs.	5,705.00	Draft opposition to motion for preliminary injunction; related research; strategy conference with J. Pink.
01/11/11	J. M. Righettini	1.20 hrs.	420.00	Revise, edit, and draft of reply in support of motion to strike, dismiss, and for a more definite statement.
01/12/11	J. M. Righettini	3.40 hrs.	1,190.00	Further draft of opposition to motion for preliminary injunction; related research; edit and revise brief.
01/14/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review and notate plaintiff's reply in support of motion for preliminary injunction.
01/14/11	M. M. Seale	1.40 hrs.	469.00	Prepare for and attend strategy call with joint defense team.
01/14/11	J. M. Righettini	0.70 hrs.	245.00	Telephone conference with co-counsel concerning Rule 26

				disclosures.
01/14/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Review and analyze plaintiff's reply in support of motion for preliminary injunction.
01/20/11	A. Nolan	2.35 hrs.	188.00	Research and compile relevant cases for Motion for Preliminary Judgment.
01/21/11	J. S. Pink	3.10 hrs.	1,240.00	Communicate with associate and K. Cenar re counter claim; begin outlining discovery.
01/21/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Telephone communication with court clerk re order to take matter of motion to dismiss under submission; review court order re same; communicate with colleagues re same.
01/21/11	J. M. Righettini	0.80 hrs.	280.00	Strategy conference concerning January 24, 2011 hearing, in particular, discussion of registration requirements, deposit, and sound recordings.
01/21/11	K. T. Hemphill	0.10 hrs.	21.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and deadlines re: motion.
01/25/11	J. S. Pink	1.00 hrs.	400.00	Discussion with K. Cenar re arguments on up-coming hearings, including information from copyright office re rejection of plaintiff's copyright application.
01/25/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Strategy conference concerning plaintiff's compliance with copyright registration requirements, in particular, how to respond given that plaintiff seems to have not informed the copyright office that he is proceeding with an infringement claim with respect to a work that was denied registration by the copyright office.
01/25/11	J. M. Righettini	1.30 hrs.	455.00	Begin preparation of outline for

				hearing on plaintiff's motion for permanent injunction; review and analyze related pleadings.
01/26/11	J. S. Pink	0.90 hrs.	360.00	Telephone conference with K. Cenar re strategy on hearing on motion for preliminary injunction; analyze discrepancies in plaintiff's briefs; draft requests for admission.
01/26/11	J. M. Righettini	2.10 hrs.	735.00	Research concerning elements a copyright plaintiff must affirmatively plead and prove in circumstances where no registration has been granted, whether a presumption of harm attaches in copyright actions upon a showing of a likelihood of success on the merits. Draft outline for hearing on motion for preliminary injunction.
01/27/11	J. S. Pink	0.60 hrs.	240.00	Review and notate court order on motion to dismiss; conferences with K. Cenar and associate re order and go-forward strategy in light of same.
01/27/11	J. M. Righettini	0.50 hrs.	175.00	Review and analyze ruling on motion to dismiss.
01/27/11	J. M. Righettini	1.20 hrs.	420.00	Continue preparation of hearing outline on motion for preliminary injunction; related research.
01/28/11	J. M. Righettini	5.40 hrs.	1,890.00	Prepare hearing outline on motion for preliminary injunction; related research.
01/28/11	K. T. Hemphill	0.20 hrs.	42.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and deadlines re: order.
01/29/11	K. E. Cenar	5.00 hrs.	2,800.00	Prepare for oral argument on preliminary injunction hearing; travel to Irvine for hearing.
01/29/11	J. S. Pink	1.60 hrs.	640.00	Communicate with J. Righettini and K. Cenar re outline of

				hearing brief, evidence needed to move for summary judgment and prevail in case; review and comment on draft hearing outline; review final hearing outline.
01/29/11	M. M. Seale	8.10 hrs.	2,713.50	Travel; review Plaintiff's motion for preliminary injunction, Defendants' opposition and Plaintiff's reply in preparation for oral argument; review and compile exhibits for the oral argument.
01/30/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Confer with R. Rosoff on draft answer.
01/30/11	J. S. Pink	3.80 hrs.	1,520.00	Series of communications and telephone conferences with litigation team and counsel for co-defendants regarding hearing strategy; additional legal research re topics anticipated for discussion at hearing.
01/30/11	M. M. Seale	8.90 hrs.	2,981.50	Review Plaintiff's motion for preliminary injunction and responding briefs in preparation for oral argument; prepare draft answer for Adams; call with defendants' counsel regarding hearing strategy.
01/30/11	J. M. Righettini	0.70 hrs.	245.00	Strategy meeting concerning hearing on motion for preliminary injunction.
01/30/11	J. M. Righettini	1.40 hrs.	490.00	Further strategy conference concerning hearing on motion for preliminary injunction.
01/31/11	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,120.00	Prepare for, attend and argue oral argument on motion for preliminary injunction.
01/31/11	J. S. Pink	4.00 hrs.	1,600.00	Travel to/from court to attend hearing on motion for preliminary injunction; meeting with client and co-defense counsel following.

Black Eyed Peas

February 25, 2011
Invoice # 9943447
Client # C073033
Page 10



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

February 25, 2011
Invoice # 9943447
Client # C073033
Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated January 12, 2011	\$	106,479.11	
Payments and Other Credits		(106,479.11)	
BALANCE FORWARD	\$		0.00

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	102,538.50	
Expenses and Other Charges		8,661.86	
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$		111,200.36
STATEMENT TOTAL	\$		111,200.36

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

March 22, 2011
Invoice # 9950991
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated February 25, 2011	\$	217,679.47
Payments and Other Credits		(106,479.11)
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	111,200.36

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

Fees for Legal Services	\$	31,715.50
Expenses and Other Charges		4,844.21

TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE \$ 36,559.71

STATEMENT TOTAL \$ 147,760.07

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through February 28, 2011

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

02/01/11	J. S. Pink	0.50 hrs.	200.00	Group discussion regarding go-forward plan on written discovery.
02/01/11	M. M. Seale	4.10 hrs.	1,373.50	Draft answers for Ferguson, Pineda, Gomez and Tab Magnetic, Jeepney, EMI and Cherry River.
02/01/11	J. M. Righettini	1.20 hrs.	420.00	Attorney conference concerning developing strategy for discovery.
02/01/11	J. M. Righettini	0.70 hrs.	245.00	Begin draft of W. Adams's first set of requests for admission
02/01/11	J. M. Righettini	1.10 hrs.	385.00	Review and analyze correspondence in preparation of draft of discovery requests.
02/01/11	A. Nolan	1.85 hrs.	148.00	Review documentation for trial database.
02/02/11	J. S. Pink	2.10 hrs.	840.00	Further drafting of written discovery; meeting with K. Cenar re related issues.
02/02/11	M. M. Seale	2.90 hrs.	971.50	Draft answers for Ferguson, Pineda, Gomez and Tab Magnetic, Jeepney, EMI and Cherry River.
02/03/11	J. S. Pink	0.60 hrs.	240.00	Meeting with colleagues re discovery issues.
02/03/11	M. M. Seale	1.70 hrs.	569.50	Revise answers for Gomez, Pineda and Tab.
02/03/11	J. M. Righettini	1.40 hrs.	490.00	Begin draft of W. Adams's first set of document requests.
02/03/11	J. M. Righettini	1.30 hrs.	455.00	Begin draft of W. Adams's first

				set of interrogatories.
02/03/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Research concerning ASR-10 REDACTED
02/04/11	J. S. Pink	1.10 hrs.	440.00	Communicate with K. Cenar and J. Righettini re flaws in plaintiff's case; review plaintiff's web site, BMI list of works for which plaintiff registered, and related site for works played in France.
02/04/11	J. M. Righettini	0.30 hrs.	105.00	REDACTED
02/04/11	J. M. Righettini	0.80 hrs.	280.00	Research concerning plaintiff's use of our musical material and whether his works are registered with any PROs to establish whether there is a record of his works ever being publicly performed.
02/04/11	J. M. Righettini	0.50 hrs.	175.00	Research concerning NRG files and accessing plaintiff's file that he claims fixed his work in 1999.
02/04/11	J. M. Righettini	0.60 hrs.	210.00	Further research concerning ASR-10 REDACTED
02/04/11	J. M. Righettini	1.20 hrs.	420.00	Continue draft of W. Adams's first set of interrogatories.
02/04/11	J. M. Righettini	1.50 hrs.	525.00	Begin draft of S. Ferguson's first set of interrogatories.
02/07/11	J. S. Pink	0.20 hrs.	80.00	Review answer in Batts for purposes of opining on additional defenses appropriate to Pringle case; communicate with K. Cenar re same.
02/07/11	J. M. Righettini	0.30 hrs.	105.00	Analysis and consideration of possible affirmative defenses.
02/07/11	J. M. Righettini	1.00 hrs.	350.00	Further draft of W. Adams's document production requests and S. Ferguson's interrogatories.

02/07/11	J. M. Righettini	1.20 hrs.	420.00	Further review and analysis of prior correspondence for purposes of drafting discovery.
02/08/11	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,120.00	Prepare answers; conference with all regarding responses.
02/08/11	J. S. Pink	2.10 hrs.	840.00	Further discussion with colleagues regarding defenses and possible counter claim; review Court's ruling on preliminary injunction; review and notate proposed answers to complaint.
02/08/11	M. M. Seale	0.50 hrs.	167.50	Revise Cherry answer; conduct research on potential counterclaims and whether they are compulsory.
02/08/11	J. M. Righettini	0.90 hrs.	315.00	Further analysis concerning possible affirmative defenses and counterclaims.
02/08/11	J. M. Righettini	0.50 hrs.	175.00	Review and analyze court's order denying plaintiff's motion for preliminary injunction.
02/10/11	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,680.00	Prepare draft Initial disclosures.
02/10/11	J. S. Pink	0.60 hrs.	240.00	Review answer to complaint and coordinate filing of same; telephone call to associate re potential issue with respect thereto.
02/11/11	J. S. Pink	0.40 hrs.	160.00	Review and respond to emails between counsel re Rule 26 meeting
02/11/11	J. M. Righettini	2.80 hrs.	980.00	Further draft of W. Adams interrogatories to Plaintiff, S. Ferguson's interrogatories to Pringle, and editing of requests for admissions and document requests for Pringle.
02/11/11	S. G. Watkins	0.20 hrs.	57.00	Attention to answer of defendants Shapiro/Guetta to first amended complaint and prepare memorandum regarding

				related deadlines.
02/13/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review and respond to emails from co-counsel in preparation for Rule 26 conference.
02/14/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Attend Rule 26 conference; prepare letter regarding ESI issues required to be addressed.
02/14/11	J. S. Pink	0.70 hrs.	280.00	Review and respond to additional emails in preparation for Rule 26 meeting; attend and participate in Rule 26 meeting in preparation for joint report.
02/14/11	J. S. Pink	0.80 hrs.	320.00	Telephone conversation with K. Cenar re discovery and issues related to telephone conversation with opposing counsel (and regarding issue of protective order in case, and scope of necessary discovery)
02/14/11	K. T. Hemphill	0.20 hrs.	42.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and deadlines re: order.
02/14/11	K. T. Hemphill	0.40 hrs.	84.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and deadlines re: Answers to second amended complaint.
02/15/11	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,120.00	Review plaintiff draft joint report; prepare defense draft edits; consider electronic discovery rules and the need for compliance with electronic discovery component of Rule 26 conference.
02/15/11	J. S. Pink	1.40 hrs.	560.00	Review and respond to email regarding Rule 26 report; review plaintiff's proposed Rule 26 report; review discovery drafted by associate; discussion with associate re discovery; communicate with K. Cenar re same.
02/15/11	J. M. Righettini	3.40 hrs.	1,190.00	Edit, revise, and further draft of

				W. Adams and S. Ferguson interrogatories.
02/15/11	J. M. Righettini	3.60 hrs.	1,260.00	Draft A. Pineda interrogatories and related research.
02/16/11	J. S. Pink	7.50 hrs.	3,000.00	Review and revise proposed joint report (and court ruling on setting scheduling conference); review proposed drafts from co-defense counsel (T. Dickstein and L. Buroughs); communicate by email and telephone with co-defense counsel (T. Dickstein and L. Buroughs) re proposed changes to document; implement proposed changes; discuss discovery with associate; further drafting and revisions to written discovery (interrogatories) propounded by Adams, Ferguson and Pineda; communicate with plaintiffs' counsel regarding draft of joint report that includes defendants' contribution
02/16/11	J. M. Righettini	0.60 hrs.	210.00	Revise W. Adams and S. Ferguson interrogatories for B. Pringle.
02/16/11	J. M. Righettini	1.00 hrs.	350.00	Review and analyze draft of joint rule 26 report, related research, and provide commentary.
02/16/11	S. G. Watkins	0.10 hrs.	28.50	Attention to UMG's answer to first amended complaint and prepare memorandum regarding related court deadlines.
02/17/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Review draft joint report; review court order; edit draft.
02/17/11	J. S. Pink	4.30 hrs.	1,720.00	Review emails regarding changes to proposed joint report; make requested changes; review and incorporate changes from co-counsel, T. Dickstein.
02/17/11	J. M. Righettini	1.00 hrs.	350.00	Further review and analysis of proposed joint rule 26 report

				and provide related commentary.
02/18/11	J. S. Pink	0.50 hrs.	200.00	Communicate with co-defense counsel and colleagues re finalizing joint report; communicate with opposing counsel re same.
02/18/11	J. S. Pink	0.60 hrs.	240.00	Further drafting of written discovery (interrogatories) regarding alleged creation of guitar twang.
02/22/11	J. S. Pink	1.20 hrs.	480.00	Communicate with opposing counsel re missing Exhibit A to Joint Report; forward copy of exhibit to same so that plaintiffs can correct/file; communicate with opposing counsel re ADR Questionnaire (and research re same)
02/22/11	J. M. Righettini	0.50 hrs.	175.00	Begin draft of initial disclosures.
02/23/11	J. M. Righettini	3.25 hrs.	1,137.50	Draft answer of W. Adams.
02/23/11	J. M. Righettini	1.40 hrs.	490.00	Further draft of initial disclosures.
02/23/11	K. T. Hemphill	0.10 hrs.	21.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and deadlines re: report.
02/24/11	J. S. Pink	1.90 hrs.	760.00	Research regarding content of initial disclosures; draft and revise initial disclosure.
02/24/11	J. M. Righettini	1.30 hrs.	455.00	Continue draft of initial disclosures.
02/25/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review communication from court re scheduling orders, etc.
02/28/11	J. S. Pink	0.80 hrs.	320.00	Revisions to Initial Disclosure; communicate with co-defense counsel and colleagues re same.
02/28/11	M. M. Seale	0.30 hrs.	100.50	REDACTED
02/28/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Review and analyze orders of court concerning scheduling and ADR procedures.

Total Hours 83.40

Total Fees for Legal Services \$ 31,715.50

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

02/04/11	Miscellaneous Fees - Pacer Service Center December 2010 Pacer usage	0.16
02/04/11	Miscellaneous Fees - Pacer Service Center November 2010 Pacer usage	1.28
02/03/11	Search Fee - LexisNexis Risk Data Management Inc Accurint Billable - Dec 2010 No Tax Paid 1342155	5.30
02/15/11	Meals - Jonathan Stuart Pink Dinner for BEP team on 1/16/11	26.07
02/15/11	Meals - Jonathan Stuart Pink Dinner for BEP team on 1/10/11	66.34
02/22/11	Meals - Mariangela "Merili" Seale Travel to Newport Beach, CA (01/29-02/04/11) to work at Client's office	343.69
02/23/11	Meals - Kara Cenar Lunch on 01/30/11 with M. Seale to discuss strategy of case at Fairmont Newport Beach Hotel	63.58
02/23/11	Meals - Kara Cenar Dinner on 01/30/11 with M. Seale to discuss strategy of case at Fairmont Newport Beach Hotel	66.14
02/07/11	Travel Related Costs - Mariangela "Merili" Seale Airfare for Travel to Santa Ana, CA (01/22-02/08/11) to work at client's	249.70
02/22/11	Travel Related Costs - Mariangela "Merili" Seale Travel to Newport Beach, CA (01/29-02/04/11) to work at Client's office	943.12
02/22/11	Travel Related Costs - Kara Cenar Travel to Irvine, CA (01/29-02/04/11) to prepare for, attend and argue motions for preliminary injunction	1,108.32
	Audio Conferencing	76.37
	Computerized Support Services	21.00
	Copy Charges	8.00
	Local Delivery - External Service	222.29
	Lexis Computerized Research	972.25
	Postage	3.05
	Long Distance Telephone Charges	1.05
	Scanning PDF Charges	29.00
	Westlaw Computerized Research	637.50
	Total Expenses and Other Charges	\$ 4,844.21

Black Eyed Peas

March 22, 2011
Invoice # 9950991
Client # C073033
Page 9

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER

\$ 36,559.71



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

March 22, 2011
Invoice # 9950991
Client # C073033
Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated February 25, 2011	\$	217,679.47
Payments and Other Credits		(106,479.11)
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	111,200.36

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	31,715.50
Expenses and Other Charges		4,844.21
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	36,559.71
STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	147,760.07

OUR RECORDS SHOW THESE INVOICES OUTSTANDING AS OF March 22, 2011

Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9943447	(Dated 02/25/11)	111,200.36
-----------------------------	---------	------------------	------------

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

April 21, 2011
Invoice # 9959517
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated March 22, 2011	\$	147,760.07
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	147,760.07

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

Fees for Legal Services	\$	15,587.50
Expenses and Other Charges		1,185.89

TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE \$ 16,773.39

STATEMENT TOTAL \$ 164,533.46

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through March 31, 2011

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

03/01/11	J. S. Pink	0.40 hrs.	160.00	Review co-defendants' initial disclosures.
03/01/11	M. M. Seale	0.40 hrs.	134.00	
03/01/11	J. M. Righettini	0.50 hrs.	175.00	Review and analyze plaintiff's initial disclosures.
03/01/11	K. T. Hemphill	0.10 hrs.	21.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and deadlines re: settlement.
03/02/11	J. S. Pink	0.90 hrs.	360.00	Further drafting of discovery regarding plaintiff's electronic evidence.
03/02/11	K. T. Hemphill	1.00 hrs.	210.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and deadlines re: exhibit conference, final pre-trial conference and trial.
03/03/11	J. S. Pink	1.40 hrs.	560.00	Further drafting of interrogatories and requests for admission targeted at electronic media on which plaintiff purportedly created music.
03/03/11	J. M. Righettini	0.50 hrs.	175.00	Review and analyze proposed discovery requests
03/04/11	J. S. Pink	1.65 hrs.	660.00	
03/04/11	K. T. Hemphill	0.20 hrs.	42.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and

				deadlines re: discovery.
03/04/11	K. T. Hemphill	0.10 hrs.	21.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and deadlines of timekeepers.
03/07/11	J. S. Pink	0.80 hrs.	320.00	Further drafting of interrogatories, requests for admission and request for production
03/08/11	J. S. Pink	0.40 hrs.	160.00	Review and revise interrogatories re electronic issues.
03/10/11	J. S. Pink	3.60 hrs.	1,440.00	Review and revise Adams', Fergueson's and Pineda's sets of interrogatories; draft requests for production in connection with same; communicate with colleagues regarding finalization of same.
03/11/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Review discovery requests.
03/11/11	J. S. Pink	1.90 hrs.	760.00	Further revisions to written discovery; forward same to K. Cenar questions and comments.
03/11/11	J. M. Righettini	0.60 hrs.	210.00	Edit S. Ferguson and A. Pineda interrogatories.
03/13/11	J. S. Pink	3.50 hrs.	1,400.00	Draft memo to Stephen Dallas re current status of case; draft additional requests for production based on Plaintiff's alleged distribution of derivative work at issue.
03/14/11	J. S. Pink	6.10 hrs.	2,440.00	Further drafting of and revisions to memo to Stephen Dallas re current status of case; communicate with S. Dallas re same; further drafting of and revisions to requests for production based on Plaintiff's alleged distribution of derivative work at issue;
03/15/11	K. T. Hemphill	0.20 hrs.	42.00	Analyse and review documents with regard to case calendar and deadlines re: discovery.

REDACTED

03/16/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Review letters from D. Dickie regarding F. Risterer; confer with B. Slotnik.
03/19/11	K. E. Cenar	0.50 hrs.	280.00	Review Slotnik letters; confer with R. Rosoff regarding Risterer and D. Dickie, confer with B, Slotnik regarding address issue; confer with J. Pink and M. Seale regarding D. Dickie issues.
03/20/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review and respond to series of emails between D. Dickie's office and B. Slotnick, and from and K. Cenar, and B. Slotnick regarding attempted service on additional parties.
03/22/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review series of correspondence from opposing counsel re depositions; review and respond to email regarding same; communicate with K. Cennar re same.
03/24/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review discovery propounded by plaintiffs, including interrogatories, requests for production and deposition notices.
03/27/11	J. S. Pink	0.40 hrs.	160.00	Review email from K. Cenar and review proposed protective order.
03/28/11	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,120.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding case status; review discovery and deposition matters; review discovery requests; consider conflict issues regarding further representation of UMG/Universal.
03/30/11	J. W. Amberg	1.25 hrs.	812.50	Review draft conflict disclosure; emails and conference call with J. Pink re same; draft additional disclosure language re potential conflicts of interest arising from joint representation.

03/30/11	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,120.00	Review discovery requests and other matters and consider discovery requests; consider and prepare memorandum on conflicts and other issues on joint representation.
03/30/11	J. S. Pink	1.10 hrs.	440.00	Telephone conference with K. Cenar regarding conflict letter, upcoming depositions and related issues; review draft correspondence regarding conflict waiver; discuss same with John Amberg.
03/31/11	J. W. Amberg	0.50 hrs.	325.00	Emails re protection in joint representation engagement letter against disqualification.
03/31/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Confer with B. Slotnik regarding discovery and deposition scheduling; prepare memorandum regarding conflicts and joint representation of UMG/Interscope.

Total Hours 35.90

Total Fees for Legal Services \$ 15,587.50

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

03/03/11	Meals - Kara Cenar Dinner on 01/29/11 with Merili Seale to discuss strategy of case at The Beachcomber	136.95
03/11/11	Meals - Kara Cenar Lunch on 01/31/11 with Merili Seale at Gypsy Den Grand Central Cafe	100.86
03/11/11	Meals - Kara Cenar Dinner on 01/29/11 with Merili Seale, Jonathan Pink and spouse to discuss strategy of case at The Beachcomber	306.05
03/10/11	Parking - Jonathan Stuart Pink Parking re Motion for Preliminary Injunction on 1/31/11	8.75
03/22/11	Travel Related Costs - Kara Cenar Travel to Irvine, CA (01/29-02/04/11) to prepare for, attend and argue motions for preliminary junctions	451.70
	Audio Conferencing	9.46
	Computerized Support Services	36.00

Black Eyed Peas

April 21, 2011
Invoice # 9959517
Client # C073033
Page 6

Local Delivery - External Service	115.42
Postage	12.90
Scanning PDF Charges	7.80
Total Expenses and Other Charges	\$ 1,185.89
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER	\$ 16,773.39



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

April 21, 2011
Invoice # 9959517
Client # C073033
Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated March 22, 2011	\$	147,760.07
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	147,760.07

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	15,587.50
Expenses and Other Charges		1,185.89
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	16,773.39

STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	164,533.46
-----------------	----	------------

OUR RECORDS SHOW THESE INVOICES OUTSTANDING AS OF April 21, 2011

Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9943447	(Dated 02/25/11)	111,200.36
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9950991	(Dated 03/22/11)	36,559.71

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

May 31, 2011
Invoice # 9971906
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated April 21, 2011	\$	164,533.46
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	164,533.46

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

Fees for Legal Services	\$	13,820.00
Expenses and Other Charges		132.82
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	13,952.82

STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	178,486.28
-----------------	----	------------

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through April 30, 2011

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

04/05/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Review materials and prepare email directed to deposition scheduling and send to opposing counsel/
04/06/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Telephone conference with B. Slotnik regarding his motions and his client's deposition scheduling and his availability for deposition in July for our client's depositions; confer with J. Pink regarding due dates for Pringle's discovery responses and deposition scheduling.
04/07/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Review and edit scheduling order.
04/11/11	J. S. Pink	1.30 hrs.	520.00	Communicate internally and with opposing counsel regarding discovery; initial review of discovery propounded by plaintiff and discussion with associate re same; review motion and reply with respect to Reisener issue.
04/12/11	J. S. Pink	0.90 hrs.	360.00	Further review and notation of discovery propounded by plaintiffs.
04/12/11	J. M. Righettini	3.10 hrs.	1,085.00	Review and analyze Plaintiff's discovery requests in anticipation of preparing responses to same.
04/12/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Review and analyze Defendants' reply in support of motion to dismiss for improper service.
04/13/11	J. S. Pink	0.90 hrs.	360.00	Discussion with co-defense

				counsel regarding discovery responses, and internal discussion related to same; review court order on plaintiff's motion for preliminary injunction in connection with drafting and planning motion for summary judgment;
				REDACTED
				discussion with associate regarding same.
04/13/11	J. M. Righettoni	2.10 hrs.	735.00	Review and analyze responses of Plaintiff to discovery requests.
04/14/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Review scheduling order and edit for filing.
04/14/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Follow-up communication with opposing counsel with regards to motion for protective order; draft correspondence to opposing counsel regarding inaccuracy in plaintiffs' proof of service of written discovery, and notification that such discovery will be deemed served by mail.
04/15/11	J. S. Pink	0.80 hrs.	320.00	Review and draft rough discovery responses; review court's order re defendant Reisener.
04/18/11	J. M. Righettoni	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Review and analyze order concerning Rister motion to dismiss.
04/25/11	J. S. Pink	0.70 hrs.	280.00	Review plaintiff's discovery responses; plan strategy regarding possible motion to compel and motion for summary judgment; discussion with associates regarding same; review discovery propounded by plaintiff and discuss proposed responses thereto.
04/25/11	J. M. Righettoni	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Research timing issues in

				connection with filing motion to compel in central district of california.
04/25/11	J. M. Righettini	3.50 hrs.	1,225.00	Prepare discovery responses.
04/26/11	J. S. Pink	1.40 hrs.	560.00	Discussion with associate regarding written responses to interrogatories and related issues; review and revise draft discovery
04/26/11	J. M. Righettini	2.10 hrs.	735.00	Prepare draft responses of will.i.am music to plaintiff's document requests.
04/26/11	J. M. Righettini	2.30 hrs.	805.00	Prepare draft responses of W. Adams to plaintiff's document requests.
04/27/11	J. S. Pink	0.60 hrs.	240.00	Review court order on motion to quash service on F. Resisner, and declarations of I. Gould and B. Slotnick with respect to dispute over attorneys fees.
04/27/11	J. M. Righettini	2.50 hrs.	875.00	Prepare draft of J. Gomez's response to document requests
04/27/11	J. M. Righettini	1.60 hrs.	560.00	Edit discovery responses of W. Adams and will.i.am music.
04/28/11	J. M. Righettini	2.00 hrs.	700.00	Prepare draft response of S. Ferguson to document requests.
04/28/11	J. M. Righettini	1.90 hrs.	665.00	Prepare draft discovery responses of Jeepney Music.
04/28/11	J. M. Righettini	1.30 hrs.	455.00	Prepare draft discovery responses of Headphone Junkie.
04/30/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding discovery responses.

Total Hours 35.50

Total Fees for Legal Services \$ 13,820.00

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

Computerized Support Services	26.50
Copy Charges	39.20
Search Fee	13.92
Scanning PDF Charges	25.20
Westlaw Computerized Research	28.00
Total Expenses and Other Charges	\$ 132.82

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER \$ 13,952.82



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Miami | New York
 Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
 c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
 Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
 450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
 Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

May 31, 2011
 Invoice # 9971906
 Client # C073033
 Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated April 21, 2011	\$	164,533.46
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	164,533.46

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	13,820.00
Expenses and Other Charges		132.82
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	13,952.82

STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	178,486.28
-----------------	----	------------

OUR RECORDS SHOW THESE INVOICES OUTSTANDING AS OF May 31, 2011

Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9943447	(Dated 02/25/11)	111,200.36
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9950991	(Dated 03/22/11)	36,559.71
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9959517	(Dated 04/21/11)	16,773.39

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
 PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
 BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
 THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
 Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
 c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
 Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
 450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
 Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

June 22, 2011
 Invoice # 9978208
 Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
 Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated May 31, 2011	\$	178,486.28
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	178,486.28

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629
 Copyright Infringement Litigation
 Re: Bryan Pringle

Fees for Legal Services	\$	20,980.00
Expenses and Other Charges		1,884.93
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	22,864.93

STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	201,351.21
-----------------	----	------------

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
 PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
 BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
 THANK YOU

For Legal Services Rendered Through May 31, 2011

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

04/11/11	K. E. Cenar	0.50 hrs.	280.00	Review discovery requests served on defendants.
05/02/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review supplemental declaration of Barry Slotnick in support of application to recover expenses.
05/03/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review and notate reply brief filed by S. Fergusson.
05/03/11	J. S. Pink	0.20 hrs.	80.00	Discussion with associate re answers to written discovery.
05/03/11	J. M. Righettini	2.60 hrs.	910.00	Edit and revise responses of W. Adams and will.i.am music to plaintiff's request for production of documents.
05/04/11	J. W. Amberg	0.40 hrs.	260.00	Edit language for engagement letter and consent to multiple representation.
05/04/11	J. S. Pink	2.60 hrs.	1,040.00	Research California Rules of Prof. Conduct 3-310; draft conflict waiver letter for clients; discussion with K. Cenar and J. Amberg re same.
05/04/11	J. M. Righettini	1.70 hrs.	595.00	Draft response of W. Adams to first set of interrogatories.
05/04/11	J. M. Righettini	1.80 hrs.	630.00	Prepare responses of EMI to request for production of documents.
05/04/11	J. M. Righettini	1.60 hrs.	560.00	Prepare responses to request for production of documents on behalf of Cherry River.
05/05/11	J. S. Pink	4.85 hrs.	1,940.00	Review exchange of emails concerning files regarding the creation of "I Gotta Feeling"

				including documentation in the form of computer files and files regarding co-defendants' contributions to the song; communicate with K. Cenar regarding conflict letter; revisions to same; draft conflict letter to UMG; review and notate responses to discovery provided by co-defendants; review and comment on meet and confer letter from co-counsel re deficient discovery responses; final review of draft discovery responses and forward same to client.
05/05/11	J. M. Righettini	1.20 hrs.	420.00	Communications concerning strategy for case, including potential motion for summary judgment, evidence needed, and possible motion to compel based on Plaintiff's discovery responses.
05/06/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Communicate and strategize with K. Cenar re responses to discovery; further edits to W. Adam's responses to interrogatories and discuss other proposed responses with colleagues.
05/09/11	J. S. Pink	2.10 hrs.	840.00	Review and revise written discovery responses; final edits on draft of MSJ brief; discuss same with associate for further drafting and research.
05/10/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Review plaintiff's request for reconsideration of sanctions.
05/11/11	J. S. Pink	2.20 hrs.	880.00	Email and telephone conference with co-defense team in connection with planning for summary judgment and related issues; t

REDACTED

				communicate with Katherine Dunn re depositions and scheduling of same; communicate with client regarding drafting meet and confer concerning production of documents; review and analyze documents produced and discussion with colleagues regarding same with respect to evidentiary value of same.
05/11/11	J. M. Righettini	0.50 hrs.	175.00	Attorney telephone conference and e-mail exchange concerning potential motion for summary judgment and procuring of requested documents from plaintiffs.
05/11/11	J. M. Righettini	2.20 hrs.	770.00	Review and analysis of documents produced by plaintiffs; further communications concerning general case strategy.
05/11/11	J. M. Righettini	3.20 hrs.	1,120.00	Edit and revise responses to Plaintiff's discovery requests.
05/12/11	J. S. Pink	1.40 hrs.	560.00	Communicate with Steve Dallas regarding status of case and issues regarding draft discovery; communicate with B. Slotnick regarding motion to compel and documents produced by plaintiffs; review correspondence from opposing counsel regarding depositions and related topics; review meet and confer correspondence prepared by associate..
05/12/11	J. M. Righettini	4.10 hrs.	1,435.00	Draft meet and confer letter concerning Plaintiff's discovery responses.
05/13/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Communicate with S. Dallas regarding draft discovery responses prepared on behalf of EMI.

05/16/11	J. S. Pink	1.40 hrs.	560.00	Review and respond to series of correspondence between counsel regarding depositions and related issues; draft correspondence to opposing party regarding dates, location and scheduling of depositions; communicate with S. Dallas re discovery responses; edit discovery responses based on same.
05/18/11	J. S. Pink	1.80 hrs.	720.00	Communicate with client regarding outstanding discovery; revise discovery responses; review correspondence from opposing counsel; review and revise draft declaration of W. Adams.
05/19/11	J. S. Pink	0.20 hrs.	80.00	Review court's order denying motion for reconsideration.
05/19/11	J. M. Righettini	0.70 hrs.	245.00	Revise discovery responses of EMI and Cherry River.
05/19/11	J. M. Righettini	2.40 hrs.	840.00	Revise discovery responses of J. Gomez; S. Ferguson; Jeepney Music; and Headphone Junkie.
05/19/11	J. M. Righettini	1.50 hrs.	525.00	Prepare Tab Magnetic responses to Plaintiff's request for the production of documents.
05/20/11	J. S. Pink	0.40 hrs.	160.00	Communicate with colleagues and co-defense counsel re planned deposition of Frederic Riesterer; communicate with client re draft discovery responses.
05/20/11	J. M. Righettini	1.00 hrs.	350.00	Global revisions to discovery responses.
05/20/11	J. M. Righettini	2.50 hrs.	875.00	Revise motion for summary judgment, REDACTED
05/21/11	J. S. Pink	0.20 hrs.	80.00	Draft email to client regarding outstanding discovery responses.
05/23/11	J. S. Pink	0.80 hrs.	320.00	Communicate with colleagues regarding draft discovery responses; finalize same and

				prepare for service; draft correspondence to opposing counsel regarding change in deposition dates.
05/23/11	J. M. Righettini	0.80 hrs.	280.00	Make further global revisions to defendants' discovery responses.
05/25/11	K. E. Cengar	2.00 hrs.	1,120.00	Review and edit summary judgment papers.
05/25/11	J. S. Pink	0.40 hrs.	160.00	Draft follow-up letter to opposing counsel regarding deposition dates; review amended notice of deposition from same; review correspondence from opposing counsel re same; draft correspondence further correcting dates of deposition.
05/26/11	K. E. Cengar	2.00 hrs.	1,120.00	Read and consider changes to summary judgment motion for final filing; confer with J Pink regarding same; confer with R. Rosoff regarding same.
05/26/11	J. M. Righettini	0.20 hrs.	70.00	Draft e-mail to opposing counsel concerning meet and confer in connection with Plaintiff's discovery responses.
05/27/11	J. S. Pink	0.40 hrs.	160.00	Communicate with co-defense counsel re up-coming depositions.
05/27/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Review and respond to opposing counsel's emails concerning meet and confer
05/31/11	J. S. Pink	0.20 hrs.	80.00	Communicate with associate regarding meeting and conferring with opposing counsel regarding deficient discovery responses; draft letter to plaintiffs regarding depositions.

Total Hours

53.95

Total Fees for Legal Services	\$	20,980.00
-------------------------------	----	-----------

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

05/05/11	Search Fee - Pacer Service Center PACER Billable usage from 1/1/11-3/31/11 NO TAX PAID BC0648	1.60
05/05/11	Search Fee - Pacer Service Center PACER Billable usage from 1/1/11-3/31/11 NO TAX PAID BC0648	3.36
05/05/11	Search Fee - Pacer Service Center PACER Billable usage from 1/1/11-3/31/11 NO TAX PAID BC0648	4.64
	Computerized Support Services	53.50
	Copy Charges	181.00
	Postage	31.63
	Scanning PDF Charges	47.80
	Westlaw Computerized Research	1,561.40
	Total Expenses and Other Charges	\$ 1,884.93

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER	\$	22,864.93
-------------------------------	----	-----------



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
 Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
 c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
 Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
 450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
 Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

June 22, 2011
 Invoice # 9978208
 Client # C073033
 Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated May 31, 2011	\$	178,486.28
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	178,486.28

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	20,980.00
Expenses and Other Charges		1,884.93
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	22,864.93

STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	201,351.21
------------------------	-----------	-------------------

OUR RECORDS SHOW THESE INVOICES OUTSTANDING AS OF June 22, 2011

Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9943447	(Dated 02/25/11)	111,200.36
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9950991	(Dated 03/22/11)	36,559.71
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9959517	(Dated 04/21/11)	16,773.39
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9971906	(Dated 05/31/11)	13,952.82

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
 PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
 BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
 THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

July 26, 2011
Invoice # 9987120
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated June 22, 2011	\$	201,351.21
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	201,351.21

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

Fees for Legal Services	\$	74,204.50
Expenses and Other Charges		3,962.04

TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE \$ 78,166.54

STATEMENT TOTAL \$ 279,517.75

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

<p>PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER) PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976 THANK YOU</p>

For Legal Services Rendered Through June 30, 2011

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

06/01/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Discussion with associate re preparation for meeting and conferring with plaintiff regarding deficient discovery responses.
06/02/11	K. E. Cenar	0.50 hrs.	280.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding deposition dates.
06/02/11	J. S. Pink	6.50 hrs.	2,600.00	Communicate with associate re meet and confer telephone conference; review plaintiff's discovery responses in connection with same; begin drafting additional interrogatories; participate in meet and confer conference; communicate further with co-defense counsel re motion for summary judgment based on outcome of meet and confer conference; legal research in connection with same.
06/02/11	J. M. Righettini	1.80 hrs.	630.00	Review discovery and prepare for meet and confer concerning Pringle's discovery responses.
06/02/11	J. M. Righettini	0.90 hrs.	315.00	Meet and confer with opposing counsel concerning Plaintiff's discovery responses.
06/02/11	J. M. Righettini	1.30 hrs.	455.00	Strategy conference concerning motion for summary judgment in light of meet and confer and communications concerning go forth strategy.
06/03/11	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,120.00	Confer with T. Dickstein and R. Rosoff regarding discovery and

				depositions dates and expert discovery.
06/03/11	J. S. Pink	4.20 hrs.	1,680.00	Exchange of emails with co-defense counsel; conference call with same, including individual follow-up calls; review correspondence from opposing counsel; drafting of further discovery and discussion with associate regarding same.
06/03/11	M. M. Seale	1.60 hrs.	536.00	Prepare for and attend call with joint defense team regarding upcoming deadlines and planned summary judgment motion.
06/03/11	J. M. Righettini	1.50 hrs.	525.00	Attorney conference concerning discovery, expert reports, and motion for summary judgment.
06/03/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Communications with opposing counsel concerning follow up meet and confer.
06/03/11	J. M. Righettini	0.50 hrs.	175.00	Edit protective order.
06/06/11	J. S. Pink	1.50 hrs.	600.00	Communicate with co-defense counsel regarding proposed protective order; resend email to opposing counsel regarding same; review material submitted by plaintiff in connection with preparation for deposition of F. Reisterer; review correspondence from Tal Dickstein; review and revise letter to opposing counsel regarding production of further documents and inspection of equipment.
06/06/11	J. M. Righettini	0.20 hrs.	70.00	Further communications with opposing counsel in connection with plaintiffs' production.
06/06/11	J. M. Righettini	1.20 hrs.	420.00	Draft letter to opposing counsel confirming representations made during meet and confer.
06/06/11	J. M. Righettini	0.50 hrs.	175.00	Research concerning BMI record retention practices.

06/06/11	J. M. Righettini	0.30 hrs.	105.00	Telephonic conference with co-counsel concerning records of plaintiff's alleged public performances.
06/07/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Confer with T. Dickstein regarding documents to produce and confidentiality stipulation.
06/07/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Communicate with colleagues and co-counsel re documents co-counsel intends to produce; review same.
06/14/11	J. S. Pink	0.30 hrs.	120.00	Communicate with colleague regarding upcoming deadlines and issues in Pringle matter.
06/15/11	J. S. Pink	0.50 hrs.	200.00	Review and respond to series of emails from colleagues and opposing counsel regarding protective order; communicate with colleague re collection of electronic data from plaintiff.
06/15/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Discussion with co-counsel concerning Plaintiffs' production, anticipated motion for summary judgment.
06/15/11	J. M. Righettini	0.50 hrs.	175.00	Draft e-mail to opposing counsel confirming contents of discussion concerning Plaintiffs' production.
06/17/11	K. E. Cenar	1.00 hrs.	560.00	Prepare approval on protective order stipulation.
06/17/11	J. S. Pink	0.60 hrs.	240.00	Communicate with colleagues and co-counsel regarding inspection of plaintiffs' equipment and scheduling of same, along with deposition issues.
06/17/11	J. M. Righettini	0.70 hrs.	245.00	Review and analyze letter from opposing counsel concerning plaintiff's production; communications with co-counsel concerning the same.

06/17/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	140.00	Review and analyze newly scheduled deposition notices for band members.
06/18/11	M. M. Seale	0.20 hrs.	67.00	Review Rule 26 Joint Status Report.
06/20/11	K. E. Cengar	3.50 hrs.	1,960.00	Prepare for meeting with B. Slotnik and T. Dickstein regarding discovery, deposition, and summary judgment, prepare for Risterer deposition.
06/20/11	J. S. Pink	0.40 hrs.	160.00	Review and respond to series of emails regarding deposition scheduling; finalize deposition notice; communicate with co-counsel re same.
06/21/11	K. E. Cengar	3.00 hrs.	1,680.00	Prepare, meet and confer on Pringle computer related discovery and lack of computer related files; prepare for Risterer deposition; hold meet and confer on motion for protective order.
06/22/11	K. E. Cengar	8.00 hrs.	4,480.00	Prepare for attendance at Risterer deposition; prepare for and review and attend meet and confer on deposition of band member issues; confer with R. Rosoff regarding discovery and meet and confer; prepare for and attend meet and confer conference.
06/22/11	J. S. Pink	10.50 hrs.	4,200.00	Travel to New York City for deposition of F. Reisterer; meeting with K. Cengar in connection with same.
06/22/11	M. M. Seale	5.30 hrs.	1,775.50	Review and revise meet and confer letter to opposing counsel; draft Motion for Protective Order; call with J. Righettini re same.
06/22/11	J. M. Righettini	3.40 hrs.	1,190.00	Draft ex parte application for protective order; related research.

06/22/11	J. M. Righettini	1.70 hrs.	595.00	Meet and confer with opposing counsel concerning protective order and deposition scheduling; related conference with co-counsel.
06/23/11	K. E. Cenar	8.00 hrs.	4,480.00	Prepare for, attend and defend deposition of F. Reisterer on behalf of band member clients.
06/23/11	J. S. Pink	11.00 hrs.	4,400.00	Travel to/from deposition of Fred Riesterer; meeting with Kara Cenar re deposition and related case issues.
06/23/11	M. M. Seale	0.80 hrs.	268.00	Research docket regarding attorney appearances; research potential objections regarding same.
06/24/11	K. E. Cenar	5.00 hrs.	2,800.00	Confer with B. Slotnik and T. Dickstein regarding deposition of F. Reisterer; deposition of Guetta, deposition of BEP; deposition of Pringle; discovery requests on computer related materials; travel from NY.
06/24/11	J. S. Pink	11.00 hrs.	4,400.00	Return travel from New York following deposition of F. Reisterer.
06/24/11	J. M. Righettini	0.30 hrs.	105.00	Review and analyze order denying protective order.
06/27/11	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,680.00	Prepare for and attend meet and confer conference on Pringle computer; draft letter confirming conference.
06/27/11	M. M. Seale	3.90 hrs.	1,306.50	Prepare for call with opposing counsel re discovery deficiencies; review Plaintiff's discovery responses to Defendants' requests.
06/27/11	A. M. Hunter	1.20 hrs.	450.00	Conferences with J. Righetinni and J. Pink regarding motion for protective order.
06/27/11	A. M. Hunter	1.30 hrs.	487.50	Research and analysis into federal case law and statutes

				governing protective orders.
06/27/11	J. M. Righettini	2.40 hrs.	840.00	Attorney conference concerning discovery issues; motion for protective order; and plaintiffs' motion to compel.
06/28/11	K. E. Cenar	2.00 hrs.	1,120.00	Confer with R. Rosoff regarding discovery responses and documents; prepare for meet and confer meeting with Pringle's lawyers; gather documents for production.
06/28/11	J. S. Pink	1.85 hrs.	740.00	Communicate with S. Dallas regarding discovery issues; review documents from same; telephone conference with K. Hauprich re documents.
06/28/11	M. M. Seale	4.60 hrs.	1,541.00	Conduct legal research regarding 17 U.S.C. 504 and a plaintiff's burden to show the portion of the accused work that is infringing for purposes of damages; revise meet and confer letter to opposing counsel.
06/28/11	A. M. Hunter	1.30 hrs.	487.50	Continue researching and analyzing federal case law on grounds for protective order and sequence of discovery.
06/28/11	A. M. Hunter	3.70 hrs.	1,387.50	Begin drafting motion for a protective order.
06/29/11	K. E. Cenar	8.00 hrs.	4,480.00	Prepare detailed Rule 11 letter and detailed meet and confer letter regarding deficiencies in discovery; review documents for production.
06/29/11	J. S. Pink	5.60 hrs.	2,240.00	Communicate with colleague regarding meeting and conferring with plaintiffs concerning discovery dispute;
				review and revise motion for protective order.
06/29/11	M. M. Seale	1.80 hrs.	603.00	Review initial disclosures; review

REDACTED

				deposition notices; prepare for meet and confer regarding discovery issues and deposition scheduling; attend meet and confer call.
06/29/11	A. M. Hunter	4.90 hrs.	1,837.50	Continue drafting motion for protective order.
06/29/11	A. M. Hunter	0.60 hrs.	225.00	Begin drafting declaration of J. Pink in support of motion for protective orders.
06/29/11	J. M. Righettini	3.80 hrs.	1,330.00	Research concerning bifurcation of liability and damages issues in copyright cases; ownership and standing; prepare outline of same for anticipated motion to bifurcate.
06/29/11	S. Caldwell	1.50 hrs.	307.50	Create new Ringtail database; load data to Ringtail database.
06/30/11	K. E. Cenar	3.50 hrs.	1,960.00	Review and analyze documents to produce in the litigation and responsiveness to the requests.
06/30/11	J. S. Pink	1.90 hrs.	760.00	Review and finalize ex parte application for protective order; communicate with colleague re discovery issues, including production of documents.
06/30/11	M. M. Seale	9.10 hrs.	3,048.50	Review case file and documents provided by client in preparation for production of documents; conduct privilege review of same; revise letter to opposition counsel regarding discovery deficiencies and deposition scheduling issues.
06/30/11	A. M. Hunter	0.50 hrs.	187.50	Research local rules and Judge's procedures for ex parte requirements on discovery motion.
06/30/11	A. M. Hunter	3.60 hrs.	1,350.00	Continue drafting motion for protective order and incorporate ex parte request for relief or order to shorten time.

06/30/11	A. M. Hunter	0.80 hrs.	300.00	Continue drafting declaration of J. Pink in support of motion for protective order and compile supporting exhibits.
06/30/11	A. M. Hunter	0.70 hrs.	262.50	Review deposition transcript of F. Reisterer for testimony regarding creation and incorporate into motion for protective order.
06/30/11	S. Caldwell	1.30 hrs.	266.50	Load data to Ringtail database.

Total Hours	175.85
-------------	--------

Total Fees for Legal Services	\$	74,204.50
-------------------------------	----	-----------

EXPENSES AND OTHER CHARGES

06/14/11	Travel Related Costs - Jonathan Stuart Pink Travel expenses for trip to New York to attend deposition of Riesterer on 6/22/11	1,948.72
	Audio Conferencing	82.89
	CD Charges	56.00
	Computerized Support Services	116.50
	Copy Charges	4.50
	Postage	6.48
	Long Distance Telephone Charges	7.35
	Scanning PDF Charges	59.00
	Westlaw Computerized Research	1,680.60
	Total Expenses and Other Charges	\$ 3,962.04

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER	\$	78,166.54
-------------------------------	----	-----------



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
 Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
 c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
 Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
 450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
 Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

July 26, 2011
 Invoice # 9987120
 Client # C073033
 Matter # 0310629

REMITTANCE ADVICE

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated June 22, 2011	\$	201,351.21
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	201,351.21

CURRENT CHARGES

Fees for Legal Services	\$	74,204.50
Expenses and Other Charges		3,962.04
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	78,166.54

STATEMENT TOTAL	\$	279,517.75
------------------------	-----------	-------------------

OUR RECORDS SHOW THESE INVOICES OUTSTANDING AS OF July 26, 2011

Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9943447	(Dated 02/25/11)	111,200.36
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9950991	(Dated 03/22/11)	36,559.71
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9959517	(Dated 04/21/11)	16,773.39
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9971906	(Dated 05/31/11)	13,952.82
Balance Outstanding on Inv.	9978208	(Dated 06/22/11)	22,864.93

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER)
 PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO
 BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089
 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976
 THANK YOU



Bryan Cave LLP Atlanta | Charlotte | Chicago | Dallas | Hamburg | Hong Kong | Irvine | Jefferson City | Kansas City | Los Angeles | Milan | New York
Paris | Phoenix | San Francisco | Shanghai | St. Louis | Washington, DC | and Bryan Cave, A Multinational Partnership London | www.bryancave.com

EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION NUMBER: 43-0602162

Black Eyed Peas
c/o Rachel Rosoff, Esq.
Goldring Hertz & Lichtenstein, LLP
450 N. Roxbury Drive, 8th Floor
Beverly Hills, CA 90210-4222

August 24, 2011
Invoice # 9995256
Client # C073033

Payment is due upon
Receipt

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

BALANCE FORWARD:

Balance per Statement Dated July 26, 2011	\$	279,517.75
Payments and Other Credits		0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	\$	279,517.75

CURRENT CHARGES FOR MATTER:

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

Fees for Legal Services	\$	173,033.50
Expenses and Other Charges		5,771.78
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE	\$	178,805.28

STATEMENT TOTAL \$ 458,323.03

INVOICE DUE UPON RECEIPT

<p>PLEASE INCLUDE THE CLIENT, MATTER OR INVOICE NUMBER WITH ALL YOUR PAYMENTS (CHECK OR WIRE TRANSFER) PLEASE RETURN REMITTANCE ADVICE WITH PAYMENT IN THE ENCLOSED ENVELOPE AND MAIL TO BRYAN CAVE LLP, P.O. BOX 503089, ST. LOUIS, MO 63150-3089 OR WIRE TRANSFER FUNDS TO BANK OF AMERICA, N.A., ROUTING #0260-0959-3 ACCOUNT #100101007976 THANK YOU</p>

For Legal Services Rendered Through July 31, 2011

File #0310629
Copyright Infringement Litigation
Re: Bryan Pringle

07/01/11	K. E. Cenar	5.00 hrs.	2,800.00	Prepare supplemental production and supplemental production letter; finalize documents for inclusion in the production.
07/01/11	J. S. Pink	3.20 hrs.	1,280.00	Revise ex parte application based on new facts (deposition dates provided by client, and plaintiffs' refusal to use dates for Pringle matter); confer with colleague regarding discovery to be produced; contact S. Dallas regarding same; meeting with associates regarding drafting of further revisions to ex parte application; review and respond to series of emails from opposing counsel regarding depositions and related issues; review notices of subpoena to third parties.
07/01/11	M. M. Seale	4.00 hrs.	1,340.00	Review pleadings and documents from client in preparation for production; conduct privilege/confidentiality review of same; prepare production of documents for opposing counsel.
07/01/11	A. M. Hunter	0.40 hrs.	40.00	Brief conference with J. Pink regarding motion for protective order, additional meet and confer conferences, and immediate harm.
07/01/11	A. M. Hunter	0.20 hrs.	20.00	Review further email correspondences with opposing

				counsel to add to motion for protective order.
07/03/11	A. M. Hunter	3.40 hrs.	340.00	Continue drafting motion for protective order and declaration of J. Pink in support and incorporate K. Cenar arguments.
07/05/11	K. E. Cenar	5.00 hrs.	2,800.00	Tend to production issues and production of documents from Cherry, etc; tend to and prepare for meet and confer conference demanded on 30 discovery requests served on ten different defendants.
07/05/11	J. S. Pink	6.90 hrs.	2,760.00	Review and revise ex parte application for protective order; review and revise declaration and proposed order; discussion with associate re motion to bifurcate; begin drafting letter to opposing counsel re same; telephone conference with K. Cenar re same; telephone conference with S. Dallas re production of documents.
07/05/11	M. M. Seale	3.10 hrs.	1,038.50	Review pleadings and documents from client in preparation for production; conduct privilege/confidentiality review of same; call with K. Cenar and J. Pink regarding upcoming filings, depositions and deadlines.
07/05/11	A. M. Hunter	1.30 hrs.	130.00	Continue drafting ex parte motion for protective order and declaration of J. Pink in support.
07/05/11	J. M. Righettini	0.30 hrs.	30.00	Draft e-mail to co-counsel concerning possible BMI subpoena.
07/05/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	40.00	Attorney conference concerning anticipated motion for bifurcation.
07/05/11	J. M. Righettini	2.50 hrs.	250.00	Research issues related to bifurcation in copyright cases;

				prepare outline for motion to bifurcate.
07/05/11	J. M. Righettini	1.50 hrs.	150.00	Begin draft of motion for bifurcation.
07/06/11	K. E. Cenar	5.00 hrs.	2,800.00	Prepare detailed spreadsheet of discovery requests on multiple defendants; prepare for meet and confer requests; work with respective clients to assist in their gathering and identification of responsive documents.
07/06/11	J. S. Pink	1.60 hrs.	640.00	Draft notice of errata; review and respond to series of emails regarding discovery and related issues; draft meet and confer correspondence re motion to bifurcate, and follow up emails with opposing counsel re same; review opposition brief and communicate with colleague re same.
07/06/11	M. M. Seale	3.50 hrs.	1,172.50	Review discovery requests Plaintiff issued to Defendants in connection with supplemental production and in preparation for upcoming call with opposing counsel; review documents from clients in preparation for production; conduct privilege review and confidentiality review of same; draft production letter; coordinate production of same.
07/06/11	J. M. Righettini	1.30 hrs.	130.00	Review and analyze 6 subpoenas served on third parties by plaintiffs.
07/06/11	J. M. Righettini	0.80 hrs.	80.00	Revise protective order to comply with court's concerns in connection with EMI production.
07/06/11	J. M. Righettini	0.40 hrs.	40.00	Attorney conference concerning motion for bifurcation strategy.
07/06/11	J. M. Righettini	3.80 hrs.	380.00	Further draft of motion for bifurcation; related research.

07/07/11	K. E. Cenar	4.00 hrs.	2,240.00	Continue to prepare detailed spreadsheet of discovery requests on multiple defendants; prepare for meet and confer requests; work with respective clients to assist in their gathering and identification of responsive documents.
07/07/11	J. S. Pink	2.00 hrs.	800.00	Revise motion to bifurcate; communicate with colleagues re discovery issues and regarding court's ruling on ex parte application; review court's ruling; contact damages expert.
07/07/11	M. M. Seale	5.60 hrs.	1,876.00	Review documents produced by client in preparation for production; revise discovery chart; meeting with K. Dunn regarding EMI production documents; meet and confer with K. Cenar and K. Dunn regarding discovery issues relating to the EMI documents and the protective order; review Court ruling.
07/07/11	J. M. Righettini	0.30 hrs.	30.00	Review communications concerning protective order and review revised protective order.
07/08/11	K. E. Cenar	3.50 hrs.	1,960.00	Prepare for and attend lengthy meet and confer conference regarding discovery issues; review response to the meet and confer and Rule 11 letter regarding plaintiffs' failure to produce discovery and information supporting its claim; deal with deposition scheduling and other issues; draft letters memorializing discovery failures.
07/08/11	J. S. Pink	2.60 hrs.	1,040.00	Meeting with colleague regarding go forward steps in case and deposition preparation; begin drafting additional discovery; contact client regarding

				production of documents; meet and confer re motion to bifurcate; revise motion re same.
07/08/11	M. M. Seale	2.40 hrs.	804.00	Meet and confer with K. Cenar and opposing counsel regarding discovery deficiencies; finalize EMI documents for production; produce same; strategize regarding upcoming deadlines.
07/08/11	H. C. Ottiger	0.30 hrs.	30.00	Research regarding agreements between W. Adams and Interscope.
07/11/11	K. E. Cenar	3.00 hrs.	1,680.00	Tend to supplemental production issues; multiple conferences with various clients and review of documents to determine responsiveness.
07/11/11	J. S. Pink	1.20 hrs.	480.00	Series of communications with colleagues and co-counsel regarding discovery and litigation; begin drafting additional discovery.
07/12/11	K. E. Cenar	5.00 hrs.	2,800.00	Prepare production of documents on behalf of defendants represented; review discovery requests and confer with various client representatives to confirm completeness of production; draft letter responding to production meet and confer; draft discovery requests to be served on Pringle.
07/12/11	J. S. Pink	1.10 hrs.	440.00	Meeting with associate regarding memo concerning motion for undertaking; draft letter to opposing counsel re same; communicate with co-counsel re same; review emails from opposing counsel concerning motion to bifurcate;

REDACTED