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O A S K KR
6425 Christie Avenue, Suite 230

Emeryville, CA 94608

Invoice submitted to:
Ronald S. Katz, Esq.
Manatt , Phelps & Phillips, LLP
1001 Page Mill Road, Building 2
Palo Alto CA 94304

In Reference To: Adderley et al. v . NFL Players Inc.

Invoice #141
Professional Services 51112008 to 5/2412008
Payable within 30 days.

Name
Ratanak Uch Case Assistant
Peter Rhee Analyst
Johnny Chau Associate
Andrew D. Schwarz Managing Partner
Daniel A. Rascher Managing Partner

Professional Services

65.75 40.00
55.50 25.00 $23

102.40 205.00 $20,992.00
14.25 210.00 $2,992.50

Hou Rate Amount
16.0 160.00 $2,560.00

Hours

51112008 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. 0.75

0112008 Mng Partner Research 0.75

51212008 Analyst Research 1.50

51512008 Analyst Research. Dratted Memo. 1.50

5/5!2008 Mng Partner Research 0.50

51612008 Analyst Research. Drafted memo. 1.00

5/712008 Analyst Research 1.40

5/7/2008 Mng Partner Conference Call with Attorney/Client.
Development of Case Plan.

1.75

5/712008 Mng Partner Research. Conversation with Case team 1.25
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Hours

518/2008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. 5.00

5/9/2008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information- 7.00

5/9/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 0.50

5/92/2008 Mng Partner Research. Interviews with Industry
Participants. Review of Case Materials.

4.00

5112/2008 Mng Partner Analyzed Financial Information, Conversation
with Case Team.

1.75

5/1 212 0 0 8 Analyst Research 6.00

5/1312008 Mng Partner Analyzed Financial Information. 1.00

5/13/2008 Mng Partner Interviews with Industry Participants. 8.00

511312008. Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. Drafted Memo.
Research.

8.00

5/1412008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. Research. 8.00

5/14/2008 Mng Partner Interviews with Industry Participants. 7.00

5/1 412 00 8 Mng Partner Met with Attomey/Client. Travel. Analyzed
Financial Information.

5.50

5/1512008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

2.00

511512008 Mng Partner Interviews with Industry Participants. 4.25

511512008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. 6.00

5/16/2008 Mng Partner Draft 0.50

511612008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 3.50

5/17/2008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. 1.00

5/18/2008 Mng Partner Programmed Spreadsheet. Reviewed Case
Materials. Met With Case team.

7.25

5118/2008 Mng Partner Draft 4.50

5/18/2008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. Research. 4.00
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Hours

511912008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. Research. 9.00

511912008 Mng Partner Programmed Spreadsheet. Reviewed Case
Materials. Met with Case team. Organized
Information to Facilitate Expert Analysis.

9.50

5/19/2008 Mng Partner draft 9:25

5/2012008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

3.00

5/20/2008 Mng Partner Organized information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

3.25

5120/2008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. Research. 9.25

5120/2008 Associate Audited Case Materials 7.00

5/2012008 Mng Partner Draft 625

5/2112008 Analyst Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

5.00

5/2112008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. 8.00

5/21/2008 Case Assistant Organized information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

4.00

5/21/2008 Mng Partner Draft 10.00

512112008 Mng Partner Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis. Conversation with Attorney/Client.

9.25

5121/2008 Associate. Audited Case Materials 6.50

5/21/2008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. 7.25

5/22/2008 Mng Partner Draft. Conversation with Attorney/Cflent. 7.25

512212008 Associate Audited Case Materials 0.75

5/22/2008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. 10.00

5/22/2008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

3.00

5/2212008 Mng Partner Organized Information to f=acilitate Expert
Analysis. Reviewed Case Materials

8.25
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Hours

512312008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis-

4.00

5123/2008 Mng Partner Draft. Conversation with Attorney/Client. 2.25

5123/2008 Analyst Analyzed Financial Information. 3.50

512 312 0 0 8 Mng Partner Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis. Conversation with Attorney/Client.

125

Amount
. For Professional Services Rendered 253.90 $79,799.59

Additional Charges :

5/2312008 Copying cost for deposition and exhibits binders. 99.03

Total additional charges $99.03

Total amount of this bill $79,898.53

Balance due $79,818.53
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6425 Christie Avenue , Suite 230

Emeryville, CA 94608

Invoice submitted to:
Ronald S. Katz, Esq.
Manatt, Phelps & Phillips, LLP
1001 Page Mill Road, Building 2
Palo Alto CA 94304

July 01, 2008

In Reference To: Adderley et at. v_ NFL Players Inc.

Invoice #154
Professional Services 5/2512008 to 613012008
Payable within 30 days.

'1

Z q `1 q-o (v 0

Name
Timekeeper Summary -

Hours
Jing Xu Case Assistant 7.00
Ratanak Uch Case Assistant 11.00
Ronald J. Park Case Assistant 0.50
Kenneth Fung Analyst 15.00
Peter Rhee Analyst 42.90
Johnny Chau Associate 20.95
Andrew D. Schwarz Managing Partner 97.00
Daniel A. Rascher Managing Partner 70.25

Rate Amount
160.00 $1,120.00
160.00 $1,760.00
160:00 $80.00
205.00 $3,075.00
205.00 $8,794.50
210.00 $4,399.50
425.00 $11,225.00
450.00 $31,612.50

Amount

For Professional Services Rendered

Professional Services F ^
AR

L 6 4-

ASS

5/26/2008 Analyst Reviewed Case Materials.

5/27/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials- Privileged Note to
Counsel.

6/212008 Analyst Research

6/2/2008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

61212008 Mng Partner Reviewed case materials.

6/3/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed case materials.

6111/2008 Mng Partner Call with AftorneylCiient. Reviewed Case
Materials.

264.60 $92,066.50

Hours

1.00

0.50

0.40

0.50

0.75

0.75

0.75
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Hours

6/12/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 1.00

6112/2008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis-

2.00

611312008 Analyst Reviewed Case Materials. 2.00

6/13/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed ease materials. 2.75

611312008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

2.00

611312008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 1.20

6/13/2008 Mng Partner Privileged Dote to Counsel. Reviewed Case
Materials.

3.25

6/1412008 Analyst Reviewed Case Materials. 1.00

811 412 0 0 8 Mng Partner Privileged Note to Counsel. Reviewed Case
Materials.

1.50

6/15/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 0.50

611612008 Mng Partner Privileged Note to Counsel. Conference Call
with Attorney/Client. Conversation with Case
Team. Analyzed Financial Information.
Reviewed Case Materials.

8.75

6/1612008 Mng Partner Reviewed case materials. 8.00

6/1612008 Associate Analyzed Financial Information. 3.50

6/1712008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 1.50

6117/2008 Mng Partner Privileged Note to Counsel. Conversation with
Case Team. Analyzed Financial Information.
Reviewed Case Materials.

10.00

6/17/2008 Analyst Reviewed Case Materials. 1.00

6117/2008 Mng Partner Draft expert report. Reviewed case materials. 2.50

6118/2008 Analyst Reviewed Case Materials. 5.00

6/18/2008 Mng Partner Draft expert report. Reviewed case materials. 9.00

6/1812008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 6.50



Adderl eylN FLPI Page 3

Hours

611 812 0 0 8 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. Assisted Expert with
Preparation of Report.

10.50

6119/2008 Mng Partner Draft expert report. Reviewed case materials. 8.25

611912008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

0.50

611 912 0 0 8 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. Assisted Expert with
Preparation of Report.

9.75

611 912 0 0 8 Associate . Analyzed Financial Information. 1.00

611 912 0 0 8 Analyst Reviewed Case Materials. 4.00

6/2012008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

2.00

612 012 0 0 8 Mng Partner Draft expert report. Reviewed case materials. 6.50

612012008 Analyst Reviewed Case Materials. . 5.00

612012008 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. Assisted Expert with
Preparation of Report.

10.25

612 1 12 0 0 8 Mng Partner Draft expert report. Reviewed case materials. 2.50

6121/2008 Mng Partner Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

3.50

612112008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 6.00

612 212 0 0 8 Mng Partner Draft expert report. Reviewed case materials. 4.00

6/2312008 Mng Partner Draft expert report. Reviewed case materials. 8.75

6/2312008 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. Assisted Expert with
Preparation of Report.

8.25

6123/2008 Associate Conversation with Case Team. 0.50

612312008 Analyst Assisted Expert with Preparation of.Report. 9.00

612 412 0 0 8 Analyst Assisted Expert with Preparation or Report. 10.50

612412008 Mng Partner Draft expert report. Reviewed case materials. 7.00
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Hours

6/24/2008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

2.00

6/2412008 Mng Partner Met with Attomey/Cli ent. Met with Case Team.
Assisted Expert with Preparation of Report.

11.25

612 512 0 0 8 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate. Expert
Analysis.

3.00

6125/2008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

1.00

6125/2008 Mng Partner Assisted Expert with Preparation of Report.
Audit.

8.75

612512008 Mng Partner Draft expert report. Reviewed case materials- 7.50

6/25/2008 Analyst Assisted Expert with Preparation of Report. 10.00

612512008 Associate Audited Case Materials 0.50

6126/2008 Mng Partner Draft expert report. Reviewed case materials. 2.00

6/2612008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

3.00

612612008 Analyst Assisted Expert with Preparation of Report. 7.00

612 612 0 08 Mng Partner Conference Call with AtforneylClient. Assisted
Expert with Preparation of Report. Audit.

8.50

6126/2008 Associate Audited Case Materials 0.25

6/27/2008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

2.50

612712008 Analyst Assisted Expert with Preparation of Report. 2.00

Amount

For Professional Services Rendered 264.60 $92 ,066.50

Previous balance $79,818.53

Accounts receivable transactions

6/312008 Payment - Thank You No. 503600 ($39,909.26)
611912008 Payment - Thank You No. 63381 ($39,909.27)
6/1912008 Credit for over billing Analyst time of 725 hours on 5121108 from Invoice 141. ($1,486.25)
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Amount

Total payments and adjustments. ($81,304.78)

Balance due $90,580.25
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C 6425 Christie Avenue, Suite 230

Invoice submitted to:
Ronald S. Katz, Esq.
Manatt, Phelps & Phillips, LLP
9001 Page Mill Road, Building 2
Palo Alto CA 94304

August 01, 2008

In Reference To: Adder ley et al. v. NFL Players Inc.

Invoice #169
Professional Services 7/0112008 to 7/3112008
Payable within 30 days.

Emeryville, CA 94608

f -e a S^ ^ C u1 ^^ 1- Q^-
J

Timekeeper Summary
Name Hours Rate Amount
Jin.g Xu Case Assistant 6.00
Ratanak Uch Case Assistant 8.00
Ronald J. Park Case Assistant 9.50
Kenneth ,=ung Associate 5.00
Peter Rhee Associate 37.90
John Associate 17.50
And bjRgP AjP

Managing Partner 53.25
Daniel A. Ras Managing Partner 54.50

AUG U 2008

160.00
160.00
160.00
215.00
205.00
210.00
425.00
450.00

$960.00
$1,280.00
$1,520.00
$1,075.00
$7,769.50
$3,675.00

$22,631.25
$24,525.00

Amount

Wr Professlonat Services Rendered 191.65 $63 , 576.55

Professional Services

Hours

7/2/2008 Mng Partner Privileged Note to Counsel. Reviewed Case
Materials.

3.25

7/3/2008 Mng Partner Privileged Note to Counsel. Reviewed Case
Materials.

5.50

713/2008 Analyst Analyzed data and programs. 2.50

71712008 Mng Partner Conference Call with Attorney/Client.rrivileged
Note to Counsel. Reviewed Case Materials.

5.00

71812008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. Conversation with
Case Team.

1.50

7/812008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

4.00

BLE
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Hours

7/8/2008 Analyst Analyzed data and programs. 0.50

71912008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
. Analysis.

4.00

7/912008 Mng Partner Attended Deposition. 8.50

7/1012008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 2.75

7111/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 4.75

7'11412008 Mng Partner Prepared for Meeting. 1.50

711512008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. Conference Call with
Attorney/Client.

0.75

7/1512008 Mng Partner Call with AttorneylClient. Preparation for
deposition.

4.75

7/1612008 Mng Partner Prepared for Meeting. Met with Case Team. 4.25

7/16/2008 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. 0.50

7!17/2008 Mng Partner Met with Case Tearn. 0.50

711712008 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. 0.50

7/1912008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. Reviewed
Deposition Transcript,

7.50

7/2012008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials, 7.25

7/2112008 Analyst Research. Review. 4.00

7/21/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 6.00

7/2212008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials- Conversations with
Case Team.

1.75

7/22/2008 -Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. Deposition
preparation. Met with case team.

5.50

7/23/2008 Mng Partner Met with Attorney/Client. Analyzed Statistical
Information.

4-75

7/2 312 0 0 8 Case Assistant Audited Case Materials. 1.00
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Hours

7123/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. Deposition
preparation.

5.00

7/23/2008 Analyst Analyzed Statistical Information. Audited Case
Materials.

5.00

712412008 Mng Partner Deposition preparation. Met with case team. 9.50

7/24/2008 Mng Partner Met with Attorney/Client. Met with Case team. 2.75

7/24/2008 Analyst Audited Case Materials. Reviewed Case
Materials.

7.00

712512008 Analyst Programmed Spreadsheet. 6.50

7125/2008 Mng Partner Deposition, 8.00

712512008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 9.50

712 512 0 0 8 Case Assistant Organized Information for Counsel. Met with
case team.

5.50

7/25/2008 Analyst Organized Information for Counsel. Met with
case team.

5.00

7125/2008 Case Assistant Organized Information for Counsel Met with
case team.

6.00

712 512 008 Mng Partner Analyzed data and programs. Met with case
team.

3.00

.7128/2008 Mng Partner Privileged Note to Counsel. Analyzed data and
programs.

1.25

7128/2008 Analyst Programmed Spreadsheet. 7.20

7/28/2008 Case Assistant Organized Information for Counsel. 3.00

7/28/2008 Associate Analyzed data and programs. 5.50

712912008 Associate Audited Case Materials 2.50

7129/2008 Analyst Programmed Spreadsheet. 5.20

7130/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 1.50

Amount

For Professional Services tendered 191.65 $63,435.75



Adderley/NFLPI

Additional Charges :

6/27/2008 Delivery Cost for Western Messenger service.

Total additional charges

Total amount of this bill

Previous balance

Accounts receivable transactions

7/17/2008 Payment - Thank You No. 63915

Total payments and adjustments

Balance due
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6425 Christie Avenue, Suite 230

Emeryville, CA 94608

Invoice submitted to:
Ronald S. Katz, Esq.
Manatt, Phelps & Phillips, LLP
1001 Page Mill Road, Building 2
Palo Alto CA 94304

September 02, 2008

ITIEMW
M

SEP LU ;

In Reference To: Adderley et al. v. NFL Players Inc.

Invoice #181
Professional Services 810 1 120 0 8 through 8131/2008
Payable within 30 days . All amounts in US Dollars.

Name
Timekeeper Summary

Hours
Jing Xu Case Assistant 26.00
Ronald J. Park Case Assistant 27.50
Peter Rhee Associate 52.50
Johnny Chau PRPn JatP A4,,nriatp 37.00
Andrew D. Schwarz Managing Partner 20.50
Daniel A. Rascher Managing Partner 26.75

W
For Professional Services Rendered

Professional Services

Rate Amount
160.00 $4,160.00
160.00 $4,400.00
205.00 $10,762.50
210.00 $7,770.00
425.00 $8,712.50
450.00 $12,037.50

Amount

190.25 $47,919.87

Hours

8/612008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case. Materials. 0.50

816/2008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 4.75

818/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. . 5.25

8111/2008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 0.75

8111/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 0.25

811 512 00 8 Associate Conversation with Case Tearrt_ 4.00

811512008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. Conversation with
case team.

1.00

811512008 Case Assistant Programmed Spreadsheet. Conversation with
case team.

1.50

f0
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Hours

811812008 Associate Analyzed data and programs. 7.50,

811 812 0 08 Mng Partner Conversation with Attorney/Client. 0.50

8118/2008 Case Assistant Programmed Spreadsheet. 2.50

8/18/2008 Associate Programmed Spreadsheet. 8.50

811812008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Analysis. 9.00

8/19/2008 Case Assistant Programmed Spreadsheet. 4.00

8/1912008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Analysis. 4.00

8119/2008 Case Assistant Audited Case Materials 2.00

8/1912008 Associate Programmed Spreadsheet. 9.40

8/1912008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 3.50

8/1912008 Mng Partner Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis. Internet Research. Reviewed Case
Materials.

2.25

8/20/2008 Case Assistant Organized Information to Facilitate Analysis. 7.50

8/20/2008 Associate Programmed Spreadsheet. 10.00

8/20/2008 Associate Analyzed data and programs. 6.50

8120/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 2.50

8120/2008 Case Assistant Programmed Spreadsheet. 8.00

8t2112008 Case Assistant Audited Case Materials 0.50

812112008 Associate Programmed Spreadsheet. 10.00

8/2 1 12 0 0 8 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 6.00.

8/21/2008 Case Assistant Programmed Spreadsheet. 7.00

812112008 Associate Analyzed data and programs. 8.50

8/21/2008 Mng Partner Conference Call with Attorney/Client. Review of
Case Materials.

2.75
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Hours

8/22/2008 Case Assistant Programmed Spreadsheet. Conversation with
case team.

2.00

8/22/2008 Associate Audited Case Materials. Conversation with case
team.

4.50

8/22/2008 Associate Conversation with Case Team. 7.00

8 /2 312 0 0 8 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 0.25

8125/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 4.00

812 512 0 0 8 Associate Conference Call with Attorney/Client. 0.50

8/25/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. Conference Call with
Attorney/Client-

125

812812008 Associate Conversation with Case Team_ 1.00

8/26/2008 Case Assistan€ Programmed Spreadsheet. Conversation with
case team.

3.50

8/28/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. Conversation with
case team.

3.25

812 7120 0 8 Case Assistant Programmed Spreadsheet. 2.00

8127/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 1.00

8127/2008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 2.00

8/2712008 Mng Partner Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Report.Reviewed Case Materials- Conversation
with Attorney/Client.

2,50

812812008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. . 5.50

8128/2008 Mng Partner Privileged Note to Counsel. Reviewed Case
Materials.

7,25

8128/2008 Associate Research 0.50

8129/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 1.50

8129/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 0.75

Amount

For Professional Services Rendered 190.25 $47,842.50
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Additiona3 Charges :

811 412 0 0 8 ESPN Encyclopedia book order 77.37

Total additional charges $77.37

Total amount of this bill $47,919.87

Previous balance $108,866.67

Accounts receivable transactions

814/2008 Payment - Thank You No. 513095 ($45,290.13)
8/4/2008 Payment - Thank You No. 514419 ($31,78828)

811812008 Payment - Thank You No. 64473 ,$31,788.281

Total payments and adjustments ($108,866.89)

Balance due $47,919.85
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Invoice submitted to:
Ronald S. Katz, Esq-
Manatt, Phelps & Phillips, LLP
1001 Page Mill Road , Building 2
Palo Alto CA 94304

October 01, 2008

6425 Christie Avenue, Suite 230

Emeryville, CA 94608

i.
In Reference To. Adderley et al. v . NFL Players Inc.

Invoice #188
Professional Services 91112008 through 9/30/2008
Payable within 30 days . All amounts in US Dollars.

Timekeeper Summary
Name Hours Rate Amount
Ronald J. Park Case Assistant 1.00 160 . 00 $160.00
Peter Rhee Associate 27.50 205.00 $5,637.50
Andrew D. Schwarz Managing Partner 6.50 425.00 $2,762.50
Daniel A. Rascher Managing Partner 11.75 450.00 $5,287.50

For Professional Services Rendered

Amount

46.75 $13,847.50

Professional Services

Hours

912/2008 Mng Partner reviewed Case Materials. 1.00

9/312008 Case Assistant Reviewed Case Materials. 1,00

9/5/2008 Mng Partner Conversation with Attorney/Client. Review of
Case,

0.50

9/9/2008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 1.50

9/1012008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 0.50

9/11/2008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 2.00

9/1812008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 0.50

9/23/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 0.75

9/25/2 08 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 3.50

9/26/20 8 Associate Preparation 7.50

i

FEIN 26-1394016
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Hours

9/29/2008 Associate Preparation 8.00

9/29/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 4.25

9129/2008 Mng Partner Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

2.00

9/3012008 Mng Partner Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

3.0^v

9130/2008 Associate Preparation 7.50

9/3012008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 3.25

For Professional Services Rendered

Previous balance

46.75

Accounts receivable transactions

9/1712008 Payment - Thank You No. 64958 (McKool Smith)

Total payments and adjustments

Amount

$13,847.50

Balance due
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Suite 2306425 Christie Avenue,

Invoice submitted to:
Ronald S. Katz, Esq.
Manatt , Phelps &'Phillips, LLP
1001 Page Mill Road, Building 2
Palo Alto CA 94304

November 03, 2008

In Reference To: Adderley at ai, v. NFL Players Inc.

Invoice ##198
Professional Services 101112008 through 1 013 1 12 0 08
Payable within 30 days.

Timekeeper Summary
Name Hours Rate Amount
Peter Rhea
Johnny Chau
Andrew D. Schwarz
Daniel A. Rascher

Associate 51.50
Associate 1.50
Managing Partner 71.25

Managing Partner 95.50

205.00 $10,557.50
210.00 $315.00
425.00 $30,281.25
450.00 $42,975.00

Amount

For Professional Services Rendered 219.75 $34 , 881.95

Professional Services

Hours

1011/2008 Mng Partner Preparation 3.50

10/112008 Associate Preparation 8.00

1 01212 0 0 8 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. Met with Case Team. 5.00

1 01212 0 0 8 Associate Preparation. Met with case team. 8.00

10/2/2008 Associate Conversation with Case Team. 1.50

1002008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Review reports. 4.50

1 0/412 0 0 8 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Review reports. 1.75

10/612008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Review reports. 5.75

1016/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. 0.75

1017/2008 Associate Research 5.00

FEIN 25-1394015
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Hours

101912008 Associate Reviewed Case Materiats_ Met with case team. 2.50

10/9/2008 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. 1.50

10/10/2008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 6.00

10/1012008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Met with case team. 4.00

10/10/2008 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. 4.00

10/11/2008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Document organizing. 0.25

10113/2008 Associate Preparation 3.50

1 011 31200 8 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Discussion with
attorney/client.

3.75

10/14/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. Assist Expert with
Trial Preparation.

5.25

10114/2008 Associate Organized Information to Facilitate Expert
Analysis.

1.50

10/1512008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Review documents. Met
with case team.

5.75

10/15/2008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 1.00

10/1512008 Mng Partner Privileged Note to Counsel. Met with Case
Team.

6.00

10/16/2008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. 3.50

10116/2008 Associate Research 3.00

10/1712008 Mng Partner Met with AftorneylClient. Trip to Manatt LA
office.

10.00

1011712008 Mng Partner Met with Attorney/Client. Travel time. 10.00

1 0/1 812 0 0 8 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. 0.25

1012012008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. 2.50

1012012008 Mng Partner Privileged Note to Counsel. 3.00

10120/2008 Associate Preparation 3.00



Adderley/NFLPI Page 3

Hours

10/21/2008 Mng Partner Privileged Note to Counsel. 4.25

10/21/2008 Mng Partner Review case materials. 0.75

1012212008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. 8.25

90/2212008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials. Privileged Note to
Counsel.

4.75

10/22/2008 Associate Reviewed Case Materials. 1.50

10/23/2008 Associate Preparation.. Met with case team. 1.00

1012312008 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. Privileged Note to
Counsel.

6.25

1 012412 0 0 8 Associate Preparation 2.00

1012412008 Mng Partner Met with Case Team. Privileged Note to
Counsel.

3.00

10/24/2008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Met with case team. 7.00

1012612008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. 5.75

1 0/2 712 0 0 8 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Met with attorney/client. . 4.25

10/27/2008 Associate Met with Attomey/Client. 2.00

10/27/2008 Mng Partner Reviewed Case Materials.Met with
Attorney/Client.

5.50

10128/2008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Met with case tears. 6.50

10/28/2008 Mng Partner Met with case team . Privileged Note to Counsel. 2.50

10/2 912 0 0 8 Mng Partner Trial. Met with Attorney/Client. 5.50

1 0/2 9120 0 8 Associate Trial 3.50

10/29/2008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial- Met with attorneylclient. 6.00

10130/2008 Mng Partner Preparation for trial. Met with attorney/client. 7.50

10/3112008 Mng Partner Trial. Met with Attorney/Client. 4.00

10/31J2008 Mng Partner Trial 4.00
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For Professional Services Rendered

Additional Charges :

10117/2008 Airline Tickets for meeting at Manatt's LA office.

Airline Tickets for meeting at Manatt's LA office.

Taxi Fare from LAX to Manatt.

Taxi Fare from Manatt to LAX.

Delivery Cost for Western Messenger to Manatt SF office:

Total additional charges

Total amount of this bill

Previous balance

Accounts receivable transactions

309.00

309.00

45.00

40.00

50.20

$753.20

10/1712008 Payment - Thank You No. 65463 McKool Smith ($6,923.75)
1012012008 Payment - Thank You No. 523257 Manatt ($23,959.53)
10/20/2008 Payment - Thank You No_ 525868 Manatt ($6,923.75)

Total payments and adjustments ($37,807.43)

Balance due $84,882.33

219.75 $84,128.75


