

ROBERT G. RYAN

## Client Pre-Bill Detail Report

For Client: Yick Hung Sim

Payor: (Pro Bono for U.S. District Court)

Billing Attorney: Robert G. Ryan for Law Offices of Eugene C.  
WongMatter: Yick Hing Sim v. USCIS, et al., No. C-04-4643

Date		Hours	Rate	Fee Amt.
10/9/04	DISCUSSED CASE WITH EUGENE C. WONG	.25	151.65	37.91
10/9/04	DRAFTING PETITION FOR REVIEW	.5	151.65	75.83
10/28/04	DRAFTING PETITION FOR REVIEW AND LEGAL RESEARCH	1.25	151.65	189.56
10/29/04	EDITING PETITION FOR REVIEW AND LEGAL RESEARCH	1.75	151.65	265.39
1/24/05	DISCUSSED CASE WITH AUSA ALISON DAW	.25	155.11	38.78
2/15/05	TELEPHONE VOICE MAIL RESPONSE TO AUSA'S DAW'S FAX	.25	155.11	38.78
2/15/05	DISCUSSED CASE WITH AUSA DAW	.25	155.11	38.78
2/16/05	DISCUSSED CASE WITH AUSA DAW	.25	155.11	38.78
2/16/05	DISCUSSED CASE WITH AUSA DAW	.25	155.11	38.78

2/17/05	REVIEWED GOVT'S NOTICE OF INTENT TO REOPEN	.25	155.11	38.78
3/3/05	DISCUSSED CLIENT'S WHEREABOUTS WITH AUSA DAW	.25	155.11	38.78
3/4/05	VOICE MAIL MESSAGE FOR AUSA DAW RE USCIS RESCHEDULING OF CLIENT'S NATURALIZATION CASE	.25	155.11	38.78
6/12/05	REVIEWED COURT'S AMENDED ORDER, PREVIOUSLY FILED PAPERS AND DRAFTING OPPOSITION	.25	155.11	38.78
6/13/05	EDITING DRAFT OPPOSITION TO AMENDED ORDER AND LEGAL RESEARCH	.25	155.11	38.78
8/2/05	DRAFTING EAJA MOTION	.75	155.11	117.34
8/3/05	REVIEWED FILE AND DRAFTED EAJA BILLING REPORT	.75	155.11	117.34
8/3/05	EDITING EAJA MOTION AND LEGAL RESEARCH	1	155.11	155.11
8/4/05	DISCUSSED CASE WITH EUGENE C. WONG	.5	155.11	77.56
		<u>9.25</u>		<u>\$1,421.80</u>