

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

TABLE OF CONTENTS OF EXHIBITS

EXHIBIT A

Proskauer’s bills relating to anti-SLAPP motions as submitted to Cornell 4

EXHIBIT B

Summary of Proskauer’s billed time submitted to Cornell. 20

EXHIBIT C

Detail of unbilled January 2009 time related to Bill of Costs and this Motion 21

EXHIBIT A

CORNELL UNIVERSITY
300 CCC BUILDING
GARDEN AVENUE
ITHACA, NY 14853-2601
ATTENTION: NELSON E. ROTH, ESQ., DEPUTY UNIVERSITY COUNSEL

911328
May 13, 2008

PROSKAUER ROSE LLP 1585 Broadway
New York, NY 10036-8299 Employer identification No. 13-1840454

CLIENT NAME: CORNELL UNIVERSITY
MATTER NAME: KEVIN VANGINDEREN V. CORNELL UNIVERSITY
OUR REFERENCE #: 21177.0001

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED
for the period ending April 30, 2008 as set forth
in the attached printout.

Fees:

~~\$12,852.50~~ 7,525.00

Out-of-pocket disbursements and other miscellaneous
charges posted through April 30, 2008

1,007.86

TOTAL THIS BILL

\$14,860.36

OUTSTANDING INVOICES

<u>Date</u>	<u>Invoice</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Payments Received</u>	<u>Remaining Balance</u>
04/08/08	904798	862.41	0.00	862.41

TOTAL OF PRIOR OUTSTANDING INVOICES

\$ 862.41

TOTAL DUE

\$15,722.77

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE YOU MAY WIRE PAYMENT TO:
CITIBANK, N.A., 111 WALL STREET, NEW YORK NY 10005
ACCOUNT NO. 02838341
ABA NO. 021-000089

DETAIL DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
-------------	-----------------	--------------------	--------------

REDACTED

04/16/2008	LARY ALAN RAPPAPORT	Conferences with Mr. Deixler and Mr. Davidson re removal, anti-SLAPP motion; legal research re same	.25 .50
04/16/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Read new complaint against Cornell and Bert Deixler. Performed legal research regarding removal of the action to federal court.	.25 4.50
04/16/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Prepare correspondence to Davidson; review complaint; prepare memorandum.	.50

REDACTED

04/17/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Telephone conference with Nelson Roth.	.25
04/17/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Review and prepare memorandum.	.25
04/17/2008	LARY ALAN RAPPAPORT	Conf Mr. Deixler, Mr. Davidson re removal, fraudulent joinder, anti-SLAPP motion	.25
04/17/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Performed legal research. Drafted notice of removal.	4.50
04/18/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Performed legal research regarding anti-SLAPP and 12(b)(6) motions.	.75

REDACTED

04/25/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT	Prepared removal papers. Drafted anti-	2.50 3.50
------------	----------------	--	----------------------

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
	DAVIDSON	SLAPP motion.	
04/28/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Drafted and filed notice of removal. Drafted anti-SLAPP motion.	2.5 3.75

REDACTED

04/29/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Filed notices of appearance. Served notices on adverse party and state court. Drafted Tim Stanley declaration. Performed legal research. Drafted anti-SLAPP motions.	4.5 5.50
04/30/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Drafted anti-SLAPP motions.	8.25
04/30/2008	LARY ALAN RAPPAPORT	Prepare and file Notice of Appearance; conferences Mr. Davidson re Notice, service; conference anti-SLAPP motion	.25 .50

TIME AND FEE SUMMARY

<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Dollars</u>	
DEIXLER, BERT H.	1 3.00	350.00	1,050.00	350
RAPPAPORT, LARY ALAN	.5 2.00	350.00	700.00	175
TOTAL FOR PARTNER	1.5 5.00		1,750.00	525
DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	20 34.25	350.00	11,987.50	7,000
TOTAL FOR ASSOCIATE	34.25		11,987.50	7,000
MUNGUIA, IVANIA	.75	95.00	71.25	
TOTAL FOR LEGAL ASSISTANT	.75		71.25	
WINSLOW, LISA	.25	175.00	43.75	
TOTAL FOR LIBRARY	.25		43.75	
MATTER TOTAL	21.5 40.25		13,852.50	7,525.00

DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES

<u>DESCRIPTION:</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
REPRODUCTION	9.60
LEXIS	292.25
WESTLAW	702.00

PROSKAUER ROSE LLP
CORNELL UNIVERSITY
KEVIN VANGINDEREN V. CORNELL UNIVERSITY

May 13, 2008
Page 4

DESCRIPTION:	AMOUNT
LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	1.90
POSTAGE	2.11
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER:	\$1,007.86

CORNELL UNIVERSITY
300 CCC BUILDING
GARDEN AVENUE
ITHACA, NY 14853-2601
ATTENTION: NELSON E. ROTH, ESQ., DEPUTY UNIVERSITY COUNSEL

917673
June 11, 2008

PROSKAUER ROSE LLP

1585 Broadway
New York, NY 10036-8299

Employer identification No. 13-1840454

CLIENT NAME: CORNELL UNIVERSITY
MATTER NAME: KEVIN VANGINDEREN V. CORNELL UNIVERSITY
OUR REFERENCE #: 21177.0001

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED
for the period ending May 31, 2008 as set forth
in the attached printout.

Fees:

~~-\$11,692.50~~ #10,292.50

Out-of-pocket disbursements and other miscellaneous
charges posted through May 31, 2008

487.95

TOTAL THIS BILL

\$12,180.45

OUTSTANDING INVOICES

<u>Date</u>	<u>Invoice</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Payments Received</u>	<u>Remaining Balance</u>
05/13/08	911328	14,860.36	0.00	14,860.36

TOTAL OF PRIOR OUTSTANDING INVOICES

\$14,860.36

TOTAL DUE

\$27,040.81

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE YOU MAY WIRE PAYMENT TO:
CITIBANK, N.A., 111 WALL STREET, NEW YORK NY10005
ACCOUNT NO. 02838341
ABA NO. 021-000089

DETAIL DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
05/01/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Telephone conference with Mr. Roth.	.25
REDACTED			
05/01/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Revise anti-SLAPP motion.	.25
05/01/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Telephone conference with Mr. Roth.	.25
05/01/2008	LARY ALAN RAPPAPORT	Conferences Mr. Davidson re anti-SLAPP motions	.25
05/01/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Review declaration; conference with C. Davidson regarding same.	.25
05/01/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Drafted anti-SLAPP motions.	9.00
05/02/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Drafted anti-SLAPP motions.	6.25
REDACTED			
05/02/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Review revisions of motion; conference with C. Davidson regarding same.	.50
05/02/2008	LARY ALAN RAPPAPORT	Conferences Mr. Davidson, prepare anti-SLAPP motion	1.00
05/02/2008	IVANIA MUNGUIA	Redact document; bates label exhibit	.25
05/03/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Drafted anti-SLAPP motions.	2.50
05/04/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Drafted anti-SLAPP motions and related documents.	2.00
05/05/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Drafted anti-SLAPP motions and associated documents. Coordinated filing and service of same.	5.75
05/05/2008	IVANIA MUNGUIA	Bates Label Exhibits	1.25

REDACTED

Date Attorney Description Hours

REDACTED

05/17/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Reviewed new discovery rule case.	.50
05/30/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Reviewed new case regarding anti-SLAPP motions.	.25

TIME AND FEE SUMMARY

<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
DEIXLER, BERT H.	1.5 2.75	350.00	962.50 525
RAPPAPORT, LARY ALAN	1.25 2.50	350.00	875.00 437.50
TOTAL FOR PARTNER	2.75 5.25		1,837.50 962.50
DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	26.25 27.75	350.00	9,712.50 9,187.50
TOTAL FOR ASSOCIATE	26.25 27.75		9,712.50 9,187.50
MUNGUIA, IVANIA	1.50	95.00	142.50
TOTAL FOR LEGAL ASSISTANT	1.50		142.50
MATTER TOTAL	31.75 34.50		11,692.50 10,292.50

DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES

<u>DESCRIPTION:</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
REPRODUCTION	153.00
LEXIS	266.25
WESTLAW	20.00
LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	3.25
POSTAGE	5.05
DATA BASE SEARCH SERV.	40.40
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER:	\$ 487.95

CORNELL UNIVERSITY
300 CCC BUILDING
GARDEN AVENUE
ITHACA, NY 14853-2601
ATTENTION: NELSON E. ROTH, ESQ., DEPUTY UNIVERSITY COUNSEL

923550
July 10, 2008

PROSKAUER ROSE LLP

1585 Broadway
New York, NY 10036-8299

Employer identification No. 13-1840454

CLIENT NAME: CORNELL UNIVERSITY
MATTER NAME: KEVIN VANGINDEREN V. CORNELL UNIVERSITY
OUR REFERENCE #: 21177.0001

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED
for the period ending June 30, 2008 as set forth
in the attached printout.

Fees:

~~\$5,425.00~~ \$ 262.50

Out-of-pocket disbursements and other miscellaneous
charges posted through June 30, 2008

1,212.46

TOTAL THIS BILL

\$6,637.46

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE YOU MAY WIRE PAYMENT TO:
CITIBANK, N.A., 111 WALL STREET, NEW YORK NY 10005
ACCOUNT NO. 02838341
ABA NO. 021-000089

DETAIL DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
-------------	-----------------	--------------------	--------------

REDACTED

06/04/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Reviewed anti-SLAPP order. Prepared notice to plaintiff of order and judgment. Conferred with Bert Deixler and Nelson Roth regarding next steps.	.5 2.00
------------	-----------------------------	--	--------------------

REDACTED

06/16/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Performed legal research in connection with applications for attorneys' fees and costs. Reviewed new anti-SLAPP case.	.25 1.75
------------	-----------------------------	---	---------------------

REDACTED

TIME AND FEE SUMMARY

<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
DEIXLER, BERT H.	2.25	350.00	787.50
TOTAL FOR PARTNER-	2.25		787.50

PROSKAUER ROSE LLP
CORNELL UNIVERSITY
KEVIN VANGINDEREN V. CORNELL UNIVERSITY

July 10, 2008
Page 3

DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	.75	13.25	350.00	4,637.50	262.50
TOTAL FOR ASSOCIATE		13.25		4,637.50	262.50

MATTER TOTAL	.75	13.25		5,425.00	262.50
--------------	-----	------------------	--	---------------------	--------

DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES

DESCRIPTION:	AMOUNT
REPRODUCTION	40.40
LEXIS	84.50
WESTLAW	150.80
WORD PROCESSING	123.75
FILING FEES	635.30
LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	4.06
POSTAGE	6.48
DELIVERY CHARGES	53.02
DATA BASE SEARCH SERV.	114.15
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER:	\$1,212.46

CORNELL UNIVERSITY
300 CCC BUILDING
GARDEN AVENUE
ITHACA, NY 14853-2601
ATTENTION: NELSON E. ROTH, ESQ., DEPUTY UNIVERSITY COUNSEL

923552
July 10, 2008

PROSKAUER ROSE LLP

1585 Broadway
New York, NY 10036-8299

Employer identification No. 13-1840454

CLIENT NAME: CORNELL UNIVERSITY
MATTER NAME: VANGINDEREN V. CORNELL UNIVERSITY, ET AL.
OUR REFERENCE #: 21177.0002

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED
for the period ending June 30, 2008 as set forth
in the attached printout.

Fees:

~~\$15,137.50~~ 414,350

Out-of-pocket disbursements and other miscellaneous
charges posted through June 30, 2008

47.20

TOTAL THIS BILL

~~\$15,184.70~~

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE YOU MAY WIRE PAYMENT TO:
CITIBANK, N.A., 111 WALL STREET, NEW YORK NY 10005
ACCOUNT NO. 02838341
ABA NO. 021-000089

DETAIL DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
06/04/2008	RAPPAPORT, LARY ALAN	Review Order; memoranda and conf Mr. Davidson re strategy going forward re fees, second lawsuit	.25
06/05/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Review opposition / order and motion; conference with C. Davidson.	.50
06/05/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Review correspondence from Mr. Roth; prepare correspondence to Mr. Roth.	.25
06/05/2008	RAPPAPORT, LARY ALAN	Review Order; conferences and memoranda Mr. Deixler, Mr. Davidson; legal research Rule 15, amendment, mootness of anti-SLAPP motion	1.25
06/05/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Reviewed plaintiff's filings regarding second suit. Performed legal research regarding opposition and court's granting of leave to amend.	2.00
06/06/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Review and prepare correspondence to Mr. Roth; C. Davidson; conference with C. Davidson.	.25
06/06/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Performed legal research regarding reply in support of anti-SLAPP motion.	1.00
06/09/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Review correspondence from and prepare correspondence to Mr. Roth.	.25
06/09/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Telephone conference with Mr. Roth regarding reply.	.25
06/10/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Performed legal research for use in reply memo.	1.75
06/11/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Drafted letter to Vanginderen encouraging him not to amend his complaints.	.50
06/13/2008	RAPPAPORT, LARY ALAN	Memoranda Mr. Davidson, mr. Deixler re amended complaint, anti-SLAPP motion, demurrer	.25
06/13/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Reviewed notice of appeal and related documents. Conferred with Bert Deixler and Lary Rappaport regarding same. Performed legal research.	2.50
06/16/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Review order; conference with C. Davidson regarding status.	.25
06/17/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Review correspondence regarding anti-SLAPP.	.25
06/17/2008	RAPPAPORT, LARY ALAN	Conf Mr. Davidson re strategy, filing reply and new anti-SLAPP motion	.25
06/19/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD	Performed legal research regarding anti-	1.75

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
	SCOTT	SLAPP reply.	
06/20/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Conference with C. Davidson; review and prepare correspondence regarding reply brief.	.25
06/20/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Drafted reply in support of anti-SLAPP motions.	2.50
06/23/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Drafted reply.	6.00
06/24/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Review memorandum regarding motion to strike; conference with C. Davidson.	.50
06/24/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Review order regarding appellate schedule; conference with C. Davidson regarding same.	.25
06/24/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Drafted consolidated reply, declarations and evidentiary objections.	5.25
06/25/2008	DEIXLER, BERT H.	Review evidence objections.	.25
06/25/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Drafted reply memorandum, declarations and evidentiary objections.	3.25
06/26/2008	RAPPAPORT, LARY ALAN	Review filings	.25
06/26/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Drafted and filed reply, declarations and evidentiary objections.	2.75
06/27/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Drafted anti-SLAPP motions in response to first amended complaint.	1.00
06/28/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Drafted anti-SLAPP motions in response to first amended complaint.	1.00
06/30/2008	RAPPAPORT, LARY ALAN	Review filings, notices	.25
06/30/2008	DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	Drafted and filed anti-SLAPP motions to FAC. Drafted motion for attorneys' fees.	4 6.25

TIME AND FEE SUMMARY

<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
DEIXLER, BERT H.	3.25	350.00	1,137.50
RAPPAPORT, LARY ALAN	2.50	350.00	875.00
TOTAL FOR PARTNER	5.75		2,012.50
DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	38.25 37.50	350.00	13,125.00 12,337.50
TOTAL FOR ASSOCIATE	38.25 37.50		13,125.00 12,337.50
MATTER TOTAL	41 43.25		15,137.50 14,350.00

DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES

PROSKAUER ROSE LLP
CORNELL UNIVERSITY
VANGINDEREN V. CORNELL UNIVERSITY, ET AL.

July 10, 2008
Page 4

DESCRIPTION:	AMOUNT
REPRODUCTION	47.20
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER:	\$ 47.20

CORNELL UNIVERSITY
300 CCC BUILDING
GARDEN AVENUE
ITHACA, NY 14853-2601
ATTENTION: NELSON E. ROTH, ESQ., DEPUTY UNIVERSITY COUNSEL

935857
September 10, 2008

PROSKAUER ROSE LLP 1585 Broadway
New York, NY 10036-8299 Employer identification No. 13-1840454

CLIENT NAME: CORNELL UNIVERSITY
MATTER NAME: VANGINDEREN V. CORNELL UNIVERSITY, ET AL.
OUR REFERENCE #: 21177.0002

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED
for the period ending August 31, 2008 as set forth
in the attached printout.

Fees:	\$2,362.50
Out-of-pocket disbursements and other miscellaneous charges posted through August 31, 2008	<u>106.21</u>
TOTAL THIS BILL	<u>\$2,468.71</u>

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE YOU MAY WIRE PAYMENT TO:
CITIBANK, N.A., 111 WALL STREET, NEW YORK NY 10005
ACCOUNT NO. 02838341
ABA NO. 021-000089

DETAIL DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
08/05/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Review objection.	.25
08/07/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Prepare reply in support of anti-SLAPP motion.	.50
08/08/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Reviewed opposition to anti-SLAPP motion.	.50
08/08/2008	LARY ALAN RAPPAPORT	Memoranda with Mr. Davidson re motion, notice	.25
08/11/2008	LARY ALAN RAPPAPORT	Memoranda and conferences with Mr. Deixler and Mr. Davidson re opposition, reply	.50
08/11/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Drafted reply in support of anti-SLAPP motions.	2.75
08/11/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Review and prepare correspondence reply brief.	.25
08/12/2008	LARY ALAN RAPPAPORT	Memoranda with Mr. Davidson re reply	.25
08/12/2008	BERT H. DEIXLER	Review and prepare correspondence regarding reply.	.25
08/12/2008	CLIFFORD SCOTT DAVIDSON	Drafted and filed reply and evidentiary objections.	1.25

TIME AND FEE SUMMARY

<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
DEIXLER, BERT H.	1.25	350.00	437.50
RAPPAPORT, LARY ALAN	1.00	350.00	350.00
TOTAL FOR PARTNER	2.25		787.50
DAVIDSON, CLIFFORD SCOTT	4.50	350.00	1,575.00
TOTAL FOR ASSOCIATE	4.50		1,575.00
MATTER TOTAL	6.75		2,362.50

DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES

<u>DESCRIPTION:</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
REPRODUCTION	2.20
WORD PROCESSING	102.50
POSTAGE	1.51
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS AND CHARGES FOR THIS MATTER:	\$ 106.21

EXHIBIT B

Summary of Fees Incurred By Cornell in Prosecuting Anti-SLAPP Motions

	Total Hours	Total Fees Incurred
April 2008	21.50	\$7,525.00
May 2008	31.75	\$10,292.50
June 2008	41.75	\$14,612.50
August 2008	6.75	\$2,362.50
Grand Total	101.75	\$34,792.50

EXHIBIT C

Time Spent on Bill of Costs and Motion for Attorneys' Fees

Bill of Costs

	Task	Time	Cost
1-Jan-09	Reviewed order granting anti-SLAPP motion. Reviewed invoices for costs and attorneys' fees.	0.50	\$175.00
15-Jan-09	Prepared and filed bill of costs.	2.50	\$875.00
	Total	3.00	\$1,050.00

Motion for Attorneys' Fees

	Task	Time	Cost
16-Jan-09	Reviewed bills in preparation for motion for attorneys' fees.	0.50	\$175.00
17-Jan-09	Performed legal research regarding motion for attorneys' fees. Prepared legal bills for redaction. Drafted moving papers.	2.00	\$700.00
19-Jan-09	Drafted motion for attorneys' fees.	3.00	\$1,050.00
20-Jan-09	Drafted and filed motion for attorneys' fees.	1.75	\$612.50
	Total	7.25	\$2,537.50
Grand Total		10.25	\$3,587.50