

EXHIBIT A

Robin Sparks
60 Harding Street
Hamden, CT 06518

September 16, 2010
Invoice # DRAFT
Matter # 073061.0001

Re: Robin Sparks, et al. vs. Quinnipiac University

For services rendered through September 16, 2010

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
03/26/09	Orleans	Correspondence with Ms. Galles, Mr. Schatz and Mr. Matthews; telephone call with Ms. Sparks; research re Title IX regulations	1.90
03/27/09	Orleans	Correspondence with Ms. Galles, Ms. Sparks, Mr. Schatz and Mr. Matthews; legal research re Title IX issues; draft and revise letter to President Lahey; review Quinnipiac University website	4.20
03/30/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Mr. Matthews and Mr. Doyle re press issues	0.40
03/31/09	Orleans	Review of correspondence; research re cheerleading as varsity sport	0.50
04/01/09	Orleans	Correspondence with Mr. Matthews; telephone call with Mr. Matthews	0.40
04/02/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Galles, Ms. Sparks, Mr. Matthews, Mr. Schatz, et al.; legal research; telephone conference with Mr. Schneider and Mr. Matthews; telephone call with Ms. Marottolo of Quinnipiac University (QU)	2.40
04/03/09	Schneider	Legal research on Westlaw; scan and email same to Mr. Orleans	0.40
04/03/09	Orleans	Telephone call with ACLU Legal Committee; telephone calls with Mr. Matthews, Mr. Schneider, Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks; correspondence with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks re meeting with clients; legal research (review Title IX cases)	2.30
04/04/09	Orleans	Review and revise draft of retention agreement; correspondence with Ms. Galles; prepare for meeting with clients	1.50
04/05/09	Orleans	Meeting with Ms. Galles, Ms. Sparks and volleyball players	2.00
04/05/09	Orleans	Travel to and from Hamden, CT	1.00
04/05/09	Orleans	Meeting with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks	1.00
04/06/09	Orleans	Telephone call with Mr. Schneider (.1); telephone call with Mr. Doyle (.1); office conference with Mr. Hernandez (.4); telephone	1.50

Connecticut law requires us to advise you that this communication is an attempt to collect a debt.

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		calls with Ms. Ryker and Ms. Payne (.5); review of correspondence from Ms. Sparks (.3); correspondence with Ms. Galles (.1)	
04/06/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding scope of litigation and Title IX background	0.50
04/06/09	Hernandez	Review correspondence and background documents	0.40
04/06/09	Hernandez	Review Title IX case law	2.50
04/07/09	Orleans	Review of correspondence from athletes and parents (.5); review court rules re TRO procedures (.4); review sample motions and memoranda re TRO applications (.4)	1.30
04/08/09	Hernandez	Review case law; confer with Mr. Orleans regarding filing date and preparation of pleadings	2.30
04/08/09	Orleans	Telephone call with Mr. and Mrs. Payne; office conference with Mr. Hernandez re TRO and PI filings; telephone call with Ms. Sparks; correspondence with Ms. Galles; telephone call with Mr. Schneider	1.60
04/09/09	Orleans	Correspondence with clients (.4); correspondence with co-counsel (.3); review draft pleadings (.2)	0.90
04/10/09	Hernandez	Review and edit motion for TRO and memorandum of law in support of motion for TRO	4.30
04/11/09	Orleans	Review drafts of TRO and PI papers (.9); research re NCAA rules (2.0); review Title IX cases (1.0); research re Quinnipiac University self-study (1.0)	4.90
04/13/09	Orleans	Telephone calls with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles (.4); legal research (1.2); drafting and revising brief re TRO, affidavits, etc. (5.3)	6.90
04/13/09	Hernandez	Research, draft and revise motion for waiver of cost bond	2.30
04/13/09	Hernandez	Review, revise and redraft memorandum of law in support of motion for temporary restraining order	5.30
04/14/09	Orleans	Review and revise complaint (2.5); review and revise declarations of Ms. Biediger and Ms. Lawler (.9); telephone call with Ms. Sparks (.3); review and revise TRO and PI papers (3.0); office conferences with Mr. Hernandez (.4); review and revise press release (.3); correspondence with co-counsel (.3)	7.70
04/15/09	Orleans	Drafting, reviewing and revising pleadings (5.6); conference with clients (1.0); telephone calls with Mr. Doyle and Mr. Schneider (.3); telephone call with Ms. Galles (.2); telephone conference with clients and co-counsel (.8); correspondence with Attorney Judge (.4); telephone call with Ms. Marottolo (.2); telephone call with Ms. Yorke (.6)	9.10
04/16/09	Orleans	Review and revise complaint, etc. (2.0); conference with court clerk re TRO proceedings (1.0); multiple telephone calls with clients and co-counsel (.8); telephone call with Attorney Gambardella (.4); research re application of 3-part test (.9); review of correspondence (.3); research re cheerleading as "sport" under Title IX (2.0)	7.40

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
04/17/09	Hernandez	Prepare for court appearance; consult with clients and attendance at court hearing on Plaintiffs' motion for TRO; confer with co-counsel regarding scope of discovery	2.00
04/17/09	Orleans	Office conference with Mr. Hernandez (.5); prepare for TRO hearing (2.3); review brief and affidavit filed by defendant (.5); correspondence with co-counsel (.3); conference with clients (.3); attendance at hearing re TRO (2.0); drafting discovery requests (.3)	6.20
04/19/09	Orleans	Drafting discovery requests	0.50
04/19/09	Hernandez	Review and modify proposed discovery request	0.50
04/20/09	Orleans	Telephone call with Ms. Galles (.3); drafting and revising discovery requests (2.9); review notices from court (.2)	3.40
04/21/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Attorney Gambardella and Mr. Orleans regarding discovery disputes and schedule conference with Judge Underhill	1.10
04/21/09	Hernandez	Westlaw research to review District Court decisions regarding proper scope of discovery in Title IX cases	0.80
04/21/09	Orleans	Correspondence with Ms. Gambardella (.2); office conferences with Mr. Hernandez (.5); review of court orders (.4); telephone conference with Ms. Gambardella re discovery issues (.8); telephone conference with Court Clerk (.2); telephone calls with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles (.7); research re discovery issues (1.2)	4.00
04/21/09	Orleans	Research re potential expert witnesses	0.50
04/21/09	Schneider	Review additional pleadings; review and revise pleadings index	0.40
04/22/09	Hernandez	Review District Court decisions regarding appropriate scope of discovery in Title IX cases	0.30
04/22/09	Hernandez	Meeting with Ms. Sparks and Mr. Orleans to review available documents and information and nature of claims	0.50
04/22/09	Orleans	Research re discovery issues (1.2); review defendant's discovery responses (.8); conference with Ms. Sparks (.6); correspondence with Ms. Galles (.2); miscellaneous research re Title IX (.5)	3.30
04/23/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Mr. Orleans, Kristen Galles and Ms. Sparks to discuss discovery ruling, scheduling of depositions and witness interviews and preparation	0.80
04/23/09	Hernandez	Expert witness research, Donna Lopiano	0.40
04/23/09	Hernandez	Review and analyze West Chester decision, discuss with co-counsel and frame argument; copy and transmit relevant cases to opposing counsel and court	0.70
04/23/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference with District Court and opposing counsel regarding discovery issues	0.90
04/23/09	Hernandez	Follow up telephone conference with opposing counsel to resolve discovery disputes, expert witness disclosure and conduct of videotape deposition	0.30

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
04/23/09	Hernandez	Westlaw research of District Court decisions, orders and findings in connection with Title IX litigation; review cases and discuss significance of Choike v. Judge Underhill with co-counsel	1.70
04/23/09	Hernandez	Discuss Mansourian decision with Mr. Orleans regarding impact on discovery issues	0.30
04/23/09	Hernandez	Additional Westlaw research of District Court decisions regarding scope of Title IX discovery	0.30
04/23/09	Orleans	Office conferences with Mr. Hernandez re discovery hearing (2.0); legal research (1.0); telephone call with Ms. Galles (.7); prepare for hearing (1.0); telephone hearing with Judge Underhill re discovery issues (.9); telephone conference with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks (.6)	6.20
04/24/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding matters to be addressed, expert witness and discovery issues	0.50
04/24/09	Orleans	Review of documents produced by defendant (.7); review of discovery requests (.2); research (.5); correspondence with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks (.4); conference with Ms. Schneider re research assignment (.3)	2.10
04/24/09	Schneider	Conference with Mr. Orleans re: case background and assignment	0.40
04/24/09	Schneider	Research online re: Title IX regulations and polices	1.00
04/25/09	Hernandez	Review Department of Education guidelines and rules	2.00
04/25/09	Orleans	Review of documents (2.5); organize file (1.5)	4.00
04/27/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference with Attorney Galles regarding proposed changes and edits to expert witness disclosure	0.20
04/27/09	Hernandez	Review and consider email responses by Attorney Gambardella to expert witness disclosure	0.30
04/27/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans; internet research of expert qualifications; review materials for expert witness disclosure; prepare letter to opposing counsel providing notice pursuant to Rule 26	2.70
04/27/09	Hernandez	Review and revise expert witness disclosure and conform to version provided by Attorney Galles	0.30
04/27/09	Hernandez	Review proposed expert witness disclosure with Attorney Galles and transmit	0.10
04/27/09	Orleans	Review of correspondence (.5); office conference with Mr. Hernandez re expert disclosure (.2); review CV of Dr. Lopiano (.2); correspondence with Ms. Gambardella (.2); draft discovery objections (.2)	1.30
04/27/09	Schneider	Prepare binder and labels re: Office of Civil Rights and Title IX	1.00
04/28/09	Hernandez	Review email exchange regarding discovery and pending issues	0.20
04/28/09	Hernandez	Review NCAA materials regarding Title IX standards and	2.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		compliance	
04/28/09	Hernandez	Review Plaintiff's response to Defendant's demand for production and review with Mr. Orleans	0.30
04/28/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with clients and co-counsel	0.50
04/28/09	Orleans	Draft and serve discovery responses (1.2); correspondence with Ms. Gambardella (.4); correspondence with Ms. Galles (.3); telephone conference with clients (.5); review of documents (2.2); conferences with Mr. Hernandez (.3)	4.90
04/29/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding scheduling of depositions, discovery and email communications from Attorney Gambardella	0.20
04/29/09	Hernandez	Review Defendant's document production	2.30
04/29/09	Hernandez	Review email communications from Ms. Sparks and Attorney Galles	0.30
04/29/09	Hernandez	Review email exchanges with Attorney Gambardella	0.30
04/29/09	Hernandez	Review email comments and exchanges with Ms. Sparks and Attorney Galles	0.30
04/29/09	Orleans	Review of accumulated correspondence (.6); telephone call with Ms. Galles re disclosure issues (.2); correspondence with Ms. Gambardella (.4); review of documents disclosed by QU (1.5)	2.70
04/30/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding status of discovery and scheduling of depositions; review deposition exhibits and outline issues and topics to cover at depositions	0.40
04/30/09	Hernandez	Review email protestations and complaints from opposing counsel and deal with accordingly	0.50
04/30/09	Hernandez	Review proposed exhibits; prepare for depositions	3.50
04/30/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference with prospective witness; review and discuss issues to cover during depositions	0.80
04/30/09	Schneider	Review proposed deposition exhibits; prepare for deposition	1.00
04/30/09	Orleans	Telephone calls and correspondence with Ms. Gambardella re depositions and disclosures (1.1); telephone calls and correspondence with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks (.7); prepare for depositions (3.5)	5.30
05/01/09	Hernandez	Review expert witness disclosure materials and prepare for meeting with Donna Lopiano	0.70
05/01/09	Hernandez	Deposition of Jack McDonald, DU Athletic Director	4.00
05/01/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with presiding judge, discussing issues associated with expert witness disclosure and discovery	0.50
05/01/09	Hernandez	Deposition of Tracy Flynn, QU Senior Women's Administrator	3.30
05/01/09	Schneider	Attend deposition of Jack McDonald	2.50
05/01/09	Schneider	Attend deposition of Tracy Flynn	3.00
05/01/09	Schneider	Prepare copies of deposition exhibits	0.40

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
05/01/09	Orleans	Take deposition of Mr. McDonald (4.5); telephone conference with Ms. Gambardella and court (.3); telephone conferences with Ms. Galles (several) (.5); attend deposition of Ms. Flynn (2.5); conference with Ms. Sparks (.4)	8.20
05/02/09	Hernandez	Meeting with Attorney Galles and Mr. Orleans; review discovery materials and expert witness preparation with Dr. Lopiano and outline testimony	3.80
05/02/09	Hernandez	Review deposition transcripts	0.50
05/02/09	Orleans	Conference with Dr. Lopiano, Attorney Galles, Ms. Sparks and Mr. Hernandez (4.0)	4.00
05/03/09	Orleans	Review of deposition transcripts (1.0); conference with Dr. Lopiano, Ms. Sparks and co-counsel (1.5); telephone conference with Ms. Gambardella, Dr. Lopiano, et al (1.5); review of documents (.5)	4.50
05/03/09	Hernandez	Meet with Ms. Sparks, Attorney Galles and Dr. Lopiano to prepare for expert witness disclosure	0.50
05/03/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with opposing counsel and Dr. Lopiano re expert witness disclosure	1.00
05/03/09	Hernandez	Meeting with Attorney Galles and Mr. Orleans to discuss pending discovery issues, strategy for PI hearing and division of labor	1.30
05/04/09	Hernandez	Draft section of pretrial memorandum re testimony of Dr. Lopiano	0.30
05/04/09	Hernandez	Review and edit witness summaries for pretrial memorandum	1.50
05/04/09	Hernandez	Read and review outline of expert witness examination	0.30
05/04/09	Schneider	Prepare binders of manuals and articles	0.30
05/04/09	Schneider	Conference with MIS department re: bates labeling document production (.1); print same and create file folder (.9)	1.00
05/04/09	Orleans	Review of documents (4.); draft list of exhibits for hearing (.5); conferences with Ms. Galles (.5); correspondence with Ms. Gambardella (.4); prepare for P.I. hearing (1.3)	6.70
05/05/09	Schneider	Prepare exhibits for deposition of Dr. Lopiano	0.30
05/05/09	Hernandez	Prepare for and attend deposition of Dr. Lopiano	6.30
05/05/09	Hernandez	Draft trial memorandum.	1.30
05/05/09	Hernandez	First draft edit and revision of Plaintiffs' proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	4.20
05/05/09	Hernandez	Review, revise and edit Plaintiff's proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law with Ms. Sparks and Mr. Orleans	0.40
05/05/09	Orleans	Review documents (2.); prepare exhibit list (1.0); research re work product issues (.8); prepare for deposition of Dr. Lopiano (2.5); attend deposition of Dr. Lopiano (4.0); review and revise proposed findings of fact (1.5)	10.00
05/06/09	Larson	Research re work product privilege and Title IX issues; draft	3.50

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		research results summary	
05/06/09	Orleans	Drafting and revisiting exhibit list, witness list, proposed findings and conclusions (3.); conference with Mr. Hernandez and Ms. Galles (.5); correspondence with Mr. BarDavid (several) (.5); conferences with Ms. Larson re: research assignment (.6); review of documents (3.)	7.60
05/06/09	Hernandez	Confer with Attorney Galles and Mr. Orleans regarding previous night's deposition, strategy for PI hearing and proposed exhibits	0.50
05/06/09	Hernandez	Review and edit proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	3.70
05/06/09	Schneider	Review and print pleadings; review and revise pleadings index	0.60
05/06/09	Schneider	Review exhibits from McDonald, Flynn and Lopiano depositions; draft index for deposition exhibits	1.00
05/06/09	Schneider	Telephone conference with Ms. Larson re: parties in lawsuit	0.20
05/06/09	Schneider	Conference with Mr. Orleans re: Lopiano deposition	0.20
05/07/09	Hernandez	Post-hearing telephone call with Mr. Orleans regarding scope of examinations and witness preparation schedule	0.10
05/07/09	Hernandez	Revise and edit proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	1.30
05/07/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding proposed exhibits, outline arguments and position for pretrial conference	0.80
05/07/09	Hernandez	Attend pretrial conference with Judge Underhill	1.70
05/07/09	Orleans	Prepare for pretrial conference; attend conference; telephone conferences with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles	7.00
05/07/09	Larson	Complete research re work product and Title IX and e-mail correspondence to Mr. Orleans re same	1.00
05/08/09	Hernandez	Prepare notice of supplemental disclosure	0.10
05/08/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference with potential witness Germaine Fairchild; arrange for further interview and witness preparation	0.10
05/08/09	Hernandez	Interview and prepare witnesses for testimony	2.00
05/08/09	Schneider	Prepare binders of Plaintiff's and Defendant's exhibits for temporary injunction hearing	2.50
05/08/09	Schneider	Review Joint Trial Memo	0.20
05/08/09	Orleans	Research and draft letter brief re work product issue (3.); correspondence and telephone conferences with Mr. Bardavid and Ms. Gambardella re exhibits and witnesses (.9); conference with clients (2.0); telephone conference with Ms. Galles (.3); miscellaneous preparation for hearing (.5)	6.70
05/09/09	Orleans	Preparation for preliminary injunction hearing (2.)	2.00
05/10/09	Orleans	Preparation for preliminary injunction hearing (12.)	12.00
05/10/09	Hernandez	Witness preparation of Kayla Lawler	0.80
05/10/09	Hernandez	Witness preparation and travel arrangements for Lesley Riker	0.30

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
05/10/09	Schneider	Prepare exhibits and binders for preliminary temporary injunction hearing	6.50
05/11/09	Hernandez	Review and edit Plaintiffs' trial brief	1.50
05/11/09	Hernandez	Confer with witness regarding proposed testimony	0.50
05/11/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans and prepare witness for testimony	1.00
05/11/09	Hernandez	Hearing before Judge Underhill on Plaintiffs' motion for preliminary injunction	7.00
05/11/09	Hernandez	Meeting with Mr. Orleans and Attorney Galles and clients, discussing issues raised during hearing and proposed responses	0.60
05/11/09	Schneider	Attend preliminary temporary injunction hearing (6.5); conference with Mr. Orleans, Mr. Hernandez and clients re: hearing (.3)	6.80
05/11/09	Orleans	Attendance at preliminary injunction hearing; prepare for continued hearing	14.00
05/12/09	Orleans	Attendance at preliminary injunction hearing; prepare for continued hearing; revisiting trial brief	15.00
05/12/09	Schneider	Attend Temporary Injunction Hearing (3.5); Conference with Mr. Orleans, Mr. Hernandez and clients (.3)	3.80
05/12/09	Hernandez	Review transcript of expert witness testimony and transcript designations	2.10
05/12/09	Hernandez	Post-hearing meeting with clients to discuss progress of hearing and discuss strategy	0.70
05/12/09	Hernandez	Review transcript of Tracey Flynn deposition and notes of progress of hearing, prepare cross examination of Flynn	1.40
05/12/09	Hernandez	Hearing on Plaintiffs' motion for preliminary injunction	6.30
05/12/09	Hernandez	Meeting with Mr. Orleans and Attorney Galles regarding Plaintiffs' trial brief, proposed redactions and edits	0.60
05/12/09	Hernandez	Confer with clients regarding progress of hearing and day's evidence	0.40
05/13/09	Schneider	Prepare copies of DVD's re: cheerleading performance; arrange delivery to court and e-mail to Mr. Orleans re: same	0.30
05/13/09	Hernandez	Review, revise and edit Plaintiffs' trial brief	1.50
05/13/09	Hernandez	Conference with Mr. Orleans in preparation for oral argument	0.50
05/13/09	Hernandez	Hearing on Plaintiffs' motion for preliminary injunction before Judge Underhill	7.00
05/13/09	Hernandez	Meeting with Attorney Gambardella and witness Coach Germaine Fairchild	0.40
05/13/09	Hernandez	Confer with witness regarding testimony	0.60
05/13/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding progress of hearing, outline of day's proposed testimony and cross examinations	0.70

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
05/13/09	Orleans	Preparation for and attendance at hearing re: preliminary injunction; revise trial brief; prepare for closing argument	11.00
05/14/09	Orleans	Prepare for oral argument re preliminary injunction (4.5); attendance at hearing (1.7); review/revise trial memo (3.5)	9.70
05/14/09	Hernandez	Confer with Ms. Sparks and Mr. Orleans in preparation for oral argument	0.50
05/14/09	Hernandez	Oral argument on Plaintiffs' motion for preliminary injunction	1.50
05/14/09	Hernandez	Review edits from Mr. Orleans on trial brief; mark up draft	0.70
05/14/09	Hernandez	Update full citations to trial brief and Westlaw research	0.50
05/14/09	Hernandez	Review and revise Plaintiffs' trial brief in connection with hearing on preliminary injunction	5.20
05/14/09	Schneider	Review docket report; print and organize pleadings	0.40
05/15/09	Orleans	Organize file (2.0); review defendant's memo of law (.4); correspondence with Ms. Penberthy (.2)	2.60
05/17/09	Hernandez	Email exchange with Mr. Orleans regarding proposed response to Attorney Gambardella's motion to strike testimony of Coach Fairchild	0.20
05/18/09	Orleans	Conference with Mr. Hernandez re response to motions re witness (.1); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.1)	0.20
05/18/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding response to Defendant's motion to strike testimony of Coach Fairchild	0.30
05/18/09	Schneider	Review online articles, blogs and newspapers re: Title IX and Quinnipiac; maintain press folder	0.40
05/19/09	Orleans	Organize file	3.50
05/19/09	Schneider	Review newspaper articles and internet blogs re: Quinnipiac University Volleyball team; organize same	0.30
05/20/09	Schneider	Review Defendant's Memorandum of Law in Opposition to Plaintiff's Motion for Preliminary Injunction; legal research re: same; review and organize plaintiff and defendant legal research	2.50
05/20/09	Orleans	Correspondence with Ms. Gambardella and Ms. Penberthy (several)	0.40
05/21/09	Orleans	Correspondence with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks (0.2); review court order re scheduling (.1); review Staff Handbook (.2)	0.50
05/22/09	Orleans	Review court decision; telephone conferences with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks	1.50
05/22/09	Schneider	Review Order Granting Motion for Preliminary Injunction	0.40
05/26/09	Orleans	Telephone conferences with Ms. Sparks and Mr. Doyle (.5); review press release by QU (.2); telephone conferences with news reporter (.5)	1.20
05/26/09	Orleans	Correspondence with Ms. Galles (.3); review press coverage re preliminary injunction (.5)	0.80

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
05/27/09	Orleans	Correspondence with client and co-counsel	0.30
05/29/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.4); review of correspondence (.1)	0.50
05/29/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Gambardella; telephone conference with Ms. Sparks; office conference with Mr. Hernandez re: strategy	1.20
06/01/09	Ben-Atar	Meeting with Mr. Orleans to discuss research project on preliminary injunction interim fee award	0.80
06/01/09	Orleans	Office conference with Mr. Ben-Atar re: research assignment	0.40
06/01/09	Schneider	Review pleadings; review docket report; update pleadings index	0.80
06/02/09	Orleans	Correspondence with Ms. Gambardella re: settlement (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2)	0.40
06/03/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Gambardella (.2); correspondence with Ms. Sparks, Ms. Galles and Mr. Hernandez (.4); draft Rule 26(f) report (.3)	0.90
06/03/09	Hernandez	Email exchanges with Mr. Orleans regarding clarification of scope of court's order	0.20
06/04/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Judge Underhill's chambers (.1); correspondence with Ms. Gambardella (.1); correspondence with clients (.3); prepare and file motion for reference (.5)	1.00
06/04/09	Ben-Atar	Research on attorney fee awards for preliminary injunction	3.80
06/05/09	Ben-Atar	Case research and discussion with Mr. Orleans on attorney fees motion	2.30
06/12/09	Orleans	Correspondence with clients and co-counsel re: scheduling conference	0.30
06/15/09	Orleans	E-mails to and from Ms. Galles	0.20
06/16/09	Orleans	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Judge Garfinkel (.8); correspondence with Ms. Gambardella (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2); correspondence with Ms. Galles (.3)	1.50
06/17/09	Orleans	Correspondence with Ms. Gambardella (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2)	0.40
06/18/09	Orleans	Correspondence with Ms. Gambardella (several) (.4)	0.40
06/18/09	Schneider	Conference with Mr. Orleans re: organization of file	0.20
06/19/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding possible publication of Judge Underhill's decision and order and discuss settlement and trial strategies	0.30
06/19/09	Orleans	Correspondence with co-counsel re: Rule 26(f) report (several)	0.40
06/19/09	Orleans	Review and revise motions to extend time and postpone argument (.3)	0.30
06/23/09	Schneider	Review and organize file	0.50
06/23/09	Orleans	Correspondence to Ms. Sparks re: mediation	0.20

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
06/24/09	Orleans	Correspondence with co-counsel, Ms. Gambardella and Ms. Sparks re: mediation; telephone conference with Ms. Sparks	0.80
06/25/09	Orleans	Research re: UC-Davis settlement	0.50
06/26/09	Ben-Atar	Meet with Mr. Orleans to discuss results of research on award of attorney fees for preliminary injunction	2.80
06/26/09	Orleans	Conference with Ms. Haraj-Sai re research assignment (.3); conference with Mr. Ben-Atar re research assignment (.4); research (.5)	1.20
06/28/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Mr. Orleans and clients regarding status of case and mediation strategy; follow up call with Mr. Orleans	1.00
06/28/09	Orleans	Prepare assignment for Ms. Haraj-Sai (.5); conference call with clients (1.0)	1.50
06/29/09	Ben-Atar	Attorney fees research	2.90
07/01/09	Haraj-Sai	Review materials from Mr. Orleans regarding background for assignment	1.50
07/01/09	Ben-Atar	Research re attorney fees motion	2.20
07/02/09	Orleans	Conference with Ms. Haraj-Sai re: assignment (.2); draft settlement statement (.4)	0.60
07/02/09	Haraj-Sai	Read materials for background of case	0.80
07/02/09	Haraj-Sai	Discuss case with Mr. Ben-Atar	0.30
07/02/09	Ben-Atar	Research re fee awards based solely upon the issuance of a preliminary injunction in civil rights cases	4.60
07/03/09	Ben-Atar	Research re attorney fee awards	0.60
07/04/09	Ben-Atar	Continued research re attorney fee awards	1.40
07/05/09	Ben-Atar	Further research re attorney fee awards	2.50
07/06/09	Ben-Atar	Research regarding attorney fees	8.20
07/06/09	Orleans	Review correspondence from Ms. Gambardella re cancellation of mediation (.1); conference with Mr. Hernandez re: same (.2)	1.30
07/06/09	Hernandez	Review news postings and opposing counsel's email demand to Mr. Orleans; discuss email exchange and appropriate response	0.50
07/06/09	Hernandez	Review and edit proposed letter to Attorney Gambardella regarding settlement discussions	0.50
07/06/09	Haraj-Sai	Research re standing issue raised in defendant's Motion to Dismiss	0.50
07/06/09	Haraj-Sai	Office conference with Mr. Orleans	0.10
07/06/09	Haraj-Sai	Review background materials	0.80
07/06/09	Haraj-Sai	Print cases cited in defendant's Memorandum in Support of Motion to Dismiss	0.20
07/07/09	Hernandez	Review email exchange between Mr. Orleans and Attorney Gambardella regarding settlement discussions	0.30

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
07/07/09	Orleans	Revise letter to Ms. Gambardella (.5); e-mail correspondence with Ms. Gambardella (.3)	0.80
07/07/09	Haraj-Sai	Research cases regarding standing and Title IX complaint and Title VII complaints	0.20
07/07/09	Haraj-Sai	Research regarding standing and Title IX and Title VII complaints	3.00
07/07/09	Ben-Atar	Review of materials concerning attorney fees motions and research re same; draft Motion for Attorney Fees and Costs; began drafting Memorandum of Law in Support of Motion for Attorney's Fees and Costs	6.90
07/08/09	Hernandez	Review and comment on proposed settlement demand	0.50
07/08/09	Haraj-Sai	Conference call with Mr. Orleans regarding Jackson v. Birmingham case	0.10
07/08/09	Haraj-Sai	Research regarding Title IX and Title VII and preemption and preclusion	2.80
07/08/09	Schneider	Review pleadings index; print and organize pleadings	1.00
07/08/09	Orleans	E-mails to Ms. Gambardella (.2); revise settlement position statement (.4); e-mails with co-counsel and clients (.3); telephone conferences with Ms. Haraj-Sai re: research assignment re: motion to dismiss (.3); draft settlement demand (.3)	1.50
07/08/09	Ben-Atar	Draft Motion for Attorneys' Fees and Costs	5.90
07/09/09	Ben-Atar	Draft Motion for Attorneys' Fees and Costs	6.70
07/09/09	Haraj-Sai	Research re Title IX and Title VII and retaliation claims	1.80
07/09/09	Haraj-Sai	Telephone call with Mr. Orleans	0.10
07/09/09	Haraj-Sai	Research re Title IX and Title VII	0.60
07/09/09	Haraj-Sai	Research re Title IX	0.70
07/09/09	Orleans	Telephone conferences with Ms. Haraj-Sai and Mr. Ben-Atar re: research and briefing assignments	0.50
07/09/09	Schneider	Review, revise and update pleadings index	1.50
07/09/09	Schneider	Review and organize file; draft file index	1.00
07/10/09	Schneider	Review and organize file; review and revise file index	1.00
07/10/09	Hernandez	Review and respond to Wiggin and Dana letter withdrawing from settlement conference	0.40
07/10/09	Hernandez	Review email communications regarding settlement discussions, help fashion response and strategy for Mr. Orleans	0.30
07/10/09	Haraj-Sai	Conference with Ms. Collyer regarding Title VII and Title IX claims	0.20
07/10/09	Haraj-Sai	Drafting brief in opposition to motion to dismiss	1.50
07/10/09	Haraj-Sai	Research re motion to dismiss	2.30
07/10/09	Haraj-Sai	Research re response to motion to dismiss	0.20

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
07/10/09	Haraj-Sai	Conference with Mr. Schwartz regarding Title VII claims	0.20
07/10/09	Ben-Atar	Draft motion for fees and costs	2.00
07/11/09	Ben-Atar	Revise draft motion and memo of law	4.50
07/12/09	Haraj-Sai	Research re preemption of Title IX claims by Title VII	2.80
07/12/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Haraj-Sai re: motion to dismiss (.3); research re: same (.4)	0.70
07/13/09	Hernandez	Review email communications regarding status of case and settlement discussions, explore possibility of filing amended or new complaint	0.60
07/13/09	Orleans	Research re motion to dismiss (3.0); correspondence with co-counsel (.2); draft letter to Judge Garfinkel (.4)	3.60
07/13/09	Ben-Atar	Revise draft of motion for fees	4.00
07/13/09	Haraj-Sai	Draft brief re motion to dismiss	0.90
07/14/09	Hernandez	Review and edit draft of letter to Magistrate Judge Garfinkle regarding proposed settlement discussions	0.30
07/14/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Sanders of Judge Garfinkel's chambers (.2); revise letter to Judge Garfinkel (.3); telephone conferences with Mr. BarDavid re extension of time (.2); draft and file motion for extension of time (.4); research re: response to motion to dismiss (.5)	1.60
07/15/09	Orleans	E-mail with co-counsel (.2)	0.20
07/16/09	Orleans	Research re: opposition to motion to dismiss (1.1); draft memo of law (.9); correspondence with co-counsel re: settlement conference (.1)	2.10
07/20/09	Orleans	Conference with Mr. Hernandez re tasks (.4); conference with Ms. Haraj-Sai re memorandum in opposition to motion to dismiss (.4); telephone conference with Ms. Galles re settlement and litigation strategy (.4)	1.20
07/20/09	Hernandez	Track email exchanges with co-counsel; confer with Mr. Orleans regarding division of responsibilities and work	0.30
07/20/09	Haraj-Sai	Read Brown case and Great American Federal Savings case	0.40
07/20/09	Haraj-Sai	Confer with Ms. Burgio regarding suggestions for draft of argument section of brief in opposition to motion to dismiss Sparks' claim	1.60
07/20/09	Haraj-Sai	Rework draft of argument section of brief in opposition to motion to dismiss Sparks' claim incorporating Ms. Burgio's suggestions	0.60
07/20/09	Haraj-Sai	Research re response to motion dismiss	1.50
07/20/09	Haraj-Sai	Draft brief in opposition to motion to dismiss	2.60
07/21/09	Haraj-Sai	Confer with Mr. Orleans re brief	0.10
07/21/09	Haraj-Sai	Revise brief	1.90
07/21/09	Hernandez	Draft confidential settlement memorandum	0.90

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
07/21/09	Hernandez	Further edit, revise and draft confidential statement for settlement meeting with Magistrate Judge Garfinkel	2.30
07/21/09	Orleans	Conference with Ms. Haraj-Sai (.3); review and revise brief re motion to dismiss (1.4); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.3); review and revise draft of mediation statement (.4)	2.40
07/22/09	Orleans	Review and revise draft of motion for attorney fees and memorandum of law	0.40
07/22/09	Hernandez	Confer with law student intern regarding Plaintiff's opposition to motion to dismiss	0.80
07/22/09	Hernandez	Revise and final edits to settlement memorandum to Magistrate Judge Garfinkel	0.70
07/22/09	Haraj-Sai	Draft and revise brief in opposition to motion to dismiss	2.30
07/23/09	Haraj-Sai	Confer with Mr. Orleans and Mr. Hernandez re changes to brief	0.80
07/23/09	Haraj-Sai	Review and revise brief re motion to dismiss	6.70
07/23/09	Orleans	Conferences with Ms. Haraj-Sai and Mr. Hernandez re: opposition to motion to dismiss (0.6); review and revise draft of brief (2.9); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (0.2); review e-mail from Ms. Sparks (0.2); e-mail with Ms. Galles (0.2)	4.10
07/23/09	Hernandez	Review, revise and edit draft of memorandum in opposition to motion to dismiss	0.80
07/23/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding memorandum of law in opposition to motion to dismiss, review proposed edits	0.50
07/24/09	Hernandez	Research and review of cases dealing with preemption of Title IX by Title VII	1.10
07/24/09	Hernandez	Draft and incorporate research findings into memorandum of law in opposition to motion to dismiss	1.30
07/24/09	Hernandez	Review and edit draft of memorandum in opposition to motion to dismiss	1.70
07/24/09	Hernandez	Meeting with law student intern to review proposed edits to memorandum in opposition to motion to dismiss	0.60
07/24/09	Hernandez	Research and review of cases dealing with standing to bring Title IX claim	0.70
07/24/09	Haraj-Sai	Confer with Mr. Hernandez re changes to brief in opposition to motion to dismiss Coach Sparks' claim; edit brief	4.00
07/24/09	Orleans	Review and revise brief re motion to dismiss; conferences with Mr. Hernandez and Ms. Haraj-Sai re same; file same	4.50
07/26/09	Orleans	Prepare for mediation	0.70
07/27/09	Orleans	Attendance at settlement conference (5.0); draft discovery requests (.3); telephone conference with Ms. Galles (.2)	5.50
07/27/09	Hernandez	Meet with clients; attendance at settlement conference with Magistrate Judge Garfinkel; confer with client after settlement discussions	5.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
07/27/09	Haraj-Sai	Attend settlement conference with Mr. Orleans and Mr. Hernandez	5.00
07/29/09	Orleans	Draft discovery requests	0.20
08/02/09	Orleans	Review draft of motion for attorney fees and memo of law re: same	0.30
08/04/09	Orleans	Research re: Title IX claims by coaches	0.50
08/07/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Attorney BarDavid regarding proposed Rule 26(f) report	0.50
08/07/09	Hernandez	Revise and edit proposed Rule 26(f) report	1.00
08/13/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference with Ms. Sparks regarding Defendant's request to withdraw motion to dismiss, media relations and contact with attorney for Defendant	0.50
08/13/09	Hernandez	Communicate to opposing counsel that Plaintiffs have no objection to Defendant's motion to withdraw motion to dismiss Ms. Sparks as plaintiff	0.10
08/17/09	Orleans	Review of motion to withdraw motion to dismiss and order re: same	0.30
08/17/09	Hernandez	Research and review Rule 34, Federal Rules of Civil Procedure, regarding entry and inspection, recording of buildings and transmit email to Ms. Sparks	0.50
08/18/09	Orleans	E-mail from Ms. Gambardella re: Rule 26(f) report and conference with Mr. Hernandez re: same (.2); research re: cheer injuries (.3); research re: University responses to budget issues (.3)	0.80
08/18/09	Hernandez	Discuss status of Rule 26(f) report with Mr. Orleans	0.20
08/19/09	Orleans	Conference with Mr. Hernandez re: Rule 26(f) report (.3); review draft of report (1.2); e-mails with Ms. Galles and Ms. Gambardella (.2)	1.70
08/19/09	Hernandez	Discussion with Mr. Orleans regarding proposed Rule 26(f) report	0.30
08/19/09	Hernandez	Revise proposed Rule 26(f) report	0.80
08/19/09	Hernandez	Research re motion for class certification	1.00
08/20/09	Hernandez	Draft motion and memorandum in support of motion for class certification	1.30
08/20/09	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Galles re: Rule 26(f) report (.2); review draft of report (.4); e-mail with Ms. Gambardella (.2)	0.80
08/21/09	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Gambardella (.4); office conference with Mr. Hernandez (.1)	0.50
08/25/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Mr. Brill (.1); e-mail with Ms. Galles (.1)	0.20
08/26/09	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Sparks	0.10
08/27/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Mr. Brill (.6); e-mail with co-counsel	0.80

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		and client (.2)	
09/01/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding status of 26(f) report, new counsel and motion for attorney fees	0.30
09/01/09	Orleans	Conference with Mr. Hernandez (.1); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.3)	0.40
09/02/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding pending issues to address with Attorney Brill, clients and Attorney Galles	0.70
09/02/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference call among Mr. Orleans and Attorney Galles regarding discovery, trial schedule and strategy	1.00
09/02/09	Orleans	Office conference with Mr. Hernandez re: potential amendments to complaint, class certification and case strategy (.8); e-mail with Ms. Friedfel re: Rule 26(f) report (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Galles re: case strategy (1.); draft revised Rule 26(f) report (.9)	2.90
09/03/09	Hernandez	Review, revise and approve proposed Rule 26(f) report	0.30
09/03/09	Hernandez	Review draft of motion for attorneys' fees and case law	2.50
09/03/09	Orleans	Draft and revise motion for fees and memo of law (1.5); correspondence with Ms. Galles (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2)	1.90
09/04/09	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Sparks, Ms. Galles (.3); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2)	0.50
09/04/09	Hernandez	Review and edit motion and memorandum in support of motion for attorneys' fees	1.50
09/08/09	Orleans	Review of e-mails from Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks (.3); e-mail to Ms Galles (.2); review of QU Athletics website (.5); review and revise letter from Sparks to Thompson (.8)	1.80
09/09/09	Orleans	Exchange e-mails with Ms. Sparks	0.10
09/10/09	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Friedfel re: Rule 26(f) report (.2); revise draft of report (.6); e-mail with Ms. Sparks re: roster issues (.2)	1.00
09/14/09	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Sparks re roster issues (.2); review Rule 26(f) report from defendant (.2); e-mail to Mr. Brill re: same (.1)	0.50
09/15/09	Orleans	Review Athletic Staff Handbook	0.40
09/15/09	Hernandez	Review Quinnipiac University Student Athletics Handbook and confer with Mr. Orleans	0.30
09/16/09	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Sparks and co-counsel (.3); review and revise proposed joint Rule 26(f) report (.6); e-mail with Attorney Brill (.2)	1.10
09/17/09	Hernandez	Finalize Rule 26(f) report, review and file	0.30
09/17/09	Orleans	Review and revise Rule 26(f) report	0.20
09/18/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference with Natalie in Judge Underhill's chambers regarding court order concerning Rule 26(f) report	0.10
09/18/09	Orleans	E-mail with Mr. Brill	0.10

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
09/21/09	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Sparks (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Patrick Doyle (.2)	0.40
09/22/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Galles	0.30
09/24/09	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Sparks	0.10
10/01/09	Orleans	Review correspondence from Ms. Sparks re: article in Chronicle and ongoing discrimination against volleyball program (0.4); telephone with Judge Underhill's clerk re: scheduling conference (.2)	0.60
10/02/09	Orleans	Telephone conferences and e-mails re: scheduling conference with court	0.40
10/05/09	Orleans	Conference with Mr. Hernandez re: preparation for scheduling conference	0.40
10/05/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding issues to cover at discovery conference, motion for attorney's fees and amending complaint	0.60
10/07/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Sparks re: meeting with VP Thompson (.2); e-mail with Ms. Galles re: hearing transcripts (.1)	0.30
10/08/09	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles re: press inquiry	0.20
10/09/09	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Sparks (.1); telephone call with USA Today reporter (.2)	0.30
10/12/09	Orleans	E-mail to Ms. Sparks re: meeting with Mr. Thompson	0.40
10/13/09	Orleans	Exchange e-mail with Ms. Sparks	0.20
10/15/09	Hernandez	Review materials related to possible claims of retaliation and disparate accommodations	1.00
10/21/09	Hernandez	Review proposed schedule change by defendant's counsel	0.20
10/21/09	Hernandez	Electronic research regarding motion and memorandum in support of application for attorneys fees; further review applicable case law	0.50
10/22/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans in preparation for hearing on trial schedule	0.30
10/22/09	Hernandez	Attend meeting at federal court of counsel and presiding judge; telephone conference afterwards with Attorney Galles, discussing division of labor for discovery and drafting of non-dispositive motions	2.00
10/22/09	Orleans	Office conference with Mr. Hernandez to prepare for scheduling conference with court (.5); two telephone conferences with Ms. Galles (.5); review of pleadings and correspondence re: proposed schedule (.4); attendance at U.S. District Court, Bridgeport, re: scheduling conference (1.2)	2.60
10/23/09	Orleans	Telephone conferences and e-mails with Ms. Sparks re: results of scheduling conference, potential witnesses and current status	0.40
10/27/09	Orleans	Review of order (.1); e-mail with co-counsel (.1)	0.20
10/28/09	Hernandez	Review draft request for admissions	1.10

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
10/28/09	Hernandez	Follow up on lead regarding former QU track coach Shawn Green	0.30
10/28/09	Orleans	E-mails with co-counsel (.1); telephone call and e-mails with Mr. Brill re: scheduling, etc. (.3)	0.40
10/29/09	Hernandez	Review communication from Shawn Green regarding availability as witness	0.10
10/30/09	Hernandez	Review draft requests for admission	1.00
11/02/09	Orleans	E-mails with Mr. Brill (.2); review and revise proposed pretrial schedule (.3); e-mail with Ms. Galles (.1)	0.60
11/03/09	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Galles and Mr. Brill (.2); review draft discovery requests (.9)	1.10
11/04/09	Orleans	Telephone conferences with Ms. Sparks (.2); Ms. Galles (.5); draft proposed discovery schedule (.2)	0.90
11/05/09	Orleans	Telephone conference with Mr. Brill (.3); e-mail with Mr. Brill (.2)	0.50
11/06/09	Orleans	E-mails and telephone calls with Mr. Brill, Ms. Galles, Mr. Sbalbi	0.80
11/09/09	Orleans	Telephone calls with Mr. McGuire (0.2); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles (1.0)	1.20
11/10/09	Orleans	E-mails re: media inquiry (0.3); telephone conference with Mr. P. Doyle re: same (0.2); review and revise draft of motion re: schedule	3.40
11/11/09	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding status of litigation schedule, discuss production requests, timing of trial, virtues and disadvantages to court versus jury trial on merits	0.50
11/11/09	Orleans	Draft and revise request for resolution of scheduling dispute (4.); e-mails and telephone conferences with Ms. Galles re: same (.7)	4.70
11/12/09	Orleans	Revise and file request to resolve scheduling dispute (3.0); telephone conferences with Mrd Friedfel and Ms. Sbalbi re: same (.2); e-mails with Ms. Galles re: Attorney Judge (.2)	3.40
11/17/09	Orleans	Review QU submission re: scheduling conference	0.30
11/19/09	Orleans	Telephone call with Ms. Galles re: telephone conference with Court (.2); telephone conference with Court and counsel re: schedule (.6)	0.80
11/19/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Judge Underhill and opposing counsel regarding scheduling of trial and discovery and related issues	0.60
11/24/09	Hernandez	Review communication from Attorney Galles and respond regarding proposed additional witness	0.10
11/25/09	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Sparks, Ms. Galles and Mr. Brill	0.40
11/30/09	Orleans	Review and revise discovery to QU (1.7); telephone conference with Mr. Brill and Ms. Friedfel (.2); review QU website information re: competitions and justification (.5)	2.40
12/01/09	Orleans	Review and revise requests for production (.9); e-mail to Ms.	1.10

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		Galles (.2)	
12/02/09	Orleans	Telephone conferences with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles re: discovery issues; case strategy	0.50
12/03/09	Hernandez	Travel to and from Hamden, Connecticut with Mr. Orleans and meet with clients regarding status of litigation, trial and discovery schedule	4.00
12/03/09	Orleans	Office conference with Mr. Hernandez re: client meeting (.2); review and revise draft of requests for admissions (1.0); meeting with clients in Hamden, CT (3.8); e-mails with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks (.3)	5.30
12/04/09	Hernandez	Review communications from Attorney Galles and follow up with research	1.50
12/04/09	Hernandez	Review communications from Ms. Sparks regarding statistical analysis of women athletes and photographs of inaugural competitive cheer exhibition	0.70
12/04/09	Hernandez	Analyze potential retaliation claims regarding QU press statements about reasons for cutting men's teams and need for resources for education; confer with Mr. Orleans, communicate theory of retaliation to co-counsel and client	0.70
12/04/09	Orleans	Online research re QU Competitive Cheer competition schedule, Spirit Unlimited (1.2); review of correspondence from Ms. Sparks re: rosters (.5); office conference with Mr. Hernandez re: amended complaint (.2)	1.90
12/06/09	Hernandez	Review and mark up draft of amended complaint	1.10
12/06/09	Orleans	Review and revise draft of amended complaint; e-mails with Ms. Galles re: same	4.20
12/07/09	Hernandez	Review and edit draft of amended complaint, scan and transmit to Attorney Galles; confer with Mr. Orleans regarding proposed changes	3.50
12/07/09	Orleans	Review and revise draft of amended complaint (.6); office conference with Mr. Hernandez re: amended complaint (.3); e-mails with Ms. Galles (.3); telephone conferences with Mr. Brill, Ms. Friedfel and Ms. Galles (.4)	1.60
12/09/09	Orleans	Review drafts of amended complaint; office conference with Mr. Hernandez and telephone conference with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks re: same; revise and file amended complaint	7.00
12/09/09	Hernandez	Review, edit and revise draft of complaint	1.00
12/09/09	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Mr. Orleans, Attorney Galles and Ms. Sparks to review and consider draft of amended complaint; follow up and email communications regarding same	1.00
12/10/09	Orleans	Review of e-mails (.2); attention to e-filing of exhibits (.3); review articles re: competitive cheer (.3)	0.80
12/13/09	Orleans	Review/revise requests for admissions (.5)	0.50
12/15/09	Orleans	Review/revise requests for admissions; e-mail with Ms. Galles	1.20
01/06/10	Hernandez	Review email communications from Ms. Sparks and Attorney	0.30

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		Galles regarding opposing counsel's response to request for squad size numbers and other discoverable information, respond accordingly	
01/10/10	Orleans	E-mails with co-counsel re: discovery issues	0.50
01/18/10	Orleans	E-mail with co-counsel	0.20
01/20/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Mr. Orleans and Attorney Galles regarding discovery, motions practice and expert witnesses, division of labor, review notes of conversation and take appropriate measures	1.50
01/20/10	Orleans	Conference call with Mr. Hernandez and Ms. Galles re: discovery issues and trial planning	1.20
01/21/10	Orleans	Review of e-mails re: Quinnipiac events	0.50
01/21/10	Hernandez	Research and draft memorandum of law in support of motion for class certification	2.50
01/22/10	Hernandez	Revise and edit memorandum of law in support of motion for class certification	1.30
01/25/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Sparks re: facilities access, etc.	0.30
01/25/10	Hernandez	Research, draft and edit motion and memorandum of law in support of motion for class certification; transmit initial draft to co-counsel for review	6.30
01/26/10	Hernandez	Further research and revision of memorandum of law in support of motion for class certification	1.30
01/27/10	Orleans	Review previous expert report of Dr. Yiamouyiannis	0.40
01/27/10	Hernandez	Review and edit memorandum of law in support of class certification	0.90
01/28/10	Hernandez	Edit memorandum of law in support of motion for class certification	2.50
01/28/10	Orleans	Review of correspondence from Ms. Sparks (.4); review draft of class certification brief (.5)	0.90
01/29/10	Orleans	Organize file (1.0); review of documents (1.0); research re track issues (1.0)	3.00
01/30/10	Orleans	Review of documents re roster targets, gender equity plan, etc. (1.4); revise draft of brief re class certification (1.9)	3.30
01/31/10	Orleans	Revise class certification brief (.9); draft damages analysis (.8); review prior discovery requests and responses (1.6); revise second set of requests for production (2.0)	5.30
02/01/10	Orleans	Review and revise Galles declaration in support of class certification (.4); prepare Orleans declaration (.5); review/revise brief (1.0); correspondence to Ms. Sparks re: athletes' declarations (.3); revise damages analysis (.4); draft letters (2) to opposing counsel re: discovery issues (.9); review of disclosure by defendant (1.5)	5.00
02/01/10	Hernandez	Review and revise memorandum of law in support of motion for class certification incorporating and declining edits from co-	2.70

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		counsel	
02/01/10	Hernandez	Further incorporate/decline edits from co-counsel and circulate for review; prepare declarations in support of motion and memorandum of law in support of motion for class certification	3.50
02/02/10	Orleans	Review and revise letters to Mr. Brill, et al re: discovery issues	0.70
02/02/10	Hernandez	Forward pleadings to co-counsel, discuss and review email inquiries from clients and co-counsel, address questions	0.40
02/03/10	Orleans	Review defendant's responses to request for admissions (.6); e-mail Ms. Galles re: requests for production (.3)	0.90
02/04/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles (.3); revise and serve second set of requests for production (.4); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2); office conference with Ms. LeBel-Lasse re: discovery chart (.4)	1.30
02/04/10	LeBel Lasse	Telephone conference with Mr. Orleans re: discovery project; meet with Mr. Orleans to discuss case and project involving tracking discovery responses; create case in CaseMap, scan discovery responses; create spreadsheet for tracking discovery requests and responses; commence entry of discovery information into spreadsheet; forward sample to Mr. Orleans for review and comments	2.80
02/05/10	LeBel Lasse	Continue and complete spreadsheet containing plaintiff's request for production and defendant's responses to same; forward document to Mr. Orleans for review	2.60
02/05/10	Orleans	Research re: retaliation claims under Title IX (.4); correspondence with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles (.1)	0.50
02/08/10	Orleans	Review letters (2) from Ms. Friedfel (.4); review and revise draft of student declaration in support of motion for class certification (.4); e-mail to Ms. Sparks (.1)	0.90
02/09/10	Orleans	Legal research (.4); e-mail to Ms. Sparks re: athlete declarations (.2)	0.60
02/09/10	Hernandez	Review emails from co-counsel and attached relevant case law regarding participation opportunities	0.40
02/11/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Friedfel (.2); e-mail with co-counsel (.2); review defendant's document production (.4); revise athlete declarations re: class certification (.9); e-mail with Ms. Friedfel (.1)	1.80
02/12/10	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Galles (.1); e-mail with Ms. Friedfel (.2); e-mail with clients re: class certification declaration (.5); research re: class certification (.4)	1.20
02/16/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Galles re: cheer experts (.1); e-mail with Ms. Lawler (.1); review articles re: cheer (.2); review documents from QU (.3); review requests for production (.4)	1.10
02/18/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Lawler; e-mails with Ms. Sparks	0.40
02/19/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Galles and Mr. Hernandez re: cheer experts, etc. (.8)	0.80

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
02/19/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Mr. Orleans and Attorney Galles regarding expert witnesses, disclosure, pending discovery issues, declarations of plaintiffs in support of class certification	0.80
02/22/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Overdevest (.4); review of documents (3.0); draft discovery plan (.3); Title IX research (1.2)	4.90
02/23/10	Orleans	Telephone conferences with Ms. Sparks (2) (.3); deposition preparation (.3); telephone conference with Ms. Galles and Mr. Hernandez (.5); e-mail with Ms. Friedfel (.3)	1.40
02/23/10	Hernandez	Weekly telephone conference call with Mr. Orleans and Attorney Galles regarding discovery and scheduling of depositions; follow up to meeting	0.80
02/24/10	Orleans	Revise declaration of Ms. Corinaldesi (.3); e-mail to Ms. Friedfel re: deposition schedule (.1)	0.40
02/25/10	Orleans	E-mail to Ms. Corinaldesi (.1)	0.10
02/26/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Sparks	0.10
02/28/10	Orleans	Meeting with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Riker re: preparation for depositions, etc.	2.70
03/01/10	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Biediger (.2); file declarations (.1); e-mail with Ms. Friedfel (.1)	0.40
03/02/10	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans and co-counsel regarding scheduling of depositions	0.10
03/02/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Sparks, athletes (.2); review of documents from QU (.4); e-mail to Ms. Friedfel (.1)	0.70
03/05/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Friedfel	0.40
03/08/10	Orleans	E-mails with clients re deposition schedule (.2); review materials from Ms. Galles (.2)	0.40
03/09/10	Orleans	Conference with Ms. Sparks to prepare for deposition (4.0); review of QU response to RFP (.3); e-mail with Ms. Galles (.2)	4.50
03/09/10	Hernandez	Meeting with Ms. Sparks and Mr. Orleans to discuss deposition, direct preparation and identify issues to address	2.00
03/10/10	Hernandez	Meeting with Mr. Orleans to examine discovery materials, arrange for electronic scanning and discuss preparation for depositions and issues to cover in each	0.60
03/10/10	Orleans	Telephone conferences with Ms. Friedfel and Ms. Galles (.8); office conferences with Mr. Hernandez and Ms. LeBel-Lasse (.5); e-mails with clients (.3); telephone conference with Ms. Biediger (.4)	2.00
03/10/10	LeBel Lasse	Telephone conference with Mr. Orleans re: document production received and processing same to electronically searchable format; review hard copy documents received from opposing counsel; confer with Mr. Orleans re: same; telephone conference with vendor re: pricing info for scanning and OCRing paper documents and preparing same for loading into Summation database; commence unitizing production documents in preparation for scanning; telephone conference	2.80

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		with vendor to schedule pickup	
03/11/10	LeBel Lasse	Continue unitizing documents in anticipation of scanning same; e-mail exchange with Mr. Orleans re: scanning production; confer with Mr. Hernandez re: document production; make arrangements with mail room re: completion of unitization; e-mail exchange with vendor	3.50
03/11/10	Hernandez	Review document production from defendant Quinnipiac University	3.30
03/15/10	Orleans	E-mails with clients (.4); e-mails with Ms. Friedfel (.2); review defendant's opposition to class certification (.5); telephone conferences with Mr. Jones at Merrill Corp. re: document scanning (.3)	1.40
03/16/10	Hernandez	Review and annotate defendant's memorandum of law in opposition to motion for class certification	1.70
03/16/10	Whiting	Directions from Mr. Orleans regarding Quinnipiac's Responses and Objections to Second Request for Production; create index of requests, objections, responses and documents produced using CaseMap	3.10
03/16/10	Orleans	Office conference with Ms. Whiting re: discovery chart (.3); e-mails with clients (.3); e-mails with Ms. Friedfel (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2); office conferences (2) with Mr. Hernandez re reply brief re class cert, document review (.4); draft objections and responses to QU requests for production (1.6)	3.00
03/17/10	Orleans	Drafting responses to requests for production (.6); review of documents (1.0); telephone conferences with Ms. Lawler and Ms. Sparks (.3); e-mail with clients (.2); conferences with Mr. Hernandez (.3)	2.40
03/17/10	Hernandez	Review and catalogue defendant's discovery	7.70
03/17/10	Whiting	Review and revise index of Quinnipiac's Responses and Objections to Second Request for Production objections, responses and documents produced	0.50
03/18/10	Hernandez	Review documents produced by defendant	1.70
03/19/10	Orleans	Review and revise responses and objections to requests for production (2.5); review of documents (1.5); correspondence to Ms. Friedfel (.2); office conferences with Mr. Hernandez re: documents (.5); e-mail with Ms. Galles (.3); prepare for meeting with clients (.4); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2); research re recent Title IX cases (.5)	6.10
03/19/10	Hernandez	Research cases in defendant's memorandum of law in opposition to motion and memorandum for class certification, outline reply arguments	2.50
03/19/10	Whiting	Brief office conference with and directions from Mr. Hernandez; review case law citations contained in Defendant's Memorandum of Law in Opposition to Motion for Class Certification; retrieve case law from Westlaw	0.90
03/21/10	Hernandez	To client meeting in Hamden: meet with plaintiffs and prepare	4.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		for depositions	
03/21/10	Orleans	Meeting with clients in Hamden, CT to prepare for depositions	4.00
03/22/10	Orleans	Review hearing transcripts (.3); e-mail to clients (.2); e-mails to Ms. Friedfel re deposition schedule (.2); office conference with Mr. Hernandez re class certification brief (.3)	1.00
03/22/10	Hernandez	Review case law cited in defendant's memorandum; draft reply to memorandum in opposition to motion for class certification	5.30
03/23/10	Orleans	Telephone conferences with Ms. Friedfel re deposition schedule (.3); research re class certification issues (.8); office conference with Mr. Hernandez re same (.4); review of documents (1.0); review of QU responses to requests for admissions (1.0)	3.50
03/23/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference with ACLU attorney Dunne regarding reply brief and precedents	0.30
03/23/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference and email exchanges with Attorney Galles	0.40
03/23/10	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding organization of reply brief and possibility of submitting additional declarations	0.30
03/23/10	Hernandez	Exchange communications with Attorney Galles regarding outline of reply brief	0.20
03/23/10	Hernandez	Review transcript of Robin Sparks regarding evidence in support of class certification, continue to research and draft reply brief	3.00
03/23/10	Hernandez	Legal research regarding class certification in Title IX matters	2.30
03/24/10	Whiting	Create index of Defendant's Responses and Objections to Plaintiffs' First Request for Admissions	1.90
03/24/10	Orleans	Research re Title IX and men's sports teams	0.50
03/25/10	Hernandez	Draft and revise reply brief	3.30
03/25/10	Orleans	Review participation documents disclosed by QU (.3); e-mails to clients (.4); telephone call and conference with Ms. Sparks (.4); review of documents (1.0); e-mail with Ms. Friedfel re deposition schedule (.2)	2.30
03/26/10	Orleans	Attend depositions of Ms. Corinaldes and Ms. Biediger; telephone conference with Ms. Sparks	7.50
03/26/10	Hernandez	Review discovery materials for support to reply brief	1.20
03/26/10	Hernandez	Revise reply brief, incorporate suggested changes	1.90
03/29/10	Hernandez	Discussion with Mr. Orleans re depositions and issues raised by questioning	0.20
03/29/10	Hernandez	Edit reply to Defendant's memorandum of law in opposition to class certification	2.30
03/30/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with court reporter re: transcripts (.1); review deposition notes (.2)	0.30
03/31/10	Orleans	Review deposition transcripts and e-mail to co-counsel; review QU document disclosure	0.30

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
03/31/10	Hernandez	Review deposition transcripts	1.00
04/01/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Friedfel, Ms. Sparks and Ms. Overdevest re: deposition schedule (.30); e-mail to Ms. Sparks (.1)	0.40
04/02/10	Orleans	Review of e-mails from Ms. Galles	0.20
04/03/10	Orleans	Review and revise reply brief re: class certification	2.50
04/04/10	Orleans	Office conference with Mr. Hernandez re: reply brief and case strategy (.3); revise reply brief (2.4); legal research re: class certification issues (1.3)	4.00
04/05/10	Hernandez	Review and edit reply to memorandum of law in opposition to motion for class certification, coordinating comments with co-counsel	5.40
04/05/10	Orleans	Telephone conferences with Ms. Friedfel (.2); draft motion to extend time re: reply brief (.3); telephone conference with Ms. Galles (.3); conferences with Mr. Hernandez (.2)	1.00
04/06/10	Hernandez	Review comments and proposed edits from co-counsel and add to reply brief	0.50
04/06/10	Orleans	Revise reply brief re class certification; research re: same; review of documents from QU	2.00
04/07/10	Hernandez	Final review and edits to reply brief and supporting documents, prepare motion for permission to file oversized brief	1.40
04/07/10	Orleans	Review of discovery objections and documents to prepare for discovery conference (2.3); review and revise reply brief re: class certification (0.6)	2.90
04/08/10	Orleans	Conference with Ms. Sparks (1.6); prepare for telephone call to Ms. Friedfel (.5); telephone conference with Ms. Friedfel re: discovery issues (.8); review of QU discovery responses (.5)	3.40
04/09/10	Orleans	Review of documents from Ms. Sparks (1.0); review of documents from QU (.5)	1.50
04/10/10	Orleans	E-mail to Ms. Overdevest (.2); review of documents (.2)	0.40
04/12/10	Orleans	Defend depositions of Ms. Erin Overdevest and Ms. Robin Sparks at Wiggin and Dana, New Haven	9.50
04/13/10	LeBel Lasse	Meet with Mr. Orleans and Ms. Whiting re: production	0.50
04/13/10	Whiting	Office conference with Mr. Orleans and Ms. LeBel-Lasse regarding organization of discovery and trial preparation	0.50
04/13/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Friedfel (.4); review of file re: confidentiality stipulation (.3); conference with Ms. Lasse and Ms. Whiting re: document review (.5); e-mails with Ms. Galles (.3); review Lahey statements (.7); review transcripts re: bifurcation of claims (.3); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2)	2.70
04/14/10	Whiting	Convert electronic deposition transcripts into format suitable for use in Summation database; upload transcripts into Summation; receipt of additional documents produced by defendants	0.40
04/14/10	LeBel Lasse	Confer with Ms. Whiting re: hard copy documents received from	0.30

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		Mr. Orleans and processing same; review and respond to e-mails from Mr. Orleans and Ms. Whiting re: transcripts	
04/14/10	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans and Attorney Galles regarding scheduling and issues to address in depositions and discovery	1.30
04/14/10	Orleans	Review documents (1.6); telephone conference with Ms. Galles and Mr. Hernandez (1.0); telephone call with Ms. Friedfel (.1); correspondence to clients re transcripts (.3)	3.00
04/15/10	LeBel Lasse	Review e-mail from Ms. Whiting re: deposition transcripts; meet with Ms. Whiting to review of defendant's production documents received from Mr. Orleans, discuss gap in Bates numbering and arranging for documents to be loaded into Summation database; review of thumb drive materials; electronically load sample materials from thumb drive to Summation and review same; review e-mail from Ms. Whiting re: Summation database training	1.20
04/15/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Friedfel re discovery issues (.8); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2); review documents and deposition transcripts (1.0)	2.00
04/16/10	Whiting	Unitize documents produced by defendant to be sent to vendor for scanning	3.10
04/16/10	LeBel Lasse	Telephone conference with vendor re: invoice for scanning production documents and additional items to be scanned; review e-docs and transcripts loaded into Summation database and compare e-docs to those received on client's thumbdrive, note issues with same; confer with Ms. Whiting re: paper documents	1.00
04/16/10	Hernandez	Review exhibits and transcripts in preparation for Mecca deposition	1.30
04/16/10	Orleans	E-mails with counsel re: status conference (.4); review of documents (.9); office conference with Mr. Hernandez re: deposition preparation (.3)	1.60
04/18/10	Orleans	Review of documents to prepare for Powers deposition (1.2); draft memo re discovery issues (.8)	2.00
04/19/10	Orleans	Prepare for Powers deposition (3.9); telephone conferences with Ms. Galles (.3)	4.20
04/19/10	LeBel Lasse	Confer with Ms. Whiting re: paper documents and pickup scheduled by vendor; meet with vendor representative; e-mail exchange with vendor support staff re: project specifications	0.40
04/20/10	LeBel Lasse	Review e-mail from vendor re: Bates capture of defendant's documents and Bates range; compare range given by vendor to those in database; telephone call to vendor re: same; review content list of thumb drive received from vendor; telephone conference with vendor re: specifications for processing same; confer with Ms. Whiting re: Bates numbering on documents sent for scanning; telephone conference with project manager re: processing both paper and e-docs; e-mail exchange with Mr. Walsh of MIS department re: document ID numbering in Summation database; receive invoice from Merrill and forward	0.80

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		same to Mr. Orleans	
04/20/10	Whiting	Participate in telephone conference with Judge Underhill and opposing counsel regarding scheduling issues; office conference with Mr. Orleans and Mr. Hernandez	0.50
04/20/10	Whiting	Receipt of Summation load file from vendor; directions to MIS department to load data into Summation database	0.10
04/20/10	Hernandez	Review deposition transcripts and prepare for Mecca deposition	4.30
04/20/10	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding rescheduling of trial per Judge's request and details for telephone conference	0.20
04/20/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Friedfel re: discovery (1.2); prepare summary of agreements re discovery (1.0); telephonic status conference with counsel and Judge Underhill re: trial schedule (.4); office conference with Mr. Hernandez and Ms. Whiting re: discovery (.2); e-mails with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks (.3)	3.10
04/20/10	Orleans	Prepare for deposition of Ms. Powers	1.00
04/21/10	Hernandez	Prep for deposition; conversation with co-counsel	0.10
04/21/10	Orleans	Review of QU document disclosure (.5); telephone conference with Ms. Galles (.5); prepare for deposition of Ms. Powers (4.5)	5.50
04/22/10	Orleans	Prepare for and take deposition of Ms. Powers; attend deposition of Mr. Mecca; prepare for deposition of Mr. McDonald; e-mail to Ms. Galles; telephone conference with Ms. Galles	7.50
04/22/10	Hernandez	Organize and prepare for deposition of Mr. William Mecca	2.30
04/22/10	Hernandez	Attend and assist deposition of Coach Mary Ann Powers	4.00
04/23/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference with Ms. Sparks regarding conduct of deposition and issues raised therein	0.50
04/23/10	Orleans	Preparation for depositions	0.50
04/26/10	LeBel Lasse	Confer with Mr. Orleans re: check received from defendant's counsel for half payment of Merrill processing invoice, discuss additional production documents received from defendants and Sparks documents that were loaded into Summation; review Sparks electronic documents loaded into Summation; e-mails to Mr. Walsh and vendor's project manager re: issue concerning e-docs; telephone conference with Mr. Walsh re: e-docs; e-mail exchange with vendor re: same; arrange for payment of Merrill's invoice	1.00
04/26/10	Orleans	Review correspondence from Ms. Friedfel (.2); office conferences with Ms. LeBel-Lasse and Ms. Whiting re document disclosure (.3); e-mail and telephone conference with Ms. Friedfel (.2)	0.70
04/27/10	Hernandez	Coordinate deposition coverage fro Friday, April 30	0.20
04/27/10	Whiting	Review CDs received from opposing counsel to determine data type and whether or not data can be loaded into Summation database; office conference with Ms. LeBel-Lasse regarding	0.40

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		same; e-mail to IT department regarding CDs	
04/27/10	LeBel Lasse	Confer with Ms. Whiting re: additional production received from defendant's counsel; send follow up e-mail to vendor re: status of rectifying issue with electronic documents loaded into Summation; confer with Ms. Whiting re: contents of disks received and processing same for Summation load; e-mail exchange with Ms. Whiting re: thumb drive and issue concerning tiff and native images	0.50
04/27/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Riker and Ms. Friedfel; office conference with Mr. Hernandez	0.40
04/28/10	Orleans	Correspondence re: deposition transcripts (.2)	0.20
04/28/10	Whiting	Office conference with Ms. LeBel-Lasse to determine how to proceed with processing data received from opposing counsel and to discuss issue with vendor regarding e-mails; e-mail to Mr. Orleans regarding same	0.40
04/28/10	LeBel Lasse	Review and respond to e-mails from vendor re: e-mails loaded in Summation database containing imbedded images from internet and native thumb drive load for Summation; receive check payment for Merrill Communications invoice, forward same to vendor; receive original thumb drives from vendor, forward same to Mr. Orleans along with file copies of paid invoice; confer with Ms. Whiting re: contents of disk and video file, discussion re: Sparks thumb drive documents; print sample of problem items loaded into Summation, send copy of same to vendor; e-mail exchange with vendor and our IT person re: native files	1.00
04/29/10	Whiting	Review e-mails produced by Ms. Sparks and tag for issues in to aid in discovery production	2.50
04/29/10	Hernandez	Review transcripts of depositions of Robin Lamott Sparks and Erin Overdevest to prepare for defense of depositions	1.50
04/29/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Friedfel re: discovery issues (.3); telephone conferences with Ms. Lawler and Ms. Riker re depositions (.4); e-mails to Ms. Overdevest and Ms. Sparks re: depositions (.2); review deposition transcripts (.3)	1.20
04/30/10	Whiting	Continued review of Ms. Sparks' e-mails in Summation database and tag for issues to prepare for production to opposing counsel	1.40
04/30/10	Orleans	Attention to deposition arrangements (:3); draft proposed protective order (.6)	0.90
04/30/10	Hernandez	Travel to and from Quinnipiac University and Wiggin & Dana, New Haven; prepare witnesses and defend depositions of Kayla Lawler and Logan Riker	2.50
04/30/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference with client Robin Sparks regarding depositions of Lawler and Riker, issues addressed	0.20
05/01/10	Orleans	Research re: admissibility of expert testimony re: Title IX issues (.3); review 2005 deposition testimony of Mr. McDonald to prepare for McDonald deposition (2.8); revise draft of protective order (.3)	3.40

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
05/03/10	Orleans	Correspondence to Ms. Friedfel, et al re: Ms. Biediger deposition transcript (.1); review/revise draft protective order (.3); review of documents for disclosure (1.5); correspondence with Ms. Galles (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.3); review draft of stipulation to bifurcate (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Fairchild (.3); on-line research re Varsity cheer organization (.5)	3.40
05/03/10	Whiting	Continued review of Ms. Sparks' e-mails in Summation database	0.80
05/03/10	Whiting	Office conference with Mr. Orleans regarding production of Ms. Sparks' emails	0.20
05/03/10	Hernandez	Review, organize disclosures from defendant	0.50
05/04/10	LeBel Lasse	Telephone conference with vendor re: completion of project involving thumb drives; review vendor invoice and process same for payment	0.30
05/04/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Galles (.5); office conference with Mr. Hernandez re: depositions (.4); review documents for disclosure (2.0); prepare for deposition of Mr. McDonald (.6)	3.50
05/04/10	Scroggin	Assist Ms. Whiting with electronic document production in summation	0.40
05/04/10	Whiting	E-mail to vendor to obtain price quote to have recent document production from defendant converted to TIFFs for use in Summation database	0.10
05/04/10	Whiting	E-mails to and from Mr. Quierolo at Merrill Corporation regarding conversion of PDF files for use in Summation; letter to Mr. Quierolo enclosing disc for conversion; begin preparing production set of Ms. Sparks' e-mails	1.10
05/04/10	Hernandez	Review Flynn transcript and confer with Mr. Orleans regarding depositions of Lawler and Riker, plan issues to cover in further depositions	0.50
05/04/10	Hernandez	Prepare for deposition of Tracy Flynn	1.30
05/05/10	Whiting	Create production set in Summation database of documents to be produced to opposing counsel	1.10
05/05/10	Orleans	Draft and revise correspondence to Mr. Schatz of ACLUF-CT (.8); prepare for depositions (4.4)	5.20
05/05/10	Scroggin	Assist Ms. Whiting with electronic document production in summation and finalize production set and create browser briefcase	0.60
05/05/10	Hernandez	Review and organize exhibits for Thompson deposition	3.30
05/06/10	Orleans	Prepare for and take deposition of Mr. McDonald (7.4); office conference with Ms. Sparks (.5)	7.90
05/06/10	Hernandez	Organize exhibits and outline in anticipation of deposition of Ms. Tracy Flynn	1.10
05/06/10	Hernandez	Deposition of Ms. Tracy Flynn	3.30

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
05/06/10	Hernandez	Client conference with Robin Sparks regarding trial issues, scheduling and proposed questions for future depositions	0.50
05/07/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles re: depositions (.4); office conferences with Ms. Whiting and Mr. Hernandez (.4); review of documents (1.3)	2.10
05/07/10	Whiting	Office conference with Mr. Orleans regarding recent document production	0.10
05/07/10	Hernandez	Review notes from deposition and organize exhibits, brief client Robin Sparks and co-counsel	1.20
05/09/10	Orleans	Review Title IX blog re: EADA and NCAA statistics (.4)	0.40
05/10/10	Orleans	Review of documents (1.3); revise proposed stipulation to bifurcate trial (.7); revise proposed protective order (.5)	2.50
05/10/10	Hernandez	Review and prepare for deposition of Mr. Thompson	2.10
05/11/10	Orleans	Prepare for Thompson and Martin depositions (.5); review documents (.4); e-mails with Ms. Friedfel (.2); telephone call with Ms. Galles (.3)	1.40
05/12/10	Orleans	Prepare for Thompson deposition (1.0); review documents (1.8); telephone conference with Ms. Galles (.4); prepare and file motion to approve stipulation to bifurcate (.4)	3.60
05/12/10	Whiting	Assist Mr. Orleans with Summation issue	0.30
05/12/10	Hernandez	Review and prepare for Thompson deposition	1.50
05/13/10	Hernandez	Review and organize exhibits and prepare for deposition of Mr. Thompson	4.00
05/13/10	Hernandez	Meeting with Mr. Orleans to discuss contours of Thompson deposition	0.30
05/13/10	Orleans	Prepare for Thompson deposition (2.0); review of documents (3.0); e-mails with Ms. Galles (.4); telephone conference and e-mail with Ms. Friedfel (.4)	5.80
05/14/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Mr. Hernandez and Ms. Sparks (.2)	0.20
05/14/10	Hernandez	Confer with client Robin Sparks and co-counsel regarding Thompson deposition, discuss issues arising from testimony	0.30
05/14/10	Hernandez	Respond to Mr. Brill's request for expert witness reports, communicate with co-counsel Galles and confirm due dates with Ms. Friedfell	0.20
05/14/10	Hernandez	Organize and prepare for deposition of Mark Thompson, pre-mark exhibits with court reporter	2.00
05/14/10	Hernandez	Deposition of Mark Thompson	2.70
05/15/10	Orleans	Review and revise expert disclosure (1.3); telephone conference with Ms. Galles (.4); review Lopiano report (.9); research re FERPA (.5); review scheduling order	3.30
05/16/10	Orleans	Review and revise disclosure re cheer experts (.4); e-mails with Ms. Galles, Ms. Brill and Ms. Friedfel (.9); telephone conferences with Ms. Galles (.4); review Thompson deposition	3.10

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		transcript (.4); prepare for deposition of Ms. Martin (1.0)	
05/17/10	Orleans	Prepare for deposition of C. Martin (4.2); review and disclose expert reports (.5)	4.70
05/17/10	Hernandez	Review email communications from weekend	0.50
05/17/10	Hernandez	Discovery review with Mr. Orleans, prepare for further review and organization of recent disclosures by defendant	0.30
05/18/10	Hernandez	Review and organize discovery materials from client, confer with Ms. Whiting (paralegal) on process and review expert witness reports and exhibits	5.00
05/18/10	Whiting	Brief office conference with and directions from Mr. Hernandez regarding organization of discovery; review file; organize Defendant's discovery production	2.50
05/18/10	Orleans	Prepare for and attend deposition of Coach Martin (8.0); e-mails with Ms. Galles (.2); e-mail to counsel re disclosure of expert report (.2); draft letter to Mr. Brill re scholarship issue (.4)	8.80
05/19/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.2); revise draft of letter to Mr. Brill (.2)	0.40
05/19/10	Whiting	Review and organize Plaintiffs' and Defendant's discovery production; review file to ensure there are hard copies of all discovery production	3.00
05/19/10	Hernandez	Confer with Ms. Whiting regarding document numbers to locate and enter into summation data base	0.30
05/19/10	Hernandez	Review and propose edit to draft letter to Mr. Brill regarding status quo and defendant's proposed revocation of scholarships	0.20
05/20/10	Hernandez	Review decision and order of district court granting in part and denying in part plaintiff's motion for class certification; discuss notice procedure with Mr. Orleans	0.30
05/20/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Sparks re deposition (0.3); telephone conference with Judge Underhill's chambers (0.1); telephone conference with Mr. Hernandez re class certification decision (0.3); e-mails with defense counsel (0.2)	0.90
05/21/10	Hernandez	Westlaw search of cases regarding notice requirements of Rule 23 in class action lawsuit involving civil rights claims	0.30
05/21/10	Hernandez	Review and digest case law on Rule 23 notice in class action lawsuits involving civil rights claims	1.00
05/21/10	Hernandez	Telephone call to chambers to coordinate conference call for Tuesday, email counsel to confirm date and time	0.20
05/21/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Attorney Hernandez re class notice issue (0.2)	0.20
05/22/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Mr. Brill and Ms. Friedfel (0.3); e-mail with co-counsel (0.2)	0.50
05/23/10	Orleans	Review court decision re class certification (0.4); review Ms. Friedfel's revision to protective order (0.1)	0.50
05/24/10	Mocciolo	Conference with Mr. Orleans regarding procedure for admission	0.10

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		of preliminary injunction record	
05/24/10	Orleans	Document review (.5); telephone call with Ms. Galles (.5); office conference with Mr. Hernandez re: class notice and trial preparation (.3); telephone call with Ms. Sparks (.2); e-mails with Mr. Brill and Ms. Friedfel (.4); review NCAA website re Compliance Assist (.4); office conference with Mr. Mocchiolo (.10)	2.40
05/24/10	Hernandez	Review print out of defendant's disclosure with paralegal Amy Whiting and instruct on steps for printing, ordering and organizing for attorney review	0.20
05/24/10	Hernandez	Review and respond to press inquiries regarding district court's decision and order granting motion for class certification	0.20
05/24/10	Hernandez	Discovery review	1.50
05/24/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with co-counsel, Mr. Orleans and Ms. Galles regarding Rule 23 notice, deposition of plaintiffs and defense expert witnesses	0.50
05/24/10	Hernandez	Forward copies of Judge Underhill's ruling on motion for class certification to interested parties	0.30
05/25/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Judge Underhill's chambers and opposing counsel, contact chambers and reschedule	0.10
05/25/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Judge Underhill and opposing counsel, discuss with Mr. Orleans (0.4), notify co-counsel of agreed upon schedule (0.2)	0.60
05/25/10	Orleans	Telephonic status conference with Court (.4); e-mails with Ms. Galles and Mr. Brill (.4); review of documents (.3)	1.10
05/26/10	Orleans	Telephone call with Mr. Webb (.3); telephone call with Ms. Sparks (.2); e-mails with Ms. Galles (.6); e-mails with Mr. Brill (.8); review Lopiano report (.9)	2.80
05/26/10	Mocchiolo	Research procedure for admitting evidentiary record of preliminary injunction hearing at trial	0.70
05/26/10	Whiting	Organize documents produced by Defendant	0.70
05/26/10	Whiting	Directions from Mr. Orleans to have recently produced documents from the defendant sent to vendor for processing; review Summation file to obtain last set of documents loaded and to determine which documents need to be processed; e-mail to vendor to obtain price quote	0.70
05/26/10	Hernandez	Review document production from defendant	1.20
05/27/10	Orleans	E-mails (many) with Ms. Galles, Mr. Brill and Ms. Friedfel (1.0); telephone call with Ms. Galles re: experts (.3)	1.30
05/27/10	Hernandez	Discovery review, organize potential trial exhibits, prepare trial memorandum	5.30
05/27/10	Whiting	Prepare and unitize Defendant's document production to go to vendor for processing	1.50
05/28/10	Whiting	Receipt of additional documents from Defendant; unitize and prepare same for processing by vendor	0.30

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
05/28/10	Hernandez	Discovery review; pull exhibits for trial	3.00
05/28/10	Orleans	Review of QU document disclosure (.5); e-mails with Mr. Brill and co-counsel re: expert depositions, etc. (.5)	1.00
05/30/10	Orleans	Trial preparation (review of documents, e-mails with co-counsel, legal research, draft fact stipulations)	3.00
05/31/10	Orleans	Telephone call with Ms. Galles (.8); telephone call with Mr. Brill (.7); review deposition transcripts (.5); e-mails to clients (.3); e-mails to Ms. Galles and Mr. Brill (.6)	2.90
06/01/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks (.8); draft correspondence to Mr. Brill (.3); e-mails with Mr. Brill (.4); trial preparation (3.5)	5.00
06/01/10	Hernandez	Discovery review and analysis	2.00
06/01/10	Whiting	Receipt of additional documents produced by Defendant; e-mail to vendor to inquire if additional documents can be added to current processing job; unitize and prepare documents for processing by vendor	0.30
06/01/10	Whiting	Organize additional documents produced from Defendant	0.20
06/01/10	Whiting	Directions from Mr. Orleans regarding deposition files; organize deposition transcripts, files and exhibits	2.40
06/02/10	Hernandez	Review and analyze discovery produced by defendant; review compact disc containing videotape of competitive cheer competition	5.00
06/02/10	Orleans	Trial preparation: review of video disclosed by QU; review of documents; e-mails with co-counsel and adversaries; telephone call with Ms. Sparks, etc.	3.80
06/03/10	Orleans	Review of documents produced by QU (3.); drafting joint pretrial memo (2.0); telephone call with Ms. Galles (.4); miscellaneous trial preparation (1.0)	6.40
06/03/10	Hernandez	Continue review and analysis of discovery materials provided by defendant Quinnipiac University	5.00
06/04/10	Hernandez	Review and prepare for trial, outline proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	2.30
06/04/10	Orleans	Trial preparation	5.00
06/05/10	Orleans	Trial preparation	1.30
06/06/10	Hernandez	Review and organize deposition exhibits and trial exhibits	2.00
06/06/10	Orleans	E-mails with Mr. Brill and Ms. Galles (1.0); trial preparation (2.0)	3.00
06/07/10	Orleans	Trial preparation; telephone calls with Ms. Galles and Mr. Brill; telephonic status conference with Judge Underhill; review of documents	5.00
06/07/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Judge Underhill and opposing counsel regarding procedural issues, follow up with Mr. Orleans regarding proposed resolution of pending disputes and telephone conference with Mr. Brill regarding same; draft outline of proposed statement of issues in contention	1.50

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
06/07/10	Hernandez	Review discovery materials from defendant Quinnipiac University and assess as potential trial exhibits	4.50
06/08/10	Whiting	Continue organizing deposition exhibits	0.20
06/08/10	Whiting	Office conference with and directions from Mr. Orleans regarding deposition digests; begin reviewing 5/6/10 deposition of Jack McDonald	1.20
06/08/10	Hernandez	Review deposition transcripts and prepare for trial	2.50
06/08/10	Orleans	Trial preparation; review deposition of Ms. Powers; revise draft of pretrial order; telephone call with Ms. Galles; e-mails with Mr. Brill, etc.	5.00
06/09/10	Hernandez	Review deposition transcripts and plan witness examinations	2.30
06/09/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Mr. Orleans and opposing counsel regarding pretrial order, and follow up with Mr. Orleans	0.80
06/09/10	Hernandez	Outline trial exhibits list and meet with paralegal to begin generating list	0.40
06/09/10	Whiting	Review deposition transcript of Jack McDonald in order to prepare deposition digest	2.80
06/09/10	Whiting	Continued preparation of digest of deposition of Jack McDonald; office conference and direction with Mr. Hernandez regarding preparation of Exhibit List; prepare exhibit list	2.80
06/09/10	Orleans	Trial preparation; telephone conferences and e-mails with co-counsel and opposing counsel; review of documents, etc.	6.90
06/10/10	Whiting	Complete deposition digest of Jack McDonald's 5/6/10 deposition	4.30
06/10/10	Whiting	Organize Defendant's most recent document productions	0.60
06/10/10	Orleans	Draft and revise joint pretrial order; e-mails with Mr. Brill and Ms. Friedfel; e-mails and calls with Ms. Galles; trial preparation	7.00
06/10/10	Hernandez	Review proposed trial exhibits	1.30
06/10/10	Hernandez	Draft proposed findings of fact	3.20
06/11/10	Orleans	Prepare for and attend pretrial conference; telephone calls and e-mails with Ms. Galles; telephone call with Ms. Sparks; review of documents; review draft of trial memo; e-mails with Mr. Brill, et al; miscellaneous trial preparation	6.50
06/11/10	Hernandez	Prepare proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	4.50
06/11/10	Hernandez	Travel to federal court, pretrial conference with Judge Underhill	1.30
06/11/10	Hernandez	Review and prepare for pretrial conference, confer with Mr. Orleans, telephone conference call with Attorney Galles	1.00
06/11/10	Hernandez	Re-read transcript of Mr. Thompson for factual support regarding persistence of roster manipulation	1.00
06/12/10	Hernandez	Review depositions, pleadings and expert witness reports, prepare proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law	5.00
06/12/10	Orleans	Trial preparation	6.50

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
06/13/10	Orleans	Trial preparation	6.00
06/13/10	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans and Attorney Galles, continue to prepare proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law and trial brief	5.50
06/14/10	Orleans	Trial preparation; revise exhibit list; review deposition transcripts; office conferences with co-counsel; telephone conference with Ms. Flynn, et al, etc.	4.40
06/14/10	LeBel Lasse	Confer with Ms. Whiting re: status of trial preparation and assistance; review e-mail from Ms. Whiting re: exhibits; send e-mail to Mr. Orleans re: assistance with trial	0.40
06/14/10	LeBel Lasse	Confer with Ms. Whiting re: trial exhibits and trial preparation; send e-mail to Mr. Orleans re: trial assistance; review Mr. Orleans's response to same	0.30
06/14/10	Whiting	Review Defendant's exhibit list; gather and organize exhibits	4.90
06/14/10	Hernandez	Find and manage personnel for deposition	0.20
06/14/10	Hernandez	Confer with Attorney Galles regarding expert witnesses and fact witnesses and scope and significance of their respective testimony	0.50
06/14/10	Hernandez	Review depositions and dictate proposed findings of fact	6.50
06/15/10	Orleans	Trial preparation; attend deposition of Mr. Seemes; work on exhibit list; review documents; telephone call with Ms. Sparks; review deposition of Mr. Webb, etc.	8.00
06/15/10	Hernandez	Continue to review deposition transcripts and expert witness reports, dictate proposed findings of fact	5.00
06/15/10	Whiting	Review files; gather and retrieve plaintiffs' trial exhibits	6.70
06/15/10	Lolli	Attend and take notes at deposition of Mr. Seemes; conference with Ms. Galles	6.00
06/16/10	Hernandez	Trial preparation, review and organize exhibits, prepare for direct and cross examinations	7.50
06/16/10	Lolli	Research standard for granting title IX permanent injunction	0.50
06/16/10	Orleans	Trial preparation	8.50
06/16/10	LeBel Lasse	Confer with Ms. Whiting re: availability for meeting with Mr. Orleans, discussion re: pretrial order and preliminary exhibits; review Judge Underhill's chambers practices and joint pretrial order	0.50
06/16/10	Whiting	Finish compiling set of defendant's exhibits; office conference with Ms. LeBel-Lasse regarding trial preparations; e-mail to Mr. Orleans regarding same; review Pre-Trial Order	0.80
06/16/10	Lolli	Prepare expert witness for deposition/trial testimony; discuss permanent injunction research; research standard for granting Title IX permanent injunction	2.00
06/17/10	Whiting	Office conference with Mr. Orleans, Mr. Hernandez and Ms. LeBel-Lasse to coordinate trial preparations	0.80

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
06/17/10	Whiting	Travel to courthouse with Mr. Orleans, Mr. Hernandez and Ms. LeBel-Lasse to speak with courthouse staff concerning logistics of securing room for witnesses, working with ELMO and other trial issues	1.00
06/17/10	LeBel Lasse	Meet with Mr. Orleans, Mr. Hernandez and Ms. Whiting re: preparation for trial; meet with IT personnel to arrange for laptop, wireless card and electronic copy of case database; travel to Bridgeport Federal Courthouse and meet with Judge Underhill's Courtroom Deputy and Information Technology person to discuss logistics of equipment and arrangements for trial; review plaintiff's trial exhibits pulled by Ms. Whiting; meet with Mr. Orleans to discuss use of original exhibits used in Preliminary Injunction hearing; instruct copy center re: copies of exhibits and binders for same, discuss arrangements for courier to deliver boxes to courthouse on Monday; meet with Mr. Orleans re: revisions to exhibit list; revise exhibit list and locate additional exhibits to be included in same; arrange for work center to prepare exhibit labels; confer with Ms. Whiting re: revisions to exhibit list, exhibits, binders, marking exhibits and arrangements for trial; send e-mail to Mr. Orleans re: revised exhibit list and exhibit tabs; telephone conference with Mr. Orleans re: same	7.00
06/17/10	Orleans	Trial preparation; revise exhibit lists; courtroom technology orientation; telephone calls with Mr. Seeley, Mr. McDonald, Mr. Brill and Ms. Lakowski; etc.	9.10
06/17/10	Hernandez	Draft edit and revise proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law, trial brief	4.50
06/18/10	Whiting	Prepare trial exhibits	8.60
06/18/10	Lolli	Research re standard for granting permanent injunction in a title IX case	3.00
06/18/10	Hernandez	Witness preparation	1.00
06/18/10	Hernandez	Trial preparation	7.50
06/18/10	Orleans	Trial preparation; telephone conference with court and counsel re: privilege dispute; revise exhibit list; conference with Ms. Sparks, etc.	9.00
06/18/10	LeBel Lasse	Review e-mails received from Mr. Orleans, print and review revised exhibit list; confer with Ms. Whiting re: additional items on list and pages to be pulled from the staff handbook exhibits, discussion re: laptop and arrangements for copy of case database; review e-mail from Mr. Orleans re: oversized color exhibit; confer with IT and mailroom re: arrangements for oversized color copies; arrange for vendor to print oversized exhibit and copies of same; e-mail exchanges with Mr. Orleans concerning various documents for trial; review defendant's trial exhibit list and assemble notebooks containing same, pull additional trial exhibits from Summation database; meet with Mr. Orleans re: trial preparation	7.00
06/19/10	Hernandez	Trial preparation	6.30
06/19/10	Orleans	Trial preparation	8.50

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
06/19/10	LeBel Lasse	Review e-mails received from Mr. Orleans; e-mail exchange with Mr. Orleans re: arrangements for assistance with trial preparation; telephone conference with Ms. Whiting to arrange for assistance early Monday morning before trial	0.30
06/20/10	Orleans	Trial preparation; meet with clients; prepare examinations; review documents, etc.	10.00
06/20/10	Hernandez	Trial preparation, exhibits, witnesses and pleadings	8.00
06/21/10	Hernandez	Trial preparation and trial	12.00
06/21/10	LeBel Lasse	Assist Mr. Orleans with trial preparation; attend and assist at trial	7.00
06/21/10	Whiting	Prepare additional exhibits to be added to exhibit list; attend and assist at trial	12.00
06/21/10	Orleans	Trial and preparation for trial	14.60
06/22/10	Orleans	Trial and trial preparation	13.50
06/22/10	Hernandez	Trial preparation and trial	12.00
06/22/10	Whiting	Prepare materials needed by Mr. Orleans for use at trial; file Plaintiffs' Trial Exhibit List; attend and assist at trial	10.00
06/22/10	LeBel Lasse	Review and respond to e-mail from Ms. Whiting re: trial; arrange for lunch delivery to court house for counsel and witnesses	0.20
06/23/10	Whiting	Review and edit trial notes	1.70
06/23/10	Whiting	Prepare additional materials needed by Mr. Orleans for trial; assist and attend trial	5.00
06/23/10	Whiting	Review Plaintiffs' and Defendant's exhibit lists; compile list of exhibits admitted at trial thus far	0.50
06/23/10	Hernandez	Trial preparation and trial	11.50
06/23/10	Orleans	Trial and trial preparation; work on trial brief and closing arguments	10.00
06/24/10	Hernandez	Trial preparation and trial; draft and edit pleadings	9.50
06/24/10	Whiting	Prepare additional materials needed by Mr. Orleans; attend and assist at trial	4.80
06/24/10	Whiting	Review and edit trial notes	2.70
06/24/10	Orleans	Trial; work on trial brief; prepare for closing argument	13.00
06/25/10	Hernandez	Trial preparation and trial; review and edit trial brief; post trial meeting with clients	7.00
06/25/10	Orleans	Closing argument; revise and file trial brief	6.00
06/25/10	Whiting	Create demonstrative for use in closing arguments; attend closing arguments	4.40
06/29/10	Orleans	Organize file	2.00
06/30/10	Orleans	Conference with Ms. LaRoche; e-mail with Mr. Yaster and counsel; review supplemental brief of QU; draft response to supplemental brief	1.90

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
07/01/10	Orleans	Revise and file response to QU supplemental brief	2.00
07/01/10	LeBel Lasse	Forward signed authorization letter and invoices to Mr. Sacramone for payment	0.10
07/01/10	Whiting	Telephone call to Judge Underhill's clerk to request copy of list of exhibits admitted at trial; telephone call to and message for Susan Catucci regarding trial transcript; brief telephone conference with Mr. Orleans regarding same	0.20
07/01/10	Hernandez	Review, revise and edit Plaintiffs' response to Defendant's supplemental trial brief	1.20
07/06/10	Whiting	Organize trial files and boxes	0.70
07/06/10	Orleans	Review of exhibit lists; e-mail to Ms. Friedfel	0.40
07/07/10	Orleans	Review press reports re trial (.4); e-mail to Ms. Sbalbi re exhibit list (.2)	0.60
07/08/10	Orleans	Email to Ms. Sbalbi re exhibit list	0.10
07/14/10	Orleans	Telephone call with Mr. Webb	0.20
07/21/10	Orleans	Review decision (1.0); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (0.2); attention to media inquiries (2.5)	3.70
07/21/10	Hernandez	Read and analyze decision and order of Court finding for Plaintiffs	2.30
07/21/10	Hernandez	Review, edit and confer on press release regarding decision and order of district court	0.70
07/22/10	Orleans	Attention to media requests for information (3.1); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks (.3); telephone conference with Mr. Brill (.3)	3.70
07/23/10	Orleans	Office conference with Mr. Hernandez re settlement strategy, etc. (.8); telephone call with Indiana reporter (.4); telephone call with Ms. Sparks (.2); miscellaneous correspondence (.3)	1.70
07/23/10	Hernandez	Confer with Mr. Orleans regarding proposed resolution of case, application for attorneys' fees, follow up issues to address with clients	0.80
07/26/10	Hernandez	Research and draft motion for award of costs and attorneys fees	3.00
07/26/10	Orleans	Telephone call with Ms. Sparks (.4); review decision (.5); e-mail with Mr. Brill (.1)	1.00
07/27/10	Orleans	Review of decision granting preliminary injunction (1.0); telephone call with Mr. Brill (.3); review of e-mails from Ms. Sparks (.2)	1.50
07/28/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference with Mr. Orleans regarding proposed settlement of claims against Quinnipiac University	0.10
07/28/10	Orleans	E-mail to Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles re settlement (.7); review of e-mails (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Hernandez	1.00
07/29/10	Hernandez	Conference call with clients, Attorney Galles and Mr. Orleans regarding proposed settlement by counsel for defendant	1.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		Quinnipiac University	
07/29/10	Orleans	Telephone conference with Ms. Galles, Ms. Sparks, Mr. Hernandez (1.0); research re time to appeal and time to file motion for fees (1.3); e-mail with Mr. Brill (.1)	2.40
07/29/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Galles re deposition invoice (0.4)	0.40
07/31/10	Orleans	E-mail to Mr. Brill re settlement	0.40
08/04/10	Hernandez	Review, edit and revise motion for attorney's fees	0.20
08/04/10	Orleans	Research regarding time to file motion for fees (0.8); revise and file motion (0.5)	1.30
08/05/10	Orleans	Telephone call with Mr. Brill	0.30
08/06/10	Orleans	E-mail to client and co-counsel re call with Mr. Brill	0.30
08/09/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Sparks re use of gym	0.30
08/10/10	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Sparks re use of gym	0.10
08/11/10	Orleans	Review of QU Compliance Plan (.4); e-mails and telephone calls with co-counsel and Ms. Sparks (.5)	0.90
08/11/10	Hernandez	Review and discuss Defendant Quinnipiac University's proposed compliance plan, forward to co-counsel and client Robin Sparks	0.50
08/12/10	Orleans	Telephone call with Mr. DelVecchio re deposition transcript (.2); correspondence to Mr. DelVecchio (.2); e-mails with Ms. Sparks and Ms. Galles (.2)	0.60
08/13/10	Orleans	Telephone call with Mr. Brill (.4); e-mails with co-counsel and Ms. Sparks (.3)	0.70
08/16/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Galles and Ms. Sparks (.2); telephone calls with Mr. Yaster (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Sparks and Mr. Hernandez (.5)	0.90
08/16/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with Mr. Orleans and client, Robin Sparks, regarding plaintiffs' response to defendant's proposed compliance plan	0.70
08/17/10	Orleans	E-mails with Mr. Brill re scheduling and stipulation (.8); e-mails with Ms. Sparks re QU press release (.2)	1.00
08/18/10	Orleans	Revise and file motion to approve stipulation re: scheduling	0.40
08/19/10	LeBel Lasse	Review e-mail from Ms. Perkins regarding invoice from vendor; send e-mail to Merrill Corporation requesting that invoice be changed to reflect correct name; review response from vendor	0.30
08/19/10	Orleans	E-mail to Mr. Yaster	0.10
08/20/10	Orleans	Draft response to proposed compliance plan (1.0); telephone call to Ms. Sanders (.1)	1.10
08/23/10	Orleans	E-mails with Attorney Galles re response to compliance plan (.4); draft declaration re attorney fees (.5)	0.90
08/24/10	Orleans	Research re class action settlement procedures (.4); revise declaration (.3); telephone call with Ms. Sanders (.2); e-mail to	1.80

<u>Date</u>	<u>Professional</u>		<u>Hours</u>
		counsel (.2); research re motion for fees (.7)	
08/25/10	Orleans	E-mails with Ms. Galles (.4); telephone calls with Mr. Tropp re: motion for fees (.4); draft declaration of Mr. Tropp (.4); revise Orleans declaration (.2)	1.40
08/26/10	Hernandez	Review communications from co-counsel and ECF notices regarding status of appeal to Second Circuit	0.30
08/26/10	Orleans	Review of appellate rules and procedures (.6); review appeal pleadings (.3); telephone call with Mr. Brill (.2); telephone call with court clerk (.2); prepare and file appearance with court of appeals (.4); e-mails with co-counsel (.2)	1.90
08/27/10	Orleans	Preparation of supporting materials for attorney fees application	0.40
08/31/10	Hernandez	Review communications from client and co-counsel, proposed motion supplement for attorney's fees	0.70
09/07/10	Orleans	E-mails with Mr. Hernandez; review draft of response to compliance plan	0.30
09/07/10	Hernandez	Exchange communications with Ms. Friedfel and Mr. Orleans, draft and file motion for extension of time to respond to defendant's proposal	0.30
09/08/10	Orleans	Office conference with Mr. Hernandez	0.20
09/14/10	Orleans	E-mail with Ms. Galles	0.20
09/15/10	Hernandez	Review NCAA team add and drop and sponsorship statistics for women's rugby and golf, co-counsel's recommended changes to Plaintiff's response to proposal, revise and edit	1.70
09/15/10	Hernandez	Telephone conference call with co-counsel regarding submission of plaintiffs' response to defendant's proposal and strategy for settlement conference with magistrate and district judges	0.40
09/15/10	Orleans	Review of e-mail from Ms. Sparks (.2); telephone conference with Ms. Galles (.3); drafting and revising response to QU compliance plan (2.2)	2.70
09/16/10	Hernandez	Revise, edit Plaintiffs' response to defendant's compliance proposal	0.50
09/16/10	Orleans	Revise and file response to proposed compliance plan	2.50

Professional Summary

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Alex V. Hernandez	Partner	492.00
Jonathan B. Orleans	Partner	345.40
Jonathan B. Orleans	Partner	447.00

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Assaf Ben-Atar	Associate	62.10
Randi Haraj-Sai	Associate	49.10
Carrie L. Larson	Associate	4.50
Andrew T. Lolli	Associate	11.50
Adam S. Mocchiolo	Associate	0.80
Patricia LeBel Lasse	Paralegal	41.80
Victoria L. Schneider	Paralegal	43.80
Susanne E. Scroggin	Paralegal	1.00
Amy L. Whiting	Paralegal	107.70

Disbursements

	Amount
Copy Expense	9,485.70
Long Distance Telephone Exp.	131.72
On-line Legal Research	
Facsimile Transmission Expense	6.00
Filing Fees	375.00
Messenger Service	46.70
Witness Fees	68.08
Deposition	8,338.93
Express Mail	198.09
Outside Copy Charges	1,453.42
Travel and related expenses	25.50
Transcripts	4,780.18
External Telephone Charge	229.05
Business Lunch	639.32
Conference Call	294.25
Postage	10.20
Total Disbursements	\$ 26,082.14