

EXHIBIT 26

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & PROSSER P.A.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

B. MICHAELBACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
AMANDA E. CHAZAL
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART
MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
DON M. STICHTER
SCOTT A. STICHTER

TAMPA & FORT MYERS
110 E. MADISON STREET
SUITE 200
TAMPA, FLORIDA
33602-4700
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 COLONIAL BLVD
SUITE H57
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA
33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

June 07, 2013

www.srbp.com

Of Counsel
RICHARD C. PROSSER

Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve**INVOICE**

Matter: 1

Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve

Client: 12533

For Professional Services Rendered:

02/01/2013	HER	Emails and telephone conference with Michael Lamont regarding Vernon Lee case.	0.50
02/03/2013	HER	Memo to file and to Susan Sharp regarding background and issues in Lee Chapter 13 case.	0.50
02/07/2013	HER	Work on engagement letter and emails with Michael Lamont regarding same.	0.50
02/11/2013	HER	Communications with Michael Lamont and Susan Sharp regarding Lee case.	0.40
02/11/2013	SHS	Receipt of memo and communications with Harley Riedel regarding Lee Chapter 13 case.	0.20
02/12/2013	HER	Review of email from Michael Lamont regarding strategy; review of Susan Sharp's reply thereto.	0.20
02/12/2013	SHS	Additional telephone call with Michael Lamont and brief review of docket and pleadings filed in case.	0.40
02/12/2013	SHS	Dictate notice of appearance.	0.20
02/12/2013	SHS	Telephone conference with Michael Lamont regarding Vernon Lee Chapter 13 filing.	0.60
02/13/2013	SHS	Finalize notice of appearance.	0.20
02/13/2013	SHS	Initial research on issue of exceeding 109(e) debt limit where final judgment is scheduled as contingent, and telephone conferences with Michael Lamont regarding the same.	2.00
02/14/2013	SHS	Receipt and review of ECF activity in Vernon Lee case and draft email to Michael Lamont regarding the same.	0.20
02/19/2013	HER	Review of Susan Sharp's email to Michael Lamont regarding draft motion seeking to annul the stay.	0.10
02/19/2013	RMB	Conference with Susan Sharp and Michael Hooi regarding receiver and appeal issue.	0.40
02/19/2013	SHS	Research issue relating to filing notice of appeal and violation of automatic stay and draft email to Michael Lamont regarding the same.	3.50
02/19/2013	SHS	Work on Motion to dismiss and research same, telephone conferences with client regarding the same.	1.70
02/20/2013	HER	Emails with Michael Lamont regarding appeal issues; communications with Susan Sharp regarding same; review of draft of motion for relief from stay and related emails between Ms. Sharp and Mr. Lamont.	0.40
02/20/2013	SHS	Brief office conference with Harley Riedel regarding stay and appeal.	0.20

02/20/2013	SHS	Telephone call with Michael Lamont regarding appeal and stay issues.	0.30
02/20/2013	SHS	Telephone call to chambers regarding hearing on emergency motion.	0.20
02/20/2013	SHS	Additional telephone call with clients and revise motion to modify stay.	0.40
02/20/2013	SHS	Working on motion for stay relief and continued research regarding same, and draft email to Michael Lamont forwarding the same. Office conference with Susan McKee regarding certificate of necessity for emergency filing and review of same, and telephone conference with John Hightower.	2.50
02/20/2013	SM	Conferences with Susan Sharp, drafting of certificate of necessity, filing of emergency stay motion and certificate and service of motion; drafting of notice of hearing, filing and service of same.	0.80
02/21/2013	SHS	Review and respond to email from Ms. Murphy regarding proposed order.	0.10
02/21/2013	SHS	Review and respond to email from James Elliott regarding proposed order on stay modification.	0.10
02/21/2013	SHS	Attend hearing on emergency motion to modify stay and follow up with client regarding the same.	1.30
02/21/2013	SHS	Work on draft of order approving modification of stay, draft emails to client and opposing counsel, draft email to Kim Murphy regarding proposed order in advance of hearing.	1.20
02/22/2013	SHS	Follow up call to chambers regarding docketing of order for stay relief, check docket for same and draft email to Michael Lamont regarding the same.	0.30
02/22/2013	SHS	Work on motion to dismiss.	1.10
02/25/2013	SHS	Telephone conference with Michael Lamont regarding dismissal strategy and conversion.	0.80
02/25/2013	SHS	Review email from Michael Lamont regarding revisions to draft of motion to dismiss. Telephone conference with Gianluca Morello regarding motion to dismiss and strategy issues.	0.70
02/25/2013	SHS	Work on revisions to motion to dismiss, review documents from Gianluca Morello regarding undisclosed assets and transfers and email revised draft to Michael Lamont and Gianluca Morello.	1.00
02/28/2013	SHS	Receipt and review of ECF, review and respond to email from client regarding hearing, and chambers regarding hearing date.	0.30

Total Professional Services Rendered \$6,617.00

For Disbursements Incurred:

02/20/2013	U.S. Bankruptcy Court; Court Costs to file Motion for Relief from Stay.	\$176.00
Total Expenses Incurred		\$176.00

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Riedel, Harley E.	2.60	\$1,235.00
Blain, Russell M.	0.40	\$184.00
Sharp, Susan	19.50	\$5,070.00
McKee, Susan	0.80	\$128.00
Total For Professional Services Rendered		\$6,617.00
Adjusted Services Total		\$6,617.00
Professional Services		\$6,617.00
Disbursements		\$176.00
Total New Charges This Invoice		\$6,793.00

Previous Balance \$8,400.48
Less Payments Received (\$0.00)

Less Adjustments	\$8,400.48 CR
Outstanding Balance	\$0.00
New Charges This Invoice	\$6,793.00
Total Due	\$6,793.00

Bill # 32305

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You