

EXHIBIT 4

Wiand Guerra King P.L.

5505 West Gray Street

Tampa, FL 33609

Telephone: 813-347-5100

Facsimile: 813-347-5198

Federal Tax ID # 27-0937962

Burton W. Wiand
Attention: Burton W. Wiand
Wiand Guerra King, P.L.
5505 W. Gray Street
Tampa, FL 33609

June 14, 2013
Client: 025305
Matter: 090245
Invoice #: 5322

Page: 1

RE: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

For Professional Services Rendered Through February 28, 2013

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
	ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery		
10/3/2012	BWW	Review our opposition to motion to dismiss (.5); telephone conference with Mr. Price regarding Nadel issues (.3); emails to investors regarding IRS delays (.2); preparation of email to IRS (.2).	1.2	\$420.00
10/4/2012	BWW	Receipt of email from IRS regarding status (.2); telephone conference with Mr. Price regarding same (.4); office conference with G. Morello regarding same (.4); office conference re: Bonds.com transfer (.3).	1.3	\$455.00
10/5/2012	BWW	Review and revise Plaintiff's opposition to defendant's motion to dismiss Counts I-V of the first amended complaint and strike certain general allegations therein (1.0); telephone conference to discuss opposition to motion with S. Keefe and J. Cohen (.5).	1.5	\$525.00
10/9/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo, Mr. Montgomery and Mr. Hall regarding transfer of Bonds.com group certificate and medallion stamp (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
10/10/2012	BWW	Telephone conference with Mr. Price and N. Ridenour (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
10/11/2012	BWW	Office conference with M. Lamont regarding Tradewind objections (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
10/15/2012	BWW	Exchange correspondence with R. Jernigan regarding hangars and North Carolina buildings (.5).	0.5	\$175.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
10/23/2012	BWW	Office conferences regarding computers (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
10/24/2012	BWW	Telephone conference with J. Maglich regarding Vermont property (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
10/25/2012	BWW	Review and revise motion for leave to pay arbitrator's hourly fees directly from Receivership Estate (.4); communications with G. Morello regarding same (.3).	0.7	\$245.00
10/26/2012	BWW	Review and revise motion for possession of Vermont property (.4); review and revise declaration in support (.6).	1.0	\$350.00
10/29/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding Vermont property (.2); review and revise fifth motion for reappointment (.2).	0.4	\$140.00
10/31/2012	BWW	Review and make final revisions to motion for possession of Vermont property and declaration in support (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
11/5/2012	BWW	Exchange correspondence regarding Upper Bear Creek (1.0); attention to Evergreen, CO property (1.0); review information related to LaBellasara condo (.5); communications regarding Vermont property (.2).	2.7	\$945.00
11/6/2012	BWW	Correspondence regarding real estate with J. Rizzo (.5); exchange correspondence regarding possible suit against Anne Nadel (.5).	1.0	\$350.00
11/7/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding disposition of computer equipment (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
11/8/2012	BWW	Telephone conference with G. Burns regarding distribution of funds (.2); prepare email to J. Rizzo and G. Morello regarding distribution (.2); email with R. Jernigan regarding sale of computers (.3); telephone conference with R. Jernigan (.5).	1.2	\$420.00
11/9/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding S. King's offer for the tug (.4); exchange correspondence regarding same (.2).	0.6	\$210.00
11/12/2012	BWW	Exchange correspondence with R. Jernigan regarding Fruitville Rd (.3); consider real estate issues with J. Rizzo (.3); correspond with R. Jernigan regarding tug (.3); correspond with J. Cohen (.3); correspond with R. Jernigan regarding Merlin III turbo proposition (.5); office conference with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding Evergreen, Colorado property (.3).	2.0	\$700.00
11/13/2012	BWW	Receipt and review of motion for distribution (.6); office conference with G. Morello regarding same (.3); office conference with M. Lamont regarding same (.3); conference call with J. Cohen regarding status of discovery motions and motion to dismiss discovery related to pending distribution (.3); considered matters related to distribution (.3).	1.8	\$630.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
11/14/2012	BWW	Meeting with R. Jernigan and J. Rizzo regarding status of disposition of assets (1.3).	1.3	\$455.00
11/15/2012	BWW	Communicate with G. Morello, J. Rizzo, and G. Guerra regarding potential sale of Evergreen, Colorado property (.1); review materials regarding Evergreen, Colorado property (.5).	0.6	\$210.00
11/26/2012	BWW	Communications with G. Morello regarding tax refunds (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
11/27/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
11/28/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind (.2); review communication regarding Evergreen, Colorado offer (.2).	0.4	\$140.00
11/29/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo and brokers regarding Evergreen, Colorado property and Tradewind offers (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
11/30/2012	BWW	Communications with G. Morello regarding motion for possession of Vermont property (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
12/3/2012	BWW	Office conference with R. Jernigan and brokers regarding Evergreen, Colorado property (.5); communications with G. Morello and S. Masel regarding consent and final judgment (.4).	0.9	\$315.00
12/4/2012	BWW	Conference with J. Rizzo regarding Evergreen agreement (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
12/5/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding offers on Tradewind (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
12/6/2012	BWW	Office conference with R. Jernigan and brokers regarding potential sales of Evergreen, Colorado and Tradewind properties (.2); communication with Mr. Swicegood, G. Morello and R. Jernigan regarding auction (.3).	0.5	\$175.00
12/7/2012	BWW	Office communication with R. Jernigan and brokers regarding potential sales of Evergreen, Colorado property (.2); office conference regarding Purchase and Sale Agreement (.2).	0.4	\$140.00
12/12/2012	BWW	Prepare emails to T. Smiljanich regarding Wells Fargo (.5); correspondence with J. Rizzo regarding Upper Bear Creek (.4).	0.9	\$315.00
12/17/2012	BWW	Review correspondence regarding MAM shares (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
1/2/2013	BWW	Telephone conference with J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind hangars (.2); communicate with J. Rizzo regarding sale of Evergreen property (.1).	0.3	\$105.00
1/3/2013	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind hangars (.3).	0.3	\$105.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET		Asset Analysis and Recovery		
1/9/2013	BWW	Communicate with J. Rizzo regarding Colorado property (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
1/11/2013	BWW	Review Colorado newsletter (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
1/15/2013	BWW	Emails with R. Jernigan re: Evergreen house (.3); review documents (.5).	0.8	\$280.00
1/17/2013	BWW	Communication with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding counter-offer for Evergreen, Colorado property (.3); exchange emails with R. Jernigan regarding Laurel Preserve (.4); review sworn statement for Valhalla's MAM shares located in unclaimed property (.2).	0.9	\$315.00
1/18/2013	BWW	Exchange correspondence with R. Jernigan regarding B. Kimpton (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
1/22/2013	BWW	Communicate with J. Rizzo regarding marketing plan (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
1/23/2013	BWW	Attention to brief edits (1.2); communication with J. Cohen regarding same (.3).	1.9	\$665.00
1/24/2013	BWW	Communicate with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding sale of Evergreen property (.4); office conference with J. Rizzo regarding same (.2).	0.6	\$210.00
1/25/2013	BWW	Office conference with M. Lamont (.3); office conference with J. Rizzo (.3).	0.6	\$210.00
2/4/2013	BWW	Exchange correspondence regarding hangars with R. Jernigan (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
2/11/2013	BWW	Communications with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding Evergreen, Colorado property (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
2/12/2013	BWW	Attention to purchase agreement for Colorado property (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
2/15/2013	BWW	Telephone conferences and emails with J. Cohen regarding Wells Fargo case (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
2/18/2013	BWW	Attention to liquidation of MAMs shares (.8); exchange correspondence with D. Mitchell regarding MAMs shares (.3); conference with J. Rizzo regarding same (.2).	1.3	\$455.00
2/19/2013	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding Colorado property and closing instructions and completion of documentation (.7); attention to administration of Receivership with J. Rizzo (checks, etc.) (.3).	1.0	\$350.00
2/19/2013	BWW	Participate in telephone conference with S. Keefe, D. Cimo, D. Stermer, J. Cohen and T. Mossana (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
Total: Asset Analysis and Recovery			36.90	\$12,915.00
BUSIN		Business Operations		

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
BUSIN	Business Operations			
10/1/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding stop payment on checks (.4); attention to administrative items and emails with R. Jernigan (.2).	0.6	\$210.00
10/4/2012	BWW	Attention to wire transfers with Bay Cities Bank (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
10/5/2012	BWW	Attention to administrative tasks and administration of documents (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
10/10/2012	BWW	Attention to administrative tasks (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
10/16/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding administrative matters (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
11/7/2012	BWW	Office conference regarding payment of RWJ invoices (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
11/9/2012	BWW	Attention to administrative matters (checks, etc.) (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
11/13/2012	BWW	Communication with J. Rizzo regarding bank consolidation (.9); various communications with R. Jernigan and J. Rizzo related to administrative issues (.6).	1.5	\$525.00
11/19/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding Bay Cities Bank (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
12/12/2012	BWW	Attention to administrative issues (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
12/13/2012	BWW	Review and sign checks (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
12/14/2012	BWW	Communication with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding extension of Tradewind lease (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
12/14/2012	BWW	Communication with J. Rizzo regarding extension of Tradewind lease (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
12/19/2012	BWW	Communication with R. Jernigan regarding Newnan-Coweta (.2); communication with J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind invoices (.1).	0.3	\$105.00
12/21/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding vendors (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
1/9/2013	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind insurance renewal (.4); attention to administrative matters (.3).	0.7	\$245.00
1/14/2013	BWW	Review and execute checks (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
1/14/2013	BWW	Office conference regarding stop payments request (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
1/25/2013	BWW	Telephone conference with R. Jernigan regarding loans (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
2/4/2013	BWW	Attention to administrative matters (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
2/7/2013	BWW	Office meeting with R. Jernigan regarding administrative signatures, checks, etc (2.0).	2.0	\$700.00
2/11/2013	BWW	Attention to administrative matters (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
BUSIN		Business Operations		
Total: Business Operations			12.90	\$4,515.00
CASE		Case Administration		
10/16/2012	BWW	Office conference with M. Lockwood regarding interim report (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
10/17/2012	BWW	Review correspondence regarding interim report (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
10/22/2012	BWW	Review of interim report and email revisions to M. Lockwood (2.0).	2.0	\$700.00
10/23/2012	BWW	Review and revise interim report (2.0).	2.0	\$700.00
12/4/2012	BWW	Office conferences with M. Lamont and G. Morello regarding interim report (2.0); review interim report (4.0).	6.0	\$2,100.00
12/14/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding Order on Motion (.2); office conference with M. Lamont and G. Morello regarding same (.3).	0.5	\$175.00
2/12/2013	BWW	Office conference with M. Lockwood regarding informational returns (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
Total: Case Administration			11.10	\$3,885.00
CLAIM		Claims Administration and Objections		
10/4/2012	BWW	Office conference with M. Lockwood regarding second distribution (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
10/31/2012	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo and M. Gura regarding claims distribution (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
11/13/2012	BWW	Office conference with M. Lockwood regarding distribution motion (.3); review motion for distribution and exhibits (1.5); review and comment on correspondence to claimants regarding distribution (.3).	2.1	\$735.00
11/15/2012	BWW	Correspondence with claimants regarding distribution (.5); office conference with G. Morello regarding claimant questions (.5).	1.0	\$350.00
11/16/2012	BWW	Receipt and review Order from Judge approving second investor distribution (1.0); office conferences regarding same (.2); preparation of second distribution press release (.8).	2.0	\$700.00
11/19/2012	BWW	Office conference with M. Gura regarding second distribution checks (.6); review distribution checks (.5).	1.1	\$385.00
11/27/2012	BWW	Office conference with M. Gura regarding stop payments (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
12/4/2012	BWW	Office conference with M. Lockwood regarding claims (.3); further office conferences regarding claims issues (1.0).	1.3	\$455.00

June 14, 2013

Client: 025305

Matter: 090245

Invoice #: 5322

Page: 7

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
CLAIM	CLAIMS	Claims Administration and Objections		
12/4/2012	BWW	Office conference regarding stop payment issue with numerous individuals (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
12/4/2012	BWW	Office conference with M. Lockwood regarding distribution claims and procedures regarding reissuance of checks (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
12/6/2012	BWW	Communication with M. Gura regarding stop payment (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
1/18/2013	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding claimant (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
Total: Claims Administration and Objections			9.70	\$3,395.00
Total Professional Services			70.6	\$24,710.00
Total Services			\$24,710.00	
Total Current Charges				\$24,710.00
Previous Balance				\$28,035.00
Less Payments				(\$28,035.00)
PAY THIS AMOUNT				\$24,710.00

TASK RECAP

Services

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
NADEL - ASSET	36.9	\$12,915.00
NADEL - BUSIN	12.9	\$4,515.00
NADEL - CASE	11.1	\$3,885.00
NADEL - CLAIM	9.7	\$3,395.00
	<u>70.60</u>	<u>\$24,710.00</u>

Disbursements

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	<u>\$0.00</u>

BREAKDOWN BY PERSON

<u>Person</u>	<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
BWW Burton W. Wiand	NADEL - ASSET	36.9	\$12,915.00
BWW Burton W. Wiand	NADEL - BUSIN	12.9	\$4,515.00
BWW Burton W. Wiand	NADEL - CASE	11.1	\$3,885.00
BWW Burton W. Wiand	NADEL - CLAIM	9.7	\$3,395.00
		<u>70.60</u>	<u>\$24,710.00</u>