

EXHIBIT 27

REMINER CO., L.P.A.

101 West Prospect Avenue, Suite 1400
Cleveland, Ohio 44115
(216) 687-1311
Fax (216) 687-1841
Fed. Tax ID 34-1101394

Burton Wiand
Wiand Guerra King
5505 W. Gray Street
Tampa, FL 33609

September 19, 2013
Client/Matter No. 8589.73175
Statement No. 1122511087

Re: Burton Wiand v. Brian L. Meeker
Claim No.: n/a

**INTERIM STATEMENT SUMMARY
Through August 31, 2013**

Services Rendered	\$2,254.50
Disbursements	64.20
CURRENT STATEMENT	\$2,318.70

REMITTANCE PAGE

Please return this page with your payment
Remit to address in above letterhead

REMINGER CO., L.P.A.

101 West Prospect Avenue, Suite 1400
Cleveland, Ohio 44115
(216) 687-1311
Fax: (216) 687-1841
Fed. Tax ID 34-1101394

Burton Wiand
Wiand Guerra King
5505 W. Gray Street
Tampa, FL 33609
727-460-4679

September 19, 2013
Client/Matter No. 8589.73175
Statement No. 1122511087

Re: Burton Wiand v. Brian L. Meeker
Claim No.: n/a

INTERIM STATEMENT FOR SERVICES RENDERED Through August 31, 2013

<u>Date</u>	<u>Atty.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Description</u>
04/02/13	DRH1	0.20	Conference with Paralegal Donna Keefe regarding particulars of asset search on real property assets owned by Brian Meeker in preparation for further handling of collection efforts and assessment of strategy for execution of collection efforts.
04/03/13	JBS	1.80	Receipt and analytical review of deposition transcript of Brian Meeker for analysis of potential collection activity.
04/03/13	JBS	1.20	Analytical review of Ohio case law regarding execution on personal assets of trustee where judgment is rendered against name of trust.
04/04/13	JBS	1.10	Analytical review of deposition transcript of Brian L. Meeker to evaluate trust assets.
04/05/13	DRH1	0.30	Conference with attorney Stalzer regarding strategy for further handling of collection against Brian Meeker Trust and particulars of time for appeal in federal court before an exemplified copy of judgment can be obtained for transfer to another district court.
04/08/13	DRH1	0.10	Receipt and review of correspondence from Jordan Maglich regarding approval of strategy for further handling of file and notice of Brian Meeker's filing of appeal.
04/08/13	DRH1	0.10	Correspondence to Jordan Maglich regarding attempts to obtain certification of judgment and impact of filing of appeal on further handling of collection efforts.
04/08/13	JBS	0.50	Receipt and review of correspondence from Jordan Maglich regarding agreement with recommendations for further handling, obtaining certified copy of judgment, and exhibits to the deposition transcript of Brian Meeker.

<u>Date</u>	<u>Atty.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Description</u>
04/09/13	DRH1	0.10	Receipt and review of correspondence from Jordan Maglich, regarding exhibits to Brian Meeker deposition in preparation for further handling of collection activities and determination of trust assets.
04/09/13	DRH1	0.40	Summary review of exhibits to Brian Meeker deposition in preparation for further handling of file and collection efforts.
04/11/13	AJD	0.20	Review/analyze file re: case status, identification of critical dates, and review of strategies re: collection efforts.
07/22/13	AJD	0.10	Review/analyze file re: case status, identification of critical dates, and strategies.
08/02/13	AJD	0.10	Receipt and review correspondence from Mr. Maglich re: dismissal of Mr. Meeker's appeal.
08/02/13	JBS	0.20	Receipt and review of correspondence from Jordan Maglich regarding dismissal of Meeker's appeal in Florida and further handling of certification for registration in foreign district.
08/02/13	JBS	0.30	Receipt and analytical review of correspondence from Jeffrey Rizzo regarding handling of transfer of judgment to Northern District of Ohio including clarification of form needed to file judgment in Ohio.
08/06/13	JBS	0.10	Receipt and review of correspondence from Jeffrey Rizzo regarding completed certification of foreign judgment form and parameters of further handling.
08/19/13	HG	0.20	Analytical review of USDC Northern District of Ohio online procedure for transferring a foreign judgment.
08/19/13	HG	0.30	Extended conference with the Clerk of Courts for the USDC Northern District of Ohio regarding procedure for transferring a foreign judgment, and regarding collections procedures.
08/19/13	HG	0.10	Preparation of USDC Civil Case Cover Sheet in preparation for transfer of foreign judgment.
08/19/13	HG	0.10	Correspondence to Clerk of Courts for the USDC Northern District of Ohio regarding transfer of a foreign judgment from the USDC for the Middle District of Florida in preparation for collections proceedings.
08/19/13	JBS	0.20	Preparation and review of materials for opening case.
08/22/13	JBS	0.10	Correspondence to Jordan Maglich regarding status of effort to transfer judgment and parameters of further handling.

<u>Date</u>	<u>Atty.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Description</u>
08/22/13	JBS	0.20	Receipt and review of correspondence from Jordan Maglich regarding strategy for further execution.
08/28/13	JBS	0.30	Extended conference with Jordan Maglich regarding strategy for discovery and further handling.
08/28/13	JBS	0.40	Receipt and analytical review of proposed discovery to Brian Meeker from Jordan Maglich.
08/28/13	JBS	0.20	Receipt and review of correspondence from Jordan Maglich regarding Meeker's position regarding trust.

SERVICES SUMMARY

<u>Atty.</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Position</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
AJD	Dorman, Andrew J	Partner	0.40	275.00	110.00
DRH1	Hudson, David R.	Associate	1.20	225.00	270.00
HG	Grabowy, Heather	Paralegal	0.70	85.00	59.50
JBS	Stalzer, John B	Partner	6.60	275.00	1,815.00
TOTAL FOR SERVICES			8.90		\$2,254.50

DISBURSEMENTS:

04/04/13	Cefaratti Litigation Support				\$18.20
08/19/13	United States District Ct, Northern District of OH; Transferring of Judgment Filing Fee; REQUEST#: 1007659				46.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS					\$64.20

STATEMENT TOTAL **\$2,318.70**