

EXHIBIT 31

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & PROSSER P.A.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

B. MICHAELBACHMAN, JR.
 RUSSELL M. BLAIN
 AMANDA E. CHAZAL
 BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
 DANIEL R. FOGARTY
 AMY DENTON HARRIS
 BARBARA A. HART
 MICHAEL J. HOOI
 ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
 STEPHEN R. LESLIE
 EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
 CHARLES A. POSTLER
 HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
 SUSAN HEATH SHARP
 DON M. STICHTER
 SCOTT A. STICHTER

TAMPA & FORT MYERS
 110 E. MADISON STREET
 SUITE 200
 TAMPA, FLORIDA
 33602-4700
 T 813.229.0144
 F 813.229.1811

1342 COLONIAL BLVD
 SUITE H57
 FORT MYERS, FLORIDA
 33907-1009
 T 239.939.5518
 F 239.939.5568

June 07, 2013

www.srbp.com

Of Counsel
 RICHARD C. PROSSER

Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve

INVOICE

Matter: 1
 Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve
 Client: 12533
 For Professional Services Rendered:

| | | | |
|------------|-----|---|------|
| 03/05/2013 | SHS | Review and respond to email from Michael Lamont. | 0.10 |
| 03/05/2013 | SHS | Conference with Michael Lamont in advance of 341 meeting and attendance at same. | 1.40 |
| 03/05/2013 | SHS | Telephone call from James Elliott regarding dismissal of case. | 0.30 |
| 03/27/2013 | SHS | Receipt and review of email from Michael Lamont, telephone call with Tonya Pitts regarding dismissal, dictate and revise agreed order to dismiss and circulate same. | 0.40 |
| 03/27/2013 | SM | Review of file, drafting of proposed order dismissing case and forwarding to Susan Sharp. | 0.20 |
| 04/01/2013 | SHS | Receipt of notice of rejection of order and follow up with case manager regarding same. | 0.30 |
| 04/02/2013 | SHS | Review and revise proposed order on dismissal. | 0.20 |
| 04/02/2013 | SHS | Draft follow up email to Tonya Pitts. Read and respond to email from Michael Lamont regarding objection to exemptions, review file and Trustee's motion to dismiss, and respond to Michael Lamont's email. | 0.50 |
| 04/04/2013 | SHS | Draft follow up email to Tonya Pitts regarding status of agreed dismissal. | 0.10 |
| 04/10/2013 | SHS | Draft follow up email to Tonya Pitts regarding status of dismissal order. | 0.10 |
| 04/11/2013 | SHS | Receipt and review of email from Tonya Pitts and respond to same, review file and forward draft of order. | 0.20 |
| 04/15/2013 | SHS | Review and respond to email from Michael Lamont regarding upcoming hearing. | 0.10 |
| 04/16/2013 | SHS | Review and respond to email from Michael Lamont regarding appearance at hearing. | 0.10 |
| 04/17/2013 | HER | Conference with Susan H. Sharp regarding results of hearing on dismissal of case. | 0.10 |
| 04/17/2013 | SHS | Prepare for hearing on motion to dismiss, attend hearing on motion to dismiss, revise order granting same, submit order to chambers, and draft follow up email to Michael Lamont regarding the same; brief conference with Harley E. Riedel regarding results of hearing. | 1.20 |
| 04/18/2013 | SHS | Telephone call from chambers regarding the status of the dismissal order, review ECF for signed order and draft email to Michael Lamont regarding the signed dismissal order. | 0.30 |

Total Professional Services Rendered

\$1,457.50

For Disbursements Incurred:

| | | |
|-------------------------|---|-----------------|
| 03/04/2013 | Westlaw Online Research for February, 2013. | \$119.08 |
| 04/09/2013 | USBC online research for 1st Quarter, 2013. | \$30.90 |
| Total Expenses Incurred | | <u>\$149.98</u> |

Recapitulation

| Name | Hours | Amount |
|--|-------|------------------------------|
| Riedel, Harley E. | 0.10 | \$47.50 |
| Sharp, Susan | 5.30 | \$1,378.00 |
| McKee, Susan | 0.20 | \$32.00 |
| Total For Professional Services Rendered | | 5.60 Hours <u>\$1,457.50</u> |
| Adjusted Services Total | | <u>\$1,457.50</u> |
| Professional Services | | \$1,457.50 |
| Disbursements | | \$149.98 |
| Total New Charges This Invoice | | <u>\$1,607.48</u> |

| | |
|--------------------------|--------------------------|
| Previous Balance | \$6,793.00 |
| Less Payments Received | <u>(\$0.00)</u> |
| Outstanding Balance | \$6,793.00 - Pd |
| New Charges This Invoice | <u>\$1,607.48</u> |
| Total Due | <u><u>\$8,400.48</u></u> |

Bill # 32306

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You