

EXHIBIT 32

SCOTT, DOUGLASS
& McCONNICO, L.L.P.
A REGISTERED LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP
ONE AMERICAN CENTER
600 CONGRESS AVENUE, 15TH FLOOR
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78701-2589

TELEPHONE (512) 495-6300
TELECOPIER (512) 474-0731

FEDERAL I.D. No. 74-1864860

BURTON W. WIAND
COURT APPOINTED RECEIVER FOR
QUEST ENERGY MANAGEMENT GROUP, INC.
WIAND GUERRA KING
5505 W. GRAY STREET
TAMPA, FL 33609

September 11, 2013
Invoice No. 217753

For Professional Services Rendered:

RE: MOTION FOR HEARING ON P-5

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
08/01/13	JKH	Call with Bryan Lauer regarding Quest P-5 renewal; Office conference with Bryan Lauer to review documents from George Guerra; Call with RRC examiner Terry Johnson and Bryan Lauer regarding recommended approval for motion for rehearing; Call with P-5 manager Tim Poe and Bryan Lauer regarding agreement to pass the motion for rehearing until the September 10, 2013 open meeting; Call with George Guerra and Bryan Lauer regarding corrective actions; Call with RRC enforcement counsel Kristi Reeve and Bryan Lauer regarding enforcement actions against Quest;	2.30
08/01/13	BDL	Prepare for call with George Guerra; Conduct call with George Guerra to discuss issues to be resolved with various Quest wells to bring them into compliance with Railroad Commission; Discuss background of case with John Hicks and tactics for gaining Railroad Commission consent to renew P-5; Conduct call with Tim Poe of Railroad Commission to discuss delaying conference consideration of P-5 renewal; Conduct call with Terry Johnson on same; Conduct call with George Guerra to discuss Commission staff's decisions and recommendation for going forward;	3.50
08/01/13	BDL	Analyze potential downside of passing on August conference with John Hicks; Research Commission rules on potential costs for renewing P-5; Analyze potential problems arising from Quest's illegal venting of H2S gas from 22 wells for P-5 renewal; Draft email to George Guerra setting out pros and cons of delaying conference to September; Conduct call with George Guerra and John Hicks to discuss same; Review Nadel plea agreement and hearing transcript; Review order appointing receiver; Review order granting motion to expand receivership;	4.00
08/02/13	JKH	Emails with Bryan Lauer regarding date for motion for rehearing being denied by operation of law; Call with Bill Black in Commissioner Craddick's office regarding scheduling of the September 2013 conferences; Call with Bryan Lauer regarding the effect of the September 10, 2013 Commissioners' Conference being canceled; Office conference with Bryan Lauer regarding strategy; Review RRC records on the two non-compliant	5.20

SCOTT, DOUGLASS & MCCONNICO, L.L.P.

MOTION FOR HEARING ON P-5
September 11, 2013

INVOICE NO. 217753
PAGE 2

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
		wells that Quest is not planning to plug; Email to Bryan Lauer regarding same; Call with George Guerra and Bryan Lauer; Call with Brian Miller regarding W-3A; Call with RRC regarding overproduction;	
08/05/13	JKH	Review email and documents from George Guerra; Call with Bryan Lauer regarding same; Emails to RRC examiner Terry Johnson and RRC enforcement counsel Kristi Reeve regarding receivership; Call with RRC examiner Terry Johnson confirming the docket has been passed until September 10 open meeting;	0.90
08/05/13	BDL	Review emails to Terry Johnson discussing Hatchett Ranch wells; Draft comments on same;	0.30
08/06/13	JKH	Meeting at RRC with RRC attorney Kristi Reeve regarding status of Quest wells and settlement of Quest enforcement docket; Call to RRC compliance analyst Eric Kittinger regarding overproduction on Quest EMG Hatchett Ranch R1; Email to Kristi Reeve regarding same;	0.50
08/07/13	JKH	Call with Kristi Reeve and Sheila Weigand at RRC regarding one time allowable to resolve the overproduction on the Hatchett Ranch Well R2; Draft letters requesting one-time allowable for the Hatchett Ranch Well R2 and Well R1; Email to George Guerra with status update on the P-5 renewal; Follow-up calls with Kristi Reeve; Review RRC severances on additional Quest leases; Review RRC's P-5 renewal database to confirm outstanding issues for renewal of Quest P-5;	3.50
08/08/13	JKH	Review email from George Guerra regarding statute; Review RRC severance records for Quest and draft note to Bryan Lauer regarding same;	0.20
08/13/13	JKH	Call with Kristi Reeve regarding the resolution of the overproduction violation on Hatchett Ranch Well No. R1;	0.10
08/19/13	JKH	Emails with Jeffrey Rizzo regarding status of one-time allowable for Hatchett Ranch Wells R1 and R2;	0.20
08/21/13	JKH	Emails with Jeffrey Rizzo regarding W-3C; Review W-3C; Review status of other wells preventing P-5 renewal; Email to George Guerra and Jeffrey Rizzo regarding same; Review requirements for signing W-3C and email same to Jeffrey Rizzo; Emails with Jeffrey Rizzo regarding H-15 non-compliance letter from RRC regarding Carter, Elwood -B- Well 1B;	1.50
08/22/13	JKH	Call from Kristi Reeve regarding Quest P-5; Review email from Jeffrey Rizzo regarding failed H-15 for the Elwood Carter -B- Well No. 1B; Call with RRC field ops and RRC district office regarding failed H-15; Email to Jeffrey Rizzo regarding same; Calls with Kristi Reeve regarding Downeys and the P-5; Review email from Kristi Reeve regarding same; Email to George Guerra regarding RRC plan to keep the with Downeys on the P-5;	2.60
08/28/13	JKH	Emails with Jeffrey Rizzo regarding H-15 failure for Elwood Carter -B- Well No. 1B and plugging schedule prior to Open Meeting on Quest P-5; Review RRC database for status of remaining P-5 issues; Call to Kristi Reeve regarding W-3C for Main Hatchett Ranch Well No. 2;	0.30
08/30/13	JKH	Calls with George Guerra regarding status; Call with Tim Poe at RRC regarding W-3C; Call with Kristi Reeve regarding override by P-5 group	5.00

SCOTT, DOUGLASS & McCONNICO, L.L.P.

MOTION FOR HEARING ON P-5
September 11, 2013

INVOICE NO. 217753
PAGE 3

DATE	INITIALS	DESCRIPTION	HOURS
		for Hatchett Ranch No. 1; Email to Tim Poe regarding same; Emails with Jeffrey Rizzo regarding production reporting requirements; Call with RRC production reporting regarding assistance with online filing; Email to Jeffrey Rizzo regarding same; Call with George Guerra, Jeffrey Rizzo and Burton Wiand regarding the severances; Calls to RRC Kristi Reeve and UIC group regarding removal of lease severances; Review emails from Jeffrey Rizzo and Burton Wiand with the H-5 for the Mack Henry No. 10; Email to RRC's Steve Schmidt regarding the H-5; Email to RRC's Tim Poe and Kristi Reeve regarding status of plugging; Send update to Burton Wiand regarding the lease severances;	

NAME	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
JOHN K. HICKS	22.30	400.00	8,920.00
BRYAN D. LAUER	7.80	385.00	3,003.00
Totals	<u>30.10</u>		<u>11,923.00</u>

TOTAL FEES \$ 11,923.00

EXPENSES	AMOUNT
Long Distance	<u>2.59</u>
Totals	<u>2.59</u>

TOTAL EXPENSES \$ 2.59

TOTAL THIS INVOICE \$ 11,925.59