

EXHIBIT 25

MAPLES

Wiand, Burton W.
5505 W. Gray Street
Tampa 33609
United States of America

Invoice No. 1362877
Date 01-Apr-14
Client No. 688524
Contact Arabella Di Iorio
Page 1

INVOICE

Re: Enforcement against World Opportunity Fund and World Opportunity Master Fund

Fees

To our charges for professional services rendered by this firm for the period ending
on 31 January 2014. (see attached) 3,761.00

Total Fees 3,761.00

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE US\$ 3,761.00

Additional disbursements may be invoiced at a later date.

All of the services rendered by this firm were performed outside of the United States of America.

US\$ Wire transfer instructions (must be sent as a SWIFT or international transfer and not Fedwire):

Beneficiary Bank: HSBC Bank (Cayman) Limited
HSBC House, 68 West Bay Road, PO Box 1109
George Town, Grand Cayman
SWIFT: HSBCKYKY

Beneficiary: Maples and Calder

Account: 100-004787-501

Intermediary Bank: HSBC Bank USA, N.A.
452 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10018
SWIFT: MRMDUS33

Account: 000-050-415 (if required)

Reference **688524-1362877**

Please confirm payment details via email to accounts.help@maplesandcalder.com

Fee Detail

10-Jan-14	Mays, Ben	Telcons B Wiand and M Lamont, file note and consider instructions.	0.50	362.50
14-Jan-14	Mays, Ben	Work with and supervise VAL re advice.	0.00	0.00
14-Jan-14	Lord, Victoria	Review authorities and procedural rules - draft long email advice and initial stepsto receiver and to BDM for review	2.60	1,144.00
15-Jan-14	Lord, Victoria	Amendments to draft email to client initial advice, following BDM comments and to BDM for review	0.50	220.00
16-Jan-14	Lord, Victoria	Discuss with BDM email draft to client and advice re receiver and charging order issues	0.40	176.00
16-Jan-14	Lord, Victoria	Amend email to client and further consider advice and provisions of partnership act. Call with ML re issues surrounding arbitration agreement certified copy. Discuss same with BDM and review authorities. Amend draft email to client. Email exchange with client re next steps	1.60	704.00
17-Jan-14	Lord, Victoria	Review authorities on certified copy and authenticated copies. Finalise draft email to client and advice and send. Email from client confirming position and ack receipt.	0.80	352.00
20-Jan-14	Mays, Ben	Discuss certification issue VAL, review emails.	0.10	72.50
21-Jan-14	Lord, Victoria	Review attestation and email to client re advice on wording.	0.20	88.00
21-Jan-14	Lord, Victoria	Review executed copy of Agreement and ack receipt of pdf to client.	0.10	44.00
24-Jan-14	Mays, Ben	Review draft advice.	0.20	145.00
24-Jan-14	Lord, Victoria	Instructions to RDK to scan in documents - consider if 2013 act in force - draft email to client to BDM for approval ack receipt and suggesting time frame for issue - review instructions and acknowledge receipt.	0.70	308.00
31-Jan-14	Mays, Ben	Discussion VAL re basis for service out, proceedings	0.20	145.00
Totals			7.90	US\$ 3,761.00

Fee Earner Summary

	Hrs	Rate	Amount
Mays, Ben (BDM)	0.00	0.00	0.00
Lord, Victoria (VAL)	6.90	440.00	3,036.00

Invoice No. 1362877
Date 01-Apr-14
Client No. 688524
Contact Arabella Di Iorio
Page 3

Fee Earner Summary

Mays, Ben (BDM)	1.00	725.00	725.00
Totals	7.90		US\$ 3,761.00