

# EXHIBIT 4

# Wiand Guerra King P.L.

5505 West Gray Street

Tampa, FL 33609

Telephone: 813-347-5100

Facsimile: 813-347-5198

Federal Tax ID # 27-0937962

Burton W. Wiand  
**Attention: Burton W. Wiand**  
Wiand Guerra King, P.L.  
5505 W. Gray Street  
Tampa, FL 33609

June 17, 2014  
Client: 025305  
Matter: 090245  
Invoice #: 7054

Page: 1

RE: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

For Professional Services Rendered Through January 31, 2014

---

## SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
	<b>ASDIS</b>	<b>Asset Disposition</b>		
9/6/2013	BWW	Communications with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding Garren Creek (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
10/10/2013	BWW	Communications with G. Morello regarding LaBellasara condominium lien (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
10/17/2013	BWW	Communications with J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind hangar loan and listing (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
10/28/2013	BWW	Review and revise letter to E. Laughlin regarding potential sale of Newnan Hangars (Tradewind) (.5); office conference with J. Rizzo regarding same (.3).	0.8	\$280.00
11/1/2013	BWW	Telephone conference with T. Denslow (.2); exchange correspondence with T. Denslow (.3).	0.5	\$175.00
11/4/2013	BWW	Communications with T. Denslow (.4); communications with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding executed mutual confidentiality agreement from potential purchaser of Tradewind (.1).	0.5	\$175.00
11/12/2013	BWW	Communicate with J. Rizzo, M. Horne, and R. Jernigan regarding Tradewind (.3); communicate with J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind loan modification (.2).	0.5	\$175.00

June 17, 2014

Client: 025305

Matter: 090245

Invoice #: 7054

Page: 2

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>ASDIS</b>		<b>Asset Disposition</b>		
11/25/2013	BWW	Telephone conference with C. McCombie regarding wires (.3); communication with R. Jernigan regarding Albany, TX property (.4); office conferences with G. Morello and M. Lamont regarding legal strategy (.5).	1.2	\$420.00
11/26/2013	BWW	Communications with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding Garren Creek (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
12/2/2013	BWW	Communication with J. Rizzo regarding Garren Creek (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
12/6/2013	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding (Tradewind) Newnan hangar offer (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
12/10/2013	BWW	Review documents regarding the Orlando house closing sent by R. Jernigan. (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
12/11/2013	BWW	Review proposal for sale of Tradewinds (.7); office conference with J. Rizzo (.1); telephone conference with R. Jernigan (.2); communications with R. Jernigan and J. Rizzo regarding LaBellasara and loan (.2).	1.2	\$420.00
12/12/2013	BWW	Communications with R. Jernigan and J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind offer (.1); address matters pertaining to Tradewind (.5).	0.6	\$210.00
12/13/2013	BWW	Communication with R. Jernigan and J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind offer (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
1/9/2014	BWW	Communicate with Buyer's counsel and J. Rizzo regarding sale and purchase of Tradewind (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
1/10/2014	BWW	Communicate with J. Rizzo regarding sale of Tradewind and asset purchase agreement (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
1/14/2014	BWW	Communicate with J. Rizzo regarding Tradewind. (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
1/16/2014	BWW	Communicate with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan regarding Laurel Preserve lots (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
1/22/2014	BWW	Communicate with J. Rizzo regarding status of sale of Tradewind (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
1/23/2014	BWW	Communicate with J. Rizzo regarding agreement with Bank of Coweta resolving claim and payoff (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
1/27/2014	BWW	Office communication regarding status. (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
<b>Total: Asset Disposition</b>			<b>8.90</b>	<b>\$3,115.00</b>
<b>ASSET</b>		<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>		
9/5/2013	BWW	Telephone conference with T. Smiljanich (.5); arrange for mediation in Wells Fargo matter (.5).	1.0	\$350.00
9/6/2013	BWW	Telephone conference with S. Keefe regarding deposition in Wells Fargo matter (.3).	0.3	\$105.00

June 17, 2014

Client: 025305

Matter: 090245

Invoice #: 7054

Page: 3

---

**SERVICES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>TKPR</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			
9/10/2013	BWW	Telephone conference with S. Keefe regarding deposition schedule in Wells Fargo matter (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
10/2/2013	BWW	Telephone conference with T. Smiljanich in preparation for mediation in Wells Fargo matter (.5); office conference with G. Morello regarding same (.3); telephone conference with M. Lamont regarding deposition and mediation status (.3); communications with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan (.4).	1.5	\$525.00
10/3/2013	BWW	Office meeting with G. Morello regarding Wells Fargo and Receivership issues related to recovering assets (1.5); office conference with G. Morello and M. Lamont regarding research on new precedent (1.0).	2.5	\$875.00
10/14/2013	BWW	Communications with B. Price regarding Nadel's tax return and potential motion for order regarding IRS tax distribution (.5); consider same with M. Lamont (.4).	0.9	\$315.00
10/16/2013	BWW	Review of DOI settlement statement in Wells Fargo matter (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
10/21/2013	BWW	Office conference and correspondence with M. Lamont regarding Circuit Judge (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
10/23/2013	BWW	Review and revise draft Declaration in support of memorandum of law in opposition to Defendant's motion to compel production of documents responsive to Defendant's First Request for Production of Document in Wells Fargo matter (1.0); correspondence and telephone conferences with S. Keefe regarding declarations in support of same in Wells Fargo matter (1.0).	2.0	\$700.00
10/30/2013	BWW	Receipt and review of Judge Pizzo's Order and determine strategy as to same (.6).	0.6	\$210.00
10/31/2013	BWW	Telephone conference with T. Smiljanich and S. Keefe regarding Wells Fargo matter (.5); review affidavits (.5); telephone conferences with S. Keefe regarding discovery and affidavit edits (.3).	1.3	\$455.00
11/12/2013	BWW	Exchange correspondence with S. Keefe regarding Wells Fargo matter (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
12/3/2013	BWW	Office conferences with M. Lamont regarding legal strategy (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
12/4/2013	BWW	Office meeting with G. Morello prior to preparation (.5); preparation for deposition with James Hoyer attorneys in Wells Fargo matter (3.5).	4.0	\$1,400.00
12/5/2013	BWW	Plan and prepare for deposition in Wells Fargo matter (2.0); attend deposition and office conferences with G. Morello (3.5); emails with S. Keefe regarding same (.5).	6.0	\$2,100.00
12/12/2013	BWW	Address matters pertaining to Wells Fargo matters (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>ASSET</b>		<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>		
1/8/2014	BWW	Office conference with M. Lamont regarding Vermont property (.5); telephone conference with T. Smiljanich (.2); attend pre-hearing conference before Judge Whittemore in Wells Fargo matter (3.5).	4.2	\$1,470.00
<b>Total: Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			<b>28.20</b>	<b>\$9,870.00</b>
<b>BUSIN</b>		<b>Business Operations</b>		
9/9/2013	BWW	Attention to administrative matters and checks (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
10/3/2013	BWW	Office meeting with R. Jernigan regarding administrative and real estate issues (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
10/10/2013	BWW	Address administration related to sale of Laurel Mountain Preserve, Garren Creek, Quest and Tradewind (1.2); completion of multiple Division of Revenue unemployment forms (.8).	2.0	\$700.00
10/24/2013	BWW	Sign checks and review numerous invoices to be approved (.3); office conferences with J. Rizzo regarding same and administration of case (.5).	0.8	\$280.00
10/30/2013	BWW	Execution of numerous checks and other administrative documentation. (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
11/12/2013	BWW	Review communications regarding Tradewind status and Bank of North Georgia loan (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
12/10/2013	BWW	Communications regarding checks (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
12/11/2013	BWW	Review various invoices and execute checks (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
12/12/2013	BWW	Administrative review of invoices and execution of checks (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
1/15/2014	BWW	Office meeting with R. Jernigan regarding administrative signatures, approvals, etc. (.5); meeting with B. Price regarding 1040 and preparation of letter to IRS (3.0); review correspondence with B. Price related to tax return and administrative check approvals (.5).	4.0	\$1,400.00
1/23/2014	BWW	Attention to case administration and review and execute checks (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
1/31/2014	BWW	Review and sign numerous administrative documents (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
<b>Total: Business Operations</b>			<b>12.40</b>	<b>\$4,340.00</b>
<b>CASE</b>		<b>Case Administration</b>		
9/10/2013	BWW	Telephone conference regarding Scoop administration (.3).	0.3	\$105.00

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>CASE</b>	<b>Case Administration</b>			
10/14/2013	BWW	Review and revise interim report (1.0); exchange correspondence with M. Lockwood regarding same (.2).	1.2	\$420.00
10/15/2013	BWW	Review revised interim report (1.0); conferences with M. Lockwood and G. Morello regarding same (.3).	1.3	\$455.00
10/16/2013	BWW	Prepare correspondence to M. Lockwood regarding Interim Report (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
10/29/2013	BWW	Office conference with M. Lockwood (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
1/16/2014	BWW	Office of conference with M. Lockwood regarding interim report (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
<b>Total: Case Administration</b>			<b>3.30</b>	<b>\$1,155.00</b>
<b>CLAIM</b>	<b>Claims Administration and Objections</b>			
10/14/2013	BWW	Communications with M. Lockwood regarding next distribution to claimants (.2); communications with J. Rizzo regarding claims status (.2).	0.4	\$140.00
10/15/2013	BWW	Office conference with M. Lockwood regarding third interim distribution (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
10/23/2013	BWW	Prepare correspondence to M. Lockwood regarding distribution (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
10/24/2013	BWW	Exchange correspondence with M. Lockwood regarding motion for distribution (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
11/6/2013	BWW	Office conference with M. Lamont and G. Morello regarding motion for interim distribution (.5); prepare correspondence regarding distribution (.2).	0.5	\$175.00
11/14/2013	BWW	Office conference with M. Lockwood regarding distribution issues (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
11/15/2013	BWW	Review motion to distribute and exhibits (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
11/20/2013	BWW	Office conference with G. Morello and M. Lamont regarding motion for distribution (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
11/21/2013	BWW	Office conference with G. Morello and M. Lamont regarding motion for distribution (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
11/22/2013	BWW	Office conferences with M. Lamont regarding motion for distribution (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
12/2/2013	BWW	Meeting with G. Morello and J. Rizzo to discuss V. Lee's intent to proceed with objection to claim determination (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
12/6/2013	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo regarding stop payment on claim checks (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
12/12/2013	BWW	Meet with J. Maglich and G. Morello regarding questions from Millennium Trust (.6).	0.6	\$210.00

June 17, 2014

Client: 025305

Matter: 090245

Invoice #: 7054

Page: 6

---

**SERVICES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>TKPR</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
<b>CLAIM</b>		<b>Claims Administration and Objections</b>		
12/17/2013	BWW	Communicate with M. Gura regarding replacement checks (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
		<b>Total: Claims Administration and Objections</b>	<b>5.10</b>	<b>\$1,785.00</b>
		<b>Total Professional Services:</b>	<b>57.9</b>	<b>\$20,265.00</b>
		Total Services	\$20,265.00	
		Total Current Charges		\$20,265.00
		Previous Balance		\$19,565.00
		Less Payments		(\$19,565.00)
		<b>PAY THIS AMOUNT</b>		<b>\$20,265.00</b>

June 17, 2014

Client: 025305

Matter: 090245

Invoice #: 7054

Page: 7

---

**TASK RECAP**

**Services**

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
ASDIS - ASDIS	8.9	\$3,115.00
ASSET - ASSET	28.2	\$9,870.00
BUSIN - BUSIN	12.4	\$4,340.00
CASE - CASE	3.3	\$1,155.00
CLAIM - CLAIM	5.1	\$1,785.00
	<u>57.90</u>	<u>\$20,265.00</u>

**Disbursements**

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	<u>\$0.00</u>

**BREAKDOWN BY PERSON**

<u>Person</u>	<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
BWW Burton W. Wiand	ASDIS - ASDIS	8.9	\$3,115.00
BWW Burton W. Wiand	ASSET - ASSET	28.2	\$9,870.00
BWW Burton W. Wiand	BUSIN - BUSIN	12.4	\$4,340.00
BWW Burton W. Wiand	CASE - CASE	3.3	\$1,155.00
BWW Burton W. Wiand	CLAIM - CLAIM	5.1	\$1,785.00
		<u>57.90</u>	<u>\$20,265.00</u>