

# Exhibit 22

# MAPLES

Wiand, Burton W.  
5505 W. Gray Street  
Tampa 33609  
United States of America

Invoice No. 1362878  
Date 28-Apr-14  
Client No. 688524  
Contact Arabella Di Iorio  
Page 1

## INVOICE

---

**Re: Enforcement against World Opportunity Fund and World Opportunity Master Fund**

### Fees

To our charges for professional services rendered by this firm for the period ending on 27 March 2014. (see attached) 5,507.50

**Total Fees** **5,507.50**

**Disbursements** (see attached) 831.60

**TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE** **US\$ 6,339.10**

---

Additional disbursements may be invoiced at a later date.

All of the services rendered by this firm were performed outside of the United States of America.

**US\$ Wire transfer instructions (must be sent as a SWIFT or International transfer and not Fedwire):**

Beneficiary Bank: HSBC Bank (Cayman) Limited  
HSBC House, 68 West Bay Road, PO Box 1109  
George Town, Grand Cayman  
SWIFT: HSBCKYKY

**Beneficiary: Maples and Calder**

**Account: 100-004787-501**

Intermediary Bank: HSBC Bank USA, N.A.  
452 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10018  
SWIFT: MRMDUS33

Account: 000-050-415 (if required)  
Reference **688524-1362878**

Please confirm payment details via email to [accounts.help@maplesandcalder.com](mailto:accounts.help@maplesandcalder.com)

**Fee Detail**

04-Feb-14 Mays, Ben	Review draft claim form and affidavit, discuss VAL	0.50	362.50
05-Feb-14 Mays, Ben	Review and discuss further drafts with VAL.	0.20	145.00
05-Feb-14 Lord, Victoria	Amend documents for FDCF and affi in support, following BDM comments - further amend first draft Affi service out and order - send to BDM for review.	1.00	440.00
05-Feb-14 Lord, Victoria	Further to BDM comments email draft documents with advice and req instructions on CO	0.10	44.00
10-Feb-14 Lord, Victoria	Email from ML re status - ack receipt and request instructions re charging order	0.10	44.00
18-Feb-14 Lord, Victoria	Review draft affidavits and amend and mark up comments - cc to BDM for review and discussion - ack receipt to client with ETA	0.60	264.00
19-Feb-14 Mays, Ben	Review revised affidavit from receiver and discuss comments with VAL	0.20	145.00
19-Feb-14 Lord, Victoria	Discuss amends with BDM and strategy for hearing - Amend x 2 affidavits and send with email requesting instructions to client. Review email confirming no full and frank re defences to NY Convention Award - ack receipt.	1.10	484.00
26-Feb-14 Lord, Victoria	Review draft affidavit amend and send to client with comments and request for instructions re ex	0.40	176.00
06-Mar-14 Mays, Ben	Review status	0.10	72.50
06-Mar-14 Lord, Victoria	Amend affidavit and create exhibit - send to ML for further comment and execution.	0.80	352.00
06-Mar-14 Lord, Victoria	Request from BDM re status of drafting on COrder - update re awaiting instructions and that will raise on receipt of affi from Rec.	0.10	44.00
14-Mar-14 Lord, Victoria	Review email from ML re text for settlors description - amend affi and send to ML for review and request instructions re COrder drafting	0.20	88.00

**Fee Detail**

19-Mar-14 Lord, Victoria	Review affidavit as amended and respond to client with request to revert on paragraph 8 and providing details for original executed to be sent through - review clarification from client - review Fixed date claim and send and respond with advice on destination for affidavit and next steps with regard to service out affi and issuing of documents - Prepare exhibit and affidavit for filing.	1.90	836.00
21-Mar-14 Lord, Victoria	Finalise docs for filing and prepare copies - check same through and file at registry - email to client with filed cc evi and advise re hearing date - email to Judge's clerk re hearing date confirmation.	2.10	924.00
24-Mar-14 Cameron, Angelle	Issuing the notice of application for permission with the Court	0.70	171.50
24-Mar-14 Lord, Victoria	Send affidavit and NoA re service out and filed FDC re enforcement to client - email exchange with client re edits and prep for court filing - instructions ABC re bundles	1.10	484.00
27-Mar-14 Cameron, Angelle	Finalising and collating x3 bundles for VAL review	1.40	343.00
27-Mar-14 Lord, Victoria	Instructions to RDK to acknowledge receipt of courier to client of hard cc affi - email to client with hard cc of filed documents - chaser to ABC on cc hearing bundle	0.20	88.00
<b>Totals</b>		<b>12.80</b>	<b>US\$ 5,507.50</b>

**Fee Earner Summary**

	Hrs	Rate	Amount
Cameron, Angelle (ABC)	2.10	245.00	514.50
Lord, Victoria (VAL)	9.70	440.00	4,268.00
Mays, Ben (BDM)	1.00	725.00	725.00
<b>Totals</b>	<b>12.80</b>		<b>US\$ 5,507.50</b>

Invoice No.	1362878
Date	28-Apr-14
Client No.	688524
Contact	Arabella Di Iorio
Page	4

---

**Disbursements**

Printed Pages	6.60
Revenue Stamps	825.00
<b>Total Disbursements</b>	<b>US\$ 831.60</b>

# MAPLES

Wiand, Burton W.  
5505 W. Gray Street  
Tampa 33609  
United States of America

Invoice No. 1387584  
Date 30-Jun-14  
Client No. 688524  
Contact Arabella Di Iorio  
Page 1

## INVOICE

**Re: Enforcement against World Opportunity Fund and World Opportunity Master Fund**

### Fees

To our charges for professional services rendered by this firm for the period ending  
on 30 June 2014. (see attached) 15,489.00

**Total Fees** 15,489.00

**Disbursements** (see attached) 213.99

**TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE** US\$ 15,702.99

Additional disbursements may be invoiced at a later date.

All of the services rendered by this firm were performed outside of the United States of America.

**US\$ Wire transfer instructions (must be sent as a SWIFT or international transfer and not Fedwire):**

Beneficiary Bank: HSBC Bank (Cayman) Limited  
HSBC House, 68 West Bay Road, PO Box 1109  
George Town, Grand Cayman  
SWIFT: HSBCKYKY  
**Beneficiary: Maples and Calder**  
**Account: 100-004787-501**  
Intermediary Bank: HSBC Bank USA, N.A.  
452 Fifth Avenue, New York, New York 10018  
SWIFT: MRMDUS33  
Account: 000-050-415 (if required)  
Reference **688524-1387584**

Please confirm payment details via email to [accounts.help@maplesandcalder.com](mailto:accounts.help@maplesandcalder.com)

**Maples and Calder**  
Sea Meadow House PO Box 173 Road Town Tortola VG1110 British Virgin Islands  
Tel +1 284 852 3000 Fax +1 284 852 3097 [www.maplesandcalder.com](http://www.maplesandcalder.com)

### Fee Detail

07-Apr-14	Lord, Victoria	Draft skele and review authorities - send skele to client with queries re same - instructions to IC to take to court - draft authorities bundle index and create auth bundle - pull together documents for service out.	4.00	1,760.00
08-Apr-14	Lord, Victoria	Prep for hearing and appear	3.80	1,672.00
09-Apr-14	Mays, Ben	Discussion and supervision VAL.	0.20	145.00
09-Apr-14	Lord, Victoria	email re result of hearing and call with client re same	0.40	176.00
10-Apr-14	Cameron, Angelle	Finalising hearing note for VAL review/comments	2.90	710.50
10-Apr-14	Lord, Victoria	Review and amend ABC note of hearing and to client	1.40	616.00
14-Apr-14	Cameron, Angelle	Chasing sealed Order	0.30	73.50
14-Apr-14	Lord, Victoria	Instructions to ABC to chase transcript, sealed order	0.10	44.00
14-Apr-14	Lord, Victoria	Instructions to ABC re draft letter to client with docs	0.20	88.00
17-Apr-14	Lord, Victoria	Email from client confirming rcpt of pack and affi of service to be provided - ack receipt to client	0.10	44.00
28-Apr-14	Mays, Ben	Email from ML re service	0.10	72.50
20-May-14	Mays, Ben	Email from ML, consider next steps	0.20	145.00
21-May-14	Mays, Ben	Email exchanges ML re next steps	0.20	145.00
22-May-14	Mays, Ben	Prep for and attend call M Lamont, consider issues arising	0.70	507.50
03-Jun-14	Mays, Ben	Email exchanges and telcon M Lamont, liaison/delegate DW.	0.70	507.50
03-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting application to charge	2.40	960.00
04-Jun-14	Mays, Ben	Discussions DW re charging order and receivership candidates, review emails DW and ML, DW and accountants, review FTI proposal.	0.50	362.50
04-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting application to charge	1.20	480.00
05-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting affidavit for charge	3.00	1,200.00
06-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting charging order application	1.00	400.00
10-Jun-14	Mays, Ben	Discussion/supervision DIW and review docs, email to ML.	0.50	362.50
10-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting charging order application	0.80	320.00
13-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting charging order application	0.40	160.00
17-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting affidavit seeking directions	1.50	600.00
18-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting affidavit seeking charging order	1.20	480.00
19-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting affidavit seeking charging order	0.80	320.00

Invoice No.	1387584
Date	30-Jun-14
Client No.	688524
Contact	Arabella Di Iorio
Page	3

**Fee Detail**

20-Jun-14	Mays, Ben	Discuss issues DIW re service on limited partners.	0.20	145.00
20-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting affidavit seeking charging order	2.50	1,000.00
23-Jun-14	Mays, Ben	Discuss DIW re affidavit/creditors.	0.10	72.50
23-Jun-14	Welford, David	Drafting affidavit seeking charging order	4.80	1,920.00
<b>Totals</b>			<b>36.20</b>	<b>US\$ 15,489.00</b>

**Fee Earner Summary**

	Hrs	Rate	Amount
Cameron, Angelle (ABC)	3.20	245.00	784.00
Welford, David (DIW)	19.60	400.00	7,840.00
Lord, Victoria (VAL)	10.00	440.00	4,400.00
Mays, Ben (BDM)	3.40	725.00	2,465.00
<b>Totals</b>	<b>36.20</b>		<b>US\$ 15,489.00</b>

**Disbursements**

BVI Government Company and Court Search Fees	115.00
Communication Charges	13.29
Library charges	55.00
Printed Pages	5.70
Revenue Stamps	25.00
<b>Total Disbursements</b>	<b>US\$ 213.99</b>