

# Exhibit 18

# Wiand Guerra King P.A.

5505 West Gray Street

Tampa, FL 33609

Telephone: 813-347-5100

Facsimile: 813-347-5198

Federal Tax ID # 27-0937962

Burton W. Wiand  
Attention: **Burton W. Wiand**  
Wiand Guerra King, P.A.  
5505 W. Gray Street  
Tampa, FL 33609

August 21, 2015  
Client: 025305  
Matter: 000871  
Invoice #: 8914  
  
Page: 1

RE: Scoop Legal Team - Appeal of R. Schneiderman, et al.,

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2015

---

## SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
	<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>		
11/14/2014	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Reviewed order regarding oral argument from Eleventh Circuit and response to same (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
11/19/2014	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Receipt and review of appellate court's tentative oral argument calendar (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
11/20/2014	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Reviewed Chapman's notice of appearance (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
11/24/2014	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Discussions with M. Gura regarding briefing and caselaw for oral argument (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
11/25/2014	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Work on preparation for oral argument (2.4).	2.4	\$756.00
11/25/2014	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN: Receive and review notice of hearing (.1).	0.1	\$27.00
12/3/2014	MG	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Compilation of a table of authorities for all cases cited in the initial brief, reply brief, and response in preparation for hearing (2.7).	2.7	\$378.00
12/4/2014	MG	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Research and pull the cases cited in the initial brief, reply brief, and response in preparation for hearing (3.8).	3.8	\$532.00

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			
12/5/2014	MG	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Continue to organize cases cited in the initial brief, reply brief, and response in preparation for hearing (4.7).	4.7	\$658.00
12/9/2014	MG	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Final organization of cases cited in the initial brief, reply brief, and response in preparation for hearing (1.8).	1.8	\$252.00
1/15/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Prepared for 11th Circuit oral argument (3.0).	3.0	\$945.00
1/16/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Prepared for 11th Circuit oral argument (5.0).	5.0	\$1,575.00
1/19/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Prepared for 11th Circuit oral argument (1.6).	1.6	\$504.00
1/21/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Prepared for oral argument (3.2).	3.2	\$1,008.00
1/23/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Prepared for 11th Circuit oral argument (2.5).	2.5	\$787.50
1/23/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Analyze pleadings and prepare for oral argument (4.5).	4.5	\$1,215.00
1/24/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Analyze file regarding briefing on arbitration (2.5).	2.5	\$675.00
1/26/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Prepared for oral argument (7.5).	7.5	\$2,362.50
1/26/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Travel to Jacksonville for oral argument (4.0).	4.0	\$630.00
1/26/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Travel to Jacksonville for oral argument (4.0).	4.0	\$540.00
1/26/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Prepare for oral argument (4.0).	4.0	\$1,080.00
1/26/2015	JDM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Telephone call with 11th Circuit court of appeals regarding panel selection for oral argument (.2).	0.2	\$38.70
1/27/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Travel back to Tampa following oral argument (4.0).	4.0	\$630.00
1/27/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Prepared for oral argument (1.7); SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): attend oral argument before the 11th circuit appellate court (3.0).	4.7	\$1,480.50
1/27/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Travel from Jacksonville to Tampa following oral argument (4.0).	4.0	\$540.00
1/27/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Prepare for and attend oral argument (4.0).	4.0	\$1,080.00

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			
2/10/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Reviewed opinion entered by appellate court, considered next steps and discussed same with Receiver (2.0).	2.0	\$630.00
2/10/2015	JJP	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Review and analyze Eleventh Circuit opinion affirming district court opinion (.8); SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): discuss whether to seek rehearing en banc (.4).	1.2	\$297.00
2/10/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Receive and review order on appeal (.5); SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): consider legal issues with Receiver (.4).	0.9	\$243.00
2/10/2015	DEH	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Analyze appellate order regarding various legal issues (.2).	0.2	\$38.70
2/10/2015	JR	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Review of Eleventh Circuit opinion (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
2/19/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Discussions with team and Receiver regarding next steps and filing a motion for rehearing before the Eleventh Circuit (.2); SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): reviewed bill of costs filed by appellees (.1).	0.3	\$94.50
2/19/2015	JJP	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Research regarding motion for rehearing en banc (4.0); draft motion for rehearing en banc (4.0).	8.0	\$1,980.00
2/19/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Research regarding motion for rehearing en banc (2.5); work on motion for rehearing en banc (2.0).	4.5	\$1,215.00
2/20/2015	JJP	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Draft motion for rehearing en banc (4.0).	4.0	\$990.00
2/20/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Legal research regarding motion for rehearing en banc; (2.0); work on motion for rehearing en banc (2.0).	4.0	\$1,080.00
2/23/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Review and revise Receiver's petition for rehearing en banc (3.5).	3.5	\$1,102.50
2/23/2015	JJP	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Draft motion for rehearing en banc (5.5); revise motion for rehearing en banc (2.1).	7.6	\$1,881.00
2/23/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Telephone call with Janvey's counsel regarding rehearing (.2); draft petition for rehearing (4.5).	4.7	\$1,269.00
2/24/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Review and finalized Receiver's petition for rehearing en banc and petition for rehearing (4.2); discussions with Receiver, J. Perez and M. Lamont regarding same (.5).	4.7	\$1,480.50

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>ASSET</b>		<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>		
2/24/2015	JJP	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Revise and file motion for rehearing en banc (8.5).	8.5	\$2,103.75
2/24/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Revised petition for rehearing en banc (4.0); legal research regarding rehearing (1.0); telephone calls with counsel for Janvey regarding brief and amicus (.4).	5.4	\$1,458.00
2/24/2015	MG	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Draft and revise table of authorities for cases cited in petition for rehearing en banc (1.2); assist with finalizing brief (2.6).	3.8	\$532.00
2/26/2015	JJP	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Review draft amicus brief by Janvey receiver to be filed in support of motion for rehearing en banc (1.0).	1.0	\$247.50
2/26/2015	ML	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Analyze amicus brief from Janvey (1.0).	1.0	\$270.00
3/2/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Reviewed Janvey papers regarding amicus filing (.5).	0.5	\$157.50
3/9/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Review and revised letter to appellate clerk with supplemental authority in support of Receiver's motion for rehearing (.3); discussion with J. Perez and Receiver regarding same (.1).	0.4	\$126.00
3/18/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Reviewed 11th Circuit clerk notes (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
3/25/2015	JJP	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Research objection procedure for bill of costs (1.0).	1.0	\$247.50
4/7/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Reviewed order on motion for amicus (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
4/8/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Reviewed 11th Circuit order denying Receiver's petition for rehearing en banc and considered next steps (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
4/21/2015	GM	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Reviewed mandate issued by Eleventh Circuit and bill of costs submitted by M. Barlow (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
4/21/2015	JR	SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): Review Stanford Receiver's Amicus Curiae Brief (.1); SCHNEIDERMAN (APPEAL): review bill of costs (.1).	0.2	\$28.00
<b>Total: Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			<b>142.90</b>	<b>\$35,561.15</b>
<b>Total Professional Service:</b>			<b>142.9</b>	<b>\$35,561.15</b>

**DISBURSEMENTS**

Date	Description of Disbursements	Amount
<b>E101 Photocopies</b>		
3/9/2015	Photocopies @ .15 each (1344 @ \$0.15)	\$201.60
<b>E102 Outside Printing</b>		
12/8/2014	Tampa Legal Copies, Inc.- Copy Service- Outside copy expense	\$272.00
<b>E106 On Line Research</b>		
3/31/2015	PACER printing costs for month of January to March 2015 (56 @ \$0.10)	\$5.60
<b>E107 Del. Services/Messengers</b>		
3/9/2015	FedEx to John Ley, Clerk, US Court of Appeals	\$49.44
<b>E110 Out of Town Travel</b>		
1/9/2015	American Express- Travel- Travel to Jacksonville for oral argument - lodging	\$620.64
1/9/2015	American Express- Travel- Travel to Jacksonville for oral argument - meals	\$45.66
1/28/2015	American Express- Travel- Oral argument - lodging	\$12.16
1/28/2015	American Express- Travel- Oral argument - lodging	\$2.47
1/28/2015	American Express- Travel- Oral argument - lodging	\$12.11
1/28/2015	American Express- Travel- Oral argument - lodging	\$79.86
1/28/2015	American Express- Travel- Oral argument - lodging	\$10.92
<b>E124 Other</b>		
1/27/2015	American Express- Miscellaneous- Lunch following oral argument	\$48.04
1/27/2015	American Express- Miscellaneous- Oral agrument - hotel wifi	\$4.22
<b>Total Disbursements</b>		<b>\$1,364.72</b>

Total Services	\$35,561.15
Total Disbursements	\$1,364.72
Total Current Charges	\$36,925.87
Previous Balance	\$20,676.75
Less Payments	(\$14,971.09)
<b>PAY THIS AMOUNT</b>	<b>\$42,631.53</b>

**TASK RECAP**

**Services**

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
ASSET - ASSET	142.9	\$35,561.15
	0	\$0.00
	0	\$0.00
	0	\$0.00
	0	\$0.00
	0	\$0.00
	<u>142.90</u>	<u>\$35,561.15</u>

**Disbursements**

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Photocopies	\$201.60
Outside Printing	\$272.00
On Line Research	\$5.60
Del. Services/Messengers	\$49.44
Out of Town Travel	\$783.82
Other	\$52.26
	<u>\$1,364.72</u>

**BREAKDOWN BY PERSON**

<u>Person</u>	<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
ML Michael Lamont	ASSET - ASSET	43.6	\$10,692.00
GM Gianluca Morello	ASSET - ASSET	50.5	\$14,651.00
JJP Jared J. Perez	ASSET - ASSET	31.3	\$7,746.75
DEH Dominique E. Heller	ASSET - ASSET	0.2	\$38.70
JDM Jordan D. Maglich	ASSET - ASSET	0.2	\$38.70
MG Mary Gura	ASSET - ASSET	16.8	\$2,352.00
JR Jeffrey Rizzo	ASSET - ASSET	0.3	\$42.00
		<u>142.90</u>	<u>\$35,561.15</u>