

Exhibit 13

Wiand Guerra King P.A.

5505 West Gray Street

Tampa, FL 33609

Telephone: 813-347-5100

Facsimile: 813-347-5198

Federal Tax ID # 27-0937962

Burton W. Wiand

Attention: Burton W. Wiand

Wiand Guerra King, P.A.

5505 W. Gray Street

Tampa, FL 33609

November 25, 2015

Client: 025305

Matter: 090833

Invoice #: 9432

Page: 1

RE: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2015

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
	ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery		
5/3/2015	GM	D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): Reviewed order on Trustee's objection to Receiver's claims and considered next steps (.4).	0.4	\$126.00
5/4/2015	GM	D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): Reviewed supplemental statement and disclosure of compensation filed by counsel for debtor (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
5/4/2015	JJP	LEE: Telephone conference with S. Sharp regarding Lee bankruptcy discharge (.4); LEE: identify documents relevant to Lee bankruptcy discharge and send to S. Sharp (.8).	1.2	\$297.00
5/4/2015	JDM	LEE: Review proposed proof of claim (.1).	0.1	\$19.35
5/4/2015	JR	CLOUD: Review order that objection is sustained and Claim No. 9 is disallowed as a priority claim (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
5/7/2015	GM	V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): Reviewed draft complaint seeking imposition of equitable lien and objecting to debtors discharge (.4); V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): communications with S. Sharp regarding same (.1).	0.5	\$157.50

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
5/8/2015	GM	V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): Review of revised draft complaint seeking imposition of equitable lien and objecting to debtors discharge (.5); V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): communications with S. Sharp regarding revisions to same (.3).	0.8	\$252.00
5/8/2015	JJP	V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): Revise bankruptcy complaint against V. Lee (2.2).	2.2	\$544.50
5/8/2015	ML	V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): Telephone calls with counsel regarding complaint (.4); V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): revised complaint (1.5).	1.9	\$513.00
5/11/2015	GM	MEEKER: Review correspondence from Meeker to Judge Pizzo (.1); MEEKER: discussions with M. Lamont regarding strategy for same (.1).	0.2	\$63.00
5/12/2015	ML	MEEKER: Telephone call with B. Meeker regarding settlement and case status (.5); MEEKER: telephone call to chambers regarding status (.1); MEEKER: consider pending issues (.2); MEEKER: review documents (.4).	1.2	\$324.00
5/13/2015	ML	ELLIS: Drafted motion to dismiss (.2); SARASOTA OPERA: drafted motion to dismiss (.2).	0.4	\$108.00
5/14/2015	GM	SARASOTA OPERA: Reviewed Receiver's motion to dismiss with prejudice based on completion of settlement (.1); ELLIS: reviewed Receiver's motion to dismiss with prejudice based on completion of settlement (.1).	0.2	\$63.00
5/15/2015	GM	SARASOTA OPERA: Reviewed court's order granting Receiver's motion to dismiss with prejudice based on completion of settlement (.1); S. ELLIS: reviewed court's order granting Receiver's motion to dismiss with prejudice based on completion of settlement (.1); MEEKER: receipt and review of notice from court regarding letter submitted by defendant Meeker (.1).	0.3	\$94.50
5/19/2015	GM	D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): Reviewed order granting motion to approve compromise of controversy (.1); V LEE (BANKRUPTCY): reviewed events of hearing (.1).	0.2	\$63.00
5/21/2015	GM	D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): Reviewed proof of service of order granting motion to compromise controversies with M. Harper filed by A. Lim on behalf of Trustee D. Carapella (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
6/1/2015	GM	MEEKER: Reviewed status of settlement negotiations and considered next steps (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
6/2/2015	ML	MEEKER: Consider pending issues with Receiver (.5).	0.5	\$135.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
6/3/2015	ML	MEEKER: Analyze correspondence from B. Meeker regarding pending issues (.2); MEEKER: consider issues with Receiver (.3); MEEKER: drafted correspondence to B. Meeker regarding settlement (.3); MEEKER: revised settlement agreement (.4); MEEKER: receive and review correspondence from B. Meeker regarding confirming settlement (.1); MEEKER: drafted correspondence to Receiver regarding settlement (.2).	1.5	\$405.00
6/8/2015	GM	V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): Communications with S. Sharp and Receiver regarding moving to withdraw reference (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
6/9/2015	GM	V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): Reviewed notice of scheduling pretrial/status conference and order procedures and considered same (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
6/9/2015	ML	MEEKER: Exchange correspondence with B. Meeker regarding settlement (.3); MEEKER: consider settlement issues with Receiver (.2); MEEKER: drafted motion to approve settlement (.5).	1.0	\$270.00
6/10/2015	ML	V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): Drafted motion for possession and title to house (3.0); V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): exchange correspondence with S. Sharp regarding motion (.2); V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): review filings (.4).	3.6	\$972.00
6/11/2015	GM	MEEKER: Review communications between B. Levenson and M. Lamont regarding settlement relating to payment of judgment (.1); MEEKER: revised Receiver's motion to approve settlement of Meeker's judgment (.2).	0.3	\$94.50
6/11/2015	ML	MEEKER: Revised motion to approve agreement relating to payment of the judgment (.7); MEEKER: drafted correspondence to B. Levenson regarding motion to approve settlement (.2).	0.9	\$243.00
6/12/2015	GM	MEEKER: Reviewed Receiver's motion to approve settlement with defendant and executed agreement relating to payment of judgment regarding same (.2); MEEKER: receipt and review of order granting Receiver's motion to approve settlement (.1); D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): reviewed first application for final compensation for A. Lim, Trustee's attorney (.2).	0.5	\$157.50
6/12/2015	ML	MEEKER: Exchange correspondence with SEC regarding motion to approve (.2); MEEKER: revised motion to approve (.2); MEEKER: receive and review order granting motion to approve (.1); MEEKER: drafted correspondence to B. Meeker regarding order (.2); MEEKER: revised motion for summary judgment regarding Lee house (.7).	1.4	\$378.00
6/15/2015	GM	D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): Reviewed application for compensation for Trustee, D. Carapella (.1).	0.1	\$31.50

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
6/23/2015	GM	DANCING \$: Reviewed court's order adopting report and recommendation on prejudgment interest issue and considered next steps (.4).	0.2	\$63.00
6/23/2015	ML	DANCING \$: Analyze report and recommendation (.4); DANCING \$: consider next steps with Receiver (.2).	0.6	\$162.00
6/24/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Reviewed draft notice of appeal (.1).	0.1	\$0.00
6/24/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Draft notice of appeal (.2).	0.2	\$0.00
7/9/2015	GM	MEEKER: Revised notice of settlement (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
7/9/2015	ML	MEEKER: Telephone call with Judge Pizzo's chambers regarding settlement (.1); MEEKER: drafted notice of settlement (.4).	0.5	\$135.00
7/13/2015	JR	MEEKER: Review of Notice of Settlement (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
7/14/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Reviewed judgment in favor of Receiver (.1).	0.1	\$0.00
7/14/2015	JR	DANCING \$: Receipt and review of clerk's judgment in favor of Receiver (.1); DANCING \$: communicate with Mr. Lamont regarding recording judgment (.1).	0.2	\$0.00
7/15/2015	JR	DANCING \$: Communicate with D. Geddes regarding recording judgment in Montana per request of Mr. Lamont (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
7/17/2015	GM	DANCING \$: Reviewed court's entry of judgment (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
7/17/2015	JR	DANCING \$: Communicate with clerk's office regarding error on judgment (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
7/21/2015	GM	D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): Reviewed Notice of Final Report submitted by Trustee and Applications for Compensation (.1); discussed same with J. Maglich (.1).	0.2	\$63.00
7/21/2015	JDM	D. CLOUD: Review trustee's final bankruptcy report and distribution proposal (.4).	0.4	\$77.40
7/21/2015	JR	DANCING \$: Prepare correspondence to USDC Clerk's office requesting certified copy of judgment and exemplification certificate (.2).	0.2	\$28.00
7/28/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Reviewed and revised Receiver's notice of appeal in connection with order adopting report and recommendation (.2).	0.2	\$0.00
7/28/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Draft and finalize notice of appeal regarding prejudgment interest (.5).	0.5	\$0.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
7/28/2015	JR	DANCING \$: Prepare correspondence to D. Geddes regarding recording exemplification certificate and a certified copy of the Judgment in a Civil Case (.2); DANCING \$: communicate with D. Geddes regarding recording judgment (.1); DANCING \$: update judgment spreadsheet (.1).	0.4	\$56.00
7/28/2015	JR	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Receipt and review of Receiver's notice of appeal (.1).	0.1	\$0.00
7/30/2015	JR	DANCING \$: Communicate with D. Geddes regarding recording exemplification certificate and information needed for notice (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
7/31/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Reviewed and addressed docketing of civil appeal and next steps (.1).	0.1	\$0.00
8/4/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Considered deadlines for filing appearances, certificate of interested persons and corporate disclosure statement and civil appeal statement (.1).	0.1	\$0.00
8/5/2015	JR	DANCING \$: Communicate with D. Geddes regarding recording exemplification certificate and review filings (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
8/11/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Reviewed notice of counsel and civil appeal statement (.2).	0.2	\$0.00
8/11/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Finalize for filing appellate forms with Eleventh Circuit (1.0).	1.0	\$0.00
8/14/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Reviewed 11th Circuit notice of telephonic assessment conference (.1).	0.1	\$0.00
8/25/2015	ML	Work on motion for summary judgment (1.5).	1.5	\$405.00
8/27/2015	GM	D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): Reviewed approved notice of final report, Chapter 7 asset closing (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
8/28/2015	GM	D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): Reviewed order granting application for compensation (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
9/1/2015	GM	V. LEE (BANKRUPTCY): Addressed matters regarding disclosures in bankruptcy matter (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
9/1/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Addressed matters regarding appeal (.1).	0.1	\$0.00
9/2/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Reviewed briefing notice issued to appellant and appellee and considered deadlines for same (.1).	0.1	\$0.00
9/2/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Begin draft of appellant's brief (2.5); communicate with M. Lamont regarding obtaining extension of deadline to file brief (.2).	2.7	\$0.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
9/2/2015	ML	Drafted motion for summary judgment (1.3).	1.3	\$351.00
9/2/2015	ML	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Receive and review notice from 11th Circuit regarding deadline for brief (.1); DANCING \$: drafted correspondence to opposing counsel regarding extension of time to file brief (.2).	0.3	\$0.00
9/3/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Addressed matters regarding seeking extension for appellant's initial brief (.1); DANCING \$: reviewed clerk's new briefing deadline and appendix deadlines for appellant (.1).	0.2	\$0.00
9/3/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: (APPEAL): Communicate with 11th Circuit clerk to obtain extension of time to file appellant's brief (.5).	0.5	\$0.00
9/11/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Reviewed and revised initial brief (1.5).	1.5	\$0.00
9/11/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: (APPEAL) Draft appellate brief on prejudgment interest (8.0).	8.0	\$0.00
9/12/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Reviewed and revised initial brief (2.0).	2.0	\$0.00
9/14/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Reviewed and revised initial brief (.8).	0.8	\$0.00
9/14/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Revise appellate brief on prejudgment interest (3.0).	3.0	\$0.00
9/15/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Revise and finalized initial brief (1.5).	1.5	\$0.00
9/15/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Revise, finalize, and file appellate brief regarding prejudgment interest (4.0).	4.0	\$0.00
9/15/2015	MG	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Draft table of authorities for brief (.8); DANCING \$: assist with compiling multiple copies of the brief for various parties (1.1).	1.9	\$0.00
9/16/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Draft motion for permission to appeal (1.5).	1.5	\$0.00
9/21/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Prepare for and participate in mediation conference (1.5).	1.5	\$0.00
9/22/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Considered results of 11th Circuit case assessment conference (.1).	0.1	\$0.00
9/25/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Revised Receiver's motion for permission to appeal (.3).	0.3	\$0.00
9/25/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Revise motion for permission to appeal and send to SEC (.5).	0.5	\$0.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET		Asset Analysis and Recovery		
9/28/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Finalized Receiver's motion for permission to prosecute appeal (.2).	0.2	\$0.00
9/28/2015	JJP	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Revise, finalize, and file motion for permission to appeal (.5).	0.5	\$0.00
9/28/2015	JR	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$ (APPEAL): Receipt and review of Receiver's motion for permission to appeal (.1).	0.1	\$0.00
9/29/2015	GM	NO CHARGE: DANCING \$: Reviewed court's order granting Receiver's motion for permission to prosecute appeal (.1); work on proposed order (.1).	0.2	\$0.00
10/2/2015	GM	D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): Addressed matters regarding payout on receivership claim in D. Cloud bankruptcy (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
10/5/2015	JR	D. CLOUD (BANKRUPTCY): Review correspondence regarding payment from D. Cloud (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
10/27/2015	JJP	LEE: Review and revise bankruptcy motion for summary judgment regarding Lee's residence (1.0).	1.0	\$247.50
10/28/2015	JDM	D. CLOUD: Review proposed supplemental distribution plan filed by D. Cloud trustee (.1); communicate with legal team regarding same (.2).	0.2	\$38.70
Total: Asset Analysis and Recovery			62.70	\$7,571.45
Total Professional Service:			62.7	\$7,571.45

DISBURSEMENTS

Date	Description of Disbursements	Amount
E101 Photocopies		
9/15/2015	Photocopies @ .15 each (373 @ \$0.15)	\$55.95
E106 On Line Research		
7/1/2015	PACER printing costs for month of April to June 2015 (48 @ \$0.10)	\$4.80
7/24/2015	Westlaw	\$201.79
E107 Del. Services/Messengers		
7/28/2015	FedEx to J. Devlan Geddes, Esq.	\$15.48
8/4/2015	FedEx to US District Court, Tampa Florida (DANCING \$)	\$15.16

November 25, 2015
Client: 025305
Matter: 090833
Invoice #: 9432

Page: 8

DISBURSEMENTS

Date	Description of Disbursements	Amount
E112	Court Fees	
7/20/2015	Clerk of the Court, United States District Court,- Clerk of Court- fee for exemplification certificate (\$21) and certified copy of judgment (\$11)	\$32.00
8/4/2015	Clerk, U.S. District Court- Filing Fee- Dancing \$: Appellate filing fee	\$505.00
	Total Disbursements	\$830.18

Total Services	\$7,571.45
Total Disbursements	\$830.18
Total Current Charges	\$8,401.63
Previous Balance	\$76,499.28
Less Payments	(\$76,499.28)
PAY THIS AMOUNT	\$8,401.63

TASK RECAP

Services

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
ASSET - ASSET	62.7	\$7,571.45
	0	\$0.00
	0	\$0.00
	0	\$0.00
	<u>62.70</u>	<u>\$7,571.45</u>

Disbursements

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Photocopies	\$55.95
On Line Research	\$206.59
Del. Services/Messengers	\$30.64
Court Fees	\$537.00
	<u>\$830.18</u>

BREAKDOWN BY PERSON

<u>Person</u>	<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
ML Michael Lamont	ASSET - ASSET	16.6	\$4,401.00
GM Gianluca Morello	ASSET - ASSET	13.5	\$1,764.00
JJP Jared J. Perez	ASSET - ASSET	28.3	\$1,089.00
JDM Jordan D. Maglich	ASSET - ASSET	0.7	\$135.45
MG Mary Gura	ASSET - ASSET	1.9	\$0.00
JR Jeffrey Rizzo	ASSET - ASSET	1.7	\$182.00
		<u>62.70</u>	<u>\$7,571.45</u>