Exhibit 26

SRBP STICHTER RIEDEL BLAIN & POSTLER P.A.

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR. RUSSELL M. BLAIN **JODI DANIEL COOKE BECKY FERRELL-ANTON** DANIEL R. FOGARTY MATTHEW B. HALE **AMY DENTON HARRIS** BARBARA A. HART MICHAEL I. HOO! **ELENA PARAS KETCHUM**

STEPHEN R. LESLIE EDWARD J. PETERSON, III **CHARLES A. POSTLER** HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II MARK F. ROBENS SUSAN HEATH SHARP AMANDA CHAZAL SMITH DON M. STICHTER SCOTT A. STICHTER ADAM G. SUESS

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

November 30, 2015

Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve

INVOICE

Matter:

Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve

Client:

12533

For Professional Services Rendered:

and the second s			0.00
02/03/2015	SHS	Conference call with Michael Lamont regarding Vernon Lee filing bankruptcy	0.60
02/12/2015	SHS	Review schedules filed in case; dictate and revise notice of appearance	0.30
02/12/2015	SHS	Review pleadings filed in District Court and dictate notice of appearance	2.50
02/17/2015	SHS	Review the file and read pleadings drafted by the receiver in the District Court case and draft follow-up email to Michael Lamont	0.80
02/18/2015	SHS	Review of case law related to equitable lien on homestead	1.20
03/03/2015	SHS	Telephone conference with Michael Lamont	0.30
03/03/2015	SHS	Additional telephone call with Michael Lamont	0.40
03/09/2015	DRF	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding 341 issues	0.60
03/09/2015	DRF	Initial review of motion to dismiss in preparation for attendance at 341 meeting of creditors	0.10
03/09/2015	SHS	Work on revisions to motion to dismiss, and draft email to Michael Lamont regarding the same	0.40
03/09/2015	SHS	Telephone call with Michael Lamont regarding upcoming 341	0.30
03/09/2015	SHS	Office conference with Dan Fogarty regarding 341 and issues in case	0.60
03/11/2015	DRF	Telephone conference with Jared Perez and others regarding 341 meeting coverage	0.30
03/11/2015	SHS	Telephone conference with Michael Lamont, Dan Fogarty and others regarding 341 meeting coverage	0.30
03/12/2015	DRF	Attend Vernon Lee 341 meeting	1.50
03/13/2015	DRF	Receive and reply to e-mail from Michael Lamont re outcome of 341 meeting	0.10
03/17/2015	DRF	Conferences and telephone conference with Susan Sharp, Michael Lamont re 341 meeting, upcoming status conference hearing in district court	0.30
03/17/2015	SHS	Begin working on motion to dismiss for bad faith filing and research same, calls with client and review of detail documents	4.00
03/17/2015	SHS	Telephone call with Dan Fogarty regarding 341 and draft follow up email to Michael Lamont	0.30

Matter: 1		Bill # 36461	Page	2
		regarding the same		0.10
03/19/2015	DRF	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding status conference in district court		0.10
03/19/2015	SHS	Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding status conference		0.10
03/19/2015	SHS	Review and respond to email from Michael Lamont		0.10
03/20/2015	DRF	Attend hearing on status conference in district court case		0.70
03/20/2015	DRF	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding outcome of hearing		0.70
03/20/2015	SHS	Conference with Dan Fogarly regarding outcome of hearing		0.30
03/24/2015	SHS	Telephone call with Michael Lamont regarding motion to dismiss Draft objection to claim of exemptions by debtor in homestead property		1.00
04/09/2015	DRF	Telephone conference with Michael Lamont; revise objection to exemptions		0.50
04/10/2015	DRF	Prepare for hearing and attend hearing on motion to dismiss, conference with Michael I	amont	2.30
04/21/2015	SHS	following hearing, and dictate proposed order on motion to dismiss		
04/24/2015	SHS	Review and respond to email from from Skip Martin regarding proposed order		0.10
04/30/2015	SHS	Work on proof of claim to file in case, review district court docket, and draft email to Mic Lamont regarding the same	:hael	2.80
04/30/2015	SHS	Work on adversary complaint		1.20
		Total Professional Services Rendered		\$8,320.00
For Disburseme	nts Incurr	ed:		
07/18/2013		Public Access to Court Electronic Records for 2nd Quarter, 2013.		\$3.00
03/18/2015		Photocopies of motion		\$9.15
03/18/2015		Motion		\$2.88
04/23/2015		Public Access to Court Electronic Records for 1st Quarter, 2015.		\$12.10
			-	
		Total Expenses Incurred		\$27.13
		Total Expenses Incurred Recapitulation		\$27.13
· · ·		Recapitulation	nga garangan ang mga kang mga	
	Name	Recapitulation Hours	aga ga da an	Amoun
	Name Fogarty, Sharp, S	Recapitulation Hours Dan R. 6.00		
	Fogarty, Sharp, S	Recapitulation Hours Dan R. 6.00		Amoun \$1,950.00
	Fogarty, Sharp, S Total For	Recapitulation Hours Dan R. 6.00 Susan 19.60		Amoun \$1,950.00 \$6,370.00
	Fogarty, Sharp, S Total For Adjusted	Recapitulation Hours Dan R. 6.00 Susan 19.60 Professional Services Rendered 25.60 Hours		Amoun \$1,950.00 \$6,370.00 \$8,320.00
	Fogarty, Sharp, S Total For Adjusted	Recapitulation Hours 0.00 Susan 19.60 Professional Services Rendered 25.60 Hours Services Total	1900	Amoun \$1,950.00 \$6,370.00 \$8,320.00
	Fogarty, Sharp, S Total For Adjusted S Profession Disburser	Recapitulation Hours 0.00 Susan 19.60 Professional Services Rendered 25.60 Hours Services Total		Amoun \$1,950.00 \$6,370.00 \$8,320.00 \$8,320.00
	Fogarty, Sharp, S Total For Adjusted S Profession Disburser Total New	Recapitulation Hours 6.00 Susan 19.60 Professional Services Rendered 25.60 Hours Services Total nal Services ments v Charges This Invoice		Amoun \$1,950.00 \$6,370.00 \$8,320.00 \$8,320.00 \$8,320.00 \$27.13
	Fogarty, Sharp, S Total For Adjusted S Profession Disburser Total New	Recapitulation Hours 6.00 Susan 19.60 Professional Services Rendered 25.60 Hours Services Total nal Services ments v Charges This Invoice		Amoun \$1,950.00 \$6,370.00 \$8,320.00 \$8,320.00 \$27.13
	Fogarty, Sharp, S Total For Adjusted S Profession Disburser Total New Previous Less Pay	Recapitulation Hours 6.00 Susan 19.60 Professional Services Rendered 25.60 Hours Services Total nal Services ments v Charges This Invoice		Amoun \$1,950.00 \$6,370.00 \$8,320.00 \$8,320.00 \$27.13 \$8,347.13

Matter: 1 Bill # 36461 Page 3

Bill # 36461 Total Due \$8,347.13

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

SRBP STICHTER RIEDEL BLAIN & POSTLER P.A.

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR. RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL COOKE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART
MICHAEL J. HOOJ
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM

STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
AMANDA CHAZAL SMITH
DON M. STICHTER
SCOTT A. STICHTER
ADAM G. SUESS

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

November 30, 2015

Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve

INVOICE

Matter:

1

Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve

Client:

12533

For Professional Services Rendered:

05/04/2015	SHS	Review and respond to email from Michael Lamont regarding revisions to proof of claim	0.10
05/04/2015	SHS	Telephone call with Jared Perez regarding Vernon Lee deposition and interest in trust	0.30
05/04/2015	SHS	Review Vernon Lee deposition transcript	0.80
05/04/2015	SHS	Review Manon Sommers-Lee deposition transcript	0.40
05/04/2015	SHS	Revise proof of claim and forward same to Michael Lamont	0.20
05/04/2015	SHS	Review CD of 341 meeting in Chapter 13 case	0.80
05/07/2015	SAS	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding objections to discharge or dischargeability of debt	0.30
05/08/2015	SM	Finalize, file and serve complaint objecting to discharge	0.30
05/11/2015	SHS	Receipt and review of Certificate of Service from Susan McKee for filing	0.10
05/11/2015	SM	Draft certificate of service of complaint, summons and admin order and forwarding to Susan Sharp, file same	0.40
05/19/2015	DRF	Prepare for and attend hearing on objection to claim of exemptions	0.50
05/19/2015	SHS	Office conference with Dan Fogarty regarding preliminary hearing on objection to debtor's Homestead exemption	0.20
05/19/2015	SHS	Prepare for hearing on motion to dismiss, attend hearing on motion to dismiss, and meet with client following hearing	2.00
06/08/2015	SHS	Receipt and review of answer to complaint filed in adversary, draft email to Michael Lamont regarding the same, brief research on withdrawal of reference and call to Skip Martin regarding case	1.00
06/08/2015	SHS	Telephone call with Gianluca Morello regarding motion to withdraw the reference and receipt and review of email regarding the same	0.20
06/09/2015	SHS	Receipt and review of scheduling pretrial-status conference and draft email to Michael Lamont regarding the same	0.20
06/10/2015	SHS	Telephone call with Skip Martin regarding case	0.30

Matter:	1		Bill # 36462 Page	2
06/29/201	5	MR	Meeting with Susan Sharp regarding specifics of pre-trial conference	0.20
06/29/201		MR	Conference call with Susan Sharp regarding covering a pre-trial conference; review pleadings in case	0.70
06/30/201	15	MR	Meeting with Susan Sharp; contact opposing counsel's office regarding status of hearing; contact chambers regarding hearing; prepare for hearing	0.30
06/30/201	15	MR	Attend pre-trial conference	0.80
06/30/201		SHS	Communications with Skip Martin regarding continuing the hearing, office conference with Mark Robens regarding appearance at pretrial conference and additional call to Skip Martin's office regarding motion and proposed order	0.60
06/30/201	15	SHS	Office conference with Mark Robens regarding hearing and draft follow-up email to Skip Martin regarding the same	0.30
08/10/201	15	AEC	Attorney conference with Susan Sharp in preparation for hearing	0.30
08/11/201	15	SHS	Office conference with Amanda Chazal regarding outcome of hearing	0.20
08/31/201	15	SHS	Telephone call with Skip Martin regarding extension to file Rule 26 disclosures and draft follow up email regarding the same	0.20
08/31/201	15	SHS	Telephone call with Gianluca Morella regarding Rule 26 disclosures	0.20
08/31/201	15	SM	Emails, review file, draft witness list and initial disclosures in adversary proceeding, forwarding to Susan Sharp	0.50
09/01/20	15	SHS	Draft follow up email to Gianluca Morella regarding Rule 26 disclosures and respond to email from Gianluca Morella	0.20
09/03/20	15	SHS	Work on motion for summary judgment	3.50
09/08/20		DRF	Prepare initial disclosures in Lee adversary proceeding	1.40
09/08/20		SHS	Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding Rule 26 disclosures	0.40
09/08/20		SHS	Review and respond to email from Skip Martin regarding Rule 26 disclosure	0.10
09/09/20		SHS	Work throughout the day on summary judgment motion	4.50
09/10/20	15	SHS	Call to client and draft follow up email regarding the same	0.20
09/10/20		SHS	Work on Rule 26 disclosures, and witness list, and telephone call with Skip Martin regarding the same	1.50
10/12/20	15	SHS	Review file and work on motion for summary judgment and related research	2.00
10/13/20	15	SHS	Work throughout the day on motion for summary judgment and office conferences with Matt Hale regarding the same	6.50
10/14/20	15	MBH	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding research on equitable lien issue	0.20
10/14/20	15	MBH	Review draft motion for summary judgment	0.20
10/14/20	15	MBH	Research of law regarding foreclosure of equitable lien in bankruptcy	1.10
10/14/20	15	MBH	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding motion for summary judgment	0.70
10/14/20	15	MBH	Prepare for conference with Susan Sharp regarding motion for summary judgment	0.20
10/14/20	15	MBH	Research of law for motion for summary judgment	0.90
10/14/20	15	MBH	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding motion for summary judgment	0.40 0.50
10/14/20	15	MBH	Research of law regarding homestead exemption exception	0.30
10/14/20	15	MBH	Revise and edit motion for summary judgment	1.20
10/14/20	115	MBH	Draft motion for summary judgment	2.50
10/14/20	15	SHS	Additional work on motion for summary judgment and review of related research	0.70
10/14/20	115	SHS	Office conference with Matt Hale regarding issues related to summary judgment motion	0.70
10/14/20	15	SHS	Telephone conference with Michael Lamont regarding summary judgment	1.10
10/15/20	15	MBH	Draft motion for summary judgment	0.30
10/15/20	15	MBH	Review Yip affidavit on tracing	0.30
10/15/20	115	MBH	Work on motion for summary judgment	0.70
10/15/20	15	MBH	Work on motion for summary judgment	1.50
10/15/20	15	SHS	Work on motion for summary judgment	0.40
10/20/20		MBH	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding motion for summary judgment	0.40
10/20/20	15	МВН	Research of law regarding constructive trust	0.30

Matter: 1	1	Bill # 36462		Page	3
0/20/2015	МВН	Research of law regarding constructive	trusts		0.5
0/20/2015					0.9
0/20/2015					1.2
0/20/2015					0.5
0/20/2015	and the state of t			y judgment	0.3
0/20/2015	MBH	Research of law regarding unjust enrice	hment		0.3
0/21/2015	MBH	Research of law regarding bankruptcy	court equitable powers		0.2
0/21/2015	мвн	Complete motion for summary judgme			1.0
0/21/2015	MBH	Conferences with Susan Sharp regard			0.3
0/21/2015	SHS	Review and respond to emails from Mi	chael Lamont regarding deadlines and u	pcoming trial	0.1
0/21/2015	SHS	Work on finalizing draft of Motion for S regarding the same	ummary Judgment and draft email to M	ichael Lamont	0.8
or Dieburgs	ements incurr	arl·	Total Professional Services Rendered	İ	\$15,885.0
	SUICUM MOUN	U.S. Bankruptcy Court; Court Costs to	file Complaint		\$350.0
5/08/2015			me Complaint		\$6.7
5/08/2015		Postage charges Westlaw Online Research for April, 20	15		\$199.1
5/18/2015		Westlaw Online Research for May, 20			\$142.2
06/06/2015		Public Access to Court Electronic Rec			\$51.9
7/15/2015					\$9.4
7/15/2015		Westlaw Online Research for June, 20			\$65.0
)9/22/2015 10/28/2015		Westlaw online research for August, 2 Public Access to Court Electronic Rec			\$2.2
			Total Expenses Incurred		\$826.
			Recapitulation		
	Name		Hours		Amou
	Chazal.	Amanda E	0.30		\$60.0
	Fogarty,		0.50		\$162.5
	Fogarty,		1.40		\$490.0
	Hale, Ma		14.90		\$3,129.0
	Robens,		2.00		\$380.0
		Scott A.	0.30		\$123.0
	Sharp, S		8.10		\$2,632.5
	Sharp, S		24.80		\$8,680.0
	McKee,		1.20		\$228.0
	Total For	Professional Services Rendered	53.50 Hours		\$15,885.0
	Adjusted	Services Total			\$15,885.0
	Professio	nal Services			\$15,885.0
	Disburse				\$826.5
110 East Madi Tampa, Florida T 813.229-01 F 813-229-18	144	1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57 Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009 T 239,939,5518 F 239,939,5568	41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111 Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669 T 850.637.1836 F 850.791.6545	4475 Legendar Destin, Florida T 850.460.762 F 850.424-660	32541-9306 76

Matter:	1	Bill # 36462	Page	4
	Total New Charges This In	voice		\$16,711.59
	Previous Balance Less Payments Received			\$8,347.13 (\$0.00)
	Outstanding Balance			\$8,347.13
	New Charges This Invoice			\$16,711.59
		Tota	al Due	\$25,058.72
Bill#	36462			

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You