

Exhibit 22

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL COOKE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART
MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM

STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
AMANDA CHAZAL SMITH
DON M. STICHTER
SCOTT A. STICHTER
ADAM G. SUESS

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

August 19, 2016

Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve

INVOICE

Matter: 1
Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve
Client: 12533
For Professional Services Rendered:

11/13/2015	MBH	Review edits from Receiver; research of law regarding constructive trust; draft email regarding edits and constructive trust theory of recovery	0.50
11/13/2015	SHS	Receipt and review of emails from Jared Perez regarding revisions to motion for summary judgment, revise motion for summary judgment and forward changes to Jared Perez	1.00
11/17/2015	SHS	Review and respond to email from Jared Perez and review scheduling order	0.30
11/19/2015	MBH	Review emails regarding motion for summary judgment; review client's edits of motion for summary judgment	0.20
11/19/2015	SHS	Draft follow up email to client	0.10
11/20/2015	MBH	Emails and calls with assistant regarding filing of motion for summary judgment and exhibits	0.20
11/20/2015	MBH	Make revisions to motion for summary judgment; conference with Susan Sharp regarding motion for summary judgment; work with assistant to file motion for summary judgment	1.30
11/20/2015	SHS	Draft additional email to client regarding motion for summary judgment	0.10
11/20/2015	SHS	Telephone calls with Gianluca Morello, work on finalizing motion for summary judgment and Exhibits and conference with Matt Hale regarding the same	1.20
12/01/2015	SHS	Telephone call with Michael Lamont regarding status of motion for summary judgment and upcoming trial	0.20
12/01/2015	SHS	Review and respond to email from Maya Lockwood	0.10
12/08/2015	SHS	Receipt and review of corrected notice and draft email to client regarding the same	0.30
12/31/2015	MBH	Review response to receiver's motion for summary judgment; receive email from Susan Sharp regarding same; respond with comments regarding same	0.40
12/31/2015	SHS	Review of Vernon Lee's Response to motion for summary judgment and draft follow-up email to Michael Lamont and Matt Hale	0.40
01/04/2016	MBH	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding response; review emails regarding response; review draft response filed by Receiver in District Court action	0.30

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229-0144
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424-6604

01/04/2016	SHS	Additional review of Lee's response to motion for summary judgment, draft email to client, and office conference with Matt Hale regarding reply to Lee's response	1.60
01/05/2016	MBH	Review deadline to file Reply; draft and send email to Susan Sharp regarding deadline; begin draft of Reply to Defendants' Response to the Receiver's motion for partial summary judgment; Receive and review email and attachment from Tom Dearaujo regarding Yip tracing analysis for Reply	1.70
01/05/2016	MBH	Prepare for call with Jared Perez regarding reply to Lee's response to motion for partial summary judgment; call regarding same; conference with Susan Sharp regarding drafting of reply	0.60
01/05/2016	SHS	Office conference with Matt Hale, telephone call with Jared Perez regarding reply to Lee's response to motion for partial summary judgment, review email from Jared Perez with attached documents from Tom Dearaujo and review of restatement, begin working on reply, and telephone call with Tom Dearaujo regarding the same	3.00
01/06/2016	MBH	Work on Reply to Response to Motion for Summary Judgment; review and analyze Yip Declaration regarding tracing; research and analysis regarding tracing and unjust enrichment	3.90
01/06/2016	SHS	Telephone call with Skip Martin regarding motion for summary judgment	0.20
01/07/2016	MBH	Drafting of Reply to Defendants' Response to the Receiver's motion for partial summary judgment; research of law regarding homestead exemption, improvements or renovations, and equitable liens or constructive trusts	4.80
01/07/2016	SHS	Work on response to Vernon Lee's response to motion for partial summary judgment and brief office conference with Matt Hale regarding the same	1.50
01/08/2016	MBH	Complete drafting of Reply to Defendants' Response to the Receiver's motion for partial summary judgment; Revise and edit Reply to Defendants Response to Receiver's Motion for Summary Judgment; Final review of Reply to Defendants' Response to the Receiver's motion for partial summary judgment; send email transmitting draft of Reply to Jared Perez	4.00
01/08/2016	SHS	Office conference with Matt Hale regarding response, review and revise response, and receipt and review of email to Jerry Perez regarding the same	1.20
01/11/2016	MBH	Revise motion to abate; draft order granting motion to abate	0.40
01/11/2016	MBH	Review emails and voicemail from Jared Perez with comments on Reply to Defendants' Response to Receiver's Motion for Summary Judgment; work on and make revisions to Reply; final edit and review of Reply prior to filing; send email to Jared Perez regarding final review prior to filing, and office conference with Susan Sharp	2.80
01/11/2016	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Jerry Perez, receipt and review of email from Michael Lamont, receipt and review of email from Gianluca Morello, and office conference with Matt Hale regarding response to summary judgment	0.30
01/11/2016	SHS	Review and revise motion to abate proceedings pending hearing on motion for summary judgment, draft email to Skip Martin regarding the same	0.20
01/12/2016	SHS	Review and respond to email from Skip Martin regarding canceling trial pending outcome of motion for summary judgment	0.10
01/13/2016	MBH	Call with chambers regarding motion to abate; conference with Susan Sharp regarding same; call with Judge May law clerk regarding order; conference with Susan Sharp regarding order; Draft motion to abate evidentiary hearing and consideration of objection to exemption in main bankruptcy case; draft order regarding same; draft and send email to Skip Martin regarding consent to file as agreed	1.70
01/15/2016	MBH	Receive email from Skip Martin regarding consent to abatement motion and order (main case); final review and email to assistant regarding filing	0.20
01/18/2016	MBH	Emails and review regarding hearing date and scheduling	0.20
01/20/2016	MBH	Call with Susan Sharp regarding Friday's hearing; review docket for status of hearing on motion for summary judgment; conference with Susan Sharp regarding preparation for hearing on motion for summary judgment; review motion, response, and reply for case law to be printed at hearing; conference with law clerk regarding printing and organizing case law	1.00
01/20/2016	SHS	Review file and draft email to client and call with Matt Hale	0.30
01/21/2016	MBH	Preparation for summary judgment hearing; conferences with Susan Sharp throughout the day regarding same	2.50
01/21/2016	SHS	Begin preparing for hearing on motion for summary judgment	3.50
01/22/2016	MBH	Prepare for, travel to, attend, and return from hearing on motion for partial summary judgment	1.00

01/22/2016	SHS	Continue preparing for hearing on motion for summary judgment, reread cases cited	3.00
01/22/2016	SHS	Attend hearing on motion for summary judgment and meet with client before and after hearing	1.00
02/01/2016	MBH	Review and analyze Defendants' memorandum of law regarding tracing; conference with Susan Sharp regarding response to Defendants' memorandum of law	1.10
02/01/2016	SHS	Review response filed by Vernon Lee and quick research of case law cited	0.70
02/01/2016	SHS	Review and respond to email from Burt Wiand regarding response filed by Vernon Lee	0.10
02/01/2016	SHS	Office conference with Matt Hale regarding response	0.50
02/02/2016	MBH	Research of law regarding tracing	0.40
02/03/2016	MBH	Research of law on tracing and other issues from the Defendants memorandum of law	3.00
02/03/2016	MBH	Work on Response to Memorandum of Law	1.20
02/04/2016	MBH	Draft response to defendants' post-hearing memorandum of law; conference with Susan Sharp regarding revisions; revise and send draft response to Jared Perez	3.60
02/04/2016	SHS	Follow up with Jared Perez in the response to memorandum of law and finalize same	0.40
02/05/2016	MBH	Review Jared Perez edits to response memorandum; email assistant regarding same; make revisions and complete final edit; file	0.80
06/23/2016	SHS	Review and respond to email from Michael Lamont, follow up with Judge May's law clerk, and call to Michael Lamont regarding the same	0.30
07/26/2016	SHS	Draft follow-up email to Michael Lamont and Gianluca Morello	0.10

Total Professional Services Rendered \$15,533.00

For Disbursements Incurred:

11/12/2015	Westlaw Online research for October, 2015.	\$225.21
01/14/2016	Postage charges	\$5.75
01/26/2016	Public Access to Court Electronic Records for 4th Quarter, 2015.	\$13.70
02/09/2016	Westlaw Online Research for January, 2016.	\$177.48
03/14/2016	Westlaw Online Research for February, 2016.	\$143.13
04/28/2016	Public Access to Court Electronic Records 1st. Quarter, 2016.	\$5.60
07/19/2016	Public Access to Court Electronic Records for 2nd Quarter, 2016.	\$2.60
Total Expenses Incurred		\$573.47

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Hale, Matt B	37.80	\$7,938.00
Sharp, Susan	21.70	\$7,595.00
Total For Professional Services Rendered		59.50 Hours \$15,533.00
Adjusted Services Total		\$15,533.00
Professional Services		\$15,533.00
Disbursements		\$573.47
Total New Charges This Invoice		\$16,106.47

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229-0144
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424-6604

Previous Balance	\$25,058.72
Less Payments Received	<u>(\$25,058.72)</u>
Outstanding Balance	\$0.00
New Charges This Invoice	<u>\$16,106.47</u>
	<u><u>\$16,106.47</u></u>

Bill # 37805 Total Due

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229-0144
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424-6604