

# **EXHIBIT 17**

**SRBP** STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.  
RUSSELL M. BLAIN  
JODI DANIEL COOKE  
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON  
DANIEL R. FOGARTY  
MATTHEW B. HALE  
AMY DENTON HARRIS  
BARBARA A. HART  
MICHAEL J. HOQI

ELENA PARAS KETCHUM  
STEPHEN R. LESLIE  
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III  
CHARLES A. POSTLER  
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II  
MARK F. ROBENS  
SUSAN HEATH SHARP  
DON M. STICHTER  
SCOTT A. STICHTER

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

August 21, 2018

Wiand, Burton W., Receiver - Nadel

**INVOICE**

Matter: 1

Wiand, Burton W. Receiver - Ve

Client: 12533

For Professional Services Rendered:

06/23/2017	MBH	Receipt and review of memorandum opinion; conference with Susan Sharp regarding same	0.50
06/23/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of order on receiver's motion for partial summary judgment—imposition of equitable lien on homestead and constructive trust, and office conference with Matt Hale	0.80
06/23/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding upcoming hearing	0.20
06/26/2017	SHS	Telephone conference with Michael Lamont (.4) regarding post judgment briefing and draft follow up email to Burt Wiand	0.60
06/26/2017	SHS	Begin working on memorandum for request for prejudgment interest	1.00
06/26/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of additional email from Michael Lamont and review of attached briefing and case law and detailed review of Judge May's opinion	1.20
06/27/2017	MBH	Research on prejudgment interest issues	0.50
06/27/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Michael Lamont regarding postjudgment interest	0.20
06/27/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Skip Martin regarding postjudgment interest	0.20
07/06/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Michael Lamont, telephone conference with Michael Lamont regarding pre-judgment interest	0.40
07/07/2017	SHS	Review and revise supplemental memorandum for an award of prejudgment interest and review of Yip amended declaration	2.40
07/10/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of Lee's memo on prejudgment interest and draft detailed email to client regarding the same	1.00
07/14/2017	MBH	Review materials and filings in advance of hearing	0.30
07/17/2017	MBH	Call with Burt Wiand, Michael Lamont, and Susan Sharp regarding hearing	0.20
07/17/2017	MBH	Call with Skip Martin and Susan Sharp; conference with Susan Sharp regarding hearing	1.00
07/17/2017	SHS	Conference call with Skip Martin and Matt Hale	0.50
07/17/2017	SHS	Office conference with Matt Hale regarding tomorrow's hearing	0.80

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200  
Tampa, Florida 33602  
T 813.229-0144  
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57  
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009  
T 239.939.5518  
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111  
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669  
T 850.637.1836  
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40  
Destin, Florida 32541-9306  
T 850.460.7676  
F 850.424-6604

07/17/2017	SHS	Telephone conference with Michael Lamont, Burt Wiand and Matt Hale regarding strategy for pending matters related to the 727 action	0.40
07/18/2017	MBH	Prepare for, travel to, attend, and return from hearing on prejudgment interest	2.30
07/18/2017	MBH	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding hearing; call with Michael Lamont and Ms. Sharp regarding hearing; further call with Michael Lamont regarding next steps	0.50
07/21/2017	MBH	Receive and review final judgment; draft and send email to client; brief research on constructive trust	0.30
07/24/2017	MBH	Conference with Susan Sharp; research of law on constructive trust enforcement	1.60
07/24/2017	SHS	Office conference with Matt Hale	0.20
07/24/2017	SM	Search public records and forwarding of lis pendens notice to Matthew Hale	0.20
07/25/2017	MBH	Drafting of stay motion for constructive trust; further research regarding same	2.10
07/25/2017	MBH	Receive and review emails and comments regarding filing; draft and send email to Susan Sharp regarding filing	0.20
07/25/2017	SHS	Work on appeal and forward detailed email to Burt Wiand and Michael Lamont	2.10
07/25/2017	SM	Conferences with Susan Sharp and Matthew Hale, revise motion confirming stay not in effect with hearing legend, finalize and file same	0.40
07/26/2017	MBH	Draft and sent email regarding final judgment to Michael Lamont	0.10
07/27/2017	SHS	Review pleadings file in appeal, and review prior district court docket, and draft email to client regarding the same	1.20
07/28/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Michael Lamont regarding District Court of Appeal	0.10
08/01/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Jared Perez regarding Vernon Lee's bankruptcy schedules and forward motion for partial summary judgment and response to Lee's post hearing memorandum	0.40
08/07/2017	MBH	Prepare for hearing	0.70
08/08/2017	MBH	Review notes from hearing; drafting of order confirming stay not in effect; review motion	0.50
08/08/2017	MBH	Prepare for hearing on automatic stay order; travel to, attend, and return from hearing and office conference with Susan Sharp	3.00
08/08/2017	SHS	Office conference with Matt Hale regarding hearing, review proposed draft of order	0.30
08/08/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of record designation filed with bankruptcy court and draft email to Jared Perez regarding the same	0.20
08/09/2017	MBH	Review form of order; draft and send email to Skip Martin regarding order submission	0.10
08/10/2017	MBH	Receive and review comments on order from opposing counsel; revise order; draft and send email to opposing counsel; Emails regarding order; call with Burt Wiand	0.40
08/14/2017	MBH	Revise order; review emails; draft and send email regarding revised order to opposing counsel	0.20
08/17/2017	MBH	Receive and respond to email from Jared Perez regarding order	0.10
08/17/2017	SHS	Draft email to Jared Perez regarding entry of order confirming that automatic stay is not in effect, and dictate certificate of service	0.30
08/17/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Jared Perez, review documents as part of the record and respond to email regarding the same	0.20
08/17/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of documents included in the record on appeal and draft email to Jared Perez regarding the same	0.40
11/07/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Jared Perez regarding appeal and review file regarding the same	0.20
11/30/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Burt Wiand regarding correspondence from Mike Markham and Alan Gassman	0.30
12/28/2017	SHS	Office conference with Matt Hale regarding new trial date	0.30
01/16/2018	SHS	Telephone call with Michael Lamont and Jared Perez regarding status of appeal, review file regarding trial preparation, and draft email to Skip Martin regarding deposition dates	0.40
01/16/2018	SHS	Telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding upcoming trial	0.20
01/17/2018	MBH	Review of documents and pleadings in preparation for trial; conference with Susan Sharp regarding trial preparation	0.30
01/17/2018	SHS	Office conference with Matt Hale regarding trial strategy in preparation	0.30
01/19/2018	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Michael Lamont regarding continuing hearing and draft	0.20

		email to Skip Martin regarding the same, and review and respond to email from Matt Hale regarding the same	
01/22/2018	MBH	Drafting of motion to continue trial; emails to client and opposing counsel regarding same; review of trial preparation notes; drafting of task list for discovery in continued trial	1.70
01/23/2018	MBH	Receive email from opposing counsel regarding motion to continue; finalize for filing; call with chambers regarding trial rescheduling; drafting of proposed order	0.70
01/29/2018	MBH	Receive and review order continuing trial; draft and send email regarding same	0.10
Total Professional Services Rendered			\$9,724.00

## For Disbursements Incurred:

06/23/2017		Photocopies of Doc 34	\$1.20
06/23/2017		Photocopies of Doc 30	\$1.20
06/23/2017		Postage Doc 34	\$2.30
06/23/2017		Postage Doc 30	\$2.30
06/27/2017		Postage Doc 33	\$0.67
07/14/2017		Public Access to Court Electronic Records for 2nd Quarter, 2017.	\$1.90
08/30/2017		Westlaw Online Research, July, 2017.	\$265.90
09/28/2017		Westlaw Online Research, August, 2017.	\$21.06
10/12/2017		PACER Online USBC research for 3rd Quarter 2017.	\$63.90
02/20/2018		Westlaw Online Research for January, 2018.	\$9.71
04/27/2018		Public Access to Court Electronic Records for the 1st Quarter, 2018.	\$10.50
Total Expenses Incurred			\$380.64

## Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Hale, Matt B.	17.40	\$3,654.00
Sharp, Susan	17.00	\$5,950.00
McKee, Susan	0.60	\$120.00
Total For Professional Services Rendered		35.00 Hours
Adjusted Services Total		\$9,724.00
Professional Services		\$9,724.00
Disbursements		\$380.64
Total New Charges This Invoice		\$10,104.64
Previous Balance		\$10,633.64
Less Payments Received		(\$0.00)
Less Adjustments		\$10,633.64 CR
Outstanding Balance		\$0.00

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200  
Tampa, Florida 33602  
T 813.229-0144  
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite HS7  
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009  
T 239.939.5518  
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111  
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669  
T 850.637.1836  
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40  
Destin, Florida 32541-9306  
T 850.460.7676  
F 850.424-6604

---

New Charges This Invoice

\$10,104.64

Total Due

\$10,104.64

---

---

Bill # 41306

Date Last Payment

December/04/2017

Last Payment Amount

\$287.28

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

---

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200  
Tampa, Florida 33602  
T 813.229-0144  
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57  
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009  
T 239.939.5518  
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111  
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669  
T 850.637.1836  
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40  
Destin, Florida 32541-9306  
T 850.460.7676  
F 850.424-6604

**SRBP** STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.  
RUSSELL M. BLAIN  
JODI DANIEL COOKE  
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON  
DANIEL R. FOGARTY  
MATTHEW B. HALE  
AMY DENTON HARRIS  
BARBARA A. HART  
MICHAEL J. HOOL

ELENA PARAS KETCHUM  
STEPHEN R. LESLIE  
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III  
CHARLES A. POSTLER  
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II  
MARK F. ROBENS  
SUSAN HEATH SHARP  
DON M. STICHTER  
SCOTT A. STICHTER

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

August 21, 2018

Burton W. Wiand, Receiver  
5505 W. Gray Street  
Tampa, FL 33609

INVOICE

Matter: 3  
Wiand, Burton W. - Nadel/Rite-  
Client: 12744  
For Professional Services Rendered:

04/03/2017	SHS	Review pleadings filed in case relating to Wells Fargo, telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding the same (.2), review emails from Steve Wirth, and related research, and draft follow up emails to Jeffrey Rizzo regarding Rite Aid rents	4.50
04/03/2017	SHS	Review and respond to emails from Burt Wiand (3x) and review and respond to email from Jeffrey Rizzo (2x)	0.30
04/17/2017	SHS	Draft detailed email to Steve Wirth and circulate draft to client	0.80
04/17/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Burt Wiand regarding rent and payment of interest	0.30
04/18/2017	SHS	Work on detailed analysis from spreadsheets prepared by client for all properties covered by Wells Fargo mortgages and email same to client	3.10
04/24/2017	SHS	Draft email to client	0.10
04/24/2017	SHS	Telephone call to Steve Wirth and draft email regarding the same	0.20
04/26/2017	SHS	Communications with client regarding settlement offer, draft email settlement offer to Steve Wirth, and receipt and review of email from Steve Wirth	1.10
05/19/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from client, draft email regarding settlement offer	0.40
05/19/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Steve Wirth and related follow up with Burt Wiand's office	0.30
05/24/2017	SHS	Draft email to Burt Wiand regarding mediation, telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding settlement with Wells Fargo, follow up with Steve Wirth, telephone call with Donald Kirk regarding mediation with Wells Fargo	0.70
05/25/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Steve Wirth regarding Wells Fargo and follow up with Burt Wiand, and begin draft of settlement motion.	1.60
05/30/2017	SHS	Begin working on draft of motion to authorize disbursement to Wells Fargo from sale proceeds	3.00
05/31/2017	SHS	Continue working on motion for order to release funds, follow up calls with Jeffrey Rizzo, review and respond to emails from Steve Wirth regarding NC property and inspection	4.00

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200  
Tampa, Florida 33602  
T 813.229-0144  
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57  
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009  
T 239.939.5518  
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111  
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669  
T 850.637.1836  
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40  
Destin, Florida 32541-9306  
T 850.460.7676  
F 850.424-6604

05/31/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Steve Wirth regarding environmental site assessment and draft email to Burt Wiand regarding the same	0.20
06/01/2017	SHS	Work on motion to compromise and additional follow up with Jeff Rizzo regarding the same	3.50
06/02/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Sean Keefe, revise settlement motion, and email draft of same to Steve Wirth	0.30
06/02/2017	SHS	Continue working on settlement motion in Wells Fargo matter, call to Sean Keefe and draft follow up email regarding Wells Fargo settlement	3.80
06/07/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Jeff Rizzo and respond to same	0.20
06/09/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from John Dicks, and review revisions to motion to disburse funds	0.70
06/09/2017	SHS	Work on revisions to motion to disburse Wells Fargo's funds, and draft email to Burt Wiand regarding the same	3.70
06/12/2017	SHS	Work on additional revisions to disbursement motion and draft email to Steve Wirth regarding the same	2.60
06/12/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of additional email from Steve Wirth, review file and draft follow-up email to Steve Wirth regarding the same	0.40
06/12/2017	SHS	Work on finalizing motion, collecting exhibits, and email to Susan McKee for filing	3.30
06/12/2017	SHS	Review email from Burt Wiand, review prior court order on Rite Aid sale, and draft response to Burt Wiand	0.60
06/12/2017	SHS	Review 11th circuit opinion relating to issues on extinguishment of liens and draft email to Sean O'Keefe regarding the same	0.80
06/12/2017	SM	Work on Motion to Approve Settlement, finalize and file with exhibits, review local rules regarding submitting of proposed orders	0.70
06/13/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Josh Dell regarding motion to extend time to file an objection to disbursement motion, and draft email to Burt Wiand regarding the same	0.30
06/13/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Steve Wirth to Josh Dell	0.10
06/13/2017	SHS	Additional call with Burt Wiand regarding disbursement motion	0.30
06/13/2017	SHS	Draft email; to Josh Dell regarding motion to extend time	0.20
06/13/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Burt Wiand, conference call with Burt Wiand, draft emails to Bob Levenson, calls with Bob Levenson regarding motion to disburse sale proceeds	1.70
06/13/2017	SM	Calls with Susan Sharp regarding Wells Fargo settlement motion and proposed order	0.20
06/20/2017	SHS	Work on revisions to order on Wells Fargo settlement Between Bellasara and Wells Fargo, and circulate same	0.40
06/20/2017	SHS	Telephone calls with Burt Wiand regarding banks request for interest, receipt and review of email from Steve Wirth and respond to same	0.50
06/20/2017	SHS	Review and respond to additional emails from Steve Wirth, review and respond to emails from Martin Garcia regarding proposed order, follow up with chambers regarding proposed order, and submit revised order	3.30
06/20/2017	SM	Download and save filed version of motion to disburse and exhibits	0.20
06/21/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Steve Wirth regarding proposed order	0.10
06/21/2017	SHS	Draft additional email to Steve Wirth regarding bank's new claim for interest	0.20
06/21/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Jeffrey Rizzo regarding amounts of distribution	0.30
06/21/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Martin Garcia regarding distributions	0.30
06/21/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of additional email from Martin Garcia and forward same to Jeffrey Rizzo regarding disbursements from settlement funds	0.40
06/21/2017	SHS	Work on revision to the court's orders regarding agreement with Martin Garcia's client and bank, calls with Martin Garcia and Steve Wirth, revisions to disbursements and order, and respond to several emails regarding the same	2.60
06/21/2017	SM	Finalize and file motion to clarify orders	0.20
06/22/2017	SHS	Draft email to Steve Wirth and Martin Garcia regarding status of wire transfers	0.20
06/22/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Steve Wirth, follow up with client regarding status of wire transfers and draft email to Steve Wirth	0.30
06/23/2017	SHS	Receipt of email from Martin Garcia regarding confirmation of settlement funds and forward same to Jeffrey Rizzo	0.20

06/29/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Jeff Rizzo, follow up with Steve Wirth, and draft email to Jeff Rizzo regarding the same	0.30
07/06/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of multiple emails regarding wire transfer in connection with Wells Fargo settlement	0.30
07/10/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of emails regarding wire transfer to Wells Fargo	0.20
07/25/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Shelley McNellis and attach fee application to same	0.70
07/26/2017	SHS	Draft email to Burt Wiand regarding mediation, and telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding the same	0.40
07/31/2017	SHS	Work on coordination of mediation between Wells Fargo and receiver, telephone conference with Burt Wiand	0.40
08/10/2017	SHS	Follow-up on scheduling mediation with Wells Fargo	0.30
08/14/2017	SHS	Draft email to client regarding follow-up on mediation	0.20
08/21/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Burt Wiand regarding mediation and respond to same	0.20
08/28/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Maya Lockwood regarding motion for interim distribution	0.20
08/29/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Michael Lamont regarding interim distribution	0.20
08/29/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Maya Lockwood regarding interim distribution	0.30
08/31/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of motion for 7th interim distribution	0.30
08/31/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding mediation	0.40
08/31/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Steve Wirth regarding pending matters in mediation	0.30
09/01/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Burt Wiand	0.10
09/05/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding transfer of the Laurel Preserve property to Wells Fargo	0.30
09/06/2017	SHS	Review and respond to multiple emails from Steve Wirth regarding wiring of funds, follow up with Jeff Rizzo, and calls with client regarding the same	0.60
09/14/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Burt Wiand (.3) regarding issues pertaining to receivers deed/bank's foreclosure and draft email to Steve Wirth (.3) regarding the same	0.60
09/14/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Steve Wirth	0.20
09/14/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Jeff Rizzo regarding settlement funds from Wells Fargo, draft response regarding the same	0.20
09/14/2017	SHS	Review and respond to additional email from Steve Wirth	0.30
09/18/2017	SHS	Review and respond to emails from Donald Kirk regarding mediation	0.20
09/25/2017	SHS	Work on mediation statement, office conference with Scott Stichter regarding theory, and draft email to Burt Wiand regarding the same	5.50
09/25/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Donald Kirk regarding Receiver's position and mediation	0.40
09/26/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Steve Wirth regarding bank's position to proceed with foreclosure upon receipt of funds, confirm receipt of funds with Jeff Rizzo and receipt of appraisal	0.60
09/26/2017	SHS	Dictate and revise notice of receipt of Wells Fargo settlement payment	0.40
09/28/2017	SHS	Continue working on mediation statement, research related issues, and calls with Burt Wiand regarding the same	4.70
09/27/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Donald Kirk regarding mediation	0.60
09/27/2017	SHS	Draft follow-up email to Donald Kirk regarding Wells Fargo's claim	0.30
09/27/2017	SHS	Prepare for call with Donald Kirk regarding Wells Fargo	0.40
09/27/2017	SHS	Preparation for mediation	1.20
09/28/2017	SHS	Attend mediation and meet with Sean Keefe following mediation.	5.50
10/09/2017	SHS	Telephone call from Donald Kirk regarding continued settlement discussions, review file and draft email to Burt Wiand regarding settlement offer, and additional call to Donald Kirk and draft email to Donald Kirk regarding the same.	0.70
10/13/2017	SHS	Telephone call from Steve Wirth regarding Wells Fargo's position	0.30
10/16/2017	SHS	Telephone call with client and draft email to client and follow up	0.30
10/16/2017	SHS	Telephone call from Steve Wirth regarding Wells Fargo's position	0.30
10/16/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Donald Kirk regarding Wells Fargo's position	0.20

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200  
Tampa, Florida 33602  
T 813.229-0144  
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57  
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009  
T 239.939.5518  
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111  
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669  
T 850.637.1836  
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40  
Destin, Florida 32541-9306  
T 850.460.7676  
F 850.424-6604



10/18/2017	SHS	Draft follow-up email to Steve Wirth	0.10
10/18/2017	SHS	Draft email to Sean Keefe regarding email from Steve Wirth	0.10
10/26/2017	SHS	Review and respond to email from Steve Wirth	0.10
10/27/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Steve Wirth, and follow up with Burt Wiand regarding the same	0.40
11/13/2017	SHS	Respond to email from Steve Wirth	0.10
11/13/2017	SHS	Office meeting with client regarding filing chapter 7, brief office conference with Susan McKee regarding the same	1.80
11/17/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding Wells Fargo	0.30
11/17/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Steve Wirth and draft follow up email to client and Sean Keefe regarding the same, and brief review of attachment of Wirth's email	0.60
11/21/2017	MBH	Call with Susan Sharp regarding settlement offer and associated proposed filings of Wells Fargo; call with Ms. Sharp and Donald Kirk regarding same; further calls and emails with Ms. Sharp regarding same; review of documents	1.20
11/21/2017	MBH	Review of Wells Fargo motion for turnover and motion for administrative expense claim; drafting of summary memorandum regarding same	4.50
11/21/2017	SHS	Telephone calls with Sean Keefe regarding drafts of pleadings from Steve Wirth, telephone call with Donald Kirk and Sean Keefe, telephone call with Matt Hale regarding attorney fees issues, and begin research of same	3.70
11/21/2017	SHS	Work on memo to client, telephone calls with Sean Keefe and Burt Wiand regarding Wells Fargo, calls with Matt Hale regarding status of research	3.50
11/22/2017	MBH	Work on review of Wells Fargo motions and drafting of memo	1.30
11/27/2017	SHS	Work on email to Steve Wirth, and telephone call with Sean Keefe regarding the same, revise email to Steve Wirth, telephone call with Burt Wiand and Sean Keefe regarding the same, additional call with Burt Wiand, and revise email accordingly	1.40
11/28/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of additional email from Steve Wirth	0.10
11/28/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Steve Wirth and forward same to Burt Wiand	0.10
11/29/2017	SHS	Review file notes in advance of telephone conference with Donald Kirk, conference call with Donald Kirk and Sean Keefe (.6), and conference call with Sean Keefe following call with Donald Kirk (.5), and telephone call with Burt Wiand and Sean Keefe (.3) regarding proposed settlement discussions with bank, and draft detailed email to Donald Kirk regarding the same and additional call with Sean Keefe regarding the same	2.70
11/30/2017	SHS	Telephone call from Donald Kirk regarding settlement discussions with bank	0.40
11/30/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Donald Kirk, and forward same to client and Sean Keefe	0.20
11/30/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Steve Wirth and forward information to Burt Wiand regarding contact person at Wells Fargo	0.20
12/01/2017	SHS	Telephone call with Donald Kirk regarding renewed settlement discussions with bank, telephone call with Sean Keefe regarding the same, and telephone further Sean Keefe and Burt Wiand regarding further settlement discussions, and review of related emails	0.80
12/01/2017	SHS	Additional call with Burt Wiand regarding Wells	0.30
12/06/2017	MBH	Review documents and pleadings; drafting research of law regarding admin claim	2.00
12/07/2017	MBH	Review motion for admin expense claim and work on response	1.70
12/07/2017	MBH	Research of law	1.40
12/11/2017	SHS	Work on Objection/response to Wells Fargo	3.50
12/12/2017	MBH	Work on response to admin claim motion	1.70
12/12/2017	SHS	Begin working on response to Wells Fargo turnover motion	3.00
12/13/2017	MBH	Work on response to admin claim motion	5.20
12/13/2017	SHS	Work on objection and review of pleadings filed in the case	3.00
12/14/2017	MBH	Work throughout the day on response to administrative expense motion	3.00
12/14/2017	SHS	Work on objections and review of prior pleadings filed in the case, telephone call with Burt Wiand, draft email regarding extension	6.50
12/14/2017	SM	Finalize extension motion and order and file same	0.20
12/15/2017	SHS	Work on responses to Wells Fargo's motions and communications with client regarding the same	6.40

12/18/2017	MBH	Work on administrative expense claim response	6.90
12/18/2017	SHS	Work on response to Wells Fargo motion for turnover	2.50
12/19/2017	MBH	Work throughout the day on administrative expense claim response; revisions to same; conferences with Susan Sharp regarding same; research of law regarding same	8.30
12/19/2017	SHS	Office conferences with Matt Hale and work on responses to Wells Fargo's motions	4.50
12/20/2017	MBH	Work on review and revisions to responses to Wells Fargo motions	1.60
12/20/2017	SHS	Work throughout the day on objection to Wells Fargo's motions	5.70
12/21/2017	MBH	Work on revisions to objection to Wells Fargo rents motion; call with Jordan Maglich; conferences with Susan Sharp regarding same	1.90
12/21/2017	SHS	Telephone calls with client, work throughout the day on objection to Wells Fargo's, and office conference with Matt Hale regarding objection to Wells Fargo's fee motion	6.00
12/22/2017	MBH	Review and revisions to responses to Wells Fargo motions	1.70
12/22/2017	SHS	Work throughout the day on objection to Wells Fargo's motions, telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding the objections; telephone calls with Michael Lamont regarding the objections; telephone call with Jordan Maglich regarding objection to turnover motion; and office conference with Matt Hale regarding revisions	7.50
12/27/2017	MBH	Receive and review emails and filings regarding Wells Fargo issues; call with Susan Sharp regarding same	0.30
12/27/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of emails from Steve Wirth and draft email to client regarding the same	0.20
12/27/2017	SHS	Draft additional email to Steve Wirth	0.10
12/27/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of pleadings filed by bank	0.60
12/29/2017	SHS	Receipt and review of orders and draft email to Matt Hale regarding additional response	0.30
01/03/2018	SHS	Research issues related to free and clear order and review transcript from 11th Cir	3.50
01/04/2018	MBH	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding attorney fees	0.40
01/15/2018	SHS	Receipt and review of reply brief filed by Wells Fargo relating to turnover of rents and request for administrative treatment of attorney expenses	3.50
01/16/2018	SHS	Telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding Wells Fargo reply briefs	0.30
01/16/2018	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Steve Wirth regarding interest, telephone call from Steve Wirth regarding claim for Wells Fargo interest in supporting documentation	0.40
01/16/2018	SHS	Begin working on response to Wells Fargo's reply briefs	4.00
01/17/2018	MBH	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding surreply; review Wells Fargo reply	0.40
01/17/2018	SHS	Review Wells Fargo motion for attorney's fees, and office conference with Matt Hale regarding the same	1.20
01/18/2018	MBH	Work on surreply	0.20
01/22/2018	MBH	Work throughout the day on admin fee surreply; research of law for rent surreply	4.80
01/22/2018	SHS	Work on responses to Wells Fargo reply and office conference with Matt Hale regarding the same	6.30
01/23/2018	MBH	Work throughout the day on surreply to Wells Fargo admin fee response; research of law for same	7.00
01/23/2018	SAS	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding litigation issues	0.30
01/23/2018	SHS	Continue working on responses to Wells Fargo surreply and office conference	5.00
01/24/2018	MBH	Work throughout the day on finalizing surreply to Wells Fargo administrative expense reply	5.10
01/24/2018	MBH	Research of law for surreply to Wells Fargo rents turnover reply	2.00
01/24/2018	SHS	Work on Wells Fargo replies and office conferences with Matt Hale regarding the same	7.70
01/25/2018	MBH	Work throughout evening drafting, revising, and editing to rents turnover reply; receive and review emails from Burt Wiand regarding revisions to same; review of pleadings and documents regarding same	7.50
01/25/2018	MBH	Research of law throughout the day on response to Wells Fargo rents turnover reply	4.00
01/25/2018	SHS	Work on responses to Wells Fargo reply and office conference with Matt Hale regarding the same	8.60
01/26/2018	MBH	Review, edit, and finalize administrative expense response to Wells Fargo for filing; conference with Susan Sharp regarding responses	1.60
01/26/2018	SHS	Calls with client and continue working on replies and revisions to same	5.50

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200  
Tampa, Florida 33602  
T 813.229-0144  
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57  
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009  
T 239.939.5518  
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111  
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669  
T 850.637.1836  
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40  
Destin, Florida 32541-9306  
T 850.460.7676  
F 850.424-6604

02/20/2018	SHS	Receipt of order in Rite Aid matter and review of same, draft email to Burt Wiand regarding order	0.60
02/20/2018	SHS	Telephone call with Burt Wiand regarding Rite Aid order	0.30
02/21/2018	SHS	Telephone call with Burt Wiand and Michael Lamont	0.30
02/22/2018	SHS	Review email from Steve Wirth and draft email to Burt Wiand.	0.20
02/26/2018	SHS	Telephone call with Burt Wiand review and respond to email relating to correspondence with Steve Wirth, follow-up call with Steve Wirth and additional call with Burt Wiand regarding the same	1.10
03/09/2018	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Jared Perez regarding pending matters with Wells Fargo	0.20
03/29/2018	SHS	Review and respond to email from Jeff Rizzo regarding marketing of NC property and draft email to Steve Wirth regarding the same.	0.30

Total Professional Services Rendered \$84,996.00

## For Disbursements Incurred:

04/14/2017	Public Access to Court Electronic Records for 1st. Quarter, 2017 .	\$23.60
04/27/2017	Westlaw Online Research for March, 2017.	\$300.04
05/22/2017	Westlaw Online Research for April, 2017.	\$118.35
07/14/2017	Public Access to Court Electronic Records for 2nd Quarter, 2017.	\$74.90
09/28/2017	Moxie's Cafe....mediation lunch, Sept. 28, 2017.	\$67.14
12/20/2017	Westlaw Online Research for November, 2017.	\$169.28
01/08/2018	Public Access to Court Electronic Records for Fourth Quarter, 2017.	\$56.20
01/25/2018	Westlaw Online Research for January, 2018.	\$1,094.69
02/20/2018	Westlaw Online Research for January, 2018.	\$877.60

Total Expenses Incurred \$2,781.80

## Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Hale, Matt B.	75.70	\$15,897.00
Stichter, Scott A.	0.30	\$129.00
Sharp, Susan	196.20	\$68,670.00
McKee, Susan	1.50	\$300.00
Total For Professional Services Rendered		273.70 Hours <span style="float: right;">\$84,996.00</span>
Adjusted Services Total		\$84,996.00
Professional Services		\$84,996.00
Disbursements		\$2,781.80
Total New Charges This Invoice		\$87,777.80
Previous Balance		\$9,581.00
Less Payments Received		(\$9,581.00)
Outstanding Balance		\$0.00

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200  
Tampa, Florida 33602  
T 813.229-0144  
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57  
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009  
T 239.939.5518  
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111  
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669  
T 850.637.1836  
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40  
Destin, Florida 32541-9306  
T 850.460.7676  
F 850.424-6604

---

New Charges This Invoice

\$87,777.80

Total Due

\$87,777.80

Bill # 41284

Date Last Payment December/04/2017

Last Payment Amount \$9,581.00

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

---

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200  
Tampa, Florida 33602  
T 813.229-0144  
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite HS7  
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009  
T 239.939.5518  
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111  
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669  
T 850.637.1836  
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40  
Destin, Florida 32541-9306  
T 850.460.7676  
F 850.424-6604