

# **EXHIBIT 11**

# Wiand Guerra King P.A.

5505 West Gray Street

Tampa, FL 33609

Telephone: 813-347-5100

Facsimile: 813-347-5198

Federal Tax ID # 27-0937962

Burton W. Wiand

**Attention: Burton W. Wiand**

Wiand Guerra King, P.A.

5505 W. Gray Street

Tampa, FL 33609

December 11, 2018

Client: 025305

Matter: 090833

Invoice #: 15827

Page: 1

RE: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2018

---

## SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>ASDIS</b>	<b>Asset Disposition</b>			
6/4/2018	JJP	Analyze potential value of judgments against investors and others regarding ability to collect or sell (3.8).	3.8	\$940.50
<b>Total: Asset Disposition</b>			<b>3.80</b>	<b>\$940.50</b>
<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			
6/4/2018	JR	Review correspondence from J. Perez regarding status of judgment collection efforts related to V. Burns (.1); review case related documentation and correspondence related to judgment collection efforts related to V. Burns (.2); communicate with PDR regarding money deposited from V. Burns (.1).	0.4	\$56.00
7/5/2018	JR	Review order affirming final judgment of the Bankruptcy Court and related correspondence from J. Perez regarding V. Lee (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
7/6/2018	JR	Review judgment spreadsheet and lien certificate information and prepare second judgment lien filing for D. Cloud (.4).	0.4	\$56.00
7/9/2018	JJP	Research whether any claims or collection efforts remain against D. Rowe and related parties (3.4); draft email to Receiver regarding results of research (.2).	3.6	\$891.00

---

**SERVICES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>TKPR</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			
7/9/2018	JR	Review correspondence from Florida Secretary of State confirming filing of second judgment lien certificate related to D. Cloud (.1); review judgment spreadsheet, lien certificate information, and prepare second judgment lien filing for D. Rowe (.3); communicate with Receiver regarding judgment lien certificate renewals (.1); communicate with J. Perez regarding filing second judgment lien certificates (.1); review correspondence from J. Perez regarding status of recovery from D. Rowe (.1).	0.7	\$98.00
7/11/2018	JJP	Prepare for and participate in telephone conference with S. Sharp regarding V. Lee and bankruptcy matters (.7).	0.7	\$173.25
7/23/2018	JJP	Review settlement offer and communicate with Receiver and counsel for V. Lee regarding same (1.0).	1.0	\$247.50
7/23/2018	JR	Review correspondence from V. Lee regarding settlement offer (.1); review correspondence from S. Sharp in response to V. Lee settlement offer (.1); review correspondence from Receiver in response to V. Lee settlement offer (.1).	0.3	\$42.00
7/30/2018	JJP	Communicate with Receiver regarding letter from V. Lee's daughter to SEC and allegations therein (1.2).	1.2	\$297.00
7/31/2018	JJP	Communicate with Receiver regarding letter from V. Lee's daughter to SEC and allegations therein (.8); revise letter responding to SEC (2.3).	3.1	\$767.25
7/31/2018	JDM	Review draft letter to R. Levenson regarding V. Lee (.3).	0.3	\$58.05
7/31/2018	JR	Review case materials for emails and documentation regarding V. Lee's relationship with A. Nadel per request of Receiver (.5).	0.5	\$70.00
8/1/2018	JJP	Revise and finalize letter responding to SEC regarding V. Lee (1.7).	1.7	\$420.75
8/8/2018	JJP	Coordinate preparation of initial appellate documents in connection with V. Lee's appeal of equitable lien to Eleventh Circuit (.4).	0.4	\$99.00
8/13/2018	KDG	Research regarding statute of limitations on constructive trusts (1.8); correspondence with J. Perez and J. Maglich regarding the same (.2); confer with J. Perez regarding asset spreadsheet and status (.1); research regarding the statute of limitations on court judgments (.5).	2.6	\$364.00
8/21/2018	JJP	Review jurisdictional question issued by Eleventh Circuit in V. Lee appeal (.2); communicate with S. Sharp regarding same (.1).	0.3	\$74.25

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>ASSET</b>		<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>		
8/28/2018	JJP	Revise and file certificate of interested persons and corporate disclosure statement (.5); review V. Lee's statement of issues and designation of record (.4); review Eleventh Circuit rules to identify any additional necessary filings (.3).	1.2	\$297.00
8/30/2018	JJP	Call with S. Sharp regarding jurisdictional question issued in V. Lee appeal to Eleventh Circuit (.5).	0.5	\$123.75
8/31/2018	JJP	Call with S. Sharp and Receiver regarding jurisdictional question issued in V. Lee appeal to Eleventh Circuit (.5).	0.5	\$123.75
9/5/2018	JJP	Revise, finalize, and file response to jurisdictional question issued by Eleventh Circuit in V. Lee appeal (.5).	0.5	\$123.75
9/12/2018	JJP	Review and provide comments to opposing counsel on motion to certify V. Lee opinion for appeal (.8).	0.8	\$198.00
9/12/2018	JR	Review V. Lee's motion to certify final judgment (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
9/17/2018	JR	Review correspondence from appellate court regarding notice of telephone mediation (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
9/21/2018	JJP	Communicate with Eleventh Circuit mediator, Receiver, and opposing counsel regarding various scheduling issues (.7).	0.7	\$173.25
10/3/2018	JJP	Prepare for and participate in hearing regarding V. Lee motion for certificate of appealability.	1.0	\$247.50
10/19/2018	JJP	Draft mediation statement for V. Lee appeal.	1.0	\$247.50
10/22/2018	JJP	Finalize and submit mediation statement for V. Lee appeal.	0.8	\$198.00
10/25/2018	JDM	Meet with J. Perez regarding V. Lee mediation (.2).	0.2	\$38.70
10/26/2018	JJP	Prepare for and participate in telephonic mediation of V. Lee appeal.	1.5	\$371.25
10/26/2018	JDM	Participate in telephonic mediation and meet with B. Wiand and J. Perez regarding same (2.1).	2.1	\$406.35
10/30/2018	KDG	Research regarding whether appellee's brief deadline is stayed until jurisdictional question is answered by the Court.	0.4	\$77.40
<b>Total: Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			<b>28.70</b>	<b>\$6,382.25</b>
<b>CASE</b>		<b>Case Administration</b>		
6/6/2018	JR	Review order on motion to refund garnishment deposit (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
6/12/2018	JR	Review Court's notice regarding disbursement voucher and return of \$700 fee (.1).	0.1	\$14.00

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>CASE</b>	<b>Case Administration</b>			
6/18/2018	JR	Communicate with J. Perez regarding Court's reimbursement check of \$700 related to V. Lee matter (.1); communicate with B. Nguyen regarding \$700 reimbursement check from court related to V. Lee matter and determination of where to deposit funds (.1); communicate with S. O'Brien at PDR regarding \$700 reimbursement check (.1).	0.3	\$42.00
7/30/2018	JR	Receipt and review of initial appeal package transmittal notice regarding V. Lee (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
8/27/2018	JR	Communicate with Receiver regarding prior settlement with Sarasota Opera (.1).	0.1	\$14.00

**Total: Case Administration** 0.70 \$98.00

**Total Professional Service:** 33.2 **\$7,420.75**

Total Services	\$7,420.75
Total Current Charges	\$7,420.75
Previous Balance	\$39,441.90
Less Payments	(\$39,441.90)
<b>PAY THIS AMOUNT</b>	<b>\$7,420.75</b>

**TASK RECAP**

**Services**

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
ASDIS - ASDIS	3.80	\$940.50
ASSET - ASSET	28.70	\$6,382.25
CASE - CASE	0.70	\$98.00
	<u>33.20</u>	<u>\$7,420.75</u>

**Disbursements**

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	<u>\$0.00</u>

**BREAKDOWN BY PERSON**

<u>Person</u>	<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
JJP Jared J. Perez	ASDIS - ASDIS	3.80	\$940.50
JJP Jared J. Perez	ASSET - ASSET	20.50	\$5,073.75
KDG Kris D. Galloway	ASSET - ASSET	3.00	\$441.40
JDM Jordan D. Maglich	ASSET - ASSET	2.60	\$503.10
JR Jeffrey Rizzo	ASSET - ASSET	2.60	\$364.00
JR Jeffrey Rizzo	CASE - CASE	0.70	\$98.00
		<u>33.20</u>	<u>\$7,420.75</u>