



Burton W. Wiand  
 Fowler White Boggs P.A.  
 501 East Kennedy Blvd., Suite 1700  
 Tampa, Florida 33602

March 12, 2010  
 Invoice 745944  
 Tax # 59-1280172  
 Page 1  
 BWW/1090833

Re: **1090833**  
**Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors**

**Professional Services Through 01/31/10**

**Asset Analysis and Recovery**

09/02/09	Worked on settlement agreements.	ASSET	CRN	0.20 hrs.
09/02/09	Preparation of Motion to Approve Settlement regarding investor J. Cart per conference with Mr. Nelson (.5); preparation of correspondence to Natalie Dunham, Esq. regarding fully executed settlement agreements regarding investor John Cart per conference with Mr. Nelson (.3); edit Settlement Agreement related to investor S. Wood per conference with Mr. Nelson (.2).	ASSET	JCR	1.00 hrs.
09/03/09	Filed motion to approve John Cart settlement.	ASSET	CRN	0.10 hrs.
09/03/09	Communications with M. Lockwood regarding profiteer analysis.	ASSET	GM	0.30 hrs.
09/03/09	Profiteers - Office conference with G. Morello regarding exhibits to complaints (.2); office conference with J. Rizzo regarding same (.2); review of spreadsheets from PDR (.3); telephone call with B. Price regarding same (.2).	ASSET	MML	0.90 hrs.

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

501 EAST KENNEDY BLVD., SUITE 1700 • TAMPA, FLORIDA 33602 • P.O. BOX 1438 • TAMPA, FL 33601

TELEPHONE (813) 228-7411 • FAX (813) 229-8313 • WWW.FOWLERWHITE.COM

EXPENSES ARE BILLED AT ACTUAL COSTS DETERMINED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ABA GUIDELINES

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Page 2  
BWW/1090833

09/08/09	E-mail exchange with M. MacPhail regarding S. Wood settlement.	ASSET	CRN	0.30 hrs.
09/08/09	Revised Settlement Agreement regarding investor Wood per conference with Mr. Nelson (.2); receipt, review and process 4th installment from investor T. Brooks and communicate with Sharon at PDR regarding same (.1).	ASSET	JCR	0.30 hrs.
09/09/09	Edit Settlement Agreement related to investor Wood per conference with Mr. Nelson.	ASSET	JCR	0.20 hrs.
09/10/09	E-mail exchange with Janet Cart regarding Ben Cart settlement.	ASSET	CRN	0.20 hrs.
09/10/09	Receipt and processing of check from investor Cart per conference with Mr. Nelson.	ASSET	JCR	0.20 hrs.
09/11/09	Work on follow-up letters to first round of profiteer letters.	ASSET	KLS	3.60 hrs.
09/14/09	Research regarding clawback complaints.	ASSET	GM	1.00 hrs.
09/15/09	E-mail exchanges with M. MacPhail regarding S. Wood release (.3); e-mail exchanges with T. Schlegal regarding Yip settlement (.2); received S. Wood settlement agreement (.1); prepared motion to approve S. Wood settlement (.3); e-mail from J. Evans regarding settlement (.2).	ASSET	CRN	1.10 hrs.
09/15/09	Continue work on follow-up letters to the April 7th profiteer letters.	ASSET	KLS	1.70 hrs.

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Page 3  
BWW/1090833

09/17/09	Reviewed F. Moseley's file (.7); e-mail to Moseley (.3); received Order approving S. Wood settlement (.1); e-mail to M. MacPhail regarding order of approval (.2); e-mail to J. Evans regarding settlement (.4).	ASSET	CRN	1.70 hrs.
09/17/09	Review of documentation related to K. Lee (.5); update chart of investments and withdrawals per conference with Mr. Nelson (.2).	ASSET	JCR	0.70 hrs.
09/18/09	Prepare letter regarding potential for settlement regarding ABN, R. Beale, H. Buhl, V. Burns, C. Castor, M. Elkin, M. Flegel, W. Gasparrini, J. Grier Construction, W. Hirons, J. Hirsh, J. Karapralos, W. Lobdell, Neubeiser Trust, Sandcastle Partners, W. Scribner, V. Tanner, R. Thauer, M. Timmick, S. Wengert, W. Watson and Wintch Family Trust (6.6); reviewed status of proposed settlements regarding Ben Cart, J. Evans, J. Fletcher, Frank Moseley and Luke Yip Estate (.6).	ASSET	CRN	7.20 hrs.
09/18/09	Review of and organization documentation regarding investors Graetz and Fraser (2.0); preparation of spreadsheets per conference with Mr. Nelson (.5).	ASSET	JCR	2.50 hrs.
09/21/09	Received and reviewed Yip settlement agreement (.3); prepared motion to approve (.8); letter to Bruce Bell (.3).	ASSET	CRN	1.40 hrs.
09/21/09	Review of correspondence from Mr. Bell in response to letter from Mr. Nelson regarding profits (.2); review of documentation regarding Lazy B, Ltd. (.5); preparation of transaction summary per conference with Mr. Nelson (.5); communicate with Bill Price regarding Lazy B., Ltd. (.3).	ASSET	JCR	1.50 hrs.
09/21/09	Review and print various new profiteer schedules for aggregated accounts prepared by the forensic accountant (1.4); begin to segregate aggregate accounts for mailing purposes (1.2); complete follow-up letters to first round of profiteers and prepare mailing (4.7); create tracking spreadsheet			

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

	for recipients (1.3).	ASSET	KLS	2.60 hrs.
09/22/09	Office conference with K. Salo regarding profiteer spreadsheets and issues (.3); receipt and review of revised spreadsheet from B. Price regarding same (.3); exchange of e-mail with B. Price regarding meeting (.2); office conference with G. Morello regarding same (.2); prepare for and attend meeting with Receiver and B. Price (1.0).	ASSET	MML	2.00 hrs.
09/23/09	Review of asset lists (.7); communicate with Receiver, Mr. Liu and Mr. Guerra regarding collection of the same (.3).	ASSET	JCR	1.00 hrs.
09/23/09	Review of correspondence from Mr. Hildreth (.2); preparation of correspondence to investors Day per conference with Receiver (.3); communicate with Receiver regarding process for collecting from profiteering investors (.2).	ASSET	JCR	0.70 hrs.
09/23/09	Drafting of demand letter to profiteers (1.0); review of documents for same (.3); telephone call with G. Morello regarding same (.2).	ASSET	MML	1.50 hrs.
09/24/09	Communications with attorney for Janice and Philip Day regarding letter sent in error (.5); follow up on letters to investors that were sent on September 21 (2.5).	ASSET	ABT	3.00 hrs.
09/24/09	Reviewed exhibits for complaints (.1); reviewed demand letter (.3); reviewed data in connection with clawback complaints (.2); revised clawback complaint template (4.5).	ASSET	GM	5.10 hrs.
09/24/09	Receipt and review of sample exhibit for demand letters (.2); prepared e-mail to G. Morello regarding same (.1); revised exhibit (.6); prepared			

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Page 5  
BWW/1090833

	e-mails to G. Morello and K. Salo regarding same (.2); revised demand letter to investors (.3); prepared e-mail to Receiver regarding same (.1).	ASSET	MML	1.50 hrs.
09/25/09	Review and follow up on messages from investors regarding settlement of clawback claims (.5); follow up regarding investor letters sent on September 21 (.5); communications with attorney for one investor regarding 9/21/09 letter (.1).	ASSET	ABT	1.10 hrs.
09/25/09	Exchange of e-mails regarding draft demand letter (.2); receipt and review of e-mail from PDR regarding exhibits for same (.1).	ASSET	MML	0.30 hrs.
09/28/09	Receipt and review of correspondence from investor Janice Wintsch regarding false profits letter (.2); review and assemble materials regarding deposits and withdrawals per conference with Mr. Nelson (.8).	ASSET	JCR	1.00 hrs.
09/29/09	Review of materials related to Wintsch Family Trust (.2); communicate with PDR regarding backup information and edit spreadsheet of ins and outs (.2); receipt and review of correspondence and materials from investor Hunter(.4); communicate with Scoop team regarding same (.1).	ASSET	JCR	0.90 hrs.
09/29/09	Receipt and review of e-mail from PDR regarding false profits template (.2); exchange of e-mail with K. Salo regarding same (.2); receipt and review of revised settlement spreadsheet (.1).	ASSET	MML	0.50 hrs.
09/30/09	Exchange of e-mails regarding false profit templates for investors.	ASSET	MML	0.20 hrs.
10/02/09	Telephone conference and e-mail exchange with R. Walter regarding J. Fletcher settlement (.8); telephone conference with and e-mail exchange with K. Abel regarding Timmick settlement (.7); reviewed all investor			

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Page 6  
BWW/1090833

	files (1.9).	ASSET	CRN	3.40 hrs.
10/02/09	Review of investor materials related to Wintsch, Timmick and Winners Circle per conference with Mr. Nelson and Ms. Salo.	ASSET	JCR	1.00 hrs.
10/05/09	Call from W. Wengert regarding settlement (.1); e-mail exchange and telephone conference with V. Tanner regarding settlement agreement (.3); call from D. Rappaport regarding Sandcastle Partners, LP (.2); e-mail exchange with T. Schegel regarding Yip settlement (.3); organized claims list (.1); call from J. Wentsch regarding claim (.2).	ASSET	CRN	1.20 hrs.
10/06/09	Letter to D. Campbell regarding R. Beale settlement (.7); letter to R. Travis regarding M. Flegal settlement (.6); telephone conference with and letter to J. Wentsch regarding settlement agreement (1.1).	ASSET	CRN	2.70 hrs.
10/06/09	Review of correspondence from counsel for investor W. Gasparri and investor file and analyze ins and outs per conference with Mr. Nelson.	ASSET	JCR	0.50 hrs.
10/06/09	Office conferences with C. Nelson regarding demand letters (.5); review of profiteer files for status (.4); exchange of e-mails regarding demand letters (.4); receipt and review of spreadsheets regarding prior mail-outs (.3); created combined spreadsheet for same in preparation of complaints (1.0); office conference regarding same (.3).	ASSET	MML	2.90 hrs.
10/07/09	Receipt and review of settlement check from Wood Trust and process same (.1); communicate with Ms. Rehus regarding recent letters to investors (.1).	ASSET	JCR	0.20 hrs.
10/08/09	Letter to C. Nicholson regarding Dr. Gasparri.			

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Page 7  
BWW/1090833

	ASSET	CRN	0.20 hrs.
10/08/09	Communicate with Michelle Moyers, Bill Price and Jason Deirmenjian at PDR regarding investor Gasparini (.1); communicate with Mr. Nelson and Ms. Salo regarding same (.1); communicate with investor Woodman (.1); preparation of correspondence to Mr. Woodman with Receiver's 2nd and 3rd Interim Reports (.2).		
	ASSET	JCR	0.50 hrs.
10/09/09	Call from R. Walinski regarding S. Wengert.		
	ASSET	CRN	0.20 hrs.
10/13/09	Review of documents for additional demand letters (.8); review of files regarding previous mailings (.8); office conferences with C. Nelson regarding past and future demands and current status of negotiations (.7); office conference with K. Salo regarding same (.4); updated spreadsheet for same (.5); receipt and review of multiple e-mails and spreadsheets from K. Salo regarding demands (.4); review and analysis of PDR spreadsheet (.5); prepared e-mail to B. Price regarding same (.2); telephone call with B. Price regarding same (.4); office conference with J. Rizzo regarding sampling for complaints (.3); office conference with G. Morello regarding complaints (.3).		
	ASSET	MML	4.80 hrs.
10/14/09	Prepared Settlement Agreement regarding Ben Cart (.2); received telephone call from Abby Hirsch regarding Jewel Hirsch (.2); e-mail exchange with Abby Hirsch (.2).		
	ASSET	CRN	0.60 hrs.
10/14/09	Receipt and review of spreadsheet for October demands (.4); analyzed PDR's spreadsheet regarding same (1.0); revised October spreadsheet to comport with PDR analysis (1.0); review of exhibits for demands (.4); prepared e-mail to PDR regarding same (.2); telephone call with C. Puntill regarding sampling for complaints (.3); prepared e-mail regarding same (.2).		
	ASSET	MML	3.50 hrs.

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Page 8  
BWW/1090833

10/15/09	Letter to Nicholson regarding W. Gasparrini settlement (.2); receipt and review of letter from C. Hall regarding John Grier Construction demand (.2); e-mail exchange with Virginia Tanner regarding settlement (.7); prepared J. Wentsch Settlement Agreement (.4); letter to J. Wentsch (.3); e-mail exchange with T. Schlegel regarding clearing Yip settlement funds (.4).	ASSET	CRN	2.20 hrs.
10/15/09	Receipt and review of e-mails regarding various settlements (.5); review of agreements regarding same (.2); updated spreadsheet for settlements (.3); receipt and review of e-mail from Receiver regarding same and complaints (.1); telephone call with C. Nelson regarding same (.2); telephone call with G. Morello regarding same (.2); responded to Receiver's e-mail (.1); receipt and review of motion to approve settlement (.1).	ASSET	MML	1.70 hrs.
10/16/09	Reviewed documents submitted by V. Kourvant regarding net worth and call to William Dooley to discuss (1.7); call from Frank Moseley regarding demand (.4); call to F. Kretchmer regarding Castor Family Trust (.3); letter to K. Broberg regarding Daley Trust (.3) ; letter to R. Kramer regarding Mace Security International file (.2); letter to Snyderburn regarding Kelvin Lee (.2).	ASSET	CRN	3.10 hrs.
10/16/09	Receipt and review of revised consolidated spreadsheet (.4); exchange of e-mails regarding same (.3).	ASSET	MML	0.70 hrs.
10/19/09	Received executed Ben Cart Settlement Agreement (.2); received Order Approving Ben Cart settlement (.2); letter to Janet Cart regarding approval (.4); call from S. Wengert regarding settlement (.9).	ASSET	CRN	1.70 hrs.
10/19/09	Review of documentation related to investors to confirm gains in preparation for filing lawsuits per conference with Ms. Lockwood.	ASSET	JCR	3.00 hrs.

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---



Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Page 9  
BWW/1090833

10/20/09	Motion to Approve V. Tanner settlement (.1); received and reviewed order of approval (.1); e-mail to Virginia Tanner regarding approval (.2).	ASSET	CRN	0.40 hrs.
10/20/09	Office conferences with G. Morello regarding complaints (.4); telephone call with M. Lamont regarding same (.4); prepared e-mails to M. Lamont with key documents (.2); review of exhibits in preparation of complaints (.3); receipt and review of e-mail from PDR regarding same (.2); receipt and review of files regarding demands and settlements (.2); updated spreadsheet for same (.2); telephone call with B. Price regarding complaints (.2).	ASSET	MML	2.10 hrs.
10/21/09	Received and reviewed executed J. Fletcher settlement agreement (.2); e-mail to Fletcher's attorney R. Walters regarding original settlement agreement (.2); prepared S. Wengert settlement agreement (1.0).	ASSET	CRN	1.40 hrs.
10/21/09	Review of investor file documentation and comparison to information provided by PDR per conference with Ms. Lockwood (1.5); communicate with investor Woodman regarding status of case (.1); receipt of check from investor V. Tanner and process check from deposit and notify Sharon at PDR regarding same (.1).	ASSET	JCR	1.70 hrs.
10/22/09	Review of documentation regarding investor World Opportunity, Black and Kaye per conference with Ms. Lockwood (2.3); communicate with Mr. Price regarding same (.2).	ASSET	JCR	2.50 hrs.
10/22/09	Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Price regarding false profits (.2); receipt and review of spreadsheet from PDR regarding same (.3); exchange of e-mail with B. Price regarding same (.2); exchange of e-mail with J. Rizzo regarding calculations and prospective plaintiffs (.3).	ASSET	MML	1.00 hrs.

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Page 10  
BWW/1090833

10/23/09	Preparation of memo to Ms. Lockwood regarding summary of review of false profit information (.7); review investor file (.1); review of Scoop e-mails for information and documentation related to investor deposits and redemptions (.2).	ASSET	JCR	1.00 hrs.
10/26/09	E-mail exchange with F. Krechmer regarding Castor (.3); prepared Castor Settlement Agreement (.6); forwarded Castor Settlement Agreement to Krechmer (.2).	ASSET	CRN	1.10 hrs.
10/26/09	Telephone call with B. Wiand regarding complaints (.2); receipt and review of e-mail from J. Rizzo regarding profiteers (.2); receipt and review of e-mails from B. Price regarding same (.2).	ASSET	MML	0.60 hrs.
10/27/09	E-mail to S. Wengert regarding settlement (.2); e-mail to F. Krechmer regarding Castor settlement (.2); e-mail to D. Campbell regarding Biehl settlement (.3).	ASSET	CRN	0.70 hrs.
10/29/09	Receipt and review of three settlement agreements (.3); updated spreadsheet for same (.3).	ASSET	MML	0.60 hrs.
10/30/09	Call to C. Nicholson regarding Gasparrini (.2); received S. Wengert Settlement Agreement (.1).	ASSET	CRN	0.30 hrs.
11/02/09	Prepared settlement agreement for Gasparrini (1.3); e-mailed Settlement Agreement to C. Nicholson (.2); prepared motion to approve Wintsch settlement (.3); prepared motion to approve Beale settlement (.3); prepared motion to approve Fletcher settlement (.3); e-mail to D. Campbell regarding Beale settlement (.2); letter to J. Wintsch regarding settlement (.2).			

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Page 11  
BWW/1090833

	ASSET	CRN	2.80 hrs.
11/03/09	Receipt and review of Orders regarding investor settlement (.1); communicate with Mr. Nelson and Ms. Rehus regarding payment (.3).		
	ASSET	JCR	0.30 hrs.
11/03/09	Receipt and review of e-mails regarding settlements (.2); receipt and review of three motions to approve settlements (.3); receipt and review of three orders granting same (.2); updated spreadsheet for same (.2).		
	ASSET	MML	0.90 hrs.
11/06/09	Prepared motion to approve Castor Trust settlement (1.8); received and forwarded order approving Castor settlement (.3); edited and filed Gasparrino motion to approve settlement (.4); received order approving Gasparrino settlement and forwarded to C. Nicholson (.3).		
	ASSET	CRN	2.80 hrs.
11/06/09	Receipt and review of motion to approve settlement (.1); receipt and review order granting same (.1).		
	ASSET	MML	0.20 hrs.
11/09/09	E-mail exchange with F. Krechmer regarding Castor settlement (.1); e-mail exchange with K. Able regarding Winner's Circle (.1).		
	ASSET	CRN	0.20 hrs.
11/10/09	Call from Kay Abel regarding Timmick/Winner's Circle (.6); e-mail to Abel regarding Timmick (.3); conferred with Burt Wiand regarding Timmick (.2); call from Ken Hirsch regarding Jewel Hirsch (.4); prepared settlement agreement regarding Jewel Hirsch (.5); letter to Jewel Hirsch (.2).		
	ASSET	CRN	2.20 hrs.
11/11/09	E-mail exchange with J. Rizzo regarding Beale settlement funds.		
	ASSET	CRN	0.20 hrs.
11/17/09	Telephone conference with Michael Lamont regarding status of		

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Page 12  
BWW/1090833

	settlement.	ASSET	CRN	0.20 hrs.
11/19/09	Reviewed status of pending settlements with Morello and Lamont.	ASSET	CRN	0.20 hrs.
11/20/09	E-mail exchange with M. Lamont regarding settlement form for J. Evans.	ASSET	CRN	0.20 hrs.
11/23/09	Call from M. Lamont regarding Moseley settlement.	ASSET	CRN	0.10 hrs.
<b>TOTAL Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			<b>\$26,903.85</b>	<b>105.30 hrs.</b>

**Case Administration**

09/03/09	Communicate with Natalie Dunham, Esq. regarding investor John Cart.	CASE	JCR	0.10 hrs.
09/04/09	Review of Receivership settlement spreadsheets.	CASE	JCR	0.20 hrs.
09/04/09	Exchange of e-mail regarding investor.	CASE	MML	0.20 hrs.
10/12/09	Receipt and review of correspondence from Investor Wilkes to Judge Koeltl regarding Nadel bail (.1); review of investor file of S. Shumway (.1); review of other materials and charts related to investors to confirm account (.2).	CASE	JCR	0.40 hrs.
10/28/09	Review of letter from investor Pei.	CASE	JCR	0.10 hrs.
<b>TOTAL Case Administration</b>			<b>\$166.00</b>	<b>1.00 hrs.</b>

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
 Re: Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors

March 12, 2010  
 Invoice 745944  
 Page 13  
 BWV/1090833

**Summary of Fees**

	Hours	Rate/Hr	Dollars	
Carl R Nelson	40.30	325.00	13,097.50	
Kathryn Salo	7.90	140.00	1,106.00	
Maya M Lockwood	26.10	270.00	7,047.00	
Ashley Bruce Trehan	4.10	193.50	793.35	
Gianluca Morello	6.40	315.00	2,016.00	
Jeffrey C Rizzo	21.50	140.00	3,010.00	
	-----	-----	-----	
<b>TOTAL</b>	106.30		27,069.85	
<b>Fees for Professional Services Rendered.....</b>				<b>\$ 27,069.85</b>

Disbursements Through 01/31/10

09/10/09	Photocopies 6 pages	0.90
<b>Total Disbursements .....</b>		<b>\$ 0.90</b>

**TOTALS FOR THIS INVOICE**

Fees for Professional Services.....	27,069.85
Disbursements .....	0.90
<b>TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE .....</b>	<b>\$ 27,070.75</b>

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE



Burton W. Wiand  
Fowler White Boggs P.A.  
501 East Kennedy Blvd., Suite 1700  
Tampa, Florida 33602

March 12, 2010  
Invoice 745944  
Tax # 59-1280172  
BWW/1090833

Re: **1090833**  
**Scoop Legal Team - Recovery from Investors**

**\*\*\* REMITTANCE ADVICE \*\*\***

**Payment is due upon receipt.**  
**Please remit this page with your payment.**

<b>Fees Due This Invoice</b>	<b>27,069.85</b>
<b>Disbursements Due This Invoice</b>	<b>0.90</b>
<b>TOTAL DUE FOR THIS MATTER.....</b>	<b>\$ <u>27,070.75</u></b>

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

501 EAST KENNEDY BLVD., SUITE 1700 • TAMPA, FLORIDA 33602 • P.O. BOX 1438 • TAMPA, FL 33601

TELEPHONE (813) 228-7411 • FAX (813) 229-8313 • WWW.FOWLERWHITE.COM

EXPENSES ARE BILLED AT ACTUAL COSTS DETERMINED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ABA GUIDELINES