



Burton W. Wiand
 Fowler White Boggs P.A.
 501 East Kennedy Blvd., Suite 1700
 Tampa, Florida 33602

March 12, 2010
 Invoice 745940
 Tax # 59-1280172
 Page 1
 BWW/1090245

Re: **1090245**
Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

Professional Services Through 01/31/10

Asset Analysis and Recovery

09/01/09	Considered issues of complaint against Holland and Knight with G. Morello (.7); review documents regarding real estate by J. Rizzo (.5); review filed complaint of Home Front Homes by M. Hildreth (.5).	ASSET	BWW	1.70 hrs.
09/03/09	Communications with A. Trehan regarding reply in support of motion to enjoin state court proceeding and for possession of Jewelry (.2); office conference with G. Morello regarding same and next steps (.4); receipt and review Judge Lazzara's Order regarding jewelry; telephone conferences and office conferences regarding same (1.2); preparation of F. Morrissey termination letter (.5); review and approve Queens Wreath response (.5); review and approve Holland and Knight response and telephone conference with G. Burns regarding same (.5); e-mails pertaining to assets (.5).	ASSET	BWW	3.80 hrs.
09/04/09	Office conference with J. Liu regarding Bonds.com.	ASSET	BWW	0.30 hrs.
09/14/09	Telephone with J. Berry, C. Loughlin and J. Liu re Board of Directors seat on Bonds.com (.3); telephone conference with G. Burns and J. Coleman regarding Holland and Knight case (.3); review documents related to Holland and Knight responsibility (1.0).			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

501 EAST KENNEDY BLVD., SUITE 1700 • TAMPA, FLORIDA 33602 • P.O. BOX 1438 • TAMPA, FL 33601

TELEPHONE (813) 228-7411 • FAX (813) 229-8313 • WWW.FOWLERWHITE.COM

EXPENSES ARE BILLED AT ACTUAL COSTS DETERMINED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ABA GUIDELINES

EXHIBIT 4

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

March 12, 2010
Invoice 745940
Page 2
BWW/1090245

	ASSET	BWW	1.60 hrs.
09/15/09	Communications with G. Morello regarding W. Bishop's motion to intervene.		
	ASSET	BWW	0.10 hrs.
09/22/09	Office conference with J. Liu regarding monthly report to the Receiver from Bonds.com and possibility of serving on the company's board.		
	ASSET	BWW	1.00 hrs.
09/23/09	Office conferences with J. Rizzo regarding administration of assets (.5); office conference with D. Pearlman regarding Venice Jet Center (.8); receipt and review Judge Lazarra's Order (.3).		
	ASSET	BWW	1.60 hrs.
09/25/09	Conference with J. Liu regarding preparation of term sheet for the sale of the Venice Jet Center.		
	ASSET	BWW	0.30 hrs.
10/01/09	Communicate with J. Rizzo, Ms. Jordan and Mr. Jernigan regarding status of Sarasota condo foreclosure proceeding (.2); meeting with K. Salo regarding demand letter and exhibits for second round of profiteer letters (.4); telephone conference with C. Cassidy, Federal Defense Office regarding A. Nadel (.3); telephone conference with D. Clayton (.2); communicate with J. Rizzo and Mr. Padilla at Regions Bank regarding loan documentation for Home Front Homes (.4).		
	ASSET	BWW	1.50 hrs.
10/05/09	Telephone conference with M. Hiller and several e-mails to him regarding status (.2); e-mails to and from R. Jernigan regarding status (.5); office meeting with R. Jernigan regarding administrative issues (1.0); telephone conference with Potential buyer (2x) regarding developments in Venice Jet Center deal (1.5); meeting with R. Jernigan regarding Venice Jet Center and administrative tasks (1.5); telephone conference with Northern Trust representative, P. Biegel, regarding Venice Jet Center (1.5).		

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

March 12, 2010
Invoice 745940
Page 3
BWW/1090245

		ASSET	BWW	6.20 hrs.
10/22/09	Telephone conference with G. Burns, J. Coleman and G. Morello.	ASSET	BWW	1.00 hrs.
10/23/09	Conference with G. Morello regarding communications with C. Cassidy and M. Gombiner.	ASSET	BWW	0.10 hrs.
10/26/09	Conference with G. Morello to discuss teleconference with Nadel's counsel regarding meeting.	ASSET	BWW	0.10 hrs.
10/27/09	Conference with G. Morello and R. Brodsky regarding meeting with A. Nadel (.5); attended conference call with Roberta Colton and J. Liu regarding global settlement with Northern Trust (.5).	ASSET	BWW	1.00 hrs.
10/28/09	Conference with G. Morello regarding motion to compel relating to the Venice Jet Center and considered response.	ASSET	BWW	0.10 hrs.
11/02/09	Considered settlement letter from Doug Titus with C. Nelson.	ASSET	BWW	0.10 hrs.
11/04/09	Conference with J. Rizzo and Mr. Jernigan regarding sale of Mule and Buck (.3); conference with J. Rizzo regarding communications with James Essenson, Esq. (.1).	ASSET	BWW	0.40 hrs.
	TOTAL Asset Analysis and Recovery		\$7,315.00	20.90 hrs.

Asset Disposition

09/01/09 Communicate with J. Rizzo regarding listing with John Skicewicz at

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

March 12, 2010
Invoice 745940
Page 4
BWW/1090245

	Coldwell Banker (.1); communicate with Nona Armour and J. Rizzo regarding reduction of list price on Garren Creek property (.3).	ASSETDIS	BWW	0.40 hrs.
09/02/09	Telephone conference with Potential buyer regarding negotiation of Venice Jet Center sale.	ASSETDIS	BWW	0.50 hrs.
09/04/09	Correspondence with R. Jernigan regarding Venice Jet Center (.3); telephone conference with Potential buyer regarding Venice Jet Center (1.0); meeting with Potential buyer prior to meeting with Northern Trust (.5); meeting with P. Biegel of Northern Trust and Potential buyer regarding Venice Jet Center (3.5); telephone conference with M. Gramatica regarding Home Front Homes (.3); telephone conference with J. Rizzo and Mr. Horne regarding sale of Shell Gas Station and escrow funds (.2); office conference with J. Rizzo regarding sale of Venice Jet Center (.1).	ASSETDIS	BWW	5.90 hrs.
09/10/09	Considered issues with complaint with G. Morello (.5); office meeting with M. and B. Gramatica regarding Home Front Homes (1.0)	ASSETDIS	BWW	1.50 hrs.
09/14/09	Analyze status of Home Front Homes with G. Morello and numerous telephone conferences with several people at Home Front Homes, several telephone conferences with R. Jernigan regarding same (1.0); telephone conference with Cindy of Home Front Homes (.3); telephone conference with J. Yirovat and J. Rizzo regarding jewelry for sale (1.0); telephone conference with R. Jernigan regarding Habitat for Humanity and Ms. Wilcox (.3).	ASSETDIS	BWW	2.60 hrs.
09/15/09	Telephone conference with M. Hiller (.3); telephone conference with P. Biegl of Sarasota Northern Trust (.5); meeting with J. Rizzo, M. Gramatica, B. Gramatica and JC Calder regarding Home Front Homes deal (.5); email to M. Hildreth regarding meeting (.3).	ASSETDIS	BWW	1.60 hrs.

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

March 12, 2010
Invoice 745940
Page 5
BWW/1090245

09/18/09	Communicate with J. Rizzo and Mr. Jernigan regarding sale of Tradewind, LLC article in the Coweta Times.	ASSETDIS	BWW	0.20 hrs.
09/25/09	Communications with G. Morello regarding Nadel's request for bail modification.	ASSETDIS	BWW	0.30 hrs.
09/30/09	Office meeting with J. Liu regarding Venice Jet Center and sale of Shell Gas Station (.5); review of Letter of Intent regarding Venice Jet Center (.5).	ASSETDIS	BWW	1.00 hrs.
10/01/09	Office meeting with J. Rizzo, R. Jernigan and G. Guerra regarding disposition of assets.	ASSETDIS	BWW	0.50 hrs.
10/05/09	Office meeting with J. Liu regarding letter of intent for the sale of Venice Jet Center (.5); e-mails to and from E. Niemoth regarding his interest in Venice Jet Center (.2); office conference with J. Liu regarding draft real estate sale and purchase agreement for gas station in Georgia (.5); office meeting with J. Liu regarding preparation of asset purchase agreement for the sale of Venice Jet Center (.3).	ASSETDIS	BWW	1.50 hrs.
10/09/09	Communicate with J. Rizzo and realtor regarding offer to purchase Garren Creek.	ASSETDIS	BWW	0.30 hrs.
10/13/09	Review proposal of purchase from Ed Durden with J. Rizzo.	ASSETDIS	BWW	0.20 hrs.
10/21/09	Review revised asset purchase agreement for Venice Jet Center with J. Liu.	ASSETDIS	BWW	1.00 hrs.

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

March 12, 2010
Invoice 745940
Page 6
BWW/1090245

10/26/09	Telephone call with M. Lockwood regarding Venice Jet Center. ASSETDIS BWW	0.20 hrs.
10/26/09	Office meeting with J. Rizzo, J. Liu and R. Jernigan regarding several issues: Garren Creek, Bonds.com, Northern Trust settlement and other issues. ASSETDIS BWW	2.50 hrs.
10/27/09	Review of asset purchase agreement for the sale of assets in Venice Jet Center, LLC with J. Liu and M. Lockwood. ASSETDIS BWW	0.50 hrs.
10/28/09	Meeting with J. Rizzo regarding Offer to Purchase Garren Creek home (.5); communicate with J. Rizzo regarding Motion filed by Mr. Neimoth in connection with disposition of the Venice Jet Center (.3). ASSETDIS BWW	0.80 hrs.
10/30/09	Telephone conference with H. Decker, R. Sawczyn and J. Rizzo regarding Garren Creek Property. ASSETDIS BWW	0.50 hrs.
11/02/09	Conference with J. Rizzo, J. Liu and Mr. Jernigan regarding sale of Venice Jet Center, Garren Creek and Shell Gas station (.8); review Venice Jet Center agreements and Northern Trust global settlement with J. Liu (1.0). ASSETDIS BWW	1.80 hrs.
11/03/09	Review correspondence related to sale of Venice Jet Center, Garren Creek and Shell gas station. ASSETDIS BWW	0.30 hrs.
11/04/09	Office conference with J. Liu regarding e-mails with factual information for motion to approve sale of the Venice Jet Center. ASSETDIS BWW	0.50 hrs.

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

March 12, 2010
Invoice 745940
Page 7
BWW/1090245

TOTAL Asset Disposition **\$8,610.00** **24.60 hrs.**

Business Operations

09/04/09	Administrative tasks with J. Rizzo (checks, letters, etc.) . BUSINESS	BWW	0.50 hrs.
10/02/09	Several office meetings with J. Rizzo regarding administration of assets (2.0); office meeting with G. Morello regarding assets (1.0). BUSINESS	BWW	3.00 hrs.
10/19/09	Receipt and review several e-mails regarding administration. BUSINESS	BWW	1.00 hrs.
10/27/09	Telephone conference with M. Hildreth (1.0); office conferences with J. Rizzo (1.0); office meeting with R. Jernigan regarding administrative issues (1.0). BUSINESS	BWW	3.00 hrs.

TOTAL Business Operations **\$2,625.00** **7.50 hrs.**

Case Administration

09/01/09	Conference with J. Rizzo regarding general matters. CASE	BWW	0.80 hrs.
09/02/09	Office meeting with G. Morello regarding Judge Koehlrl letter. CASE	BWW	1.00 hrs.
09/03/09	Office Conference with J. Liu regarding company announcements on closing of new financing and documents filed with the SEC. CASE	BWW	0.30 hrs.
09/10/09	Telephone conference with G. Burns and J. Coleman along with G. Morello regarding A. Nadel prison visit (1.0); communicate with J. Rizzo		

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

March 12, 2010
Invoice 745940
Page 8
BWW/1090245

	and Mr. Jernigan regarding documentation from Regions Bank regarding Home Front Homes (.2).	CASE	BWW	1.20 hrs.
09/22/09	Office office discussion with G. Morello regarding status.	CASE	BWW	0.20 hrs.
09/23/09	Office conferences with G. Morello and A. Trehan regarding legal strategy.	CASE	BWW	0.50 hrs.
10/01/09	Review status and hold administrative meeting with legal team.	CASE	BWW	2.00 hrs.
10/15/09	Receipt and review numerous e-mails regarding status.	CASE	BWW	0.50 hrs.
10/26/09	Review Fourth Interim Report with A. Trehan.	CASE	BWW	0.50 hrs.
10/28/09	Review Fourth Interim Report with J. Rizzo.	CASE	BWW	0.70 hrs.
10/29/09	Review Fourth Interim Report with J. Rizzo and A. Trehan.	CASE	BWW	0.10 hrs.
10/30/09	Review revisions to Receiver's Fourth Interim Report with J. Rizzo and A. Trehan.	CASE	BWW	0.70 hrs.
	TOTAL Case Administration		\$2,975.00	8.50 hrs.

Work on Fees Application

09/10/09 No Charge: Telephone conference with S. Masel regarding billing.

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
 Re: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

March 12, 2010
 Invoice 745940
 Page 9
 BWV/1090245

	WFEEES	BWW	0.30 hrs.
TOTAL Work on Fees Application		\$0.00	0.30 hrs.

Summary of Fees

	Hours	Rate/Hr	Dollars	
Burton W Wiand	0.30	0.00	0.00	
Burton W Wiand	61.50	350.00	21,525.00	
	-----	-----	-----	
TOTAL	61.80		21,525.00	
Fees for Professional Services Rendered.....				\$ 21,525.00

TOTALS FOR THIS INVOICE

Fees for Professional Services.....	21,525.00
Disbursements	0.00
TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE.....	\$ 21,525.00

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE



Burton W. Wiand
Fowler White Boggs P.A.
501 East Kennedy Blvd., Suite 1700
Tampa, Florida 33602

March 12, 2010
Invoice 745940
Tax # 59-1280172
BWW/1090245

Re: **1090245**
Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

***** REMITTANCE ADVICE *****

Payment is due upon receipt.
Please remit this page with your payment.

Fees Due This Invoice	21,525.00
Disbursements Due This Invoice	0.00
TOTAL DUE FOR THIS MATTER.....	\$ <u>21,525.00</u>

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

501 EAST KENNEDY BLVD., SUITE 1700 • TAMPA, FLORIDA 33602 • P.O. BOX 1438 • TAMPA, FL 33601

TELEPHONE (813) 228-7411 • FAX (813) 229-8313 • WWW.FOWLERWHITE.COM

EXPENSES ARE BILLED AT ACTUAL COSTS DETERMINED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ABA GUIDELINES