



Burton W. Wiand  
 Fowler White Boggs P.A.  
 501 East Kennedy Blvd., Suite 1700  
 Tampa, Florida 33602

September 1, 2010  
 Invoice 758438  
 Tax # 59-1280172  
 Page 1  
 BWV/1090069

Re: **1090069**  
**Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership**

**Professional Services Through 04/30/10**

**Asset Analysis and Recovery**

|          |                                                                                                            |       |     |           |
|----------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-------|-----|-----------|
| 02/04/10 | E-mail exchange with Dominique Pearlman regarding origins of subpoena of Foley and Lardner.                | ASSET | ABT | 0.30 hrs. |
| 02/09/10 | Reviewed brokerage statement from Wells Fargo.                                                             | ASSET | JL  | 0.20 hrs. |
| 02/15/10 | E-mail exchange with Gianluca Morello regarding suing a charity under the Uniform Fraudulent Transfer Act. | ASSET | ABT | 0.20 hrs. |
| 02/17/10 | E-mail exchange with Jeff Rizzo regarding Bear Stearns account for Valhalla Investment Partners L.P.       | ASSET | ABT | 0.20 hrs. |
| 02/22/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding Bonds.com domain name.                                                   | ASSET | JL  | 0.20 hrs. |
| 02/23/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo and the Receiver regarding Bonds.com stock certificate and Wells Fargo.            | ASSET | JL  | 0.70 hrs. |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

501 EAST KENNEDY BLVD., SUITE 1700 • TAMPA, FLORIDA 33602 • P.O. BOX 1438 • TAMPA, FL 33601

TELEPHONE (813) 228-7411 • FAX (813) 229-8313 • WWW.FOWLERWHITE.COM

EXPENSES ARE BILLED AT ACTUAL COSTS DETERMINED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ABA GUIDELINES

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Page 2  
BWW/1090069

|          |                                                                                                                                                                                                                                |       |    |           |
|----------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-------|----|-----------|
| 02/24/10 | Teleconference with David Spanos regarding Receivership interest in Bonds.com (.3); e-mails with John Barry regarding special board position (.8); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo and the Receiver regarding Wells Fargo issues (.3). | ASSET | JL | 1.40 hrs. |
| 02/25/10 | E-mails with Tristate regarding Part 16 notice and interest payment (.2); teleconferences with Roger Jernigan regarding same and Venice Jet Center deposit (.4).                                                               | ASSET | JL | 0.60 hrs. |
| 02/26/10 | Reviewed letter from Tristate regarding payment offset (.2); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (.2).                                                                                                                      | ASSET | JL | 0.40 hrs. |
| 03/01/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo and Roger Jernigan regarding Venice Jet Center tenant address.                                                                                                                                         | ASSET | JL | 0.20 hrs. |
| 03/03/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding Chris Moody and Bonds.com.                                                                                                                                                                   | ASSET | JL | 0.30 hrs. |
| 03/04/10 | E-mails with David Spano from Bonds.com and Jeff Rizzo regarding repayment of promissory note and wire instructions.                                                                                                           | ASSET | JL | 0.70 hrs. |
| 03/25/10 | Reviewed action by written consent from Bonds.com regarding increase in authorized capital.                                                                                                                                    | ASSET | JL | 0.50 hrs. |
| 04/01/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo and David Spanos from Bonds.com regarding April payment.                                                                                                                                               | ASSET | JL | 0.60 hrs. |
| 04/21/10 | E-mails with David Spanos from Bonds.com regarding Valhalla promissory note.                                                                                                                                                   |       |    |           |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Page 3  
BWW/1090069

|                                          |                                                                                                                          |                   |                  |
|------------------------------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-------------------|------------------|
|                                          | ASSET                                                                                                                    | JL                | 0.30 hrs.        |
| 04/22/10                                 | E-mails with David Spanos from Bonds.com regarding Valhalla promissory note and management conference with the Receiver. |                   |                  |
|                                          | ASSET                                                                                                                    | JL                | 0.40 hrs.        |
| <b>TOTAL Asset Analysis and Recovery</b> |                                                                                                                          | <b>\$1,393.20</b> | <b>7.20 hrs.</b> |

**Asset Disposition**

|          |                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     |    |           |
|----------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----|-----------|
| 02/01/10 | E-mails with Mark Euster regarding amendment executed by the Receiver (.6); teleconference with Jeff Rizzo regarding same and status update (.4).                                                                                                                                                                                   |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            | JL | 1.00 hrs. |
| 02/02/10 | Finalized Venice Jet Center closing packet for delivery to Tristate Aviation Group of Florida.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                      |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            | JL | 0.50 hrs. |
| 02/03/10 | Teleconference and e-mails with Roger Jernigan regarding outstanding closing issues with Home Front Homes (.5); teleconference and e-mails with Paul Panagos regarding status of Home Front Homes, LLC as an entity (.3); e-mails with Mark Euster and Jeff Rizzo regarding status of amendment on the sale of the gas station 0.3) |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            | JL | 1.10 hrs. |
| 02/04/10 | Teleconference with Jeff Rizzo regarding closing disbursements to M&I Bank.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                         |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            | JL | 0.30 hrs. |
| 02/05/10 | Teleconference with Michelle Cobb regarding status of amendment for extension of time for closing.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            | JL | 0.20 hrs. |
| 02/09/10 | Voicemail with Mark Euster regarding status of amendment (.2); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (.3).                                                                                                                                                                                                                         |    |           |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Page 4  
BWW/1090069

|          |                                                                                                                                                                                                                        |    |           |
|----------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----|-----------|
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                               | JL | 0.50 hrs. |
| 02/10/10 | E-mails with Mark Euster and Jeff Rizzo regarding executed amendment and status of underwriting.                                                                                                                       |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                               | JL | 1.20 hrs. |
| 02/11/10 | E-mails with SADC regarding Home Front Homes, LLC (.5); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (.1).                                                                                                                   |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                               | JL | 0.60 hrs. |
| 02/16/10 | Calls and e-mails with Roger Jernigan and the Receiver regarding electric aircraft tug and Tristate (1.4); voicemail with Tristate regarding same (.1); calls with Roger Jernigan regarding receivership updates (.3). |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                               | JL | 1.80 hrs. |
| 02/18/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of gas station.                                                                                                                                                                 |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                               | JL | 0.10 hrs. |
| 02/22/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding property tax notices (.4); e-mails and teleconference with Roger Jernigan regarding same (.6).                                                                                       |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                               | JL | 1.00 hrs. |
| 02/23/10 | E-mails and teleconference with Roger Jernigan regarding status of Venice Jet Center deposit.                                                                                                                          |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                               | JL | 0.30 hrs. |
| 02/25/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of gas station.                                                                                                                                                                 |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                               | JL | 0.40 hrs. |
| 02/26/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of Rite Aid property.                                                                                                                                                           |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                               | JL | 0.10 hrs. |
| 03/01/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of Rite Aid property and letter of intent (.2).                                                                                                                                 |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                               | JL | 0.20 hrs. |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Page 5  
BWW/1090069

|          |                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                 |          |    |           |
|----------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------|----|-----------|
| 03/04/10 | E-mails and teleconference with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of Rite Aid property (.7); teleconference with Mark Euster regarding sale of gas station (.4); e-mails and teleconference with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of gas station (.8); addressed issues regarding evidence of satisfaction on Venice Jet Center loans with Northern Trust (.4) | ASSETDIS | JL | 2.30 hrs. |
| 03/05/10 | E-mails and teleconference with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of Rite Aid property.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                 | ASSETDIS | JL | 0.60 hrs. |
| 03/08/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of Rite Aid property.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    | ASSETDIS | JL | 0.10 hrs. |
| 03/09/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of gas station (.1); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of Rite Aid property (.2).                                                                                                                                                                                                                   | ASSETDIS | JL | 0.30 hrs. |
| 03/18/10 | E-mails and teleconferences with Mark Euster regarding sale of gas station (1.8); e-mails with the Receiver and Jeff Rizzo regarding same and anticipated closing (.7).                                                                                                                                                                         | ASSETDIS | JL | 2.50 hrs. |
| 03/19/10 | E-mails with the Receiver regarding status on the sale of the gas station (.3); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding earnest money deposit for the sale of the gas station (.2).                                                                                                                                                                   | ASSETDIS | JL | 0.50 hrs. |
| 03/23/10 | Teleconference with Mark Euster regarding sale of the gas station.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                              | ASSETDIS | JL | 0.50 hrs. |
| 03/25/10 | Voicemail with Mark Euster regarding sale of gas station (.2); teleconference with Jeff Rizzo and Jim Hamilton regarding sale of Rite Aid property (.5); e-mails and teleconferences with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (.7).                                                                                                                       |          |    |           |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

---

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Page 6  
BWW/1090069

|          |                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                |    |           |
|----------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----|-----------|
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       | JL | 1.40 hrs. |
| 03/26/10 | Teleconferences and e-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of Rite Aid property (1.2); teleconference with Jim Hamilton regarding same (.5); reviewed and revised purchase agreement regarding same (2.7).                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       | JL | 4.40 hrs. |
| 03/28/10 | Reviewed and revised purchase agreement regarding sale of the Rite Aid property.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                               |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       | JL | 1.50 hrs. |
| 03/29/10 | Reviewed and revised Agreement for Purchase and Sale of Rite Aid property (2.5); prepared Assignment and Assumption of Lease Agreement and Escrow Agreement (3.5); teleconferences and e-mails with Jeff Rizzo and Jim Hamilton regarding revisions and comments (.7); reviewed and revised exhibits to the Agreement for Purchase and Sale of Rite Aid property (.6); teleconference with Mark Euster and teleconference with the Receiver regarding closing on the sale of gas station (.8). |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       | JL | 8.10 hrs. |
| 03/30/10 | Teleconference and e-mails with Roger Jernigan regarding the Cockpit Cafe deposit (.4); teleconferences and e-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding closing on the sale of the gas station and the sale of Rite Aid property (1.2); e-mails with Mark Euster regarding closing on the sale of the gas station and exemption from Georgia withholding tax (2.2).                                                                                                                                      |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       | JL | 3.80 hrs. |
| 03/31/10 | E-mails and teleconference with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of Rite Aid property (.2); e-mails and teleconference with the Receiver regarding correspondence from Mark Euster as buyer's counsel for the sale of the gas station, and e-mails and teleconference with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (1.2); e-mails with Mark Euster regarding buyer's default under the sale and purchase agreement for the sale of the gas station (1.8).                                                           |    |           |
|          | ASSETDIS                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       | JL | 3.20 hrs. |
| 04/01/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo and the Receiver regarding sale of the gas station                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     |    |           |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Page 7  
BWW/1090069

|          |                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       |          |    |           |
|----------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------|----|-----------|
|          | (.3); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo and Jim Hamilton regarding sale of Rite Aid (.3).                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                       | ASSETDIS | JL | 0.60 hrs. |
| 04/02/10 | E-mails and teleconferences with Jeff Rizzo and Jim Hamilton regarding buyers for the Rite Aid property (1.8); e-mails and teleconferences with Jeff Rizzo and Roger Jernigan regarding Cockpit Cafe deposit (.4); voicemail, teleconference and e-mails with Kirsten Pederson regarding return of Cockpit Cafe deposit (.8);                                                                         | ASSETDIS | JL | 3.00 hrs. |
| 04/05/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding revised purchase agreement for the sale of the Rite Aid property.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                   | ASSETDIS | JL | 0.10 hrs. |
| 04/06/10 | Reviewed and revised purchase agreement regarding sale of Rite Aid property (3.8); teleconference and e-mails with Jim Hamilton regarding buyer's revisions on the Rite Aid purchase agreement (1.4); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (.3).                                                                                                                                                    | ASSETDIS | JL | 5.50 hrs. |
| 04/07/10 | Teleconference with the Receiver regarding sale of the Rite Aid property (.2); revised purchase agreement and exhibits regarding same (1.8); e-mails with Jim Hamilton and Jeff Rizzo regarding purchase agreement revisions for the sale of the Rite Aid property (.7); e-mails and teleconferences with Diane Burnette regarding same (.3).                                                         | ASSETDIS | JL | 3.00 hrs. |
| 04/08/10 | Teleconference with Jim Hamilton regarding updates on the sale of the Rite Aid property (.5); teleconferences with Mark Euster regarding closing on the sale of the gas station (1.2); reviewed purchase agreement regarding the sale of the gas station (.5); teleconference with Jeff Rizzo regarding updates on the sale of the Rite Aid property and closing on the sale of the gas station (.3). | ASSETDIS | JL | 2.50 hrs. |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Page 8  
BWW/1090069

|          |                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                      |          |    |           |
|----------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------|----|-----------|
| 04/09/10 | Prepared for closing on the sale of the gas station (4.0); teleconferences and e-mails with Mark Euster regarding same (1.5); teleconferences with the Receiver regarding same (.5); conferences with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (1.0).                                                                                                                                                               | ASSETDIS | JL | 7.00 hrs. |
| 04/12/10 | Voicemail and teleconferences with Mark Euster regarding sale of the gas station (.7); e-mails with Roberta Colton regarding Fruitville Road property (.1); teleconference with the Receiver regarding earnest money deposit for the sale of the gas station (.2); e-mails with Diane Burnette regarding transfer of earnest money deposit funds from the escrow agent to the Receiver account (.2). | ASSETDIS | JL | 1.20 hrs. |
| 04/13/10 | E-mails with Jim Hamilton regarding reduction in purchase price for the Rite Aid property (.5); e-mails and teleconferences with the Escrow Agent regarding transfer of the earnest money deposit (.8).                                                                                                                                                                                              | ASSETDIS | JL | 1.30 hrs. |
| 04/14/10 | Review revised letter of intent for the sale of the gas station (.7); teleconference with the Receiver regarding terms on counteroffer (.4).                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                         | ASSETDIS | JL | 1.10 hrs. |
| 04/15/10 | Reviewed and revised letter of intent and prepared amortized payment schedule (5.0); e-mails with the Receiver regarding same (.5); e-mails with Mark Euster regarding same (1.0).                                                                                                                                                                                                                   | ASSETDIS | JL | 6.50 hrs. |
| 04/16/10 | Teleconference with David Spanos from Bonds.com regarding new management meeting with the Receiver (.4); e-mails with the Receiver regarding same (.1).                                                                                                                                                                                                                                              | ASSETDIS | JL | 0.50 hrs. |
| 04/19/10 | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo and Roger Jernigan regarding status on the sale of the gas station property and the Fruitville Road property.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                | ASSETDIS | JL | 0.40 hrs. |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE



Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Page 9  
BWW/1090069

|                                |                                                                                                                                                                     |          |                    |                   |
|--------------------------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------|--------------------|-------------------|
| 04/20/10                       | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding eviction of tenant at the gas station property.                                                                                   | ASSETDIS | JL                 | 0.20 hrs.         |
| 04/21/10                       | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding Fruitville Road property update (.1); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding sale of the Rite Aid property (.1).                       | ASSETDIS | JL                 | 0.20 hrs.         |
| 04/22/10                       | E-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding status on the sale of the gas station property (.1); teleconference with the Receiver regarding same (.1).                        | ASSETDIS | JL                 | 0.20 hrs.         |
| 04/24/10                       | Voicemail from Mark Euster regarding sale of gas station property.                                                                                                  | ASSETDIS | JL                 | 0.10 hrs.         |
| 04/26/10                       | Voicemail with Mark Euster regarding sale of the gas station property (.1); teleconference with Roger Jernigan regarding real estate tax for Home Front Homes (.1). | ASSETDIS | JL                 | 0.20 hrs.         |
| 04/27/10                       | Teleconference with Roger Jernigan regarding status on the sale of the Rite Aid property and the gas station property.                                              | ASSETDIS | JL                 | 0.30 hrs.         |
| 04/28/10                       | Voicemail with Mark Euster regarding sale of gas station property (.2); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (.5).                                                | ASSETDIS | JL                 | 0.70 hrs.         |
| 04/29/10                       | Teleconference with Mark Euster regarding status on the closing of the gas station property.                                                                        | ASSETDIS | JL                 | 0.50 hrs.         |
| <b>TOTAL Asset Disposition</b> |                                                                                                                                                                     |          | <b>\$14,241.60</b> | <b>73.60 hrs.</b> |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Page 10  
BWW/1090069

**Case Administration**

|                                  |                                                                                                                                                                           |      |                 |                  |
|----------------------------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------|-----------------|------------------|
| 02/04/10                         | Receipt of e-mail from Dominique Pearlman regarding Foley & Lardner subpoena (.2); review notes and other records regarding same; preparation of response to e-mail (.2). | CASE | ABT             | 0.40 hrs.        |
| 02/17/10                         | Teleconference with Maya Lockwood regarding Receivership report update.                                                                                                   | CASE | JL              | 0.60 hrs.        |
| 02/23/10                         | E-mail exchange with Jeff Rizzo regarding subpoena target.                                                                                                                | CASE | ABT             | 0.10 hrs.        |
| 03/08/10                         | Telephone conferences and e-mail exchanges with Michael Lamont regarding letters sent to investors (.5); internal investigation regarding same (1.0).                     | CASE | ABT             | 1.50 hrs.        |
| 03/08/10                         | Teleconference with Maya Lockwood regarding Bonds.com updates for the interim report.                                                                                     | CASE | JL              | 0.50 hrs.        |
| 04/05/10                         | No Charge: E-mail exchange with Carl Nelson regarding drafting a motion to withdraw as counsel (Fowler White).                                                            | CASE | ABT             | 0.10 hrs.        |
| 04/07/10                         | No Charge: Preparation of motion to withdraw as counsel for Receiver (.5); receipt and review of order granting same (.1).                                                | CASE | ABT             | 0.60 hrs.        |
| <b>TOTAL Case Administration</b> |                                                                                                                                                                           |      | <b>\$599.85</b> | <b>3.80 hrs.</b> |

**Work on Fees Application**

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand  
 Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
 Invoice 758438  
 Page 11  
 BWV/1090069

|                                       |                                                                                          |       |               |                  |
|---------------------------------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-------|---------------|------------------|
| 02/05/10                              | No Charge: Reviewed pre-bills for the receivership.                                      | WFEES | JL            | 0.30 hrs.        |
| 02/09/10                              | No Charge: Reviewed billing entries.                                                     | WFEES | JL            | 0.50 hrs.        |
| 03/11/10                              | No Charge: Review status of bills; discussions with accounting personnel regarding same. | WFEES | ABT           | 0.30 hrs.        |
| <b>TOTAL Work on Fees Application</b> |                                                                                          |       | <b>\$0.00</b> | <b>1.10 hrs.</b> |

Summary of Fees

|                                                     | Hours        | Rate/Hr | Dollars          |                     |
|-----------------------------------------------------|--------------|---------|------------------|---------------------|
| Ashley Bruce Trehan                                 | 1.00         | 0.00    | 0.00             |                     |
| Ashley Bruce Trehan                                 | 2.70         | 193.50  | 522.45           |                     |
| Jason Liu                                           | 0.80         | 0.00    | 0.00             |                     |
| Jason Liu                                           | 81.20        | 193.50  | 15,712.20        |                     |
|                                                     | -----        | -----   | -----            |                     |
| <b>TOTAL</b>                                        | <b>85.70</b> |         | <b>16,234.65</b> |                     |
| <b>Fees for Professional Services Rendered.....</b> |              |         |                  | <b>\$ 16,234.65</b> |

Disbursements Through 04/30/10

|          |                                                                                        |       |
|----------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-------|
| 02/09/10 | VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: FW0024/123109 DATE: 1/6/2010<br>Online Research | 11.12 |
| 03/04/10 | Long Distance Telephone                                                                | 13.90 |
| 03/23/10 | Long Distance Telephone                                                                | 1.65  |
| 03/29/10 | Long Distance Telephone                                                                | 0.15  |
| 03/30/10 | Long Distance Telephone                                                                | 1.50  |
| 03/31/10 | Long Distance Telephone                                                                | 0.15  |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand  
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Page 12  
BWW/1090069

|                           |                         |          |
|---------------------------|-------------------------|----------|
| 03/31/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 0.45     |
| 04/02/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 1.65     |
| 04/02/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 0.15     |
| 04/06/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 1.35     |
| 04/12/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 0.15     |
| 04/12/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 1.20     |
| 04/22/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 0.15     |
| 04/26/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 0.15     |
| 04/27/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 0.15     |
| 04/28/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 0.15     |
| 04/29/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 1.50     |
| 04/29/10                  | Long Distance Telephone | 0.15     |
| Total Disbursements ..... |                         | \$ 35.67 |

**TOTALS FOR THIS INVOICE**

|                                        |                     |
|----------------------------------------|---------------------|
| Fees for Professional Services.....    | 16,234.65           |
| Disbursements .....                    | 35.67               |
| <b>TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE.....</b> | <b>\$ 16,270.32</b> |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE



Burton W. Wiand  
Fowler White Boggs P.A.  
501 East Kennedy Blvd., Suite 1700  
Tampa, Florida 33602

September 1, 2010  
Invoice 758438  
Tax # 59-1280172  
BWW/1090069

Re: 1090069  
Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

**\*\*\* REMITTANCE ADVICE \*\*\***

**Payment is due upon receipt.  
Please remit this page with your payment.**

|                                       |                            |
|---------------------------------------|----------------------------|
| <b>Fees Due This Invoice</b>          | <b>16,234.65</b>           |
| <b>Disbursements Due This Invoice</b> | <b>35.67</b>               |
| <b>TOTAL DUE FOR THIS MATTER.....</b> | <b>\$ <u>16,270.32</u></b> |

**FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.**

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

501 EAST KENNEDY BLVD., SUITE 1700 • TAMPA, FLORIDA 33602 • P.O. BOX 1438 • TAMPA, FL 33601

TELEPHONE (813) 228-7411 • FAX (813) 229-8313 • WWW.FOWLERWHITE.COM

EXPENSES ARE BILLED AT ACTUAL COSTS DETERMINED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ABA GUIDELINES