

Wiand Guerra King P.L.3000 Bayport Drive
Suite 600

Tampa, FL 33607

Telephone: 813-347-5100

Facsimile: 813-347-5154

Federal Tax ID # 27-0937962

Burton W. Wiand
Fowler White Boggs, PA
501 E. Kennedy Blvd., Ste. 1700
Tampa, FL 33602

August 24, 2010

Client: 025305

Matter: 090245

Invoice #: 1072

Page: 1

RE: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

For Professional Services Rendered Through April 30, 2010

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASDIS	Asset Disposition			
02/04/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with J. Schicherize re: Thomasville property.	0.5	\$175.00
02/17/2010	BWW	Thomasville real estate transaction (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
02/22/2010	BWW	Review of documentation related to Thomasville closing (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
03/04/2010	BWW	Exchange several emails with R. Jernigan re: asset disposition (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
03/04/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: sale of assets and Spiro (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
03/23/2010	BWW	Consideration of disposition of property with R. Jernigan; execution of vendor checks.	0.6	\$210.00
03/26/2010	BWW	Office conference with R. Jamieson re: Nitzsche (.4); telephone conference with R. Jernigan (.5); review of documents related to NC property closing (.5).	1.4	\$490.00
03/29/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with J. Liu and J. Rizzo re: GA gas station (.7).	0.7	\$245.00
04/07/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with J. Liu re: Rite Aid purchase agreement.	1.0	\$350.00
04/08/2010	BWW	Review emails re: Shell gas station closing (.4).	0.4	\$140.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASDIS	Asset Disposition			
04/09/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with J. Liu re: Shell Gas Station closing.	0.5	\$175.00
04/19/2010	BWW	Telephone conference and emails with R. Jernigan about Newnan hangars and Receivership details; telephone conference with M. Sullivan.	1.1	\$385.00
04/22/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with W. Price and G. Morello; office discussion with J. Rizzo re: administration.	1.0	\$350.00
04/27/2010	BWW	Office conferences with J. Rizzo re: status, bank accounts, etc. (.5); office meeting with R. Jernigan re: airplanes and administration of same (.5); telephone conference with W. Price re: POA for IRS; review investor emails and execute POA (.5); email S. Masel re: presentation (.3); review investor emails (.3); office conference with R. Jamieson re: Bishop property (.6).	2.7	\$945.00
Total: Asset Disposition			12.30	\$4,305.00
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
02/04/2010	BWW	Telephone conferences with M. Lockwood (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
02/05/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with D. Wolfson and J. Rizzo re: Thomasville property (.1).	0.1	\$35.00
02/08/2010	BWW	Review ownership document for A. Nadel's former house (.5); telephone conference with C. Cassidy and M. Gombiner (.5); telephone conference with investor victims (.5).	1.5	\$525.00
02/15/2010	BWW	Administrative status meeting with R. Jernigan and J. Rizzo (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
02/17/2010	BWW	Office meeting with J. Rizzo (.5); Venice Jet Center conferences with R. Jernigan re: tugs (.2); telephone conference with R. Brodsky and M. Douvas (.5); office conference with G. Morello (.3); telephone conference with C. Cassidy (.5).	2.0	\$700.00
02/17/2010	BWW	Office meeting with G. Guerra and G. Morello prior to meeting with Moody's counsel (2.0); meeting with J. Felman, M. Danzi and R. Glenn with G. Guerra (1.0); administrative meeting with R. Jernigan (.5); administrative meeting with Gwynn Davis of Bay Cities to open accounts (.5).	4.0	\$1,400.00
02/17/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with E. Silvestrini of Tampa Tribune re: assets.	0.5	\$175.00
02/19/2010	BWW	Consideration of assets with J. Rizzo; consideration of Thomasville property and transactions; review Venice Jet Center documentation.	2.0	\$700.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET		Asset Analysis and Recovery		
02/19/2010	BWW	Consideration of approval or denials of settlements with M. Lamont.	0.5	\$175.00
02/26/2010	BWW	Meeting with J. Barry of Bonds.com re: board; meeting with J. Rizzo re: assets.	2.5	\$875.00
03/04/2010	BWW	Review Garren Creek property with J. Rizzo (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
03/05/2010	BWW	Office meeting with R. Jernigan re: assets (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
03/05/2010	BWW	Office meeting with R. Jernigan re: assets (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
03/08/2010	BWW	Review of prior correspondence related to discounts (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
03/10/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: assets (.5); consideration of claims and arrangements re: Wachovia Bank accounts (.4); telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: airplane insurance, C. Moody rental and Little Gasparilla rental house and related matters (.6).	1.5	\$525.00
03/17/2010	BWW	Office conference with G. Morello re: proposed Motion (.8).	0.8	\$280.00
Total: Asset Analysis and Recovery			21.40	\$7,490.00
BUSIN		Business Operations		
02/03/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with J. Rizzo, N. Armour and B. Etheridge re: L. Mountain Preserve and Garren Creek.	1.0	\$700.00
Total: Business Operations			1.00	\$700.00
CASE		Case Administration		
02/01/2010	BWW	Office meeting with R. Jernigan re: status.	0.5	\$175.00
02/02/2010	BWW	Review interim report and billings.	1.5	\$525.00
02/04/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with C. Cassidy and M. Gombiner re: plea for A. Nadel (.5); office conference with M. Lockwood and G. Morello re: conference with Ms. Cassidy and Mr. Gombiner (.5); telephone conference with M. Doubas of U.S. Justice Department (.5); status meeting re: case (1.5).	3.0	\$1,050.00
02/04/2010	BWW	Office meeting with J. Rizzo re: bank accounts and execution of checks (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
02/26/2010	BWW	Meeting with Tampa Tribune Reporter, Elaine Silvestrini re: assets.	2.5	\$875.00
03/01/2010	BWW	Preparation for visit with A. Nadel.	3.0	\$1,050.00
03/02/2010	BWW	Visit A. Nadel; meet with counsel; travel to and from jail.	8.0	\$2,800.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
CASE	Case Administration			
03/04/2010	BWW	Meet with J. Rizzo re: asset administration of checks, etc. (.5); telephone conference with J. Hilshire of Herald Tribune re: developments (.5).	1.0	\$350.00
03/04/2010	BWW	Review Receiver's report (2.5).	2.5	\$875.00
03/10/2010	BWW	Final review of 5th interim report and approval of same with M. Lockwood (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
03/11/2010	BWW	Conference re: development strategy with M. Lamont and M. Lockwood re: developing presentation to investors and filing of claims procedures (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
03/11/2010	BWW	Office discussion with G. Morello and M. Lamont and review of Judge's Order (1.0).	0.5	\$175.00
03/12/2010	BWW	Preparation and execution of contract letter to R. Jernigan (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
03/15/2010	BWW	Administrative tasks, letters, checks, bank accounts, etc.	0.8	\$280.00
03/18/2010	BWW	Telephone conference and communication with Bank re: letter of credit for R. Jernigan and NC property; telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: NC property; office conference with J. Rizzo.	0.5	\$175.00
03/30/2010	BWW	Execution of SAS consulting and preparation for hearing; arrangements for claims procedure and for town meeting.	0.5	\$175.00
04/06/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with E. Zack, former wife of A. Nadel.	0.1	\$35.00
04/08/2010	BWW	Arrangements for Receivership symposium (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
04/25/2010	BWW	Preparation of power point presentation for meeting in Sarasota.	1.5	\$525.00
04/26/2010	BWW	Final revisions to power point presentation (.5); interview with Channel 10 News (.8); travel to Sarasota for Nadel Receivership meeting and give presentation (6.0).	7.3	\$2,555.00
Total: Case Administration			36.60	\$12,810.00
Total Professional Services			71.3	\$25,305.00
Total Services			\$25,305.00	
Total Current Charges				\$25,305.00
Previous Balance				\$15,330.00
<i>Less Payments</i>				<i>(\$15,330.00)</i>
PAY THIS AMOUNT				\$25,305.00

TASK RECAP

Services

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
NADEL - ASDIS	12.3	\$4,305.00
NADEL - ASSET	21.4	\$7,490.00
NADEL - BUSIN	1	\$700.00
NADEL - CASE	36.6	\$12,810.00
	<u>71.30</u>	<u>\$25,305.00</u>

Disbursements

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	<u>\$0.00</u>

BREAKDOWN BY PERSON

<u>Person</u>	<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
BWW Burton W. Wiand	NADEL - ASDIS	12.3	\$4,305.00
BWW Burton W. Wiand	NADEL - ASSET	21.4	\$7,490.00
BWW Burton W. Wiand	NADEL - BUSIN	1	\$700.00
BWW Burton W. Wiand	NADEL - CASE	36.6	\$12,810.00
		<u>71.30</u>	<u>\$25,305.00</u>