

**Wiand Guerra King P.L.**3000 Bayport Drive  
Suite 600

Tampa, FL 33607

Telephone: 813-347-5100

Facsimile: 813-347-5154

Federal Tax ID # 27-0937962

Burton W. Wiand

Burton W. Wiand

Wiand Guerra King, P.L.

3000 Bayport Drive, Ste. 600

Tampa, FL 33607

November 18, 2010

Client: 025305

Matter: 090808

Invoice #: 1455

Page: 1

RE: Scoop Legal Team - Carolina Mountain Land Conservancy

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2010

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
	<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>		
05/03/2010	JR	Receipt, review and reply to e-mail from Doug Rabold regarding Laurel Mountain Preserve (.2); receipt and review of correspondence and photographs regarding Garren Creek property from Roger Jernigan (.1).	0.3	\$42.00
05/11/2010	GM	Addressed matters relating to Laurel Preserve easement (0.5).	0.5	\$157.50
05/11/2010	ML	Factual analysis re: easement (1.0); drafted amended complaint (2.0).	3.0	\$810.00
05/13/2010	GM	Revised Carolina Conservancy clawback complaint (1.8).	1.8	\$567.00
05/17/2010	GM	Revised Carolina Conservancy complaint (0.8).	0.8	\$252.00
05/21/2010	GM	Prepared amended complaint against Carolina Conservancy (1.0).	1.0	\$315.00
06/10/2010	GM	Reviewed Carolina Conservancy answer (0.3).	0.3	\$94.50
06/14/2010	GM	Work on Carolina Conservancy case management report (2.0).	2.0	\$630.00
06/15/2010	GM	Prepared case management report for Carolina Conservancy case (0.9); communications with C Smart re Carolina Conservancy case (0.1).	1.0	\$315.00
06/16/2010	ML	Factual analysis re: transfers to Carolina Conservancy (1.5).	1.5	\$405.00

**EXHIBIT 13**

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
	<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>		
06/18/2010	GM	Case management conference with C Smart re Carolina Conservancy case (0.3); communications with C Smart re confidentiality agreement and mediation (0.1).	0.4	\$126.00
06/22/2010	GM	Addressed mediation of Carolina Conservancy case (0.3).	0.3	\$94.50
06/29/2010	JR	Review of documentation related to Laurel Preserve for opinions on value of conservation easement per conference with Mr. Morello (.5).	0.5	\$70.00
06/30/2010	GM	Prepared for conference with C Smart re Carolina Conservancy case (0.4); conference with C Smart (0.4).	0.8	\$252.00
07/08/2010	GM	Reviewed case management order in Carolina Conservancy case (0.3).	0.3	\$94.50
07/14/2010	GM	Communications with Receiver re Carolina Conservancy case (0.1).	0.1	\$31.50
07/15/2010	RJ	Drafting Rule 26 initial disclosures.	0.8	\$154.80
07/16/2010	RJ	Drafting Wiand v. Carolina Mountain Land Conservancy Rule 26(a)(1) initial disclosures.	3.5	\$677.25
07/19/2010	GM	Prepared Rule 26 initial disclosures for Carolina Conservancy case (2.1).	2.1	\$661.50
07/19/2010	RJ	Revising Rule 26(a)(1) initial disclosures.	1.5	\$290.25
07/19/2010	JR	Research and review of documentation related to Laurel Preserve per communication with Mr. Morello (.4).	0.4	\$56.00
<b>Total: Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			<b>22.90</b>	<b>\$6,096.30</b>
<b>Total Professional Services</b>			<b>22.9</b>	<b>\$6,096.30</b>
Total Services			\$6,096.30	
Total Current Charges				\$6,096.30
Previous Balance				\$1,701.00
<i>Less Payments</i>				<i>(\$1,701.00)</i>
<b>PAY THIS AMOUNT</b>				<b>\$6,096.30</b>

---

**TASK RECAP**

**Services**

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
NADEL - ASSET	22.9	\$6,096.30
	<u>22.90</u>	<u>\$6,096.30</u>

**Disbursements**

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	\$0.00
	<u>\$0.00</u>

**BREAKDOWN BY PERSON**

<u>Person</u>	<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
ML Michael Lamont	NADEL - ASSET	4.5	\$1,215.00
GM Gianluca Morello	NADEL - ASSET	11.4	\$3,591.00
RJ Robert Jamieson	NADEL - ASSET	5.8	\$1,122.30
JR Jeffrey Rizzo	NADEL - ASSET	1.2	\$168.00
		<u>22.90</u>	<u>\$6,096.30</u>