

Wiand Guerra King P.L.3000 Bayport Drive
Suite 600

Tampa, FL 33607

Telephone: 813-347-5100

Facsimile: 813-347-5154

Federal Tax ID # 27-0937962

Burton W. Wiand
 Burton W. Wiand
 Wiand Guerra King, P.L.
 3000 Bayport Drive, Ste. 600
 Tampa, FL 33607

November 19, 2010

Client: 025305

Matter: 090245

Invoice #: 1485

Page: 1

RE: Scoop Receivership - Representation of Scoop Receivership

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2010

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASDIS	Asset Disposition			
5/11/2010	BWW	Offices conferences with J. Rizzo re: real estate (.3); telephone conference with W. Price (.5).	0.8	\$280.00
5/13/2010	BWW	Emails with J. Liu re: Bonds.com (.5); office conferences with J. Rizzo re: banking and asset issues (1.0).	1.5	\$525.00
5/26/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: status update (.8); telephone conferences with W. Price re: Newnan and other updates (1.0); office conferences with J. Rizzo re: hangar sales efforts and emails re: hangars (0.7).	2.5	\$875.00
6/11/2010	BWW	Work in connection with sale of Cherokee (.9); telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: status of transactions (.2); emails and review of motion and documents (.1).	1.2	\$420.00
7/9/2010	BWW	Review and execute documents to sell Cherokee plane.	0.3	\$105.00
7/20/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with M. Saunders re: Bonds.com.	3.0	\$1,050.00
7/23/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with R. Jernigan, J. Rizzo and J. Liu re: closing of Shell Gas Station (1.0); telephone conference with J. Skicewz related to sale of Fruitvale Rd (1.0).	2.0	\$700.00

EXHIBIT 3

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
	ASDIS	Asset Disposition		
7/26/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with R. Brodsky re: funds from A. Nadel (.5); telephone conference with G. Morello re: gas station (.3); preparation for conference with SEC (.4); office conferences with J. Rizzo re: consideration of memorandum for approval of sale of gas station (.3); office conference with R. Jernigan re: Ballasarra conditions (1.0); telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: receivership assets (.2).	2.7	\$945.00
7/27/2010	BWW	Office conferences with J. Rizzo re: P. Nadel's financial situation (1.5); communications with J. Rizzo and J. Liu re: gas station closing (1.5).	3.0	\$1,050.00
7/29/2010	BWW	Office conference with J. Liu pertaining to Shell Gas Station closing (1.10); telephone conference with M. Sanders related to Bonds.com and sale of gas station (.4); execution of documents associated with closing (.2); office meeting with J. Rizzo and review closing documents re: potential sale of Starbucks (.5); telephone conference with J. Skiciewcz re: same (.3).	2.5	\$875.00
7/30/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with J. Skiciewcz re: Fruitville (.5); address gas station closing (1.0).	1.5	\$525.00
Total: Asset Disposition			21.00	\$7,350.00
	ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery		
5/7/2010	BWW	Conversation and emails re: Bonds.com (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
5/12/2010	BWW	Email exchange re: foreclosure procedures.	0.3	\$105.00
5/18/2010	BWW	Bonds.com execution of emails and documents with M. Sanderson (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
5/20/2010	BWW	Review and revise claim from IRS for Nadel Receivership.	1.0	\$350.00
5/25/2010	BWW	Review email re: equity numbers (.2); office conference with J. Rizzo re: various matters (.6).	0.8	\$280.00
5/27/2010	BWW	Office conference with G. Morello re: funds and legal strategy.	1.0	\$350.00
6/1/2010	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo re: jewelry and execution of check for properties.	0.3	\$105.00
6/3/2010	BWW	Review D. Rowe tax returns (.2); review and revise subpoena (.2); arrange contact with Fidelity (.1).	0.5	\$175.00
6/4/2010	BWW	Review D. Rowe bank deposits (1.0); review subpoenas with J. Rizzo (.2).	1.2	\$420.00
6/7/2010	BWW	Emails to S. Masel (.3); emails to W. Price (.2); telephone conference with W. Price (.2).	0.7	\$245.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
6/7/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with W. Price re: additional D. Rowe information.	0.2	\$70.00
6/8/2010	BWW	Telephone conferences with R. Jernigan (.2); office conference with J. Rizzo (.2); review draft motion (.4); review documents for R. Jernigan (.2).	1.0	\$350.00
6/8/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with D. Clayton re: D. Rowe case.	0.3	\$105.00
6/9/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with T. Hudson (.5); office meeting with T. Hudson and Sr. Vice President (1.5).	2.0	\$700.00
6/9/2010	BWW	Office conference with R. Jamieson re: tax bill to Home Front Homes re: Bishop property (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
6/14/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: airplanes (.5); office conferences and emails with J. Rizzo re: assets (1.0); preparation of agreement document and promissory note re: airplane with R. Jernigan (1.0).	2.5	\$875.00
6/15/2010	BWW	Office conference with M. Lockwood re: legal strategy.	0.3	\$105.00
6/17/2010	BWW	Review with M. Lamont Rowe's objection to subpoena and timing of money.	1.0	\$350.00
6/18/2010	BWW	Sign checks (.10); authorize various actions on properties (.5); discuss new arrangements for property marketing (.4).	1.0	\$350.00
6/18/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: aircraft (.3); telephone conferences with R. Jernigan re: real estate (.3); office conference with J. Rizzo re: final transaction documents for aircraft (.5).	1.1	\$385.00
6/21/2010	BWW	Emails re: Cherokee airplane with J. Rizzo and R. Jernigan.	0.5	\$175.00
6/22/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with S. Masel re: D. Rowe motion (.4); office conference with M. Lamont and G. Morello re: SEC's participation in response (1.0); review and revise response to motion (3.5); office conference with G. Morello and M. Lamont (.5); review email of A. Saul (.1).	4.5	\$1,575.00
7/2/2010	BWW	Telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: emails, creditors, utilities, repairs and maintenance matters (.8); office conference with R. Jamieson re: defense judgment (.5).	1.3	\$455.00
7/7/2010	BWW	Review draft of motion relating to Bonds.com tender offer.	0.5	\$175.00
7/7/2010	BWW	Review offer re: Goody Consulting Property (.9); review emails regarding gas station and send email re: future matters relating to gas station (.4).	1.3	\$455.00
7/15/2010	BWW	Office conferences with G. Morello and M. Lamont (0.2); telephone conference with J. Lopez (0.3); review documents for IRS (0.5).	1.0	\$350.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery		
7/16/2010	BWW	Review Motion for Contempt (1.0); telephone conference with T. Tremaine re: custody of stock and cash holdings (.5).	1.5	\$525.00
7/21/2010	BWW	Office meeting with J. Rizzo re: J. Pines condominium (.3); continue work regarding subcontract to Katz Rosen (.3); telephone conference with R. Jernigan re: Shell Station (.2); email exchange with J. Skicewicz re: Starbucks (.2).	1.0	\$350.00
7/22/2010	BWW	Office conference with J. Rizzo re: assets (.2); office meetings with M. Lamont, J. Rizzo and S. Bell re: gas station assets and company records (.4); office conferences with G. Guerra re: Wells Fargo contract(.4); telephone conference with J. Rizzo and R. Brodsky related to signature on IRS refund check issued to A. Nadel (.4); office conferences re: gas station (.4); review of expert witness John Fedders and Professor Freeman (.2).	2.0	\$700.00
7/27/2010	BWW	Office discussion with M. Lockwood re: Northern Trust documents and signature to same (.4); review of documents (.4).	0.8	\$280.00
7/28/2010	BWW	Office meeting with M. Lamont and J. Rizzo re: assets collected for S. Masel's report (1.5); telephone conference with J. Liu re: Bonds.com (.5); discussions with G. Morello and M. Lamont re: various matters (.2); telephone conference with B. Anton Ferrell re: J. Cloud (.3).	2.5	\$875.00
Total: Asset Analysis and Recovery			33.30	\$11,655.00
Total Professional Services			54.3	\$19,005.00
Total Services			\$19,005.00	
Total Current Charges				\$19,005.00
Previous Balance				\$25,305.00
<i>Less Payments</i>				<i>(\$25,305.00)</i>
PAY THIS AMOUNT				\$19,005.00

TASK RECAP

Services

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
NADEL - ASDIS	21	\$7,350.00
NADEL - ASSET	33.3	\$11,655.00
	<u>54.30</u>	<u>\$19,005.00</u>

Disbursements

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	<u>\$0.00</u>

BREAKDOWN BY PERSON

Person

BWW Burton W. Wiand
BWW Burton W. Wiand

Project No.

Hours

Amount

NADEL - ASDIS 21 \$7,350.00
NADEL - ASSET 33.3 \$11,655.00
54.30 \$19,005.00