

EXHIBIT 12



Burton W. Wiand
Fowler White Boggs P.A.
501 East Kennedy Blvd., Suite 1700
Tampa, Florida 33602

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Tax # 59-1280172
Page 1
BWW/1090069

Re: **1090069**
Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

Professional Services Through 12/31/10

Asset Analysis and Recovery

08/02/10	Emails with Jeff Rizzo and the Receiver regarding Bond.com proposal for extension and amendment of promissory note (0.4); reviewed document regarding same (0.8).	ASSET	JL	1.20 hrs.
08/03/10	Reviewed Bond.com proposal regarding extension and amendment of promissory note.	ASSET	JL	0.60 hrs.
08/05/10	E-mails and teleconferences with the Receiver regarding terms of extension on promissory note (.4); reviewed proposal and prepared correspondences regarding same (2.2).	ASSET	JL	2.60 hrs.
08/10/10	Emails with Jeff Rizzo and the Receiver regarding terms for the extension of Bonds.com promissory note (.4); emails with Roger Jernigan regarding letter of intent for the Rite Aid property (.2).	ASSET	JL	0.60 hrs.
08/11/10	Teleconference and emails with the Receiver regarding Bonds.com note extension terms (.4); emails with Michael Sanderson regarding same and conversion of warrants (.6); voicemail with Jeff Chertoff regarding paperwork for warrant conversion (.1); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

501 EAST KENNEDY BLVD., SUITE 1700 • TAMPA, FLORIDA 33602 • P.O. BOX 1438 • TAMPA, FL 33601

TELEPHONE (813) 228-7411 • FAX (813) 229-8313 • WWW.FOWLERWHITE.COM

EXPENSES ARE BILLED AT ACTUAL COSTS DETERMINED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ABA GUIDELINES

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 2
BWW/1090069

	same (.4).	ASSET	JL	1.50 hrs.
08/12/10	Addressed warrant conversion issues with Bonds.com.	ASSET	JL	0.70 hrs.
08/13/10	Emails with Michael Sanderson regarding proposed terms for extension of promissory note (0.4); reviewed proposed terms regarding same (0.9).	ASSET	JL	1.30 hrs.
08/17/10	Teleconference and emails with the Receiver regarding counter-terms from Bonds.com (.8); emails with Michael Sanderson regarding responses from the Receiver (1.4); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding extension of Bonds.com promissory note and warrant conversion documents (.6).	ASSET	JL	2.80 hrs.
08/18/10	Communications with J. Liu regarding Bonds.com SEC filing issues.	ASSET	IL	0.50 hrs.
08/18/10	Reviewed documents regarding Bonds.com warrant conversion (1.6); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same and extension of Bonds.com promissory note (.4); teleconference with the Receiver regarding same (.2).	ASSET	JL	2.20 hrs.
08/19/10	Emails with Michael Sanderson regarding revised request on ratchet provision to the Receiver (1.3); emails and voicemail with the Receiver regarding same (.3).	ASSET	JL	1.60 hrs.
08/23/10	Emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding Bonds.com warrants and extension terms (.6); reviewed regarding same (.4); teleconference with Diane Burnette regarding same (.1); reviewed letter from Suncoast Air Center regarding offset (.1).	ASSET	JL	1.20 hrs.

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 3
BWW/1090069

08/24/10	Emails and teleconferences with the Receiver and George Guerra regarding expiration date for Neil Moody's Bonds.com warrants (.6); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (.8); emails and teleconferences with Jeff Chertoff and Michael Sanderson regarding same (1.4); emails with Michael Sanderson regarding proposed terms for secured promissory note extensions (.8).	ASSET	JL	3.60 hrs.
08/25/10	Teleconferences and emails with Michael Sanderson and Mark Danzi regarding proposed terms for secured promissory note extensions (5.6); emails and conferences with the Receiver regarding same (.4); reviewed capitalization table and computation of ratchet protection (.6); addressed issue regarding exercise of warrants (1.2).	ASSET	JL	7.80 hrs.
08/26/10	Telephone conference with J. Liu (.2); review and analysis of documents relating to exchange offer and antidilution adjustments (1.1).	ASSET	DBN	1.30 hrs.
08/26/10	Teleconferences and emails with Michael Sanderson regarding proposed terms for secured promissory note extensions (2.7); emails and teleconferences with the Receiver regarding same (.4); reviewed capitalization table and computation of ratchet protection (1.7); addressed issues regarding ratchet protection provisions (4.4).	ASSET	JL	9.20 hrs.
08/27/10	Review and legal analysis of documents relating to exchange offer by Bonds.com.	ASSET	DBN	1.20 hrs.
08/27/10	Teleconferences and emails with Michael Sanderson and Mark Danzi regarding proposed terms for secured promissory note extensions (6.2); emails with the Receiver regarding same (1.2); emails and teleconferences with Bill Price regarding computation of capitalized accrued interest amount (1.8); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (.6); addressed issues regarding capitalization table (1.8).			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 4
BWW/1090069

	ASSET	JL	11.60 hrs.
08/28/10	Addressed updates regarding Bonds.com.		
	ASSET	JL	0.20 hrs.
08/30/10	Teleconference with Mark Danzi, Rachel Feinman regarding proposed term sheet for extension of the convertible promissory notes (1.0); reviewed and revised regarding same (2.8); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding computation of accrued interest amounts (.4).		
	ASSET	JL	4.20 hrs.
08/31/10	Attorney conference with Ian Larson regarding amendments to promissory notes (0.7); reviewed regarding same (1.8); teleconference with Roger Jernigan regarding same and Guy-Nadel Foundation real estate tax bill (.4).		
	ASSET	JL	2.90 hrs.
09/02/10	Emails with Mark Danzi regarding status on the preparation of term sheet (1.1); emails with Bill Price regarding computation of accrued interest (.6); attorney conference with Ian Larson regarding preparation of draft documents (.4); voicemails with the Receiver (.2).		
	ASSET	JL	2.30 hrs.
09/03/10	Teleconference with the Receiver regarding status of Bonds.com promissory note extensions (.3); followed-up regarding same (.9).		
	ASSET	JL	1.20 hrs.
09/07/10	Emails with Mark Danzi regarding proposed term sheet for the amendment of the convertible promissory notes (2.8); reviewed regarding same (1.9).		
	ASSET	JL	4.70 hrs.
09/08/10	Reviewed accrued interest computations regarding amendment of the convertible promissory notes (1.4); emails with Bill Price and Matt Low regarding same (.7); reviewed revised term sheet regarding amendment of		

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 5
BWW/1090069

	the convertible promissory notes (2.4); emails and teleconferences with Mark Danzi regarding same (1.7).	ASSET	JL	6.20 hrs.
09/09/10	Reviewed accrued interest computations regarding amendment of the convertible promissory notes (.8); emails with Matt Low regarding same and revisions (.6); reviewed revised term sheet regarding amendment of the convertible promissory notes (1.7); emails and teleconferences with Mark Danzi regarding same (2.1).	ASSET	JL	5.20 hrs.
09/10/10	Reviewed revised accrued interest computations regarding amendment of the convertible promissory notes (1.7); emails and teleconferences with Matt Low regarding same and revisions (.8); reviewed revised term sheet regarding amendment of the convertible promissory notes (1.8); emails and teleconferences with Mark Danzi regarding same and short-term extension (.8); emails and teleconferences with the Receiver regarding same (.3).	ASSET	JL	5.40 hrs.
09/13/10	Emails with Mark Danzi regarding request for extension of the convertible promissory notes (2.1); reviewed and revised draft extension agreement regarding same (1.1).	ASSET	JL	3.20 hrs.
09/13/10	Conducted research and reviewed SEC reporting requirements regarding Bonds.com securities.	ASSET	JL	3.50 hrs.
09/14/10	Emails with Mark Danzi regarding request for payment extension of the Valhalla promissory note (1.4); reviewed document regarding same (1.3).	ASSET	JL	2.70 hrs.
09/15/10	Reviewed and revised extensions to convertible promissory note and term promissory note for Bonds.com (2.2); emails with Ian Larson regarding same (.6).			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 6
BWW/1090069

	ASSET	JL	2.80 hrs.	
09/16/10	Finalized extensions to promissory notes from Bonds.com (1.1); emails with Mark Danzi regarding same for the company's execution (.7).	ASSET	JL	1.80 hrs.
09/17/10	Emails with Mark Danzi regarding extensions executed by the company (.4); emails with Diane Burnette regarding extensions to be executed by the Receiver (.3).	ASSET	JL	0.70 hrs.
09/20/10	Emails and teleconferences with Mark Danzi regarding extension terms for convertible promissory notes (1.5); teleconferences with the Receiver regarding same (.4); teleconference with Diane Burnette regarding Receiver's countersignatures for the short-term extensions (.7).	ASSET	JL	2.60 hrs.
09/21/10	Conference with the Receiver regarding countersign of promissory note extensions (1.4); emails and teleconference with Mark Danzi regarding same and proposed terms of follow-up extensions request (2.4).	ASSET	JL	3.80 hrs.
09/22/10	Emails and teleconferences with Mark Danzi regarding extension terms for convertible promissory notes (4.0); teleconferences with the Receiver regarding same (.3); teleconference with Diane Burnette regarding meeting with the Receiver and management from Bonds.com (.4).	ASSET	JL	4.70 hrs.
09/23/10	Emails and teleconferences with Mark Danzi regarding proposed term sheet (2.1); reviewed term sheets (.8); prepared for meeting with Bonds.com and the Receiver (1.6).	ASSET	JL	4.50 hrs.
09/24/10	Emails with Mike Sanderson regarding meeting with the Receiver (.3); reviewed revised capitalization table (.7); prepared for meeting with the Receiver (.6); emails and teleconference with Mark Danzi regarding same			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 7
BWW/1090069

	and common share adjustments (2.1).	ASSET	JL	3.70 hrs.
09/25/10	Prepared for meeting with Bonds.com (1.2); emails with Jeff Chertoff regarding meeting presentation (.4); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (.2).	ASSET	JL	1.80 hrs.
09/27/10	Prepared for meeting with Ted Knetzger and Mike Sanderson from Bonds.com regarding extension of promissory notes (2.5); attended meeting regarding same (1.2); conference with the Receiver regarding same (.8); prepared summary of transaction regarding same (3.2); addressed issues with Bonds.com common stock certificate for deposit with the Receiver's brokerage account (.8).	ASSET	JL	8.50 hrs.
09/28/10	Reviewed and revised draft amendments to convertible promissory notes (3.8); emails and teleconferences with Mark Danzi regarding same (2.4).	ASSET	JL	6.20 hrs.
09/29/10	Addressed issues with the Bonds.com stock certificates for deposit with Receiver's brokerage account.	ASSET	JL	2.80 hrs.
10/01/10	Emails with Jeff Rizzo and Maya Lockwood regarding Bonds.com updates.	ASSET	JL	0.70 hrs.
10/04/10	Emails with Maya Lockwood regarding Bonds.com updates (.5); reviewed and revised amendment to secured convertible promissory note (2.3); teleconferences and emails with Mark Danzi regarding same (.8); teleconference with the Receiver regarding same (.3).	ASSET	JL	3.90 hrs.
10/05/10	Reviewed and revised amendment to secured convertible promissory note (2.6); teleconferences and emails with Mark Danzi regarding same (1.3);			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 8
BWW/1090069

	emails with Jeff Chertoff from Bonds.com regarding consent and waiver for execution (.1); conference with the Receiver regarding amendment to secured promissory note and consent and waiver for execution (.2).	ASSET	JL	4.20 hrs.
10/06/10	Reviewed and revised amendment to secured convertible promissory note (1.4); teleconferences and emails with Mark Danzi regarding same (2.2); emails with Jeff Chertoff from Bonds.com regarding executed consent and waiver (.2).	ASSET	JL	3.80 hrs.
10/07/10	Emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding value of stock holdings in the Receivership (.3); prepared for securities filings regarding Bonds.com (1.2).	ASSET	JL	1.50 hrs.
10/08/10	Teleconferences and emails with the Receiver regarding promissory note extensions for Bonds.com (.3); prepared Form 4 and Schedule 13D filings with the SEC (2.3).	ASSET	JL	2.60 hrs.
10/11/10	Prepared SEC filings for Bonds.com; (3.4) reviewed and revised regarding transactional documents on the extension of the Bonds.com promissory notes and subordination agreement regarding priority interest in Bonds.com domain name (3.7); teleconferences and emails with Mark Danzi regarding same (1.1).	ASSET	JL	8.20 hrs.
10/12/10	Prepared SEC filings for Bonds.com (4.8); reviewed and revised regarding transactional documents on the extension of the Bonds.com promissory notes and subordination agreement regarding priority interest in Bonds.com domain name (3.1); teleconferences and emails with Mark Danzi regarding same (1.2); emails with the Receiver regarding same (.7).	ASSET	JL	9.80 hrs.
10/13/10	Analysis of issues relating to late filings of SEC reports (.4); telephone			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

	conference with J. Liu (.1).	ASSET	DBN	0.50 hrs.
10/13/10	Prepared SEC filings for Bonds.com (4.5); teleconferences and emails with Mark Danzi regarding transactional documents on the extension of the Bonds.com promissory notes (3.7); emails with Diane Burnette regarding execution of extension of promissory notes (.4); teleconference with Maya Lockwood regarding Bonds.com updates (.6).	ASSET	JL	9.20 hrs.
10/14/10	Prepared SEC filings for Bonds.com (2.1); teleconferences and emails with Mark Danzi regarding transactional documents on the extension of the Bonds.com promissory notes (1.8); emails with with Receiver regarding same (.3); emails with Gianluca Morello regarding same (.4); emails with Maya Lockwood regarding Bonds.com updates (.2).	ASSET	JL	4.80 hrs.
10/15/10	Prepared SEC filings for Bonds.com (1.4); teleconferences and emails with Mark Danzi regarding transactional documents on the extension of the Bonds.com promissory notes (3.8); emails and teleconference with with Receiver regarding same (.8); emails with Gianluca Morello regarding same and draft motion (1.4).	ASSET	JL	7.40 hrs.
10/18/10	Emails with Mark Danzi regarding finalizing restructuring of Bonds.com promissory notes (1.2); emails with Gianluca Morello regarding court filings regarding approval for restructuring of Bonds.com promissory notes (1.5).	ASSET	JL	2.70 hrs.
10/19/10	Emails with Mark Danzi regarding court approval for restructuring of Bonds.com promissory notes (.4); emails with Gianluca Morello regarding same(.4); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding Bonds.com stock certificates (.4).	ASSET	JL	1.20 hrs.

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 10
BWW/1090069

10/20/10	Assembled final executed documents regarding restructuring of the Bonds.com promissory notes.	ASSET	JL	1.40 hrs.
10/21/10	Reviewed and revised interim report updates regarding Bonds.com (0.8); reviewed and revised Form 4 regarding tender of warrants with Bonds.com (1.3).	ASSET	JL	2.10 hrs.
10/22/10	Reviewed and revised Form 4 regarding tender of warrants for Bonds.com (0.7); reviewed reverse split regarding Drinks America (1.8); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding reverse split of Drinks America (0.6); emails with Mark Danzi regarding post-extension details for Bonds.com (1.2); emails with Maya Lockwood regarding Bonds.com updates (0.2).	ASSET	JL	4.50 hrs.
10/25/10	Review Form 4 (.3); telephone conference with J. Liu (.2).	ASSET	DBN	0.50 hrs.
10/25/10	Filed Form 4 with the SEC regarding tender of warrant in the exchange offer by Bonds.com (0.8); emails with Mark Danzi regarding beneficial ownership interest and reissuance of stock certificate (0.5).	ASSET	JL	1.30 hrs.
10/26/10	Emails with George Guerra regarding assignment of shares in Rustic Oven, Inc. and Rustic Oven II, Inc. (0.6); prepared corporate document regarding same (2.2).	ASSET	JL	2.80 hrs.
10/27/10	Emails with George Guerra regarding corporate consents required for the assignment of shares in Rustic Oven, Inc. and Rustic Oven II, Inc. (0.6); prepared corporate document regarding same (3.1).	ASSET	JL	3.70 hrs.
10/28/10	Teleconference and emails with Jeff Chertoff from Bonds.com regarding follow-up on reissuance of stock certificates and capitalization table			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 11
BWW/1090069

	(0.3); reviewed capitalization table and prepared Schedule 13D Amendment No. 1 (2.8).	ASSET	JL	3.10 hrs.
10/29/10	Analysis of Schedule 13D issues (.5); legal research regarding same (.5); telephone conference with J. Liu (.3).	ASSET	DBN	1.30 hrs.
10/29/10	Prepared Schedule 13D Amendment No. 1 for SEC filing regarding Bonds.com (4.7); emails and teleconference with Jeff Chertoff from Bonds.com regarding reissuance of stock certificates (1.6); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (0.2); revised spreadsheet regarding Receivership interest in Bonds.com (1.0).	ASSET	JL	7.50 hrs.
11/01/10	Emails with the Receiver and Jeff Chertoff regarding Bonds.com's 8K filing with the SEC (0.3); emails with Mark Danzi and Jeff Chertoff regarding consolidation of Bonds.com shares held by the Receiver (1.2); emails with Erik Moody regarding assignment of Bonds.com stock certificates (0.8); emails with George Guerra regarding Neil Moody and assignment of Bonds.com stock certificates (0.4); prepared stock power regarding assignment of Bonds.com stock certificates (1.7).	ASSET	JL	4.40 hrs.
11/02/10	Reviewed and revised Schedule 13D (4.7); emails and voicemails with Mark Danzi regarding transfer of Bonds.com stock certificates (0.2).	ASSET	JL	4.90 hrs.
11/03/10	Reviewed executed stock power from Erik Moody regarding assignment of Bonds.com stock certificates (0.2); emails with Erik Moody regarding same (0.2); emails with George Guerra regarding transactional documents for Rustic Oven (0.2); emails with George Guerra regarding stock powers for Neil Moody (0.4); emails with Mark Danzi and Jeff Chertoff regarding consolidation of Bonds.com shares (0.8); reviewed and revised draft Amendment No. 1 to Schedule 13D (2.7).	ASSET	JL	4.50 hrs.

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 12
BWW/1090069

11/04/10	Teleconferences and emails with Carylyn Bell from Corporate Stock Transfer regarding consolidation of Bonds.com share certificates (2.7); emails with Gianluca Morello, Jeff Rizzo and Robert Jamieson regarding same (0.6); prepared final version of Amendment No. 1 to Schedule 13D regarding Bonds.com (0.4).	ASSET	JL	3.70 hrs.
11/05/10	Emails with Carylyn Bell regarding stop transfer letter for Bonds.com.	ASSET	JL	0.20 hrs.
11/08/10	Prepared stop transfer letter to Corporate Stock Transfer regarding Receiver's shares in Bonds.com (1.6); emails with Carylyn Bell from Corporate Stock Transfer regarding consolidation of Bonds.com shares (.8); emails and teleconferences with Gianluca Morello and Robert Jamieson regarding same (0.8).	ASSET	JL	3.20 hrs.
11/09/10	Telephone conference with J. Liu (.2); analysis of security law issues (.5).	ASSET	DBN	0.70 hrs.
11/09/10	Prepared and filed Schedule 13D Amendment No.1 (1.8); emails with Carylyn Bell from Corporate Stock Transfer regarding Bonds.com stock certificates (1.4); emails with Gianluca Morello and Robert Jamieson regarding same (0.6).	ASSET	JL	3.80 hrs.
11/10/10	Emails with Carylyn Bell from Corporate Stock Transfer regarding Bonds.com stock certificates (1.4); emails with Robert Jamieson regarding same (0.2).	ASSET	JL	1.60 hrs.
11/12/10	Emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding transfer of Drinks America stocks.	ASSET	JL	0.40 hrs.
11/16/10	Emails with Maya Lockwood regarding Bonds.com shares (0.2); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding Drinks America shares (0.4).			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 13
BWW/1090069

	ASSET	JL	0.60 hrs.
11/18/10	Emails and voicemails with Maya Lockwood regarding Bonds.com update (0.4); emails with Rob Jamieson regarding motion to consolidate Bonds.com shares (0.1); reviewed regarding same (1.2).		
	ASSET	JL	1.70 hrs.
11/19/10	Emails with the Receiver regarding Schedule 13D (0.3); emails with Maya Lockwood regarding same (0.1); reviewed motion to consolidate Bonds.com shares (1.2).		
	ASSET	JL	1.60 hrs.
11/22/10	Emails with Jeff Chertoff at Bonds.com regarding updated capitalization table and reissuance of shares.		
	ASSET	JL	0.40 hrs.
11/23/10	Teleconference with Robert Jamieson regarding review of motion to consolidate Bonds.com shares.		
	ASSET	JL	0.10 hrs.
11/29/10	Reviewed letter from Suncoast Air Center: interest payment.		
	ASSET	JL	0.10 hrs.
11/30/10	Emails with Jeff Chertoff at Bonds.com regarding reissuance of shares and issuance of shares from tender of warrants.		
	ASSET	JL	0.30 hrs.
12/03/10	Teleconference with Patrick Boyle from Bonds.com regarding consolidation of shares already issued and shares from warrant tender (.8); teleconference with Mark Danzi regarding same (.3); complied documents for deliver to Patrick Boyle regarding same (2.6).		
	ASSET	JL	3.70 hrs.
12/07/10	Correspondences with Patrick Boyle from Bonds.com regarding consolidation of the Receivership's interest in the company.		
	ASSET	JL	1.40 hrs.

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 14
BWW/1090069

12/08/10	Addressed issues regarding SEC filing fees (.1); emails with M. Lockwood regarding same (.1).	ASSET	JL	0.20 hrs.	
12/16/10	Emails and teleconferences with Jeff Chertoff regarding change in Bonds.com domain name registration (1.2); emails with Jeff Rizzo and the Receiver regarding approval regarding same (.6).	ASSET	JL	2.80 hrs.	
12/20/10	Teleconference and emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding Home Front Homes promissory note (1.4); reviewed and revised demand letter regarding same (1.0); emails with Gianluca Morello regarding same (.2).	ASSET	JL	2.60 hrs.	
12/21/10	Reviewed correspondences from Alan Craig and Jeff Rizzo regarding Home Front Home issues and payment for promissory note due (1.6); teleconference and emails with Patrick Boyle from Bonds.com regarding affidavits of lost warrant and reviewed affidavits (1.3); emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding same (.1).	ASSET	JL	3.00 hrs.	
TOTAL Asset Analysis and Recovery				\$53,434.70	271.70 hrs.

Asset Disposition

08/02/10	Emails and teleconferences with Jeff Rizzo, the Receiver, Mark Euster, George Calloway, and Reid Harbin regarding closing details on the sale of the gas station.	ASSETDIS	JL	5.60 hrs.
08/03/10	Emails and teleconferences with Jeff Rizzo, the Receiver, Mark Euster, George Calloway, and Reid Harbin regarding closing on the sale of the gas station.	ASSETDIS	JL	3.80 hrs.

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 15
BWW/1090069

08/04/10	E-mails and teleconferences with George Callaway, Mark Euster, the Receiver and Jeff Rizzo regarding closing details and wire transfer on the sale of the gas station.	ASSETDIS	JL	3.90 hrs.
08/05/10	E-mails with Jeff Rizzo and the Receiver regarding prepare motion and propose order for the dismissal of the eviction suit relating to the gas station property.	ASSETDIS	JL	0.20 hrs.
08/06/10	Reviewed draft motion and proposed order to dismiss the eviction suit regarding gas station property (.4); e-mails with Jeff Rizzo and the Receiver regarding same (.2); teleconference with Roger Jernigan regarding same (.2); emails with Mark Euster regarding same (.4).	ASSETDIS	JL	1.20 hrs.
08/09/10	Emails with Jeff Rizzo regarding status on the dismissal of the eviction complaint.	ASSETDIS	JL	0.20 hrs.
08/26/10	Communications with Jason Liu regarding promissory note provisions and modification.	ASSETDIS	ALM	0.30 hrs.
08/27/10	Drafted email to Mark Danzi regarding proposed terms (.5); phone conference with Mike Sanderson regarding Bonds.com terms (.6); communications with J. Liu regarding Bonds.com deal (1.4); researched Edgar and company website regarding total authorized shares (.5); reviewed terms and forwarded to opposing counsel (.4).	ASSETDIS	IL	3.40 hrs.
08/28/10	Reviewed communications to Mark Danzi regarding Bonds.com terms.	ASSETDIS	IL	0.40 hrs.
08/30/10	Analyzed capitalization tables for Bonds.com (.4); communications with J. Liu regarding bonds.com terms (.4); phone conference with Mark			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 16
BWW/1090069

	Danzi regarding Bonds.com (.8); reviewed Exchange Offer for Bonds.com (.8); reviewed Bonds.com loan documents (1.6).	ASSETDIS	IL	4.00 hrs.
08/31/10	Communications with J. Liu regarding disposition of receivership assets and other transaction issues (1.2); reviewed remaining receivership assets for sale (.4).	ASSETDIS	IL	1.60 hrs.
09/02/10	Reviewed FL law regarding doc stamp taxes on Amended Promissory Note.	ASSETDIS	IL	0.60 hrs.
09/08/10	Phone conference with M. Danzi regarding Bonds.com loan restructure and term sheet (.9); reviewed draft term sheet from Bonds.com (1.4).	ASSETDIS	IL	2.30 hrs.
09/09/10	Phone conference with Mark Danzi regarding revised Bonds.com term sheet (8); reviewed revisions to Bonds.com loan restructure term sheet (.6); reviewed revised term sheet from M. Danzi (.3).	ASSETDIS	IL	1.70 hrs.
09/10/10	Analyzed amortization schedules for all outstanding Bonds.com loan obligations (.5); phone conference with Mark Danzi and communications with J. Liu regarding change in financing and term sheet (1.4).	ASSETDIS	IL	1.90 hrs.
09/13/10	Reviewed proposed Amendment No. 1 to Convertible Promissory Note (.4); reviewed updated Amortization Schedules (.3).	ASSETDIS	IL	0.70 hrs.
09/16/10	Reviewed Amendments to Bonds.com notes (.8); reviewed file regarding Form 4 and Form 5 and Schedule 13(d) filings (.7).	ASSETDIS	IL	1.50 hrs.
09/17/10	Reviewed Bonds.com SEC filings (.7); reviewed SEC Form 4 and Form 5			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 17
BWW/1090069

	filing requirements regarding Bonds.com (2.1); reviewed SEC Schedule 13D and regulations related thereto regarding Bonds.com (1.9).	ASSETDIS	IL	4.70 hrs.
09/20/10	Reviewed Form 4 footnotes.	ASSETDIS	IL	0.20 hrs.
09/28/10	Communications with J. Liu regarding term sheet and status update on Bonds.com refinancing/UBS deal (.8); reviewed bonds.com offering memorandum (.6).	ASSETDIS	IL	1.40 hrs.
09/29/10	Bonds.com - Reviewed Amendment No. 2 to Convertible Notes (.4); reviewed Bonds.com table of Receiver's interest and summary of loan extension (.4).	ASSETDIS	IL	0.80 hrs.
10/05/10	Addressed property taxes issue with the Shell gas station.	ASSETDIS	JL	0.20 hrs.
10/06/10	Reviewed revised Amendment No. 2 and conversion price - weighted average provision.	ASSETDIS	IL	0.30 hrs.
10/07/10	Emails with Roger Jernigan regarding real estate taxes for the gas station.	ASSETDIS	JL	0.30 hrs.
10/08/10	Reviewed Form 4 and Schedule 13D instructions for preparation and filing.	ASSETDIS	IL	0.60 hrs.
10/11/10	Communications and meetings with J. Liu regarding draft documents and SEC filings (2.2); reviewed revised capitalization table (.7); reviewed and revised Amendment No. 2 to Notes (.9); reviewed and revised Subordination Agreement (.8); reviewed SEC rules and regulations regarding Form 3, Form 4, Form 5 and Schedule 13D (1.8); prepared SEC			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 18
BWW/1090069

	Form 4 for acquisition of Moody shares (.8); prepared SEC Form 5 for 2009 (.8); prepared SEC Schedule 13D (.9).	ASSETDIS	IL	8.90 hrs.
10/12/10	Communications with J. Liu regarding Form 4 and Schedule 13D filings (1.4); phone conference with Bonds.com counsel regarding revised documents and UBS purchase agreement (1.2); reviewed court and SEC filings regarding disposed warrants in preparation for drafting Form 3 and Form 4 (3.3); revised Form 4 filing regarding acquisition of Moody shares (1.8); drafted Form 4 regarding acquisition and disposal of Stock Warrants (1.9).	ASSETDIS	IL	9.60 hrs.
10/13/10	Revised Form 4 regarding acquisition and disposal of Moody shares and warrants (2.4); revised Form 4 regarding acquisition of Moody shares (.8).	ASSETDIS	IL	3.20 hrs.
10/14/10	Communications with J. Liu regarding Form 4 and Schedule 13G filings, bonds.com capitalization and receivership holdings (1.7); finalized and filed Form 4 regarding acquisition of Moody shares (.2); drafted foot notes to Form 4 regarding acquisition and disposal of shares and warrants (1.4); reviewed SEC rules and regulations and 34 Act regarding beneficial ownership and derivative securities (2.2); drafted summary of calculations of beneficial ownership of shares and derivative securities (.8).	ASSETDIS	IL	6.30 hrs.
10/15/10	Communications with J. Liu regarding SEC filings (1.8); drafted Schedule 13G (.6).	ASSETDIS	IL	2.40 hrs.
10/18/10	Revised Schedule 13G.	ASSETDIS	IL	0.30 hrs.
10/20/10	Communications with J. Liu regarding SEC filings and Bonds.com refinancing transactions (1.2); revised and finalized Form 4 regarding			

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 19
BWW/1090069

	warrants (.5).	ASSETDIS	IL	1.70 hrs.
10/21/10	Communications with J. Liu regarding SEC filings and Bonds.com refinance (1.1); reviewed and revised Form 4 proof regarding acquisition and disposal of warrants (.3); reviewed and revised Schedule 13G proof (.4).	ASSETDIS	IL	1.80 hrs.
10/28/10	Communications with J. Liu regarding Bonds.com refinance, 8K and Schedule 13G filings (.9); reviewed Bonds.com 8k and exhibits (1.4).	ASSETDIS	IL	2.30 hrs.
10/29/10	Reviewed revised capitalization table (.3); drafted Schedule 13D (.4); communications with J. Liu regarding bonds.com refinance and SEC filings (.2).	ASSETDIS	IL	0.90 hrs.
	TOTAL Asset Disposition		\$15,361.65	79.20 hrs.

Business Operations

12/07/10	Addressed issues with SEC filing regarding Bonds.com.	BUSINESS	JL	0.40 hrs.
	TOTAL Business Operations		\$77.40	0.40 hrs.

Work on Fees Application

10/21/10	No Charge: Reviewed time entry (.4); teleconference and emails with Gianluca Morello and Misty Spidel regarding same (.4).	WFEES	JL	0.80 hrs.
	TOTAL Work on Fees Application		\$0.00	0.80 hrs.

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
 Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
 Invoice 786776
 Page 20
 BWV/1090069

Summary of Fees

	Hours	Rate/Hr	Dollars	
Jason Liu	0.80	0.00	0.00	
Jason Liu	281.50	193.50	54,470.25	
Andrew L McIntosh	0.30	315.00	94.50	
Ian Larson	64.00	193.50	12,384.00	
Daniel B Nunn	5.50	350.00	1,925.00	
	-----	-----	-----	
TOTAL	352.10		68,873.75	
Fees for Professional Services Rendered				\$ 68,873.75

Disbursements Through 12/31/10

08/02/10	Long Distance Telephone	1.20
08/03/10	VENDOR: Corporation Service Company (CSC); INVOICE#: 53141808 - Filing in Delaware	265.00
08/04/10	Long Distance Telephone	0.45
08/04/10	Long Distance Telephone	0.45
08/04/10	Long Distance Telephone	0.15
08/06/10	Long Distance Telephone	1.20
08/11/10	Long Distance Telephone	0.30
08/17/10	Long Distance Telephone	1.05
08/18/10	VENDOR: Corporation Service Company (CSC); INVOICE#: 53170371; DATE: 7/29/2010 - Search Fee	157.00
08/18/10	VENDOR: Corporation Service Company (CSC); INVOICE#: 53170395 - UCC Search	157.00
08/18/10	Long Distance Telephone	0.15
08/26/10	Long Distance Telephone	2.25
08/26/10	Long Distance Telephone	1.35
08/27/10	Long Distance Telephone	3.75

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

Burton W. Wiand
Re: Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Page 21
BWW/1090069

10/11/10	Long Distance Telephone	0.30
10/12/10	Long Distance Telephone	0.15
10/12/10	Long Distance Telephone	0.30
10/14/10	Long Distance Telephone	0.60
10/20/10	VENDOR: Federal Express INVOICE#: 727623503 DATE: 10/29/2010 Delivery from UFEMIA ZIMMER/FOWLER WHITE BOGGS to RECORDING/SARASOTA COUNTY CLERK OF COURT on 10/20/2010	10.80
10/28/10	Long Distance Telephone	1.05
11/04/10	Long Distance Telephone	2.70
11/09/10	Facsimiles 10 pages	8.00
12/16/10	Long Distance Telephone	0.45
Total Disbursements		\$ 615.65

TOTALS FOR THIS INVOICE

Fees for Professional Services.....	68,873.75
Disbursements	615.65
TOTAL DUE FOR THIS INVOICE.....	\$ 69,489.40

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE



Burton W. Wiand
Fowler White Boggs P.A.
501 East Kennedy Blvd., Suite 1700
Tampa, Florida 33602

June 7, 2011
Invoice 786776
Tax # 59-1280172
BWW/1090069

Re: **1090069**
Scoop Legal Team - Scoop Capital, LLC Receivership

***** REMITTANCE ADVICE *****

**Payment is due upon receipt.
Please remit this page with your payment.**

Fees Due This Invoice	68,873.75
Disbursements Due This Invoice	615.65
TOTAL DUE FOR THIS MATTER.....	\$ <u>69,489.40</u>

FOWLER WHITE BOGGS P.A.

TAMPA • FORT MYERS • TALLAHASSEE • JACKSONVILLE • FORT LAUDERDALE

501 EAST KENNEDY BLVD., SUITE 1700 • TAMPA, FLORIDA 33602 • P.O. BOX 1438 • TAMPA, FL 33601

TELEPHONE (813) 228-7411 • FAX (813) 229-8313 • WWW.FOWLERWHITE.COM

EXPENSES ARE BILLED AT ACTUAL COSTS DETERMINED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ABA GUIDELINES