

# EXHIBIT 19

# Wiand Guerra King P.L.

3000 Bayport Drive  
Suite 600

Tampa, FL 33607

Telephone: 813-347-5100

Facsimile: 813-347-5198

Federal Tax ID # 27-0937962

Burton W. Wiand  
**Attention: Burton W. Wiand**  
Wiand Guerra King, P.L.  
3000 Bayport Drive, Ste. 600  
Tampa, FL 33607

May 24, 2011  
Client: 025305  
Matter: 000167  
Invoice #: 2183

Page: 1

RE: Scoop Legal Team - Holland & Knight

For Professional Services Rendered Through December 31, 2010

---

## SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
	<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>		
08/03/2010	GM	Review correspondence to Holland & Knight regarding discovery (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
08/03/2010	JR	Review of correspondence between Mr. Wakshlag and Mr. Burns regarding discovery issues related to lawsuit (.4).	0.4	\$56.00
08/04/2010	GM	Review correspondence regarding suit against Holland & Knight (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
08/04/2010	JR	Communicate with Mr. Coleman regarding discovery issues related to lawsuit and review of correspondence regarding discovery issues (.3).	0.3	\$42.00
08/05/2010	JR	Review of documentation from Scoop office and documentation from Holland & Knight for operating agreement per conference with Mr. Lamont (1.5).	1.5	\$210.00
08/09/2010	JR	Review of correspondence from Mr. Burns to Holland & Knight counsel regarding discovery issues and communicate with Mr. Morello regarding same (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
08/18/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
08/25/2010	ML	Attend deposition of S. McCloud. (8.0).	8.0	\$2,160.00
08/25/2010	JR	Review of settlement demand letter (.2).	0.2	\$28.00
08/26/2010	ML	Attend deposition of S. McCloud (8.0).	8.0	\$2,160.00

**SERVICES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>TKPR</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			
08/30/2010	GM	Communications with G. Burns and J. Coleman regarding strategy and next steps for lawsuit against Holland & Knight (1.3).	1.3	\$409.50
08/30/2010	ML	Work on discovery matters (1.5).	1.5	\$405.00
09/14/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding document production in Holland & Knight case (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
09/17/2010	GM	Reviewed Holland & Knight motion to compel (.3); addressed issues regarding Holland & Knight case (.5).	0.8	\$252.00
09/20/2010	GM	Considered strategy for Holland & Knight case (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
09/22/2010	GM	Considered Holland & Knight motion for protection (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
09/30/2010	JR	Review of miscellaneous correspondence and documentation related to case (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
10/10/2010	GM	Revised response to Holland & Knight motion to compel (2.5).	2.5	\$787.50
10/11/2010	GM	Reviewed and commented on draft opposition to motion to compel in Holland & Knight case (.5).	0.5	\$157.50
10/18/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding discovery in suit against Holland & Knight (1.2).	1.2	\$378.00
10/20/2010	GM	Addressed issues regarding production in Holland & Knight case (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
10/20/2010	JR	Review of proposed order on discovery in Holland & Knight litigation and communicate with Mr. Barauskas at Johnson Pope and Mr. Morello regarding same (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
10/21/2010	GM	Communications with team regarding document production for Holland & Knight case and prepared for same (1.0).	1.0	\$315.00
10/21/2010	ML	Consider issues with document production to Holland & Knight (.7).	0.7	\$189.00
10/21/2010	JR	Office conference with Mr. Morello, Mr. Lamont, Mr. Harris and Ms. Rehus regarding proposed discovery order and collection of responsive materials (.7); review of internal correspondence documentation related to individuals listed in order and prepare list of e-mail address for individuals and their counsel (1.3).	2.0	\$280.00
10/22/2010	GM	Addressed issues regarding production to Holland & Knight (1.3).	1.3	\$409.50
10/25/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
10/25/2010	JWH	Review and analyze client documents for production to Holland & Knight (2.4).	2.4	\$336.00

**SERVICES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>TKPR</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			
10/26/2010	GM	Considered matters relating to producing files in connection with case against Holland & Knight (.2); communications with G. Burns regarding response to Holland & Knight document requests (.4); addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.2).	0.8	\$252.00
10/26/2010	ML	Analyze documents to be produced to Holland & Knight (1.0).	1.0	\$270.00
10/26/2010	JWH	Review/analyze email communications from investors and investor attorneys in preparation for production of same (3.0); analysis of correspondence to investors and investor attorneys in preparation for production of same (3.0).	6.0	\$840.00
10/27/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
10/27/2010	ML	Work on production of documents to Holland & Knight (.5).	0.5	\$135.00
10/27/2010	JWH	Review/analyze email correspondence regarding privileged (1.2); review/analyze investor statements (2.5); review client documents for productions (1.2).	4.9	\$686.00
10/28/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
10/28/2010	JWH	Review and analysis of documents for production (7.0).	7.0	\$980.00
10/29/2010	JR	Review of Scoop office documentation for correspondence between Scoop office and Munson per request of Mr. Lamont and review of E-Hounds results (1.0).	1.0	\$140.00
10/29/2010	JWH	Analyze client documents for production to Holland & Knight (7.3).	7.3	\$1,022.00
11/01/2010	JR	Receipt and review of communication from J. Coleman and Discovery Order and Case Management Scheduling Order (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
11/01/2010	JWH	Review/analyze email communication with investors and investor attorneys for settlement communications and other privileged information in preparation for attorney review and production of same (3.5); review/analyze case files for any communication to investors and investor attorneys in preparation for review by attorney and production of same (3.5).	7.0	\$980.00
11/02/2010	GM	Addressed discovery responses for lawsuit against Holland & Knight (1.6).	1.6	\$504.00
11/02/2010	MML	Receipt and review of Holland & Knight case management order (.2).	0.2	\$54.00

**SERVICES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>TKPR</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
	<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>		
11/02/2010	JWH	Review/analyze case files for any communication to investors and investor attorneys in preparation for review by attorney and production of same (5.7); review/analyze email communications with investors and investor attorneys (1.2).	6.9	\$966.00
11/03/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding Receiver's production to Holland & Knight (2.5).	2.5	\$787.50
11/03/2010	ML	Work on production of documents to Holland & Knight (1.4).	1.4	\$378.00
11/03/2010	JR	Conference with Mr. Morello, Mr. Lamont, Mr. Harris and Ms. Rehus to discuss status of retrieval of documentation responsive to discovery order (.8); conference with A. Sharp of E-Hounds and J. Harris regarding retrieval of e-mails responsive to discovery order (.2); review of investor chart of e-mails and names (.2).	1.2	\$168.00
11/03/2010	JWH	Review/analyze case files for any communication to investors and investor attorneys (3.7); prepare chart regarding investor names and email addresses (1.5); review/analyze case files for communications between investors and investor attorneys (2.1); telephone call with E-Hounds regarding extensive search of emails for communications with investors and investor attorneys (.2).	7.5	\$1,050.00
11/04/2010	GM	Addressed discovery issues for Holland & Knight case (.6).	0.6	\$189.00
11/04/2010	JR	Review of investor telephone calls per request of Mr. Morello in connection with discovery order (.8).	0.8	\$112.00
11/04/2010	JWH	Review/analyze case files for any communication to investors and investor attorneys (3.7); telephone call with E-Hounds regarding search of emails for communication with investors and investor attorneys in preparation of production of same per court order (.4); revise list of investor associated emails and names (.9); telephone call with Tribridge regarding search of emails for communication with investors and investor attorneys (.2).	5.2	\$728.00
11/05/2010	JWH	Telephone call to Tribridge regarding coordination of email dump (.3); telephone call to E-Hounds regarding coordination of email dump (.3); review/analyze case files for any communication to investors and investor attorneys (4.5); draft/revise investor chart regarding investors (.5).	5.6	\$784.00
11/08/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
11/08/2010	ML	Work on document production to Holland & Knight (.4).	0.4	\$108.00

May 24, 2011

Client: 025305

Matter: 000167

Invoice #: 2183

Page: 5

---

**SERVICES**

<b>Date</b>	<b>TKPR</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			
11/08/2010	JWH	Telephone call to Tribridge regarding email dump (.2); telephone call to Tribridge regarding email dump (.2); redact confidential settlement communications for production (5.5).	5.9	\$826.00
11/09/2010	JWH	Redact confidential settlement communications for production (3.5); review and analyze files for any communications with investors and/or investor attorneys for production (2.0).	5.5	\$770.00
11/10/2010	JWH	Redacting confidential settlement communications for production (3.0); review and analyze files for any communications with investors and/or investor attorneys (2.7).	5.7	\$798.00
11/11/2010	GM	Communications with D. Rhinehart regarding email search for production to Holland & Knight (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
11/11/2010	JR	Communicate with Mr. Coleman regarding status of collection of materials and review of correspondence from Mr. Harris related to same (.1).	0.1	\$14.00
11/11/2010	JWH	Review/analyze case files for complete copies of correspondence between investor and investor attorneys (3.0); continued preparation of file documents by redacting confidential settlement communications for production (3.0).	6.4	\$896.00
11/12/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.7).	0.7	\$220.50
11/12/2010	JWH	Redact settlement communications for production (3.0).	3.0	\$420.00
11/15/2010	GM	Considered matters regarding discovery to Holland & Knight (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
11/15/2010	ML	Analyze client documents for production to Holland & Knight (3.5).	3.5	\$945.00
11/15/2010	JWH	Receive correspondence from E-Hounds regarding status of email searches in preparation of production of same (.2); continued preparation of file documents for production (5.5).	5.7	\$798.00
11/16/2010	JWH	Continued preparation of file documents for production (5.0).	5.0	\$700.00
11/17/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
11/17/2010	JWH	Telephone call to E-Hounds regarding status of email search (.2); continued preparation of file documents for production (4.9); email to outside counsel regarding production of settlement communications (.1); email from outside counsel regarding production of settlement documents (.1).	5.3	\$742.00

---

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>ASSET</b>	<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			
11/18/2010	JWH	Review and analyze case files for any communications with investors and investor attorneys for production of same (2.8).	4.7	\$658.00
11/19/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
11/19/2010	JWH	Review/analyze case files for any communications with investors and investor attorneys for production of same (1.0); continued preparation of file documents for production (1.0).	5.5	\$770.00
11/22/2010	GM	Addressed issues regarding production to Holland & Knight (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
11/22/2010	JWH	Email correspondence from E-Hounds regarding status of email search (.1).	0.2	\$28.00
11/23/2010	GM	Work in connection with document production to Holland & Knight (.6).	0.6	\$189.00
11/24/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.3).	0.3	\$94.50
11/24/2010	JWH	Email communication to E-Hounds regarding email search for communications (.1); review/analyze documents received from outside vendor in response to email search for communications between investor and/or investor attorneys (3.4).	3.5	\$490.00
11/29/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
11/29/2010	JWH	Prepare email conversion received from E-Hounds (1.0); email communication to E-Hounds regarding email conversion (.1); continue to review/analyze files for any communications with investors and/or investor attorneys for production (2.2).	3.3	\$462.00
11/30/2010	JWH	Review/analyze email communications for settlement communications to investors and attorney investors and redaction of same (7.3).	7.3	\$1,022.00
12/01/2010	GM	Addressed matters regarding production to Holland & Knight (.2).	0.2	\$63.00
12/01/2010	JR	Receipt and review of pdf packet with redacted e-mails slated for production (.5).	0.5	\$70.00
12/01/2010	JWH	Review/analyze email communications for settlement communications to investors and investors attorneys and redaction of same (2.0).	2.0	\$280.00
12/02/2010	JWH	Prepare file documents for production to outside law firm (.3).	0.3	\$42.00

**SERVICES**

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
<b>ASSET</b>		<b>Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>		
12/07/2010	JR	Communicate with Carol at Johnson Pope regarding investor fund and purchase information and communicate with Mr. Morello, Mr. Lamont and PDR regarding same (.2).	0.2	\$28.00
12/08/2010	JR	Receipt of CD of Scoop office e-mail search results regarding Holland & Knight and MacLeod to E-Hounds and transfer materials to system and review materials (.3).	0.3	\$42.00
12/14/2010	GM	Reviewed documents for production to Holland & Knight (4.9).	4.9	\$1,543.50
12/14/2010	JWH	Telephone call with Tribridge regarding conversion of emails (.1); email communication to E-Hounds regarding emails (.1); prepare third set of production documents for review by attorney (1.0).	1.2	\$168.00
12/15/2010	GM	Communications with J. Coleman regarding Holland & Knight production (.1).	0.1	\$31.50
<b>Total: Asset Analysis and Recovery</b>			<b>189.00</b>	<b>\$34,041.00</b>
<b>Total Professional Services</b>			<b>189.0</b>	<b>\$34,041.00</b>

**DISBURSEMENTS**

Date	Description of Disbursements	Amount
<b>E107 Del. Services/Messengers</b>		
11/30/2010	Choice Express- Courier Service- Courier expense to Johnson & Pope, PA (Tampa) 11/17/10	\$14.00
11/30/2010	Choice Express- Courier Service- Courier expense to Johnson & Pope, PA (Tampa) 11/24/10	\$14.00
<b>Total Disbursements</b>		<b>\$28.00</b>

Total Services	\$34,041.00
Total Disbursements	\$28.00
Total Current Charges	\$34,069.00
Previous Balance	\$2,062.90
Less Payments	(\$2,062.90)
<b>PAY THIS AMOUNT</b>	<b>\$34,069.00</b>



May 24, 2011

Client: 025305

Matter: 000167

Invoice #: 2183

Page: 8

**TASK RECAP**

**Services**

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
ASSET - ASSET	189	\$34,041.00
	<u>189.00</u>	<u>\$34,041.00</u>

**Disbursements**

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Del. Services/Messengers	\$28.00
	<u>\$28.00</u>

**BREAKDOWN BY PERSON**

<u>Person</u>	<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
ML Michael Lamont	ASSET - ASSET	25	\$6,750.00
GM Gianluca Morello	ASSET - ASSET	24.6	\$7,749.00
MML Maya M. Lockwood	ASSET - ASSET	0.2	\$54.00
JWH Jeffrey W. Harris	ASSET - ASSET	130.3	\$18,242.00
JR Jeffrey Rizzo	ASSET - ASSET	8.9	\$1,246.00
		<u>189.00</u>	<u>\$34,041.00</u>