

EXHIBIT 18



ORRICK, HERRINGTON & SUTCLIFFE (EUROPE) LLP
107 CHEAPSIDE
LONDON EC2V 6DN
DX 557 LONDON/CITY
tel +44 (0) 20 7862 4600
fax +44 (0) 20 7862 4800
WWW.ORRICK.COM
REGULATED BY THE
SOLICITORS REGULATION AUTHORITY

INVOICE

Orrick Contact: Simon Cockshutt

Wland Guerra King
3000 Bayport Drive, Suite 600
Tampa, FL FL 33607
United States of America
Attn: Robert Jamieson

Date (TAX Point). November 24, 2011
VAT Registration No. GB 719 3598 96
Client Matter No. 26751.2001
Invoice No. 20031529

Dispute with Benjamin Linstead

FOR SERVICES RENDERED through November 30, 2011 in
connection with the matters described on the attached pages:

£ 16,813.00

DISBURSEMENTS as per attached pages:

1,081.38

TOTAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS:

£ 17,894.38

TOTAL INVOICE:

£ 17,894.38

(Outside the Scope of UK VAT, under Article 56 of EC Directive
2006/112/EC)

Due and Payable Upon Receipt
In order to ensure proper credit to your account,
please reference your **INVOICE** and **CLIENT** numbers on your remittance.

Electronic Funds Transfers:

HSBC Bank Plc, 60 Queen Victoria Street, London. EC4N 4TR

Sort Code: 40-05-30, BIC Code: MIDLGB22

IBAN Code: GB37MIDL40053004063856

Account Number: 04063856 Account Name: Orrick Herrington & Sutcliffe (Europe) LLP

Reference: 26751/ Invoice: 20031529

ORRICK, HERRINGTON & SUTCLIFFE (EUROPE) LLP IS A LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP REGISTERED IN ENGLAND AND WALES UNDER NUMBER OC347108 AND IS A
MULTINATIONAL PRACTICE OF REGISTERED FOREIGN LAWYERS AND ENGLISH SOLICITORS.

THE TERM PARTNER IS USED TO REFER TO A MEMBER OF ORRICK, HERRINGTON & SUTCLIFFE (EUROPE) LLP.

A LIST OF THE MEMBERS OF ORRICK, HERRINGTON & SUTCLIFFE (EUROPE) LLP AND THEIR PROFESSIONAL QUALIFICATIONS IS OPEN TO INSPECTION AT THE REGISTERED OFFICE SET OUT ABOVE.



Wland Guerra King - 26751
page 2

November 24, 2011
Invoice No. 20031529

For Legal Services Rendered Through November 30, 2011 in Connection With:

Matter: 2001 - Dispute with Benjamin Linstead

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME
Initial Work covered by Agreed Flat Fee of £4,000			
09/26/11	K. Twinem	Drafting letter before action.	1.00
09/26/11	K. Twinem	Reviewing client's proposed changes to draft letter before action.	0.15
09/27/11	K. Twinem	Email correspondence with client to discuss issues concerning Florida proceedings and any potential limitation issues affecting UK claim.	0.30
09/27/11	K. Twinem	Discuss S. Cockshutt.	0.40
09/27/11	S. Cockshutt	Discuss with K Twinem.	0.40
09/27/11	S. Cockshutt	Sign off on demand letter.	0.30
09/28/11	K. Twinem	Drafting engagement letter.	1.00
09/28/11	K. Twinem	Drafting conditional fee arrangement.	1.00
09/28/11	K. Twinem	Discuss S. Cockshutt.	0.20
09/28/11	S. Cockshutt	Review terms of fee proposal drafted by K Twinem.	0.30
09/28/11	S. Cockshutt	Discuss with K Twinem.	0.20
09/29/11	K. Twinem	Attendance on call with Michael Lamont of WGK.	0.60
09/29/11	K. Twinem	Drafting CFA for WGK.	1.20
09/29/11	K. Twinem	Drafting note accompanying CFA.	0.50
09/29/11	K. Twinem	Review of witness statement by Linstead in US proceedings.	1.10
09/29/11	K. Twinem	Further revisions to engagement letter.	0.20
09/29/11	K. Twinem	Discussions with S. Cockshutt.	0.30



Wiand Guerra King - 26751
page 3

November 24, 2011
Invoice No. 20031529

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME
09/29/11	S. Cockshutt	Telecon attorneys at Burton Wiand.	0.60
09/29/11	S. Cockshutt	Discuss with K Twinem.	0.30
09/29/11	S. Cockshutt	Review revised draft CFA and note on CFAs.	0.60
10/05/11	K. Twinem	Drafting M7 Claim Form in accordance with Cross Border Insolvency Regulations.	0.80
10/05/11	K. Twinem	Review of case law for common law position regarding judicial cooperation in relation to international insolvency proceedings.	1.30
10/05/11	K. Twinem	Research on UK law and case law regarding statute of limitations - the relevant time period where parties have been ordered to arbitrate claim in first instance.	1.35
10/06/11	K. Twinem	Review of investor file relating to Benjamin Linstead.	0.70
10/06/11	K. Twinem	Review of relevant terms of the Subscription agreement regarding the jurisdiction and applicable law.	0.40
10/06/11	K. Twinem	Review of Cross Border Insolvency Regulations to identify basis upon which they might apply re the Linstead matter.	2.15
Total Hours at agreed flat fee			17.35
Total For Services at agreed flat fee			£4,000.00

Additional work carried out on a time spent basis at agreed discounted rates

10/04/11	K. Twinem	Preparing claim form and first draft of particulars of claim.	1.90
10/05/11	K. Twinem	Preparing instructions to counsel and bundle for counsel to advise on UK proceedings.	1.60
10/05/11	K. Twinem	Review of and drafting detailed response on relevant basis for UK proceedings under section 423 of the Insolvency Act.	1.30



Wiand Guerra King - 26751
page 4

November 24, 2011
Invoice No. 20031529

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME
10/06/11	K. Twinem	Work relating to affidavit of Burton Wiand to submit in support of UK proceedings.	3.45
10/07/11	K. Twinem	Preparing draft application for recognition of Burton Wiand as Receiver.	3.90
10/07/11	K. Twinem	Attendance on call with counsel's clerk.	0.15
10/07/11	K. Twinem	Continuing with draft instructions to counsel.	1.80
10/07/11	K. Twinem	Discuss with S. Cockshutt.	0.20
10/07/11	S. Cockshutt	Discuss with K Twinem.	0.20
10/10/11	K. Twinem	Work on draft witness statement of Burton Wiand and accompanying exhibit bundle.	2.70
10/10/11	K. Twinem	Continuing drafting detailed instructions to counsel.	2.20
10/10/11	K. Twinem	Review of counsel's bundle.	0.50
10/11/11	K. Twinem	Discuss S. Cockshutt.	0.30
10/11/11	K. Twinem	Review of law relating to limitation issues and pre action protocol compliance.	0.90
10/11/11	K. Twinem	Preparing note to client.	0.70
10/11/11	K. Twinem	Preparing drafts of Form ML1 in accordance with cross border insolvency regulations to accompany action.	1.60
10/11/11	K. Twinem	Preparing section 423 claim to accompany application for recognition of the foreign receiver.	2.10
10/11/11	K. Twinem	Review of procedure involved in applying for recognition of foreign receiver.	0.50
10/11/11	K. Twinem	Preparing application for recognition of Burton Wiand as foreign receiver.	0.40
10/11/11	K. Twinem	Attendance on call with counsel to discuss claim and potential arbitration issue.	0.80



Wland Guerra King - 26751
page 5

November 24, 2011
Invoice No. 20031529

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME
10/11/11	S. Cockshutt	Review draft standstill agreement.	0.30
10/11/11	S. Cockshutt	Draft advice.	0.20
10/11/11	S. Cockshutt	Note to K Twinem.	0.20
10/11/11	S. Cockshutt	Discuss with K. Twinem Linstead response and time request and limitation issues arising.	0.30
10/12/11	S. Cockshutt	Review draft instructions to counsel and relevant material.	0.70
10/12/11	S. Cockshutt	Emails client team re standstill agreement.	0.30
10/13/11	S. Cockshutt	Finalise review of insolvency instructions and documents supplied.	1.20
10/13/11	S. Cockshutt	Letter to Linstead re standstill.	0.30
10/14/11	S. Cockshutt	Review counsel's email.	0.50
10/14/11	S. Cockshutt	Discuss with N Wagacha.	0.30
10/14/11	S. Cockshutt	Email counsel.	0.30
10/14/11	S. Cockshutt	Email clients re formal requirements.	0.50
10/17/11	K. Twinem	Attendance on call with counsel.	0.50
10/17/11	K. Twinem	Subsequent discussions with S. Cockshutt to discuss next steps.	0.20
10/17/11	K. Twinem	Telcon clients.	0.40
10/17/11	K. Twinem	Review of and incorporating counsel's amendments into draft affidavit.	3.10
10/17/11	K. Twinem	Review of and responding to email correspondence from client concerning arbitration and UK court application.	1.30
10/17/11	S. Cockshutt	Discussions with K Twinem.	0.20
10/17/11	S. Cockshutt	Telecon counsel.	0.50



Wland Guerra King - 26751
page 6

November 24, 2011
Invoice No. 20031529

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME
10/17/11	S. Cockshutt	Telecon Michael Lamont and Jared Perez.	0.40
10/17/11	S. Cockshutt	Emails re Standstill Agreement and the issuing of proceedings.	0.10
10/18/11	K. Twinem	Attendance on call with counsel to discuss client's strategy regarding arbitration as opposed to filing a claim in the UK courts.	0.45
10/18/11	K. Twinem	Drafting advice email to client to advise on potential risks involved if arbitration agreements rendered invalid and potential time limitation issues.	1.20
10/18/11	K. Twinem	Review of service rules applicable to the arbitration proceedings to ensure service effected on Linstead in accordance with the rules and advising client accordingly.	0.60
10/19/11	K. Twinem	Review of and incorporating changes to witness statement and exhibits bundle regarding service on Mr. Linstead.	0.90
10/19/11	K. Twinem	Review of and responding to emails from client regarding arbitration.	0.20
10/19/11	K. Twinem	Review of draft request/demand for arbitration.	0.75
10/19/11	K. Twinem	Responding to client's email regarding timing for service.	0.40
10/19/11	K. Twinem	Discuss S. Cockshutt.	0.10
10/19/11	K. Twinem	Assisting in arranging for service by hand on Mr. Linstead.	0.35
10/19/11	S. Cockshutt	Email from client re service of arbitration papers.	0.10
10/19/11	S. Cockshutt	Email acknowledgment.	0.10
10/19/11	S. Cockshutt	Review online JAMS rules re commencement of arbitration and service requirements.	0.30
10/19/11	S. Cockshutt	Instructions to K Twinem.	0.10



Wland Guerra King - 26751
page 7

November 24, 2011
Invoice No. 20031529

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME
10/19/11	S. Cockshutt	Discussion with K Twinem.	0.10
10/20/11	K. Twinem	Review of witness statement and subsequent affidavit regarding service on Mr. Linstead.	0.80
10/24/11	K. Twinem	Review of affidavit in support of service.	0.80
10/27/11	K. Twinem	Review of latest correspondence from Linstead.	0.30
10/27/11	K. Twinem	Providing client with update on current position.	2.00
10/27/11	K. Twinem	Drafting response to Linstead and incorporating proposed changes.	0.90
Total Hours on time spent basis			49.45
Total For Services on time spent basis			£12,813.00
Total Hours			66.80
Total For Services			£16,813.00



O R R I C K

Wiand Guerra King - 26751
page 8

November 24, 2011
Invoice No. 20031529

BILLING SUMMARY

Client: Wiand Guerra King
Matter: 2001 - Dispute with Benjamin Linstead

For Legal Services Rendered:

Fees:

Timekeeper Summary	Hours	Rate	Amount
---------------------------	--------------	-------------	---------------

Initial Work covered by Agreed Flat Fee

Simon Cockshutt	2.70	£495.00	1,336.50
Karie Twinem	14.65	£320.00	4,688.00

TOTAL £6,024.50 BUT FLAT FEE AGREED: 4,000.00

Additional Work carried out on a time spent basis at agreed discounted rates (25% discount)

Simon Cockshutt	7.20	£371.25	2,673.00
Karie Twinem	42.25	£240.00	10,140.00

TOTAL 12,813.00

Total All Timekeepers	66.80		£16,813.00
------------------------------	--------------	--	-------------------

Total Fees £16,813.00

Disbursements

Companies House Fees Non-Vatable	2.00		
Counsel Fee (Not Yet Paid 1,050.00)	1,050.00		
Courier Fees	17.38		
Land Registry Fee Non Vatable	12.00		£1,081.38

Total Disbursements £1,081.38

Total For This Matter £17,894.38