

EXHIBIT 15

James, Hoyer, Newcomer, &
Smiljanich, P.A.
4830 W. Kennedy Blvd.,
Suite 550
Tampa, FL 33609
Tax I.D.# 59-3479025

Invoice submitted to:
BURTON W WIAND
WIAND GUERRA KING, P.L.
3000 BAYPORT DRIVE SUITE 600
TAMPA, FL 33607

July 19, 2012
In Reference To: 2384

Invoice # 10522

CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION & OBJECTIONS

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/23/2012	BF	Review of pleadings associated with both Wells Fargo and receivership claims regarding Rite Aid property (1.9). Review of accompanying documents and receivership accounts of the property (2.2).	4.10 193.50/hr 793.35
1/24/2012	SPK	Reviewing Wells Fargo's objection to Receiver's Claims Determination	0.60 270.00/hr 162.00
1/31/2012	TAS	Luncheon conference with receiver.	0.70 350.00/hr 245.00
	JBC	Attended and participated in lunch meeting w/ clients B.Wiand and G.Morello, and T.Smiljanich and S.Keefe during which strategy was discussed for WELLS FARGO REAL ESTATE DISPUTE.	0.70 315.00/hr 220.50
2/2/2012	SPK	Reading Receiver's opposition to Wells Fargo's motion to compel abandonment of property	1.50 270.00/hr 405.00
2/3/2012	SPK	Reviewed Wells Fargo's reply to Wells Fargo's objection to claims determination (Rite-Aid)	0.70 270.00/hr 189.00
2/8/2012	JBC	Reviewed WF's motion re: filing of late claims and discussed same w/ team.	1.50 315.00/hr 472.50
2/9/2012	SPK	Researching caselaw on filing of late claims by secured creditors (Laurel Preserve)	5.60 270.00/hr 1,512.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/9/2012	SPK Reading Wells Fargo's Motion for Leave to file belated claim (Laurel Preserve)	1.20 270.00/hr	324.00
2/10/2012	SPK Researching case law on Fed Rule 60(b) (motion by Wells Fargo for filing belated claim on Laurel Preserve)	1.20 270.00/hr	324.00
	SPK Reviewing Receiver's Reply (doc 712) to Wells Fargo's objection to claims determination and exhibits/Morello declaration	2.80 270.00/hr	756.00
	SPK Drafting Receiver's reply to Wells Fargo's Motion to file belated claim on Laurel Preserve	1.10 270.00/hr	297.00
	JBC Conference call w/ S.Keefe & G.Morello re: WF's Mot. for Determination that Filing of Proofs of Claim Is Not Necessary (0.8). Re-read WF's Mot. for Determination that Filing of Proofs of Claim Is Not Necessary (1.5). Discussed documentation supporting arguments against WF's Mot. for Determination that Filing of Proofs of Claim Is Not Necessary w/ S.Keefe (0.7). Reviewed Receiver's Reply to TRSTE and WF's Objection and Opposition to Claims Motion (1.5). Reviewed docket entries 712, 714 and 728 in SEC Receivership Action in connection w/ reviewing WF's Mot. for Determination that Filing of Proofs of Claim Is Not Necessary (1.0).	5.50 315.00/hr	1,732.50
2/13/2012	SPK Drafting Receiver's response to Wells Fargo's Motion for Court to determine it doesn't need to file a claim/allow belated claim under FRCP 60(b) (Laurel Preserve)	7.40 270.00/hr	1,998.00
	JBC Reviewed various pleadings, filings and supporting exhibits re: WF's alleged interest in Receivership properties and summarized same in database (6.5). Reviewed WF's memo on jurisdiction in response to court's order (1.0).	7.50 315.00/hr	2,362.50
	SPK Phone conversation with Burt Wiand (.1) and Joe Shaheen (.1) discussing Receiver's Motion to Appoint Appraisers	0.20 270.00/hr	54.00
2/14/2012	SPK Reading and discussing with Jonathon Cohen Wells Fargo's brief regarding jurisdiction over the Laurel Preserve Property	1.10 270.00/hr	297.00
2/15/2012	SPK Drafting Receiver's response to Wells Fargo's motion for belated claim (Laurel Preserve)	4.10 270.00/hr	1,107.00
	SPK Preparing database	0.70 270.00/hr	189.00
	MD Researching and reading cases on concurrent jurisdiction and the test for whom is given priority jurisdiction.	1.60 193.50/hr	309.60
2/16/2012	TAS Review issues for March 2 hearing on all claim objections.	1.20 350.00/hr	420.00
2/17/2012	JBC Continued summarizing Wells Fargo litigation issues and supporting evidence (6.5).	6.50 315.00/hr	2,047.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/19/2012	JBC Continued summarizing Wells Fargo litigation issues and supporting evidence.	3.00 315.00/hr	945.00
2/21/2012	JBC Reviewed documents and materials supporting claims against Wells Fargo and summarized knowledge extracted from same. (8.5) Reviewed draft response to Wells Fargo's claims motion and discussed w/ S.Keefe and T.Smiljanich (0.5)	9.00 315.00/hr	2,835.00
	SPK Discussions with Morello concerning opposition brief to Wells Fargo's motion for related claims (.4) and Burt Wiand concerning motion to appoint appraisers (.1)	0.50 270.00/hr	135.00
	SPK Redrafting Receiver's Opposition to Wells Fargo's Motion for belated claims (Laurel Preserve)	8.30 270.00/hr	2,241.00
	TAS Conferences with staff re: memoranda due this week (1.0). Review case law re: secured claims (.4).	1.40 350.00/hr	490.00
2/22/2012	SPK Discussion with Morello concerning opposition brief to Wells Fargo's motion for related claims	0.50 270.00/hr	135.00
	JBC Conference call w/ S.Keefe and client re: Receiver's Objection to Wells Fargo's claims motion. (0.5) Legal research and drafting re: Receiver's Objection to Wells Fargo's claims motion (3.5) Reviewed documents and materials supporting claims against Wells Fargo and summarized knowledge extracted from same. (5)	9.00 315.00/hr	2,835.00
	SPK Drafting Opposition brief to WF's motion regarding Laurel Preserve claim (5.1)/researching if secured creditors must file claims in bankruptcy (2.6)	7.70 270.00/hr	2,079.00
2/23/2012	MD Reviewing jurisdiction memo on Laurel Mountain Property, then discussing it with Jonathan Cohen.	0.90 193.50/hr	174.15
	SPK Finalizing and filing Receiver's opposition to Wells Fargo's Motion to File Claim on Laurel Preserve	10.40 270.00/hr	2,808.00
	JBC Researched and drafted Opposition to WF's determination of late claims (8.5); drafted Declaration and prepped exhibits in support of same (3.0). Reviewed Jurisdictional brief; coordinated filing of all three (1.0).	12.50 315.00/hr	3,937.50
	TAS Review draft of memorandum on jurisdiction (.6). Review draft of memorandum on claims process (.8).	1.40 350.00/hr	490.00
2/24/2012	MD Preparing a Notice of Limited Appearance and then emailing it to Jan Brown for her to file.	0.20 193.50/hr	38.70
	TAS Telephone conference with Wells Fargo attorney (.2). Telephone conference with Cohen re: drafting of memoranda (.2).	0.40 350.00/hr	140.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
2/24/2012	JBC	Continued drafting case narrative and summarizing/extracting knowledge from documents, articles, etc. (3.5) Re-read jurisdictional brief (1.0)	4.50 315.00/hr	1,417.50
2/27/2012	JBC	Call w/ S.Keefe & G.Morello re: tomorrow's meeting and WF's interest in additional briefing on late claims. (0.7). Reviewed correspondence w/ WF re: additional briefing on late claims (0.5) Reviewed Objection to WF's late claims brief and Receiver's jurisdictional brief (2.5) Reviewed WF claim form for Rite Aid property (0.3) Updated case summary with additional knowledge re mortgage loans and status of each for disputed properties (3.0)	7.00 315.00/hr	2,205.00
	SPK	Sending email to Steven Wirth regarding Wells Fargo's reply brief (Laurel Preserve)	0.10 270.00/hr	27.00
	TAS	Review memoranda and cases, and prepare for claims hearing.	4.00 350.00/hr	1,400.00
2/28/2012	TAS	Prepare for and attend meeting with Receiver counsel re: hearing and arguments for claims determination.	3.50 350.00/hr	1,225.00
	JBC	Meeting w/ client re: Friday hearing on jurisdiction and late claims. Reviewed filings in preparation for same. (2.7)	2.70 315.00/hr	850.50
2/29/2012	JBC	Reviewed WF's motion for continuation of hearing and motion to disqualify receiver. Drafted opposition to motion for continuation. (4.0)	4.00 315.00/hr	1,260.00
	TAS	Review pending motions and prepare for hearing.	7.50 350.00/hr	2,625.00
3/1/2012	MD	Reviewing case documents and summaries.	1.50 193.50/hr	290.25
3/2/2012	MD	Research case law (2.0). Review Kirkland docket and pleadings (1.5).	3.50 193.50/hr	677.25
	MD	Attending hearing with Judge Lazzara re: jurisdiction issue and motion for continuance and disqualification	1.40 193.50/hr	270.90
	JBC	Prepared for hearing (1.0). Attend hearing re; jurisdiction, continuance, claims determination and appointment of appraisers (1.2).	2.50 315.00/hr	787.50
		For professional services rendered	164.90	\$48,536.70

James, Hoyer, Newcomer, &
Smiljanich, P.A.
4830 W. Kennedy Blvd.,
Suite 550
Tampa, FL 33609
Tax I.D.# 59-3479025

Invoice submitted to:
BURTON W WIAND
WIAND GUERRA KING, P.L.
3000 BAYPORT DRIVE SUITE 600
TAMPA, FL 33607

July 19, 2012
In Reference To: 2384

Invoice # 10522

CASE ADMINISTRATION

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/28/2012	JBC Conference calls w/ opposing counsel and client re: WF's motion to stay Friday's hearing and motion to remove Wiand as Receiver; discussed same w/ team (0.5). Reviewed filing by LandMark Bank of Florida re: intent to reply on briefs (0.2).	0.70 315.00/hr	220.50
2/29/2012	JBC Reviewed WF's Reply to Opposition re: Late Claims (0.5). Discussed WF's intention to remove Wiand as Receiver w/ team (0.4).	0.90 315.00/hr	283.50
3/1/2012	MD Research caselaw on "good cause" for a continuance within the 11th Circuit in general and then from the M.D. of Fla. on Local Rule 3.09.	2.00 193.50/hr	387.00
	TAS Review motion to continue and motion to disqualify Receiver (.3). Review referenced file material re: motion to disqualify (.4). Conference with Cohen re: response to motions (.2). Telephone conference with Morello re: filing of responses to motions to continue and disqualify (.2). Review various draft responses to motion to continue (.4). Prepare for hearing on issues (2.7).	4.20 350.00/hr	1,470.00
	JBC Reviewed, edited & coordinated filing of Receiver's Opposition to Mot. for Continuance (1.0). Discussed same w/ team and client (.3). Reviewed WF's motion to disqualify receiver (.7). Reviewed Govt's Application for Order Vacating Preliminary Order of Forfeiture (.3). Prepared Notice of Filing re same (.2). Reviewed briefs and case law in preparation for March 2 hearing re: jurisdiction, continuance, claims determination and appointment of appraisers (7.5).	10.00 315.00/hr	3,150.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/1/2012	MD	1.00 193.50/hr	193.50
	TAS	4.00 350.00/hr	1,400.00
3/2/2012	MD	0.50 193.50/hr	96.75
	TAS	3.30 350.00/hr	1,155.00
	MD	0.90 193.50/hr	174.15
3/5/2012	MD	0.30 193.50/hr	58.05
	MD	0.20 193.50/hr	38.70
	MD	3.20 193.50/hr	619.20
	MD	0.30 193.50/hr	58.05
	MD	0.30 193.50/hr	58.05
	TAS	4.00 350.00/hr	1,400.00
	MD	3.40 193.50/hr	657.90
3/6/2012	MD	1.10 193.50/hr	212.85
	MD	2.50 193.50/hr	483.75
	TAS	1.50 350.00/hr	525.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/6/2012	MD	2.50 193.50/hr	483.75
	MD	0.90 193.50/hr	174.15
3/7/2012	MD	0.90 193.50/hr	174.15
	MD	5.20 193.50/hr	1,006.20
	TAS	1.00 350.00/hr	350.00
	JBC	8.70 315.00/hr	2,740.50
3/8/2012	TAS	0.40 350.00/hr	140.00
	MD	6.90 193.50/hr	1,335.15
3/9/2012	JBC	7.50 315.00/hr	2,362.50
3/12/2012	MD	1.20 193.50/hr	232.20
	MD	1.30 193.50/hr	251.55
	MD	3.60 193.50/hr	696.60
	MD	0.90 193.50/hr	174.15
	MD	0.20 193.50/hr	38.70

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
3/12/2012	TAS	Review research on disqualification (.4). Review and edit draft of opposition brief (.9). Conference with Megan Davis re: brief (.2).	1.50 350.00/hr	525.00
	SPK	Reviewing our Opposition to the Motion to Disqualify Receiver	0.40 270.00/hr	108.00
3/13/2012	TAS	Conference with Jonathan Cohen re: appraisers and opposition brief (.6). Review correspondence re: WGK brief (.2).	0.80 350.00/hr	280.00
	MD	Review and revise motion in opposition to WF's motion to disqualify the receiver.	0.20 193.50/hr	38.70
	MD	Discuss the facts of WGK's relationship with WF and WFA with Jonathan Cohen (.2), and revise motion in opposition to WF's motion to disqualify the receiver (2.2).	2.40 193.50/hr	464.40
	TAS	Review and revise opposition brief on disqualification (1.0).	1.00 350.00/hr	350.00
	JBC	Edit of Wiand Declaration in Support of Opposition to Motion to Disqualify and Opposition Brief (7.6). Team meeting re: same (1.0).	8.60 315.00/hr	2,709.00
3/14/2012	MD	Review and edit our draft in opposition to WF's motion to disqualify the receiver.	2.10 193.50/hr	406.35
	MD	Review and revise WGK's response in opposition to WF's motion to disqualify WGK.	2.60 193.50/hr	503.10
	MD	Edit our response and WGK's response to WF's Motion.	1.00 193.50/hr	193.50
	MD	Review Burton Wiand's declaration to be filed with our response in opposition to WF's motion to disqualify the receiver.	0.40 193.50/hr	77.40
	MD	Edit response to WF's motion to disqualify Receiver.	0.80 193.50/hr	154.80
	JBC	Further drafting and editing of Wiand Declaration in Support of Opposition to Motion to Disqualify and Opposition Brief (7.0). Conference calls w/ client re: same (.5). Conference call w/ SEC re: Opposition to Motion to Disqualify (.3). Reviewed WGK's Opposition Brief (1.7). Reviewed Notice of Removal in fraud case (1.0).	10.50 315.00/hr	3,307.50
	TAS	Review WGK brief on disqualification (.7). Conference with staff re: responses (.2). Review final draft of opposition brief (.7).	1.60 350.00/hr	560.00
3/15/2012	JBC	Reviewed and edited Opposition to WF's motion for leave to file reply brief (7.2). Corresponded w/ opposing counsel re: filing (.3). Corresponded w/ G. Morello re: Opposition to WF's request for judicial notice (.2). Reviewed response to request for judicial notice (.5). Reviewed SEC's amended Opposition to WF's motion for leave to file reply brief (.3).	8.50 315.00/hr	2,677.50

BURTON W WIAND

Page 5

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/15/2012 MD	Reviewing the Receiver's and WGK's response in opposition to WF's motion for leave to file a reply in support of its motion to disqualify.	0.40 193.50/hr	77.40
3/16/2012 MD	Review response to WF's motion to file a reply.	0.50 193.50/hr	96.75
TAS	Review new filings on motion for leave to file a reply by Wells Fargo to motion to disqualify, oppositions of Receiver and S.E.C., and order denying motion (.6). Review and file response to request for judicial notice (.2).	0.80 350.00/hr	280.00
	For professional services rendered	<u>129.60</u>	<u>\$35,610.95</u>

James, Hoyer, Newcomer, &
Smiljanich, P.A.
4830 W. Kennedy Blvd.,
Suite 550
Tampa, FL 33609
Tax I.D.# 59-3479025

Invoice submitted to:
BURTON W WIAND
WIAND GUERRA KING, P.L.
3000 BAYPORT DRIVE SUITE 600
TAMPA, FL 33607

July 19, 2012
In Reference To: 2384

Invoice # 10522

ASSET ANALYSIS & RECOVERY

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/20/2012	TAS Telephone conferences with co-counsel and staff re: asset recoveries.	0.40 350.00/hr	140.00
1/23/2012	TAS Research receivership issues (5.1). Review Rite-Aid pleadings (1.2). Telephone conference with Burt Wiand re: Rite-Aid issues (0.2).	6.50 350.00/hr	2,275.00
	SPK Reviewing spreadsheets/documents provided by Bill Price	1.20 270.00/hr	324.00
	SPK Conference with Cohen and Smiljanich (0.8)	0.80 270.00/hr	216.00
	JBC Conference with Keefe and Smiljanich (0.8)	0.80 315.00/hr	252.00
1/30/2012	TAS Review Rite-Aid materials.	1.00 350.00/hr	350.00
1/31/2012	SPK Rite-Aid Property litigation research.	0.70 270.00/hr	189.00
2/3/2012	SPK Phone Call with Jim Felman regarding Neil Moody and the Wachovia properties	0.10 270.00/hr	27.00
	SPK Phone conversation with Andrew Martin regarding bank accounts/Wachovia's involvement with investments/Wachovia's loans issued to Nadel	0.80 270.00/hr	216.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/3/2012	SPK	0.70 270.00/hr	189.00
	SPK	0.80 270.00/hr	216.00
2/4/2012	SPK	1.30 270.00/hr	351.00
2/6/2012	SPK	0.60 270.00/hr	162.00
	For professional services rendered	<u>15.70</u>	<u>\$4,907.00</u>

James, Hoyer, Newcomer, &
Smiljanich, P.A.
4830 W. Kennedy Blvd.,
Suite 550
Tampa, FL 33609
Tax I.D.# 59-3479025

Invoice submitted to:
BURTON W WIAND
WIAND GUERRA KING, P.L.
3000 BAYPORT DRIVE SUITE 600
TAMPA, FL 33607

July 19, 2012
In Reference To: 2384

Invoice # 10522

ASSET DISPOSITION

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/22/2012	SPK Reviewing Receiver's Motion to Sell Rite-Aid Property/Wells Fargo's Objection/Wells Fargo's Motion to compel Receivership to abandon Rite-Aid property (1.8). Research issues (1.0).	2.80 270.00/hr	756.00
	SPK Prepared Memo analyzing Receiver's Motion to Sell Rite-Aid Property/Wells Fargo's Objection/Wells Fargo's Motion to compel Receivership to abandon Rite-Aid property	1.50 270.00/hr	405.00
1/23/2012	SPK Reviewing Wachovia investment information provided by Michael Lamont and comparing it to Wells Fargo's motion in support of their Rite Aid claim	2.40 270.00/hr	648.00
1/25/2012	SPK Reviewing cases cited by Wells Fargo in their motion to compel abandonment of Rite-Aid property	0.80 270.00/hr	216.00
1/27/2012	SPK Researching Wells Fargo's motion to compel abandonment of property	0.50 270.00/hr	135.00
2/2/2012	JBC Conference call w/ G.Morello to discuss jurisdictional dispute over Laurel Preserve Property (0.3). Reviewed property payment records and loan details provided by J.Rizzo (1.0).	1.30 315.00/hr	409.50
2/3/2012	JBC Conference call w/ G.Morello to discuss jurisdictional dispute over Laurel Preserve Property, availability of local counsel in S.D. of NY and need for notice of appearance re: Wells Fargo disputes (0.3). Drafted notice of appearance (0.2). Revised per comments from G.Morello (0.1). Conferred w/ C.Casper re: contacts in SDNY for local counsel (0.2). Reviewed property payment records and loan details	7.50 315.00/hr	2,362.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	provided by J.Rizzo for all Wachovia loans (6.1). Drafted email to R.Jordan detailing three schedules of fraudulent transfers needed (0.2). Reviewed Order setting hearing on Laurel Preserve jurisdiction issue (0.2). Conferred w/ T.Smiljanich re: coverage of March 2 hearing re: Laurel Preserve jurisdiction (0.2).		
2/3/2012	SPK Reading Judge Lazzara's Orders on sale of Rite-Aid property and scheduling hearing on jurisdiction over Laurel Preserve	0.20 270.00/hr	54.00
2/5/2012	JBC Printed and reviewed docs provided by Receivership re: Wells Fargo's challenge to the Middle District's jurisdiction over the Laurel Preserve Property and request for ancillary hearing re: this Property in SDNY criminal case against Nadel.	3.50 315.00/hr	1,102.50
2/6/2012	SPK Phone conference and follow-up meeting with Receivership and SEC to discuss Laurel Preserve forfeiture proceeding and motion to disqualify	0.70 270.00/hr	189.00
	SPK Phone conference with Receivership and DOJ discussing Laurel Preserve forfeiture proceeding in SDNY	0.30 270.00/hr	81.00
	TAS Telephone conference with receiver and S.E.C.	0.30 350.00/hr	105.00
2/8/2012	SPK Reviewing/ Filing Motion to Appoint Appraisers for Rite-Aid property	0.40 270.00/hr	108.00
2/10/2012	SPK Phone conference with Wells Fargo's counsel (Joseph Shaheen) regarding their position on Receiver's Motion to Appoint Appraisers	0.20 270.00/hr	54.00
2/14/2012	SPK Phone conversation with Burt Wiand (.1) and Joe Shaheen (.1) discussing Receiver's Motion to Appoint Appraisers	0.20 270.00/hr	54.00
	SPK Drafting Receiver's Reply to Wells Fargo's Motion for Determination that it didn't need to file claims (Laurel Preserve)	3.70 270.00/hr	999.00
	JBC Discussed WF's position on Receiver's Motion to Appoint Appraisers w/ S.Keefe (0.5). Reviewed WF's Memo on Jurisdiction re: Laurel Preserve. Discussed same w/ S.Keefe & T.Smiljanich. (3.5). Reviewed, summarized & organized docs and facts for each real property at issue w/ WF (3.5).	7.50 315.00/hr	2,362.50
2/15/2012	SPK Discussion with Jonathan Cohen (.2) and Wells Fargo counsel Steve Wirth (.1) about Wells Fargo disclosing the extent of contact between the bank and its proposed appraisers for the Rite-Aid property	0.30 270.00/hr	81.00
	SPK Reviewing Wells Fargo's counter-submission of compliance with 3.01(g) (Rite Aid Property)	0.20 270.00/hr	54.00
	SPK Phone conference with Morello regarding jurisdiction over Laurel Preserve	0.80 270.00/hr	216.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/15/2012	MD	0.80 193.50/hr	154.80
	MD	0.20 193.50/hr	38.70
	MD	0.70 193.50/hr	135.45
	MD	2.70 193.50/hr	522.45
	JBC	9.00 315.00/hr	2,835.00
	TAS	3.20 350.00/hr	1,120.00
2/16/2012	MD	3.00 193.50/hr	580.50
	MD	3.90 193.50/hr	754.65
	SPK	2.70 270.00/hr	729.00
	JBC	5.00 315.00/hr	1,575.00
2/17/2012	MD	3.40 193.50/hr	657.90
2/20/2012	MD	0.20 193.50/hr	38.70

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/20/2012	MD	1.00 193.50/hr	193.50
	JBC	8.00 315.00/hr	2,520.00
	JBC	3.00 315.00/hr	945.00
2/21/2012	JJL	1.70 140.00/hr	238.00
2/22/2012	JJL	7.30 140.00/hr	1,022.00
	SPK	0.80 270.00/hr	216.00
2/23/2012	JJL	3.50 140.00/hr	490.00
	JLB	3.10 140.00/hr	434.00
2/24/2012	JJL	2.20 140.00/hr	308.00
	SPK	0.30 270.00/hr	81.00
	JBC	6.00 315.00/hr	1,890.00
2/27/2012	JJL	0.70 140.00/hr	98.00
3/19/2012	JBC	0.30 315.00/hr	94.50
For professional services rendered		107.80	\$28,064.15

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Total for professional services rendered	418.00	\$117,118.80
Additional Charges :		
		<u>Amount</u>
1/31/2012 Dinner with Burt Wiand (client) and co counsel on 1/31/12		110.99
3/7/2012 Parking on 3/2/12 for hearing		4.00
Total costs		<u>\$114.99</u>
Total amount of this bill		<u>\$117,233.79</u>
Balance due		<u><u>\$117,233.79</u></u>

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
BROWN, JAN	3.10	140.00	\$434.00
COHEN, JONATHAN	183.20	315.00	\$57,708.00
DAVIS, MEGAN	74.70	193.50	\$14,454.45
FRANZONI, BRENDAN	4.10	193.50	\$793.35
KEEFE, SEAN P	81.90	270.00	\$22,113.00
LEUSNER, JIM J	15.40	140.00	\$2,156.00
SMILJANICH, TERRY A.	55.60	350.00	\$19,460.00