

EXHIBIT 22



ORRICK, HERRINGTON & SUTCLIFFE (EUROPE) LLP
107 CHEAPSIDE
LONDON EC2V 6DN
DX 557 LONDON/CITY

tel +44 (0) 20 7862 4600
fax +44 (0) 20 7862 4800

WWW.ORRICK.COM

REGULATED BY THE
SOLICITORS REGULATION AUTHORITY

INVOICE

Orrick Contact: Simon Cockshutt

Wiand Guerra King
3000 Bayport Drive, Suite 600
Tampa, FL FL 33607
United States of America
Attn: Robert Jamieson

Date (TAX Point).	March 13, 2012
VAT Registration No.	GB 719 3598 96
Client Matter No.	26751.2001
Invoice No.	20032528

Dispute with Benjamin Linstead

FOR SERVICES RENDERED through February 29, 2012 in
connection with the matters described on the attached pages:

£ 6,493.13

DISBURSEMENTS as per attached pages:

2.00

TOTAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS:

£ 6,495.13

TOTAL INVOICE:

£ 6,495.13

(Outside the Scope of UK VAT, under Article 56 of EC Directive
2006/112/EC)

Due and Payable Upon Receipt

In order to ensure proper credit to your account,
please reference your **INVOICE** and **CLIENT** numbers on your remittance.

Electronic Funds Transfers:

HSBC Bank Plc, 60 Queen Victoria Street, London. EC4N 4TR

Sort Code: 40-05-30, BIC Code: MIDLGB22

IBAN Code: GB37MIDL40053004063856

Account Number: 04063856 Account Name: Orrick Herrington & Sutcliffe (Europe) LLP

Reference: 26751/ Invoice: 20032528



ORRICK

Wiand Guerra King - 26751
page 2

March 13, 2012
Invoice No. 20032528

For Legal Services Rendered Through February 29, 2012 in Connection With:

Matter: 2001 - Dispute with Benjamin Linstead

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME
01/24/12	K. Twinem	Review of Linstead's UK lawyer's proposed UK proceedings.	1.00
01/24/12	K. Twinem	Research into alternatives to Tomlin order.	2.00
01/24/12	K. Twinem	Discussion with S. Cockshutt on possibility of consent judgment as opposed to Tomlin order.	0.20
01/24/12	K. Twinem	Drafting detailed note to client on process involved in both options : consent judgment and Tomlin order.	1.90
01/24/12	S. Cockshutt	Review email from M Lamont re Tomlin procedure.	0.10
01/24/12	S. Cockshutt	Note to K. Twinem.	0.30
01/24/12	S. Cockshutt	Discuss alternatives with K Twinem.	0.20
02/06/12	K. Twinem	Review correspondence with Receiver.	0.20
02/06/12	K. Twinem	Advising Receiver on structure of proposed settlement.	0.70
02/06/12	K. Twinem	Preparing settlement documentation.	1.00
02/06/12	K. Twinem	Discuss with S. Cockshutt.	0.20
02/06/12	K. Twinem	Preparing draft Part 8 claim form.	0.30
02/06/12	K. Twinem	Reviewing terms of proposed settlement.	0.40
02/06/12	S. Cockshutt	Review client instructions following settlement.	0.10
02/06/12	S. Cockshutt	Discuss with K. Twinem.	0.20
02/08/12	K. Twinem	Preparing draft claim form and consent judgment for purposes of settlement agreement.	2.70
02/08/12	K. Twinem	Discussion with S. Cockshutt on proposed structure of settlement.	0.40
02/08/12	K. Twinem	Review of and responding to email correspondence with Michael Lamont on structure of settlement.	0.20



ORRICK

Wland Guerra King - 26751
page 3

March 13, 2012
Invoice No. 20032528

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME
02/08/12	S. Cockshutt	Discuss with K. Twinem draft court documents for attachment to draft settlement agreement.	0.40
02/09/12	K. Twinem	Review of the proposed settlement agreement and incorporating proposed changes.	1.60
02/16/12	K. Twinem	Review of latest email correspondence and instructions from Michael Lamont.	0.50
02/16/12	K. Twinem	Responding to email from Michael Lamont on the three potential scenarios to be addressed by the consent judgment options.	1.10
02/16/12	K. Twinem	Incorporating further changes into the settlement agreement and accompanying draft Consent Judgment and schedules to take into account further proposed revisions.	1.40
02/16/12	K. Twinem	Drafting additional Consent Judgment to take into account scenario where Mr. Linstead pays two installments but defaults on payment of the third schedule	0.80
02/16/12	K. Twinem	Discuss with S. Cockshutt.	0.30
02/16/12	S. Cockshutt	Review final draft settlement agreement.	0.40
02/16/12	S. Cockshutt	Discuss with K. Twinem.	0.30
02/17/12	K. Twinem	Review of proposed settlement agreement and providing comment.	1.20
02/17/12	K. Twinem	Incorporating further revisions into the draft consent judgment in light of recent amendments to the settlement terms.	1.30
02/29/12	K. Twinem	Review of proposed changes to the settlement agreement from Linsteads lawyers.	1.00
02/29/12	K. Twinem	Discuss with S. Cockshutt.	0.20
02/29/12	S. Cockshutt	Discuss current position with K. Twinem.	0.20



ORRICK

Wiand Guerra King - 26751
page 4

March 13, 2012
Invoice No. 20032528

02/29/12	S. Cockshutt	Discuss client new billing requirements.	0.10
		Total Hours	22.90
		Total For Services	£6,493.13



ORRICK

Wiand Guerra King - 26751
page 5

March 13, 2012
Invoice No. 20032528

BILLING SUMMARY

Client: Wiand Guerra King
Matter: 2001 - Dispute with Benjamin Linstead

For Legal Services Rendered:

Fees:

Timekeeper Summary	Hours	Rate	Amount
Simon Cockshutt	2.30	£371.25	853.88
Karie Twinem	20.60	£273.75	5,639.25
Total All Timekeepers	22.90		£6,493.13

Total Fees £6,493.13

Disbursements

Companies House Fees Non-Vatable

2.00

Total Disbursements £2.00

Total For This Matter £6,495.13