

EXHIBIT 25



ORRICK, HERRINGTON & SUTCLIFFE (EUROPE) LLP
107 CHEAPSIDE
LONDON EC2V 6DN
DX 557 LONDON/CITY
tel +44 (0) 20 7862 4600
fax +44 (0) 20 7862 4800
WWW.ORRICK.COM
REGULATED BY THE
SOLICITORS REGULATION AUTHORITY

INVOICE

Orrick Contact: Simon Cockshutt

Wiand Guerra King
3000 Bayport Drive, Suite 600
Tampa, FL FL 33607
United States of America
Attn: Robert Jamieson

Date (TAX Point). June 15, 2012
VAT Registration No. GB 719 3598 96
Client Matter No. 26751.2001
Invoice No. 20033967

Dispute with Benjamin Linstead

FOR SERVICES RENDERED through June 15, 2012 in connection with the matters described on the attached pages:

£ 4,610.63

TOTAL FEES & DISBURSEMENTS:

£ 4,610.63

SUBTOTAL:

£ 4,610.63

Agreed Success Fee on all discounted billed fees (50% uplift on discounted hourly rates / 112.5% uplift on normal hourly rates) incurred by our invoices: 20031529 dated 24 November 2011; 20032528 dated 13 March 2012; and 20033967, being this current invoice.

£ 11,958.39

TOTAL INVOICE:

£ 16,569.02

TRUST AVAILABLE: £32.44
TRUST AMOUNT TO BE APPLIED:
REMAINING TRUST BALANCE: £0

(32.44)

ADJUSTED BALANCE DUE (Pay this amount):

£ 16,536.58

(Outside the Scope of UK VAT, under Article 56 of EC Directive 2006/112/EC)

Due and Payable Upon Receipt
In order to ensure proper credit to your account,
please reference your **INVOICE** and **CLIENT** numbers on your remittance.

Electronic Funds Transfers:

HSBC Bank Plc, 60 Queen Victoria Street, London, EC4N 4TR
Sort Code: 40-05-30, BIC Code: MIDLGB22
IBAN Code: GB37MIDL40053004063856

Account Number: 04063856 Account Name: Orrick Herrington & Sutcliffe (Europe) LLP

Reference: 26751/ Invoice: 20033967

ORRICK, HERRINGTON & SUTCLIFFE (EUROPE) LLP IS A LIMITED LIABILITY PARTNERSHIP REGISTERED IN ENGLAND AND WALES UNDER NUMBER OC347108 AND IS A MULTINATIONAL PRACTICE OF REGISTERED FOREIGN LAWYERS AND ENGLISH SOLICITORS.

THE TERM PARTNER IS USED TO REFER TO A MEMBER OF ORRICK, HERRINGTON & SUTCLIFFE (EUROPE) LLP.

A LIST OF THE MEMBERS OF ORRICK, HERRINGTON & SUTCLIFFE (EUROPE) LLP AND THEIR PROFESSIONAL QUALIFICATIONS IS OPEN TO INSPECTION AT THE REGISTERED OFFICE SET OUT ABOVE.



Wland Guerra King - 26751
page 2

June 15, 2012
Invoice No. 20033967

For Legal Services Rendered Through June 15, 2012 in Connection With:

Matter: 2001 - Dispute with Benjamin Linstead

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME
05/03/12	K. Twinem	Research relating to the steps and costs involved in applying for the enforcement of a Consent Order (as opposed to a consent judgment as originally proposed).	1.20
05/03/12	K. Twinem	Review of and responding to proposed change to the structure of the settlement agreement.	0.60
05/04/12	K. Twinem	Review of relevant sections in the CPR concerning consent judgments and consent orders.	0.80
05/04/12	K. Twinem	Providing summary of the relevant CPR provisions to client.	0.40
05/04/12	K. Twinem	Review of the settlement agreement and accompanying documentation to incorporate changes to the settlement structure and the change to a Consent Order as requested for confidentiality reasons by Mr. Linstead's UK lawyers.	1.20
05/04/12	K. Twinem	Email correspondence with Michael Lamont of WGK.	0.30
05/04/12	K. Twinem	Discuss with S. Cockshutt.	0.30
05/04/12	K. Twinem	Attendance on call with Michael Lamont of WGK to discuss Consent Order option and the steps required to enforce a consent order in the event of default.	0.30
05/04/12	K. Twinem	Attendance on call with Mr. Linstead's UK lawyer to discuss changes to settlement agreement and structure.	0.60
05/04/12	S. Cockshutt	Discuss with K Twinem.	0.30
05/09/12	K. Twinem	Email correspondence relating to finalising settlement agreement.	0.60
05/11/12	K. Twinem	Attendance on call with B Linstead.	0.60
05/11/12	K. Twinem	Review of legal requirements and steps required to enforce a consent order.	0.80



Wiand Guerra King - 26751
page 3

June 15, 2012
Invoice No. 20033967

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME
05/11/12	K. Twinem	Advising Michael Lamont of WGK regarding legal requirements surrounding consent orders.	0.70
05/11/12	K. Twinem	Review of and responding to email correspondence from B. Linstead and Michael Lamont of WGK explaining earlier discussions with B. Linstead's UK lawyer.	1.10
05/24/12	K. Twinem	Attendance on call with B. Linstead.	0.40
05/24/12	K. Twinem	Review and responding to email correspondence with Ben Linstead.	0.70
05/24/12	K. Twinem	Reviewing and revising the settlement agreement to reflect the terms most recently agreed by the parties.	2.10
05/25/12	K. Twinem	Discussing revised form of order with S. Cockshutt.	0.10
05/25/12	K. Twinem	Attendance on call with Benjamin Linstead and his lawyer to discuss finalising the settlement agreement.	0.90
05/25/12	K. Twinem	Providing further explanation in subsequent email correspondence on the differences between consent orders and tomlin orders.	1.00
05/25/12	S. Cockshutt	Discuss requested revised form of order with K Twinem.	0.10
05/31/12	K. Twinem	Review of and responding to email correspondence between client and with Benjamin Linstead to finalise the settlement agreement.	1.20
06/06/12	K. Twinem	Responding to email correspondence with Benjamin Linstead and arranging for transfer of funds.	0.40
		Total Hours	16.70
		Total For Services	£4,610.63



Wland Guerra King - 26751
page 4

June 15, 2012
Invoice No. 20033967

BILLING SUMMARY

Client: Wland Guerra King
Matter: 2001 - Dispute with Benjamin Linstead

For Legal Services Rendered:

Fees:

<u>Timekeeper Summary</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Simon Cockshutt	0.40	£371.25	148.50
Karie Twinem	16.30	£273.75	4,462.13
Total All Timekeepers	16.70		£4,610.63

Total Fees £4,610.63

Success Fee:

Agreed Success Fee on all discounted billed fees (50% uplift on discounted hourly rates / 112.5% uplift on normal hourly rates) incurred by our invoices: 20031529 dated 24 November 2011; 20032528 dated 13 March 2012; and 20033967, being this current invoice. £11,958.39

Total For This Matter £16,569.02
Total For This Matter £16,569.02