

EXHIBIT 4

Wiand Guerra King P.L.

3000 Bayport Drive
Suite 600

Tampa, FL 33607

Telephone: 813-347-5100

Facsimile: 813-347-5198

Federal Tax ID # 27-0937962

Burton W. Wiand
Wiand Guerra King, P.L.
3000 Bayport Drive, Ste. 600
Tampa, FL 33607

November 27, 2012
Client: 025305
Matter: 090822
Invoice #: 4414

Page: 1

RE: Scoop Receivership - Recovery from Investors

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2012

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
	ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery		
4/26/2012	BWW	GIRLS, INC.: Office conference with M. Lamont and R. Jamieson regarding investors (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
5/1/2012	BWW	GIRLS, INC.: Prepare for meeting with Girls, Inc. (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
5/2/2012	BWW	GIRLS, INC.: Travel to Sarasota for meeting with K. Francoletti (2.0).	2.0	\$350.00
5/2/2012	BWW	GIRLS, INC.: Lunch meeting with K. Francoletti regarding defendant (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
5/9/2012	BWW	GIRLS, INC.: Telephone conference with K. Francoletti regarding settlement position regarding Girls, Inc. (.3); GIRLS, INC.: office conference with M. Lamont regarding settlement terms regarding same (.4).	0.7	\$245.00
5/10/2012	BWW	GIRLS, INC.: Review settlement agreement (1.0).	1.0	\$350.00
5/14/2012	BWW	GIRLS, INC.: Communications with K. Francoletti regarding settlement agreement (.7); GIRLS, INC.: office conferences with R. Jamieson and M. Lamont regarding same (.3).	1.0	\$350.00
5/18/2012	BWW	ELLIS: Office discussion with M. Lamont regarding settlement issues (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
5/22/2012	BWW	GEOFCO: Telephone conference with M. Lamont regarding resolution (.5).	0.5	\$175.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
5/23/2012	BWW	EFG BANK (241): Various telephone conferences and emails related to potential resolution (1.0); GIRLS INC.: several emails with M. Lamont and R. Jamieson and telephone conference with R. Jamieson related to Girls, Inc. (.3).	1.3	\$455.00
5/25/2012	BWW	GIRLS INC.: Communication with R. Jamieson regarding defendant (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
5/29/2012	BWW	GIRLS, INC.: Communication with R. Jamieson regarding settlement agreement (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
5/31/2012	BWW	LINSTEAD: Communication with M. Lamont regarding settlement (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
6/1/2012	BWW	GEOFCO: Office conference with M. Lamont regarding settlement issues (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
6/6/2012	BWW	MEEKER: Office conference with D. Heller regarding upcoming deposition (.5); MEEKER: review expert report and emails related to potential deposition (.3).	0.8	\$280.00
6/8/2012	BWW	MEEKER: Office conference with G. Morello and M. Lamont regarding deposition of defendant (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
6/8/2012	BWW	MEEKER: Consider legal strategy with M. Lamont (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
6/11/2012	BWW	CHARITIES: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
6/13/2012	BWW	EFG BANK/D&E UNIT (241): Office conference with M. Lamont regarding settlement details (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
6/13/2012	BWW	EFG BANK: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
6/14/2012	BWW	DANCING \$: Office conference with M. Lamont regarding defendant (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
6/14/2012	BWW	EFG BANK: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
6/15/2012	BWW	EFG BANK: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
6/18/2012	BWW	EFG BANK: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
6/22/2012	BWW	GIRLS, INC.: Telephone conference with K. Francoletti regarding settlement (.4); GIRLS, INC.: office conference with R. Jamieson (.2).	0.6	\$210.00
6/26/2012	BWW	CHARITIES: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
6/27/2012	BWW	MASON: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.2).	0.2	\$70.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET	Asset Analysis and Recovery			
6/27/2012	BWW	CHARITIES: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
6/29/2012	BWW	DANCING \$: Office conference with M. Lamont (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
7/5/2012	BWW	GIRLS, INC.: Office conference with R. Jamieson regarding settlement (.3); office conference with J. Perez regarding settlement (.2); emails from M. Lamont regarding settlement (.1).	0.6	\$210.00
7/9/2012	BWW	CHARITIES: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
7/10/2012	BWW	CHARITIES: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
7/11/2012	BWW	EFG BANK: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
7/23/2012	BWW	Office conference with M. Lamont and G. Morello re: legal strategy (.5); office conference with M. Lamont related to settlement (.5).	1.0	\$350.00
7/26/2012	BWW	LEE/MEEKER/MORGAN: Prepare for deposition with M. Lamont and G. Morello (4.0).	4.0	\$1,400.00
7/26/2012	BWW	CHARITIES: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
7/27/2012	BWW	LEE/MEEKER/MORGAN: Prepare for and attend deposition (8.0).	8.0	\$2,800.00
7/30/2012	BWW	SARASOTA OPERA: Office conference with M. Lamont prior to meeting with Sarasota Opera (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
7/30/2012	BWW	SARASOTA OPERA: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
7/31/2012	BWW	RUSSELL: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
8/1/2012	BWW	WOF: Review potential arbitrators (.5); conference with M. Lamont related to review of arbitration materials including response from Mr. Warren's firm (1.0).	1.5	\$525.00
8/2/2012	BWW	WHITLOCK: Consider legal strategy with M. Lamont (.4); WOF: review potential arbitrators (1.4).	1.8	\$630.00
8/9/2012	BWW	RUSSELL: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.2); office conference with M. Lamont regarding T. Barlow cases (.3).	0.5	\$175.00
8/16/2012	BWW	WHITLOCK: Consider potential arbitrators (.6); CHARITIES: consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.3); KHODORKOVSKY/GROSMAN: consider legal strategy with M. Lamont (.2); WOF: meeting with M. Lamont and G. Morello regarding arbitrator selection (1.0).	2.1	\$735.00

SERVICES

Date	TKPR	Description of Services	Hours	Amount
ASSET		Asset Analysis and Recovery		
8/17/2012	BWW	RUSSELL: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.4).	0.4	\$140.00
8/29/2012	BWW	DANCING \$: Consider settlement issues with M. Lamont (.5).	0.5	\$175.00
9/6/2012	BWW	D. CLOUD: Meeting with M. Lamont regarding settlement of claims (.2).	0.2	\$70.00
9/13/2012	BWW	LEE/MEEKER/MORGAN/DANCING \$/ROWE: Office discussion regarding motion to strike experts with G. Morello (.1); WOF: office discussion with M. Lamont regarding arbitration strategy (.3).	0.4	\$140.00
9/20/2012	BWW	SARASOTA OPERA: Settlement agreement office conference (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
Total: Asset Analysis and Recovery			40.20	\$13,720.00
CASE		Case Administration		
4/5/2012	BWW	Office discussion with R. Jamieson regarding collection of default judgments in California and Minnesota (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
4/18/2012	BWW	Office discussion with J. Rizzo regarding wire payments (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
7/2/2012	BWW	Receipt and review of executed settlement agreement, promissory note, and settlement check (.3).	0.3	\$105.00
Total: Case Administration			0.90	\$315.00
Total Professional Services			41.1	\$14,035.00
Total Services			\$14,035.00	
Total Current Charges				\$14,035.00
Previous Balance				\$7,630.00
Less Payments				(\$7,630.00)
PAY THIS AMOUNT				\$14,035.00

November 27, 2012

Client: 025305

Matter: 090822

Invoice #: 4414

Page: 5

TASK RECAP

Services

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
NADEL - ASSET	40.2	\$13,720.00
NADEL - CASE	0.9	\$315.00
	<u>41.10</u>	<u>\$14,035.00</u>

Disbursements

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	\$0.00
	\$0.00
	<u>\$0.00</u>

BREAKDOWN BY PERSON

<u>Person</u>
BWW Burton W. Wiand
BWW Burton W. Wiand

<u>Project No.</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
NADEL - ASSET	40.2	\$13,720.00
NADEL - CASE	0.9	\$315.00
	<u>41.10</u>	<u>\$14,035.00</u>