

APPENDIX A
3 OF 6

EXHIBIT D

**SALARY TABLE 2005-CHI
INCORPORATING THE 2.50% GENERAL SCHEDULE INCREASE AND A LOCALITY PAYMENT OF 19.70%
FOR THE LOCALITY PAY AREA OF CHICAGO-NAPERVILLE-NICHIGAN CITY, IL-IN-WI**

(See <http://www.opm.gov/oca/05tables/flocdef.asp> for definitions of locality pay areas.)
(TOTAL INCREASE: 3.75%)

EFFECTIVE JANUARY 2005

Hourly Basic (B) Rates by Grade and Step

Hourly Overtime (O) Rates by Grade and Step

GRADE	B/O	STEP 1	STEP 2	STEP 3	STEP 4	STEP 5	STEP 6	STEP 7	STEP 8	STEP 9	STEP 10
GS-1	B	\$ 9.19	\$ 9.49	\$ 9.80	\$ 10.10	\$ 10.41	\$ 10.59	\$ 10.89	\$ 11.19	\$ 11.21	\$ 11.49
	O	13.79	14.24	14.70	15.15	15.62	15.89	16.34	16.79	16.82	17.24
2	B	10.33	10.57	10.92	11.21	11.33	11.66	12.00	12.33	12.66	13.00
	O	15.50	15.86	16.38	16.82	17.00	17.49	18.00	18.50	18.99	19.50
3	B	11.27	11.64	12.02	12.40	12.77	13.15	13.52	13.90	14.27	14.65
	O	16.91	17.46	18.03	18.60	19.16	19.73	20.28	20.85	21.41	21.98
4	B	12.66	13.07	13.49	13.91	14.34	14.76	15.18	15.60	16.02	16.44
	O	18.98	19.61	20.24	20.87	21.51	22.14	22.77	23.40	24.03	24.66
5	B	14.15	14.63	15.10	15.57	16.04	16.51	16.99	17.46	17.93	18.40
	O	21.23	21.95	22.65	23.35	24.06	24.77	25.49	26.19	26.90	27.60
6	B	15.78	16.30	16.83	17.35	17.88	18.41	18.93	19.46	19.98	20.51
	O	23.67	24.45	25.25	26.03	26.82	27.62	28.40	29.19	29.97	30.77
7	B	17.53	18.12	18.70	19.29	19.87	20.45	21.04	21.62	22.21	22.79
	O	26.30	27.18	28.05	28.94	29.81	30.68	31.56	32.43	33.32	34.19
8	B	19.42	20.06	20.71	21.36	22.00	22.65	23.30	23.94	24.59	25.24
	O	29.13	30.09	31.07	32.04	33.00	33.98	34.95	35.43	35.43	35.43
9	B	21.45	22.16	22.87	23.59	24.30	25.02	25.73	26.45	27.16	27.88
	O	32.18	33.24	34.31	35.39	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43
10	B	23.82	24.40	25.19	25.98	26.77	27.55	28.34	29.13	29.92	30.70
	O	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43
11	B	25.95	26.81	27.68	28.54	29.41	30.27	31.14	32.00	32.87	33.73
	O	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43
12	B	31.10	32.14	33.17	34.21	35.24	36.28	37.32	38.35	39.39	40.43
	O	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	35.43	36.28	37.32	38.35	39.39	40.43
13	B	36.98	38.21	39.45	40.68	41.91	43.14	44.38	45.61	46.84	48.07
	O	36.98	38.21	39.45	40.68	41.91	43.14	44.38	45.61	46.84	48.07
14	B	43.70	45.15	46.61	48.07	49.53	50.98	52.44	53.90	55.36	56.81
	O	43.70	45.16	46.61	48.07	49.53	50.98	52.44	53.90	55.36	56.81
15	B	51.40	53.12	54.83	56.55	58.26	59.97	61.69	63.40	65.11	66.83
	O	51.40	53.12	54.83	56.55	58.26	59.97	61.69	63.40	65.11	66.83

NOTE: Locality rates of pay are basic pay only for certain purposes--see "Salary Tables for 2005" cover sheet.

EXHIBIT E

SALARY TABLE 2005-DCB
INCORPORATING THE 2.50% GENERAL SCHEDULE INCREASE AND A LOCALITY PAYMENT OF 15.98%
FOR THE LOCALITY PAY AREA OF WASHINGTON-BALTIMORE-NORTHERN VIRGINIA, DC-MD-PA-VA-WV
 (See <http://www.opm.gov/oc/05tables/ocdef.asp> for definitions of locality pay areas.)
(TOTAL INCREASE: 3.71%)

EFFECTIVE JANUARY 2005

Hourly Basic (B) Rates by Grade and Step

Hourly Overtime (O) Rates by Grade and Step

GRADE	B/O	STEP 1	STEP 2	STEP 3	STEP 4	STEP 5	STEP 6	STEP 7	STEP 8	STEP 9	STEP 10
GS-1	B	\$ 8.90	\$ 9.20	\$ 9.49	\$ 10.08	\$ 10.26	\$ 10.55	\$ 10.84	\$ 10.86	\$ 11.13	
	O	13.35	13.60	14.24	14.69	15.12	15.39	15.83	16.26	16.29	16.70
2	B	10.01	10.24	10.58	10.86	10.98	11.30	11.62	11.95	12.27	12.59
	O	15.02	15.36	15.87	16.29	16.47	16.95	17.43	17.93	18.41	18.89
3	B	10.92	11.28	11.55	12.01	12.37	12.74	13.10	13.47	13.83	14.19
	O	16.38	16.92	17.48	18.02	18.56	19.11	19.65	20.21	20.75	21.29
4	B	12.26	12.67	13.07	13.48	13.89	14.30	14.71	15.12	15.52	15.93
	O	18.39	19.01	19.61	20.22	20.84	21.45	22.07	22.68	23.28	23.90
5	B	13.71	14.17	14.63	15.09	15.54	16.00	16.46	16.92	17.37	17.83
	O	20.57	21.26	21.95	22.64	23.31	24.00	24.69	25.38	26.06	26.75
6	B	15.29	15.80	16.31	16.82	17.32	17.83	18.34	18.85	19.36	19.87
	O	22.94	23.70	24.47	25.23	25.98	26.75	27.51	28.28	29.04	29.81
7	B	16.99	17.55	18.12	18.69	19.25	19.82	20.38	20.95	21.52	22.08
	O	25.49	26.33	27.18	28.04	28.88	29.73	30.57	31.43	32.28	33.12
8	B	18.61	19.44	20.07	20.69	21.32	21.95	22.57	23.20	23.83	24.45
	O	28.22	29.16	30.11	31.04	31.98	32.93	33.86	34.32	34.32	34.32
9	B	20.78	21.47	22.16	22.86	23.55	24.24	24.93	25.63	26.32	27.01
	O	31.17	32.21	33.24	34.29	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32
10	B	22.88	23.64	24.41	25.17	25.93	26.70	27.46	28.22	28.99	29.75
	O	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32
11	B	25.14	25.98	26.82	27.65	28.49	29.33	30.17	31.01	31.84	32.68
	O	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32
12	B	30.13	31.14	32.14	33.14	34.15	35.15	36.16	37.16	38.17	39.17
	O	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32
13	B	35.83	37.03	38.22	39.41	40.61	41.80	43.00	44.19	45.39	46.58
	O	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32
14	B	42.34	43.75	45.17	46.58	47.99	49.40	50.81	52.22	53.63	55.05
	O	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32	34.32
15	B	49.81	51.47	53.13	54.79	56.45	58.11	59.77	61.43	63.09	64.75
	O	49.81	51.47	53.13	54.79	56.45	58.11	59.77	61.43	63.09	64.75

NOTE: Locality rates of pay are basic pay only for certain purposes--see "Salary Tables for 2005" cover sheet.

EXHIBIT F

REDLINE V. CHARLEAN FOSTER

Case Number 11050

Hourly Billings

Prepared Dec 08, 2005

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Cathleen M. Combs <i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Apr-28-2004	conf w jol, dae settlement	0.1
Apr-29-2004	attendance at mot	1.3
May-03-2004	conf w DAE & JOL	0.3
May-05-2004	confe dae re: court appearances	0.5
Jun-01-2004	conf w JOL. MRT DAE re: settlement	1.0
Jun-05-2004	conf w tlg, kl3 re: amend not mot class cert	0.1
Jul-12-2004	conf dae,jol, jom re: amd comp	0.3
Aug-24-2004	confs w dae, jol, jpm re: brief	0.4
Oct-15-2004	conf w DAE; t/c D Schultz; re: settlemnt	1.0
Dec-14-2004	conf w dae, jpm re: settl	0.3
Jan-28-2005	t/c Velde	0.2
Jan-31-2005	t/c ct re settlement; t/c Velde	1.0
Feb-03-2005	conf w Velde	0.3
Feb-04-2005	t/c Judge	0.3
Mar-02-2005	conf re: Sherman	0.3
Mar-16-2005	conf dae, jol; t/c op csl	0.5
Mar-28-2005	work on settlement agree	0.3
Apr-29-2005	work on settlement agreement	0.5
May-11-2005	conf w jpm, dae, op csl re: sett	0.3
Dec-05-2005	work on settlement agreement	0.3
Total:		9.3
		\$ 3,952.50
Daniel A. Edelman <i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Dec-05-2003	prepare complaint, research re: defendant	4.0
Mar-02-2004	conf dvi re: class cert	0.2
Mar-03-2004	review class papers	0.5
Mar-07-2004	prepare class papers, discovery	3.0
Mar-23-2004	revise discovery	1.0
Mar-31-2004	conf dvi re: amend comp	0.2
Mar-31-2004	conf kl3 re: mtn lv 2nd am cmplt; rev same	0.4
Apr-16-2004	prepare 3d amd cmplt and motion for leave to file same	5.0
Apr-18-2004	identifying other class members	2.0
Apr-21-2004	rev memo from kl3	0.1
Apr-26-2004	prepare settlement proposal	1.0
Apr-27-2004	conf jol sett prop	0.1
Apr-28-2004	conf jol, cmc re: sett proposal	0.1
May-02-2004	work on class motion and motion for judgment on the pleadings	4.0
May-03-2004	discussion re: settlement	0.5

Date	Task	Hours
May-04-2004	conf jb2 re: doc search; rev docs	0.9
May-05-2004	conf JB2: re: doc search; rev docs	0.7
May-05-2004	reviewing documents to identify collection agencies used by Sherman	2.0
May-06-2004	conf JB2; rev docs	0.6
May-07-2004	reviewing documents to identify collection agencies used by Sherman	6.0
May-16-2004	reviewing additional Sherman collection letters	2.0
May-19-2004	ph call JPM	0.1
May-26-2004	analyze settlement proposal	3.0
May-27-2004	discussion of settlement	2.0
May-29-2004	examining Sherman collection letters	2.0
May-31-2004	prepare 2d amd cmplt and motion for leave to file	2.0
Jun-01-2004	discussion re settlement	1.0
Jun-04-2004	conf jol re: settlement	0.1
Jun-04-2004	conf jol settlement	0.2
Jun-06-2004	review letter re: settlement, correspondenc	0.3
Jul-11-2004	prepare 4th amd cmplt and motion for leave to file, review information on defendants	4.0
Jul-12-2004	conf jol, cmc, jpm re: amend comp	0.3
Jul-22-2004	confs jpm re: ct app, motions	0.4
Aug-19-2004	review brief	1.0
Aug-24-2004	conf jol, cmc, jpm re: brief	0.3
Oct-15-2004	sett conf cmc	0.5
Dec-14-2004	settlement conference, preparation for same	4.0
Jan-19-2005	settlement conf., travel	11.0
Jan-31-2005	various discussions re: settlement	3.0
Feb-02-2005	confs re settlement	1.0
Feb-03-2005	confs re settlement	1.0
Feb-03-2005	review additional Sherman documents	3.0
Feb-09-2005	t/cs re: settlement	1.0
Feb-11-2005	settlement discussions	1.0
Feb-11-2005	settlement discussions	1.5
Feb-16-2005	conf jol, jpm re: disc	0.6
Mar-01-2005	draft new proposal	1.0
Mar-02-2005	conf cmc, jol re: settlement	0.3
Mar-02-2005	discuss settlement	2.0
Mar-15-2005	conf jol, jpm mtd opinion	0.3
Mar-16-2005	t/c re: settlement	0.5
Mar-21-2005	settlement discussions	1.0
Mar-22-2005	settlement discussions	2.0
May-02-2005	conf jol re: set agreem	0.2

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>
May-02-2005	conf jol, jpm re set agreement	0.3
May-11-2005	conf settlement smc, jpm, schultz	0.3
Jun-07-2005	confs jpm re: set agreement; rev docs	1.1
Jun-09-2005	conf mrt re: sett, notice	0.4
Jul-26-2005	prepare for preliminary approval hearing	1.0
Jul-27-2005	appearance for preliminary approval	1.0
Sep-14-2005	respond to class member emails	3.0
Sep-15-2005	respond to email from class member	0.4
Sep-16-2005	responding to emails from class members	1.0
Nov-03-2005	conf jpm re: new cases	0.3

Total: 94.7 \$ 40,247.50

James O. Latturmer

Partner

Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00

Dec-11-2003	work on complaint	0.3
Mar-31-2004	research; work on amended complaint	0.8
Apr-26-2004	conf dae re global settlement	0.5
Apr-27-2004	work on settlement proposal; canf dae	0.5
Apr-28-2004	work on settlement proposal; conf dae, cmc	0.3
May-03-2004	conf dae,cmc re: settlement	0.3
May-18-2004	recand rev deft ans to third amended complaint	0.3
May-21-2004	rec and rev FRS answer	0.3
May-31-2004	work on settlement proposal; conf dae	0.6
Jun-01-2004	conf dae, cmc, mrt re settlement proposal	0.7
Jun-04-2004	conf dae re settlement	0.3
Jun-30-2004	conf w/ jpm re: discovery	0.2
Jul-01-2004	prep for and appear on motion to reassign	1.8
Jul-12-2004	CONF DAE, CMC, JPM RE AMENDMENT; WORK ON 4TH AMENDED COMPLAINT	0.8
Jul-12-2004	rec and rev defts' responses to motion to transfer	0.3
Jul-12-2004	rec and rev Redline's response to motion for JOP	0.4
Jul-12-2004	rec and rev Sherman response to motion for JOP and reply in support of MTD; research; conf jpm	0.9
Jul-14-2004	work on response to FRS brief in support of Sherman MTD; research	0.5
Jul-23-2004	rec and rev NAS response to first discovery request	0.5
Aug-13-2004	rec and rev Sherman MTD	0.5
Aug-16-2004	rec and rev FRS' and NAFS' MTDs	0.4
Aug-20-2004	work on response to mtd	1.0
Aug-24-2004	work on response to FRS MTD; conf jpm, dae	1.2
Feb-16-2005	conf dae, jpm discovery	0.6
Mar-02-2005	review of file re settlement; conf dae, cmc	1.6
Mar-09-2005	work on discovery response; conf jpm	0.4
Mar-15-2005	rec and rev court's mtd opinion; conf dae, jpm	0.8

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Mar-15-2005	work on discovery	1.0		
Mar-16-2005	tc opposing attorney; conf cmc, dae	0.5		
Mar-22-2005	conf dae re settlement	0.3		
Mar-28-2005	work on settlement agreement	2.2		
Apr-29-2005	work on settlement agreement; conf jpm	0.7		
May-02-2005	conf jpm, dae re settlement agreement; work on agreement	0.6		
Jun-06-2005	rec, rev and worked on draft settlement agreement; conf jpm	1.4		
Jun-13-2005	work on class notice	0.4		
Jul-14-2005	work on preliminary approval documents; conf jpm	1.2		
	Total:	25.1		\$ 10,667.50
Tara L. Goodwin	<i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 385.00</i>	
Dec-09-2003	rev. file, assign case	0.2		
May-06-2004	conf KL3 re: amend motion	0.1		
Sep-24-2004	rev. incoming discovery to see what response will entail	0.3		
Sep-09-2005	letter to BK att. Re: we do not represent Sherman	0.5		
	Total:	1.1		\$ 423.50
Michelle R. Teggelaar	<i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 275.00</i>	
Jun-01-2004	settlement conf w/daem cmc, jol	1.0		
Jun-09-2005	conf dae re: issues in settlement, disc settlement documents/notice	0.4		
Jun-09-2005	disc w/jpm re: orders	0.1		
Jun-09-2005	review notice, disc w/jpm	0.3		
Jun-10-2005	disc notice w/jpm	0.1		
Jun-10-2005	work on sherman notice	0.9		
Aug-30-2005	read memo from JPM re: sherman	0.2		
Dec-01-2005	conf JB re: preparation of appendices for fee petition/final memo	0.3		
Dec-01-2005	conf JPM re: fee petition	0.2		
Dec-01-2005	conf JPM re: final memo, review var models on fee petition, conf FRG and JPM re: relevant provisions	1.0		
	Total:	4.5		\$ 1,237.50
Francis R. Greene	<i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 225.00</i>	
Sep-13-2005	class call	0.2		
	Total:	0.2		\$ 45.00
Curtis Warner	<i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>	
Sep-12-2005	4 more class calls en espanol	0.6		
Sep-12-2005	telephono de espanol	0.1		
Sep-12-2005	telephono de espanol	0.2		
Sep-13-2005	more spanish speaking class member callers	0.3		
Sep-14-2005	call from spanish speaking class member	0.2		
Sep-14-2005	call from Spanish speaking class member.	0.3		
Sep-14-2005	Spanish speaking cl mem.	0.2		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
		Total:	1.9
			\$ 361.00
Derek Rieman	<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>	
May-27-2005	conf jpm re: settlement	0.4	
Sep-12-2005	class member call and research client account list	0.4	
Nov-14-2005	conf JB2 re: class calls	0.1	
		Total:	0.9
			\$ 171.00
Danita V. Ivory	<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>	
Feb-19-2004	spoke w/ client re: amendments to compl. to add add'l plaintiffs/explained class aspects	0.25	
Mar-02-2004	Conf KL3 re: summons	0.1	
Mar-02-2004	Conf. w/ DAE re: class cert. (timing for filing motion)	0.25	
Mar-03-2004	Confs JB2 and AK2 re: class cert	0.2	
Mar-03-2004	Returned call from Ms. Flood	0.2	
Mar-05-2004	returned call from FRS	0.2	
Mar-05-2004	Reviewing class certification motion/memo. & making revisions to prior drafts	1.0	
Mar-09-2004	Conf KL3 re: reassign	0.1	
Mar-26-2004	Conf KL3 re: service	0.1	
Mar-31-2004	Conf. W/ DAE re: amending cmpt to add Chuway claim/reviewed amendment	0.4	
Apr-05-2004	Reviewed Answer from Nat'l Action defendant	0.4	
Apr-07-2004	Memo to TES re: court appearance on 4-8	0.3	
Apr-08-2004	conf TES re: ct appearance	0.2	
Apr-09-2004	letter to o.c./transfer memo for file	0.4	
		Total:	4.1
			\$ 779.00
Heather A. Piccirilli	<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>	
Sep-09-2005	Read JPM memo	0.1	
Sep-12-2005	Cls call	0.4	
		Total:	0.5
			\$ 95.00
John Blythin	<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>	
May-20-2004	Ct. status report	0.3	
May-20-2004	motion hearing	0.8	
May-20-2004	prepare for motion hearing	0.5	
		Total:	1.6
			\$ 304.00
Jeremy Monteiro	<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>	
Apr-26-2004	phone call to steve mora.	0.1	
May-11-2004	review case file for mts up on Thursday, Pacer research.	0.3	
May-13-2004	court appearance on 2 motions	0.5	
May-13-2004	ct app. Status report	0.1	
May-13-2004	draft 26f ltr.	0.1	
May-13-2004	Review Mt. For Partial Judgement on the Pleadings for court	0.3	
May-19-2004	mtg w/ mrt and jdb re: motion. Phone call to op/counsel.	0.5	

Date	Task	Hours
May-19-2004	phone call to DAE on court app.	0.1
May-19-2004	rev ltr from op.counsel.	0.1
May-24-2004	Draft motion for leave to file corrected exhibit.	0.3
May-24-2004	Edit discovery requests for 3rd Am. Complaint.	1.7
May-24-2004	phone call to op counsel re: am complt. Exhibit problem.	0.1
May-25-2004	Send corrected exhibit to op. Counsel.	0.1
May-26-2004	Edit motion.	0.1
May-27-2004	Rev. judgement of pleadings ag. NCFS, to draft on other D's.	0.6
Jun-01-2004	disc resp	1.5
Jun-01-2004	draft mt for judgment on the pleadings, conf w/ CMC/JOL to discuss Chuway letters.	1.7
Jun-02-2004	draft judgment on the pleadings.	0.5
Jun-02-2004	edit mt for judgment on the pleadings - research.	0.4
Jun-03-2004	mot for judgement on the pleadings and response to mtd on ct ii	2.7
Jun-03-2004	phone call to op. Counsel re; motion being granted.	0.1
Jun-04-2004	mt for judgment on pleadings	0.1
Jun-07-2004	edit mt judg pleadings	0.7
Jun-08-2004	draft mt for judgment on pleadings	0.8
Jun-14-2004	phone call to op counsel	0.1
Jun-15-2004	respond to mtd counti	1.1
Jun-16-2004	phone call from op counsel	0.1
Jun-16-2004	reply in support of judge on the pleadings/ mtd count II	1.3
Jun-17-2004	Conf w/ client Blair re: interrogatory requests	0.5
Jun-17-2004	Court app for mt for judge on pleadings, draft court status report.	1.1
Jun-17-2004	phone call to client	0.1
Jun-17-2004	resp to mtd	0.8
Jun-17-2004	rev. NES' answer to complt	0.3
Jun-18-2004	edit resp mtd	1.2
Jun-21-2004	P's rsp mtd count 1	0.2
Jun-21-2004	phone call to client re" discovery	0.3
Jun-21-2004	phone call to clients re: discovery answers	0.5
Jun-22-2004	Draft discovery responses to NAFS' production	1.3
Jun-22-2004	edit resp to mtd ct1	0.1
Jun-23-2004	draft NAFS discovery responses and phone calls to clients	5.7
Jun-24-2004	document review and discovery responses	3.8
Jun-25-2004	edit resp. judgement on pleadings	0.8
Jun-27-2004	draft disc resp	1.2
Jun-27-2004	edit reply	0.5
Jun-28-2004	conf jb2 sn re: filing	0.1
Jun-28-2004	edit P's reply for jud pleadings	0.5

Date	Task	Hours
Jun-29-2004	edit disc.	0.3
Jun-30-2004	conf w/ jol re disc responses	0.2
Jun-30-2004	disc resp	0.9
Jun-30-2004	edit disc	0.8
Jul-01-2004	court prep and court appearance and CASR	1.2
Jul-01-2004	rev mrs answer	0.2
Jul-02-2004	disc rev	0.4
Jul-08-2004	phone call to op counsel	0.1
Jul-12-2004	conf jol, dae, cmc re: 4th amend complaint	0.3
Jul-12-2004	discovery responses	0.2
Jul-12-2004	doc revi	0.3
Jul-12-2004	phone call to client re discovery	0.2
Jul-13-2004	phone call to client	0.2
Jul-13-2004	resp to FRS brief	2.6
Jul-13-2004	rev client docs	0.2
Jul-14-2004	draft/edit resp FRS brief	2.5
Jul-14-2004	edit 4th am complaint	1.2
Jul-14-2004	reply mt to reassign	1.1
Jul-15-2004	draft 4th am complt	0.9
Jul-15-2004	draft disc ltr	0.5
Jul-15-2004	ltr to redline	0.1
Jul-15-2004	mt strike FRS Brief	0.2
Jul-15-2004	Resp. FRS brief	1.2
Jul-16-2004	draft discovery letter	2.2
Jul-16-2004	Draft reply in support of Judgement on Pleadings	1.2
Jul-16-2004	Edit 4th Am. Complt	0.5
Jul-16-2004	phone call from client1	0.1
Jul-16-2004	phone calls to clients re: discovery	0.5
Jul-17-2004	reply mt reassign	1.4
Jul-19-2004	edit 4th am complt	0.5
Jul-19-2004	edit reply to judge pleadings	0.3
Jul-19-2004	mt leave to file 4th am complt	1.0
Jul-19-2004	phone call from client	0.1
Jul-19-2004	phone call from client	0.1
Jul-20-2004	phone call to client re: discovery responses	0.3
Jul-20-2004	rev discovery responses by redline, sherman	1.0
Jul-21-2004	disc ltr	0.1
Jul-21-2004	disc ltr	0.1
Jul-22-2004	conf w/ dae re motions, prepare for court, court appearance on mt for 4th am complt and strike.	2.5
Jul-22-2004	edit 4th am complt	0.4

Date	Task	Hours
Jul-23-2004	4th am complt	0.3
Jul-27-2004	phone call to client	0.2
Jul-29-2004	resp to redline's discovery requests	1.4
Jul-29-2004	phone call to client re: discovery	0.1
Jul-29-2004	phone call to op counsel	0.1
Jul-30-2004	Draft resp to redline's discovey req	0.7
Jul-30-2004	ltr re protective order	0.2
Aug-02-2004	draft second set of discovery	0.6
Aug-02-2004	Draft supp discovery	1.1
Aug-02-2004	supp discovery	0.4
Aug-02-2004	supp discovery responses	0.4
Aug-03-2004	doc rev	0.3
Aug-04-2004	doc review re disc req	0.5
Aug-05-2004	discovery ltr to mrs, frs, nes, nafs	1.1
Aug-05-2004	mt leave amd class mt	0.3
Aug-05-2004	research on Chuway/Taylor	0.2
Aug-06-2004	dis ltr to mrs, frs, nafs and nes	0.4
Aug-06-2004	disc ltr to redline	0.6
Aug-06-2004	draft redline discovery ltr	0.3
Aug-06-2004	draft redline discovery ltr	0.2
Aug-06-2004	phone call to lynn thorpe re protective order and Foster.	0.2
Aug-09-2004	edit mt for leave to am class mt	0.2
Aug-09-2004	rev prot order, phone call to op counsel	0.7
Aug-10-2004	am mt class cert	1.6
Aug-11-2004	rev protective order	0.1
Aug-13-2004	rest mtd	0.4
Aug-16-2004	pro order ltr	0.1
Aug-16-2004	rev d's mtd	0.5
Aug-17-2004	draft disc resp to sherman	1.4
Aug-17-2004	draft resp mtd - sherman	1.0
Aug-18-2004	draft resp frs mtd	1.8
Aug-18-2004	draft resp Sherman/RL MTD	4.4
Aug-19-2004	Court appearance	1.6
Aug-19-2004	resp mtd sherman	2.5
Aug-20-2004	mem class cert	0.6
Aug-20-2004	mt class cert	1.0
Aug-20-2004	mt class cert	0.4
Aug-20-2004	resp Frs mtd	1.5
Aug-23-2004	edit resp mtd sherman	0.7
Aug-23-2004	mt class cert	0.8
Aug-24-2004	conf w/ jol,dae,cmc re frs brief	0.4

Date	Task	Hours
Aug-24-2004	mt leave oversized brief	0.2
Aug-24-2004	resp frs mtd	2.0
Aug-24-2004	rev complt	0.2
Aug-24-2004	rev resp sherman mtd	3.8
Aug-25-2004	am memo class cert and motion	0.9
Aug-25-2004	resp mtd frs	1.3
Aug-26-2004	conf jb2, sn re: motion excess page limit	0.1
Aug-26-2004	mt leave oversized brief	0.7
Aug-26-2004	resp mtd frs	1.9
Aug-26-2004	resp sherman mtd	0.8
Aug-27-2004	resp sa 2nd discovery	0.7
Aug-30-2004	resp sa 2nd discovery	1.2
Aug-30-2004	rev protective order	0.5
Aug-31-2004	mts compel rrs,frs,mrs,nafs,nes	1.8
Aug-31-2004	rev discovery responses, doc review	0.7
Sep-01-2004	compel mts	1.1
Sep-07-2004	disc ltr	0.4
Sep-09-2004	court app	1.5
Sep-10-2004	disc ltr	0.1
Sep-13-2004	conf sn, jb2 re: filing	0.2
Sep-13-2004	mt compel	0.4
Sep-16-2004	prepare for mts compel and court app on mts to compel	1.2
Sep-16-2004	rev sherman docs	1.0
Sep-17-2004	document review	1.2
Sep-17-2004	ltr re: docs	0.5
Sep-17-2004	phone call to op counsel re: RRS discovery and mt to compel	0.2
Sep-20-2004	draft disc ltr	0.1
Sep-20-2004	draft discovery ltr	0.5
Sep-22-2004	rev and edit re-notice of mt compel	0.1
Sep-24-2004	dis ltr to op counsel	0.1
Sep-24-2004	doc review, research accounts	1.0
Sep-24-2004	supp discovery resp	0.3
Sep-29-2004	prep mt compel, court appearance	1.6
Sep-30-2004	rev mt, court app on RRS's 2 motions	1.0
Oct-04-2004	draft discovery	1.0
Oct-11-2004	ltr to op counsel re class mt	0.4
Oct-18-2004	mt w/draw class cert	0.5
Oct-19-2004	resp to rfa's	0.7
Oct-21-2004	doc review	2.6
Oct-26-2004	FRS discovery ltr, review discovery	0.5

Date	Task	Hours
Oct-26-2004	phone call to clients	0.5
Nov-03-2004	phone call to clients	0.3
Nov-08-2004	draft 3rd set of discovery, review file	1.7
Nov-09-2004	ltr to NAFS	0.2
Nov-09-2004	rev discovery, draft 3rd set of discovery to sherman	0.8
Nov-10-2004	phone calls to clients, draft supp. Disc resp.	0.3
Nov-10-2004	rev disc, ltr to nes	0.3
Nov-18-2004	mt w/ draw class alleg - court app - granted w/out ct app	0.4
Nov-30-2004	mt to substitute	0.3
Nov-30-2004	phone call to clients re supp docs	0.3
Nov-30-2004	research	0.1
Dec-01-2004	disc ltrs	0.5
Dec-01-2004	draft dep notice	0.6
Dec-01-2004	draft supp discovery responses	0.3
Dec-01-2004	phone call to client re docs	0.1
Dec-01-2004	schedule deps	0.1
Dec-03-2004	doc rev	0.2
Dec-09-2004	rev sa 3rd disc resp	0.2
Dec-10-2004	disc rev	0.4
Dec-10-2004	phone call from client	0.2
Dec-13-2004	rev ct docs	0.2
Dec-14-2004	conf w/ dae/cmc re settlement	0.3
Dec-16-2004	mt substitute	1.0
Dec-20-2004	phoen call from op counsel	0.1
Dec-20-2004	rev disc resp	0.2
Dec-29-2004	ltr to op counsel	0.1
Dec-30-2004	ltr to op counsel	0.1
Dec-31-2004	phone call from op counsel	0.1
Dec-31-2004	rev discovery re: re-aging, draft subpoenas	1.0
Jan-04-2005	ltr to op counsel re confirmation of deps	0.2
Jan-05-2005	phone call from client	0.1
Jan-10-2005	rev discovery	1.1
Jan-10-2005	supp discovery, doc rev2	1.7
Jan-17-2005	ltr to op counsel re: deps	0.2
Jan-24-2005	phone call from op counsel re: status of settlement	0.1
Feb-14-2005	phone call from op counsel	0.1
Feb-16-2005	conf w/ dae & jol re discovery	0.6
Mar-03-2005	disc ltr to stelter and o'conner	0.9
Mar-07-2005	phone call from redline's csl	0.1
Mar-08-2005	dep scheduling	0.8
Mar-08-2005	disc ltr	0.1

Date	Task	Hours
Mar-08-2005	p call from def csl	0.1
Mar-09-2005	dep scheduling,conf jol	0.4
Mar-09-2005	rev file	0.3
Mar-10-2005	p call to op csl	0.1
Mar-11-2005	rev disc resp	0.1
Mar-14-2005	rev order	0.5
Mar-15-2005	confs w jol, dae cour't motion to dismiss opinion	0.3
Mar-16-2005	subpoena account agreements for clients	2.5
Mar-17-2005	supoenas	0.1
Mar-18-2005	doc review	0.3
Mar-21-2005	dep confirmation calls, ltr to client	1.0
Mar-22-2005	notice of settlement	0.2
Mar-23-2005	settlement papers	1.7
Mar-24-2005	draft settlement agreement	2.0
Mar-25-2005	draft class papers	5.0
Mar-28-2005	class papers	2.0
Mar-29-2005	conf re settlement agreement	1.6
Mar-30-2005	class settlement	0.3
Mar-31-2005	draft subpoena w/ drawal ltrs	0.4
Apr-06-2005	phone call re: subpoena	0.1
Apr-18-2005	edit class settlement agreement	0.4
Apr-29-2005	con jol re: sett agreement	0.3
Apr-29-2005	rev set ag and edit set ag	2.2
May-02-2005	edit set agreement and conf w/ jol and dae	0.9
May-04-2005	ct app and casr	0.8
May-04-2005	ltr to john rossman re: settlement	0.4
May-11-2005	conf w/ cmc and dae and schultz re sherman settlement	0.3
May-11-2005	rev e-mail	0.1
May-11-2005	rev settlement docs	0.2
May-16-2005	phone call from client - s. washington	0.2
May-16-2005	rev lucas file	0.2
May-27-2005	conf w/ dbr re settlement and collectcorp	0.4
May-27-2005	ltr to op csl	0.2
Jun-01-2005	phone call to op csl re motion, conf w/ HAP re settlement	0.3
Jun-06-2005	conf jol re: set agreement	0.3
Jun-06-2005	draft mt enforce settlement	0.4
Jun-06-2005	mt extend	0.2
Jun-06-2005	rev set ag	2.4
Jun-07-2005	edit set agreement, conf w/ dae re set ag	6.5
Jun-07-2005	mt extend prelim approval	0.3
Jun-08-2005	edit class notice	3.5

Date	Task	Hours
Jun-09-2005	confs mrt re notice, orders	0.2
Jun-09-2005	draft mt preliminary approval	0.9
Jun-09-2005	draft prelim approval order	0.3
Jun-09-2005	edit class notice	3.3
Jun-10-2005	conf mrt re: notice	0.1
Jun-10-2005	edit notice	1.5
Jun-14-2005	edit class notice	0.5
Jun-21-2005	rev release language	0.2
Jun-24-2005	p call to op csl	0.1
Jun-24-2005	rev class notice and d's edits	0.5
Jun-27-2005	prepare for ct	0.1
Jun-28-2005	p call to op csl re set ag	0.1
Jul-11-2005	p call to op csl	0.1
Jul-13-2005	p call to op csl re set ag	0.1
Jul-14-2005	conf jol re: prel approval	0.2
Jul-14-2005	edit class notice, draft preliminary class motion	0.3
Jul-14-2005	rev set ag and edit final approval	1.5
Jul-15-2005	rev set ag and e-mail op csl	0.5
Jul-18-2005	draft mt enforce	0.6
Jul-18-2005	edit final app order	0.5
Jul-18-2005	edit mt	0.2
Jul-18-2005	set ag, prelim mt class	3.5
Jul-19-2005	rev set ag, mt prelim,	2.6
Jul-19-2005	settlement	1.5
Jul-26-2005	rev set agreement	0.4
Jul-27-2005	conf TES re: settlement hearing	0.1
Jul-27-2005	rev set ag ct app for prelim approval; conf tes	2.0
Jul-28-2005	conf w/ sk re settlement, p call to op csl	0.3
Jul-29-2005	p call from Noah Downs re Sherman	0.2
Aug-01-2005	p call to client re settlement - C Nelson	0.2
Aug-02-2005	e-mail op csl re notice	0.1
Aug-03-2005	conf w/ sn re settlement	0.7
Aug-03-2005	send order to op csl	0.2
Aug-10-2005	p call to n downs re settlement	0.1
Aug-11-2005	p call to noah downs re settlement	0.1
Aug-16-2005	p call to op csl re notice	0.1
Aug-29-2005	ltr to op csl	0.2
Aug-30-2005	memo mrt re sherman	0.2
Sep-01-2005	conf w/ paralegals re sherman settlement	0.2
Sep-01-2005	confs jb2 re: phone script info	0.2
Sep-06-2005	rev sherman memo, edit; conf SK	0.4

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Sep-09-2005	conf SK re: class notice	0.2	
Sep-12-2005	take sherman class calls	1.5	
Sep-13-2005	p call from class members	0.5	
Sep-13-2005	sherman settlement	0.8	
Sep-14-2005	e-mail op csl, conf w/ dae	0.2	
Sep-14-2005	p call to sherman class members	0.4	
Sep-15-2005	p call from sherman class member	0.2	
Sep-16-2005	p call from sherman class	0.2	
Sep-16-2005	p call from sherman class member	0.3	
Sep-16-2005	p call to sherman class member	0.5	
Sep-20-2005	class member call	0.2	
Sep-21-2005	p call from op csl	0.2	
Sep-21-2005	p call to class member	0.6	
Sep-22-2005	ct app on mt stay and mt supp	0.5	
Sep-22-2005	p call to sherman class member	0.2	
Sep-26-2005	p call from class member	0.2	
Sep-27-2005	p call from sherman class member	0.2	
Sep-30-2005	p call from r claybon	0.1	
Sep-30-2005	p call to sherman classmember atty	0.1	
Oct-04-2005	p call from client	0.2	
Oct-05-2005	p call to op csl	0.5	
Oct-07-2005	p call from sherman call member	0.5	
Oct-17-2005	p call to Sherman class member	0.2	
Oct-19-2005	p call from sherman class member	0.3	
Nov-02-2005	ltr to op csl	0.1	
Nov-03-2005	conf w dae re new sherman cases	0.3	
Nov-04-2005	p call from pot cli	0.3	
Nov-15-2005	ltr to trustee re Sherman settlement	0.2	
Nov-29-2005	draft final approval memo	1.4	
Nov-29-2005	p call to op csl re notice	0.1	
Dec-01-2005	conf w/ MRT and JB re time and expenses	0.3	
Dec-01-2005	confs mrt re: fee petition	0.2	
Dec-02-2005	resp to op csl e-mail	0.2	
Dec-05-2005	Edit final approval memorandum	2.0	
Dec-06-2005	rev time records	0.5	
Dec-07-2005	Conf w/ NZ re: declaration	0.3	
Dec-07-2005	Edit Final Approval Memorandum	1.0	
Dec-07-2005	Rev Sherman Exclusion list and edit Memorandum	0.3	
Dec-07-2005	review time records for declaration	0.3	
Dec-08-2005	Edit Final Approval Memo and Fee Petition	2.0	
	Total:	229.3	\$ 43,567.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Thomas Soule			<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Apr-08-2004	Court appearance (FOR DVI), CASR, conf DVI/KL3 re granting of motion for 2AC	1.5		
Apr-09-2004	Memo to DAE re status of case	0.1		
Jul-27-2005	Conf JPM re settlement hearing	0.1		
	Total:	1.7		\$ 323.00
Jeffrey Becker			<i>Legal Asst.</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 105.00</i>
Mar-03-2004	Confs DVI, AK2 re: class cert motion and memo	0.3		
May-04-2004	Confs DAE, KF, AK2; docs review	5.5		
May-05-2004	Confs DAE, AK2, KF, JG3; doc review	4.5		
May-06-2004	Confs DAE; docs review with MD, NR, KF and JA5	6.0		
Jun-09-2004	Call from op csl; loc docs; fax doc to op csl	0.3		
Jun-22-2004	Conf MD re: notice	0.1		
Jun-23-2004	Docket answer to 3rd am complaint	0.1		
Jun-28-2004	Confs JPM, SN; prep cert service; prep filing	0.5		
Aug-17-2004	Conf SN re: service of summons	0.1		
Aug-26-2004	Confs JPM, SN re: motion for leave to file in excess of page limit	0.2		
Sep-13-2004	Confs JPM, SN; assist SN in prep of filing	0.6		
Jul-19-2005	Assist SK re: prep for filing; confs SK and JA5	0.5		
Aug-31-2005	Record phone script; confs SK	0.4		
Sep-01-2005	Prep phone script for class notice on phone line; confs SK and JPM	0.5		
Sep-12-2005	Numerous class calls	3.5		
Sep-13-2005	Numerous class calls	4.5		
Sep-14-2005	Numerous class calls	2.9		
Sep-15-2005	Numerous class calls	2.1		
Sep-19-2005	Numerous class calls	0.9		
Sep-20-2005	Class calls	0.5		
Sep-21-2005	Numerous class calls	0.4		
Sep-26-2005	Class calls	0.6		
Oct-06-2005	Class calls	0.2		
Oct-12-2005	Conf SW re: class call; class calls	0.3		
Nov-14-2005	Class calls; conf DBR; check class list for class member; call to class member re: letter	0.5		
Nov-15-2005	Class call	0.1		
Dec-01-2005	confs MRT re: fee petition and final memo	0.3		
	Total:	36.4		\$ 3,822.00
Andrew Komanski			<i>Legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Mar-03-2004	draft class cert motion and memo; cnf DVI, JB2, KL3 re same	1.2		
Mar-04-2004	revise per DAE cis memo; mot	0.4		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
May-04-2004	doc review	2.8	
May-05-2004	doc review	4.5	
Aug-09-2004	file motion to amend class cert	0.6	

Total: 9.5 \$ 950.00

Alec Smith

Legal Asst

Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00

Sep-12-2005	class calls re: set	3.2	
Sep-13-2005	class calls re: set	1.9	
Sep-14-2005	class calls re: set	1.4	
Sep-15-2005	class calls re: set	1.5	
Sep-16-2005	class calls re: set	1.1	
Sep-19-2005	return class calls; address change	1.6	
Sep-20-2005	class calls re: set	0.9	
Sep-21-2005	class calls re: set	1.0	
Sep-22-2005	class call re: opt-out	0.5	
Sep-23-2005	class calls re: set	0.3	
Sep-26-2005	class calls re: set	0.5	
Sep-27-2005	class call re: set	0.1	
Sep-28-2005	class call re: set	0.5	
Sep-29-2005	class calls re: set	0.5	
Sep-29-2005	class calls re: set	0.5	
Sep-30-2005	class call re: set	0.1	
Oct-03-2005	class call re: set	0.1	
Oct-04-2005	class calls re: set	0.3	
Oct-05-2005	class calls re: set	0.2	
Oct-11-2005	class call re: set	0.1	
Oct-12-2005	class calls re: set	0.4	
Oct-18-2005	class call re: set	0.1	
Oct-24-2005	class call re: set	0.1	
Nov-07-2005	class call re: set, continuing problems	0.3	
Nov-09-2005	class call re: set, lawsuit	0.2	
Nov-10-2005	class call re: set	0.2	
Nov-14-2005	class calls re: set	0.1	
Nov-17-2005	class call re: set	0.2	
Nov-22-2005	field class call re: set	0.2	

Total: 18.1 \$ 1,810.00

Benita Harris

Legal Assist

Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00

Sep-12-2005	11 class calls re: recovery	0.5	
Sep-12-2005	25 class calls re: recovery	0.5	
Sep-13-2005	13 class calls re: recovery	0.5	
Sep-14-2005	7 class calls re: recovery	0.3	
Sep-15-2005	Took 14 class calls re: recovery	0.6	

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
		Total:	2.4
			\$ 240.00
Brian Kolbus	<i>legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Feb-25-2004	Ct. file sums proof svc.	0.3	
		Total:	0.3
			\$ 30.00
Emily Kulpa	<i>Legal Assit</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-12-2005	settlement inquiry calls	5.0	
Sep-13-2005	settlement inquiry calls	4.2	
Sep-14-2005	settlement inquiry calls	2.8	
Sep-15-2005	class member inquiry calls	1.1	
Sep-16-2005	class member inquiry calls	1.4	
Sep-19-2005	class member inquiry calls	1.6	
Sep-20-2005	class member inquiry calls	0.7	
Sep-21-2005	class member inquiry calls	0.3	
Sep-22-2005	class member inquiry call	0.1	
Sep-23-2005	class member inquiry calls	0.1	
Sep-26-2005	class member inquiry calls	0.5	
Sep-27-2005	class member inquiry calls	0.2	
Sep-28-2005	class member inquiry call	0.1	
Sep-29-2005	class member inquiry call	0.1	
Sep-30-2005	class member inquiry calls	0.4	
Oct-04-2005	class member inquiry calls	0.4	
Oct-05-2005	class member inquiry call	0.1	
Oct-06-2005	class member inquiry calls	0.2	
Oct-07-2005	class member inquiry call	0.1	
Oct-11-2005	class member inquiry call	0.1	
Oct-12-2005	class member inquiry call	0.1	
Nov-08-2005	class member inquiry call	0.1	
Nov-14-2005	class member inquiry call	0.2	
Nov-18-2005	class member inquiry calls	0.5	
Nov-22-2005	class member inquiry calls	0.4	
		Total:	20.8
			\$ 2,080.00
Jared Andersen	<i>Legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Feb-20-2004	docket schedule	0.1	
Mar-22-2004	dct sumns filed in fed.	0.1	
Mar-22-2004	dct sumns srvd; D consl appear filed	0.2	
Apr-05-2004	help draft not of motion; motion to withdraw as consl	0.4	
Apr-26-2004	dct crt order; dct ps' motion for leave to file third amended comp	0.2	
Aug-10-2004	filed not of mtn in fed crt	0.5	
Sep-13-2004	dct reply brief	0.1	
Apr-25-2005	dct verification; dct order	0.2	

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
May-04-2005	dct crt app status	0.1		
Jul-19-2005	prep/bind docs for crt filing	0.6		
Sep-12-2005	answer class member settlement q's	2.5		
Sep-13-2005	answer class member settlement q's	4.2		
Sep-14-2005	answer class member settlement q's	2.5		
Sep-15-2005	answer class member q's	2.0		
Sep-16-2005	answer class member settlement q's	2.0		
Sep-19-2005	answer class member settlement q's	1.0		
Sep-20-2005	answer class member settlement q's	0.8		
Sep-21-2005	answer class calls	0.7		
Sep-22-2005	answer class member settlement q's	0.7		
Sep-26-2005	answer class member settlement q's	0.7		
Sep-27-2005	answer class member settlement q's	0.2		
Sep-29-2005	answer class member calls	0.5		
Sep-30-2005	answer class member q's	0.5		
Oct-03-2005	answer class member settlement q's	0.8		
Oct-04-2005	answer class member settlement q's	1.0		
Oct-06-2005	answer class member settlement q's	0.5		
Oct-07-2005	answer class member settlement q's	0.3		
Oct-12-2005	answer class member q's	0.5		
Oct-13-2005	answer class member q's	0.3		
Oct-14-2005	draft order	0.3		
Nov-10-2005	answer class member q's	0.2		
Dec-07-2005	conf jpm, nz, re: final approval; prep and assist with final approval memo, docs and appendix,	2.0		
Dec-08-2005	conf jpm, nz re: final approval; prep and assist with final approval memo, docs and appendix	2.0		
		Total:	28.7	\$ 2,870.00
Jeff Griffin	<i>Legal Asst.</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Apr-02-2004	doc not mot	0.1		
May-04-2004	assemble client docs	2.0		
May-05-2004	assemble/review client docs	1.3		
May-06-2004	assemble & rev client docs	1.5		
Sep-21-2004	log ct order	0.1		
Sep-27-2004	ml opcnsl	0.2		
Sep-29-2004	log def;s and for leave to file amended	0.1		
Dec-09-2004	conf sn re document recovery, review	0.2		
		Total:	5.5	\$ 550.00
Jason Kunowski	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-12-2005	Class calls	3.0		
Sep-13-2005	Class member calls	5.5		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Sep-14-2005	Class calls	2.0
Sep-15-2005	Class calls	1.0
Sep-16-2005	Class calls	1.0
Sep-19-2005	Class calls	1.0
Sep-20-2005	Class calls	0.8
Sep-21-2005	Class calls	0.5
Sep-21-2005	Class calls	0.5
Sep-21-2005	Class calls	0.5
Sep-22-2005	Spanish class call	0.1
Sep-26-2005	Class calls	0.3
Sep-27-2005	Class calls	0.3
Sep-28-2005	Class calls	0.3
Sep-29-2005	Class calls	0.1
Sep-29-2005	Class calls	0.3
Sep-30-2005	Class calls	0.3
Oct-17-2005	Class calls	0.1
Oct-17-2005	Spanish class call	0.2
Oct-18-2005	Docketing	0.1
Oct-28-2005	Class call en espanol	0.2
Total:		18.1
		\$ 1,810.00

John Mounce

Legal Asst

Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00

Mar-26-2005	class calls	0.2
Sep-12-2005	answering class calls	3.5
Sep-13-2005	answering class calls	2.8
Sep-14-2005	answering class calls	2.1
Sep-15-2005	answering class calls	0.9
Sep-16-2005	answering class calls	0.7
Sep-19-2005	class calls	0.4
Sep-20-2005	answering class calls	0.6
Sep-21-2005	answering class calls	0.7
Sep-22-2005	answering class calls	0.1
Sep-29-2005	answering class calls	0.4
Sep-30-2005	answering class calls	0.3
Oct-04-2005	answering class calls	0.1
Oct-05-2005	answering class calls	0.1
Oct-10-2005	answering class call	0.1
Oct-11-2005	answering class calls	0.1
Oct-12-2005	answering class calls	0.2
Oct-13-2005	answering class calls	0.2
Oct-17-2005	answering class calls	0.2
Oct-20-2005	answering class calls	0.1

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Oct-24-2005	answering class calls	0.1	
Oct-31-2005	class call	0.2	
Nov-01-2005	class call	0.1	
	Total:	14.2	\$ 1,420.00
Katherine Ling	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Dec-10-2003	draft cmplt auth letter; copy coclient	0.8	
Feb-11-2004	file new cmplt; draft lien ltrrs; prp summons	1.5	
Feb-12-2004	org binder; docket summons, lien, cmplt, app, civ cov sht; input case info; prep sum; drft doc pres	2.0	
Feb-13-2004	prep summons to be served by sangamon sheriff, call sangamon cty for reqmnt	0.5	
Feb-16-2004	consolidate cmplt and doc pres with two new plaintiffs; prep to file mtn to amend	1.0	
Feb-18-2004	draft rfa	0.8	
Feb-19-2004	call from foster; conf DVI	0.2	
Feb-25-2004	call about service; return summons to Ct	0.3	
Feb-25-2004	prep file amended cmplt; draft summons; prep to serve summons; conf AK2	1.2	
Feb-26-2004	rtm summons to ct	0.2	
Mar-02-2004	conf DVI; prep and reserve summons	0.8	
Mar-03-2004	add 2 plaintiffs to case; memo to kj; reserve summons on FRS	1.0	
Mar-08-2004	mail minute order to oc	0.1	
Mar-09-2004	prep exhibit for reassign; conf DVI	0.2	
Mar-10-2004	prep summons to fil in crt	0.2	
Mar-15-2004	docket mtn to enlarge time, appearance, mtn to extend, jury demand	0.5	
Mar-15-2004	rtm summons to ct	0.2	
Mar-16-2004	update case info; draft 26 f letter; call clerk about hearing	0.6	
Mar-19-2004	draft doc pres mtn	0.6	
Mar-23-2004	docket apperance of d	0.1	
Mar-25-2004	docket mtn to enlarge	0.1	
Mar-26-2004	memo DVI; conf DVI on service	0.2	
Mar-31-2004	prep to file mtn for leave to file 2nd amnd cmplt; conf DAE JOL DVI; docket mtn date	1.5	
Apr-05-2004	conf with oc about appearance	0.1	
Apr-05-2004	edit mtn to withdraw; prep to file	0.3	
Apr-13-2004	service on D; memo dae	0.3	
Apr-16-2004	conf DAE; search for files; compile 3rd amend cmplt	1.3	
Apr-16-2004	docket transfer memo	0.1	
Apr-19-2004	prepare 3rd amend cmplt; draft ltr to clients; update case info; call clnts	2.0	
Apr-20-2004	call clnt to approve amend cmplt	0.5	

Date	Task	Hours		
Apr-21-2004	prep to file 3rd amend cmplt; call 411 to check addresses; memo DAE; prep summons and serve	2.0		
May-03-2004	check docket for order; prep to file class cert; memo dae; prep to file milton mtn for pleading	2.7		
May-04-2004	check docket; get summons issued	0.7		
May-04-2004	docket russo email, 3rd amnd cmplt, milton partial judgment and mtn for class cert	0.4		
May-05-2004	prep summons for service; draft ltr to servers	1.0		
May-06-2004	prep serve summons; conf TLG CL CMC; draft amend not mtn class cert & judgment; docket dates	2.0		
May-10-2004	org binder; docket docs and authorization	1.0		
May-12-2004	file summons to court; docket date	0.2		
May-12-2004	update case info	0.1		
May-13-2004	rtn of svc to court	0.2		
May-14-2004	draft mtn to reassign not mtn; edit; prep to file; conf KP2, file mtn	2.0		
May-19-2004	docket trn of svc x3, mtn to reassign, d amended anser, fax 3rd amnd cmplt to cocsl	0.5		
May-24-2004	docket order for class cert, answer 3rd amend cmplt, mtd 3rd amnd cmplt, appearance; update case inf	0.5		
May-26-2004	prep to file corrected exhibit mtn	1.5		
Jun-02-2004	call judge about hearings	0.1		
Jun-03-2004	docket appearance, casr, mtn enlargmnt time x2; rfa requests x2, answer & aff def, mtn to correct l	0.4		
Jun-04-2004	compil rfa to serve MRS; conf JPM; draft ltr to opcs; reserve exhibit l to discovery on opcs	1.0		
Jun-07-2004	draft mtn to file corrected exhibit l; docket exhibit & 3rd amend cmplt	1.0		
Jun-08-2004	docket rfa req, corrected exh	0.2		
Jun-10-2004	prep rfa resp; conf KJ; draft ltr to clnt x7	1.5		
Jun-16-2004	docket mtn fo rtime, mtn for judgment	0.2		
	Total:	38.4		\$ 3,840.00
Meg Casey	<i>Legal Assist</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-12-2005	case calls	3.0		
Sep-13-2005	client calls	2.0		
Sep-14-2005	class calls	4.0		
Sep-21-2005	class calls	2.0		
	Total:	11.0		\$ 1,100.00
Melissa DeJesus	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Mar-03-2004	Draft notice of motion	0.4		
Apr-13-2004	Draft ltr to client attached filing; conference with KL3	0.4		
May-06-2004	Review and locate docs for DAE at Lamets with JB2, NR & JG3	7.0		
May-07-2004	Draft ltr to client and attached filing	0.3		
Jun-18-2004	Log CASR	0.1		

Date	Task	Hours
Jun-18-2004	Log notice of filing	0.1
Jun-18-2004	Log notice of motion	0.1
Jun-22-2004	Conference with JB2; prepare notice of filing; assemble appendix; conference with JPM	1.5
Jun-22-2004	Log notice of filing	0.1
Jun-23-2004	Draft notice of motion; gather exhibits; conference with JPM	0.6
Jul-16-2004	Log notice of filing	0.1
Aug-05-2004	Conference with SN re: discovery; prepare for oc	0.6
Aug-05-2004	Log P's supplemental response	0.1
Aug-09-2004	Log CASR	0.1
Aug-09-2004	Log P's 2nd discovery request	0.1
Sep-07-2004	Conference with Sn; fax correspondence to oc	0.2
Total:		11.8
		\$ 1,180.00

Nicholas Allchin

Legal Assist

Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00

Jul-27-2005	Find pl's addresses	0.5
Jul-28-2005	Find pl's addresses	0.5
Sep-12-2005	class member calls	3.6
Sep-13-2005	class member calls	4.3
Sep-14-2005	class member calls	2.5
Sep-14-2005	class member calls	2.2
Sep-16-2005	class member calls	1.5
Sep-19-2005	Class member calls	0.9
Sep-20-2005	class member calls	1.1
Sep-21-2005	Class member calls	0.9
Sep-22-2005	cls member calls	0.9
Sep-23-2005	class member calls	0.4
Sep-26-2005	cls mmb calls	0.6
Sep-27-2005	class member calls	0.6
Sep-28-2005	clas member calls	0.3
Sep-29-2005	class calls	0.2
Sep-30-2005	class member calls	0.4
Oct-03-2005	cls member calls	0.5
Oct-04-2005	cls mbr calls	0.4
Oct-11-2005	cls member calls	0.3
Oct-12-2005	cls calls	0.3
Oct-13-2005	class member calls	0.3
Oct-14-2005	class member calls	0.2
Oct-17-2005	cls calls	0.2
Oct-19-2005	class calls	0.4
Oct-24-2005	class calls	0.4
Oct-25-2005	class calls	0.2

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Oct-28-2005	class calls	0.3		
Nov-01-2005	cls calls	0.2		
Nov-16-2005	cls call	0.1		
Dec-01-2005	class calls	0.3		
Dec-01-2005	class calls	0.2		
		Total:	25.7	\$ 2,570.00
Nicole Roth	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Apr-07-2004	doc d's answer to comp	0.1		
Apr-07-2004	doc P's counsel mtn to w/draw	0.1		
Apr-09-2004	doc CASR	0.1		
May-06-2004	doc review	4.6		
May-10-2004	doc summons for new D, doc P's partial sj mtn and class cert mtn	0.2		
		Total:	5.1	\$ 510.00
Nathanael Zoba	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-06-2005	rvw cls memo	0.2		
Sep-13-2005	t/c cls mbrs	3.0		
Sep-14-2005	t/c cls mbrs	2.0		
Sep-15-2005	t/c cls mbrs	1.4		
Sep-16-2005	t/c cls mbrs	3.0		
Sep-19-2005	t/c cls mbrs,	1.5		
Sep-21-2005	t/c cls mbr	0.5		
Sep-22-2005	t/c cls mberm rvw cls mbr date	0.4		
Sep-26-2005	t/c cls mbrs	0.5		
Oct-06-2005	t/c cls mbr	0.2		
Oct-10-2005	t/c cls mbr	0.2		
Oct-12-2005	t/c cls mbrs	0.4		
Dec-02-2005	conf sh re: fee petition	0.4		
Dec-06-2005	rvw dox, conf ja5, jb2, prp final appr. Dox	1.5		
Dec-07-2005	rvw opt out dox, conf jpm, ja5, rvw ct dox re op outs	2.2		
		Total:	17.4	\$ 1,740.00
Sara Knox	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jun-07-2005	prep not of mot and motion to ext deadline for prelim app	1.0		
Jun-08-2005	docket mtn to ext deadl for prelim app	0.1		
Jun-08-2005	fax old notice to Lynn Thorpe, prep fax cov sheet	0.2		
Jun-08-2005	prep amended not of mtn for extn of deadlie. Mail to 3 def, prep fax cov sht and fax	0.6		
Jun-10-2005	circ draft of classnot to partners	0.1		
Jun-14-2005	docekt entry from ct about reassign jdg	0.1		
Jun-17-2005	docket check for mortg pay to briggs	0.1		
Jul-11-2005	docket redwall timerrec for settlmt	0.1		

Date	Task	Hours
Jul-18-2005	prep mtn to enforce settlement for fil, serve on op cl	0.8
Jul-19-2005	prep mtn for prelim app of settlement for filing, app A-N, ex 1-3, serve on op cl	4.5
Jul-20-2005	docket ct date, make add copy of mtn, prep cout copy for J	1.0
Jul-20-2005	docket mtn to enf settle	0.1
Jul-22-2005	docket motion to enf settle	0.1
Jul-25-2005	make copy of mtn for prelim app of sett	0.5
Jul-27-2005	draft 2 cl settle let, mail 17 lets, prep SASE	1.5
Jul-28-2005	send 17 more cl settle let, prep SASE, compile list of all clients involved in settle, search cs inf	1.5
Jul-29-2005	compl list of clients, read over settle tp prep for memo	0.6
Jul-29-2005	docket ct app st reo	0.1
Aug-01-2005	init draft of class memo, rec sign settle, calls with clients	1.0
Aug-02-2005	client call re settle	0.2
Aug-03-2005	collect and record signed sett agr, scan order into pdf	0.2
Aug-04-2005	docket prelim appr order	0.1
Aug-09-2005	rec and record settles signed by cl	0.2
Aug-15-2005	docket entry from ct	0.1
Aug-24-2005	send c. smith docs to debt counsel	0.3
Aug-25-2005	spoke with cl, Paul Lucas re signed settle, resend settle to sign, draft 2nd let, SASE	0.4
Aug-26-2005	update Rosenberg cl info	0.1
Aug-29-2005	fx and ml corresp 3 op cl	0.3
Aug-30-2005	edit class memo	0.4
Aug-31-2005	draft script for class not, edit class memo, record script with JB2	1.8
Sep-01-2005	prep memo and script for meet, edit, conf JPM, record script	1.0
Sep-06-2005	edit memo, conf JPM, distr memo	0.4
Sep-07-2005	phone w/ C Smith, plaintiff, re settle	0.2
Sep-08-2005	phone Paul Lucas re settle sig	0.3
Sep-09-2005	conf JPM class not	0.2
Sep-12-2005	48 class calls	5.0
Sep-13-2005	40 class calls	4.5
Sep-14-2005	28 class calls	3.2
Sep-15-2005	25 class calls	2.8
Sep-16-2005	15 class calls	2.0
Sep-19-2005	20 class calls, type address change, opt-out	3.0
Sep-20-2005	18 class calls, update address changes and opt outs	2.5
Sep-20-2005	fx and ml atty	0.1
Sep-21-2005	17 class calls, update address changes	2.2
Sep-22-2005	return calls, 10 class calls, advise class member who came in, update addresses	1.7

Date	Task	Hours
Sep-23-2005	12 class calls, create excel spreadsheet, update address and opt outs	1.7
Sep-23-2005	docket exclusions	0.1
Sep-26-2005	six settlement calls, correct address changes, record opt-outs	1.0
Sep-27-2005	10 class calls, draft let to class member, email	1.4
Sep-28-2005	4 class calls, address changes/optouts	0.7
Sep-29-2005	5 class calls, address changes/opt-out	0.8
Sep-30-2005	9 class calls, redwall Tower Legal info, ml corresp class member, address changes	1.3
Oct-03-2005	12 class calls, address changes/opt-outs	1.4
Oct-03-2005	docket excl	0.1
Oct-04-2005	10 class calls, address changes/optouts	1.4
Oct-05-2005	7 pot cl calls, address changes/exl	1.0
Oct-06-2005	11 class calls, address changes	1.3
Oct-07-2005	9 class calls	1.1
Oct-10-2005	18 class calls	2.1
Oct-10-2005	docket set ag signed Sher	0.1
Oct-11-2005	9 class calls, address changes	1.3
Oct-13-2005	12 class calls, update address changes	1.5
Oct-14-2005	6 class calls	0.8
Oct-18-2005	address changes/opt-out, 1 class call	0.4
Oct-19-2005	6 class calls, prep address changes/opt-out	0.8
Oct-20-2005	draft let to class member thomson, elliott, mcbride	1.0
Oct-20-2005	draft let to class member vaught, 2 class calls	0.5
Oct-21-2005	six class calls	0.9
Oct-24-2005	six class calls, update address changes/opt-outs	1.0
Oct-25-2005	5 class calls	0.8
Oct-26-2005	3 more class calls	0.4
Oct-26-2005	8 class calls, update address changes/opt-out	1.5
Oct-27-2005	six class calls	0.8
Nov-01-2005	one class call, update address/opt-outs	0.4
Nov-02-2005	10 class calls	1.4
Nov-03-2005	4 class calls	0.5
Nov-03-2005	fx and ml corresp op cl	0.3
Nov-04-2005	7 class calls, update address/optouts	1.0
Nov-04-2005	draft 5 let in resp to class members, prep init compl, sent	1.5
Nov-07-2005	4 class calls, update add/optouts	0.5
Nov-08-2005	6 class calls, update add/optouts	0.9
Nov-09-2005	12 class calls	1.5
Nov-10-2005	update address/optouts	0.3
Nov-11-2005	4 class calls	0.6

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Nov-15-2005	6 class calls, update add/optouts	0.9	
Nov-16-2005	1 class call, conf w/ 2 who came in	0.5	
Nov-16-2005	docket corresp	0.1	
Nov-17-2005	2 class calls	0.3	
Nov-18-2005	11 class calls	1.4	
Nov-23-2005	docket corresp class	0.1	
Nov-28-2005	4 class calls; conf w/ members at ECL&G; update address changes/opt-outs	0.8	
Nov-29-2005	8 class calls; update address changes/opt-outs	1.2	
Dec-01-2005	7 class calls	1.0	
Dec-02-2005	work on fee pet; total case fees and expenses; conf MRT JPM	2.0	
Dec-05-2005	4 class calls, update address changes	0.6	
Dec-08-2005	work on decl for fee pet; total individ hours/case; edit decl	4.0	
	Total:	96.2	\$ 9,620.00

Sarah Nun

Legal Asst

Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00

Dec-30-1899	drafting letter to OC	0.1
Jun-24-2004	preparing and sending documents	1.0
Jun-28-2004	conf jb2 re: filing	0.1
Jun-28-2004	preping docs	0.4
Jun-28-2004	preping p's reply to mtn for judgement	1.2
Jun-29-2004	doc-plaintif's reply in support of mt.	0.1
Jul-01-2004	doc-def's resp to disc	0.1
Jul-01-2004	doc-order	0.1
Jul-02-2004	preparing discovery response	2.0
Jul-13-2004	client letter	0.4
Jul-13-2004	client verification letters	0.2
Jul-15-2004	docket: notice of filing	0.1
Jul-15-2004	drafting letter to oc	0.2
Jul-15-2004	drafting letter to oc	0.3
Jul-15-2004	notice of filing	1.0
Jul-15-2004	Notice of Filing	1.3
Jul-16-2004	drafting letter to oc	0.3
Jul-16-2004	entering discovery interroggs.	1.0
Jul-16-2004	Verification letters	1.0
Jul-19-2004	notice of filing	1.0
Jul-19-2004	notice of motion	1.3
Jul-19-2004	notice of motion, notice of filing	1.0
Jul-21-2004	drafting letter to opposing counsel	0.3
Jul-21-2004	drafting letter to opposing counsel	0.3
Jul-22-2004	docket: D's answer to discovery	0.1

Date	Task	Hours
Jul-22-2004	docket: NES' Answer to P.'s Discovery Requests	0.1
Jul-23-2004	client correspondence	0.4
Jul-23-2004	docket: D's answer to Discovery	0.1
Jul-23-2004	docket: notice of filing	0.2
Jul-23-2004	notice of filing	1.0
Jul-23-2004	summons	1.0
Jul-23-2004	verification letters	0.1
Jul-26-2004	summons to TX	0.5
Jul-27-2004	correspondence with client	0.3
Jul-27-2004	summons	0.2
Jul-28-2004	summons	0.4
Jul-29-2004	discovery responses	0.8
Jul-30-2004	correspondence with opposing counsel	0.2
Jul-30-2004	discovery response	0.5
Aug-02-2004	resubmitting summons	0.5
Aug-04-2004	discovery requests	1.0
Aug-06-2004	drafting letter to OC	0.2
Aug-06-2004	summons	0.3
Aug-09-2004	notice of motion	0.5
Aug-09-2004	summons	0.1
Aug-10-2004	re-notice of motion	0.8
Aug-10-2004	re-notice of mtn	0.3
Aug-11-2004	client verification forms	0.7
Aug-11-2004	summons	0.2
Aug-17-2004	docket: discovery	0.2
Aug-17-2004	docket: notice of filing Mtn to Dismiss	0.4
Aug-17-2004	docket: summons	0.8
Aug-18-2004	docket: notice of filing	0.2
Aug-24-2004	client verification	0.3
Aug-25-2004	docket: ct order	0.1
Aug-25-2004	docket: Discovery	0.1
Aug-25-2004	docket: Status Report	0.1
Aug-25-2004	filing Mtn: conference with JPM	0.1
Aug-26-2004	conf jb2 re: motion excess pages	0.1
Aug-26-2004	drafting letter to oc	0.1
Aug-26-2004	filing	0.4
Aug-26-2004	filing P's Amended Mtn for class cert	2.5
Aug-26-2004	filing response to d's Mtn to Dismiss	1.0
Aug-26-2004	notice of filing	0.7
Aug-27-2004	docket: notice of motion and notice of filing	0.2
Aug-27-2004	docket: updating case info	0.1

Date	Task	Hours
Aug-30-2004	client verification letters	0.4
Aug-30-2004	drafting letter to oc	0.1
Aug-30-2004	summons	0.1
Sep-01-2004	Discovery Response	0.5
Sep-01-2004	Docket: Correspondence with OC	0.1
Sep-01-2004	Docket: Notice of Motion	0.1
Sep-03-2004	Discovery Responses	1.2
Sep-10-2004	Client Verification letters	0.1
Sep-10-2004	Motions to compel	1.5
Sep-10-2004	Preparing Motions to compel	0.5
Sep-13-2004	Filing Motions to Compel	3.0
Sep-14-2004	Drafting letter to OC	0.2
Sep-15-2004	Client verification letters	0.2
Sep-16-2004	Client Verification Letters	0.5
Sep-16-2004	Docket	0.6
Sep-16-2004	processing docs	0.3
Sep-16-2004	Transfer of motions to compel	0.3
Sep-16-2004	verification letters	2.2
Sep-17-2004	client verification letters	0.4
Sep-17-2004	docket: redwall	0.1
Sep-20-2004	drafting letter to oc	0.4
Sep-21-2004	docket	0.2
Sep-22-2004	docket: ct orders	0.3
Sep-22-2004	docket: motions to compel	0.4
Sep-22-2004	notice of hearing, corresp w/ ct	0.5
Sep-22-2004	renotice of mtn to compel	1.4
Sep-24-2004	drafting letter to oc	0.1
Sep-30-2004	docket	0.2
Oct-04-2004	docket	0.4
Oct-05-2004	docket: Ct Order	0.1
Oct-11-2004	discovery responses	2.0
Oct-18-2004	docket: order; managing file	0.4
Oct-19-2004	filing P's Mtn to Withdraw Am Mtn	1.5
Oct-22-2004	Preparing Discovery Responses	0.8
Oct-25-2004	sending out client verification letters	1.0
Oct-26-2004	corresp with client	0.1
Oct-26-2004	corresp with oc	0.2
Oct-26-2004	docket: docs produced by Def.	0.3
Oct-27-2004	client verification	0.1
Oct-28-2004	docket	0.2
Oct-28-2004	docket: Notice of Motion	0.1

Date	Task	Hours
Nov-09-2004	serving discovery requests	0.5
Nov-10-2004	corresp with oc	0.2
Nov-11-2004	docket; discovery requests	0.3
Nov-12-2004	resent foster verification letter	0.4
Nov-23-2004	corresp with C. Foster: resent verification form	0.4
Dec-01-2004	corresp with oc	0.3
Dec-01-2004	mailed and faxed verification letters to oc & referring attny	0.4
Dec-03-2004	Filing P's mtn to substitute D	1.6
Dec-06-2004	Tracking doen discovery doc to resend to OC	0.4
Dec-07-2004	Serving supplemental discovery requests; sending out client verification forms	1.5
Dec-08-2004	Processing client docs for JPM	0.2
Dec-09-2004	Retrieved original client docs corresp will be J. Lamet's office	1.6
Dec-13-2004	Served notice of deposition; Docket	0.9
Dec-30-2004	Corresp w OC re: appearance	0.1
Dec-30-2004	Docket	0.5
Dec-30-2004	Served OC w client verification letter for supplemental responses	0.5
Jan-03-2005	Served OC w Bates nos. ECL&G 186-187	0.4
Jan-04-2005	correspondence with OC re: depositions	0.2
Jan-04-2005	docket	0.2
Jan-10-2005	preparing bate stamped documents	0.2
Jan-11-2005	serving oc with bates: sherman general 1-65	0.4
Jan-13-2005	docket; discovery responses; updating case info	0.2
Feb-07-2005	docket re: settlement discussions	0.4
Feb-08-2005	serving discovery requests	0.8
Feb-10-2005	docket	0.1
Feb-15-2005	docket; discovery; DAE's settlment notes	0.1
Mar-03-2005	preparing documents for DAE	0.4
Mar-07-2005	correspondence with oc	0.3
Mar-09-2005	corresp wwith oc re: discovery and settlement demand	0.3
Mar-09-2005	serving oc with account notes	0.2
Mar-16-2005	DOCKET	0.8
Mar-17-2005	docket	0.1
Mar-18-2005	serving subpoena for documents	0.8
Mar-23-2005	filing and serving notice of settlement	0.8
Mar-24-2005	docket	0.2
Mar-24-2005	drafting sherman plaintiff database	1.0
Mar-29-2005	docketing due dates for productions of documents	0.3
Apr-01-2005	ltrs re: Subpoena for Docs	0.2
Apr-04-2005	corresp and docket re: subpoenas for docs	0.1

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Apr-04-2005	docket: notice of settlement	0.1		
Apr-05-2005	docket: Lein Letters	0.1		
Apr-05-2005	notification of docket entry	0.1		
Apr-05-2005	refaxing withdrawal of subpoena	0.2		
Apr-06-2005	locating Glover Authorization	0.1		
	Total:	74.7		\$ 7,470.00
Scott Whittemore	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-07-2005	read class memo	0.1		
Sep-12-2005	Take 40 class calls	3.9		
Sep-13-2005	Take 66 class calls	4.1		
Sep-14-2005	Take 39 class calls	3.1		
Sep-15-2005	take 22 class calls	2.1		
Sep-16-2005	Take 19 class calls	1.7		
Sep-26-2005	Take 3 class calls	0.2		
Sep-28-2005	Take 3 class calls	0.2		
Sep-29-2005	take 8 class calls	0.6		
Sep-30-2005	Take 4 class calls	0.3		
Oct-03-2005	take 5 class calls	0.3		
Oct-04-2005	Take 9 class calls	0.6		
Oct-06-2005	Take 3 class calls	0.2		
Oct-10-2005	Take 2 class calls	0.2		
Oct-12-2005	Take 3 class class	0.2		
Oct-13-2005	Class Call	0.1		
Oct-24-2005	1 Class call	0.1		
Oct-25-2005	class call	0.1		
Nov-10-2005	Class call	0.1		
Nov-14-2005	3 class calls	0.2		
Nov-15-2005	Class Call	0.1		
	Total:	18.5		\$ 1,850.00
Katalin Forrai	<i>Law Clerk</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 90.00</i>	
		0.0		
May-04-2004	doc review	2.5		
May-05-2004	doc review	2.5		
	Total:	5.0		\$ 450.00
Kathleen Lindqvist	<i>Legal Asst.</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 90.00</i>	
Feb-17-2004	combine 2plaintiffs to complt; draft clnt approv ltrrs; mail	1.2		
May-24-2004	prep and serve discovery; edit discovery	1.2		
	Total:	2.4		\$ 216.00
	Grand Total:	835.1		\$ 148,301.50

BOUDREAU & ASSOC. V. TAMARA DURYGINA

Case Number 11331

Hourly Billings

Prepared Dec 08, 2005

Date	Task	Hours		
Cathleen M. Combs			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
May-04-2004	work on resp to mtd	0.5		
May-06-2004	attendance at mot; ct rpt	1.0		
		Total:	1.5	\$ 637.50
Daniel A. Edelman			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Feb-19-2004	prepare complaint	2.0		
Feb-19-2004	prepare complaint, research re: defendants	2.0		
Mar-23-2004	prepare discovery	1.0		
Apr-11-2004	prepare discovery, class papers	3.0		
May-01-2004	draft response to motion to dismiss Count II	6.0		
May-01-2004	prepare motion for judgment on pleadings and combine with response to motion to dismiss	7.0		
May-03-2004	prepare response to motion to dismiss Ct I	4.0		
May-05-2004	revise response to motion to dismiss count I	2.0		
Feb-07-2005	prepare discovery	0.4		
		Total:	27.4	\$ 11,645.00
James O. Latturmer			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Feb-25-2004	work on complaint	0.3		
May-02-2004	work on motion judgment on the pleadings and in response to MTD; research	1.2		
May-03-2004	research; work on response to MTD	1.4		
May-05-2004	work on response to MTD	0.8		
May-06-2004	work on response to MTD	0.5		
Jun-02-2004	rec and rev alegis discovery responses	1.1		
Jun-03-2004	conf jpm re deflt discovery responses	0.5		
Jun-04-2004	rec and rev alegis response in oposition to motion for judgment on the pleadings; resrch; conf dae	0.7		
Jun-04-2004	rec and reviewed alegis request to produce and interrogs; work on response; conf jpm	0.6		
Jun-08-2004	work on reply in support of motion for judgment on the pleadings	1.2		
Jun-25-2004	WORK ON REPLY RE MOTION FOR JUDLGMENT ON PLEADINGS	1.0		
Jul-08-2004	work on responses to defts objections to discovery responses; conf jpm	1.0		
Jul-27-2004	work on seconded amended complaint; research; conf jpm, dae	0.6		
Mar-02-2005	work on class motion and memo; research	0.6		
Mar-02-2005	work on discovery; conf jpm	0.4		
Mar-15-2005	work on discovery	0.7		
		Total:	12.6	\$ 5,355.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Tara L. Goodwin <i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 385.00</i>
Feb-19-2004	rev. file, check SOL, assign case	0.2
Apr-23-2004	prepare for court on class motion	0.2
Apr-26-2004	court, motion for class cert., docket new deadlines	1.0
May-03-2004	rev. and edit draft of resp. to MTD	0.3
May-04-2004	rev. and edit 2d draft of resp. to MTD	0.3
Sep-22-2004	rev. defs. Responses to our discov.	0.3
Dec-02-2004	conf. W/ JPM	0.3
Mar-02-2005	rev. and edit class brief	0.4
	Total:	3.0
		\$ 1,155.00
Michelle R. Teggelaar <i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 275.00</i>
Jun-07-2004	rev draft brief,resp	0.2
	Total:	0.2
		\$ 55.00
Danita V. Ivory <i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Feb-19-2004	reviewed new case/complaint	0.25
Feb-25-2004	Spoke w/ client	0.2
Apr-02-2004	Reviewed amended compliant/conf. W/ DAE/CMC re: settlement w/ Boud./t/c w/o.c. on Boud. Re: settleme	0.7
Apr-05-2004	Took call from o.c. Manny Newberger re: extension of time to respond	0.2
Apr-09-2004	Settlement letter drafted	0.3
Apr-12-2004	Preparing transfer memo	0.4
	Total:	2.1
		\$ 389.50
Jeremy Monteiro <i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Sep-09-2000	rev reply, conf w/ dae re: response	0.3
Apr-22-2004	Review memo from DVI on case status, draft ltr to counsel requesting 26f conference scheduling.	0.9
Apr-22-2004	To ct on status; checked web for ruling on mtn ext disc; read status report; 6 t/c OC; 1 t/c cl	2.4
Apr-23-2004	review mt. Class certification for 3/26 appearance.	0.2
Apr-28-2004	phone call to client regarding the settlement offer from Boudreau.	0.2
Apr-29-2004	Meet with DAE and TLG to discuss defendants' settlement offer.	0.3
Apr-29-2004	Phone call to client re: defendants settlement offer.	0.1
May-06-2004	26f ltr to counsel.	0.1
May-07-2004	review judges orders re: 26f conference.	0.2
May-14-2004	ltr to client re settlement offer.	0.1
May-25-2004	discuss settlment options w/ DAE.	0.1
May-28-2004	ltr to boud re: settlement proposal.	1.0
Jun-02-2004	review our resp to mtd	0.4
Jun-03-2004	discovery conf w/ jol re alegis' responses	0.9
Jun-03-2004	draft discovery letter to opposing counsel on discovery.	0.9

Date	Task	Hours
Jun-04-2004	draft disc. Ltr to op counsel	0.7
Jun-04-2004	research net worth disclosure	0.2
Jun-07-2004	edit disc. Ltr	0.4
Jun-10-2004	phone call to judge's clerk re: withdrawing motion.	0.1
Jun-14-2004	phone call from op counsel	0.2
Jun-14-2004	phone call from op.cou re: extension of time to answer	0.1
Jun-14-2004	phone call to op counsel re: settlement offer	0.1
Jun-14-2004	rev docs	0.2
Jun-17-2004	phone call from M. Newberger re settlement	0.1
Jun-18-2004	mt to file add'l authority	0.2
Jun-21-2004	edit mt. Add'l authority	0.1
Jun-24-2004	rev settlement agreement w/ CMC	0.2
Jun-28-2004	settlement agreement changes, phone call to client	1.1
Jun-29-2004	disc resp and doc rev	0.9
Jun-29-2004	disc resp.	0.4
Jun-30-2004	edit disc	0.4
Jun-30-2004	edit disc resp	0.1
Jun-30-2004	edit disc resp	0.2
Jul-08-2004	conf w/ JOL re discovery responses, ltr to client, ltr to op counsel	2.5
Jul-09-2004	e-mail op counsel	0.1
Jul-09-2004	ltr to o/c re: protective order	0.1
Jul-12-2004	edit ltr re disc resp	0.2
Jul-12-2004	phone call to op counsel re; 26 f	0.1
Jul-12-2004	prep for 26f conf, 26f conf, draft 26f report	1.8
Jul-14-2004	edit 26f report	0.9
Jul-14-2004	phoen call from court re: motion, phone calls to op counsel in response	0.1
Jul-20-2004	e-mail discovery to op counsel	0.1
Jul-21-2004	rev protective order	0.3
Jul-22-2004	amdn complt	0.7
Jul-22-2004	disc extension ltr	0.1
Jul-23-2004	amd complt	0.6
Jul-23-2004	mt amend complt	0.3
Jul-27-2004	Conf re complaint amending	0.4
Jul-27-2004	draft discovery and rev complaint	1.0
Jul-28-2004	amend complaint	0.2
Jul-28-2004	edit 2nd amd complaint	0.1
Jul-28-2004	edit complaint	0.1
Jul-30-2004	ltr re protective order	0.2
Aug-02-2004	edit am complaint	0.3

Date	Task	Hours
Aug-02-2004	edit discovery	0.7
Aug-02-2004	edit settlement agreement	0.2
Aug-02-2004	phone call from client	0.3
Aug-02-2004	supp disc resp	0.3
Aug-03-2004	doc rev	0.3
Aug-04-2004	doc rev	0.5
Aug-05-2004	doc rev	0.3
Aug-05-2004	phone call to op counsel re settlement	0.2
Aug-06-2004	ltr to Boud re: w/drawing discovery req	0.1
Aug-10-2004	rev am complt for court and court appearance, CASR	1.7
Aug-11-2004	complaint amendment	0.1
Aug-26-2004	protective order ltr	0.1
Aug-26-2004	resp mtd alegis	0.7
Aug-27-2004	rest mtd alegis	1.0
Aug-30-2004	edit resp mtd - alegis	0.3
Aug-30-2004	edit resp mtd alegis	0.7
Aug-31-2004	edit resp mtd and mt leave oversize	0.9
Sep-02-2004	phone calls to/from op counsel for Boudreau	0.2
Sep-03-2004	rev sherman's discovery responses	0.1
Sep-07-2004	disc ltr	0.5
Sep-10-2004	disc ltr	0.1
Sep-15-2004	resp to interrogatories	0.8
Sep-20-2004	phone call from opposing counsel	0.2
Sep-21-2004	draft resp to discovery	0.5
Sep-22-2004	resp to discovery requests	1.0
Sep-22-2004	rev d's supp discovery resp	0.5
Sep-23-2004	document review	0.5
Sep-23-2004	phone call from op counsel	0.1
Sep-24-2004	ltr to op counsel	0.1
Sep-24-2004	mt to dismiss Bound	0.2
Sep-27-2004	ltr and documents to op counsel	0.2
Sep-28-2004	ltr to client/referring atty re: settlement	0.4
Sep-28-2004	ltr to op counsel	0.2
Sep-28-2004	phone call to client	0.1
Sep-29-2004	ltr to op counsel	0.1
Sep-29-2004	phone call to client	0.1
Oct-06-2004	phone call from judge's clerk	0.1
Oct-20-2004	rev order	0.3
Oct-21-2004	conf w/ dae	0.2
Oct-21-2004	doc review	0.3
Oct-27-2004	draft am. Class mt/memo	1.0

Date	Task	Hours
Oct-27-2004	draft third set of discovery	0.6
Oct-28-2004	phone call from op counsel re: dismiss	0.1
Nov-02-2004	phone call to op counsel	0.1
Nov-12-2004	phone call to op counsel	0.1
Nov-15-2004	edit am mt class cert	0.6
Nov-15-2004	rev complt, court appearance re: status, CASR	1.3
Nov-19-2004	not dep, rev disc	0.4
Nov-22-2004	draft disc. Responses.	0.7
Nov-23-2004	rev disco	0.3
Nov-24-2004	draft 26a disclosures	0.2
Nov-29-2004	EDIT 26A DISCLOSURES	0.1
Nov-30-2004	edit class memo/motion	0.4
Nov-30-2004	phone call from op counsel	0.1
Nov-30-2004	rev disc res[p	0.4
Dec-01-2004	compel mt, 4th set disc	0.9
Dec-01-2004	dep notice	0.1
Dec-02-2004	draft rfa's	1.3
Dec-02-2004	mt compel	0.7
Dec-06-2004	am notice of dep	0.1
Dec-29-2004	resp to discovery requests	2.2
Jan-04-2005	am class motion/memo	0.4
Jan-04-2005	phone call to client	0.1
Jan-04-2005	rev discovery	0.5
Jan-05-2005	court appearance for status	1.2
Jan-05-2005	phone call from client	0.1
Jan-05-2005	phone call from op counsel	0.1
Jan-10-2005	draft supp disc	0.1
Jan-11-2005	phone call from client, memo to DAE re: deps	0.3
Jan-13-2005	rev file, discovery, corr to op counsel	0.3
Jan-14-2005	phoen call to client	0.1
Jan-17-2005	ltr to op counsel re: deps	0.2
Feb-02-2005	conf w/ jol re deps	0.3
Feb-02-2005	mt class cert research	1.7
Feb-24-2005	court app, casr	0.8
Feb-27-2005	30b6 deps, conf w/ jol re deps	1.0
Feb-27-2005	ltr to op counsel/doc review	0.3
Feb-27-2005	rev class cert mtr	0.7
Feb-28-2005	rev class mt	0.2
Mar-01-2005	edit mt class cert	0.8
Mar-02-2005	rev mt class cert/edit	1.0
Mar-03-2005	edit mt class cert	0.8

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Mar-08-2005	disc ltr	0.2		
Mar-09-2005	phone call to client	0.1		
Mar-10-2005	phone call to client	0.1		
Mar-11-2005	rev mt class cert, edit mt	0.4		
Mar-14-2005	p call	0.1		
Mar-16-2005	research re: subpoena	0.2		
Mar-16-2005	subpoena acct agreements	0.2		
Mar-16-2005	subpoena act agreements	0.2		
Mar-17-2005	SUBPOENA	0.1		
Apr-05-2005	ct app for status and casr	1.5		
May-04-2005	court app and casr	0.8		
May-25-2005	ct app for status on settlement and casr	0.9		
Jun-27-2005	ct app on status, casr	0.6		
Jul-28-2005	casr	0.1		
Jul-28-2005	ct app on status	0.5		
	Total:	67.9	\$ 12,901.00	
Jeffrey Becker	<i>Legal Asst.</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 105.00</i>	
Aug-05-2004	Conf SN and MD re: disc responses	0.2		
Sep-29-2004	Conf SN re: co-csl check	0.1		
	Total:	0.3	\$ 31.50	
Andrew Komanski	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jul-13-2004	4pm federal filing	0.6		
	Total:	0.6	\$ 60.00	
Brian Kolbus	<i>legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jun-02-2004	Conf KL3; search racer for exhibit to res to mtd count I	0.8		
	Total:	0.8	\$ 80.00	
Emily Kulpa	<i>Legal Assit</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jun-28-2005	docket CASR from 6/27/05	0.1		
	Total:	0.1	\$ 10.00	
Jared Andersen	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Mar-15-2004	prep for two summons for service, prep UPS	0.6		
Apr-06-2004	help draft not of motion; motion for leave	0.3		
Apr-26-2004	dct not of motion; dct crt minute order	0.2		
Apr-28-2004	prep exhibits for discov; copies; fax mail op cnsl	0.6		
May-04-2005	dct crt app status	0.1		
	Total:	1.8	\$ 180.00	
Jeff Griffin	<i>Leagal Asst.</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-29-2004	mtd def richard boudreau	0.1		
Jun-30-2005	log min entry	0.1		
	Total:	0.2	\$ 20.00	
Katherine Ling	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Feb-20-2004	draft cmplt approv lttr; prep cmplt	0.5	
Feb-23-2004	draft clnt approv lttr; compile cmplt; to client	0.4	
Feb-24-2004	prep JOL approval; to ref atty	0.2	
Mar-09-2004	call lamet about clnt; draft closing lttr	0.3	
Mar-11-2004	conf DVI, JOL; prep to file cmplt	0.5	
Mar-12-2004	prep to file cmplt; lien, civ cov sht, summons, appearance	1.0	
Mar-16-2004	call about summons service	0.2	
Mar-17-2004	docket cert receipt of lien	0.1	
Mar-18-2004	org documents for filing; prep summons to file in ct; update case info; draft rfa	2.0	
Mar-23-2004	docket order on initial status	0.1	
Mar-24-2004	draft rfa	1.0	
Mar-26-2004	conf and memo to DVI on service	0.2	
Mar-26-2004	docket summons; doc pres mtn	0.6	
Apr-02-2004	prep file amend cmplt; fax lamet about earlier lttr	1.0	
Apr-07-2004	prep to file mtn to withdraw	0.2	
Apr-09-2004	notify oc mtn to withdraw was granted; fax and mail settlement lttr	0.3	
Apr-16-2004	docket transfer memo	0.1	
Apr-16-2004	prep to file mtn class cert; research opcsi; docket mtn for extension; conf TLG NR DAE	2.0	
Apr-19-2004	draft class papers	0.8	
Apr-23-2004	fax to opcsi	0.1	
Apr-28-2004	prep and serve discovery	0.8	
Apr-30-2004	call from op csl about mtn; docket enlargement	0.3	
May-04-2004	docket order on status, class cert, mtn enlargement; input case info; docket casr order mtd	0.7	
May-05-2004	prep to file mtn for judgment; call clerk; file mtn for judgment; conf JPM; prep for hearing	2.0	
May-06-2004	check rfa requests; fax opcsi	0.2	
May-10-2004	edit resp to MTD count I	0.3	
May-13-2004	edit resp mtd count I	0.3	
May-14-2004	fax confirm sht to opcsi	0.1	
May-17-2004	mail lttr	0.1	
Jun-02-2004	compile p's resp to mtd count I; conf BK; research exhibit	2.0	
Jun-03-2004	docket casr, resp, appearance, resp to count 1	0.3	
Jun-07-2004	docket p's frst rfa requests; fax lttr to opcsi	0.3	
Jun-10-2004	fax opcsi	0.1	
	Total:	19.1	\$ 1,910.00
Melissa DeJesus	<i>Legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Apr-13-2004	Draft ltr to client attached filing; conference with KL3	0.4	
Jun-21-2004	Log minute order of 06/15/04	0.1	

Date	Task	Hours	
Jun-21-2004	Log minute order of 06/16/04	0.1	
Jun-21-2004	Log notice of filing	0.1	
Jun-21-2004	Log notice of motion	0.1	
Jun-22-2004	Conference with JB2 re: notice of filing	0.1	
Jun-22-2004	Conference with JB2; prepare notice of motion; assemble of appendix; conference with JPM	0.6	
Jun-23-2004	Conference with JPM; gather doc; prepare for court; change notice of motion	0.4	
Jun-23-2004	Log and docket notice of motion	0.1	
Jul-16-2004	Log minute order	0.1	
Jul-16-2004	Log notice of motion	0.1	
Aug-05-2004	Conference with JPM; prepare response; sent to oc	0.6	
Aug-05-2004	Log P's response to D's discovery	0.1	
Aug-09-2004	Log notice of motion; P's motion to file 2nd amended complaint	0.1	
Aug-09-2004	Log P's 2nd discovery request	0.1	
Sep-07-2004	Conference with Sn; fax correspondence to oc	0.3	
	Total:	3.4	\$ 340.00
Nicole Roth	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Apr-07-2004	doc amend comp	0.1	
Apr-09-2004	doc P counsel w/draw mtn	0.1	
Apr-14-2004	doc appearance and update case info	0.2	
Apr-14-2004	doc min order	0.1	
May-10-2004	doc CASR, P's mtn for judgment and min order	0.2	
	Total:	0.7	\$ 70.00
Sara Knox	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Jun-02-2005	filing	0.1	
Jul-29-2005	docket ct app st rep	0.1	
	Total:	0.2	\$ 20.00
Sarah Nun	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Jun-28-2004	doc-d's answer to complt.	0.1	
Jun-29-2004	preping interrogs, discovery requests	0.9	
Jun-30-2004	preping discovery	1.6	
Jul-01-2004	doc-d's request for admissions	0.1	
Jul-01-2004	doc-def. resp to disc.	0.1	
Jul-01-2004	doc-plaintiff's resp to disc	0.1	
Jul-08-2004	disc. Resp. verification letters	0.4	
Jul-09-2004	drafting ltr to oc	0.2	
Jul-12-2004	corresp with oc	0.2	
Jul-14-2004	notice of filing	0.5	
Jul-22-2004	docket: notice of filing, status hearing	0.1	
Jul-22-2004	drafting letter to opposing counsel	0.3	

Date	Task	Hours
Jul-27-2004	Preparing documents for Deposition	0.2
Jul-30-2004	correspondence with opposing counsel	0.2
Aug-04-2004	discovery requests	0.5
Aug-04-2004	notice of motion	0.8
Aug-05-2004	client conference	0.4
Aug-06-2004	drafting letter to OC	0.2
Aug-10-2004	correspondence with OC	0.3
Aug-12-2004	notice of filing	1.1
Aug-16-2004	verification letters	0.5
Aug-23-2004	filing mtn for leave to amend complaint	1.0
Aug-26-2004	docket: discovery	0.1
Aug-26-2004	drafting letter to oc	0.1
Aug-30-2004	drafting letter to oc	0.1
Aug-30-2004	Preparing Discovery Response	0.4
Aug-31-2004	filing: Motion for Leave--Oversized Brief	1.0
Aug-31-2004	notice of motion	0.3
Sep-01-2004	Docket: Notice of Motion	0.1
Sep-10-2004	drafting letter to OC	0.1
Sep-16-2004	Docket: Notice of Filing	0.2
Sep-21-2004	preparing documents for JPM	0.1
Sep-24-2004	drafting letter to oc	0.1
Sep-27-2004	discovery	0.2
Sep-28-2004	filing motion to dismiss	0.5
Sep-28-2004	filing motion to dismiss	0.6
Sep-29-2004	drafting letter to OC	0.2
Sep-29-2004	preparing settlement checks	0.3
Oct-11-2004	docket: Settlement	0.3
Oct-12-2004	docket: CT Order	0.1
Oct-12-2004	rescheduling status hearing	0.2
Oct-12-2004	rescheduling status hearing.	0.1
Oct-13-2004	docket: ct order	0.1
Oct-21-2004	corresp with oc	0.2
Oct-27-2004	docket: CT order	0.2
Oct-28-2004	docket: discovery	0.2
Oct-28-2004	preparing discovery responses; docket	0.5
Nov-02-2004	preparing discovery responses	0.6
Nov-24-2004	serving notice of dep.	0.4
Nov-30-2004	serving P's initial disclosures	0.4
Dec-02-2004	client verification of discovery answers mailed to oc.	0.2
Dec-02-2004	corresp with oc re: agreement	0.3
Dec-02-2004	serving 4th Disc. Requests	0.4

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Dec-07-2004	Scheduling Ct rpt Serving amended notice of Dep of R. Roderick	1.0	
Dec-08-2004	Docket	0.1	
Dec-30-2004	Served discovery responses; sent client verification letter	0.5	
Jan-04-2005	docket	0.4	
Jan-05-2005	docket: discovery responses	0.2	
Jan-05-2005	serving oc with signed client verification for P's resp. to Def's fourth set of interrogatories	0.2	
Jan-11-2005	serving oc with bates: sherman general 1-65	0.3	
Jan-13-2005	docket	0.2	
Feb-28-2005	corresp with oc	0.3	
Mar-02-2005	circulating mtn for class cert and memorandum to partners for approval	0.4	
Mar-03-2005	serving deposition notice	0.4	
Mar-07-2005	docketing dep of durygina	0.2	
Mar-09-2005	preparing for filing def's reply in support of mtn to dismiss complaint	0.3	
Mar-09-2005	serving oc with account notes	0.2	
Mar-11-2005	filing p's amended mtn for class cert and memo in support	1.0	
Mar-14-2005	conf with JPM; updating case info	0.2	
Mar-17-2005	docket	0.5	
Mar-18-2005	serving subpoena for documents	0.8	
Mar-23-2005	filing and serving notice of settlement	0.8	
Apr-04-2005	docket	0.2	
Apr-04-2005	docket: notice of settlement	0.1	
Apr-06-2005	docket: CASR	0.1	
Apr-13-2005	docket: notification of docket entry	0.1	
	<u>Total:</u>	26.9	\$ 2,690.00
	<u>Grand Total:</u>	168.8	\$ 37,549.50

VAN RU CREDIT CORP V. ROY MADLOCK

Case Number 11908

Hourly Billings

Prepared Dec 08, 2005

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Cathleen M. Combs			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Dec-06-2004	work on reply brief	0.5		
Dec-07-2004	work on reply brief	1.0		
Feb-21-2005	moot	1.0		
Feb-22-2005	moot	1.0		
Feb-23-2005	moot	1.0		
Feb-28-2005	moot	1.0		
Feb-28-2005	moot	1.0		
		Total:	6.5	\$ 2,762.50
Daniel A. Edelman			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
May-08-2004	prepare complaint, research re: defendant	2.0		
Sep-05-2004	work on brief	6.0		
Sep-06-2004	work on brief	6.0		
Dec-06-2004	work on appellate reply brief	8.0		
Dec-07-2004	work on brief	3.0		
Dec-09-2004	revise reply brief	1.0		
Dec-10-2004	revise reply brief on appeal	1.0		
Feb-20-2005	prepare for argument	1.0		
Feb-22-2005	prepare for argument	1.0		
Feb-27-2005	prepare for argument	1.0		
Mar-01-2005	argument, preparation	4.0		
		Total:	34.0	\$ 14,450.00
James O. Lattuner			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
May-12-2004	work on complaint OK	0.2		
Jun-23-2004	rec and rev van ru MTD; research	0.5		
Jul-12-2004	work on response to mtd; research; conf dae, jpm	1.2		
Jul-19-2004	rec and rev MTD opinion; conf dae, mrt, jpm; research	0.4		
Jul-26-2004	work on notice of appeal; conf jpm, dae	0.2		
Feb-21-2005	moot dae	0.7		
Feb-23-2005	moot dae	0.6		
Feb-28-2005	moot dae	0.8		
		Total:	4.6	\$ 1,955.00
Tara L. Goodwin			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 385.00</i>
May-10-2004	rev. file, check SOL, assign case	0.2		
Sep-03-2004	rev. and edit brief	0.3		
Sep-07-2004	rev. and edit 7th cir. Brief	1.0		
		Total:	1.5	\$ 577.50
Michelle R. Teggelaar			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 275.00</i>

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Sep-03-2004	rev app brief	0.3	
	Total:	0.3	\$ 82.50
Francis R. Greene	<i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 225.00</i>
May-10-2004	reviewed letter to clientf	0.1	
May-11-2004	t/c client	0.1	
May-12-2004	t/c client re: approval of complaint	0.1	
May-13-2004	relatedness motion	2.1	
May-13-2004	revisions to motion to reassign	0.3	
	Total:	2.7	\$ 607.50
Jeremy Monteiro	<i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
May-21-2004	review J. Shadur's 26F rules	0.1	
Jun-14-2004	ltr to van ru re: deadline to have 26f conf	0.2	
Jun-23-2004	edit mt to reassign	0.2	
Jun-23-2004	phone call to op counsel	0.1	
Jun-25-2004	draft 26f report proposal	0.6	
Jun-29-2004	phone call to op counsel re 26fconf	0.2	
Jun-30-2004	court app and CASR	1.1	
Jul-12-2004	conf w/ dae/jol re resp to mtd, expert, phone call to expert	0.2	
Jul-12-2004	resp mtd	2.4	
Jul-13-2004	Resp mtd	1.6	
Jul-14-2004	edit resp mtd	0.5	
Jul-19-2004	rev. decision, conf. W/ JOL	0.4	
Jul-26-2004	Edit appeal	0.5	
Jul-26-2004	Edit notice of appeal	0.1	
Aug-02-2004	contact shanahan	0.2	
Aug-03-2004	Fax to shanahan and phone call to op counsel	0.3	
Aug-27-2004	rev appeal rules	0.1	
Aug-30-2004	draft appeal brief	4.5	
Aug-31-2004	draft appeal brief	1.9	
Sep-01-2004	edit appeal brief	2.6	
Sep-02-2004	edit appeal brief	3.5	
Sep-03-2004	edit brief	1.1	
Sep-07-2004	edit appeal brief	2.4	
Nov-10-2004	ltr to client	0.1	
Nov-16-2004	phone call from client	0.1	
Nov-24-2004	phone call to client	0.1	
Dec-15-2004	rev reply brief, edit	1.9	
Dec-17-2004	edit reply	0.8	
Feb-10-2005	review mt to strike, conf w/ dae	0.4	
Feb-11-2005	draft resp to mt to strike	3.4	
Feb-14-2005	review response to mt to strike	0.5	

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Feb-21-2005	moot for oral arg	0.6		
Feb-22-2005	oral argument -moot w/ dae, cmc, jol	0.8		
Feb-23-2005	moot for oral arg	0.4		
Mar-15-2005	edit ltr to 7th cir	0.2		
Mar-15-2005	supp authority	0.5		
Apr-27-2005	notice of settlement	0.2		
May-31-2005	draft status on settlement	0.5		
Jun-23-2005	status report	0.2		
Aug-09-2005	draft status re settlement	0.2		
Aug-11-2005	edit status report	0.2		
Nov-15-2005	notice re settlement	0.2		
			Total:	36.1 \$ 6,859.00
Jeffrey Becker	<i>Legal Asst.</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 105.00</i>	
Apr-13-2004	Conf DAE, FRG re: motion; KP2 re: para issue; rule 4 waiver; note from DAE	0.3		
Aug-05-2004	Conf SN, JPM; pick up transcript info form; prepare transcript form; note to filer; call to Ct Rptr	0.9		
Sep-07-2004	Confs SN, JPM re: appellate brief; assist in prep of TOA; chgs to draft; work on short appendix	3.2		
Sep-08-2004	Confs DAE, MRT, JPM; call to 7th Cir; add changes to form; prep for filing	0.6		
Dec-15-2004	Confs MS3 re: reply brief; formatting problems; chgs to brief	0.9		
Dec-20-2004	Chgs to brief; confs JPM, DAE; chgs to TOA; prep brief for filing; call to 7th Cir; file in 7th Cir	3.6		
Dec-21-2004	Confs DAE; call 7th Cir re: Rule 31e; prep doc; prep disks; docket, redwall briefs + motion for ext	0.6		
Dec-23-2005	Prep letter to client	0.2		
			Total:	10.3 \$ 1,081.50
Brian Kolbus	<i>legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-07-2004	Conf JB2, SN; assist prep brief	1.3		
			Total:	1.3 \$ 130.00
Jared Andersen	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-07-2004	filed app brief in fed crt	0.6		
Apr-28-2005	prep docs for crt filing; serv o.c. dct	0.7		
May-04-2005	dct order	0.1		
			Total:	1.4 \$ 140.00
Jeff Griffin	<i>Legal Asst.</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jul-26-2004	file in ct	0.7		
Jul-29-2004	call roy	0.1		
Jun-30-2005	to dae, to ct of appeals	0.6		
			Total:	1.4 \$ 140.00
Katherine Ling	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jun-01-2004	proof of service	0.1		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Jun-03-2004	docket proof of service and order	0.2	
Jun-15-2004	notify opcs1 of order	0.1	
Jun-17-2004	fax order	0.1	
	Total:	0.5	\$ 50.00
Katarina Pamucar	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
May-10-2004	draft client letter	0.4	
May-11-2004	draft appearance sheet, civil cv sheet, summons, lien letter, research D's address	1.4	
May-12-2004	prep docs for filing, copies, get partn signnatures	0.8	
May-13-2004	create logging, case info, sort docs	0.5	
May-13-2004	draft waiver of ser of summns, letter, mail via certified mail, docket returned date, conf JB2, copy	0.6	
May-14-2004	copies	0.2	
May-17-2004	conf KL3, docket return summ date	0.2	
	Total:	4.1	\$ 410.00
Melissa DeJesus	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Jun-21-2004	Lgo appearance; update case info	0.2	
Sep-07-2004	Save on disk via PDF; confernece with SN and JB2	0.7	
Sep-08-2004	Log 26.1 disclosure statement	0.1	
	Total:	1.0	\$ 100.00
Megan Schici	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Dec-13-2004	conf JB2 re: memo re: generating tables, receive eggs from JB2	0.5	
Dec-15-2004	generate tables, confs JB2, formatting issue	3.0	
Dec-16-2004	work on generating tables	2.0	
	Total:	5.5	\$ 550.00
Nicholas Allchin	<i>Legal Assist</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Mar-29-2005	Dkt	0.1	
	Total:	0.1	\$ 10.00
Sara Knox	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
May-31-2005	Prep not of filing for appel ct	0.4	
Jun-02-2005	filing	0.1	
Jun-08-2005	docket order- status of settlement by 7/1/05	0.1	
Jul-11-2005	docket let from ct	0.1	
Jul-25-2005	docket not re stat of settle	0.1	
Aug-11-2005	prep not of fil, serve on op cl f and ml	0.6	
Aug-15-2005	docket not re stat sett	0.1	
Oct-10-2005	docket order from ct	0.1	
Nov-15-2005	prep not for filing, file	0.3	
Nov-23-2005	docket not re stat set	0.1	
	Total:	2.0	\$ 200.00
Sarah Nun	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Jul-01-2004	doc-ct. appearance status report	0.1	
Jul-01-2004	doc-notice of mtn	0.1	
Jul-01-2004	doc-plaintif resp. to disc.	0.1	
Jul-14-2004	notice of filing P's Resp. mtn to dismiss	0.5	
Jul-14-2004	notice of filing: P's resp to mtn to dismiss	0.8	
Jul-22-2004	docket: judgment on a civil case	0.1	
Jul-26-2004	Notice of Appeal	0.8	
Jul-26-2004	notice of filing	1.5	
Jul-26-2004	notice of filing	0.5	
Aug-05-2004	appeal transcript response	0.3	
Aug-25-2004	docket: letter from court	0.1	
Aug-25-2004	docket: transcript info sheet	0.1	
Aug-25-2004	docket: transcript sheet	0.1	
Aug-25-2004	notice of appeal	0.1	
Aug-31-2004	preparing documents	0.4	
Sep-03-2004	Preparing and Filing Appellate Brief	6.0	
Sep-03-2004	Preparing Appeal for filing	1.3	
Sep-09-2004	Drafting letter to OC	0.2	
Sep-10-2004	Correspondence with client	0.2	
Sep-10-2004	Docket: Appellant Brief	0.1	
Oct-12-2004	docket: Notice of Motion	0.1	
Oct-13-2004	docket: ct order	0.1	
Nov-10-2004	corresp with client	0.2	
Nov-11-2004	docket; notice of motion	0.1	
Feb-08-2005	confirming schedulin of oral argument	0.3	
Feb-10-2005	confirming DAE's appearance for oral argument on 3/1/05	0.2	
Feb-14-2005	preparing and filing response to mtn to strike	1.0	
Feb-15-2005	docket: P's Responses to D's Mtn to Strike	0.1	
Feb-16-2005	preparing docs for DAE	0.3	
Feb-18-2005	preparing docs for DAE	0.3	
Mar-15-2005	filing ltr in 7th circuit	0.4	
Mar-15-2005	filing ltr with memo and order in the 7th circuit app ct.	1.0	
Mar-17-2005	docket	0.3	
Mar-22-2005	DOCKET	0.1	
Mar-22-2005	filing appellant's mtn to stay	0.6	
Apr-05-2005	docket: Ct order	0.1	
	Total:	18.6	\$ 1,860.00
	Grand Total:	131.9	\$ 31,965.50

SHERMAN ACQUISITION V. PAUL BLAIR, ERIKA WEPNER

Case Number 12426

Hourly Billings

Prepared Dec 08, 2005

Date	Task	Hours		
Cathleen M. Combs				
	<i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>	
Aug-25-2004	work on mtd	0.5		
Aug-26-2004	work on resp to mtd	0.5		
Sep-21-2004	work on resp to mtd	0.5		
		Total:	1.5	\$ 637.50
Daniel A. Edelman				
	<i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>	
Jul-09-2004	Research re: claim, prepare complaint	7.0		
Aug-26-2004	prepare response to motion to dismiss	6.0		
Aug-28-2004	work on response to motion to dismiss	4.0		
Aug-30-2004	revise response to motion to dismiss, prepare class motion, prepare discovery	4.0		
Sep-18-2004	work on response to debt collectors' motion to dismiss	5.0		
Sep-19-2004	work on response to collectors' motion to dismiss	7.0		
Nov-21-2004	prepare motion to cite additional authority	1.0		
Dec-02-2004	court appearance	1.0		
Dec-09-2004	court appearance	1.0		
Feb-07-2005	prepare discovery	0.4		
		Total:	36.4	\$ 15,470.00
James O. Latturmer				
	<i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>	
Jul-09-2004	work on complaint; conf dae; OK	0.5		
Jul-12-2004	work on complaint OK	0.2		
Aug-26-2004	research; work on response to Sherman MTD; conf dae	1.8		
Sep-21-2004	work on response to VRS, ASG, and CMS motions to dismiss	0.4		
Nov-19-2004	rec and rev court's mtd decision; conf dae	0.3		
Jan-26-2005	prep for motion and status on 1-27; conf cmc	0.8		
Jan-27-2005	appear on motion to consolidate	1.2		
		Total:	5.2	\$ 2,210.00
Tara L. Goodwin				
	<i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 385.00</i>	
Aug-26-2004	rev. draft of resp. to MTD	0.3		
Jan-20-2005	court, status call, docket new date, prep.	1.3		
		Total:	1.6	\$ 616.00
Al Hofeld Jr.				
	<i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 225.00</i>	
Dec-02-2004	Read JDB's memo and read mtn for addit authority to prepare to cover ct appearance	0.7		
		Total:	0.7	\$ 157.50
Derek Rieman				
	<i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>	
Jan-27-2005	Draft CASR	0.2		
Jan-27-2005	Motion to Reassign hearing	1.0		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Jan-27-2005	Overall case review in prer for morning hearing	0.6	
Mar-16-2005	o/c call; review file	0.3	
Mar-17-2005	o/c call, meeting w/ MRT	0.3	
Mar-21-2005	o/c call re: discovery	0.1	
Apr-28-2005	prep for status; hearing; CASR	0.8	
	Total:	3.3	\$ 627.00
John Blythin	<i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Dec-13-2004	review MTD decision	0.5	
Jan-12-2005	changes to motion to consolidate	1.0	
	Total:	1.5	\$ 285.00
Jeremy Monteiro	<i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Dec-09-2004	blair app	0.4	
	Total:	0.4	\$ 76.00
Andrea Burrell	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Nov-16-2004	prepare discovery, mail, fax	0.8	
Nov-18-2004	log, file	0.1	
Nov-19-2004	mtn to file additional authority	0.3	
Nov-22-2004	mail, fax	0.4	
Nov-22-2004	prepare mtn to file	1.0	
Nov-23-2004	doc to DAE, copy	0.1	
Nov-24-2004	clt copies	0.5	
Nov-29-2004	courtesy copy	0.3	
Nov-30-2004	log, file, dkt	0.2	
Dec-02-2004	file mtn, mail, fax	1.4	
Dec-02-2004	re-fax x2	0.4	
Dec-03-2004	client copies (mail)	0.3	
Dec-06-2004	log, file	0.1	
Dec-08-2004	log, fil	0.1	
Dec-14-2004	lgo, file	0.2	
Dec-15-2004	copy	0.2	
Dec-15-2004	find opinion	0.1	
Dec-17-2004	log, file	0.2	
Jan-05-2005	prepare mtn	2.0	
Jan-05-2005	prepare mtn to designate relatedness	0.4	
Jan-06-2005	log, file	0.1	
Jan-14-2005	log, file, redwall	0.2	
Jan-18-2005	file mtn to reassign	0.4	
Jan-18-2005	mail, fax	0.6	
Jan-19-2005	clt copy	0.3	
Jan-19-2005	copy, log, file	0.4	
Jan-19-2005	docket	0.1	

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Jan-20-2005	fax p.2 of mtn to reassign	0.3		
Jan-20-2005	log, file, change case info	0.2		
Jan-25-2005	contact o/c	0.4		
Jan-27-2005	log, fiel	0.1		
Jan-27-2005	log, file	0.1		
Jan-31-2005	log, file	0.1		
Jan-31-2005	log, file	0.1		
Feb-21-2005	log, file	0.1		
Mar-17-2005	log, file	0.3		
Mar-18-2005	log,file	0.1		
Mar-22-2005		0.0		
Mar-23-2005	log, file	0.2		
Mar-25-2005	log, file	0.1		
Mar-28-2005	update case info	0.4		
May-03-2005	log, file	0.1		
May-03-2005	log, file	0.1		
	Total:	13.9	\$ 1,390.00	
Andrew Komanski	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jul-20-2004	service of summons	0.5		
	Total:	0.5	\$ 50.00	
Alec Smith	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Dec-10-2004	pick up Blair vs. Sherman mem op & order @ fed ct	0.4		
Dec-10-2004	pick up Blair/Sherman mem op & order @ Fed Ct	0.4		
	Total:	0.8	\$ 80.00	
Jeff Griffin	<i>Leagal Asst.</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-01-2004	hand deliver docs	0.4		
	Total:	0.4	\$ 40.00	
Meg Casey	<i>Legal Assist</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-06-2005	dkt st app status rep	0.1		
	Total:	0.1	\$ 10.00	
Melissa DeJesus	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jul-12-2004	Assemble complaint	0.4		
Jul-12-2004	Draft three client approval ltr attached complaint	0.6		
Jul-14-2004	Went through file folder; review docs	0.4		
Jul-16-2004	Check request; conference with JDB; made changes to complaint	0.5		
Jul-19-2004	Check req; conference with JDB	0.1		
Jul-19-2004	Draft atty app; summons; civil cover sheet; lien ltr; prepare for court	0.8		
Jul-20-2004	Convert docs into a binder; creat logging and case info	0.6		
Jul-20-2004	Log return of service	0.1		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Jul-20-2004	Made copies of summons for court	0.2	
Jul-29-2004	Get info for DAE; conference with JDB; memo to DAE	0.2	
Aug-02-2004	Log return of service of summons	0.1	
Aug-02-2004	Prepare summons for court	0.1	
Aug-05-2004	Log appearance; update case info	0.2	
Aug-06-2004	Log notice of motion	0.1	
Aug-10-2004	Log return of service of summons	0.1	
Aug-12-2004	Log appearance; update case info	0.1	
Aug-12-2004	Log notice of motion	0.1	
Aug-13-2004	Log appearance; update case info	0.1	
Aug-16-2004	Log minute order	0.1	
Aug-24-2004	Log appearance; update casse info	0.1	
Aug-25-2004	Log notice of motion	0.1	
Aug-26-2004	Log notice of motion	0.1	
Aug-27-2004	Log notice of motion	0.1	
Aug-30-2004	Conf with JDB; compile class cert and memo; draft notice of motion; prep for court; send out	0.7	
Aug-30-2004	Docket motion	0.1	
Aug-30-2004	Draft notice of filing; conference with JDB; compile doc; prepare for court; send out	0.6	
Aug-30-2004	Log docket text	0.1	
Aug-30-2004	Log notice of filing;	0.1	
Aug-30-2004	Log notice of motion	0.1	
Sep-01-2004	Conference with JDB re: 26(f); draft 26(f)	0.6	
Sep-01-2004	Conference with JG3 re: motion deliver to the judge	0.1	
Sep-02-2004	conference with JDB re: class cert and memo	0.1	
Sep-02-2004	Draft notice of motion; conference with JDB; prepare for court; sent to oc	0.5	
Sep-02-2004	Log D's Rule 68 offer	0.1	
Sep-03-2004	Log appearance	0.1	
Sep-08-2004	Log D's motion to dismiss	0.1	
Sep-08-2004	Log minute order	0.1	
Sep-10-2004	Log minute order	0.1	
Sep-13-2004	Log notice of filing	0.1	
Sep-21-2004	Log file stamped summons	0.1	
Sep-22-2004	Log notice of filing	0.1	
Oct-14-2004	Log notice of filing	0.1	
Oct-15-2004	Log notice of filing	0.1	
Oct-18-2004	Log noitce of filing	0.1	
	Total:	9.4	\$ 940.00
Sara Knox	<i>Legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Aug-30-2005	docket minute entry	0.1	

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
		<u>Total:</u>	0.1 \$ 10.00
Sarah Nun	<i>Legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Feb-15-2005	preparing docs for JOL	0.4	
Mar-23-2005	filing and serving notice of settlement	0.8	
Apr-04-2005	docket: notice of settlement	0.1	
		<u>Total:</u>	1.3 \$ 130.00
		<u>Grand Total:</u>	77.1 \$ 22,729.00

MRS ASSOCIATES/SHERMAN ACQUISITION V. LOUISA MISTRETТА

Case Number 12596

Hourly Billings

Prepared Dec 08, 2005

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>		<u>Hours</u>	
Daniel A. Edelman		<i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Oct-18-2004	prepare complaint		2.0	
Nov-13-2004	prepare discovey		1.0	
Feb-07-2005	prepare discovery		0.4	
		Total:	3.4	\$ 1,445.00
James O. Lattuner		<i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Oct-19-2004	work on complaint; conf dae OK		0.3	
Feb-15-2005	review of file and discovery; work on new discovery		3.0	
Feb-22-2005	Rec and rev SGP answeres to requests to admit		0.2	
		Total:	3.5	\$ 1,487.50
Michelle R. Teggelaar		<i>Partner</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 275.00</i>
Aug-27-2004	review and assign		0.2	
Oct-18-2004	rev cmplt/resp dae		0.3	
Nov-08-2004	reassign to jpm, inst to LS and JDB		0.3	
		Total:	0.8	\$ 220.00
Jeremy Monteiro		<i>Associate</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Nov-12-2004	draft discovery requests		0.6	
Nov-30-2004	mt substitute		0.4	
Dec-01-2004	am complt - sherman		0.2	
Dec-09-2004	phone call to op counsel		0.1	
Dec-15-2004	phone call from op counsel		0.1	
Dec-16-2004	cout app mt to substitute		1.0	
Dec-16-2004	phone call from op counsel		0.1	
Dec-21-2004	draft initial status report		0.8	
Dec-31-2004	phone call from op counsel		0.3	
Jan-06-2005	edit status report, rev discovery requests, ltr to judge's clerk		0.9	
Jan-06-2005	ph ca from op counsel		0.1	
Jan-06-2005	phone call to op counsel		0.1	
Jan-12-2005	draft 26a disclosures, doc review for disclosures		0.8	
Jan-12-2005	e-mail op counsel		0.1	
Jan-12-2005	rev file, court app and status report		1.3	
Feb-08-2005	rev disc responses - req. for admission		0.4	
Feb-09-2005	draft disc ltr		0.2	
Feb-10-2005	e-mail op counsel re discovery		0.1	
Feb-10-2005	resp to e-mail re disc ext		0.1	
Feb-18-2005	doc review		0.3	
Feb-18-2005	draft disc resp		0.4	

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Feb-21-2005	draft disc resp, draft amend complt	1.7		
Feb-21-2005	phone call to client	0.1		
Feb-22-2005	court app for status	1.1		
Feb-22-2005	research re: sub class rep	0.4		
Feb-22-2005	rev complaint	0.2		
Feb-23-2005	amd complt	0.3		
Feb-23-2005	research	0.8		
Feb-28-2005	conf w/ hap re suggestion of death	0.1		
Mar-01-2005	edit motion	0.2		
Mar-10-2005	rev mts, ct app on mt for leave to am and mt sug death	1.2		
Mar-15-2005	ct prep, ct app for status, ct app status ct	2.1		
May-11-2005	phone call to op csl	0.1		
May-11-2005	phone call to op csl	0.1		
May-12-2005	court app status report	0.1		
May-12-2005	ct app for status	1.2		
Jul-27-2005	resp to op csl re ct app	0.1		
Jul-28-2005	casr	0.1		
Jul-28-2005	ct app for status	0.7		
Jul-28-2005	rev file	0.4		
	Total:	19.4		\$ 3,686.00
Andrea Burrell	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Nov-11-2004	file summonses in ct, give to Nun	0.3		
Nov-16-2004	check case info	0.1		
Nov-16-2004	log, file	0.1		
Jan-25-2005	log, file	0.1		
	Total:	0.6		\$ 60.00
Melissa DeJesus	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Oct-20-2004	Create logging and case info; convert doc into binder	0.5		
Oct-20-2004	Draft atty app; summons; civil cover sheet; lien ltr; check req; prepare for court	0.7		
Oct-21-2004	Draft DAE appearance; send lien ltr to defendant	0.3		
Oct-21-2004	Draft ltr to client attached complaint; research processor; check req; draft ltr send out summons	0.8		
Oct-22-2004	Log DAE appearance	0.1		
Nov-02-2004	Log file stamped summons	0.1		
	Total:	2.5		\$ 250.00
Nathanael Zoba	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Oct-19-2004	dft apprance, cvl cvr sht, 3 smns, conf bk2	1.6		
	Total:	1.6		\$ 160.00
Sara Knox	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jun-02-2005	filing	0.1		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Jun-02-2005	filing	0.1		
Jul-20-2005	docket entry from ct re stat hear	0.1		
Jul-29-2005	docket ct app st rep	0.1		
Aug-04-2005	dokcet entry from ct, case dismiss	0.1		
	Total:	0.5		\$ 50.00
Sarah Nun	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Nov-10-2004	Preparing attny appearance filing	0.4		
Nov-11-2004	filing attny appearance	0.3		
Nov-11-2004	summons	0.3		
Nov-12-2004	docket; appearances; updating case info	0.2		
Nov-16-2004	checking on status of summons being served	0.2		
Nov-16-2004	updating case info	0.1		
Nov-17-2004	checking with server re: status of summons	0.2		
Nov-18-2004	filing summons	0.2		
Dec-03-2004	Filing mtn for leave to file amended cmplt	1.3		
Dec-30-2004	Corresp w OC re: appearance	0.1		
Jan-06-2005	corresp with oc re: notice of filing	0.3		
Jan-07-2005	filing parties initial status report	1.5		
Jan-07-2005	serving plaintiff's first set of discovery requests	0.8		
Jan-12-2005	preparing docs for JPM	0.2		
Jan-13-2005	docket	0.4		
Jan-24-2005	serving oc veith plaintiff's initial disclosures	0.4		
Feb-08-2005	serving discovery requests	0.8		
Feb-10-2005	corresp with oc	0.2		
Feb-10-2005	docket	0.1		
Feb-10-2005	preparing discovery responses	0.5		
Feb-15-2005	preparing docs for JOL	0.4		
Feb-15-2005	preparing docs for JOL	0.1		
Mar-01-2005	filing mtn to suggest death of record and mtn for leave to amend complaint	1.5		
Mar-14-2005	filing 2nd amended complaint	1.0		
Mar-15-2005	corresp with oc	0.2		
Mar-23-2005	filing and serving notice of settlement	0.8		
Mar-29-2005	docket	0.2		
Mar-29-2005	docket	0.3		
Apr-04-2005	docket: notice of settlement	0.1		
	Total:	13.1		\$ 1,310.00
	Grand Total:	45.4		\$ 8,668.50

SHERMAN ACQUISITIONS V JULIE RHODES

Case Number	13386	Hourly Billings	Prepared Dec 08, 2005
<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>		<u>Hours</u>
Daniel A. Edelman		<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Nov-02-2004	prepare counterclaim		3.0
Feb-07-2005	prepare discovey		0.3
	Total:		3.3
			\$ 1,402.50
James O. Lattuner		<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Nov-04-2004	work on counter claim		0.4
	Total:		0.4
			\$ 170.00
Michelle R. Teggelaar		<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 275.00</i>
Nov-03-2004	review and assign		0.2
	Total:		0.2
			\$ 55.00
Curtis Warner		<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Sep-21-2005	rev. case appearance memo from JPM		0.1
Sep-22-2005	app on cont. status		0.7
	Total:		0.8
			\$ 152.00
Jeremy Monteiro		<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Nov-05-2004	conf w/ sn re filing of counterclaim		0.5
Nov-05-2004	edit/rev. complaint		0.2
Nov-05-2004	phone call to client re complaint approval		0.3
Nov-08-2004	draft mt to transfer to chancery		0.3
Nov-22-2004	mt dismiss/transfer court app		1.1
Nov-23-2004	phone call from client		0.1
Dec-09-2004	phone call to op counsel		0.1
Dec-16-2004	edit discovery		0.7
Dec-28-2004	phone call to op counsel		0.1
Dec-29-2004	phone call from op counsel		0.1
Dec-29-2004	resp to affirm defs		2.1
Jan-04-2005	phone call to op counsel		0.1
Jan-05-2005	court app for status		1.5
Jan-11-2005	phone call from judge's clerk		0.1
Jan-19-2005	rev discovery		0.4
Jan-19-2005	rev discovery responses		0.2
Jan-20-2005	disc ltr		0.5
Jan-20-2005	edit/amend motion to dismiss		0.4
Jan-24-2005	phone call from op counsel		0.1
Jan-26-2005	draft discovery ltr		0.1
Jan-27-2005	rev discovery		0.3
Jan-28-2005	draft motion to compel		0.9
Jan-31-2005	court appearance on D's mtd		1.2

Date	Task	Hours		
Jan-31-2005	ltr to blatt	0.2		
Feb-01-2005	phone call to op counsel, update mt to compel	0.2		
Feb-08-2005	phone call to op counsel	0.1		
Mar-01-2005	edit mt to compel	0.2		
Mar-03-2005	p/c to op coun and mt to compel	0.2		
Mar-04-2005	ltr to op counsel	0.1		
Mar-08-2005	reply in support of mtd	0.2		
Mar-09-2005	conf w/ tlg re mtd	0.1		
Mar-09-2005	disc ltr	0.2		
Mar-14-2005	ltr to judge - courtesy	0.2		
Mar-15-2005	phone call from op csl	0.1		
Mar-16-2005	ct appearance on mt to compel	0.8		
Mar-23-2005	court app, CASR, ltr to client and op csl	1.4		
Mar-24-2005	p call from client	0.1		
Jun-22-2005	ct app and casr	1.1		
Sep-22-2005	casr	0.2		
		Total:	16.8	\$ 3,192.00
Brian Kolbus	<i>legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Nov-05-2004	Assist SN re: muni sums	0.7		
		Total:	0.7	\$ 70.00
Jeff Griffin	<i>Legal Asst.</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Dec-06-2004	file in state	0.5		
Jun-22-2005	drft ltr, ml w order to oc	0.3		
		Total:	0.8	\$ 80.00
Melissa DeJesus	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Nov-17-2004	Assist SN in docket of case	0.3		
		Total:	0.3	\$ 30.00
Nicholas Allchin	<i>Legal Assist</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jul-11-2005	Fiel CASR	0.1		
		Total:	0.1	\$ 10.00
Sara Knox	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-22-2005	ml op cl	0.2		
Oct-03-2005	docket CASR	0.1		
		Total:	0.3	\$ 30.00
Sarah Nun	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Nov-03-2004	preparing counterclaim for attny approval	0.9		
Nov-04-2004	preparing counterclaim for filing	0.4		
Nov-05-2004	preparing counterclaim, mtn to dismiss, appearance	5.5		
Nov-09-2004	serving summons	1.5		
Nov-10-2004	conf w/ BK re: filing appearance	0.2		
Nov-11-2004	docket; notice of motion	0.1		

Date	Task	Hours
Nov-16-2004	filing summons	0.2
Nov-16-2004	preparing summons for filing	0.4
Dec-06-2004	Filing/serving R's 1st disc req	1.0
Dec-07-2004	Docket mtn	0.2
Dec-09-2004	Check on status of summons	0.8
Dec-09-2004	Sent filed summons to OC	0.2
Dec-14-2004	Preparing docs for OC	0.4
Dec-15-2004	Prepared docs for OC	0.3
Dec-21-2004	Filing	1.0
Dec-22-2004	Checked wCt re: transfer of case; Docket	0.3
Jan-03-2005	Corresp w OC re: extension of time to answer P's discovery requests	0.4
Jan-03-2005	TLG granted Justin Penn 2 week extension to respond to discovery requests	0.3
Jan-04-2005	filing and serving Rhodes' Response to Counter-Def's Affirmative Defenses	0.6
Jan-04-2005	Prepared response to affirmative defenses for filing	0.4
Jan-05-2005	correspondence with oc re: ct order	0.3
Jan-05-2005	docket	0.3
Jan-05-2005	Preparing Response to Affirmative Defenses for Filing	0.4
Jan-12-2005	preparing courtesy copies of counterclaim and def's mtn to dismiss for J. Kinnaird	0.4
Jan-20-2005	confirming judge assignment with court	0.3
Jan-20-2005	docket: court order	0.1
Jan-20-2005	docket: notice of filing	0.1
Jan-21-2005	corresp with oc re: discovery	0.2
Jan-21-2005	filing notice of motion: defendant's amended mtn to dismiss complaint	1.0
Jan-21-2005	serving notice of filing on oc; docket	0.4
Jan-24-2005	docket	0.1
Jan-26-2005	corresp with oc	0.1
Feb-01-2005	corresp with oc re: court order of 1/31/05	0.3
Feb-08-2005	serving discovery requests	0.8
Feb-10-2005	docket	0.1
Feb-14-2005	docket: notice of filing rhodes' additional disc requests	0.1
Feb-16-2005	docket: ct order; CASR	0.4
Mar-04-2005	corresp with oc	0.2
Mar-07-2005	correspondence with client re: mtn to dismiss	0.1
Mar-08-2005	filing def-counterplaintiff's mtn to compel	1.0
Mar-10-2005	filing reply in support of mtn to dismiss	0.5
Mar-11-2005	correspondence with oc re: discovery	0.2
Mar-14-2005	serving judge agran with def's amended mtn to dismiss and def's reply in support of amended mtn to d	0.5

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Mar-15-2005	docket	0.5	
Mar-16-2005	preparing docs for DAE	0.3	
Mar-23-2005	corresp with oc & client re: order of 3.23.05	0.3	
Apr-04-2005	docket CASR & CT Order of 3/23/05	0.1	
Apr-05-2005	docket; lien letters	0.1	
	<u>Total:</u>	24.3	\$ 2,430.00
	<u>Grand Total:</u>	48.0	\$ 7,621.50

COLLECTCORP V RICHARD CWIENKALA

Case Number 13418

Hourly Billings

Prepared Dec 08, 2005

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Daniel A. Edelman			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Nov-25-2004	prepare complaint	2.0		
		Total:	2.0	\$ 850.00
Michelle R. Teggelaar			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 275.00</i>
Nov-30-2004	review and assign	0.2		
Jan-21-2005	review file/inst ab	0.3		
Feb-10-2005	rev cmplt, memo dbr	0.2		
May-25-2005	discov docket issue/reopen file/adv dbr, jpm, ccw	0.3		
		Total:	1.0	\$ 275.00
Derek Rieman			<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Feb-02-2005	review file and prep letter	0.2		
Feb-03-2005	client phone call	0.3		
Feb-10-2005	prepcmplt to be filed	0.3		
Feb-21-2005	draft amended consoilidated complaint	1.0		
Mar-17-2005	prep for status hearing; hearing	0.8		
Apr-07-2005	o/c call re Sherman Settlement	0.1		
Apr-12-2005	conf w/ JPM re: Sherman settlement; review Sherman settlement; o/c e-mail	0.6		
Apr-25-2005	review settlement agreement; o/c call	0.6		
May-06-2005	o/c e-mail re: settlement agreement	0.1		
May-31-2005	conf w/ JPM re Sherman settlement; e-mail o/c	0.2		
May-31-2005	motion to reinstate	0.6		
Jul-18-2005	o/c e-mail re: Sherman settlement	0.1		
Apr-27-2008	prep for status hearing; Conf w/ JPM; Hearing; CARS; o/c call	1.5		
		Total:	6.4	\$ 1,216.00
Jeremy Monteiro			<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Feb-17-2005	conf w/ dae and dbr re relatedness mt	0.1		
Sep-28-2005	mt relief from judgmetn	0.5		
Oct-05-2005	casr	0.1		
Oct-05-2005	ct app - mt relief from jud	1.5		
		Total:	2.2	\$ 418.00
Andrea Burrell			<i>Legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Jan-24-2005	clt approval ltr.	0.5		
Jan-25-2005	mail clt approval ltr.	0.4		
Feb-10-2005	cmplt to MRT for approval	0.1		
Feb-10-2005	file complaint	0.2		
Feb-11-2005	file complaint	0.5		
Feb-17-2005	clt copy	0.3		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Feb-17-2005	file summons	0.2		
Feb-17-2005	serve summons	0.5		
Feb-21-2005	make binder	0.8		
Mar-02-2005	lien	0.6		
Mar-04-2005	lgo, file	0.1		
Mar-17-2005	log, file	0.1		
Mar-18-2005	log, file	0.1		
Mar-29-2005	log, file	0.1		
Apr-13-2005	log, file	0.1		
May-31-2005	file mtn	0.7		
May-31-2005	mail, fax to oc	0.3		
Jun-02-2005	log, file	0.1		
		Total:	5.7	\$ 570.00
Meg Casey	<i>Legal Assist</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-27-2005	dkt judgment	0.1		
Oct-11-2005	dkt not of dkt entry	0.1		
		Total:	0.2	\$ 20.00
Sara Knox	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Sep-29-2005	draft app, prep mtn and not of mtn, e-file, copy JPM	0.8		
Oct-03-2005	dcket mtn for relief	0.1		
Oct-10-2005	docket CASR	0.1		
		Total:	1.0	\$ 100.00
Sarah Nun	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Mar-25-2005	filing notice of settlement	0.7		
		Total:	0.7	\$ 70.00
		Grand Total:	19.2	\$ 3,519.00

VANRU CREDIT CORP V. ROBERTA CURTIS

Case Number	12546	Hourly Billings	Prepared Dec 08, 2005
<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>		<u>Hours</u>
Daniel A. Edelman		<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Nov-30-2004	prepare complaint		2.0
Dec-19-2004	prepare discovery		1.0
		Total:	3.0
			\$ 1,275.00
James O. Latturmer		<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Nov-30-2004	researach; review of complaint; conf mrt		0.4
		Total:	0.4
			\$ 170.00
Tara L. Goodwin		<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 385.00</i>
Mar-15-2005	conf. CCW re: discovery, rev. joint status report		0.4
		Total:	0.4
			\$ 154.00
Curtis Warner		<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Mar-10-2005	Case status update conf. W/ JSC.		0.1
Mar-15-2005	Call from D's counsel re: 26f conf.		0.1
Mar-15-2005	conf. W/ TLG re 26f conf.		0.1
Mar-15-2005	Review complaint, case file draft Joint Status Report.		1.2
Apr-28-2005	call from pl.		0.2
Apr-29-2005	conf. W/ JPM re: Sherman set.		0.1
Apr-29-2005	stat. Conf.		1.2
Apr-29-2005	travel to/fr. Ct		0.2
Apr-29-2005	update conf. W/ TLG		0.1
May-02-2005	conf. W/ JPM transfer case to JPM		0.1
		Total:	3.4
			\$ 646.00
Jeremy Monteiro		<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Apr-02-2005	rev file		0.2
Jun-17-2005	casr		0.1
Jun-17-2005	ct app on status		1.1
Oct-05-2005	p call to op csl		0.1
		Total:	1.5
			\$ 285.00
Jennifer Cichowski		<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Dec-07-2004	Receieved client message; t/c in response to discuss cmplt - - client approved; disc cmplt w/ MRT.		0.5
Dec-09-2004	Received and reviewed client corresp; t/c in response.		0.3
Feb-07-2005	Reviewed and responded to o.c. email re: answer and appearance.		0.2
Feb-24-2005	Reviewed file; l/m for Van Ru counsel re: status.		0.2
Feb-25-2005	T/c from o.c. re: case status.		0.1
Feb-28-2005	Received and responded to o.c. email re: appearance and answer.		0.2
Mar-01-2005	Reviewed file; drafted transitional memo.		0.2

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Mar-04-2005	Received and reviewed Ct order re: d's motion for leave to file answer.	0.1	
Mar-04-2005	Reviewed and signed motion to withdraw appearance.	0.1	
	Total:	1.9	\$ 361.00
Jeffrey Becker	<i>Legal Asst.</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 105.00</i>	
Apr-14-2005	Confs BH, CCW; prep log file; rev docs	0.6	
	Total:	0.6	\$ 63.00
Benita Harris	<i>Legal Assist</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Apr-12-2005	Docket fax re: P's discovery requests	0.1	
Apr-14-2005	Docket order; P's appearance; P's discov requests; D's 26 (a)(1)'s; settlmt; stat hearing	0.2	
Apr-14-2005	Prep docs to create a binder	0.5	
	Total:	0.8	\$ 80.00
Jared Andersen	<i>Legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Mar-03-2005	enter case number in to system	0.1	
Mar-04-2005	prep not of mtn; mtn JSC withdraw app; prep docs for filing; serv oc; dct	0.7	
	Total:	0.8	\$ 80.00
Megan Schici	<i>Legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Dec-01-2004	draft clt app ltr, create case info	0.4	
Dec-07-2004	prep summons, civil cov, appearance, lien and complaint for filing	1.2	
Dec-08-2004	review filed complaint, sort in file	0.2	
Dec-09-2004	client and ref atty letter, mail filed complaint	0.3	
Jan-10-2005	prep summons and return of service to return to ct	0.2	
	Total:	2.3	\$ 230.00
Nicholas Allchin	<i>Legal Assist</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jul-11-2005	File order	0.1	
	Total:	0.1	\$ 10.00
Sara Knox	<i>Legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jun-14-2005	file app for JPM	0.4	
Jun-15-2005	serve JPM app on opcl	0.2	
Oct-10-2005	docket minute entry	0.1	
	Total:	0.7	\$ 70.00
Sarah Nun	<i>Legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Mar-25-2005	filing notice of settlement	0.7	
	Total:	0.7	\$ 70.00
Douglas Conway	<i>Intake Coord</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 90.00</i>	
Nov-29-2004	spoke w/ ct., will travel to Chicago	0.1	
	Total:	0.1	\$ 9.00
	Grand Total:	16.7	\$ 3,503.00

FMA ALLIANCE, LTD V. ROSEMARY CLAYBON

Case Number 12000

Hourly Billings

Prepared Dec 08, 2005

Date	Task	Hours		
Cathleen M. Combs			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Jan-26-2005	dep prep & dep	2.0		
			Total:	2.0
				\$ 850.00
Daniel A. Edelman			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
May-29-2004	prepare complaint	2.0		
Jul-24-2004	prepare complaint	2.0		
Nov-15-2004	review class papers	0.5		
Mar-07-2005	revise class reply	1.0		
			Total:	5.5
				\$ 2,337.50
James O. Lattuner			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 425.00</i>
Jun-11-2004	work on complaint; conf dae, c,mc OK	0.4		
Jul-27-2004	work on complaint; conf dae; OK	0.3		
			Total:	0.7
				\$ 297.50
Michelle R. Teggelaar			<i>Partner</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 275.00</i>
Jun-01-2004	rev file/letter, disc w/dae	0.2		
Jul-26-2004	rev file/resp to dae	0.1		
Nov-01-2004	review and coment on draft discovery, rev revised discov and ok	0.6		
Jan-05-2005	review tes draft discov responses	0.4		
Mar-07-2005	review class reply and comment	0.4		
			Total:	1.7
				\$ 467.50
Heather A. Piccirilli			<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Nov-09-2004	Conf TES re: ct app	0.2		
Nov-10-2004	Ct; CASR- initial status; read TES memo; prepare for ct	2.0		
			Total:	2.2
				\$ 418.00
Thomas Soule			<i>Associate</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 190.00</i>
Sep-10-2004	Client approval call, assist JG3 in filing of complaint	0.6		
Oct-05-2004	Memo from DAE, call to OC re class size / net worth	0.1		
Oct-15-2004	Revisions to rfa/class papers, drafting of 26f plan, e-mail to OC	1.2		
Oct-29-2004	Calls to OC re 26f, instructions to JG3 re discovery plan and discovery	0.3		
Nov-09-2004	Conf HAP re coverage of hearing; memo to HAP re status of case	0.5		
Nov-10-2004	Conf HAP re court appearance	0.1		
Nov-15-2004	Revisions to class motion/memo, conf DAE	1.5		
Nov-22-2004	26a1 disclosures	0.8		
Dec-01-2004	Court appearance CASR	1.1		
Dec-09-2004	Calls OC re extension, letter to OC re same	0.4		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Jan-04-2005	Work on discovery responses; calls to client, drafting responses	4.0		
Jan-07-2005	Edit and mail discovery responses to client for approval (JG3 out); received doc from client	0.5		
Jan-13-2005	Further review of responses; call to client re deposition	0.2		
Jan-13-2005	Receipt of responses to discovery, review.	0.2		
Jan-14-2005	Review of discovery docs with JPM (re Sherman), conf DAE re same	0.2		
Jan-14-2005	Set up dep, draft dep prep for client, review case with CMC (incl class motion error)	0.6		
Jan-26-2005	Dep prep and dep of Rosemary Claybon	2.1		
Feb-03-2005	Call to OC re status, search for file	0.2		
Feb-09-2005	Review of case, drafting of motion for amendment to class motion	1.2		
Feb-15-2005	Call to OC and Court re motions relating to class motion	0.2		
Mar-04-2005	Drafting of class reply	5.0		
Mar-07-2005	Work on class reply, confs DAE, call to OC re discovery on class files	4.5		
Mar-08-2005	Call to M Smith re discovery dispute (class files), pursuant to 37.2	0.2		
Mar-08-2005	Proofread of reply brief	1.2		
Mar-14-2005	E-mail from OC re settlement status	0.1		
Mar-28-2005	Conf CMC/JOL re depositions, call to OC, notice up depositions; conf DAE re J Lamet dep, call Lamet	1.0		
Apr-12-2005	Call from OC re reset of deposition	0.1		
Apr-14-2005	Conf DAE/JPM re class definition (Sherman), calls to/from OC, e-mails to OC re same, call to client	0.7		
May-02-2005	Call to OC re status of Sherman settlement	0.1		
May-26-2005	Conf JPM re status of settlement; call to OC re status, drafting motion for reassignment, filing	1.2		
May-27-2005	Court appearance, CASR	2.0		
Jun-22-2005	Objection to report; conf DAE (no objection)	0.3		
Jun-22-2005	Receipt of order from Keys, conf CMC re same	0.2		
Jun-23-2005	Call from OC re class certification	0.1		
Jul-29-2005	Conf JPM re additional plaintiffs	0.1		
		Total:	32.8	\$ 6,232.00
Jeffrey Becker	<i>Legal Asst.</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 105.00</i>	
Nov-02-2004	Conf JG3 re: proposed discovery plan	0.1		
Nov-09-2004	Confs JG3, TES re: proposed disc plan and filing of doc	0.2		
Nov-10-2004	Conf JG3 re: 26(a)(1) disclosures	0.1		
		Total:	0.4	\$ 42.00
Alec Smith	<i>Legal Asst</i>		<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Mar-04-2005	f/m doc for JG3	0.2		
Mar-08-2005	f/m doc for JG3	0.2		

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
Apr-14-2005	file @ Federal Court, f/m doc	0.4	
Apr-15-2005	file 4/14 fax	0.1	
	Total:	0.9	\$ 90.00
Brian Kolbus	<i>legal Asst</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jan-07-2005	Conf TES; prep/draft ltr re: discovery res, verify	0.6	
	Total:	0.6	\$ 60.00
Emily Kulpa	<i>Legal Assit</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jun-03-2005	dct notice of motion and notice of filing	0.1	
	Total:	0.1	\$ 10.00
Jeff Griffin	<i>Leagal Asst.</i>	<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>	
Jul-28-2004	clnt app ltr, complnt, ml, case info	0.4	
Aug-14-2004	organize file, create log	0.7	
Sep-10-2004	assemble case, cert ml	1.5	
Sep-15-2004	find svr, ltr	0.3	
Sep-16-2004	ret of serv on FMA management	0.1	
Sep-20-2004	log summons	0.1	
Sep-23-2004	log d appearance, update case info	0.2	
Sep-27-2004	log appearances	0.1	
Oct-06-2004	log ct order, log appearance of Michael Smith, update case info	0.2	
Oct-07-2004	log d;s ans to p;s complaint	0.1	
Oct-13-2004	cls memo, discovery, cls mot	0.7	
Oct-21-2004	log ecf registration form	0.1	
Nov-01-2004	review discovery, to mrt, fx prosposed disc plan, fx cvr, conf JB2, ml/fx discovery	1.3	
Nov-02-2004	call crt, check websight, conf mrt	0.5	
Nov-04-2004	log d's 26a1 disc	0.1	
Nov-16-2004	ml, drft ltr to clnt	0.1	
Nov-17-2004	revise clsmot, log casr, find info, prep filing	0.9	
Nov-18-2004	log d;s interrogs and requests to p	0.1	
Nov-18-2004	log, drft ltr, ml	0.2	
Nov-22-2004	fx, ml, log	0.3	
Nov-23-2004	fix log	0.1	
Dec-06-2004	log casr	0.1	
Dec-07-2004	log not dep	0.1	
Dec-07-2004	log redwall d's resp to p's 1 prod req's	0.1	
Dec-09-2004	lot ct order	0.1	
Jan-05-2005	find letters from all cases for resp to d's doc req's	0.8	
Jan-11-2005	redact docs, assembles, p's resps	1.0	
Jan-12-2005	copy docs, ml docs	0.5	
Jan-14-2005	log, log verification, prep dep, prep docs	0.5	

<u>Date</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>		
Jan-17-2005	log d's resp to p's 1st disc req's	0.1		
Jan-19-2005	log d's resps to p;s 2nd set disc, log supp doc in resp to ps req;s for prod, log unop mt to ex brf	0.2		
Jan-20-2005	drft ltr, ml dep prep docs	0.1		
Jan-20-2005	drft ltr/ml, send dep prep docs to	0.3		
Feb-02-2005	dep notes, log ltr to claybon	0.1		
Feb-09-2005	prep cls cert mot, not mot, fx/cvr, fx, ml log,	1.9		
Feb-10-2005	corresp, docket	0.2		
Feb-17-2005	mot for class cert, not filing to dae, prep doc, crsp mot for clay, m clint, lg d's unop mot,	0.5		
Feb-22-2005	log order	0.1		
Feb-24-2005	log ct order	0.1		
Feb-28-2005	log tes dep notes	0.1		
Mar-08-2005	rev docs, no file, prep filing	1.3		
Mar-09-2005	log p reply, drft ltr,	0.2		
Mar-28-2005	conf TES, not dep, chk docket, copy redwall, ml/fx oc, ,log	0.7		
Apr-15-2005	call cancel dep palmer	0.1		
Apr-20-2005	corresp	0.1		
Apr-25-2005	log mot for stay	0.1		
Apr-26-2005	drft ltr	0.2		
May-10-2005	tes memo to file	0.1		
May-26-2005	not mot chk page, fx ml oc, copy tes	0.5		
May-31-2005	re not mot call clerk to ct	1.6		
		Total:	19.9	\$ 1,990.00
Jason Kunowski	<i>Legal Asst</i>			<i>Hourly Rate = \$ 100.00</i>
Jun-10-2005	Docketing	0.1		
Jun-22-2005	docketing	0.1		
		Total:	0.2	\$ 20.00
		Grand Total:	67.0	\$ 12,814.50