

Irene K. Dymkar
 53 West Jackson, Suite 733
 Chicago, IL 60604-3462
 (312) 345-0123

ATTORNEY SERVICES FOR BAKERS (Daniel H. Regenscheit)

Baker, et al. v. Ghidotti, et al, 11 C 4197

Date	Service provided	Time expended (in hours)
6/15/2016	Discuss opening appellate brief with Irene Dymkar	0.50
6/20/2017	Edit and revise opening brief	3.10
6/20/2017	Draft table of authorities	0.40
6/20/2017	Edit and revise opening brief	2.60
6/20/2017	Draft table of contents and headings	0.70
6/20/2017	Edit and revise opening brief	0.70
10/20/2016	Initial draft reply brief	1.10
10/24/2016	Confer with Irene Dymkar re: reply brief	0.10
10/24/2016	Legal Research: preclusion; motions for reconsideration	1.20
10/26/2016	Proofread, revise, and edit reply draft	1.00
10/26/2016	Proofread, revise, and edit reply brief	3.10
10/26/2017	Draft table of contents and headings	0.30
10/26/2017	Draft table of authorities	0.70
10/26/2017	Proofread, revise, and edit reply brief	1.30
	TOTAL LAW CLERK HOURS	16.8
	TOTAL FEES AT \$125/HOUR	\$ 2,100.00
11/28/2016	Prepare and review documents for oral argument	0.20
5/10/2017	Review appellate decision	0.70
5/17/2017	Confer with Irene Dymkar re: appeal, settlement offer	0.10
5/23/2017	Call court deputy re: remand and scheduling	0.10
5/23/2017	Draft timesheets and review time records for Irene Dymkar	0.80
6/2/2017	Research pre- and post-judgment interest calculations	0.80
6/9/2017	Confer with Irene Dymkar re: memorandum	0.10
6/9/2017	Research post-appeal fee memorandum	1.30
6/9/2017	Draft post-appeal memorandum (initial draft)	1.40
7/12/2017	Confer with attorney re: settlement, fee petition	0.30
7/13/2017	Court, including travel	0.80
7/13/2017	Recalculation of interest for settlement demand	0.10
	TOTAL ATTORNEY HOURS	6.7
	TOTAL FEES AT \$230/HOUR	\$ 1,541.00