

EXHIBIT E
Detailed Attorney's Fees of
Whitfield McGann & Ketterman

2/10/2014
9:00 AM

WHITFIELD, MCGANN & KETTERMAN
Slip Listing

Page 30

Slip ID	Dates and Time	Posting Status	Description	ATTORNEY Activity Case Reference	Units DNB Time Est. Time Variance	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
476867	11/6/2013	TIME	Billed	DFW Billable CTF-C./N9237/18819	0.20 0.00 0.00	175.00 T@7	35.00
			Reviewed email sent by the U.S. Dist. Court for the Northern Dist. of Illinois regarding the ORDER of Dismissal Signed by the Honorable Joan H. Lefkow on 11/4/2013		0.00		
476869	11/6/2013	TIME	Billed	DFW Billable CTF-C./N9237/18819	0.50 0.00 0.00	175.00 T@7	87.50
			Reviewed signed order of dismissal. Drafted letter to Earl E. Oliver, Field Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds,, Audit Coordinator John Conklin, Audit Coordinator Nate Lagalo, and John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager regarding the same.		0.00		
476884	11/4/2013	TIME	Billed	DFW Billable CTF-C./N9237/18819	0.40 0.00 0.00	175.00 T@7	70.00
			Prepare for court status/motion hearing; review file for current status and most recent activity; telephone conversation with trust fund regarding status of the litigation; review court docket to confirm that the case will be called for status.		0.00		
476885	11/5/2013	TIME	Billed	DFW Billable CTF-C./N9237/18819	1.00 0.00 0.00	175.00 T@7	175.00
			Attended motion hearing.				
476930	11/6/2013	TIME	Billed	DFW Billable CTF-C./N9237/18819	0.25 0.00 0.00	175.00 T@7	43.75
			Drafted correspondence to John Libby, Manager Audit & Collections, and Earl E. Oliver, Field Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds, regarding court hearing, and status of litigation.				
477103	11/9/2013	TIME	Billed	DFW Billable CTF-C./N9237/18819	0.25 0.00 0.00	175.00 T@7	43.75
			Review correspondence from the Trust Funds' office regarding the monthly Citation to Discover Assets status report and case status; reviewed case notes and case diary; updated the status of the case and future steps to be taken; reviewed the attorney fees and update since the last report. Reviewed case notes and diary and prepared case summary and talking points outline in preparation				

2/10/2014
9:00 AM

WHITFIELD, McGANN & KETTERMAN
Slip Listing

Page 31

Slip ID	ATTORNEY	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status	Case	Est. Time	Bill Status	
Description	Reference	Variance		
for the Asset Discovery Meeting with John Libby, Travis Ketterman, Nate Lagalo, Earl Oliver, Rich Oginski, and John Conklin.				
477774	TIME	DFW		
11/19/2013		Billable	175.00	26.25
Billed	G:91184	12/2/2013	T@7	
CTF-C./N9237/18819		0.00		
Reviewed case notes and case diary, left detailed message for Earl E. Oliver, Field Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds, regarding payment status.		0.00		
478126	TIME	DFW		
11/22/2013		Billable	175.00	43.75
Billed	G:91184	12/2/2013	T@7	
CTF-C./N9237/18819		0.00		
Review correspondence from the Trust Funds' office regarding the monthly Collections Meeting Litigation status report and case status; reviewed case notes and case diary; reviewed court docket entries; updated the status of the case and future steps to be taken; reviewed the attorney fees and update since the last report. Reviewed case notes and diary and prepared case summary and talking points outline in preparation for the bi-monthly collections committee meeting with John Libby, Daniel P McAnally, Earl Oliver, Harold Boswell, and Rich Oginski.		0.00		
478313	TIME	DFW		
11/29/2013		Billable	175.00	43.75
Billed	G:91184	12/2/2013	T@7	
CTF-C./N9237/18819		0.00		
Reviewed case notes and case diary, Drafted correspondence to Earl E. Oliver, Field Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds, John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager regarding bankruptcy and payment plan status.		0.00		
478974	TIME	DFW		
12/10/2013		Billable	175.00	43.75
Billed	G:91442	1/1/2014	T@7	
CTF-C./N9237/18819		0.00		
Reviewed case notes and case diary, Drafted correspondence to Earl E. Oliver, Field Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds, and John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager regarding payment.		0.00		
479786	TIME	DFW		
12/12/2013		Billable	175.00	43.75
Billed	G:91442	1/1/2014	T@7	
CTF-C./N9237/18819		0.00		
Review correspondence from the Trust Funds' office regarding the monthly Citation to Discover		0.00		

2/10/2014
9:00 AM

WHITFIELD, McGANN & KETTERMAN
Slip Listing

Page 32

Slip ID	ATTORNEY	Units	Rate	Slip Value	
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info		
Posting Status	Case	Est. Time	Bill Status		
Description	Reference	Variance			
Assets status report and case status; reviewed case notes and case diary; updated the status of the case and future steps to be taken; reviewed the attorney fees and update since the last report. Reviewed case notes and diary and prepared case summary and talking points outline in preparation for the Asset Discovery Meeting with John Libby, Travis Ketterman, Nate Lagalo, Earl Oliver, Rich Oginski, and John Conklin.					
479906	TIME	DFW	0.25	175.00	43.75
12/13/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:91442	1/1/2014	0.00		
CTF-C./N9237/18819					
Reviewed correspondence from Earl E. Oliver, Field Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds, regarding payment status, replied regarding the same, Reviewed case notes and case diary adn updated.					
480723	TIME	DFW	0.25	175.00	43.75
1/15/2014		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:91691	2/3/2014	0.00		
CTF-C./N9237/18819					
Reviewed case notes and case diary, Telephone conversation with Earl E. Oliver, Field Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds, regarding litigation and collection status.					
480905	TIME	DFW	0.25	175.00	43.75
1/16/2014		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:91691	2/3/2014	0.00		
CTF-C./N9237/18819					
Review correspondence from the Trust Funds' office regarding the monthly Citation to Discover Assets status report and case status; reviewed case notes and case diary; updated the status of the case and future steps to be taken; reviewed the attorney fees and update since the last report. Reviewed case notes and diary and prepared case summary and talking points outline in preparation for the Asset Discovery Meeting with John Libby, Travis Ketterman, Nate Lagalo, Earl Oliver, Rich Oginski, and John Conklin.					
481096	TIME	DFW	0.10	175.00	17.50
1/16/2014		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:91691	2/3/2014	0.00		
CTF-C./N9237/18819					
Reviewed correspondence from Earl E. Oliver, Field Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds, regarding amount owed.					

2/10/2014
9:00 AM

WHITFIELD, MCGANN & KETTERMAN
Slip Listing

Slip ID	ATTORNEY	Units	Rate	Slip Value	
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info		
Posting Status	Case	Est. Time	Bill Status		
Description	Reference	Variance			
481097	TIME	DFW	0.10	175.00	17.50
1/16/2014	Billable		0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:91691	2/3/2014	CTF-C./N9237/18819	0.00	
Reviewed correspondence from John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager regarding updating fees and cost in reinstating the matter					
482109	TIME	DFW	1.25	175.00	218.75
2/3/2014	Billable		0.00	T@7	
WIP	CTF-C./N9237/18819		0.00		
Reviewed correspondence from Earl E. Oliver, Field Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds, regarding amounts owed on agreed order of dismissal, drafted motion to reinstate the case and enter final judgment.					
482110	TIME	DFW	0.50	175.00	87.50
2/5/2014	Billable		0.00	T@7	
WIP	CTF-C./N9237/18819		0.00		
Drafted notice of motion, scheduled court for February 27, 2014.					
482111	TIME	DFW	0.50	175.00	87.50
2/5/2014	Billable		0.00	T@7	
WIP	CTF-C./N9237/18819		0.00		
Prepared draft judgment order for Judge Lefkow to enter.					
482112	TIME	DFW	0.75	175.00	131.25
2/6/2014	Billable		0.00	T@7	
WIP	CTF-C./N9237/18819		0.00		
Drafted sworn declaration of John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager in support of motion for judgment. Drafted correspondence to John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager and Audit Coordinator Nate Lagalo explaining the litigation need for a declaration.					
482114	TIME	DFW	0.50	175.00	87.50
2/10/2014	Billable		0.00	T@7	
WIP	CTF-C./N9237/18819		0.00		
Reviewed detailed attorney billing, prepared sworn declaration of David Whitfield in support of a fee petition.					

Grand Total

Billable	65.50	12504.85
Unbillable	0.00	0.00
Total	65.50	12504.85

total

7.70

\$1,347.⁵⁰