

EXHIBIT E  
Detailed Attorney's Fees of  
Whitfield McGann & Ketterman

1/3/2014  
9:34 AM

WHITFIELD, MCGANN & KETTERMAN  
Slip Listing

Slip ID	ATTORNEY	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status	Case	Est. Time	Bill Status	
Description	Reference	Variance		
Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds, and John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager regarding amount and submitted reports, reviewed case file and court docket draft motion for judgment by default.				
470136	DFW	0.75	175.00	131.25
7/31/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	8/1/2013	0.00		
G:90137	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Prepared a draft sworn declaration of John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager in support of default motion. Drafted correspondence to Audit Coordinator Nate Lagalo, John Clearwater, Business Representative, and Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., regarding motion for default judgment and the requirement of a sworn declaration to prove up amounts owed.				
470137	DFW	0.50	175.00	87.50
7/31/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	8/1/2013	0.00		
G:90137	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed detail attorney bills, drafted sworn declaration of David Whitfield in support of attorney fee and court costs requests.				
470144	DFW	0.25	175.00	43.75
8/1/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	9/3/2013	0.00		
G:90382	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed email from John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager, as well as his signed affidavit. Downloaded document to the file folder, print document and enclose in file.				
470145	DFW	1.00	175.00	175.00
8/1/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	9/3/2013	0.00		
G:90382	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Prepared courtesy cover sheet, prepared exhibit list, prepared exhibit cover sheet, scanned all exhibits and motion and notice of motion into PDF format, submitted to court electronically, sent hard copy cover to defendant and the court for review.				
471198	DFW	0.00	175.00	0.00
8/5/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	9/3/2013	0.00		
G:90382	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed email sent by the U.S. Dist. Court for the Northern Dist. of Illinois regarding the MOTION by Plaintiffs Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Apprentice & Trainee Program Fund, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Welfare Fund, Trustees of the Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Pension Fund for default judgment as				

1/3/2014  
9:34 AM

WHITFIELD, McGANN & KETTERMAN  
Slip Listing

Page 4

Slip ID		ATTORNEY	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time		Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status		Case	Est. Time	Bill Status	
Description		Reference	Variance		
to (Attachments: # (1) Exhibit A, # (2) Exhibit B, # (3) Exhibit C, # (4) Exhibit D, # (5) Exhibit E)					
471199	TIME	DFW	0.20	175.00	35.00
8/6/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90382	9/3/2013	0.00		
CTF-C./N9574/8734			0.00		
Reviewed email sent by the U.S. Dist. Court for the Northern Dist. of Illinois regarding the NOTICE of Motion by David Faxon Whitfield for presentment of motion for default judgment, [5] before Honorable Sharon Johnson Coleman on 8/14/2013 at 08:45 AM.					
471309	TIME	DFW	0.40	175.00	70.00
8/13/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90382	9/3/2013	0.00		
CTF-C./N9574/8734			0.00		
Prepare for court status/motion hearing; review file for current status and most recent activity; telephone conversation with trust fund regarding status of the litigation; review court docket to confirm that the case will be called for status.					
471310	TIME	DFW	1.00	175.00	175.00
8/14/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90382	9/3/2013	0.00		
CTF-C./N9574/8734			0.00		
Attended court hearing.					
471639	EXP	CPW	2	55.00	110.00
8/15/2013		\$DS			
Billed	G:90382	9/3/2013			
CTF-C./N9574/8734					
DOCUMENTS SERVED Stern Process & Investigation, LLC #388397 (7/3/13); #389540 (7/3/13)					
472337	TIME	DFW	0.75	175.00	131.25
8/30/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90382	9/3/2013	0.00		
CTF-C./N9574/8734			0.00		
Drafted amended notice of motion, filed that electronically with the court after scanning into PDF format, Sent hard copy to the Defendant Tom Gleason as well as Judge Coleman. Drafted correspondence to Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., regarding new hearing state and litigation status update, updated diary.					
472377	TIME	DFW	0.20	175.00	35.00
8/31/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90382	9/3/2013	0.00		
CTF-C./N9574/8734			0.00		
Reviewed email sent by the U.S. Dist. Court for the Northern Dist. of Illinois regarding the NOTICE of Motion by David Faxon Whitfield for presentment of motion for default judgment, [5] before					

1/3/2014  
9:34 AM

WHITFIELD, MCGANN & KETTERMAN  
Slip Listing

Page 5

Slip ID	ATTORNEY	Units	Rate	Slip Value	
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info		
Posting Status	Case	Est. Time	Bill Status		
Description	Reference	Variance			
Honorable Sharon Johnson Coleman on 9/10/2013 at 08:45 AM.					
472956	TIME	DFW	0.50	175.00	87.50
9/6/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645	10/1/2013	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00	
Reviewed case notes, reviewed court docket, reviewed daily docket, drafted case summary for Raymond J. Sanguinetti to use in court on September 10, 2013.					
473010	TIME	DPM	0.50	195.00	97.50
9/9/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645	10/1/2013	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00	
Prepare for court status/motion hearing; review file for current status and most recent activity; telephone conversation with trust fund regarding status of the litigation; review court docket to confirm that the case will be called for status; confer with attorney David Whitfield regarding the motion hearing.					
473012	TIME	DPM	1.00	195.00	195.00
9/10/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645	10/1/2013	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00	
Attend court appearance at the U.S. District Court for the Northern District of Illinois before Judge Coleman.					
473101	TIME	DFW	0.20	175.00	35.00
9/11/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645	10/1/2013	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00	
Telephone conversation with Earl E. Oliver, Field Representative, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Trust Funds, regarding litigation status.					
473319	TIME	DFW	0.20	175.00	35.00
9/12/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645	10/1/2013	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00	
Reviewed email sent by the U.S. Dist. Court for the Northern Dist. of Illinois regarding the MINUTE entry before Honorable Sharon Johnson Coleman: Motion hearing held on 9/10/2013. Plaintiffs' motion for default judgment [5] is entered and continued to 9/30/2013 at 09:30 AM.					
473930	TIME	DFW	0.35	175.00	61.25
9/26/2013		Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645	10/1/2013	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00	
Reviewed case notes, reviewed court docket, reviewed motion, draft summary for Nick Kasmer in preparation for September 30, 2013 court					

1/3/2014  
9:34 AM

WHITFIELD, McGANN & KETTERMAN  
Slip Listing

Page 6

Slip ID	ATTORNEY	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status	Case	Est. Time	Bill Status	
Description	Reference	Variance		
hearing.				
474014	DFW	1.00	175.00	175.00
9/24/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645 10/1/2013 CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed correspondence from Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., regarding amount owed, drafted agreed order of dismissal.		0.00		
474035	DFW	0.20	175.00	35.00
9/25/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645 10/1/2013 CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Telephone conversation with John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager, regarding dismissal. Drafted correspondence to Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., regarding the same.		0.00		
474367	NEK	0.17	200.00	33.33
9/25/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645 10/1/2013 CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.17		
Discussion with David on the matter and court appearance next week on case.		0.00		
474393	NEK	1.00	200.00	200.00
9/27/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645 10/1/2013 CTF-C./N9574/8734	1.00		
Review of entire file and docket in matter in preparation for court appearance in matter.		0.00		
474407	NEK	2.00	200.00	400.00
9/30/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90645 10/1/2013 CTF-C./N9574/8734	2.00		
Appearance before the court. Also discussion with Travis on agreed upon order as well as filing agreed upon order with court along with detailed reason as to why order is needed instead of dismissal without prejudice.		0.00		
474772	NEK	0.33	200.00	66.67
10/3/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90918 11/1/2013 CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.33		
Review of orders by the Court in the matter.		0.00		
475010	DFW	0.20	175.00	35.00
10/3/2013	Billable	0.00	T@7	
Billed	G:90918 11/1/2013 CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed email sent by the U.S. Dist. Court for the Northern Dist. of Illinois regarding the ATTORNEY Appearance for Plaintiffs Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Apprentice & Trainee Program Fund, Chicago Regional Council of Carpenters Welfare Fund, Trustees of the Chicago Regional Council of		0.00		

1/3/2014  
9:34 AM

WHITFIELD, McGANN & KETTERMAN  
Slip Listing

Page 7

Slip ID	ATTORNEY	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status	Case	Est. Time	Bill Status	
Description	Reference	Variance		
Carpenters Pension Fund by Nicholas Edward Kasmer				
475027	TIME	DFW		
10/3/2013		0.20	175.00	35.00
Billed	G:90918 11/1/2013	Billable	T@7	
	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed email sent by the U.S. Dist. Court for the Northern Dist. of Illinois regarding the MINUTE entry before Honorable Sharon Johnson Coleman: Motion hearing held on 9/30/2013. Plaintiffs' motion for default judgment [5] is withdrawn. By agreement, defendant shall pay plaintiffs \$245,304.14) in 7 installments as set forth in the agreed order. This case is dismissed without prejudice with leave to reinstate by May 31, 2014. If a motion to reinstate is not filed by May 31,2014, the case shall be deemed dismissed with prejudice without further order of the Court. Each party shall bear its own attorneys fees and costs. Ener Agreed Order of Dismissal. Civil case terminated.				
475028	TIME	DFW		
10/9/2013		0.50	175.00	87.50
Billed	G:90918 11/1/2013	Billable	T@7	
	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed signed agreed order of dismissal. Drafted correspondence to John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager, John Conklin, and Audit Coordinator Nate Lagalo regarding litigation status.				
475340	TIME	DFW		
10/15/2013		0.10	175.00	17.50
Billed	G:90918 11/1/2013	Billable	T@7	
	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed and updated case notes.				
476990	TIME	DFW		
11/1/2013		0.10	175.00	17.50
Billed	G:91212 12/2/2013	Billable	T@7	
	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed case notes and case diary, left detailed message for Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., regarding payment.				
477224	TIME	DFW		
11/8/2013		0.25	175.00	43.75
Billed	G:91212 12/2/2013	Billable	T@7	
	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Telephone conversation with Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., regarding payment and litigation status.				
477482	TIME	DFW		
11/15/2013		0.25	175.00	43.75
Billed	G:91212 12/2/2013	Billable	T@7	
	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed case notes and case diary, Telephone				

1/3/2014  
9:34 AM

WHITFIELD, McGANN & KETTERMAN  
Slip Listing

Page 8

Slip ID	ATTORNEY	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status	Case	Est. Time	Bill Status	
Description	Reference	Variance		
conversation with to Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., and John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager regarding payment of agreed order of dismissal.				
477671	TIME	DFW	175.00	35.00
11/15/2013		Billable	T@7	
Billed	G:91212	12/2/2013		
Reviewed case notes and case diary, Reviewed correspondence from Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., regarding payment status and work performed. Updated diary.				
477672	TIME	DFW	175.00	35.00
11/19/2013		Billable	T@7	
Billed	G:91212	12/2/2013		
Drafted correspondence to Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., Audit Coordinator Nate Lagalo, and John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager regarding reinstating case and payment status.				
477717	TIME	DFW	175.00	17.50
11/19/2013		Billable	T@7	
Billed	G:91212	12/2/2013		
Reviewed correspondence from Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., regarding payment status.				
477775	TIME	DFW	175.00	26.25
11/20/2013		Billable	T@7	
Billed	G:91212	12/2/2013		
Reviewed correspondence from John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager regarding litigation status and next steps. Reviewed case notes and case diary, and updated.				
478125	TIME	DFW	175.00	43.75
11/22/2013		Billable	T@7	
Billed	G:91212	12/2/2013		
Review correspondence from the Trust Funds' office regarding the monthly Collections Meeting Litigation status report and case status; reviewed case notes and case diary; reviewed court docket entries; updated the status of the case and future steps to be taken; reviewed the attorney fees and update since the last report. Reviewed case notes and diary and prepared case summary and talking points outline in preparation for the bi-monthly collections committee meeting with John Libby, Daniel P McAnally, Earl Oliver, Harold Boswell, and Rich Oginski.				

1/3/2014  
9:34 AM

WHITFIELD, McGANN & KETTERMAN  
Slip Listing

Slip ID	ATTORNEY	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time	Activity	DNB Time	Rate Info	
Posting Status	Case	Est. Time	Bill Status	
Description	Reference	Variance		
478329	TIME	DFW	175.00	43.75
11/30/2013	Billable	0.25	T@7	
Billed	G:91212 12/2/2013 CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed case notes and case diary, Drafted correspondence to Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager, Audit Coordinator Nate Lagalo regarding payments and motion for judgment.				
478849	TIME	DFW	175.00	43.75
12/9/2013	Billable	0.25	T@7	
WIP	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed correspondence from John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager regarding judgment, Drafted correspondence to Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., regarding amount owed.				
479854	TIME	DFW	175.00	175.00
12/16/2013	Billable	1.00	T@7	
WIP	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed correspondence from Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., regarding breach of agreed order of dismissal draft motion to reinstate and prove up.				
479855	TIME	DFW	175.00	87.50
12/16/2013	Billable	0.50	T@7	
WIP	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Drafted notice of motion to enter judgment as to January 21, 2014.				
479856	TIME	DFW	175.00	131.25
12/18/2013	Billable	0.75	T@7	
WIP	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Prepared sworn declaration of John Libby, Audit & Collection Manager in support of motion to prove up. Drafted correspondence to Rich Oginski, Trust Fund Field Rep., and John Libby regarding the same.				
479857	TIME	DFW	175.00	131.25
12/24/2013	Billable	0.75	T@7	
WIP	CTF-C./N9574/8734	0.00		
Reviewed detailed attorney fees, draft sworn declaration of David Whitfield in support of additional fees incurred.				

Grand Total

Billable  
*total*

~~24.80~~

*16-*

~~4967.50~~

*3,027.50*