#### SUPPLEMENTAL AFFIDAVIT OF ELIZABETH L. ROWE

COUNTY OF COOK	)
	) SS
STATE OF ILLINOIS	)

- I, Elizabeth L. Rowe, of full age, being duly sworn on my oath, hereby depose and say as follows:
- 1. I am an attorney admitted to the General Bar of this Court and the State of Illinois.
- 2. Since March 2014, I have been an associate in the firm Dowd, Bloch, Bennett, Cervone, Auerbach & Yokich ("Firm"), where I practice exclusively in the areas of labor, employment, and employee benefits law. In my position at the Firm, I represent the Plaintiffs in Case Number 14-cv-9592.
- 3. This affidavit is based on my personal knowledge and, if necessary, I could testify to the facts contained in this affidavit.
- 4. The rate which the Firm charged the Funds through August 31, 2016 was \$240.00 per hour for partners' work; \$175.00 per hour for work completed by me and other associates; and \$90.00 per hour for law clerks' work. The rate at which the Firm has charged the Funds since September 1, 2016 is \$300.00 per hour for partners' work; \$225.00 per hour for work completed by me and other associates; and \$100.00 per hour for law clerks' work. I believe these rates are reasonable in light of the Firm's experience and the nature of the case.
- 5. Through May 2, 2017, the Firm has devoted a total of 200.75 billable hours to the representation of the Local No. 731, I.B. of T., Private Scavengers Health and Welfare Fund and the Local No. 731, I.B. of T., Private Scavengers and Garage Attendants Pension (collectively,

Exhibit A

"Funds") in connection with this case.

- 6. Based on the above rates and 200.75 hours of work through May 3, 2017, the Funds have incurred attorneys' fees of \$38,288.17 related to this case.
- 7. The Final Judgment Order entered in this case on April 3, 2015 awarded the Funds \$11,308.60 for attorneys' fees and costs incurred by the Funds with respect to this lawsuit.
- 8. Since April 3, 2015, the Funds have incurred attorneys' fees for work including preparing citations to discover assets of the Defendants, preparing for and taking the citation deposition of the Defendants, preparing forty-five third-party citations and numerous follow up conversations with third-party citation respondents, preparing five motions for turnover orders, and communications with Defendants in efforts to obtain their cooperation and compliance with the judgment.
- 9. In addition to attorneys' fees, the Funds have incurred costs in the amount of \$2,720.92 comprised of \$400.00 in filing fees, \$905.00 in service fees, \$783.55 in postage and shipping costs, \$434.55 in photocopying and document production expenses, \$140.00 in court reporter fees, and \$57.82 for research fees.
- 10. Attached as Exhibit 1 are invoices for this case through May 3, 2017, reflecting total attorneys' fees of \$38,288.17 and costs of \$2,720.92 related to this case, which have been or will be billed to the Funds.
- 11. Since May 3, 2017, the Firm has devoted an additional 9.1 hours to resolving this case, including reviewing, revising, and supplementing this affidavit, the motion for a supplemental judgment, drafting and revising a fifth motion for a turn over order and the proposed judgment orders, electronically filing those documents, and submitting the proposed judgment orders.

- 12. Consequently, the Funds have incurred an additional \$2,047.50 in attorneys' fees for services provided from May 3, 2017 through the date this affidavit is filed.
- 13. I anticipate that, after filing the motion for a supplemental judgment and related documents and submitting the proposed judgment order, I will devote at least three additional hours to this case, in preparing for and attending the hearing on the motion, examining any orders that the Court may enter, and informing my clients and the Defendant of the results.
- 14. The Funds will therefore incur an additional \$675.00 in attorneys' fees for services provided after the date this affidavit is filed.
- 15. Accordingly, the amount of attorneys' fees and costs and fees incurred by the Funds as a result of this action, less the \$11,308.60 in attorneys' fees and costs included in the Final Judgment Order previously entered by the Court, will be \$32,422.99 as follows:

Attorneys Fees (thru 5/2): \$38,288.17 Costs: \$2,720.92 Attorneys Fees (5/2 - 5/8): \$2,047.50 Attorneys Fees (after 5/8): \$675.00

Amount Included in Final Judg. Order: (\$11,308.60)

TOTAL OWED: \$32,422.99

I have read the foregoing affidavit and swear that it is true and correct to the best of my knowledge, information, and belief.

Elizabeth L. Rowe

Subscribed and sworn to

before me this 8TH day of

ELSA I. CONTRERAS
NOTARY PUBLIC, STATE OF ILLINOIS
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES 11/30/2017

Notary Public

.

		Selection Criteria			
Slip.Classification Refe.Selection	Open Include: UNION RECYCL	LING (5)			
Rate Info - identifies	s rate source and level				
Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	TIME	JMB NORMAL 4 IBT 731 SF 56 . UNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
347552 11/11/2014 Billed Draft complaint.	TIME G:22128 1/6/2019	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.05 0.00	175.00 C@5	183.75
	TIME G:22128 1/6/2019 communication with E. Rowe mplaint and named plaintiffs.	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
347554 11/12/2014 Billed Draft complaint, a summons, and civ	ttorney appearance forms,	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	105.00
350637 11/12/2014 Billed Time not charged	TIME G:22128 1/6/2019 relating to previous entry.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.70 0.70	175.00 C@5 No Charge	122.50
appearances, and	TIME  G:22128  d draft complaint, summonses, d civil cover sheet; communication and adding own		0.75 0.00	175.00 C@5	131.25
	TIME  G:22128  with E. Rowe regarding revising de personal liability against own		0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time		Attorney Activity	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info	Slip Value
Posting Status Description		Client Reference		Bill Status	
348796 11/26/2014 Billed Conference with J. Raczkowski as del	Barr regarding adding K.	ER NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	TIME G:22128 1/6/20 and add K. Raczkowski as a attorney appearance forms a	ER NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( and	0.75 0.00	175.00 C@5	131.25
350639 11/28/2014 Billed Time not charged	TIME G:22128 1/6/20 relating to previous entry.	ER NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.35	175.00 C@5 No Charge	61.25
348489 12/1/2014 Billed Review and revise sheet, and compla	appearance forms, civil cove	JMB NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 or UNION RECYCLING (	0.80 0.00	175.00 C@5	140.00
complaint, civil cov	re documents for e-filing; e-f er sheet, attorney appearand eceive email from court and		1.50 0.00	90.00 C@7	135.00
regarding revisions	correspondence with J. Barr s; draft summons for K. spondence with C. Coleman	ER NORMAL 15 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	157.50
dates set by order; regarding order an with C. Coleman re	TIME  G:22224  and rules cited by order; doc communication with E. Rowe d how to proceed; conference garding asking process serv g with complaint and summo	e e er	0.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	87.50
349697 12/3/2014 Billed	TIME G:22224 2/9/20	ER NORMAL 15 IBT 731 SF 56	0.35	175.00 C@5	61.25

	ry from judge regarding meeting; conference with		Attorney Activity Client Reference UNION RECYCLING (	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
352922 12/3/2014 Billed Time not charged	TIME G:22224 2/9 relating to previous entry.	9/2015	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.50	175.00 C@5 No Charge	87.50
server regarding a	TIME G:22224 2/5 vith C. Coleman and proce ttempt to serve owner at and serving him at home	9/2015	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50
349704 12/4/2014 Billed Correspondence w service of complain	vith C. Coleman regarding	9/2015	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.10	175.00 C@5 No Charge	17.50
352923 12/4/2014 Billed Time not charged	TIME G:22224 2/9 relating to previous entry.	/9/2015	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.30	175.00 C@5 No Charge	52.50
server regarding a	TIME  G:22224 2/9  vith C. Coleman and proce ttempts to serve defendar g complaint and summons	/9/2015 cess ints and	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.00	175.00 C@5	61.25
349979 12/9/2014 Billed Correspondence v regarding service	vith C. Coleman and J. Ba	/9/2015	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.15	175.00 C@5 No Charge	26.25
server and confere attempts to serve service, owner's con expectation that of service; review aff service at owner's	G:22224 2/2 with C. Coleman and procence with E. Rowe regards owner, strategy for future ell phone number, and wner will attempt to evade idavit regarding attempted former home and procestion with owner's ex-wife.	cess ling e d	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Stip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
350237 12/15/2014 Billed Review correspon regarding service	TIME  G:22224  dence from C. Coleman of process; review affidavit frogarding attempted service.	ER NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.20	175.00 C@5 No Charge	35.00
350248 12/17/2014 Billed Conference with J file.	TIME G:22224 2/9/20 Barr regarding maintenance	ER NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 of UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.10	175.00 C@5 No Charge	17.50
350309 12/18/2014 Billed Review executed s answer is due.	TIME G:22224 2/9/20 summons and schedule date	ER NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( DNB per JPD	0.10 0.10	175.00 C@5 Do Not Bill	17.50
	TIME  G:22224 2/9/20 of non-service at former Lynw company's address.	JMB NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 voodUNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
350856 12/22/2014 Billed Conference with J. concerns about Ur	Barr regarding Trustees'	ER NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.10	175.00 C@5 No Charge	17.50
352924 12/22/2014 Billed Conference with E concerns about Ur	. Rowe regarding Trustees'	JMB NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.10	175.00 C@5 No Charge	17.50
350401 12/23/2014 Billed Atty Work Product	TIME G:22224 2/9/20	JMB NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.90	175.00 C@5	157.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
350864 12/23/2014 Billed Atty Work Product	TIME G:22224 . 2/9/2015	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.00	175.00 C@5	61.25
352925 12/23/2014 Billed Time not charged	TIME G:22224 2/9/2015 relating to previous entry.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.50	175.00 C@5 No Charge	87.50
352926 12/23/2014 Billed Atty Work Product		JPD NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	240.00 C@1	120.00
351278 1/6/2015 Billed Communication ar regarding status o	nd conference with C. Coleman	JMB NORMAL BT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
351593 1/9/2015 Billed Conferences with proceed with servi	C. Coleman regarding how to	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
regarding new pro serve owner; conf	G:22274 3/5/2015 with C. Coleman and E. Rowe cess server's initial attempt to erence with and communication irding service through secretary	JMB NORMAL BT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
	TIME  G:22274  3/5/2015  nd to correspondence from J.  vice of process on defendants.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
351902 1/14/2015 Billed	m process server regarding	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	TIME  G:22274  d to correspondence from J. endant's avoidance of service.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
and E. Rowe regard	TIME  G:22274  3/5/2015 ith process server, C. Colemanding additional attempts to server resist service, and additional		0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
regarding K. Raczk research alternative when personal serv correspondence to options; research h	G:22274 3/5/2015 ence from process server owski's avoidance of service; e options for service in Illinois rice is impracticable; draft J. Barr regarding alternative ow to serve corporations f state and complete necessary	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	2.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	428.75
1/20/2015 Billed	TIME G:22274 3/5/2015 elating to previous entry.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.00 1.00	175.00 C@5 No Charge	175.00
1/21/2015 Billed Conferences with E Illinois companies t	. Rowe regarding serving hrough the Secretary of State leave to serve Indiana	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50
1/21/2015 Billed Conference with J. motion for substitute	Barr regarding whether to file ed service; research ch motion; draft motion for	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	262.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
352323 TIME 1/22/2015	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( ler	0.40	175.00 C@5	70.00
352664 TIME  1/22/2015  Billed G:22274 3/5/207  Conference with C. Coleman regarding obtaining affidavits of non-service from process servers; review correspondence from process servers as stated reasons for non-service; draft motion for service by special order of the court; telephone conference with J. Barr and owner regarding amounts currently owed, obtaining past-due contribution reports, lawsuit, service, and payme	to	0.70 0.00	175.00 C@5	122.50
352374 TIME 1/23/2015 Billed G:22274 3/5/20 Telephone conference with owner regarding submitting outstanding contribution reports and payment of amounts owed; communications with E. Rowe regarding initial status hearing.	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
352671 TIME 1/23/2015 Billed G:22274 3/5/20 Prepare forms, attachments, cover letter and filir fee for service upon Union Recycling & Waste Services, Inc. and Armor Recycling, Inc. through the Secretary of State; communication with J. Baregarding initial status hearing.	•	0.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	105.00
352439 TIME 1/26/2015 Billed G:22274 3/5/207 Conference with E. Rowe regarding initial status hearing; review affidavit of non-service; review order for initial status hearing; docket date for ne status hearing.	JMB NORMAL 15 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( xt	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
352963 TIME 1/26/2015 Billed G:22274 3/5/20 Attend status hearing; draft motion for substitute service; conference with J. Barr regarding initial status hearing.	ER NORMAL 15 IBT 731 SF 56 d UNION RECYCLING (	1.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	218.75

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
352974 1/27/2015 Billed Draft affidavit of E. for substituted serv	Rowe as attachment to motion	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.00 1.00	175.00 C@5 No Charge	175.00
	TIME  G:22274  Rowe regarding affidavit of otion for substitute service;	JMB NORMAL BIT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
for substituted serve and notice of motion regarding filing affice (Atty Work Product (i) ionierence with 3.	Rowe as attachment to motion ice; prepare proposed order n; conference with C. Coleman davit of attempted service;	•	1.80 0.00	175.00 C@5	315.00
motion, certificate of proposed order; co	TIME  G:22423  ubstitute service, notice of of service, affidavit, and mmunications with E. Rowe to documents and filing motion	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.65 0.00	175.00 C@5	113.75
	TIME  G:22423  4/7/2015  lits to motion for substituted finalize motion for filing.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.70 0.00	175.00 C@5	122.50
357009 2/2/2015 Billed Time not charged r	TIME G:22423 4/7/2015 elating to previous entry.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.50 1.50	175.00 C@5 No Charge	262.50
353091 2/3/2015 Billed Review filed motion hearing date.		JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.10	175.00 C@5 No Charge	17.50

a

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
353121 2/3/2015 Billed Receive and prepa motion, exhibits, ce	re documents for e-filing; e-file ertificate of service, notice of eceive email from court and	CC NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56	0.90 0.00	90.00 C@7	81.00
353620 2/4/2015 Billed Atty-Client Priv.	TIME G:22423 4/7/2015	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	2.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	455.00
Committees; comm	TIME  G:22423 4/7/2015 memo to Collection nunication with owner regarding ntribution reports and remit	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
353639 2/9/2015 Billed Communications w delinquency and la	ith owner regarding status of	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
353764 2/10/2015 Billed Conference with E. service and hearing service.	TIME  G:22423 4/7/2019  Rowe regarding status of g on motion for substitute	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
hearing on motion	Barr regarding upcoming for substituted service; prepare ewing relevant case law	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.75 0.00	175.00 C@5	131.25
357010 2/10/2015 Billed Time not charged i	TIME G:22423 4/7/201 relating to previous entry.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.35	175.00 C@5 No Charge	61.25

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
353791 2/11/2015 Billed Conferences with	TIME G:22423 4/7/2015 E. Rowe regarding hearing on uted service and effecting	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.00	175.00 C@5	61.25
Atty Work Product	motion for substituted service;	•	2.00 0.00	175.00 C@5	350.00
353969 2/12/2015 Billed Conference with E to defendants to e service.	TIME G:22423 4/7/2015 E. Rowe regarding sending letters ffect service and affidavits of	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 SUNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
354280 2/12/2015 Billed Prepare affidavits Waste Services, Ir	TIME  G:22423  4/7/2015 of service on Union Recycling & nc. and Armor Recycling Inc.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	105.00
353974 2/13/2015 Billed Review orders gra service.	TIME G:22423 4/7/2015 nting motion for substituted	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
secretary of state a summons on K. Ra	TIME  G:22423  4/7/2015  ifying defendants of service upor and serve complaint and aczkowski and Armor Recycling to court order substituting	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 DUNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
354909 2/18/2015 Billed Draft affidavits of s		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.55 0.00	175.00 C@5	96.25

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
summonses return	TIME  G:22423 4/7/201  are documents for e-filing; e-file led executed; receive email frod documents for distribution.	CC NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.00	90.00 C@7	31.50
354371 2/20/2015 Billed Review affidavits o		JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
reports, employees	TIME  G:22423  A/7/202  Rowe regarding contribution so covered by collective lent, and calculating amounts	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
354943 2/25/2015 Billed Atty Work Product	TIME G:22423 4/7/202	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	2.15 2.15	175.00 C@5 No Charge	376.25
review collection p	on outstanding contributions; rocedures for assumption to any does not provide contributi attorney fees to date; Atty Wor	ER NORMAL 15 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.95 0.00	175.00 C@5	166.25
355610 3/2/2015 Billed Atty-Client Priv. Dowd for review.	TIME G:22483 5/8/20	ER NORMAL 15 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.10	175.00 C@5 No Charge	17.50
355608 3/5/2015 Billed Conference with J for default judgme	. Barr regarding drafting motio	ER NORMAL 15 IBT 731 SF 56 n UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description 359753 3/5/2015 Billed Conference with Idefault judgment.	TIME G:22483 E. Rowe regarding motion		Attorney Activity Client Reference JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	Units DNB Time 0.10 0.00	Rate Rate Info Bill Status 175.00 C@5	Slip Value
355607 3/6/2015 Billed	TIME G:22483 efault judgment, affidav		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	2.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	507.50
default judgment, E. Rowe, and pro- communications va- final demands for of motion for defa	TIME  G:22483  Ind draft comments to meaffidavit of R. Clarson, apposed order; conference with E. Rowe regarding payment in conjunction ult judgment; review call and final draft of affidavi	otion for affidavit o e and issuing with filing lculations	f	1.00 0.00	175.00 C@5	175.00
default judgment;	TIME G:22483 Barr regarding motion calculate attorney fees support of attorneys' fees	for and	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.00	175.00 C@5	175.00
359754 3/9/2015 Billed Time not charged	TIME G:22483 relating to previous enti	5/8/2015	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.75 0.75	175.00 C@5 No Charge	131.25
355725 3/10/2015 Billed Atty Work Product communications w owed and affidavit	vith E. Rowe regarding a	5/8/2015	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 NION RECYCLING (	0.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	105.00
356127 3/10/2015 Billed	TIME G:22483		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56	1.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	332.50

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Review J. Barr's edits to motion for default judgment; revise affidavit of R. Clarson and motion revise calculations to account for additional employee that is in dispute; prepare exhibits; send affidavit to R. Clarson for review; review attorneys' fees and redact attorney-work product entries; drainotice of motion and certificate of service; finalize documents; prepare email to company regarding motion for default judgment.	s	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
357798 TIME 3/10/2015 Billed G:22483 5/8/2015 Conference with J. Barr regarding case status, various collections strategies, aAtty-Client Priv. Atty-Client Priv.	JJL NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	240.00 C@1	48.00
359755 TIME 3/10/2015 Billed G:22483 5/8/2015 Time not charged relating to previous entry.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	2.00 2.00	175.00 C@5 No Charge	350.00
355836 TIME 3/11/2015 Billed G:22483 5/8/2015 Review and revise draft communication to owner regarding motion for default judgment and final demand for payment; communications with E. Rowe regarding communication to owner and filing	·	0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50
355854 TIME 3/11/2015 Billed G:22483 5/8/2015 Receive and prepare documents for e-filing; e-file motion, exhibits, certificate of service, notice of motion and order; receive email from court and prepare documents for distribution.	CC NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.70 0.00	90.00 C@7	63.00
356552 TIME 3/11/2015 Billed G:22483 5/8/2015 Finalize E. Rowe affidavit; redact attorneys' fees exhibit; finalize motion for default judgment and send to C. Coleman for filing; calculate exact amount owed to each Fund and draft email to Owner regarding amounts owed.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.85 0.00	175.00 C@5	148.75
356054 TIME 3/16/2015 Billed G:22483 5/8/2015 Telephone conference with attorney who may represent the company regarding motion for	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description default judgment.		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
regarding hearing telephone confere attorney regarding	TIME  G:22483 5/8/2015 and conference with E. Rowe on motion for default judgment; nce with E. Rowe and company amounts owed, calculation of ering and continuing motion for	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	. 78.75
	TIME  G:22483  5/8/2015  h J. Barr and A. Horberg  ng stay on motion for default	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
entering and contir judgment and obta	TIME  G:22483  vith company attorney regarding nuing motion for default ining outstanding contribution er continuing motion.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
357103 3/18/2015 Billed Prepare for and att default judgment.	TIME G:22483 5/8/2015 tend hearing on motion for	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.85 0.00	175.00 C@5	148.75
	TIME G:22483 5/8/2015 Rowe regarding company's to default judgment amounts.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
	TIME  G:22483 5/8/2015  Barr regarding company's to default judgment amounts.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
357233 3/31/2015 Billed Conference with E.	TIME G:22483 5/8/2015 Rowe regarding 4/1/15 hearing	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 .UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
357866 3/31/2015 Billed	Barr regarding hearing on	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
4/1/2015 Billed	Rowe regarding hearing and	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
4/1/2015 Billed Attend hearing on m	TIME  G:22580 6/12/2019  notion for default judgment; Barr regarding hearing.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.70	175.00 C@5	122.50
4/3/2015		JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
4/7/2015 Billed Communication with	TIME  G:22580 6/12/201  h E. Rowe regarding sending and deadline for payment.	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
4/7/2015 Billed Conference with J. collection on the jud	TIME  G:22580 6/12/201  Barr regarding beginning  Igment; draft correspondence  Iey requesting payment of fina	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
4/8/2015 Billed Communications wi	ith E. Rowe and attorney additional and whether he	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75
4/8/2015 Billed Review and respon- employer's counsel regarding property of	d to correspondence from ; correspondence with J. Barr owned by employer; search onference with J. Barr regardir	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.70 0.00	175.00 C@5	122.50

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
4/16/2015 Billed ( Telephone conferen conference with E. F request for additional company's potential			0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75
4/16/2015 Billed Telephone conference attorney; conference	ce with J. Barr and defendant's with J. Barr regarding two days to prepare proposal	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 SUNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
4/21/2015 Billed (	Barr regarding beginning to	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
4/21/2015 Billed (	Rowe regarding beginning to	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
4/22/2015 Billed Voicemails to and fro	G:22580 6/12/2015	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
4/22/2015 Billed Return call from defe			0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
4/24/2015 Billed G Draft third-party citati customers and to K. cover letter to Cook G judgment against def with C. Cantero regal	G:22580 6/12/2015	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	3.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	577.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description regarding another earlier against sar	judgment that was recone property.		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
360509 4/24/2015 Billed Review email from research company	n E. Rowe regarding lier	8/12/2015	JJL NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	240.00 C@1	48.00
J. Lannoye regard	TIME  G:22580 6 and conference with E. ing issuance of citations recorded against prope	6/12/2015 Rowe and s and	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 JUNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
	iew and sign 17 third-partified judgment to file a	arty	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.35 0.00	175.00 C@5	236.25
	TIME  G:22580  m R. LaSalle at Cyprenation; update correspond	Services	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
communications v	sponse from Cypren Se vith American Lawn reg holding accounts paya	ervices; jarding	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
	TIME  G:22580  and to email correspond regarding citations.		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
359871 5/4/2015 Billed Review Rayner &	TIME G:22717 7 Rinn-Scott's citation res		JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
360981 5/4/2015 Billed	TIME G:22717 7	7/16/2015	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Corp. and Rayner-	dence from American Lawn Rinn Scott in response to hart of citation responses.	Attorney Activity Client Reference UNION RECYCLING (	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
361079 5/5/2015 Billed Telephone call fro	TIME G:22717 7/16/2015 m Chase Bank regarding citation	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 DUNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
360097 5/6/2015 Billed Communication wi response.	TIME G:22717 7/16/2015 ith RockTenn regarding citation	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
to citation; review	TIME  G:22717  7/16/2015  m Quincy Recycling in response citation response from Rock e citation response status chart.	,	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
	TIME  G:22717  7/16/2015  with E. Rowe, American Lawn, le regarding citation responses.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
Quincy Recycling r correspondence ch from J. Barr regard exchange; review of Lawn Service and	TIME  G:22717  7/16/2015  Ind to correspondence from regarding citation; update hart; review correspondence ling issuing citation to currency citation response from American update correspondence chart; orrespondence from American	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75
		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	TIME G:22717 7/16/2015 ponses from Ideal Box Enterprises and update	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description correspondence log		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
361042 5/15/2015 Billed	TIME	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
regarding citation; if from Central Metal citation and update citation response from correspondence log Rayner Rinn Scott review citation respondence to calculate amount of	n Central Metal Recycling review email correspondence Recycling in response to correspondence log; review rom Able Sewerage and update g; review citation response from and update correspondence log romse from Rogers Roofing, f unpaid invoices and update g; conference with J. Barr	1	1.10	175.00 C@5	192.50
	ponses from Midwest Industrial uction Development and update		0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
362125 5/19/2015 Billed Telephone call fron citation.	TIME G:22717 7/16/2015 n Golf Construction regarding	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	TIME  G:22717 7/16/2015  dence from Golf Construction ; update correspondence chart.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
362168 5/22/2015 Billed Review correspond regarding citation r correspondence ch	lence from Able Sewerage esponse; update	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 901/200	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
362180 5/26/2015 Billed	nd to correspondence from A.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	n Company's citation response; dence chart; review status of	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
	TIME  G:22827 8/12/2015 vith E. Rowe regarding status of and filing motion for a turnover	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
filing new motion for citation response Bank regarding ou call to Scrap Interroresponse; telephone	TIME  G:22827  s and from J. Barr regarding or a turnover order; review statuses; telephone call to Chase tstanding response; telephone national regarding outstanding ne call to Luke Builds regarding ase; update correspondence log		0.85 0.00	175.00 C@5	148.75
Consultants regard response; scan an Commercial Carpe respond to email c Commercial Carpe response; update call to Scrap Intern	G:22827 8/12/2015 and from Commercial Carpet ding outstanding citation d send copy of citation to et Consultants; review and orrespondence from et Consultants regarding correspondence chart; telephone national regarding outstanding draft motion for turn over order.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	2.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	428.75
citation response;	TIME G:22827 8/12/2015 m Scrap International regarding update correspondence chart; on to send to company.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
362998 TIME 6/17/2015		0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
363849 TIME 6/17/2015 Billed G:22827 8/12/2 Telephone call to Luke Builds regarding outstanding citation response; revise turnover motion; correspondence to and from J. Barr regarding turnover motion.	ER NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.00 0.00	175.00 C@5	175.00
363096 TIME 6/19/2015 Billed G:22827 8/12/2 Communication with E. Rowe regarding status citation responses.	JMB NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 of UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
363881 TIME 6/19/2015 Billed G:22827 8/12/2 Telephone call to Chase Bank regarding outstanding citation response; second telephor call to Chase Bank to inquire on status of fax; telephone call to Luke Builds; correspondence and from J. Barr regarding outstanding response draft letter to Luke Builds threatening contempt proceedings.	to ses;	0.95 0.00	175.00 C@5	166.25
363896 TIME 6/22/2015 Billed G:22827 8/12/2 Telephone call from Luke Builds in response to citation; review email from Luke Builds concern citation response; update correspondence chain	ning	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
363722 TIME 6/25/2015 Billed G:22827 8/12/2 Communications with E. Rowe regarding Scrap International's payments to the company in violation of citation.	JMB NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 D UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175,00 C@5	35.00
363925 TIME 6/25/2015 Billed G:22827 8/12/2 Telephone call to Chase Bank concerning outstanding citation response; review correspondence and billing statements from So	ER NORMAL 015 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00

Page

correspondence ch from J. Barr regard	oonse to citation; update art; correspondence to and ing Scrap International's Recycling in violation of citation	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
International's citati	elivery receipt for Scrap ion; draft correspondence to regarding payments to Union	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.00	175.00 C@5	61.25
6/29/2015 Billed Review correspond regarding amounts	ence from Scrap International held in accounts payable to odate correspondence chart;	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	105.00
Review communica	TIME G:22827 8/12/2015 Ition from E. Rowe to Scrap ling company's violation of	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	Chase Bank regarding citation	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 ;UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
Communications w		JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
7/9/2015 Billed Leave voicemail for outstanding citation contact information correspondence with motion for turnover;	G:22922 9/8/2015 Chase Bank regarding response; search for alternate	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.75 0.00	175.00 C@5	131.25

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
365206 TIME 7/10/2015	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56	1.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	218.75
365408 TIME 7/10/2015 Billed G:22922 9/8/201 Receive and prepare documents for e-filing; e-file motion, exhibits, certificate of service, order & notice of motion; receive email from court and prepare documents for distribution.	CC NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.40 0.00	90.00 C@7	126.00
366162 TIME 7/10/2015 Billed G:22922 9/8/201 Telephone call from Chase Bank regarding citatic response; draft motion for turn over order; review J. Barr's comments to motion for turn over order; correspondence with J. Barr regarding issuing citation to currency exchange; finalize motion for turn over order and prepare exhibits for electronic filing; draft motion for judgment against Scrap International.		2.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	385.00
365343 TIME 7/13/2015 Billed G:22922 9/8/201 Review draft motion for judgment against Scrap International and proposed order; draft comments and revisions to motion; communication with E. Rowe regarding motion and proposed order.		0.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	87.50
366167 TIME 7/13/2015 Billed G:22922 9/8/201 Draft motion for judgment against Scrap International; review J. Barr's comments and revisions to motion; revise motion; prepare notice of motion and proposed order; prepare exhibits to motion; finalize motion for e-filing; telephone call from Scrap International regarding motion for turn over order.		3.05 0.00	175.00 C@5	533.75

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page 24

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	E. Rowe regarding Rodgers for three to four months to remi	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
motion, exhibits, o	are documents for e-filing; e-file order, certificate of service and receive email from court and	CC NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 274	0.50 0.00	90.00 C@7	45.00
additional time to conference with J review turn over o against Union Recamounts held by I been reported in pwith Roger's Roof	G:22922 9/8/2015 om Roger's Roofing requesting pay off amount in turn over orde . Barr regarding Roger's Roofing rder from previous lawsuit cycling to determine whether Roger's Roofing should have previous lawsuit; telephone call ing's attorney agreeing to a con time to turn over amounts.		0.70 0.00	175.00 C@5	122.50
with E. Rowe rega	sponse from Chase; conference rding requesting bank records nt and citation to New Dolton	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
366719 7/16/2015 Billed Draft citation to Ne review letter from regarding motion f	ew Dolton Currency Exchange; Roger's Roofing's attorney	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.65 0.00	175.00 C@5	113.75
366727 7/17/2015 Billed Finalize and send citation to discove	New Dolton Currency Exchange	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
365596 TIME 7/20/2015	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.00	175.00 C@5	61.25
7/20/2015 Billed G:22922 9/8/2015 Conference with J. Barr regarding New Dolton Currency Exchange citation; telephone conference with New Dolton Currency Exchange regarding citation; telephone conference with Chase Bank regarding additional documentation needed in response to citation; conference with J. Barr in preparation for hearing on motion for turnover order; revise proposed order and send to court.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.00 0.00	175.00 C@5	175.00
366748 TIME 7/21/2015 Billed G:22922 9/8/2015 Prepare for and attend hearing on motion for turn over order and motion for judgment against Scrap International.	ER NORMAL BIT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	157.50
7/21/2015 Billed G:22922 9/8/2015 Telephone call from K. Raczkowski regarding amounts owed to Union Recycling by Midwest Industrial Metals; review Midwest Industrial Metal's citation response to determine whether it reflects information provided by Union Recycling; review Chase Bank's filed citation response; draft letter to Chase Bank requesting additional documentation.		1.00 0.00	175.00 C@5	175.00
365902 TIME 7/23/2015 Billed G:22922 9/8/2015 Review orders entered by court; communication with E. Rowe regarding collecting on judgment against Scrap International.	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
366769 TIME 7/23/2015 Billed G:22922 9/8/2015 Review order from court regarding judgment against Scrap International; conference with J. Ba regarding order.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( rr	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00

Page 26

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
366344 7/28/2015 Billed Conference with J regarding lien reco	TIME  G:22922  9/8/201  Lannoye and E. Rowe  orded against company property	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
367000 7/28/2015 Billed Conference with J. lien filed on K. Rad	TIME G:22922 9/8/201 Lannoye and J. Barr regarding zkowski's property by Fund.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 J UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
367455 7/28/2015 Billed Conference with E recording lien agai	. Rowe and J. Barr regarding	JJL NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	240.00 C@1	24.00
368346 8/10/2015 Billed Review copy of tur		ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	l entered turnover order; E. Rowe regarding status of	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
turnover order, forw	TIME  G:23005 9/30/2019  vith E. Rowe regarding entered varding it to citation status of citation to currency	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
	TIME  G:23005 9/30/2019 ith J. Barr regarding sending third-party citation respondents	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
orders to citation re	rith E. Rowe regarding sending espondents and currency to provide documents by	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
368658 TIME 8/17/2015 Billed G:23005 Draft letters to third-party citation regarding Turn Over Order; calcul owed to each Fund by each respondence with J. Barr regarexchange citation response.	ate amounts ndent;	1.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	245.00
367913 TIME 8/18/2015 Billed G:23005 Communications with E. Rowe regexchange's final deadline for productions.	JMB NORMAL 9/30/2015 IBT 731 SF 56 garding currency UNION RECYCLIN ucing	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
368666 TIME 8/18/2015 Billed G:23005 Finalize and send letters to citation regarding Turn Over Order; correst Barr regarding currency exchange response.	spondence with J.	0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75
368689 TIME 8/18/2015 Billed G:23005 Telephone call to currency exchar communications with J. Barr regarcitation response.		0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
368179 TIME 8/19/2015 Billed G:23005 Review letters to citation responde turnover order.	JMB NORMAL 9/30/2015 IBT 731 SF 56 ents regarding UNION RECYCLIN	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
368688 TIME 8/19/2015 Billed G:23005 Review correspondence from R. Fregarding Turn Over Order; review exchange citation response.		0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
368262 TIME 8/20/2015 Billed G:23005 Conference with E. Rowe regarding records from currency exchange a additional citations.		0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50

Page 28

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
368704 8/20/2015 Billed Conference with J exchange's citation	TIME  G:23005  Barr regarding currency response and issuing to customers identified in	ER NORMAL BIT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	TIME  G:23005  vith Rayner & Rinn-Scott and E. tters sent in wrong envelopes.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.10	175.00 C@5 Do Not Bill	17.50
Rinn-Scott regardi		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
368904 8/24/2015 Billed Review payment fr over payment statu	om R. Rinn-Scott; update turn	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
citation cover letter	TIME  G:23005  ye additional customers; draft re; finalize citations and aff regarding mailing citations.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	218.75
368639 8/28/2015 Billed Communication wir payment from Scra	th E. Rowe regarding receipt of	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
correspondence lo Dependable Law C log; conference wit	TIME  G:23005  9/30/2015  om Scrap International; update g; review citation response from eare; update correspondence h E. Contreras regarding s to be sent to Funds.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.00	175.00 C@5	61.25

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
368803 TIME 8/31/2015	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	87.50
369609 TIME 8/31/2015 Billed G:23005 9/30/2015 Correspondence to and from J. Barr regarding Dependable Lawn Care's citation response; draft letter to Fund regarding status of payments towards judgment; review J. Barr's revisions to letter to Fund and finalize and send letter.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.00 0.00	175.00 C@5	175.00
368985 TIME 9/1/2015 Billed G:23106 11/3/2015 Communications with E. Rowe regarding check from SIMS Metal Management to the company; communications with S. Nimmer regarding absence of contribution reports, estimation of judgment amounts, and how to apply contributions	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
369637 TIME 9/1/2015 Billed G:23106 11/3/2015 Review citation response from Midwest Industrial Metals; update correspondence chart; review correspondence from Funds regarding how to apply payments toward judgment.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	. 175.00 C@5	52.50
370064 TIME 9/8/2015 Billed G:23106 11/3/2015 Review and respond to email from Hyland Noland regarding citation response; review copies of invoices from Union Recycling to Hyland Nolad; update correspondence chart; review payment from Rogers' Roofing Inc.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	87.50
369724 TIME 9/9/2015 Billed G:23106 11/3/2015 Conference with E. Rowe regarding recent citation responses and collections strategy.	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 1 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
370088 9/9/2015 Billed Draft cover letter to Roofing payment a amount; conference to issue citations to response from Acceitation and update	TIME  G:23106  Funds regarding Rogers' and outstanding judgment be with J. Barr regarding wheth defendants; review citation of Metal Recycling in response e correspondence chart; finaliz Fund regarding Rogers' Roofin	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( er	1.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	227.50
370121 9/10/2015 Billed Draft citations to d		ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.00	175.00 C@5	61.25
369994 9/11/2015 Billed Conference with E defendants.	TIME G:23106 11/3/201 . Rowe regarding citations to	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
citation and update citations and cover	Cleary's response to third part e correspondence chart; draft letters to all four defendants; Barr regarding personal service		1.80 0.00	175.00 C@5	315.00
requirements for se	TIME  G:23106 11/3/201 defendants; review erving individuals with citations aff regarding sending citations.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	157.50
371422 10/2/2015 Billed Atty Work Product	TIME G:23214 12/4/201	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 JNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	87.50
371545 10/2/2015 Billed Atty Work Product	TIME G:23214 12/4/201	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	87.50

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
372088 TIME 10/5/2015	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
371825 TIME 10/6/2015 Billed G:23214 12/4/2019 Communication from E. Rowe regarding rescheduling owner's citation examination.	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
372092 TIME 10/6/2015 Billed G:23214 12/4/2019 Schedule new date for citation deposition of defendants; draft correspondence to defendants regarding new deposition date.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
372410 TIME 10/13/2015 Billed G:23214 12/4/2019 Correspondence with staff to schedule court reporter; draft correspondence to K. Raczkowski tremind him of depositions.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( o	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
372262 TIME 10/14/2015 Billed G:23214 12/4/2019 Conferences with E. Rowe regarding strategy for citation examination, testimony from citation examination, and collections strategy.	JMB NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	87.50
372414 TIME 10/14/2015 Billed G:23214 12/4/2019 Prepare for citation deposition of defendants; take deposition of defendants; conference with J. Barr regarding collection strategy.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 9 UNION RECYCLING (	3.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	542.50
372449 TIME 10/16/2015 Billed G:23214 12/4/201 Draft correspondence to Rayner Rinn-Scott requesting update on accounts payable to Union Recycling; draft letter to Roger's Roofing, Inc.'s attorney requesting update on accounts payable t Union Recycling; identify and create list of third-party respondents to follow up with in preparation for filing motion for turn over order.	ER NORMAL 5 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	87.50

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
372962 TIME 10/20/2015	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50
372982 TIME 10/22/2015 Billed G:23214 12/4/2015 Review updated citation response from Rock Tenr Company and update correspondence chart.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
372986 TIME 10/23/2015 Billed G:23214 12/4/2015 Review updated citation response from Scrap International and update correspondence chart.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
373306 TIME 10/27/2015 Billed G:23214 12/4/2015 Telephone call from Cook County Environmental Control requesting information regarding K. Raczkowski.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
373525 TIME 10/28/2015 Billed G:23214 12/4/2015 Review correspondence from K. Raczkowski regarding outstanding invoices to customers.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
373776 TIME 11/2/2015 Billed G:23315 12/30/2015 Telephone call to Rogers Roofing for update on assets in accounts payable to Union Recycling; send request for update on citation response to American Lawn Company and Central Metal Recycling Inc; review updated responses from American Lawn Company and Central Metal Recycling Inc. and update correspondence chart; draft motion to extend citations.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.00 0.00	175.00 C@5	175.00
373781 TIME 11/3/2015 Billed G:23315 12/30/2015 Draft motion to extend citation; research case law granting motions to extend citations; draft correspondence to Union Recycling's customers for updates on responses to citations to discover	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	3.05 0.00	175.00 C@5	533.75

#### DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
assets.  373843 TIME 11/4/2015 Billed G:2337 Communications with E. R Construction regarding cor invoices; conference with I company's continuous viol bargaining agreement and Atty Work Product	owe and Golf mpany's failure to issue E. Rowe regarding ations of collective	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75
374162 TIME 11/4/2015 Billed G:233' Draft motion to extend cita correspondence from Golf to citation; telephone call fi Corp.; conference with J. E proceed with regard to coll Recycling; revise memoral regarding future collection Recycling; telephone call to Management regarding cit correspondence from Quir Rayner Rinn-Scott; update	tions; review Aquisition in response rom American Lawn Barr regarding how to lecting from Union adum to trustees efforts against Union o SIMS Midwest Metal ation; review acy Recycling and	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	2.00	175.00 C@5	350.00
373946 TIME 11/5/2015 Billed G:233 Review motion to extend o motion, and certificate of s with E. Rowe regarding mo	itations, notice of ervice; communications	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
374001 TIME 11/5/2015 Billed G:233 Receive and prepare documotion, certificate of service receive email from court a for distribution.	ments for e-filing; e-file ce and notice of motion;	CC NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 274	0.90 0.00	90.00 C@7	81.00
374163 TIME 11/5/2015 Billed G:233 Draft motion to extend cita revisions; prepare certifica of motion; correspondence filing motion to extend cita	tions; review J. Barr's te of service and notice with staff regarding	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	210.00

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
374893 11/9/2015 Billed Telephone call fro motion to extend o	m Rogers Roofing regarding	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
citations; review ju review correspond regarding addition	tend hearing on motion to exten idge's order granting motion; lence from Roger's Roofing al amounts held in accounts Recycling and update	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 dUNION RECYCLING (	1.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	280.00
	ommunication with E. Rowe tending citations and seeking	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
order extending cit	TIME  G:23315  Barr regarding wording of court ations; draft correspondence to requesting clarification on length	,	0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50
	TIME G:23315 12/30/2015 dence from K. Raczkowski ling accounts receivable.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	nd to correspondence from K. ding amounts in Union	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
377344 12/17/2015 Billed Communications we collections on judg collections.	TIME  G:23415  vith E. Rowe regarding status of ment and strategy for	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00

Dates and Time Posting Status	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
378014 TIME 12/17/2015 Billed G:23415 2/8/2016	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50
12/23/2015 Billed G:23415 2/8/2016	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
Billed G:23529 3/3/2016	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 · 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10	175.00 C@5	17.50
379617 TIME 1/22/2016 Billed G:23529 3/3/2016 Communication with E. Rowe regarding status of collections.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.65 0.00	175.00 C@5	113.75
380386 TIME 1/26/2016 Billed G:23529 3/3/2016 Send request for updated citation response to Dependable Lawn Care, Midwest Industrial Metals	ER NORMAL BIT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	280.00

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

from American Lav	tional; review correspondence wn Corporation regarding	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
amounts held belo motion for turnove	nging to Union Recycling; draft rorder.				
concerning additio	TIME  G:23529  dence from Scrap International invoice received from Union chart of amounts being held.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
collections, collecti motion, obtaining a	with E. Rowe regarding status of ions strategy, filing turnover additional records from currency nental judgment, and issuing	•	0.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	105.00
outstanding invoice calls to citation res	TIME  G:23633  M/8/2016  The four customers regarding  The sets of Union Recycling; telephone  The pondents who haven't provided  The amounts held; draft motion for	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	3.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	560.00
subpoena to AT&T certificates of servi Atty Work Product	rith E. Rowe regarding issuing ; review draft subpoenas and ce:Attv Work Product  ding owner's offer to provide	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	157.50
issue subpoenals fremail records; Atty Atty Work Product Atty Work Product	G:23633 4/8/2016 ith J. Barr regarding whether to or Union Recycling's phone and	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	3.80 0.00	175.00 C@5	665.00

### DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description outstanding amounts; Attv Work Atty Work Product review updated correspondence regarding additional amounts he Union Recycling; update motion	e from customers eld belonging to for turn over order	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
prepare notice of motion and ce  385263 TIME 2/2/2016 Billed G:23633 Time not charged relating to pre	4/8/2016	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	2.00 2.00	175.00 C@5 No Charge	350.00
380870 TIME 2/3/2016 Billed G:23633 Review motion for turnover, noticertificate of service, and propos	ice of motion,	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
381116 TIME 2/3/2016 Billed G:23633 Review J. Barr's comments regular turnover order; review corresponding to the contractors regard amounts held subject to turn ow staff regarding locating new fax Ameritech subpoena.	arding motion for ndence from ding additional er; conference with		0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
380901 TIME 2/4/2016 Billed G:23633 Review final, filed version of moorder; docket hearing date.		JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.10	175.00 C@5 No Charge	17.50
380941 TIME 2/4/2016 Billed G:23633 Receive and prepare document motion, exhibits, certificate of se motion and order; receive email prepare documents for distribut	s for e-filing; e-file ervice, notice of from court and	CC NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 274	1.20 0.00	90.00 C@7	108.00
381506 TIME 2/4/2016 Billed G:23633 Finalize motion for turnover orderstend citation; prepare exhibits	er and motion to	ER NORMAL BT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	87.50

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
385264 TIME 2/4/2016 Billed G:23633 Time not charged relating to pre		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.75 0.75	175.00 C@5 No Charge	131.25
381514 TIME 2/5/2016 Billed G:23633 Call from Cleary & Jones in resp		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
381069 TIME 2/8/2016 Billed G:23633 Communication and conference regarding citation respondent's learning amount held has been lowered to	with E. Rowe etter stating that	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
381567 TIME  2/8/2016  Billed G:23633  Review and respond to corresponding to change review letter from Hyland Nolan lowering the previously reported accounts payable to Union Recycorrespondence with Hyland Nolan regarding reason for the reduced telephone call from American Langered regarding motion for turn over or	endence from K. the meeting date; Contractors amount held as coling; lan's attorney d amount; lan Corporation	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.70 0.00	175.00 C@5	122.50
381147 TIME 2/9/2016 Billed G:23633 Conference with E. Rowe regard with owner and collections strate	4/8/2016 ling her meeting	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
381575 TIME 2/9/2016 Billed G:23633 Telephone call from Hyland Nola requesting change to proposed or reduced amount being held; revisand send Hyland Nolan confirma prepare for meeting with K. Raczwith K. Raczkowski to discuss or invoices; review invoices provide Raczkowski to determine whether already been subject to turn over motions; conference with J. Barrwith K. Raczkowski.	4/8/2016 an's attorney order to reflect se proposed order tion of change; ekowski; meeting utstanding d by K. er any have	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	332.50

Page

Slip ID		Attorney	Units	Rate	Slip Value
Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Activity Client Reference	DNB Time	Rate Info Bill Status	Onp value
381336 2/11/2016 Billed	Rowe regarding hearing on	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
381597 2/11/2016 Billed Attend hearing on a conference with J.		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	157.50
regarding requestir	ders; conference with E. Roweing that citation respondent pay that have become due	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
turn over order; dra respondents regard to New Doltan Curi extension of citatio citation response; d	TIME  G:23633  4/8/2016 due to each Fund pursuant to aft cover letters to citation ding turn over orders; draft letter rency Exchange regarding n and requesting an updated conference with J. Barr all invoices provided by K.		2.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	385.00
order; review corre	TIME  G:23633  4/8/2016 wn Corp. copy of turn over spondence from Rock-Tenn e citation correspondence file.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
382188 2/16/2016 Billed Add additional invo	ices provided by K. Raczkowski	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
AT&T to determine Recycling is still do	TIME  G:23633  4/8/2016  e phone records provided by  which customers Union  ing business with; review and ondence from American Lawn	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	262.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Corp.		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
385265 2/17/2016 Billed	TIME G:23633 4/8/2 relating to previous entry.	ER NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.50 1.50	175.00 C@5 No Charge	262.50
	TIME G:23633 4/8/2 r to Rock-Tenn regarding tu ue reviewing and analyzing /		1.65 0.00	175.00 C@5	288.75
		JMB NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 om UNION RECYCLING ( ctions	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
regarding turn ove			0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50
	TIME G:23633 4/8/2 vith E. Rowe and West Rocl unting error and how to corre		0.20	175.00 C@5	35.00
an error it made in		ER NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 IrdingUNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
382351 2/23/2016 Billed Conference with E subpoena to Yahoo	. Rowe regarding issuing	JMB NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
383300 2/23/2016 Billed	TIME G:23633 4/8/2	ER NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56	0.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	157.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

determine correct to; prepare and se turn over payment Scrap Internationa	s subpoena response and email carrier to issue subpoena nd subpoena to Yahoo!; review from Rayner Rinn-Scott and I, Inc.; telephone call from Hylar's attorney regarding timing of		Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	TIME G:23633 4/8/2016 ton currency exchange n to discover assets.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
Corp.; draft corres concerning Fund's court order; resear	TIME  G:23633  ayment from American Lawn pondence to Rock Tenn position that it must comply wit ch whether Lexis can be used to		0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75
	TIME G:23698 4/28/2016 dence from Hyland Nolan concerning turn over payment.	ER NORMAL 3 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
383235 3/3/2016 Billed Conferences with currency exchange Atty Work Product Atty Work Product Atty-Client Priv.	E. Rowe regarding status of e's response to citation, strategy	JMB NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.65 0.00	175.00 C@5	113.75
concerning overdu with J. Barr regard with J. Barr conce and strategy going	G:23698 4/28/2016 ence with Currency Exchange are citation response; conference ling phone records; conference rning conversation with R. Lace a forward; organize phone tion for staff research project.		1.70 0.00	175.00 C@5	297.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
384491 TIME 3/4/2016	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56	0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
		0.35 0.00	175.00 C@5	61.25
384505 TIME 3/8/2016 Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 Telephone call to Rogers Roofing's attorney to check on status of turn over payment; correspondence with J. Barr regarding turn over payments; draft correspondence to Rock-Tenn Corp. threatening contempt proceedings if payment is not made; review and respond to correspondence from Rock-Tenn Corp.'s attorney concerning mistakenly reported payments owed to Union Recycling; prepare instructions for staff for researching telephone number log.	ER NORMAL BIT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.80 0.00	175.00 C@5	140.00
383924 TIME 3/9/2016 Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 Communications with E. Rowe and Rock Tenn regarding its options for resolving allegedly erroneous turnover order; conference with E. Row regarding her telephone conference with Rock Tenn's in-house counsel and how to proceed.	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50
384519 TIME 3/9/2016 Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 Telephone call from Rock-Tenn Corp's attorney concerning his dispute with turn over order.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
384530 TIME 3/11/2016 Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 Telephone call to Rogers Roofing's attorney concerning outstanding turn over payment; review spreadsheet of phone numbers prepared by staff.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
384304 TIME 3/17/2016	JMB NORMAL BIT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
385197 TIME 3/17/2016 Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 Telephone call to Rogers Roofing's attorney requesting status of turn over payment; draft letter to Rogers Roofing; telephone call from Rogers Roofing's attorney.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.75 0.00	175.00 C@5	131.25
384400 TIME 3/18/2016 Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 Review draft letter to R. Clarson enclosing turnove payments.	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 PUNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
385215 TIME 3/18/2016 Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 Draft letter to R. Clarson concerning turn over payments and outstanding judgment amount.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
384777 TIME 3/24/2016 Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 Conference with E. Rowe regarding investigation of company's phone records and production of documents by currency exchange.; review and notate spreadsheet with results of investigation; Atty Work Product	JMB NORMAL SIBT 731 SF 56 OFUNION RECYCLING (	0.55 0.00	175.00 C@5	96.25
385660 TIME 3/24/2016 Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 Conference with J. Barr regarding preparing citations based on phone records; conference with J. Barr regarding status of New Dolton Currency Exchange's citation response.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
384867 TIME 3/25/2016 Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 Review and revise draft letter to currency exchange.	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID  Dates and Time  Posting Status  Description  Attorney  Activity  Client  Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
385667 TIME ER 3/25/2016 NORMAL Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 Draft and revise letter to New Dolton Currency UNION RECYCLING Exchange concerning contempt proceedings; determine which companies to issue citations to based on phone records and prepare spreadsheet of contact information; draft citations to discover assets.	2.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	367.50
384980 TIME JMB 3/28/2016 NORMAL Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 Communications with E. Rowe regarding payroll UNION RECYCLING and fleet services company included in phone records; research company; review, revise, and draft comments to new citations and cover letters.	0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75
385670 TIME ER 3/28/2016 NORMAL Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 Prepare citations and cover letters to 13 new UNION RECYCLING businesses; sign citations and conference with staff regarding issuing citations.	1.95 0.00 G (	175.00 C@5	341.25
385689 TIME ER 3/30/2016 NORMAL Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 Telephone call from Midwest Hardwood Supply; UNION RECYCLING review and respond to correspondence from Midwest Hardwood Supply concerning citation; update citation chart to reflect assets belonging to Union Recycling.	0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
385692 TIME ER 3/31/2016 NORMAL Billed G:23698 4/28/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 Telephone conference with K. Raczkowski UNION RECYCLING concerning his desire to pay off judgment; telephone call from Central Painting in response to citation.	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
386731 TIME ER 4/4/2016 NORMAL Billed G:23845 6/6/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 Correspondence from Palazzo Disposal UNION RECYCLING concerning citation; correspondence from C. Berrien concerning citation; telephone call to Rogers' Roofing concerning outstanding turn over payment; review additional checks provided by New Dolton Currency Exchange; review Yahoo's subpoena response; update citation	1.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	253.75

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description correspondence cl	nart.	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
386740 4/5/2016 Billed Review correspondence correspondence cl	TIME  G:23845 6/6/2016 dence from Mac Solutions n; update citation nart; review payment from lraft cover letter to Fund t from Rogers' Roofing and	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	157.50
records received for to which currency and potential contential contential contential recent citation phone calls from contential contential from contential contenti	G:23845 6/6/2016 . Rowe regarding additional rom currency exchange, extent exchange has withheld records empt proceedings, responses to ns, issuing additional citations, wher, and citation respondent's any in violation of citation.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40	175.00 C@5	70.00
Rogers' Roofing p from Panozzo Rec Trucking concerni correspondence c concerning citation	G:23845 6/6/2016 etter to R. Clarson concerning ayment; review citation response cycling; telephone call from R&J ng citation; update citation hart; conference with J. Barr n responses and strategy going e call from K. Raczkowski.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.55 0.00	175.00 C@5	271.25
concerning citation	TIME  G:23845 6/6/2016  vith citation respondents  ns; update correspondence char  nce with citation respondents.	ER NORMAL BT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( t;	0.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	105.00
citation; update cit telephone call fron	dence from Comdata concerning ation correspondence chart; n Acme Lumber concerning c from Acme Lumber and update		0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	TIME G:23845 6/6/2016 dditional customers revealed in ncy Exchange checks.	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	227.50
387141 4/13/2016 Billed Conference with s to discover assets	taff concerning sending citations	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
387587 4/18/2016 Billed Review correspon concerning citation	dence from Acme Lumber	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
386925 4/20/2016 Billed Atty-Client Priv.	TIME G:23845 6/6/2016	JMB NORMAL BBT 731 SF 56 JNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
387605 4/20/2016 Billed Atty-Client Priv.	TIME G:23845 6/6/2016	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
388165 4/22/2016 Billed Review undelivera and determine who	TIME  G:23845 6/6/2016 ble mail to citation respondents ether it needs to be re-sent.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
citation; review Leg	TIME  G:23845  n K.E. Murphy concerning ggett & Platt citation response; lence chart; review undeliverable	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75
citation response;	G:23845 6/6/2016 m Arcelor's attorney concerning review correspondence from ation correspondence chart.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00

### DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
388266 4/27/2016 Billed	cuments sent by Arcelor in n; update citation	ER NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
	TIME  G:23845 6/6/201  Rowe regarding collections strategy, and responses to	JMB NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50
	sponses; conference with J. Ba f citations and amount that is	ER NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 rr UNION RECYCLING (	0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75
389026 5/3/2016 Billed Request payment new citation respon	for Yahoo! subpoena; review	ER NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
389233 5/4/2016 Billed Correspondence fi citation to discover	rom Bayou Steel concerning	ER NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
389242 5/5/2016 Billed Send subpoena pa		ER NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.10	175.00 C@5 No Charge	17.50
	TIME G:23950 7/7/201 m Steven Keefe Construction n to discovery assets.	ER NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
388946 5/17/2016 Billed Communication wind collections.	TIME G:23950 7/7/201 ith E. Rowe regarding status of	JMB NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
391762 5/17/2016 Billed	TIME G:23950 7/7/2016 rith J. Barr regarding status of	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	ence with Steve O'Keefe erning citations; review status of	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.60 0.00	175.00 C@5	105.00
389161 5/20/2016 Billed Conference with E citation responses	. Rowe regarding status of	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	a 17.50
389726 5/20/2016 Billed Conference with J responses.	TIME G:23950 7/7/2016 Barr regarding status of citation	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	TIME G:24046 8/9/2016 m American Lawn Corp. mal invoices received.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
391011 6/13/2016 Billed Communication win citation responses Atty Work Product	TIME  G:24046 8/9/2016 ith E. Rowe regarding status of and turnover order and	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
391099 6/14/2016 Billed Atty Work Product	TIME G:24046 8/9/2016	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	175.00 C@5	52.50
391755 6/14/2016 Billed Conference with J.		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description prepared to file and	other motion for turnover		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
392173 6/16/2016 Billed	TIME	/9/2016	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	43.75
	TIME G:24046 8/ th E. Rowe regarding star and turnover motion.		JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
392258 6/23/2016 Billed Correspondence w motion for turnove	rith J. Barr regarding filing		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	TIME G:24046 8/ m DJ Remodeling concer on for turnover order.		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.25 0.00	175.00 C@5	218.75
extension of citation	on for turnover order and ons, proposed order, and nce with E. Rowe regardi	notice	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.55 0.00	175.00 C@5	96.25
392266 6/28/2016 Billed Continue drafting r J. Barr's revisions;	TIME  G:24046 8/ motion for turnover order; prepare certificate of ser	; review	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	2.05 0.00	175.00 C@5	358.75
updated response service for motion	vith Leggett & Platt reque to citation; revise certification;	sting ar ate of	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 DUNION RECYCLING (	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
392090 6/30/2016 Billed	TIME G:24046 8/	/9/2016	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Review filed motion date.	on for turnover; docket hearing	Attorney Activity Client Reference UNION RECYCLING (	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
concerning its obli Fund in response	m Leggett & Platt's attorney gation to turnover information to to citation; prepare exhibits for r order; finalize motion for	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	157.50
motion, exhibits, c	are documents for e-filing; e-file ertificate of service, notice of receive email from court and	CC NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.15 0.00	90.00 C@7	103.50
393326 7/5/2016 Billed Review correspon concerning assets	dence from Leggett & Platt	ER NORMAL BBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	TIME G:24087 8/31/2016 eidrich Construction; th E. Rowe regarding voicemail.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
regarding motion f			0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
393338 7/7/2016 Billed Prepare for and at turnover order.	TIME G:24087 8/31/2016 tend hearing on motion for	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.80 0.00	175.00 C@5	140.00
392688 7/8/2016 Billed Review orders gra	TIME G:24087 8/31/2016 nting turnover motion.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
393070 TIME 7/12/2016	JMB NORMAL /31/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 s holding UNION RECYCLING ( on of	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
393365 TIME 7/12/2016 Billed G:24087 8 Draft cover letters to citation respondents regarding turn over order; conference with regarding mass mailing.	ER NORMAL /31/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( n staff	1.90 0.00	175.00 C@5	332.50
393379 TIME 7/14/2016 Billed G:24087 8 Telephone calls and emails from citation respondents in response to letter requesting updates.	ER NORMAL 5/31/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( ing	0.40 0.00	175.00 C@5	70.00
393393 TIME 7/15/2016 Billed G:24087 8 Review and respond to correspondence fi Rayner Rinn Scott concerning its lack of b with Union Recycling; update correspondence for the content of the correspondence for the correspondence fo	ousiness	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
394318 TIME 7/19/2016 Billed G:24087 8 Telephone call from Chase Bank regardir to extend citations; review correspondence Quincy Recycling regarding amounts held accounts payable to Union Recycling.	ce from	0.20 0.00	175.00 C@5	35.00
394328 TIME 7/20/2016 Billed G:24087 8 Review correspondence from citation respondence from cita	ER NORMAL 3/31/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 pondents UNION RECYCLING (	0.45 0.00	175.00 C@5	78.75
394335 TIME 7/21/2016 Billed G:24087 8 Review citation response from Arcelor La	ER NORMAL 3/31/2016 IBT 731 SF 56 Place. UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
394343 7/22/2016 Billed Review citation up	date from Hylan Nolan ayment from American Lawn	ER NORMAL 3 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
394452 7/25/2016 Billed Review correspon regarding citation.	TIME G:24087 8/31/2016 dence from Chase Bank	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
393855 7/26/2016 Billed Review citation res	TIME G:24087 8/31/2016 sponse filed by Chase.	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
394462 7/26/2016 Billed Conference with J citation response.	TIME G:24087 8/31/2016 Barr regarding Chase Bank's	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
394476 7/27/2016 Billed Review and responden citation responden held; update corre	nd to correspondence from ts with updates on amounts	ER NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	175.00 C@5	87.50
394131 7/29/2016 Billed Conference with E amounts being hel	. Rowe regarding addition	JMB NORMAL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	175.00 C@5	26.25
	TIME G:24087 8/31/2016 Barr regarding additional d subject to turnover.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	dence from Chicago Rolled erning amounts being held in	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
394529 8/2/2016 Billed	. Rowe regarding status of	JMB NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
	c Solutions regarding paymernover order; conference w	ER NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 ent UNION RECYCLING ( th J.	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
395655 8/3/2016 Billed Telephone call from		ER NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
395690 8/11/2016 Billed Review correspon- concerning turnov	dence from Mac Solutions	ER NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	175.00 C@5	17.50
395880 8/18/2016 Billed Review letter to R. checks; Atty-Clien Atty-Client Priv	Clarson enclosing turnove	JMB NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.70 0.00	175.00 C@5	122.50
	taff regarding receipt of turr · to Fund regarding balance	ER NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 nover UNION RECYCLING ( on	0.65 0.00	175.00 C@5	113.75
397509 8/18/2016 Billed Atty Work Product		JJL NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.55 0.00	240.00 C@1	132.00
397420 9/1/2016 Billed Correspondence v regarding citation.	TIME G:24298 11/10/ vith American Lawn Service	ER NORMAL 2016 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 496	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
398699 9/20/2016 Billed	. Barr regarding filing another	ER NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
401010 9/20/2016 Billed Conference with E motion for turnove	. Rowe regarding filing another	JMB NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
	TIME G:24419 12/7/201 rom American Lawn Service ed citation response.	ER NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
400615 10/27/2016 Billed Conference with E status and strated Atty Work Product		JMB NORMAL 6 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50	225.00 C@5	112.50
strategy; draft lette	TIME  G:24419  Barr regarding collection  to New Dolton Currency ing updated citation response.	ER NORMAL 8 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.85 0.00	225.00 C@5	191.25
402732 11/8/2016 Billed Telephone call from Exchange.	TIME G:24509 1/6/2011 n New Dolton Currency	ER NORMAL 7 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
	rith citation respondents to amounts being held in	ER NORMAL 7 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.60 0.00	225.00 C@5	135.00
	TIME G:24509 1/6/2017 om citation respondents n amounts being held.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.20 0.00	225.00 C@5	45.00

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
11/21/2016 Billed Draft motion for turr	nover order; correspondence dents regarding updates on	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.20 0.00	225.00 C@5	270.00
11/22/2016 Billed Communications wirequest for judgmer that he will pay the creview draft turnove with E. Rowe regard moving for an order	G:24509 1/6/2017 ith E. Rowe regarding owner's not balance and representation outstanding amounts owed; or motion filing; communication ding turnover motion and requiring company to issue in the normal course of		0.35 0.00	225.00 C@5	78.75
11/22/2016 Billed Draft motion for turi	nover order; correspondence ndents; correspondence from h	ER NORMAL 7 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( K.	1.80 0.00	225.00 C@5	405.00
11/23/2016 Billed Review additional p regarding ordering	paragraphs of turnover motion company to issue invoices to it nications with E. Rowe		0.15 0.00	225.00 C@5	33.75
	from J. Barr regarding motion	ER NORMAL 7 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	225.00 C@5	112.50
Receive and prepar motion, exhibits, ce	re documents for e-filing; e-file rtificate of service, notice of receive email from court and	CC NORMAL 7 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 274	0.85 0.00	100.00 C@7	85.00
403000 11/28/2016 Billed	TIME G:24509 1/6/201	ER NORMAL 7 IBT 731 SF 56	0.70 0.00	225.00 C@5	157.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Finalize motion for exhibits for e-filing	turnover order and prepare	Attorney Activity Client Reference UNION RECYCLING (	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	TIME G:24509 1/6/2017 rom and to K. Raczkowski ling balance on judgment.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	225.00 C@5	56.25
	TIME G:24566 2/9/2017 rom and to Hylan Nolan ey regarding Motion for Turn	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	225.00 C@5	67.50
404911 12/2/2016 Billed Revise proposed o	TIME G:24566 2/9/2017 order for hearing on 12/5.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
telephone call from	TIME  G:24566  2/9/2017 motion for turn over order; n citation respondent regarding e's order on motion.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1.15 0.00	225.00 C@5	258.75
403559 12/6/2016 Billed Review orders grap Atty Work Product	TIME G:24566 2/9/2017 nting turnover motion:	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.50 0.00	225.00 C@5	112.50
405169 12/6/2016 Billed Draft letters to citat over order; (Atty W Atty Work	tion respondents concerning turn	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 DUNION RECYCLING (	1.15 0.00	225.00 C@5	258.75
	TIME G:24566 2/9/2017 to owner regarding order ue invoices to customers.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50

### DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
405185 12/8/2016 Billed	TIME G:24566 2/9/2017 tter to K. Raczkowski regarding	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56	0.50 0.00	225.00 C@5	112.50
403797 12/9/2016 Billed Atty Work Product	TIME G:24566 2/9/2017	JMB NORMAL BT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.75 0.00	225.00 C@5	168.75
405196 12/9/2016 Billed Atty Work Product		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 INION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	225.00 C@5	56.25
405979 12/9/2016 Billed Atty Work Product		JJL NORMAL 'IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 276	0.20 0.00	300.00 C@1	60.00
405205 12/13/2016 Billed Correspondence f regarding turn ove	rom American Lawn Service	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
405226 12/15/2016 Billed Review payments and Chicago Rolle	from American Lawn Service	ER NORMAL 1BT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
404473 12/16/2016 Billed Communications v respondent's requ	vith E. Rowe regarding citation	JMB NORMAL 1BT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
	TIME G:24566 2/9/2017 om Leggett & Platt requesting pondence with J. Barr regarding	ER NORMAL 7 IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	225.00 C@5	56.25

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description			Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
405239 12/19/2016 Billed Send W-9 forms t		2/9/2017	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
405493 12/20/2016 Billed Receive and revie	TIME G:24566 w payment from Leggel		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
	TIME G:24566 with Hyland Nolan's atto ding turnover payment.		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	225.00 C@5	33.75
405104 12/29/2016 Billed Review letter to R citation responder	. Clarson enclosing ched		JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
	TIME G:24566 Clarson enclosing turn over the control of the contro	/er	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.65 0.00	225.00 C@5	146.25
405876 1/6/2017 Billed Conferences with regarding case str	J. Lannoye and E. Rowe	3/7/2017	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30 0.00	225.00 C@5	67.50
	. Barr regarding collection ce with J. Lannoye rega	3/7/2017 on	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.30	225.00 C@5	67.50
408630 1/6/2017 Billed Conferences with case strategy.	TIME G:24737 J. Barr and E. Rowe reg	3/7/2017 garding	JJL NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 276	0.30 0.00	300.00 C@1	90.00
407741 1/23/2017 Billed	TIME G:24737		ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50

### DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Telephone call from outstanding balance	K. Raczkowski regarding e on judgment.	Attorney Activity Client Reference UNION RECYCLING (	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
3/8/2017 WIP	TIME th J. Lannoye and E. Rowe s status.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
3/8/2017 WIP	TIME th J. Lannoye regarding status s.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
3/9/2017 WIP Communications ar	TIME  nd conference with J. Lannoye n E. Rowe regarding collection	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.45 0.00	225.00 C@5	101.25
3/9/2017 WIP	TIME Barr regarding strategy for ent.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.25 0.00	225.00 C@5	56.25
413560 3/9/2017 WIP Atty Work Product	TIME	JJL NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 276	0.20 0.00	300.00 C@1	60.00
3/15/2017 WIP Conference with E.	TIME  Rowe regarding invoice ny reflecting a large balance customers.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
3/15/2017 WIP	TIME e for Scrap International.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
3/16/2017 WIP	TIME  pplemental judgment; draft order.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	3.90 0.00	225.00 C@5	877.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	TIME om Scrap International from Union Recycling.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
regarding amount b	TIME  mmunication with E. Rowe being held by Scrap Recycling lemental judgment for fees udgment.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
412527 3/29/2017 WIP Conference with J. amount to be collect	TIME  Barr regarding outstanding oted.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
4/6/2017 WIP Conference with J.	TIME  Lannoye regarding case status	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 ,UNION RECYCLING (	0.15 0.00	225.00 C@5	33.75
4/21/2017 WIP Communication with	TIME h E. Rowe regarding motions dgment and turnover order.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
4/21/2017 WIP	TIME ith J. Barr regarding motion for nent.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.00 0.00	225.00 C@5	0.00
4/24/2017 WIP Telephone calls fro	TIME m and to K. Raczkowski ng balance on judgment.	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.35 0.00	225.00 C@5	78.75
5/2/2017 WIP Communications wi	TIME th E. Rowe regarding motions dgment and turnover.	JMB NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description			Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
414996 5/2/2017 WIP Correspondence v	TIME with J. Barr regarding mo ment and motion for turn	otion for	ER NORMAL IBT 731 SF 56	0.10 0.00	225.00 C@5	22.50
Total: Time			Billable Unbillable Total	200.75 16.70 217.45		35567.25 2922.50 38489.75
349326 12/1/2014 Billed Complaint filing fee		2/9/2015	EIC EX IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 522/341	1	400.00	400.00
351493 12/2/2014 Billed Photocopying.	EXP G:22224		EIC PHOTOCOPYING IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	25	0.15	3.75
351312 12/10/2014 Billed Process Service: k 1/1/15 - \$570.00	EXP G:22224 2 K. Raczkowski. »ck# 419		JMB EX IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	115.00	115.00
351313 12/11/2014 Billed Process Service: k 1/1/15 - \$570.00	EXP G:22224 K. Raczkowski. »ck# 419		JMB EX IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	195.00	195.00
351314 12/15/2014 Billed Process Service: k 1/1/15 - \$570.00	EXP G:22224 K. Raczkowski. »ck# 419		JMB EX IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	195.00	195.00
Armor Recycling, I	rice: Armor Recycling of Inc., Kevin Raczkowski, e Services on 12/23/14.	Indiana, Union	JMB EX IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	315.00	315.00

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description			Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
351808 1/7/2015 Billed	EXP G:22274 t to R. Clarson. »visa	3/5/2015	EIC UPS IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	26.91	26.91
	EXP G:22274 , service of summons 1983 - 1/9/15 - \$65.00		JMB EX IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (		65.00	65.00
352331 1/22/2015 Billed Secretary of State	EXP G:22274 . »ck#41986 - 1/22/15		ER EX IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	20.00	20.00
352376 1/23/2015 Billed Certified letter to S	EXP G:22274 Secretary of State	3/5/2015	EIC CERTIFIED MAIL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	8.24	8.24
353806 1/31/2015 Billed Lexis charges.	EXP G:22274	3/5/2015	EIC LEXIS IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	43.10	43.10
355322 2/3/2015 Billed Photocopying.	EXP G:22423	4/7/2015	EIC PHOTOCOPYING IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	182	0.15	27.30
Services, Inc., Arm	EXP  G:22483  Inion Recycling & Washor Recycling, Inc. Armon, Inc. and K. Raczko	te nor wski.	EIC CERTIFIED MAIL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 57/205	2	7.82	15.64
355348 2/13/2015 Billed Photocopying.	EXP G:22483	5/8/2015	EIC PHOTOCOPYING IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 57/205	80	0.15	12.00
355776 2/28/2015 Billed Lexis charges.	EXP G:22423	4/7/2015	EIC LEXIS IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	1.32	1.32

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time		Slip Value
357912 3/11/2015 Billed Photocopying.	EXP G:22483 5/8	EIC PHOTOCOPY /2015 IBT 731 SF 50 UNION RECY	3	0.15	34.95
360956 3/31/2015 Billed Access to electron »ck#42125 - 5/8/1	ic court documents (PACE	EIC PACER /2015 IBT 731 SF 5 ER). UNION RECY		9.10	9.10
American Lawn Control Recycling, LLC, Construction Services, LLC, Gongany, Lundustrial Metals Control, Rayner & Ring Company, Rogers Inc., SET Enterprise	G:22580 6/12 Able Sewerage Company, orporation, Central Metal ommercial Carpet Consult Development, Inc., Cyprer If Acquisition Group, LLC, ake Builds, LLC, Midwest Corp., Quincy Recycle Papern-Scott, Inc., Rock-Term Roofing, Inc. Scrap Intern Sees, Inc., JPMorgan Chase entral Metal Recycling, LLC	n Ideal er, ational	6	7.19	122.23
360915 4/27/2015 Billed Photocopying.	EXP G:22580 6/12	EIC PHOTOCOPY 2015 IBT 731 SF 5 UNION RECY	6	0.15	<b>152.70</b>
363255 4/30/2015 Billed Four packages at	EXP G:22717 7/16 post office over 13 oz.	EIC PETTY CASH 1/2015 IBT 731 SF 5 UNION RECY	6	5.95	23.80
361024 5/15/2015 Billed Certified letter to A	EXP G:22717 7/16 Able Sewarage Company.	EIC CERTIFIED M 5/2015 IBT 731 SF 5 UNION RECY	6	7.19	7.19
365568 7/17/2015 Billed Certified letter to F Goodman.	EXP G:22922 9/8 Howard Mardell and Lon	EIC CERTIFIED M 1/2015 IBT 731 SF 5 UNION RECY	6	7.19	14.38
	EXP G:23005 9/30 Jones & Cleary Roofing, Care, Inc., Hyland A> Nol	EIC CERTIFIED M 1/2015 IBT 731 SF 5 UNION RECY an	6	7.19	35.95

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description Contractors, Inc., I and ACE Metal Se	Metal Management Mervice, Inc.	lidwest, Inc	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
369158 8/25/2015 Billed Photocopying.	EXP G:23005	9/30/2015	EIC PHOTOCOPYING BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	248	0.15	37.20
369911 8/31/2015 Billed UPS package sen	EXP G:23005 t to R. Clarson. »visa		EIC UPS IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	22.00	22.00
370204 9/9/2015 Billed UPS package sent	EXP G:23106 t to R. Clarson. »visa		EIC UPS IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	21.79	21.79
370031 9/14/2015 Billed Certified letters to Services, Inc.	EXP G:23106 Union Recycling & W		EIC CERTIFIED MAIL BBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	7.40	7.40
Services, inc.			from 274			
370033 9/14/2015 Billed Certified letter to A	EXP G:23106 urmor Recycling, Inc.	11/3/2015	EIC CERTIFIED MAIL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING ( from 274	1	6.91	6.91
371248	EXP		EIC	21	0.15	3.15
9/14/2015 Billed Photocopying.	G:23106	11/3/2015	PHOTOCOPYING IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (			
373898 9/30/2015 Billed Access to electron »ck# 42309 - 11/2/			EIC PACER IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	4.30	4.30
375641 10/14/2015 Billed Deposition of Kevir 11/23/15 - \$140.00	EXP G:23214 n Raczkowsi. »ck# 4:		ER EX IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	140.00	140.00
380724 2/2/2016 Billed Certified letter to S	EXP G:23633 BC Ameritech, AT&T		CC CERTIFIED MAIL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	3	7.20	21.60

Slip ID  Dates and Time Posting Status Description Services and AT&	T Wireless		Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
382369 2/23/2016 Billed	EXP G:23633	4/8/2016	EIC CERTIFIED MAIL IBT 731 SF 56	1	6.49	6.49
Certified letter to Y 385006 3/18/2016 Billed UPS package sen	EXP G:23698 t to Richard Clarson.		UNION RECYCLING ( EIC UPS IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	22.26	22.26
385172 3/28/2016 Billed Certified letters to Waster Associates Chicago Metal Rol Supply, LLC, Pacit Recycling, Central Lawn Maintenance Comdata TN, Inc., Materials, Inc., Re	EXP G:23698	4/28/2016  LC, National Service, est Harwood Trucking Shoppers & Inc., ilding Mitchell	EIC CERTIFIED MAIL IBT 731 SF 56 IUNION RECYCLING (	15	6.71	100.65
386288 3/28/2016 Billed Photocopying.	EXP G:23698	4/28/2016	EIC PHOTOCOPYING IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	240	0.15	36.00
386292 3/30/2016 Billed Photocopying.	EXP G:23698	4/28/2016	EIC PHOTOCOPYING IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	480	0.15	72.00
386682 3/31/2016 Billed Post office (4 item	EXP G:23698 s).	4/28/2016	EIC PETTY CASH IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	27.20	27.20
386372 4/6/2016 Billed UPS package sen	EXP G:23845 t to Richard Clarson.		EIC UPS IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	22.26	22.26
387942 4/12/2016 Billed Photocopying.	EXP G:23845	6/6/2016	EIC PHOTOCOPYING IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	64	0.15	9.60

# DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description			Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
Billings Roofing ar Construction, Inc., Leggett & Platt, Inc	nd Construction, DTM ArcelorMittal LaPlac c., Lynwood Recyclin Construction and K. E	i Company, I e, LLC, g Center,	EIC CERTIFIED MAIL BIBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	8	6.89	55.12
387960 4/13/2016 Billed Photocopying.	G:23845	6/6/2016	EIC PHOTOCOPYING IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	384	0.15	57.60
388206 5/3/2016 Billed Yahoo subpoena f	EXP G:23950 ee.	7/7/2016	ER EX IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	126.60	126.60
394490 7/12/2016 Billed Photocopying.	EXP G:24087	8/31/2016	EIC PHOTOCOPYING IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	96	0.15	14.40
396191 8/18/2016 Billed UPS package sent	EXP G:24193 t to Richard Clarson.		EIC UPS IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	1	22.75	22.75
	EXP G:24193 IcCue Builders (2), S pany, Inc., Foster De eside Bank.	andz	PH CERTIFIED MAIL IBT 731 SF 56 UNION RECYCLING (	6	6.68	40.08
Total: Expense			Billable Unbillable Total	0.00 0.00 0.00	_	2720.92 0.00 2720.92
Total: UNION RECY	CLING (5)		Billable Unbillable Total	200.75 16.70 217.45	_	38288.17 2922.50 41210.67
Total: IBT 731 SF 56	3		Billable	200.75	_	38288.17

## DOWD, BLOCH, BENNETT, CERVONE, AUERBACH & YOKICH Slip Listing - by Client by Ref

Page

Slip ID Dates and Time Posting Status Description	Attorney Activity Client Reference	Units DNB Time	Rate Rate Info Bill Status	Slip Value
	Unbillable Total	16.70 217.45	_	2922.50 41210.67
Grand Total	Billable Unbillable Total	200.75 16.70 217.45	_	38288.17 2922.50 41210.67