

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

Date	MPAS Staff Job Title	Action/Service	Time Entry Note	Time Amount in Hours	Employee Billable Hourly Rate	Time in Hours x Employee Billable Hourly Rate	Discount	Total Billable Amount
10/13/2008	Cody, Mark Director	Supervision - Providing Feedback & Info to Others (Casework Review, Performance Review)	Case review.	0.33	\$300.00	\$100.00		\$100.00
11/26/2008	Cody, Mark Director	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Telephone call with Judy Levy.	0.75	\$300.00	\$225.00		\$225.00
11/26/2008	Cody, Mark Director	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Meetings and phone calls with CDavis and others re press, status of case, etc.	1.00	\$300.00	\$300.00		\$300.00
12/02/2008	Cody, Mark Director	Supervision - Providing Feedback & Info to Others (Casework Review, Performance Review)	Case review	0.25	\$300.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
01/29/2009	Cody, Mark Director	Supervision - Providing Feedback & Info to Others (Casework Review, Performance Review)	Case review.	0.25	\$300.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
03/02/2009	Cody, Mark Director	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Telephone call with Bill Weber, 248.644.0077; fu e-mail.	0.50	\$300.00	\$150.00		\$150.00
03/24/2009	Cody, Mark Director	Supervision - Providing Feedback & Info to Others (Casework Review, Performance Review)	Case review.	0.25	\$300.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
04/23/2009	Cody, Mark Director	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Office conference to discuss Amended Complaint.	1.00	\$300.00	\$300.00		\$300.00
04/24/2009	Cody, Mark Director	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Review of court order. First Amended Complaint.	1.00	\$300.00	\$300.00		\$300.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

05/04/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Supervision - Providing Feedback & Info to Others (Casework Review, Performance Review)	Case review.	0.25	\$300.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
07/20/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Supervision - Providing Feedback & Info to Others (Casework Review, Performance Review)	Case review.	0.25	\$300.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
10/08/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Travel to Livonia and back for deposition.	2.33	\$300.00	\$700.00		\$700.00
10/08/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Attend deposition of client.	5.50	\$300.00	\$1,650.00		\$1,650.00
10/09/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Telephone call with Chris Davis.	0.42	\$300.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
11/25/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Supervision - Providing Feedback & Info to Others (Casework Review, Performance Review)	Case review. Review briefs, cases	0.33	\$300.00	\$100.00		\$100.00
12/03/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	cited, office conference with Chris Davis.	1.50	\$300.00	\$450.00	-\$225.00	\$225.00
12/07/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Telephone call with Tom Cecil.	0.50	\$300.00	\$150.00		\$150.00
12/07/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	E-mail to Chris Davis.	0.08	\$300.00	\$25.00		\$25.00
12/17/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Travel to Detroit and back for hearing. Second court at oral	3.00	\$300.00	\$900.00	-\$450.00	\$450.00
12/17/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	arguments on cross-motions, discussions afterwards.	2.50	\$300.00	\$750.00	-\$375.00	\$375.00
12/28/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Supervision - Providing Feedback & Info to Others (Casework Review, Performance Review)	Case review.	0.50	\$300.00	\$150.00		\$150.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

		<i>Review of court's</i>						
12/28/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	<i>decision, discussion of same with Chris Davis.</i>	1.00	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
12/28/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>E-mails re court order, review of press release.</i>	0.75	\$300.00	\$225.00	\$225.00
01/04/2010	Cody, Mark	Director	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	<i>Telephone call with Judy Levy; confirmation by e-mail of conversation. Office consults with Mark McWilliams, Chris Davis, and Elmer re same.</i>	1.00	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
01/04/2010	Cody, Mark	Director	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>following order, e-mail to management and legal teams.</i>	1.25	\$300.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
09/24/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>w/ Mark C. Discussed potential new case</i>	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
09/24/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
09/25/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>w/ Mark M</i>	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
09/25/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
09/26/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
09/26/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/02/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	<i>e-mail</i>	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount	Amount	Amount
10/02/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00
10/03/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
10/03/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
10/03/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00
10/03/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00		\$200.00
10/06/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
10/06/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Writing, Editing, Developing Materials for Clients	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
10/06/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
10/07/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	4.50	\$250.00	\$1,125.00		\$1,125.00
10/07/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
10/08/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
10/08/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00		\$25.00
10/10/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
10/10/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00		\$25.00
10/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
10/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00		\$25.00
10/15/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

10/15/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
10/17/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney with Client	Telephone Call - Direct contact	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/17/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
10/20/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney with Client	Telephone Call - Direct contact	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/20/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/20/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/21/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney with Client	Telephone Call - Direct contact	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/21/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney with Client	Telephone Call - Direct contact	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/21/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/24/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney with Client	Telephone Call - Direct contact	0.40	\$250.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
10/24/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/27/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney with Client	Telephone Call - Direct contact	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/27/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/27/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/29/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney with Client	Telephone Call - Direct contact	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
11/03/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
11/03/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

		Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)							
11/05/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00	
11/05/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00	
11/05/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00		\$500.00	
11/05/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00		\$375.00	
11/06/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00	
11/06/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00		\$25.00	
11/07/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00	
11/07/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00	
11/10/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00	
11/10/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00	
11/10/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00	
11/10/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00	
11/10/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00	
11/10/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00	
11/10/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00	
11/11/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00		\$375.00	

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

11/12/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
11/12/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	w/ R. Feldman	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
11/12/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
11/12/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
11/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
11/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		0.40	\$250.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
11/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	requested info on trustee's meeting	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
11/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	meet w/ client	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
11/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
11/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	RF	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
11/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
11/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
11/13/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Letter to OU atty	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
11/17/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
11/17/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Worked on facts section of complaint	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
11/17/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	at clients home	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
11/17/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
11/20/2008	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	RF	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

11/21/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Kim D	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
11/21/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
11/21/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
11/21/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
11/22/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Complaint	6.50	\$250.00	\$1,625.00	\$1,625.00
11/24/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
11/24/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	complaint	5.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00
11/25/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		5.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00
11/26/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
11/26/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	w/ tom m	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
11/26/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
12/01/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
12/01/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
12/01/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	ms hendren CHN	0.40	\$250.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
12/01/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
12/02/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
12/02/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	e-mail w/ E C	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

01/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)		6.00	\$250.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00
01/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	US Dist Ct	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
01/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	to-from dist ct	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
01/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)	Review and prep for hearing	4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
01/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
01/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
01/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
01/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		0.40	\$250.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
01/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)	Court discovery rules	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
01/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
01/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)	Discovery rules	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
01/29/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
01/29/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
02/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
02/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
02/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Attended OU board meeting	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00

M-F-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

02/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Travel to OU	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
02/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
02/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
02/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Review of Judges opinion	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00	\$625.00
02/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
02/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
02/06/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)		1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
02/06/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	To OU to meet w/ client	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
02/06/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
02/06/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)		1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
02/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
02/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
02/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
02/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
02/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
02/18/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
02/18/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	w/RB LMOM	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

02/18/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
02/18/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
02/18/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
02/18/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
02/19/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
02/25/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
02/25/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
02/25/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
02/25/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
02/25/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
02/26/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
02/26/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
02/26/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
02/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
02/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	1.30	\$250.00	\$325.00	\$325.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

02/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
03/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
03/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
03/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	2nd	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
03/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
03/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
03/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
03/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
03/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	1.30	\$250.00	\$325.00	\$325.00
03/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
03/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
03/11/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
03/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
03/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
03/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
03/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

03/16/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
03/16/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
03/17/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
03/17/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
03/17/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	4.50	\$250.00	\$1,125.00	\$1,125.00
03/18/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
03/23/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
03/23/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
03/24/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
03/24/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
03/26/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
03/26/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
03/31/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
03/31/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
04/01/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
04/01/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
04/01/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/01/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00

M-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

04/06/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
04/06/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/06/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/08/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
04/08/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
04/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
04/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
04/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
04/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.40	\$250.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
04/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
04/20/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

04/20/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/20/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
04/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	FOIA request	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/22/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/22/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	w/ gabriell	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/22/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Research re: order Research and Conf w/ GF and MC	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
04/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		5.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00
04/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	vm for boonin	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
04/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	w/ GF & MC	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face) Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	to client's home	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
04/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		1.30	\$250.00	\$325.00	\$325.00
04/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/28/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
04/28/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	w/ GF	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
04/28/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

04/28/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney & Client Notes	Documentation - Service Request	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/30/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/30/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
05/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
05/07/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
05/07/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
05/07/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
05/11/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
05/11/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
05/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
05/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
05/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
05/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
05/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00	\$625.00
05/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
05/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
05/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00

M-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

05/22/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
05/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	w/ Gabrielle re reply	0.40	\$250.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
05/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
05/28/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
06/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
06/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
06/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	to board of trustees meeting	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
06/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties		2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
06/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
06/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
06/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
06/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
06/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
06/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
06/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Supervision - Receiving Feedback & Information from Manager (Casework Review, Performance Review)		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
06/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	to/from Fed Dist Ct for Hearing	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

06/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
06/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
06/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00	\$625.00
06/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
06/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
06/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail letter)	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
06/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
06/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
06/24/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
06/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	5.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00
06/29/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
06/30/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
06/30/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
07/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
07/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	2.80	\$250.00	\$700.00	\$700.00

M-F-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

07/02/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
07/02/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
07/06/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
07/06/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
07/06/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
07/13/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>w/ Gabrielle re discovery w/ John R regarding filing Dept of Ed complaint.</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
07/14/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
07/16/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	<i>opp counsel and e-mail sent to client and gf</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
07/17/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>w/ Gabrielle discussing discovery planning</i>	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00	\$625.00
07/22/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	<i>discussed discovery</i>	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
07/22/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	<i>to clients home</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
07/22/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	<i>review case file in prep for meeting with client</i>	1.70	\$250.00	\$425.00	\$425.00
07/30/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>w/ gabrielle reviewing defendants answers to interrogatories</i>	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
08/03/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	<i>answers to interrogatories</i>	1.10	\$250.00	\$275.00	\$275.00
08/04/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	<i>reviewing of answers</i>	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

08/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	to Boonin	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
08/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	W/ Gabrielle	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
08/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	e-mail from RF	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
08/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	interrogatories	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
08/07/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)		1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
08/07/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	w/ Boonin	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
08/24/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	e-mails w/ Boonin	1.30	\$250.00	\$325.00	\$325.00
08/24/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
08/24/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	w/ gabrielle	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
08/24/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Reviewed Mail from Boonin	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
08/24/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
08/25/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	w/ parents	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
08/25/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Witness-list	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
08/25/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

									<i>looking into expert</i>
08/26/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Related	Research, Reading, Review and/or witnesses. Reviewing Compiling Information (Client-Related)	interrogatories and records request	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
08/26/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Other Legal Documents	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,	witness list	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
08/26/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	met client at library	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
08/26/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	review interrogatories w/ gabrielle regarding	1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
08/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	experts, witness list and depositions- by phone and e-mails	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
08/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	w/ Josh regarding experts	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
08/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Witness list	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
08/28/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
08/28/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
08/28/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Witness list	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
09/01/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	Reviewing audio and video tapes of OU Board meetings	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
09/01/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	w/ Gabrielle about research	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
09/01/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
09/01/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
09/01/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	e/mail from Boonin arranging transcription of records	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

09/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
09/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	w/ Boonin regarding Deps	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
09/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	reviewed new records from clients	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
09/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	court rules	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
09/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
09/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Responses Document requests	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
09/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	document requests	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
09/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	e-mails and calls about Maten's dep arrangements	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
09/08/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	interrogatories and document requests	5.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00
09/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)		3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
09/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)		3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
09/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
09/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	e-mails w/ opp counsel	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
09/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Meet with client	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00	\$625.00
09/11/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	gathering list e-mails	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

		Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	<i>e-mails on maten dep issues</i>					
09/11/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		1.30	\$250.00	\$325.00		\$325.00
		Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	<i>prep for deps</i>					
09/13/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		5.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00		\$1,250.00
		Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	<i>prep for deps</i>					
09/14/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		9.50	\$250.00	\$2,375.00		\$2,375.00
		Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	<i>Depositions of Wiggins and Snyder</i>					
09/15/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		5.50	\$250.00	\$1,375.00		\$1,375.00
		Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	<i>to/from depositions</i>					
09/15/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00
		Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face) Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	<i>Discussion of Deps</i>					
09/15/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00
		Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	<i>Several e-mails regarding arrangements for Maten's deposition.</i>					
09/16/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00		\$375.00
		Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing						
09/16/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00
		Supervision - Receiving Feedback & Information from Manager (Casework Review, Performance Review)						
09/17/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
		Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)						
09/17/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00		\$500.00
		Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	<i>Prep for dep</i>					
09/18/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00		\$625.00
		Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	<i>Deps- discussed with client</i>					
09/21/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
		Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	<i>prep for deposition</i>					
09/21/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		5.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00		\$1,250.00
		Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	<i>Deposition Maten</i>					
09/22/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney		2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00		\$625.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount	Amount	Amount
09/22/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00		\$500.00
09/22/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	1.30	\$250.00	\$325.00		\$325.00
09/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Photocopying or Reproduction of Materials	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00		\$625.00
09/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
10/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
10/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
10/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
10/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00		\$625.00
10/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
10/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
10/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00
10/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00		\$500.00
10/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
10/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
10/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

		Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)						
10/05/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	<i>e-mail Boonin</i>	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/05/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	<i>w/ Janice F</i>	0.75	\$250.00	\$187.50	\$187.50
10/05/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	<i>w/ Rich F to client's home to meet parents for depts</i>	0.75	\$250.00	\$187.50	\$187.50
10/05/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	<i>Dep preparation and reviewing docs</i>	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
10/05/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
10/06/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
10/06/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	<i>e-mails w/ boonin and parents on confirming depts</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/06/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>w/ veena re discovery issues</i>	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
10/07/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	<i>e-mails back-forth w/ opp counsel re: Stip & Order</i>	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
10/07/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/07/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
10/07/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/07/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/07/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	<i>Call to Schubner</i>	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/08/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	<i>MF Deposition</i>	5.00	\$250.00	\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

10/08/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)	<i>Prep for dep</i>	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/08/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>Debriefing w/ Cody</i>	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
10/08/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	<i>debriefing w/ client</i>	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
10/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)		1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)		1.80	\$250.00	\$450.00	\$450.00
10/11/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	<i>e-mails re powerpoint</i>	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e- mail, letter)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)		1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>Reading discovery docs w/ Veena re: new OJ emails, program info, witness statements</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	<i>e-mail E. White</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	<i>reading through expert opinion sent from opp counsel</i>	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

10/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	x2 e-mails	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	e-mail logs to Boonin	1.70	\$250.00	\$425.00	\$425.00
10/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	e-mail release e. white	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	W. Doctor	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	amended witness list	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	x3	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	compiling e-mails	1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
10/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	meeting w/ janice for dep	1.30	\$250.00	\$325.00	\$325.00
10/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	clients home	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	e-mail to boonin	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	e-mail compilation	1.80	\$250.00	\$450.00	\$450.00
10/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	w/ Rich prep for his dep	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/18/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	reviewed notes and sent e-mail to Kim D.	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00

M-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

10/18/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or reviewed records for dep Compiling Information (Client- Related)	this week/ Feldman Fialka	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Deposition of Rich Feldman	3.20	\$250.00	\$800.00	\$800.00
10/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	(Review of Documents, Practice) Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/20/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance	e-mails disclosure	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/20/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	(Review of Documents, Practice) Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Janice Fialka Dep Dep of Janice Fialka	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/20/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		3.50	\$250.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
10/20/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e- mail, letter)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)	going through OU disclosure docs from disks	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
10/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)	J Fialka reading depts	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
10/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client- Related)	J Fialka reading depts	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
10/22/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	5x emails w/ dif possible witness	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/22/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	5x emails w/ dif possible witness	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/22/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	reviewing another 8 e- mails	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

10/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	<i>numerous e-mails regarding expert</i>	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	<i>Started work on Brief</i>	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	<i>two calls</i>	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
10/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	<i>Brief</i>	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
10/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>w/ Mary to open transcripts</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/26/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	<i>delivered dvd to client</i>	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	<i>w/ E. Bauer</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	<i>w/ Mara S.</i>	0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	<i>w/ Rich x2</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	<i>e-mail to nicole</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	<i>locating Mara book online</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

10/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>w/ e cerano</i>	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		2.20	\$250.00	\$550.00	\$550.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
10/27/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
10/28/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/29/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	<i>Deb and Meg</i>	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/29/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/29/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/29/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	<i>other thinkcollege.com and other research for conf call</i>	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
10/29/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
10/30/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	<i>brief</i>	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
10/30/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	<i>x2</i>	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
10/30/2009	Davis, Chris	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	<i>witness list</i>	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

10/31/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
10/31/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
11/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
11/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
11/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	3.50	\$250.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
11/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
11/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
11/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
11/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00	\$625.00
11/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
11/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
11/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
11/05/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
11/06/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

11/06/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
11/07/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
11/07/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$562.50
11/08/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	3.50	\$250.00	\$875.00	-\$656.25
11/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
11/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
11/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	-\$375.00
11/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
11/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	1.70	\$250.00	\$425.00	\$425.00
11/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
11/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
11/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
11/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	4.50	\$250.00	\$1,125.00	-\$843.75
11/11/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	-\$750.00
11/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

11/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00
11/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	<i>Signature on witness affidavit</i>	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00
11/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties		0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00		\$200.00
11/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	<i>Petersons report</i>	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00		\$625.00
11/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	<i>Witness supplement</i>	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00
11/12/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	<i>Brief</i>	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	-\$375.00	\$125.00
11/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
11/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)		3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$562.50	\$187.50
11/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$562.50	\$187.50
11/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	-\$375.00	\$125.00
11/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	<i>exhibits for brief</i>	4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	-\$500.00	\$500.00
11/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	-\$250.00	\$250.00
11/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	<i>reviewing Def brief</i>	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	-\$125.00	\$125.00
11/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)		2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	-\$250.00	\$250.00
11/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
11/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>filing brief</i>	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$375.00	\$375.00
11/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

11/18/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
11/18/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	w/ Rich	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
11/18/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Review of Def Motion	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	-\$187.50	\$187.50
11/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Response Brief	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$375.00	\$375.00
11/19/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Res Brief	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	-\$125.00	\$125.00
11/20/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	to OU to meet w/ client	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00		\$375.00
11/20/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)		1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00		\$300.00
11/20/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)		0.60	\$250.00	\$150.00	-\$75.00	\$75.00
11/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
11/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	e-mail to beamon	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
11/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Mike B.	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
11/23/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$375.00	\$375.00
11/24/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	-\$500.00	\$500.00
11/24/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
11/25/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
11/25/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
11/25/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	w/ Veena	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
11/25/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)		4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	-\$500.00	\$500.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

11/29/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00	-\$312.50	\$312.50
11/30/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00
11/30/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	4.50	\$250.00	\$1,125.00		\$1,125.00
12/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00		\$500.00
12/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
12/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$375.00	\$375.00
12/01/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$375.00	\$375.00
12/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00		\$375.00
12/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	-\$250.00	\$250.00
12/02/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	2.30	\$250.00	\$575.00	-\$287.50	\$287.50
12/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
12/03/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	-\$500.00	\$500.00
12/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00
12/04/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00
12/08/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

12/08/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	2.50	\$250.00	\$625.00	-\$312.50	\$312.50
12/08/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$375.00	\$375.00
12/09/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	-\$500.00	\$500.00
12/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	-\$187.50	\$187.50
12/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00
12/10/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	4.20	\$250.00	\$1,050.00	-\$525.00	\$525.00
12/11/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$375.00	\$375.00
12/11/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00	-\$150.00	\$150.00
12/13/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	-\$187.50	\$187.50
12/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00
12/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Writing, Editing, Developing Materials for Clients	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	-\$375.00	\$375.00
12/14/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	-\$125.00	\$125.00
12/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00	-\$150.00	\$150.00
12/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance	4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00		\$1,000.00
12/15/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
12/16/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance	6.50	\$250.00	\$1,625.00	-\$812.50	\$812.50

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	to/from dist ct						
12/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Hearing in US District Court	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00
12/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance (Review of Documents, Practice)		1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	-\$187.50	\$187.50
12/17/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		6.00	\$250.00	\$1,500.00	-\$750.00	\$750.00
12/18/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	e-mails re: hearing	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00		\$375.00
12/18/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00
12/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
12/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Reviewing Opp Sides Last Min Filings and After hearing	0.40	\$250.00	\$100.00		\$100.00
12/21/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Read Judge's Opinion and order	1.40	\$250.00	\$350.00		\$350.00
12/28/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Told him of Judge's decision	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00
12/28/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Call to Boonin LM	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$125.00
12/28/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	w/ client and family about the decision	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
12/29/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00
12/29/2009	Davis, Chris Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.80	\$250.00	\$200.00		\$200.00
								\$145,537.50
11/26/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle Attorney	Photocopying or Reproduction of Materials	Review of movie	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00		\$175.00
12/03/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Case info	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

12/04/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
12/04/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
12/05/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
12/15/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
12/16/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Supervision - Receiving Feedback & Information from Manager (Casework Review, Performance Review)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
12/17/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
12/18/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
12/18/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
12/18/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
12/19/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
12/23/2008	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
01/06/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	1.20	\$250.00	\$300.00	\$300.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

01/06/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
01/07/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)		3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
01/08/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		4.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
01/09/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
01/20/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/01/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/14/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	<i>1st CD re evidence disparate tx</i>	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/15/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	<i>Notice</i>	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/16/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
04/17/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
04/17/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
04/20/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	<i>Conf CD</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/21/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/22/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/22/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

04/22/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	review order	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
04/23/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
04/24/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.60	\$250.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
04/27/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.60	\$250.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
04/29/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	conf - CD	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
04/30/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
05/04/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf with CD re: strategy, discovery, case status	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
05/07/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
05/07/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	conf CD	0.40	\$250.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
05/07/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
05/11/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
05/13/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	CD/Email STIP TO EXTEND TIME TO FILE ANSWER	0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
05/14/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Review pleadings	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
05/18/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

05/19/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
05/26/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
05/27/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
05/27/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Supervision - Providing Feedback & Info to Others (Casework Review, Performance Review)		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
05/27/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
05/28/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	135 miles	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
05/28/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
06/01/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
06/03/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
06/10/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
06/10/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
06/23/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Miles 135 - Construction traffic, bumper to bumper over 30 mins.	3.50	\$250.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
06/30/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	60 miles	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00
06/30/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Document Production/ Interrog	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

07/02/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Review Interrogatories and consult with CD	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
07/13/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
07/14/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Consult with CD	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
07/14/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.10	\$250.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
07/17/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Miles: 180	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
07/17/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
07/20/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	MFF research & discovery	0.70	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$175.00
07/22/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes		0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00	\$75.00
07/28/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Discussion with CD re. next meeting and topic.	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
08/04/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Writing, Editing, Developing Materials for Clients		1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
08/06/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	mile: 135	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
08/06/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		2.00	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
08/07/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)		0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
08/11/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Review discovery request from defendant	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
08/11/2009	Frampton, Gabrielle	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	TCT LL re. discovery request	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00	\$50.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

\$12,575.00

			<i>Met with Chris Davis to discuss his concerns</i>					
			Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups) <i>about defense arguments in response to his motion.</i>	0.17	\$150.00	\$25.50	\$25.50	
01/06/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related) <i>Read all briefs etc. in preparation for Chris Davis moot court.</i>	2.42	\$150.00	\$363.00	\$363.00	
01/06/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)					
06/16/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Photocopying or Reproduction of Materials <i>Observed court hearing Copied DVD for discovery purposes.</i>	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	
09/04/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups) <i>C. Davis consulted me about deposition strategy</i>	1.00	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$150.00	
09/21/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups) <i>discussion with chris davis about case status, next steps</i>	0.17	\$150.00	\$25.50	\$25.50	
09/23/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups) <i>Discussion with C. Davis re: upcoming deposition</i>	0.17	\$150.00	\$25.50	\$25.50	
10/13/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups) <i>brief discussion w/ Davis about deposition today.</i>	0.10	\$150.00	\$15.00	\$15.00	
10/19/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups) <i>Deposition of client's father and debriefing after.</i>	0.08	\$150.00	\$12.00	\$12.00	
10/19/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups) <i>discussion with C. Davis about strategy</i>	4.08	\$150.00	\$612.00	\$612.00	
11/03/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups) <i>Discussion with Chris D.</i>	0.42	\$150.00	\$63.00	\$63.00	
11/05/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups) <i>and Veena about settlement offer and strategy.</i>	0.42	\$150.00	\$63.00	\$63.00	

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

11/05/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	reviewed witness statement sent via e-mail	0.17	\$150.00	\$25.50	\$25.50
11/13/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Discussed case with Chris D.	0.17	\$150.00	\$25.50	\$25.50
11/13/2009	Kay, Joshua	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Discussed with Chris Davis how to approach certain witnesses based on deposition testimony.	0.17	\$150.00	\$25.50	\$25.50
01/08/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Review issues for brief with CD	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
01/12/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf. w. CD re: pleading requirements	0.08	\$250.00	\$20.83	\$20.83
02/05/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Review decision with C. Davis	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
06/17/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf. w. CD re: hearing	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
09/10/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Conf w. C. Davis re: atty-cl privilege; review MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.42	\$250.00	\$104.17	\$104.17
09/10/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	second. resources and experts	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
09/11/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

09/14/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf w. C. Davis re: appeal issues	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
09/15/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Travel to deposition	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
09/15/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Attend deposition of two witnesses	6.00	\$250.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00
09/16/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Debrief with JK and CD	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
09/21/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf w. CDavis - go to deposition	0.08	\$250.00	\$20.83	\$20.83
09/22/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Participate in Deposition of Lionel Mathen	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
09/22/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Travel to and from deposition	0.58	\$250.00	\$145.83	\$145.83
09/23/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Review depositions and next steps	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/05/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf w. CDavis re: appearance, next steps in litigation	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
10/05/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	File an appearance Review atty-client	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
10/05/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	privilege case. Conf w. Davis review SJ motion,	0.42	\$250.00	\$104.17	\$104.17
10/07/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance	affidavits, deposition testimony of OU	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/09/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf w. CD re: cl's deposition, next steps	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

10/12/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Conf. w. S. Berke of Berkeley Schools	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
10/12/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Review cl's IEP for 2008-2009	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
10/12/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	LM for Sharon Berke - Berkeley Schools	0.08	\$250.00	\$20.83	\$20.83
10/13/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Writing, Editing, Developing Materials for Clients	Respond to Berkeley Schools request for ROI, new appt time	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
10/20/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	Debrief with J. Fialka following deposition	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
10/20/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance (Review of Documents, Practice)	Deposition of Janice Fialka	3.50	\$250.00	\$875.00	\$875.00
10/20/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf. w. CD re: deposition of R. Feldman and J. Fialka	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
10/20/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf. w. C. Davis re: further depositions, debrief J. Fialka	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
10/21/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf. w. Cody re: deposition & observations	0.08	\$250.00	\$20.83	\$20.83
10/21/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Review cl's IEP for 2009-2010	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
10/22/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Conf. w. S. Berke of Berkeley Schools re: Options, CI, IEPs, CI	0.92	\$250.00	\$229.17	\$229.17
10/22/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	Update notes from S. Berke conversation	0.08	\$250.00	\$20.83	\$20.83
10/22/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Review depositions, sj motion affidavits, testimony of K. Berke (15m)	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

Date	Name	Role	Description	Rate	Hours	Amount	Amount
			<i>Conf w. CD re: expert</i>				
10/27/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other witness, student MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small witnesses and room-mate witness	0.08	\$250.00	\$20.83	\$20.83
10/28/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small <i>Conf w. CD re: motion to compel</i>	0.08	\$250.00	\$20.83	\$20.83
			<i>Review rebuttal expert</i>				
11/02/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other possibilities: Get contact info for Health Center and Lou Brown.	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
11/03/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other <i>Conf w. Davis expert MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small from inclusive housing program</i>	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
			<i>Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)</i>				
11/04/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	<i>Review Def. expert witness' CV</i>	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
			<i>Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Review affidavit of OU professor</i>				
11/05/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Other Legal Documents	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
			<i>Meeting - Consultation with Other Conf. w. CD re: OU MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small prof. affidavit, MORC emails w. Wiggins</i>				
11/05/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Groups)	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
			<i>Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)</i>				
11/06/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	<i>Review Def.'s Expert report</i>	0.75	\$250.00	\$187.50	\$187.50
			<i>Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, McPherson case; Rehab Act.</i>				
11/06/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, <i>Review reasonable accommodation cases</i>	0.33	\$250.00	\$83.33	\$83.33
			<i>Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)</i>				
11/09/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	<i>Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small expert report,</i>	1.17	\$250.00	\$291.67	\$291.67
			<i>Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)</i>				
11/09/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	<i>Review sj brief issues,</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
			<i>Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)</i>				
11/09/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	<i>Review draft of brief and edit</i>	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

11/09/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Review cases from Westlaw	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
11/09/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Monitoring	Review DOJ materials on ADA, university housing	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
11/10/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Review housing information online at OU, accommodations requests, discovery	0.75	\$250.00	\$187.50	\$187.50
11/11/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Draft and edit brief re: reasonable accommodation	3.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$750.00
11/12/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Review report of Michael Peters	0.75	\$250.00	\$187.50	\$187.50
11/12/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Review report w. CDavis	0.33	\$250.00	\$83.33	\$83.33
11/12/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Draft and edit reasonable accomod section, review exhibits,	1.75	\$250.00	\$437.50	\$437.50
11/12/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf. w. C. Davis re: brief, facts section,	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
11/15/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Edit SJ brief	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
11/16/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Edit brief--review facts, dep. info, legal issues	1.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	-\$187.50
11/16/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Review Def's motion and brief for SJ	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	-\$62.50
11/16/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Edit brief	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	-\$31.25

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

11/19/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Review briefing schedule w. CDavis Conf w. CD re: OU visit, reasonable	0.08	\$250.00	\$20.83	\$20.83
11/23/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Review reasonable accom argument	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
11/24/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	accommodation issue, review 6h cir. case	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
11/25/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Review legal arguments re: reason, accommod	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
12/02/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	review and edit brief	1.00	\$250.00	-\$125.00	\$125.00
12/02/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	conf w. CD re: brief	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
12/03/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Edit brief	1.00	\$250.00	-\$125.00	\$125.00
12/07/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Documentation - Service Request & Client Notes	Def's filed resp. to our Smolton	0.08	\$250.00	\$20.83	\$20.83
12/08/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf w. CD re: Def's resp bnf	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
12/08/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Withdraw Gab Framp as counsel	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
12/08/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	review reply brief structure	0.08	\$250.00	\$20.83	-\$10.42
12/11/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Review def's reply brief w. CD	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	-\$20.83
12/14/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	review reply brief and edit	0.75	\$250.00	\$187.50	-\$93.75
12/14/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Review reply bnf w. CD	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	-\$31.25
								\$31.25

MF-F Legal Case: Time/Billable Hours Data Report

12/15/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	File an appearance for Cody	0.33	\$250.00	\$83.33	\$83.33
12/17/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf. w. JK and MC re: oral argument	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
12/17/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Review Def. sur-reply filing	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
12/17/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Review oral argument	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	-\$31.25
12/17/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf. w. CDavis re: next steps	0.25	\$250.00	\$62.50	\$62.50
12/28/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Review decision	0.50	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$125.00
12/28/2009	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Conf. w. C. Davis about judge's order	0.17	\$250.00	\$41.67	\$41.67
01/04/2010	Rao, Veena	Attorney	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Review news stories and articles re: decision, options program	0.33	\$250.00	\$83.33	\$83.33
Grand Total							\$176,841.43	\$10,322.93