Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Frest Amended Legal - Magneting	Date	MPAS Staff Job Title	Job Title	Action/Service	Time Entry Note	Time	Employee Billable	Time in Hours x Employee	Discount	Total Billable
Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing Alexander Information of Alexander Information Infor						in Hours	Hourly Rate	Hourly Rate		
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Complaint Lot S300.00 S30					Review of court order,			ı		
Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents Complaint 1,00 \$300.00 \$300.00 \$300.00 Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing Administrative Hearing 5.50 \$300.00 \$1,650.00 \$825.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,650.00 \$1,				Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,	First Amended					
Legal - Appearance in Court or Attend deposition of Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing (Cody, Mark Director Groups) MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Chris Davis re: client Cody, Mark Director Groups) Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Circled office conference (Cody, Mark Director Lexis) Travel (Please provide detail in Travel to Darroit and Cody, Mark Director Timesheet Notes) Cody, Mark Director Timesheet Notes) Legal - Appearance in Court or motions, discussions Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing alternards. Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, decision, decrussion of Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing alternards. Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, decrussion of Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents Cody, Mark Director Oth	04/24/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Other Legal Documents	Complaint.	1.00	\$300.00	\$300.00		\$300.00
Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing 5.50 \$300.00 \$1,650,00 \$825.00 \$200.00 \$1,650,00 \$825.00 \$200.00 \$250,00 \$200.00 \$250,00 \$25				Legal - Appearance in Court or	Attend deposition of					
Cody, Mark Director Groups) Cody, Mark Director Groups (Please provide detail in Travel to Detroil and Cody, Mark Director Timesheet Notes) Cody, Mark Director Lexis) Cody, Mark Director Lexis (Please provide detail in Travel to Detroil and Cody, Mark Director Lexis) Cody, Mark Director Lexis (Please provide detail in Travel to Detroil and Cody, Mark Director Lexis) Cody, Mark Director Timesheet Notes) Legal - Appearance in Court or motions, discussions of cross- Legal - Appearance in Court or motions, discussions Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing afterwards. Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, decision, discussion of court's Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, decision, discussion of court's Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, decision, discussion of court's Letter to Outland related to Client Issue (e-mail, University) Legal Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Contact Telephone Call - Direct Contac	10/08/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Administrative Hearing	client.	5.50	\$300.00	\$1,650.00	-\$825.00	\$825.0
Cody, Mark Director Groups MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Chris Davis re: chem deposition deposi	J			Meeting - Consultation with Other	l elephone call with					
Cody, Mark Director Groups) deposition 0.42 \$300.00 \$125.00 \$200.00 \$125.00 \$200.00 \$125.00 \$200.00 \$125.00 \$200.00 \$250.00 \$200.00 \$250.00 \$200.00 \$250.00				MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small	Chris Davis re: client					
Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, cited office conference Cody, Mark Director Lexis with Chris Davis, 1.50 \$300.00 \$450.00 -\$225.00 \$250.00	10/09/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Groups)	deposition	0.42	\$300.00	\$125.00		\$125.0
Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, cited office conference with Chris Davis. 1.50 \$300.00 \$450.00 -\$225.00 \$125.00 \$200.00 \$450.00 -\$225.00 \$200.00 \$					Review briefs, cases					
Cody, Mark Director Lexis with Chris Davis. 1.50 \$300.00 \$450.00 \$225.00 \$1				Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,	cited, office conference					
Travel (Please provide detail in Travel to Detroit and Cody, Mark Director Timesheet Notes) hack for hearing shock for hearing shock for hearing seemed chair at oral segments or cross-Legal - Appearance in Court or mations, discussions discussions of Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing afterwards. Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents same with Chris Davis. 1.00 \$300.00 \$750.00 -\$375.00 \$200.00 \$300	12/03/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Lexis)	with Chris Davis.	1.50	\$300.00	\$450.00		\$225.00
Cody, Mark Director Timesheet Notes) Cody, Mark Director Timesheet Notes) Legal - Appearance in Court or motions, discussions Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing afterwards. Legal - Appearance in Court or motions, discussions Accision, discussion of court's afterword court's Legal - Appearance in Court or motions, discussions Accision, discussion of court's accision, discussion of court's Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents Research and RAR Correspondence with Third Party Letter to Oakland related to Client Issue (e-mail, University Legal Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Correspondence with Third Party Keith H. from OU related to Client Issue (e-mail, counsel's office re: response timeline Telephone Call - Direct contact response timeline Telephone Call - Direct contact response timeline Telephone Call - Direct contact response timeline 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00				Travel (Please provide detail in	Travel to Detroit and					
Second chair at oral arguments on cross- Legal - Appearance in Court or motions, discussions Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Administrative Hearing Review of court's Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Accision, discussion of Accision, discussion of Court's Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Accision, discussion of Review of court's Accision, discussion of Review of court's Accision, discussion of Review of court's Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Accision, discussion of Review of court's Letter to Oakland related to Client Issue (e-mail, Letter to OU Correspondence with Third Party Retith H from OU Correspondence with Third Party Retith H from OU Correspondence with Third Party Retith H from OU response timeline Telephone Call - Direct contact response timeline Research and RAR Review of court's Letter to OAkland	12/17/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Timesheet Notes)	back for hearing.	3.00	\$125.00	\$375.00	-\$187.50	\$187.5
Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing afterwards. Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing afterwards. Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, decision, discussion of court's Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, decision, discussion of court's Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents sume with Chris Davis 1.00 \$300.00 \$300.00 \$200.00 \$300.00 \$					Second chair at oral					
Legal - Appearance in Court or motions, discussions Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing afterwards. Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Aecision, discussion of Aecision, decision,					arguments on cross-					
Cody, Mark Director Administrative Hearing afterwards. 2.50 \$300.00 \$750.00 \$375.00 \$250.00 Cody, Mark Director Other Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Aecision, discussion of Cody, Mark Director 1.00 \$300.00				Legal - Appearance in Court or	motions, discussions					
Review of court's Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Cody, Mark Director Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, decision, discussion of decision of decision, discussion of decision of decis	12/17/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Administrative Hearing	afterwards.	2.50	\$300.00	\$750.00	-\$375.00	\$375.00
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, decision, discussion of Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents same with Chris Davis. 1.00 \$300.00 \$300.00 \$200.00					Review of court's					
Cody, Mark Director Other Legal Documents same with Chris Davis. 1.00 \$300.00 \$300.00 \$2 Same with Chris Davis. 1.00 \$300.00 \$300.00 \$2				Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,	decision, discussion of					
Research and RAR Correspondence with Third Party Letter to Oakland related to Client Issue (e-mail, University Legal Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Correspondence with Third Party Letter to OU Correspondence with Third Party Keith H. from OU related to Client Issue (e-mail, counsel's office re: Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - Direct contact response timeline Telephone Call - Direct contact response timeline Telephone Call - Direct contact response timeline	12/28/2009	Cody, Mark	Director	Other Legal Documents	same with Chris Davis.	1.00	\$300.00	\$300.00		\$300.00
Correspondence with Third Party Letter to Oakland related to Client Issue (e-mail, University Legal Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Correspondence with Third Party Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Correspondence with Third Party Correspondence with Third Party Keith H. from OU related to Client Issue (e-mail, counsel's office re: Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - Direct co										\$2,337.50
Correspondence with Third Party Letter to Oakland related to Client Issue (e-mail, University Legal Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Counsel 4.50 \$250.00 \$1,125.00 \$1 Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Letter to OU Correspondence with Third Party Keith H. from OU related to Client Issue (e-mail, counsel's office re: Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call -					Research and RAR					
Pavis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Counsel Counsel Counsel Letter to OU Correspondence with Third Party Keith H. from OU related to Client Issue (e-mail, counsel's office re: Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - Direct contact response timeline Telephone Call - Direct contact re: release and OU ltr 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00				Correspondence with Third Party	Letter to Oakland					
Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Counsel 4.50 \$250.00 \$1,125.00 \$1 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Letter to OU 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 Davis, Chris Attorney letter) counsel's office re: Davis, Chris Attorney letter) response timeline 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: release and OU ltr 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00				related to Client Issue (e-mail,	University Legal					
Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Correspondence with Third Party Keith H. from OU related to Client Issue (e-mail, counsel's office re: Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - Direct contact re: release and OU ltr 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00	10/07/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	letter)	Counsel	4.50	\$250.00	\$1,125.00		\$1,125.0
Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Correspondence with Third Party Keith H. from OU related to Client Issue (e-mail, counsel's office re: Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - Direct contact re: release and OU ltr 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00				Telephone Call - Direct contact						
Correspondence with Third Party Keith H. from OU related to Client Issue (e-mail, counsel's office re: Davis, Chris Attorney letter) response timeline 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact re: release and OU ltr 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00	10/08/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	with Client	Letter to OU	0.30	\$250.00	\$75.00		\$75.00
Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact				Correspondence with Third Party	Keith H. from OU					
Davis, Chris Attorney letter) response timeline 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: release and OU ltr 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00				related to Client Issue (e-mail,	counsel's office re:					
Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Auorney with Client re: release and OU ltr 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00	10/20/2008	Davis, Chris	Attorney	letter)	response timeline	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00
Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: release and OU ltr 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00				Telephone Call - Direct contact						
	10/27/2008	Davis, Chris		with Client	re: release and OU ltr	0.20	\$250.00	\$50.00		\$50.00

0.00	#					ı		
\$75 OO	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	and Preliminary	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/26/2008
\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00	\$250.00	5.00	Draft complaint	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/25/2008
					Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00	\$250.00	5.00	Draft complaint	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/24/2008
\$1,625.00	\$1,625.00	\$250.00	6.50	Draft complaint	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/22/2000
					Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,		2	11/17/7000
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	response and Voc Rehab	related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/20/2008
				RF re: President's	Telephone call - with other parties			
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	reviewed complaint	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/17/2008
;				at clients home-				
\$750.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	of complaint	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/17/2008
		***	ļ	Worked on facts section	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	request letter to OU atty	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/14/2008
				2nd accommodation	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
		:			Correspondence with Third Party			
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	trustee's meeting	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/13/2008
				requested info on	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	universities	Lexis)		Davis, Chris Attorney	11/11/2008
				FHA applicability to	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	Affairs	with Client	ı	Davis, Chris Attorney	11/10/2008
				with VP of Student	Telephone Call - Direct contact			
		:		re: client's conversation				
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	accommondation	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/10/2008
				response to	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
				OU letter to me-	Correspondence with Third Party			
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	ltr to Boonin	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/07/2008
					related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$187.50	\$187.50	\$125.00	1.50		Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/05/2008
					Travel (Please provide detail in			
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00		with Outside Parties	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/05/2008
					Meeting - Regarding Client Issues			
\$200.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	OPTIONS program	Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/03/2008
					Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			

\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	today	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/05/2009
				Defendant's answer due	Telephone Call - Direct contact			
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$125.00	0.50	clients home	Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/18/2008
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50		Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/18/2008
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	notice	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/18/2008
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	regarding hearing	Telephone Call - Direct contact	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/16/2008
)) 1	re: reviewed defendant's			<u> </u>	9005/91/51
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	notice of hearing	Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/18/2008
9/0.00	\$/5.00	00.00	0.50	reviewed def answer &	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,		2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2	
674 00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0 30	cont documents to client	Correspondence with Client (e-mail letter)	Attorney	12/18/2008 Davis Chris	12/18/2008
\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$250.00	6.00	Preliminary Injunction	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/15/2008
				motion and brief-	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$875.00	\$875.00	\$250.00	3.50	Preliminary Injunction	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/14/2008
				Draft and edit	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus.			
\$750.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	Draft and edit brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	12/12/2008 Davis, Chris	12/12/2008
					I and Writing Duing Aminus			
\$750.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	Draft and edit brief	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	12/11/2008 Davis, Chris	12/11/2008
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	Obtain and review affidavits	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	12/11/2008 Davis, Chris	12/11/2008
\$750.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	ADA, FHA, 504	Lexis)	Attorney	12/10/2008 Davis, Chris	12/10/2008
				Prelim. Inj. Standards.,	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			
\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$250.00	4.00	motion and brief- Preliminary Injunction	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/09/2008
\$625.00	\$625.00	\$250.00	2.50	affidavit for Richard Berstein	Writing, Editing, Developing Materials for Clients	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/08/2008
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	Preliminary Injunction	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/05/2008
					Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-			
\$50,00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	case update	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/02/2008
				a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a				

\$200.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	Court discovery rules	Related)		Davis, Chris Attorney	01/26/2009
				,	Compiling Information (Client-			
\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$250.00	4.00	Review and prep for hearing	Compiling Information (Client-Related)	1	Davis, Chris Attorney	01/13/2009
\$187.50	\$187.50	\$125.00	1.50	to-from dist ct	Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/13/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	US Dist Ct	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/13/2009
\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$250.00	6.00	for hearing	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	1	Davis, Chris Attorney	01/12/2009
\$100.00	\$100.00	\$125.00	0.80	to meet client	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)		Davis, Chris Attorney	01/09/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	reviewed upcoming hearing	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/09/2009
\$750.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	prep affidavit for RF	related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/09/2009
\$425.00	\$425.00	\$250.00	1.70	Edit 1st amended complaint	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/09/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	Reviewed complaint and hearing	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/09/2009
\$1,625.00	\$1,625.00	\$250.00	6.50	Research and work on amending complaint	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/08/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	gabrielle re: next steps	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/07/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	moot ct- prepare for practice oral	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/07/2009
\$875.00	\$875.00	\$250.00	3.50		Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/07/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	re: housing file	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/06/2009
\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00	\$250.00	5.00	cases in defendant's response brief	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/06/2009

\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	aejenaanis	Lexis)	Auorney	Davis, Ciris	02/23/2009
)))))	Draft motion to add	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,		2	0000/35/200
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	boonin re: settlement	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/25/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	letter to boonin	related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/25/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	re: case status update	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/19/2009
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	r info concerning OU's programs	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/18/2009
\$25.00	\$25.00	\$250.00	0.10	re: my contact with Boonin	with Client Direct contact	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/18/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	fax from RF re: OPTIONS students certificate requirements	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/18/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	before lawsuit	Telephone call - with other parties interest in resolving related to Client's issues before lawsuit	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/18/2009
\$187.50	\$187.50	\$125.00	1.50	To OU to meet w/ client	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/06/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	review decision with	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/05/2009
\$625.00	\$625.00	\$250.00	2.50	r Review of Judges opinion	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	02/05/2009
\$187.50	\$187.50	\$125.00	1.50	travel to OU	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/04/2009
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	Attended OU board meeting	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/04/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	re: independent living evaluation	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/02/2009
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	r Discovery rules; prepare discovery plan	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	01/27/2009

\$1,125.00	\$1,125.00	\$250.00	4.50	brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	03/17/2009
				Drat and edit Reply	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30		Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	03/16/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	response brief	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	03/15/2009
\$300.00	\$300.00	\$250.00	1.20	PCP meeting	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	Attorney	Davis, Chris	03/10/2009
\$162.50	\$162.50	\$ 125.00	1.30		Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	03/10/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	Title II	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	03/10/2009
				impairment and ADA	Compiling Information (Client- impairment and ADA			
				Post secondary Ed for	Decearch Deading Devices and/or			
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	re: PCP mtg tomorrow	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	03/09/2009
					Telephone Call - Direct contact		i	
\$200.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	defendants	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	03/05/2009
				addresses of new	Compiling Information (Client-			
					Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	housing tables availble	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	03/04/2009
					Telephone Call - Direct contact			
\$325.00	\$325.00	\$250.00	1.30		Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/27/2009
					Compiling Information (Client-			
:					Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$200.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	office	related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/27/2009
				at Congressman Peter's	Telephone call - with other parties			
				case and TCO to Carley				
				RF- recent events in				
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	add Defendants	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/26/2009
				Draft and edit motion to	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	Boonin	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	02/26/2009
				re: conversation with	Telephone Call - Direct contact			
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	Reviewed case status	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	02/25/2009
					Telephone Call - Direct contact			

Legal - Writing Brief, Anicuss. Display and edit reply 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00	\$750.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	complaint	Other Legal Documents	Chris Attorney	Davis, Chris	04/17/2009
Davis, Chris Attorney Legal - Writing Brief, Annicus, Draft and edit reply					re: motion and amended	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$250.00	0.40	re: amended complaint	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client			04/17/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50		Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues			04/16/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	1	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)			04/16/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	Boonin letter	related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)			04/13/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Arnicus, Draft and edit reply						Correspondence with Third Party			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents brief 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 \$1	\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	law	Lexis)			04/08/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	1	related to Client's issues			04/06/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply					ſ	Telenhone call - with other narries			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus. Draft and edit reply	\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	housing file	letter)			04/06/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply					ltr to Boonin requesting	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	meeting	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)			04/01/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply					OU Trustee's board				
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 \$1	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50		with Outside Parties	ı		04/01/2009
Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents brief 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 \$1 Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents brief 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 \$1 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client reviewed case status 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client schedule mtg time/date 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client schedule mtg time/date 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Davis, Chris Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis) higher ed act 2008 1.20 \$250.00 \$300.00 \$300.00 \$250.00 \$300.00 \$250.00						Meeting - Regarding Client Issues			
Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents brief 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 \$1 Davis, Chris Attorney With Client reviewed case status 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 \$1 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client schedule mtg time/date 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 \$75.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, ADA T II 1.20 \$250.00 \$75.00 \$75.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis ADA T II 1.20 \$250.00 \$300.00 \$75.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis higher ed act 2008 1.00 \$250.00 \$300.00 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney mail, letter) re: Higher Ed Act 2008 1.00 \$250.00 <t< td=""><td>\$125.00</td><td>\$125.00</td><td>\$125.00</td><td>1.00</td><td>board meeting</td><td>Timesheet Notes)</td><td>ı</td><td>Davis, (</td><td>04/01/2009</td></t<>	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	1.00	board meeting	Timesheet Notes)	ı	Davis, (04/01/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply					to Oakland Uni. for	Travel (Please provide detail in			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Davis, Chris Attorney With Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney With Client Davis, Chris Attorney With Client Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Davis, Chris Attorney Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis) Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis) Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, ADA T II Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, higher ed act 2008 Loss Correspondence with Client (e-	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	re: Higher Ed Act 2008	mail, letter)		Davis, (04/01/2009
Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents brief 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 \$1 Davis, Chris Attorney With Client reviewed case status 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client schedule mtg time/date 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis) ADA T II 1.20 \$250.00 \$300.00 \$300.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) higher ed act 2008 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00						Correspondence with Client (e-		- 1	
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Schedule mtg time/date Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	higher ed act 2008	Lexis)			03/31/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Schedule mtg time/date Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Davis, Chris Attorney Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, ADA T II Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 \$1 \$75.00 \$75.00						Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - Direct contact Schedule mtg time/date Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$250.00	1.20	ADA T II	Lexis)		Davis, (03/26/2009
Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents brief 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 \$1 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client reviewed case status 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client schedule mtg time/date 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00		:				Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents brief 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 \$1 Telephone Call - Direct contact reviewed case status 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	schedule mtg time/date	with Client		Davis, (03/24/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit repty Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents brief 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 \$1 Telephone Call - Direct contact reviewed case status 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00						Telephone Call - Direct contact	ŀ		
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents brief 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	reviewed case status	with Client		Davis, C	03/23/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Draft and edit reply Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents brief 4.00 \$250.00 \$1,000.00						Telephone Call - Direct contact			
	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$250.00	4.00	brief	Other Legal Documents		Davis, (03/18/2009
					Draft and edit renty	Leval - Writing Brief Amicus			

rief and amended plaint plaint plaint and motion udge's order update-need to file nded complaint and on e: Bob Wiggins e: Bob Wiggins e: hond Conf. w/ and MC or boonin re: on I intend to file ient's home ussed making ement offer Fre: motion and ement on copy of 2nd on con contial timeline for	\$10.00	\$70.00	\$200.00	0.50	27 252	***************************************			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney Legal Documents Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Davis, Chris Attorney Legal Documents Davis, Chris Attorney Client's Issues Davis, Chris Attorney Croups) Davis, Chris Attorney Travel (Please provide detail in to client's home Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis, Chris Attorney Meeting - Consultation with Other wi		976	\$350 00	0 2 0	potential timeline for	Telephone Call - Direct contact		Davis Ch	05/07/2000
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, FOld request for related to Client Issue (e-mail, Fold request for related to Client Issue (e-mail, Fold request for related to Client Issues Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis Fold request for related to Client Issues Fold request for 0.50 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Legal Documents Fre: Bob Wiggins 0.50 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Research and Conf. w/ 0.50 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Fre: Bob Wiggins 0.50 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Travel (Please provide detail in to client's home 0.50 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Meeting - Consultation with Other 0.50 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face) xeitlement offer 0.70 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney With Client (Face-to-Face) xeitlement offer 0.70 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client (Face-to-Face) xeitlement offer 0.70 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client (Face-to-Face) xeitlement offer 0.50 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client (Face-to-Face) xeitlement offer 0.70 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client (Face-to-Face) xeitlement offer 0.70 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client (Face-to-Face) xeitlement offer 0.70 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client (Face-to-Face) xeitlement offer 0.70 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney xeitlem		950.00	00.002	0.2.0	re: demand letter,	mun, wwy)			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - With other parties Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Consultation with Other Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Davis, Chris Attorney Groups Davis, Chris Attorney Groups Davis, Chris Attorney Groups Davis, Chris Attorney Groups Davis Groups		\$50.00	00.050	000	motion	mail letter)		Davis Ch	04/30/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact re: Judge's order Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and motion Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney Call - With other parties with for boontin re: legal Documents Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Travel (Please provide detail in Davis, Chris Attorney Call - With other parties with for boontin re: motion I mend to file Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis, Chris Attorney Meeting - Client Grace-to-Face) Excussed musturing WAPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small W GF re: motion and Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - Direct					Sent copy of 2nd amended complaint and	Correspondence with Client (e-			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research re: order Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Research re: order Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research re: order Telephone Call - With other parties Telephone Call - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research re: order Telephone Call - With other parties wn for boontin re: Telephone Call - With other parties wn for boontin re: Telephone Call - With other parties wn for boontin re: Tooley Groups) Telephone Cone, Small Writing Brief, Amicus, Chris Attorney Meeting - Client (Face-to-Pace) New Meeting - Client (Face-to-Pace) New Meeting - Client (Face-to-One, Small w/GF re: motion and O.70 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - Direct contact	1	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	re: case status	with Client	1	Davis, Ch	04/28/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended 2.00 \$250.00						Telephone Call - Direct contact			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact re: Judge's order Telephone Call - Direct contact re: Judge's order Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and motion Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: Judge's order Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and research of the related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook related to Client's issues Telephone call - with other parties Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney letter with other parties Davis, Chris Attorney letter legal Documents Telephone call - with other parties mfor boonin re: Telephone call - with other parties mfor boonin re: Telephone call - with other parties mfor boonin re: Telephone call - with other parties mfor boonin re: Travel (Please provide detail in Dricensed matterney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis Chris Attorney Time		\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	settlement	Groups)		Davis, Ch	04/28/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, FO)A request for Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client Issue (e-mail, FO)A request for Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client Issues (e-mail, FO)A request for Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Davis, Chris Attorney Legal Documents Davis, Chris Attorney Cher Legal Documents Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Telephone call - with other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Telephone call - with other parties van for boonin re: related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Telephone call - with other parties van for boonin re: Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small w/GF & MC Travel (Please provide detail in to chem's home Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis, Chris Attorney Meeting - Consultation with Other					w/GF re: motion and	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Pavis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney Consultation Davis, Chris Attorney Consultation Davis, Chris Attorney Consultation Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research re: order Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Cif and MC Telephone call - with other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Cif and MC Telephone call - with other parties Pavis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Cif and MC Telephone call - with other parties vm for boonin re: related to Client's issues MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small w/ Gif & MC Travel (Please provide detail in to client's home Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes) Davis, Chris Attorney Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face) settlement offer 1.30 \$250.00					:	Meeting - Consultation with Other			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Telephone call - with other parties Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis Davis, Chris Attorney Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Davis, Chris Attorney Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Pelated to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Regal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Davis, Chris Attorney Felated to Client's issues Meeting - Consultation with Other Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Davis, Chris Attorney Timesheet Notes)		\$325.00	\$250.00	1.30	settlement offer	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	1	Davis, Ch	04/27/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Legal - Direct contact Pavis, Chris Attorney with Client Corespondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, handhook Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client Issue (see any before the call - Writing Brief, Amicus, Pavis, Chris Attorney Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Davis, Chris Attorney Coreal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Content's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Content's issues Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Tinesheet Notes) Tavel (Please provide detail in to client's home Davis, Chris Attorney Tinesheet Notes)					Discussed making				
Legal - Writing Brief, Anicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, FOIA request for related to Client Issue (e-mail, handhook Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research re: order Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Wriff & MC Travel (Please provide detail in Davis, Chris Attorney Groups) Travel (Please provide detail in		\$87.50	\$125.00	0.70	to client's home	Timesheet Notes)		Davis, Ch	04/27/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Correspondence With Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Consultation with other parties Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Research (e.g. Westlaw, Research and Conf. w/ Meetings - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small W/ GF & MC 0.50 \$250.00						Travel (Please provide detail in			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact contact amended complaint and contact amended complaint and contact amended complaint and correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, and book contact amended complaint and contact amended co		\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	w/ GF & MC	Groups)	1	Davis, Ch	04/27/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact contact amended complaint and conting vith Client re: Judge's order cose update-need to file Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and conting related to Client Issue (e-mail, bandbook cose update-need to file) Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis JF re: Bob Wiggins content for legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, research and Conf. w/related to Client's issues related to Client's issues motion I intend to file consultation with Other consultation with consultation with consultation with consultation with consultation consultation with consultation wit						MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis Davis, Chris Attorney Cother Legal Documents Case update-need to file re: Judge's order O.50 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00			:			Meeting - Consultation with Other		:	
Legal - Writing Brief, Anicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: Judge's order case update-need to Jile Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and complaint and complaint and motion Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis) Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Telephone call - with other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Telephone call - with other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Telephone call - with other parties of Fand MC Telephone call - with other parties of Fand MC Telephone call - with other parties of Fand MC Telephone call - with other parties of Fand MC Telephone call - with other parties of Fand MC Telephone call - with other parties of Fand MC Telephone call - with other parties of Fand MC Telephone call - with other parties of Fand MC		\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	motion I intend to file	related to Client's issues	ı	Davis, Ch	04/27/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: Judge's order Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and motion Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and motion Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Telephone call - with other parties Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research re: order Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Other Legal Documents CF and MC S250.00 S250.00 S250.00 S250.00 S250.00 S250.00 S250.00 S250.00						Telephone call - with other parties			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact pavis, Chris Attorney with Client related to Client 1 Ssue (e-mail, handbook related to Client's issues Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and 0.50 \$250.00 Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook feelbhone call - with other parties pavis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Davis, Chris Attorney letter) Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues feelbhone call - with other parties Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/ Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Research and Conf. w/		\$1,250.00	\$250.00	5.00	GF and MC	Other Legal Documents	1	Davis, Ch	04/23/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - With Other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Telephone Call - With other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Telephone Call - With other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Telephone Call - With other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Telephone Call - With other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Telephone Call - With other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Telephone Call - With other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Telephone Call - With other parties Davis, Chris Attorney Telephone Call - With other parties Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone					Research and Conf. w/	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone call - With Other parties Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: Bob Wiggins 0.50 \$250.00		\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	Research re: order	Lexis)]	Davis, Ch	04/22/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: Judge's order Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and motion Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: Judge's order Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and rotion Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook Telephone call - with other parties Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues Davis, Chris Attorney related to Client's issues JF re: Bob Wiggins 0.50 \$250.00						Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			
Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: Judge's order case update-need to file Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and complaint and motion Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and motion Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, handbook Telephone call - with other parties		\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	JF re: Bob Wiggins	related to Client's issues	ı	Davis, Ch	04/21/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone Call - D						Telephone call - with other parties			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client relephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and motion Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, FOIA request for		\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	handbook	letter)	ı	Davis, Ch	04/21/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact re: Judge's order case update-need to file Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client case update-need to file Telephone Call - Direct contact amended complaint and 0.50 \$250.00 Correspondence with Third Party					FOIA request for	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Davis, Chris Attorney Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Complaint re: brief and amended 2.00 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Davis, Chris Attorney re: 2nd amended 0.50 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: Judge's order case update-need to file 0.30 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney Telephone Call - Direct contact contact amended complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00						Correspondence with Third Party			
Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Complaint Legal - Westlaw, complaint Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) Telephone Call - Direct contact Davis, Chris Attorney with Client Telephone Call - Direct contact Telephone C		\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	motion	with Client		Davis, Ch	04/21/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact re: Judge's order 0.30 \$250.00 Case update-need to file					amended complaint and	Telephone Call - Direct contact			
Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Paris 2nd amended re: 2nd amended 0.50 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Davis, Chris Attorney with Client re: Judge's order 0.30 \$250.00					case update- need to file				
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended Davis, Chris Attorney Lexis) complaint and motion 0.50 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact		\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	re: Judge's order	with Client	ı	Davis, Ch	04/20/2009
Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents re: brief and amended 2.00 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Davis, Chris Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, complaint and motion re: 2nd amended 0.50 \$250.00						Telephone Call - Direct contact			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00 Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, re: 2nd amended		\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	complaint and motion	Lexis)		Davis, Ch	04/20/2009
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, re: brief and amended Davis, Chris Attorney Other Legal Documents complaint 2.00 \$250.00					re: 2nd amended	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,		\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	complaint	Other Legal Documents		Davis, Ch	04/20/2009
					re: brief and amended	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			

06/17/2009 Davis, Chris	06/16/2009 Davis, Chris	06/16/2009 Davis, Chris	06/16/2009 Davis, Chris	06/12/2009 Davis, Chris	06/03/2009 Davis, Chris	06/03/2009 Davis, Chris		06/02/2009 Davis, Chris		05/26/2009 Davis,		05/22/2009 Davis, Chris		05/19/2009 Davis,	05/19/2009 Davis, Chris		05/19/2009 Davis,		05/19/2009 Davis,		05/15/2009 Davis,		05/15/2009 Davis, Chris		05/07/2009 Davis,	
Chris Attorney	Chris Attorney	Chris Attorney	Chris Attorney	Chris Attorney	Chris Attorney	Chris Attorney		Chris Attorney		Davis, Chris Attorney		Chris Attorney		Davis, Chris Attorney	, Chris Attorney		Davis, Chris Attorney		Davis, Chris Attorney		Davis, Chris Attorney		, Chris Attorney		Davis, Chris Attorney	
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, output output	Legal - Lexis)	, را		.l			Travel (Please provide detail in	Correspondence with Client (e- ney mail, letter)			MPAS Staff (One-to-One Small	1_	Correspondence with Client (e-	ney Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	ney Timesheet Notes)	Travel (Please provide detail in	١_	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,	ney with Client	Telephone Call - Direct contact	l	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,		Telephone Call - Direct contact		Correspondence with I hird Party related to Client Issue (e-mail,
review of decision	prep for hearing	re: hearing	to/from Fed Dist Ci for Hearing		Board of trustee's mtg	meeting	to board of trustees	re: hearing date changed and next steps		brief	w/ Gahrielle re rents			re: affidavit	clients home		MF and RF	Prepared affidavits for	re: Professor Grigg's						settlement offer	
0.50	2.50	0.20	1.00	0.20	2.00	1.00		1.20		0.40		0.30		0.50	0.50		2.50		0.50		1.00		0.30		0.70	
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$125.00		\$250.00		\$250.00		\$250.00		\$250.00	\$125.00		\$250.00		\$250.00		\$250.00		\$250.00		\$250.00	
\$125.00	\$625.00	\$50.00	\$125.00	\$50.00	\$500.00	\$125.00		\$300.00		\$100.00		\$75.00		\$125.00	\$62.50		\$625.00		\$125.00		\$250.00	- In the second	\$75.00		\$175.00	
\$125.00	\$625.00	\$50.00	\$125.00	\$50.00	\$500.00	\$125.00		\$300.00	£ 60.00	\$100.00		\$75.00		\$125.00	\$62.50		\$625.00		\$125.00		\$250.00		\$75.00		\$175.00	

\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	opp counsel and e-mail sent to client and gf	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/16/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	Status update	mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/14/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	discovery w/ John R. regarding filing Dept of Ed complaint.	Meeting - Consultation with Other discovery w/ John R MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small regarding filing Dep Groups) Ed complaint.	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/13/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	Discovery w/ Gabrielle re	Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/06/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	6/28/08 mtg at OU	related to Client's issues Filing Faxing File/Records	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/06/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50		Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/02/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	Discovery	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/02/2009
\$700.00	\$700.00	\$250.00	2.80	Int. and Doc req	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/01/2009
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20		Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/01/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	w/ Gabrielle re: Int/Req for Production	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	06/30/2009
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	Interrogatorries and Req production of docs	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	06/30/2009
\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00	\$250.00	5.00	Discovery planing - interrogatories doc requests,	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	06/29/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	Review decision and next steps	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	06/24/2009
\$200.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	w/ GF regarding discovery plan	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	06/23/2009
\$200.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	re: Judge's order, press release issued, scheduling order	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	06/19/2009

00.071\$	\$123.00	\$2000	0.50	set up mig	with Citetit	Auorney	Davis, Chris	00/24/2009
	*125			re: protective order and	Telephone Call - Direct contact			0005/15/000
\$325.00	\$325.00	\$250.00	1.30	e-mails w/ Boonin	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	08/24/2009
					Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail.			
\$12 <u>5.00</u>	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	w/ Boonin	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	08/07/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50		Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	08/07/2009
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	interrogatories	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	08/05/2009
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	e-mail from RF	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	08/05/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	to Boonin	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	08/04/2009
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	reviewing of answers	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	08/04/2009
\$275.00	\$275.00	\$250.00	1.10	Reviewing defendants answers to interrogatories	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	08/03/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	1.	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/30/2009
\$ 425.00	\$425.00	\$250.00	1.70	r review case file in prep for meeting with client	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	07/22/2009
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$125.00	0.50	to clients home	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/22/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	discussed discovery plan	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/22/2009
\$625.00	\$625.00	\$250.00	2.50	r w/ Gabrielle discussing discovery planning	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	07/17/2009

Organizing Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter) Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (c-mail, letter) Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related) Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related) Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter) Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes) Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face) Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter) Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,	\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00	\$250.00	5.00	prep for depositions	Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/13/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$125.00						Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00	\$325.0	\$325.00	\$250.00	1.30	issues	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/11/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00					e-mails on maten dep	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00						Correspondence with Third Party			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00	\$750.0	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	gathering list e-mails	Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/11/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00						Filing, Faxing, File/Records			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00	\$625.0	\$625.00	\$250.00	2.50	depositions	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/10/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00		,	4		Prep for upcoming				
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00	\$62.5	\$62.50	\$125.00	0.50	Meet with client	Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/10/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing neetings neetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$125.00	:					Travel (Please provide detail in			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing Organizing Telephone Call - Direct contact Tre: witness list and with Client Volume Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter) Filing, Faxing, File/Records Filing, Faxing, File/Records Telephone call - with other parties w/ Boonin regarding related to Client's issues Organizing Organizing File/Records Filing, Faxing, File/Records Freeward new records Organizing Organizing Organizing Organizing Organizing File/Records Freeward new records Organizing Organizing Organizing Organizing File/Records Freeward new records Organizing File/Records Freeward new records Organizing Organizing Organizing File/Records Freeward new records Freeward new records Organizing Organizing Organizing File/Records Freeward new records Organizing File/Records Freeward new records Organizing Organizing File/Records Freeward new records Organizing File/Records Freeward new records Organizing Organizing Organizing File/Records Freeward new records Organizing Organizing Organizing Organizing Organizing Organizing File/Records Freeward new records Organizing Organ	\$250.0	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	e-mails w/ opp counsel	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/10/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00						related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00		;				Correspondence with Third Party			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing Organizing Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter) Organizing Telephone call - with other parties v/ Boonin regarding related to Client's issues Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing Organizing Telephone call - with other parties v/ Boonin regarding related to Client's issues Organizing Organizin	\$750.0	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	document requests	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/10/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$ Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00 \$ Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)					interrogatories and	Compiling Information (Client-			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00						Research, Reading, Review and/or			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00	\$1,250.0	\$1,250.00	\$250.00	5.00	document requests	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/08/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$ Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00 \$ Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, e/mail from Boonin Piling, Faxing, File/Records arraging transcription Organizing Organizing of records of Piling, Faxing, File/Records of Pops of Piling, Faxing, File/Records of Pops on Pops or Piling, Faxing, File/Records of Pops or Pops of Piling, Faxing, File/Records of Pops or Pops or Pops or Pops or Pops of Pops or					interrogatories and	Compiling Information (Client-			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00 \$125.00 Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)					-	Research, Reading, Review and/or			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter) Filing, Faxing, File/Records arraging transcription Organizing Telephone call - with other parties w/ Boonin regarding related to Client's issues Organizing Correspondence with Third Party related to Client's issues Organizing Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, daten's dep	\$200.0	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	arrangements	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/04/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client United Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, e/mail from Boonin of Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, e/mail from Boonin of Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, e/mail from Boonin regarding transcription organizing of Party vihother parties w/Boonin regarding related to Client's issues of Paps 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00 Filing, Faxing, File/Records reviewed new records organizing File/Records reviewed new records organizing organizing ve-mails and calls about \$50.00 \$75.00					Maten's dep	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00					e-mails and calls about	Correspondence with Third Party			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$ Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00 \$ Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter) e/mail from Boonin 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 Filing, Faxing, File/Records arraging transcription Organizing 0/records 0/records 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00 Telephone call - with other parties w/Boonin regarding related to Client's issues 0/eps 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00 Filing, Faxing, File/Records reviewed new records	\$75.0	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	from clients	Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/02/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$ Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00 \$ Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter) e/mail from Boonin 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 \$ Filing, Faxing, File/Records arraging transcription Organizing 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00 \$ Telephone call - with other parties w/ Boonin regarding related to Client's issues Deps 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00 \$50.00					reviewed new records	Filing, Faxing, File/Records			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$ Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00 \$ Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, e/mail from Boonin letter) e/mail from Boonin 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00 \$ Filing, Faxing, File/Records arraging transcription 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00 \$ Telephone call - with other parties w/ Boonin regarding	\$50.0	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	Deps	related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/02/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing Organizing Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter) Filing, Faxing, File/Records of records video tapes of OU Board 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$ Condition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00 \$ Filing, Faxing, File/Records of records of records 0.20 \$250.00 \$50.00						Telephone call - with other parties			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$ Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00 \$ Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter) e/mail from Boonin 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00	\$50.0	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	of records	Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/01/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 \$ Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00 \$ Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, e/mail from Boonin 0.30 \$250.00 \$75.00					arraging transcription	Filing, Faxing, File/Records			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00 Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail,	\$75.	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	e/mail from Boonin	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/01/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00						related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and with Client deposition 0.50 \$250.00 \$125.00						Correspondence with Third Party			
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00 Telephone Call - Direct contact re: witness list and	\$125.0	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	deposition	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/01/2009
Filing, Faxing, File/Records video tapes of OU Board Organizing meetings 1.00 \$250.00 \$250.00					re: witness list and	Telephone Call - Direct contact			
	\$250.0	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	meetings	Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	09/01/2009
					video tapes of OU Board	Filing, Faxing, File/Records			
Reviewing audio and					Reviewing audio and				

\$200.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80		with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/06/2009
			·		Telephone Call - Direct contact		! !	
	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	Dep preparation and reviewing docs	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/05/2009
	\$87.50	\$125.00	0.70	to/ client's home to meet Parents for deps preparation	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/05/2009
	\$187.50	\$250.00	0.75	w/ Rich F	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/05/2009
	\$187.50	\$250.00	0.75	w/Janice F	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/05/2009
	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	e-mail Boonin	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/05/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	stip & order	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/05/2009
	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	Shae Howell, LM	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/05/2009
	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30		Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/05/2009
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	Attorney client privilege	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/05/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	Discovery issues - ROI	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/03/2009
	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	Boonin re: releases and protective order	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/02/2009
	\$625.00	\$250.00	2.50	i -	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/01/2009
	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	. w/ Leslie about travel arrangements	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/01/2009
	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	e-mail to Boonin	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/01/2009

\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	Reading discovery docs	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	10/12/2009
				or	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-			
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30		Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/12/2009
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20		Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/12/2009
\$450.00	\$450.00	\$250.00	1.80	5	Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/09/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	Or	Kesearch, Keading, Keview and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/09/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	1.	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/08/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	er Debriefing w/ Cody	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/08/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	Prep for dep	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/08/2009
\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00	\$250.00	5.00	MFF Deposition	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	10/08/2009
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	or Prep for client's deposition	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/07/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70		Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/07/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	e-mails hack-forth w/ opp counsel re: Stip & Order	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Autorney	Davis, Chris	10/07/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	w/ veena re discovery issues	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/07/2009
\$200.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	e-mails w/ booninand parents on confirming deps	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/06/2009

\$250.00	\$230.00	\$00.00C	1.00	e-mail to boonin	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/16/2009
25000			2		related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$125.00	0.50	clients home	Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/15/2009
\$325.00	\$325.00	\$250.00	1.30	for dep preparation	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/15/2009
				meeting w/ Jan Feldman	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			***************************************
\$300.00	\$300.00	\$250.00	1.20	Defendant's Dis. Req.	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/15/2009
				compiling e-mails for	Compiling Information (Client-			
				יי. יי	Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	хЗ	mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/15/2009
					Correspondence with Client (e-			
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	amended witness list	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/15/2009
					Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	W. Doctor	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/15/2009
					related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	e-mail release e. white	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/15/2009
					related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$425.00	\$425.00	\$250.00	1.70	e-mail logs to Boonin	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/14/2009
					related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	x2 e-mails	mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/14/2009
					Correspondence with Client (e-			
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	sent from opp counsel	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/14/2009
				review expert opinion	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	Rochester Schools	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/13/2009
				e-mail E. White at	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30		with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/13/2009
					Telephone Call - Direct contact		- 1	
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	witness statements	Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/13/2009
				emails, program info,	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				w/ Veena re: new OU	Meeting - Consultation with Other			
				,				

\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	J Fialka	related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/21/2009
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	going inrough OO disclosure docs from disks	Compiling Information (Client- disclosure does from Related) Telephone cell with other parties	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	10/21/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	Possible student to testify, facebook, attend class	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/21/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50		Correspondence with Client (email, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/21/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50		Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/20/2009
\$875.00	\$875.00	\$250.00	3.50	Dep of Janice Fialka	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/20/2009
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	Janice Fialka Dep	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance (Review of Documents, Practice)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/20/2009
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	e-mails disclosure	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/19/2009
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	Prep for Deposition	Hearing/Court Appearance (Review of Documents, Practice)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/19/2009
\$800.00	\$800.00	\$250.00	3.20	Deposition of Rich Feldman	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/19/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	reviewed records for dep this week/ Feldman Fialka	Research, Reading, Review and/or reviewed records for dep Compiling Information (Client- this week/ Feldman Related) Fialka	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/18/2009
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	reviewed notes and sent e-mail to Kim D.	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/18/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	w/ Rich prep for his dep	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues with Outside Parties	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/16/2009
\$450.00	\$450.00	\$250.00	1.80	e-mail compilation for Defendant's Int. Req.	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/16/2009

\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20		With Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/2//2009
)))))		Telephone Call - Direct contact		;	
\$550.00	\$550.00	\$250.00	2.20	Summary Judgment motion	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/27/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	Richard Berstein in response to MB's email	related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/27/2009
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	notion Judgment	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/27/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	e-mail to nicole	related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/27/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	w/Richx2 re: videos	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/27/2009
\$200.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	w/ Mara S. re: expert testimony	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/27/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	Mara Sapon-Shevren re: willling to assist	related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/26/2009
\$750.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	Brief	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/26/2009
\$200.00	\$200.00	\$250.00	0.80	two calls re: people to testify	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/26/2009
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	Status update	Correspondence with Client (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/23/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	Started work on Brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/23/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	numerous e-mails regarding expert	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/23/2009
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	reviewing another 8 e- mails	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/22/2009
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	5x emails w/ dif possible expert witness	Correspondence with I hird Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/22/2009
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	Reading depositions	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/22/2009

\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	draft and edit brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/02/2009
£100000	##U00.00	# 100.00	1.00	Wester Reposmons	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,	Autorney	Davis, Cilis	11/02/2007
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	Review depositions	Related)	Attorney	Davis Chris	11/02/2009
				Ť	Research, Reading, Review and/or Comniling Information (Client-			
\$875.00	\$875.00	\$250.00	3.50	expert witnesses	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/02/2009
				e-mails re: possible	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	witnesses	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/01/2009
				Locate potential expert	Compiling Information (Client-			
				ī	Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$750.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	Draft and edit brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/01/2009
					Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	Draft and edit brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/31/2009
					Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00		Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/31/2009
					Compiling Information (Client-			
				r	Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	witness list	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/30/2009
					Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			;
\$175.00	\$175.00	\$250.00	0.70	x2	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/30/2009
					Telephone Call - Direct contact			,
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	brief	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/30/2009
		•			Compiling Information (Client-			
				7	Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	call	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/29/2009
				other research for conf	Compiling Information (Client-			
				r thinkcollege.com and	Research, Reading, Review and/or thinkcollege.com and			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50		with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/29/2009
					Telephone Call - Direct contact			
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	Deb and Meg	with Outside Parties	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/29/2009
				5.	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues			
\$375.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	motion	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/28/2009
				Summary Judgment	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30		Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	10/27/2009
					Filing, Faxing, File/Records			

\$250.00	0.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	witness	letter)	Attorney	11/09/2009 Davis, Chris Attorney	11/09/2009
					M. Peterson- expert	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
\$218.75	5.00 -\$656.25	\$875.00	\$250.00	3.50	motion and brief	Lexis) Correspondence with Third Bart.	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/08/2009
\$187.50).00 -\$562.50	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	report, research articles	Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/07/2009
\$125.00	0.00 -\$375.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	Draft and edit brief Review expert witness	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus. Other Legal Documents Research, Reading, Review and/or Review expert witness	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/07/2009
\$500.00	0.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	Drafi and edit brief	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/06/2009
\$750.00	1.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	emails with KD at MORC	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/06/2009
\$750.00	1.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	emails to possible	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/05/2009
\$375.00	5.00	\$375.00	\$250.00	1.50	x4 calls	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/04/2009
\$250.00	1.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00		Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/04/2009
\$750.00).00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	Draft and edit brief	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/04/2009
\$625.00	.00	\$625.00	\$250.00	2.50	Draft and edit brief	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/03/2009
\$750.00	1.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	e-mails and follow-up phone calls re: arranging affidavits of NB and HS and possible experts	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	11/03/2009

11/12/2009	11/12/2009	11/12/2009	11/12/2009	11/12/2009	11/12/2009		11/12/2009	11/11/2009	11/11/2000	11/10/2009	11/10/2009	11/10/2000	11/10/2009		11/10/2009			11/09/2009		11/09/2009		11/09/2009		11/09/2009		
Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris		Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	; - -	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris)	Davis, Chris		Davis, Chris	! :		Davis, Chris		Davis, Chris		Davis, Chris		Davis, Chris		
Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney		Attorney	Altorney		Attorney	Attorney		Attorney		Attorney			Attorney		Attorney		Attorney		Attorney		
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Other Legal Documents	Research, Reading, Review and/or Compiling Information (Client-Related)	with Outside Parties	Timesheet Notes)	Groups)	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small	related to Client's issues	Other Legal Documents	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,	Other Legal Documents	mail, letter)	Correspondence with Client (e-	letter)	related to Client Issue (e-mail,	letter)	related to Client Issue (e-mail,	Correspondence with Third Party	Other Legal Documents	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,	related to Client's issues	Telephone call - with other parties	Lexis)	I aral Passarch (a a Wastlaw	Groups)	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small	Meeting - Consultation with Other
Draft and edit brief	Witness supplement	Petersons report	Witness affidavits	Signature on witness affidavit	witness report	t Conf. re: brief, expert	w/ Boonin	Draft and edit brief		Draft and edit brief	Status update	-	E-mail Gabel		e-mail Peterson			Draft and edit brief		Conf. with M. Peterson	_	motion and brief	Summan Indoment	Review expert witness	-	
2.00	0.70	2.50	0.80	0.70	1.00		0.30	4.00	-)	4.50	0.30))	0.50		0.70			1.70		1.00		2.00		1.00		
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$250.00		\$250.00	\$250.00)) 1))	\$250.00	\$250.00		\$250.00		\$250.00			\$250.00		\$250.00		\$250.00		\$250.00		
\$500.00 -\$375.00	\$175.00	\$625.00	\$200.00	\$87.50	\$250.00		\$75.00	\$1,000.00 -\$750.00		\$1,125.00 -\$843.75	\$75.00		\$125.00		\$175.00			\$425.00		\$250.00		\$500.00 -\$375.00		\$250.00		
\$125.00	\$175.00	\$625.00	\$200.00	\$87.50	\$250.00		\$75.00	\$250.00		\$281.25	\$75.00		\$125.00		\$175.00		į	\$425.00		\$250.00		\$125.00		\$250.00		

\$300.00	\$300.00	\$250.00	1.20		Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/20/2009
\$187.50	\$187.50	\$125.00	1.50	to OU to meet w/ client	Timesheet Notes)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/20/2009
) 					Travel (Please provide detail in			
\$125.00	\$250.00 -\$125.00	\$250.00	1.00	Response Brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/19/2009
\$375.00	\$750.00 -\$375.00	\$250.00	3.00	Response Brief	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/19/2009
\$187.50	\$375.00 -\$187.50	\$250.00	1.50	Review of Def Motion	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/18/2009
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	s w/Rich	Telephone call - with other parties related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/18/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50		Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/18/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	File brief	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/17/2009
\$375.00	\$750.00 -\$375.00	\$250.00	3.00	filing	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/16/2009
				Draft and edit brief for	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	Status update	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/16/2009
	- 1		t	100 mg	Telephone Call - Direct contact	/monney	Davis, Ciris	11/10/2007
\$250.00	\$500.00 -\$250.00	\$250.00	2.00	reviewino Def hrief	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Davis Chris	11/16/2000
\$125.00	\$250.00 -\$125.00	\$250.00	1.00	reviewing Def brief	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/16/2009
\$250.00	\$500.00 -\$250.00	\$250.00	2.00	Draft and edit brief	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/16/2009
\$500.00	\$1,000.00 -\$500.00	\$250.00	4.00	exhibits for brief	Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	11/15/2009
\$125.00	\$500.00 -\$375.00	\$250.00	2.00	Summary Judgment motion and brief	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/15/2009
\$187.50	\$750.00 -\$562.50	\$250.00	3.00	Summary Judgment motion and brief	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/14/2009
\$187.50	\$750.00 -\$562.50	\$250.00	3.00		Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/14/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50		Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	11/13/2009

\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	schedualing order - call	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/01/2009
) 1 2 3) }	review Courts	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$500.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	2.00	Beamon	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/01/2009
				e-mails re affidavit of T.	related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$1,125.00	\$1,125.00	\$250.00	4.50	Response Brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/30/2009
					Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	w/ D Cikis	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/30/2009
					related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$312.50	\$625.00 -\$312.50	\$250.00	2.50	Review and edit brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/29/2009
					Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$500.00	\$1,000.00 -\$500.00	\$250.00	4.00		Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/25/2009
					Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30	argument	Groups)	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	11/25/2009
				accommodation	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				: w/ Veena re: reasonable	Meeting - Consultation with Other w/ Veena re: reasonable			
\$75.00	\$75.00	\$250.00	0.30		with Client	Auornev	Davis, Chris	11/25/2009
					Telephone Call - Direct contact			
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20		with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/24/2009
					Telephone Call - Direct contact			
\$500.00	\$1,000.00 -\$500.00	\$250.00	4.00	Response Brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/24/2009
					Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$375.00	\$750.00 -\$375.00	\$250.00	3.00	Response Brief	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/23/2009
					Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	Mike B.	related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/23/2009
					Telephone call - with other parties			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	e-mail to beamon	letter)	Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney	11/23/2009
					related to Client Issue (e-mail,			
					Correspondence with Third Party			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	from Turkey	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/23/2009
	!			Student in ESL program	Telephone Call - Direct contact			
\$75.00	\$150.00 -\$75.00	\$250.00	0.60	Response Brief	Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	11/20/2009
					Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			

12/10/2009 Davis, Chris	12/10/2009 Davis, Chris	12/10/2009 Davis, Chris	12/09/2009 Davis, Chris	12/08/2009 Davis, Chris	12/08/2009 Davis, Chris	12/08/2009 Davis, Chris	12/04/2009 Davis, Chris	12/04/2009 Davis, Chris	12/03/2009 Davis, Chris	12/03/2009 Davis, Chris	12/02/2009 Davis, Chris	12/02/2009 Davis, Chris	12/02/2009 Davis, Chris	12/01/2009 Davis, Chris	12/01/2009 Davis, Chr
is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	is Attorney	Davis, Chris Attorney
Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	correspondence with Inita Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Organizing	Telephone Call - Direct contact with Client	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)
Draft and edit reply brief		Reply brief		Response		e-mail w/ Deniz Cikis	Exhibits		Draft and edit brief	Affidavii from T Beamon	Draft and edit brief		ex several meeting concerning brief. JK VR	Review and edit brief	
4.20	0.70	1.50	4.00	3.00	2.50	0.50	1.00	0.70	4.00	0.30	2.30	2.00	1.50	3.00	3.00
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
\$1,050.00 -\$525.00	\$175.00	\$375.00 -\$187.50	\$1,000.00 -\$500.00	\$750.00 -\$375.00	\$625.00 -\$312.50	\$125.00	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$1,000.00 -\$500.00	\$75.00	\$575.00 -\$287.50	\$500.00 -\$250.00	\$375.00	\$750.00 -\$375.00	\$750.00 -\$375.00
\$525.00	\$175.00	\$187.50	\$500.00	\$375.00	\$312.50	\$125.00	\$250.00	\$175.00	\$500.00	\$75.00	\$287.50	\$250.00	\$375.00	\$375.00	\$375.00

12/18/2009	12/18/2009	12/17/2009	12/17/2009	12/17/2009	12/16/2009	12/15/2009	12/15/2009	12/15/2009	12/14/2009	12/14/2009	12/14/2009	12/13/2009	12/11/2009	12/11/2009
Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris Attorney	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris	Davis, Chris Attorney
Апогпеу	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Allorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney	Attorney
Filing, Faxing, File/Records Organizing	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance (Review of Documents, Practice)	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Travel (Please provide detail in Timesheet Notes)	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance (Review of Documents, Practice)	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Hearing/Court Appearance (Review of Documents, Practice)	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Legal - Preparation for Hearing/Court Appearance (Review of Documents, Practice)	Writing, Editing, Developing Materials for Clients	Correspondence with Third Party related to Client Issue (e-mail, letter)	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)
	review oral argument	review cases, research, review law review articles	Hearing in US District Court	to/from dist ct	review briefs, draft settlement	amended witness list		moot ct prep for hearing	Prep for oral argument	Reply brief	m. Peterson	Drafi and edit reply brief	Review Defendant's Reply brief	
1.00	1.50	6.00	1.50	1.00	6.50	0.50	4.00	1.20	1.00	3.00	0.70	1.50	1.20	3.00
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
\$250.00 -\$125.00	\$375.00	\$1,500.00 -\$750.00	\$375.00 -\$187.50	\$125.00	\$1,625.00 -\$812.50	\$125.00	\$1,000.00	\$300.00 -\$150.00	\$250.00 -\$125.00	\$750.00 -\$375.00	\$175.00	\$375.00 -\$187.50	\$300.00 -\$150.00	\$750.00 -\$375.00
\$125.00	\$375.00	\$750.00	\$187.50	\$125.00	\$812.50	\$125.00	\$1,000.00	\$150.00	\$125.00	\$375.00	\$175.00	\$187.50	\$150.00	\$375.00

\$375.00	\$/50.00 -\$3/5.00	\$250.00	3.00	Malen	Administrative Hearing	Attorney	Nao, veena	09/22/2009
))	Deposition of Lionel	Legal - Appearance in Court or		;	00/17/2000
				Participate in				
\$750.00	\$1,500.00 -\$750.00	\$250.00	6.00	Attend deposition of two witnesses	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Attorney	Rao, Veena	09/15/2009
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	Conf. w. C. Davis re: appeal issues	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	09/14/2009
					Meeting - Consultation with Other			
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	second. programs	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	09/11/2009
				resources for post-	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small resources for post-			
				cl privilege; review				
				Confw. C. Davis re: attv-				
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	experts	Related)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	09/10/2009
				second. resources and	Compiling Information (Client-			
				r research other post-	Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$104.17	\$104.17	\$250.00	0.42	depositions	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	09/10/2009
				expert witnesses,	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				r Conf w. C. Davis about	Meeting - Consultation with Other Conf w. C. Davis about			
\$124,137.50								
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	about the decision	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Cliris	12/29/2009
}				w/ client and family	Telephone Call - Direct contact			0000/00/01
\$50.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	0.20	Call to Boonin LM	related to Client's issues	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/28/2009
			:		Telephone call - with other parties			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	decision	with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/28/2009
				Told him of Judge's	Telephone Call - Direct contact			
\$250.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	and order	Lexis)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/28/2009
				Read Judge's Opinion	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			
\$350.00	\$350.00	\$250.00	1.40	After hearing	Related)	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/21/2009
					Compiling Information (Client-			
				Reviewing Opp Sides	Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$100.00	\$100.00	\$250.00	0.40		Organizing	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/21/2009
į					Filing, Faxing, File/Records			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50		with Client	Attorney	Davis, Chris	12/21/2009
	The same				Telephone Call - Direct contact			

\$62.50	\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	2010	Kelated)	Attorney	Kao, Veena	10/21/2009
))	Review cl's IEP for 2009-	Compiling Information (Client-		;	
					Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	deposition	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/20/2009
				debrief J. Fialka	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				further depositions,	Meeting - Consultation with Other further depositions.			
\$41.67	\$41.67	\$250.00	0.17	Feldman and J. Fialka	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/20/2009
				deposition of R.	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				r Conf. w. CD re:	Meeting - Consultation with Other Conf. w. CD re:			
\$437.50	\$875.00 -\$437.50	\$250.00	3.50	Fialka	(Review of Documents, Practice)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/20/2009
				Deposition of Janice	Hearing/Court Appearance			
					Legal - Preparation for			
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	following deposition	with Outside Parties	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/20/2009
				S Debrief with J. Fialka	Meeting - Regarding Client Issues			
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	2009	Related)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/12/2009
				Review cl's IEP for 2008-	Compiling Information (Client-			
					Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$41.67	\$41.67	\$250.00	0.17	Berkley Schools	related to Client's issues	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/12/2009
				Conf. w. S. Berke of	Telephone call - with other parties			,
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	deposition, next steps	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/09/2009
				Conf w. CD re: cl's	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	Meeting - Consultation with Other			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	witnesses	(Review of Documents, Practice)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/07/2009
				testimony of OU	Hearing/Court Appearance			
				affidavits, deposition	Legal - Preparation for			
				KEVIEW S.J MOLION,				
\$104.17	\$104.17	\$250.00	0.42	Davis	Lexis)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/05/2009
				privilege case. Conf. w.	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw,			
				Review alty-client				;
\$41.67	\$41.67	\$250.00	0.17	File an appearance	Administrative Hearing	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/05/2009
					Legal - Appearance in Court or			
\$41.67	\$41.67	\$250.00	0.17	in litigation	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/05/2009
				appearance, next steps	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				r Conf. w. CDavis re:	Meeting - Consultation with Other			
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	next steps	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	09/23/2009
				Review depositions and	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				7	Meeting - Consultation with Other			

987:79	ψ0	\$2,00.00	0.33	700	Lexis)	Anorney	Nao, vecila	11/00/2009
22 23	663 33	6240 00	0 22	A 04	Louis)	1	Dan Vanna	0000/2000
				McPherson case: Rehah	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw			
\$187.50	\$187.50	\$250.00	0.75	report	Related)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/06/2009
				Review Def.'s Expert	Compiling Information (Client-			
\$41.67	\$41.67	\$250.00	0.17	emails w. Wiggins	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/05/2009
				prof. affidavit, MORC	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				r Conf. w. CD re: OU	Meeting - Consultation with Other Conf. w. CD re: OU			
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	professor	Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/05/2009
				Review affidavit of OU	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$41.67	\$41.67	\$250.00	0.17	witness' CV	Related)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/04/2009
				Review Def. expert	Compiling Information (Client-			
				Ť	Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	program	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/03/2009
				from inclusive housing	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				r Conf. w. Davis expert	Meeting - Consultation with Other Conf. w. Davis expert			
\$62.50	\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	and Lou Brown.	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/02/2009
				info for Heath Center	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				x possibilities. Get contact	Meeting - Consultation with Other possibilities. Get contact			
				Review rebuttal expert				
\$20.83	\$20.83	\$250.00	0.08	to compel	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/28/2009
				Conf. w. CD re: motion	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				ï	Meeting - Consultation with Other			
\$20.83	\$20.83	\$250.00	0.08	mate witness	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/27/2009
				witnesses and room-	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				r witness, student	Meeting - Consultation with Other witness, student			
:				Conf. w. CD re: expert				
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	(15m)	Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/22/2009
				testimony of K. Berke	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
				x motion affidavits,	Meeting - Consultation with Other motion affidavits,			
				Review depositions, sj				
\$229.17	\$229.17	\$250.00	0.92	Options, Cl. IEPs, Cl.	_	Attorney	Rao, Veena	10/22/2009
				s Berkley Schools re:	Telephone call - with other parties Berkley Schools re:			
				Conf. w. S. Berke of				

\$41.67 \$250.00				Edit brief review facts,	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus,			
\$41.67 \$250.00								
\$41.67	\$250.00	\$250.00	1.00	Edit SJ brief	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/15/2009
	\$41.67	\$250.00	0.17	Conf. w. C. Davis re: brief, facts section,	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/12/2009
\$437.50	\$437.50	\$250.00	1.75	Draft and edit reasonable accommod section, review exhibits,	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents Meeting - Consultation with Other	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/12/2009
\$187.50	\$187.50	\$250.00	0.75	Review report of Michael Peters	Compiling Information (Client-Related)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/12/2009
\$750.00	\$750.00	\$250.00	3.00	reasonable accommodation	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents Research Reading Review and/or	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/11/2009
\$187.50	\$187.50	\$250.00	0.75	Review housing information online at OU, accommodations requests, discovery requests	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/10/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	Review DOJ materials on ADA, university housing	Monitoring	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/09/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	Review cases from Westlaw-reasonable accommodation	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/09/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	Review draft of brief and edit	Related)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/09/2009
\$125.00	\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	r Review sj brief issues, expert report,	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/09/2009
\$291.67	\$291.67	\$250.00	1.17	Review reasonable accommodation cases	Legal - Research (e.g. Westlaw, Lexis)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/09/2009

\$250.00 \$83.33	33	File an appéarance for Cody	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	12/15/2009
\$250.00	0.25 \$2	r Review reply brf w. CD	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	12/14/2009
\$250.00	0.75 \$2	review reply brief and edit	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	12/14/2009
50	0.17 \$250.00	Review def 's reply brief w. CD	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	12/11/2009
5	0.08 \$250.00	structure	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	12/08/2009
5(0.17 \$250.00	Withdraw Gab Framp as counsel	Legal - Appearance in Court or Administrative Hearing	Attorney	Rao, Veena	12/08/2009
ري	0.17 \$250.00	Conf. w. CD re: Def's resp brf	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	12/08/2009
i h	1.00 \$250.00	Edit brief- legal arguments, add	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	12/03/2009
li a	1.00 \$250.00	review and edit brief	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	12/02/2009
	0.25 \$250.00	Review legal arguments re: reason. accommod	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/25/2009
	0.25 \$250.00	Review reasonable accommodation issue, review 6th cir. case	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/24/2009
	0.25 \$250.00	Conf. w. CD re: OU visit, reasonable acccom. argument	Meeting - Client (Face-to-Face)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/23/2009
li -	0.08 \$250.00	i	Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Groups)	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/19/2009
	0.25 \$250.00	Edit brief - legal arguments	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/16/2009
	0.50 \$250.00	Review Defs motion and brieffor SJ	Legal - Writing Brief, Amicus, Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	11/16/2009

\$7,760.45									
\$41.67		\$41.67	\$250.00	0.17	judge's order	Groups)	Attorney	12/28/2009 Rao, Veena Attorney Groups)	12/28/2009
					Conf. w. C. Davis about	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Conf. w. C. Davis about			
						Meeting - Consultation with Other			
\$125.00		\$125.00	\$250.00	0.50	Review decision	Related)	Attorney	12/28/2009 Rao, Veena Attorney Related)	12/28/2009
						Compiling Information (Client-			
						Research, Reading, Review and/or			
\$62.50		\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	steps	Groups)	Attorney	12/18/2009 Rao, Veena Attorney Groups)	12/18/2009
					Conf. w. CDavis re: next	MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small Conf. w. CDavis re: next			
:			j			Meeting - Consultation with Other			
\$31.25	\$62.50 -\$31.25	\$62.50	\$250.00	0.25	Review oral argument	Groups)	Attorney Groups)	12/17/2009 Rao, Veena	12/17/2009
		·				Meeting - Consultation with Other MPAS Staff (One-to-One, Small			
\$41.67		\$41.67	\$250.00	0.17	filing	12/17/2009 Rao, Veena Attorney Other Legal Documents	Attorney	Rao, Veena	12/17/2009
				i	Review Def. sur-reply	micus,			

\$134,235.45