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Hem Vyas
Manager, Domain Operations

firstiook

From: Tim Hassett [mailto:thassett@mac.com]
Sent: Wed 11/26/2008 1:32 PM

To: domainadmin-navigationcatalyst

Subject: appogee.com

Hello,

I am interested in the domain appogee.com and was wondering what your price is.

Kind Regards,
Tim Hassett

Tim Hassett
Greenville, NC
(252) 258-7881 Mobile

Instant Messenger: tmhassett (AIM)

<appogee.pdf>
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We are willing to transfer appogee.com to you for a fee of $420.00 USD.

Please advise us as to when we may begin the transfer process. Please bear in mind that if we do not receive a response
to this email within the next 5 days we will consider your offer withdrawn.

Feel free to contact me via email with any questions or concerns.

Thank you,

Hem Vyas
Manager, Domain Operations

firstiook

From: Tim Hassett [ mailto:thassett@mac.com]
Sent: Monday, December 01, 2008 10:56 AM
To: domaininquiry

Subject: Re: appogee.com

Thank you Hem. I look forward to hearing from you.

Kind Regards,
Tim Hassett

Tim Hassett
Greenville, NC
(252) 258-7881 Mobile

Instant Messenger: tmhassett (AIM)

On Nov 30, 2008, at 5:53 PM, domaininquiry wrote:

Dear Tim Hassett,

Thank you for contacting Navigation Catalyst Systems Inc. We have received your inquiry regarding appogee.com.

Please allow up to 5 business days to receive a response from us regarding the inquiry.

Thank you for your cooperation.



Unfortunately, the price of the domain name appogee.com is firm because we do have multiple offers received for this
name.

| do apologize that at this time we are unable to meet your requested price. However, please feel free to contact me if you
have any questions, or if you need some advice on purchasing another name, from us, or from another domain name
owner.

Thank you.

Hem Vyas
Manager, Domain Operations

firstiook

From: Tim Hassett [mailto:thassett@mac.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 02, 2008 8:06 AM
To: domaininquiry

Subject: Re: appogee.com, $420.00 USD

Hello Hem,

Thank you for the quick response. We are a very small, two employee startup business, and I'm afraid $420.00
is not within our limited budget.

Would you be willing to accept $200.00 for the domain?

Kind Regards,
Tim Hassett

Tim Hassett
Greenville, NC
(252) 258-7881 Mobile

Instant Messenger: tmhassett (AIM)

On Dec 1, 2008, at 10:50 PM, domaininquiry wrote:

Dear Tim Hassett,

Thank you for your inquiry regarding appogee.com.



Navigationcatalyst, Inc
Attention: Iris Freeman

2141 Rosecrans Ave., Suite 2000
El Segundo, CA 90245

Please include the domain name on the check.
Please note, the authorization code is provided only when the check clears.

Once the payment is confirmed we will send the authorization code to you to initiate the transfer of the domain. You will
have to contact a registrar of your choice (e.g. Network Solutions, GoDaddy, Register.com) with that authorization code to
initiate the transfer of the domain. Once the transfer is accepted please allow 5-7 business days for completion.

If you have any questions regarding this process, please contact us.
Thank you.

Hem Vyas
Manager, Domain Operations
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From: Tim Hassett [mailto:thassett@mac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, December 03, 2008 4:51 PM
To: domaininquiry

Subject: Re: appogee.com, $420.00 USD

Hem,

I discussed your price with my business partner, and we WILL purchase appogee.com for $420.00.
Please let me know what we need to do in order to perform the transaction.

-Tim

Tim Hassett
Greenville, NC
(252) 258-7881 Mobile

Instant Messenger: tmhassett (AIM)

On Dec 3, 2008, at 3:39 PM, domaininquiry wrote:

Dear Tim Hassett,

Thank you for your offer.
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From: Tim Hassett [mailto:thassett@mac.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 04, 2008 10:45 AM
To: domaininquiry

Subject: Re: appogee.com, $420.00 USD

Hem,
One last question:
Who pays the $25 escrow.com fee? You, me, or do we split it?

-Tim

Tim Hassett
Greenville, NC
(252) 258-7881 Mobile

Instant Messenger: tmhassett (AIM)

On Dec 3, 2008, at 5:03 PM, domaininquiry wrote:

Dear Tim Hassett,

This email will serve to confirm our agreement regarding your purchase of appogee.com, and payment for $420.00 USD.
Attached you will find our Domain Purchase Agreement terms and conditions. Please sign the attached copy of our
Domain Purchase Agreement and send it via email or via fax to 212 867 2880 - if you are faxing the document back
please send an email to notify us. To pay for the transfer you can either send a check or use Escrow.com services.
Please notify us whether you are making the payment by check or escrow.com.

For more information on Escrow.com, please visit:

https://www.escrow.com/solutions/escrow/process.asp

To create an account on Escrow.com, please visit:

https://escrow.com/index.asp

When asked for “Seller's Email” or “Other Party’s Email”, please use the following email:

Iris.Freeman@firstlook.com

If you are paying by check please make the check payable to:
3



Hello Tim,

In order to complete, the transfer of appogee.com you will need to contact your registrar and give them the authorization
code. Please submit the authorization code to your registrar within the next 72 hours.

The authorization information is as follows:

Domain Name: appogee.com
Authorization Info: SEF3F468B1B84DAD

Thank you,
Iris

From: Tim Hassett [mailto:thassett@mac.com]
Sent: Friday, December 05, 2008 6:04 PM

To: domaininquiry

Subject: Re: appogee.com, $420.00 USD

Hello Hem,

(=

Yesterday, the payment was sent and confirmed via escrow.com, and now the status is "seller notified of goo
funds". Did you receive it? If so, what is the turn around time on receiving the domain?

Many Thanks,
Tim

Tim Hassett
Greenville, NC
(252) 258-7881 Mobile

Instant Messenger: tmhassett (AIM)

On Dec 4, 2008, at 10:57 AM, domaininquiry wrote:

Thank you. We received your contract.
Buyer pays the escrow.com fee. If you want to avoid the fee you can mail your payment by check to:

Navigationcatalyst, Inc
Attention: Iris Freeman

2141 Rosecrans Ave., Suite 2000
El Segundo, CA 90245

Hem Vyas
Manager, Domain Operations



Cathy Dittrich

From: Tim Hassett [thassett@mac.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 09, 2008 2:19 PM
To: domainingquiry

Subject: Re: Auth code appogee.com

Hello Iris,

Sorry to send so many e-mails, but this GoDaddy transfer process has involved more steps than I originally
thought, and it does not look like the transfer process is complete yet. Attached is a screen shot of my GoDaddy
domain manager console stating it is waiting for the current registrar to accept the transfer.

Can you please advise?

Thanks,
Tim
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On Dec 8, 2008, at 10:50 AM, domaininquiry wrote:
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