
 

 

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 
WESTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN 

SOUTHERN DIVISION 
______ 

 
RYAN M. HILL, 
 

Plaintiff, 
 
v. 
 
NATHANAEL L. SMITH et al., 
 

Defendants. 

____________________________/ 

 
 
Case No. 1:24-cv-961 
 
Honorable Sally J. Berens 
 
 
 
 
 

OPINION 

This is a civil rights action brought by a state prisoner under 42 U.S.C. § 1983. Pursuant to 

28 U.S.C. § 636(c) and Rule 73 of the Federal Rules of Civil Procedure, Plaintiff consented to 

proceed in all matters in this action under the jurisdiction of a United States Magistrate Judge. 

(ECF No. 6.) 

This case is presently before the Court for preliminary review under the Prison Litigation 

Reform Act, Pub. L. No. 104-134, 110 Stat. 1321 (1996) (PLRA), pursuant to 28 U.S.C.  

§§ 1915(e)(2) and 1915A(b), and 42 U.S.C. § 1997e(c). The Court is required to conduct this initial 

review prior to the service of the complaint. See In re Prison Litig. Reform Act, 105 F.3d 1131, 

1131, 1134 (6th Cir. 1997); McGore v. Wrigglesworth, 114 F.3d 601, 604–05 (6th Cir. 1997).  

Service of the complaint on the named defendants is of particular significance in defining 

a putative defendant’s relationship to the proceedings. “An individual or entity named as a 

defendant is not obliged to engage in litigation unless notified of the action, and brought under a 

court’s authority, by formal process.” Murphy Bros., Inc. v. Michetti Pipe Stringing, Inc., 526 U.S. 

344, 347 (1999). “Service of process, under longstanding tradition in our system of justice, is 
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fundamental to any procedural imposition on a named defendant.” Id. at 350. “[O]ne becomes a 

party officially, and is required to take action in that capacity, only upon service of a summons or 

other authority-asserting measure stating the time within which the party served must appear and 

defend.” Id. (citations omitted). That is, “[u]nless a named defendant agrees to waive service, the 

summons continues to function as the sine qua non directing an individual or entity to participate 

in a civil action or forgo procedural or substantive rights.” Id. at 351. Therefore, the PLRA, by 

requiring courts to review and even resolve a plaintiff’s claims before service, creates a 

circumstance where there may only be one party to the proceeding—the plaintiff—at the district 

court level and on appeal. See, e.g., Conway v. Fayette Cnty. Gov’t, 212 F. App’x 418 (6th Cir. 

2007) (“Pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1915A, the district court screened the complaint and dismissed it 

without prejudice before service was made upon any of the defendants . . . [such that] . . . only [the 

plaintiff] [wa]s a party to this appeal.”). 

Here, Plaintiff has consented to a United States Magistrate Judge conducting all 

proceedings in this case under 28 U.S.C. § 636(c). That statute provides that “[u]pon the consent 

of the parties, a full-time United States magistrate judge . . . may conduct any or all  

proceedings . . . and order the entry of judgment in the case . . . .” 28 U.S.C. § 636(c). Because the 

named Defendants have not yet been served, the undersigned concludes that they are not presently 

parties whose consent is required to permit the undersigned to conduct a preliminary review under 

the PLRA, in the same way they are not parties who will be served with or given notice of this 

opinion. See Neals v. Norwood, 59 F.3d 530, 532 (5th Cir. 1995) (“The record does not contain a 
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consent from the defendants[; h]owever, because they had not been served, they were not parties 

to this action at the time the magistrate entered judgment.”).1 

Under the PLRA, the Court is required to dismiss any prisoner action brought under federal 

law if the complaint is frivolous, malicious, fails to state a claim upon which relief can be granted, 

or seeks monetary relief from a defendant immune from such relief. 28 U.S.C. §§ 1915(e)(2), 

1915A; 42 U.S.C. § 1997e(c). The Court must read Plaintiff’s pro se complaint indulgently, see 

Haines v. Kerner, 404 U.S. 519, 520 (1972), and accept Plaintiff’s allegations as true, unless they 

are clearly irrational or wholly incredible. Denton v. Hernandez, 504 U.S. 25, 33 (1992). Applying 

these standards, the Court will dismiss Plaintiff’s complaint for failure to state a claim. 

Discussion 

 Factual Allegations 

Plaintiff is presently incarcerated with the Michigan Department of Corrections (MDOC) 

at the Ionia Correctional Facility (ICF) in Ionia, Ionia County, Michigan. The events about which 

he complains occurred at that facility, the Charles Egeler Reception & Guidance Center (RGC) in 

Jackson, Jackson County, Michigan, the St. Louis Correctional Facility (SLF) in St. Louis, Gratiot 

County, Michigan, the Carson City Correctional Facility (DRF) in Carson City, Montcalm County, 

Michigan, the Saginaw Correctional Facility (SRF) in Freeland, Saginaw County, Michigan, and 

the Bellamy Creek Correctional Facility (IBC) in Ionia, Ionia County, Michigan.  

 
1 But see Coleman v. Lab. & Indus. Rev. Comm’n of Wis., 860 F.3d 461, 471 (7th Cir. 2017) 
(concluding that, when determining which parties are required to consent to proceed before a 
United States Magistrate Judge under 28 U.S.C. § 636(c), “context matters” and the context the 
United States Supreme Court considered in Murphy Bros. was nothing like the context of a 
screening dismissal pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1915(e)(2) and 1915A(b), and 42 U.S.C. § 
1997e(c)); Williams v. King, 875 F.3d 500, 503–04 (9th Cir. 2017) (relying on Black’s Law 
Dictionary for the definition of “parties” and not addressing Murphy Bros.); Burton v. Schamp, 
25 F.4th 198, 207 n.26 (3d Cir. 2022) (premising its discussion of “the term ‘parties’ solely in 
relation to its meaning in Section 636(c)(1), and . . . not tak[ing] an opinion on the meaning of 
‘parties’ in other contexts”). 
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Plaintiff sues several defendants from RGC: Defendants Assistant Resident Unit 

Supervisor Nathanael L. Smith and Kim Cargor; SLF Defendants: Assistant Resident Unit 

Supervisor Kristopher W. Spaulding and Andrew Dyer; DRF Defendants: Assistant Resident Unit 

Supervisor Bradly W. Purchase, Resident Unit Managers Joseph Niemiec and Kurt E. Blair, and 

Ryan Bowne; SRF Defendants: Assistant Resident Unit Supervisor Jeffrey W. Chesney, Carolle 

Walker, and Ronald Fenner; IBC Defendants: Assistant Resident Unit Supervisor Adam D. 

Houghton and Matthew Macauley; and ICF Defendants: Prisoner Counselor Unknown Santiago, 

Assistant Deputy Warden Unknown Cassel, Grievance Coordinator K. Miller, and Warden Dale 

Bonn in their personal and official capacities. Plaintiff also sues MDOC Manager of the Grievance 

Section of the Office of Legal Affairs Richard D. Russell in his personal and official capacities. 

Finally, Plaintiff names Unknown Parties SCC Screening Officers who were involved in 

determining Plaintiff’s screening classification from 2012 to 2017. (ECF No. 1, PageID.3–7.)  

Plaintiff alleges that from February 1, 2018, until the current date, he has been unlawfully 

and wrongfully punished as a result of increases in his security classification improperly caused 

by two minor misconduct tickets that he received. (Id., PageID.8.) 

Plaintiff alleges that on February 26, 2018, he was “screened” by Defendant Smith, and 

that the screening was approved by Defendant Cargor on April 16, 2018. (Id., PageID.9.) Plaintiff 

states that he was improperly assessed security points even though he had not had a major 

misconduct ticket for six months and had only had two minor misconduct tickets. (Id.) On March 

28, 2019, Plaintiff was “screened” by Defendant Spaulding, and Defendant Dyer approved the 

screening on the same day. Plaintiff states that his employment was improperly affected by two 

class II misconduct tickets. (Id.) On March 3, 2021, Plaintiff was “screened” by Defendant 
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Purchase, and the screening was approved by Defendant Niemiec on the same day. Plaintiff’s 

security points continued to be improperly affected by two minor misconduct tickets. (Id.)  

On August 7, 2023, Plaintiff was “screened” by Defendant Chesney. Defendant Walker 

approved the screening on the same date. (Id.) Plaintiff’s security points continued to be 

improperly affected by two minor misconduct tickets. (Id.) The same pattern occurred on April 8, 

2024, when Plaintiff was “screened” by Defendant Houghton, and the screening was approved by 

Defendant Macauley. Plaintiff’s security points continued to be improperly affected by two minor 

misconduct tickets. (Id., PageID.9–10.) 

On June 26, 2024, Plaintiff spoke to Defendant Santiago about getting his security level 

and employment status fixed. After waiting for a period of time, Plaintiff realized that no corrective 

action was being taken. Plaintiff’s security points continued to be improperly affected by two 

minor misconduct tickets. (Id., PageID.10.) Plaintiff then filed a grievance seeking to be placed in 

his true security level. Plaintiff’s grievance was reviewed by Defendant Cassel on July 15, 2024, 

and was rejected by Defendant Miller. Plaintiff filed a step II appeal, which was denied by 

Defendant Bonn. Plaintiff’s step III appeal was denied by Defendant Russell on August 23, 2024. 

(Id., PageID.10–11.) 

Plaintiff makes a conclusory assertion that similar incidents occurred between November 

1, 2012, and May 5, 2017, involving Defendants Unknown Parties, but that he has been denied 

access to documents needed to pursue claims related to these incidents. (ECF No. 1, PageID.11.) 

Plaintiff asserts that the improper increase of his security level has affected his ability to 

obtain parole in violation of the Eighth and Fourteenth Amendments. (Id., PageID.11–12.) Plaintiff 

seeks an order compelling the reassessment of his security points, a reconsideration of parole, and 

damages. (Id., PageID.13.)  
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 Failure to State a Claim 

A complaint may be dismissed for failure to state a claim if it fails “to give the defendant 

fair notice of what the . . . claim is and the grounds upon which it rests.” Bell Atl. Corp. v. Twombly, 

550 U.S. 544, 555 (2007) (quoting Conley v. Gibson, 355 U.S. 41, 47 (1957)). While a complaint 

need not contain detailed factual allegations, a plaintiff’s allegations must include more than labels 

and conclusions. Id.; Ashcroft v. Iqbal, 556 U.S. 662, 678 (2009) (“Threadbare recitals of the 

elements of a cause of action, supported by mere conclusory statements, do not suffice.”). The 

court must determine whether the complaint contains “enough facts to state a claim to relief that 

is plausible on its face.” Twombly, 550 U.S. at 570. “A claim has facial plausibility when the 

plaintiff pleads factual content that allows the court to draw the reasonable inference that the 

defendant is liable for the misconduct alleged.” Iqbal, 556 U.S. at 679. Although the plausibility 

standard is not equivalent to a “‘probability requirement,’ . . . it asks for more than a sheer 

possibility that a defendant has acted unlawfully.” Id. at 678 (quoting Twombly, 550 U.S. at 556). 

“[W]here the well-pleaded facts do not permit the court to infer more than the mere possibility of 

misconduct, the complaint has alleged—but it has not ‘show[n]’—that the pleader is entitled to 

relief.” Id. at 679 (quoting Fed. R. Civ. P. 8(a)(2)); see also Hill v. Lappin, 630 F.3d 468, 470–71 

(6th Cir. 2010) (holding that the Twombly/Iqbal plausibility standard applies to dismissals of 

prisoner cases on initial review under 28 U.S.C. §§ 1915A(b)(1) and 1915(e)(2)(B)(ii)). 

To state a claim under 42 U.S.C. § 1983, a plaintiff must allege the violation of a right 

secured by the federal Constitution or laws and must show that the deprivation was committed by 

a person acting under color of state law. West v. Atkins, 487 U.S. 42, 48 (1988); Street v. Corr. 

Corp. of Am., 102 F.3d 810, 814 (6th Cir. 1996). Because Section 1983 is a method for vindicating 

federal rights, not a source of substantive rights itself, the first step in an action under Section 1983 
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is to identify the specific constitutional right allegedly infringed. Albright v. Oliver, 510 U.S. 266, 

271 (1994). 

A. Statute of limitations  

Initially, the Court notes that many of Plaintiff’s claims are barred by the pertinent statute 

of limitations. State statutes of limitations and tolling principles apply to determine the timeliness 

of claims asserted under 42 U.S.C. § 1983. Wilson v. Garcia, 471 U.S. 261, 268–69 (1985). For 

civil rights suits filed in Michigan under Section 1983, the statute of limitations is three years. See 

Mich. Comp. Laws § 600.5805(2); Carroll v. Wilkerson, 782 F.2d 44, 44 (6th Cir. 1986) (per 

curiam); Stafford v. Vaughn, No. 97-2239, 1999 WL 96990, at *1 (6th Cir. Feb. 2, 1999). Accrual 

of the claim for relief, however, is a question of federal law. Collyer v. Darling, 98 F.3d 211, 220 

(6th Cir. 1996); Sevier v. Turner, 742 F.2d 262, 272 (6th Cir. 1984). The statute of limitations 

begins to run when the aggrieved party knows or has reason to know of the injury that is the basis 

of his action. Collyer, 98 F.3d at 220.2 

Michigan law no longer tolls the running of the statute of limitations when a plaintiff is 

incarcerated. See Mich. Comp. Laws § 600.5851(9). Further, it is well established that ignorance 

of the law does not warrant equitable tolling of a statute of limitations. See Rose v. Dole, 945 F.2d 

1331, 1335 (6th Cir. 1991); Jones v. Gen. Motors Corp., 939 F.2d 380, 385 (6th Cir. 1991); Mason 

v. Dep’t of Justice, No. 01-5701, 2002 WL 1334756, at *2 (6th Cir. June 17, 2002).  

 
2 28 U.S.C. § 1658 created a “catch-all” limitations period of four years for civil actions arising 
under federal statutes enacted after December 1, 1990.  The Supreme Court’s decision in Jones v. 

R.R. Donnelley & Sons Co., 541 U.S. 369 (2004), which applied this federal four-year limitations 
period to a suit alleging racial discrimination under Section 1981 does not apply to prisoner claims 
under 42 U.S.C. §1983 because, while Section 1983 was amended in 1996, prisoner civil rights 
actions under Section 1983 were not “made possible” by the amended statute. Id. at 382. 
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Plaintiff’s complaint was signed on September 12, 2024. (ECF No. 1, PageID.14.) He 

asserts claims against Defendant Unknown Parties arising between November 1, 2012, and May 

5, 2017. Plaintiff also asserts claims against RGC Defendants Smith and Cargor, SLF Defendants 

Spaulding and Dyer, and DRF Defendants Purchase, Niemiec, Blair, and Bowne arising between 

February 1, 2018, and March 3, 2021. Plaintiff had reason to know of the “harms” done to him at 

the time they occurred. However, Plaintiff filed his complaint more than three years after any 

involvement by Defendants Smith, Cargor, Spaulding, Dyer, Purchase, Niemiec, Blair, and 

Bowne.  

A claim barred by the statute of limitations is subject to dismissal for failure to state a 

claim. See Jones v. Bock, 549 U.S. 199, 215 (2007) (“If the allegations, for example, show that 

relief is barred by the applicable statute of limitations, the complaint is subject to dismissal for 

failure to state a claim . . . .”); see also Mattox v. Edelman, 851 F.3d 583, 590 (6th Cir. 2017) 

(holding that if, on the face of a complaint, the allegations show that relief is barred by an 

affirmative defense (lack of exhaustion), the complaint is subject to dismissal for failure to state a 

claim (citing Jones, 549 U.S. at 215)); Cataldo v. U.S. Steel Corp., 676 F.3d 542, 547 (6th Cir. 

2012) (when a complaint on its face is barred by the statute of limitations, it fails to state a claim). 

Because Plaintiff fails to allege any facts involving Defendants Unknown Parties, Smith, 

Cargor, Spaulding, Dyer, Purchase, Niemiec, Blair, and Bowne that occurred within the three-year 

period prior to the filing of his complaint, his claims against those Defendants are barred by the 

statute of limitations.  

B. Due process  

To the extent that Plaintiff’s claims are not barred by the statute of limitations, he has failed 

to allege facts showing that his due process rights were violated. As noted above, Plaintiff states 
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that the named Defendants violated his rights when they repeatedly determined that his security 

classification was higher than warranted based on the fact that he did not have any major 

misconduct tickets and only had two minor misconduct tickets. The Court also construes Plaintiff’s 

complaint to raise due process claims regarding his use of the grievance procedure and his prison 

employment. 

The elements of a procedural due process claim are: (1) a life, liberty, or property interest 

requiring protection under the Due Process Clause, and (2) a deprivation of that interest (3) without 

adequate process. Women’s Med. Prof’l Corp. v. Baird, 438 F.3d 595, 611 (6th Cir. 2006). 

“Without a protected liberty or property interest, there can be no federal procedural due process 

claim.” Experimental Holdings, Inc. v. Farris, 503 F.3d 514, 519 (6th Cir. 2007) (citing Board of 

Regents of State Colleges v. Roth, 408 U.S. 564, 579 (1972)). Analysis of a procedural due process 

claim involves two steps: “[T]he first asks whether there exists a liberty or property interest which 

has been interfered with by the State; the second examines whether the procedures attendant upon 

that deprivation were constitutionally sufficient.” Kentucky Dep’t of Corr. v. Thompson, 490 U.S. 

454, 460 (1989) (internal citations omitted). 

The Supreme Court has held that a prisoner does not have a protected liberty interest in the 

procedures affecting his classification and security because the resulting restraint does not impose 

an “atypical and significant hardship on the inmate in relation to the ordinary incidents of prison 

life.” Sandin v. Conner, 515 U.S. 472, 484 (1995). The Supreme Court also has held that a prisoner 

has no constitutional right to be incarcerated in a particular facility or to be held in a specific 

security classification. See Olim v. Wakinekona, 461 U.S. 238, 245 (1983); Moody v. Daggett, 429 

U.S. 78, 88 n.9 (1976); Meachum v. Fano, 427 U.S. 215, 228–29 (1976). Without a protected 

liberty interest, plaintiff cannot successfully claim that his due process rights were violated 
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because, “[p]rocess is not an end in itself.” Olim, 461 U.S. at 250. Because Plaintiff does not have 

a liberty interest in his security classification, he cannot show that Defendants’ actions in reviewing 

his security classification violated his due process rights.  

Moreover, with regard to Plaintiff’s assertion that his security classification adversely 

impacts his chance of being paroled, the Court notes that there is no constitutional or inherent right 

to be conditionally released before the expiration of a prison sentence. Greenholtz v. Inmates of 

Neb. Penal & Corr. Complex, 442 U.S. 1, 7 (1979). Although a state may establish a parole system, 

it has no duty to do so; thus, the presence of a parole system by itself does not give rise to a 

constitutionally protected liberty interest in parole release. Id. at 7, 11; Board of Pardons v. Allen, 

482 U.S. 369, 373 (1987). Rather, a liberty interest is present only if state law entitles an inmate 

to release on parole. Inmates of Orient Corr. Inst. v. Ohio State Adult Parole Auth., 929 F.2d 233, 

235 (6th Cir. 1991). 

In Sweeton v. Brown, 27 F.3d 1162, 1164–65 (6th Cir. 1994) (en banc), the Sixth Circuit, 

noting “the broad powers of the Michigan authorities to deny parole,” held that the Michigan 

system does not create a liberty interest in parole. The Sixth Circuit reiterated the continuing 

validity of Sweeton in Crump v. Lafler, 657 F.3d 393, 404 (6th Cir. 2011). In Crump, the Sixth 

Circuit held that the adoption of specific parole guidelines since Sweeton does not lead to the 

conclusion that parole release is mandated upon reaching a high probability of parole. See id.; see 

also Carnes v. Engler, 76 F. App’x 79, 80 (6th Cir. 2003). In addition, the Sixth Circuit has rejected 

the argument that the Due Process Clause is implicated when changes to parole procedures and 

practices have resulted in incarcerations that exceed the subjective expectation of the sentencing 

judge. See Foster v. Booker, 595 F.3d 353, 369 (6th Cir. 2010). Finally, the Michigan Supreme 
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Court has recognized that there exists no liberty interest in parole under the Michigan system. 

Glover v. Mich. Parole Bd., 596 N.W.2d 598, 603–04 (Mich. 1999).  

Under this authority, Plaintiff has no reasonable expectation of liberty until he has served 

his maximum sentence. The discretionary parole system in Michigan holds out “no more than a 

mere hope that the benefit will be obtained.” Greenholtz, 442 U.S. at 11. Thus, Defendants’ alleged 

interference with Plaintiff’s future parole prospects does not implicate a federal right. 

Furthermore, to the extent that Plaintiff intended to bring a due process claim regarding 

Plaintiff’s use of the grievance procedure regarding his security classification and Defendants’ 

responses to his grievances, he fails to state a claim. The courts repeatedly have held that there 

exists no constitutionally protected due process right to an effective prison grievance procedure. 

See Hewitt v. Helms, 459 U.S. 460, 467 (1983); Walker v. Mich. Dep’t of Corr., 128 F. App’x 441, 

445 (6th Cir. 2005); Argue v. Hofmeyer, 80 F. App’x 427, 430 (6th Cir. 2003); Young v. Gundy, 

30 F. App’x 568, 569–70 (6th Cir. 2002); see also Antonelli v. Sheahan, 81 F.3d 1422, 1430 (7th 

Cir. 1996); Adams v. Rice, 40 F.3d 72, 75 (4th Cir. 1994) (collecting cases). And Michigan law 

does not create a liberty interest in the grievance procedure. See Olim v. Wakinekona, 461 U.S. 

238, 249 (1983); Keenan v. Marker, 23 F. App’x 405, 407 (6th Cir. 2001); Wynn v. Wolf, No. 93-

2411, 1994 WL 105907, at *1 (6th Cir. Mar. 28, 1994). 

Moreover, as to any intended due process claim regarding Plaintiff’s prison employment, 

Plaintiff fails to state such a claim because “an inmate does not have a protected interest in prison 

employment.” Bethel v. Jenkins, 988 F.3d 931, 943 (6th Cir. 2021); see Dellis v. Corr. Corp. of 

Am., 257 F.3d 508, 511 (6th Cir. 2001) (concluding that the plaintiff’s claim that he was “fired 

from his prison job” was properly dismissed because there is no constitutionally protected interest 

in prison employment). 



 

12 
 

Accordingly, for all of the reasons set forth above, Plaintiff fails to state a Fourteenth 

Amendment procedural due process claim against any of the named Defendants. 

C. Eighth Amendment 

Plaintiff also asserts that his improper security classification violates his Eighth 

Amendment rights. The Eighth Amendment imposes a constitutional limitation on the power of 

the states to punish those convicted of crimes. Punishment may not be “barbarous,” nor may it 

contravene society’s “evolving standards of decency.” Rhodes v. Chapman, 452 U.S. 337, 345–46 

(1981). The Amendment, therefore, prohibits conduct by prison officials that involves the 

“unnecessary and wanton infliction of pain.” Ivey v. Wilson, 832 F.2d 950, 954 (6th Cir. 1987) 

(per curiam) (quoting Rhodes, 452 U.S. at 346). The deprivation alleged must result in the denial 

of the “minimal civilized measure of life’s necessities.” Rhodes, 452 U.S. at 347; see also Wilson 

v. Yaklich, 148 F.3d 596, 600–01 (6th Cir. 1998). The Eighth Amendment is only concerned with 

“deprivations of essential food, medical care, or sanitation” or “other conditions intolerable for 

prison confinement.” Rhodes, 452 U.S. at 348 (citation omitted). Moreover, “[n]ot every 

unpleasant experience a prisoner might endure while incarcerated constitutes cruel and unusual 

punishment within the meaning of the Eighth Amendment.” Ivey, 832 F.2d at 954. “[R]outine 

discomfort is ‘part of the penalty that criminal offenders pay for their offenses against society.’” 

Hudson v. McMillian, 503 U.S. 1, 9 (1992) (quoting Rhodes, 452 U.S. at 347). As a consequence, 

“extreme deprivations are required to make out a conditions-of-confinement claim.” Id. 

In order for a prisoner to prevail on an Eighth Amendment claim, he must show that he 

faced a sufficiently serious risk to his health or safety and that the defendant official acted with 

“‘deliberate indifference’ to [his] health or safety.” Mingus v. Butler, 591 F.3d 474, 479–80 (6th 

Cir. 2010) (citing Farmer v. Brennan, 511 U.S. 825, 834 (1994)) (applying deliberate indifference 
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standard to medical claims); see also Helling v. McKinney, 509 U.S. 25, 35 (1993) (applying 

deliberate indifference standard to conditions of confinement claims). The deliberate-indifference 

standard includes both objective and subjective components. Farmer, 511 U.S. at 834; Helling, 

509 U.S. at 35–37. To satisfy the objective prong, an inmate must show “that he is incarcerated 

under conditions posing a substantial risk of serious harm.” Farmer, 511 U.S. at 834. Under the 

subjective prong, an official must “know[] of and disregard[] an excessive risk to inmate health or 

safety.” Id. at 837. “[I]t is enough that the official acted or failed to act despite his knowledge of a 

substantial risk of serious harm.” Id. at 842. “It is, indeed, fair to say that acting or failing to act 

with deliberate indifference to a substantial risk of serious harm to a prisoner is the equivalent of 

recklessly disregarding that risk.” Id. at 836. “[P]rison officials who actually knew of a substantial 

risk to inmate health or safety may be found free from liability if they responded reasonably to the 

risk, even if the harm ultimately was not averted.” Id. at 844.  

In this case, Plaintiff generally asserts that his security classification was higher than it 

should be based on his lack of major misconduct tickets. However, Plaintiff fails to allege any 

facts showing that his living conditions posed a substantial risk of serious harm to his health or 

safety. Therefore, Plaintiff has failed to state a claim under the Eighth Amendment.  

Conclusion 

Having conducted the review required by the Prison Litigation Reform Act, the Court 

determines that Plaintiff’s complaint will be dismissed for failure to state a claim, under 28 U.S.C. 

§§ 1915(e)(2) and 1915A(b), and 42 U.S.C. § 1997e(c). The Court must next decide whether an 

appeal of this action would be in good faith within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 1915(a)(3). See 

McGore v. Wrigglesworth, 114 F.3d 601, 611 (6th Cir. 1997). Although the Court concludes that 

Plaintiff’s claims are properly dismissed, the Court does not conclude that any issue Plaintiff might 

raise on appeal would be frivolous. Coppedge v. United States, 369 U.S. 438, 445 (1962). 
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Accordingly, the Court does not certify that an appeal would not be taken in good faith. Should 

Plaintiff appeal this decision, the Court will assess the 605.00 appellate filing fee pursuant to 

Section 1915(b)(1), see McGore, 114 F.3d at 610–11, unless Plaintiff is barred from proceeding 

in forma pauperis, e.g., by the “three-strikes” rule of Section 1915(g). If he is barred, he will be 

required to pay the $605.00 appellate filing fee in one lump sum. 

This is a dismissal as described by 28 U.S.C. § 1915(g).  

A judgment consistent with this opinion will be entered. 

 

Dated: October 25, 2024  /s/ Sally J. Berens 

SALLY J. BERENS 
United States Magistrate Judge 


