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— Original Message —

From: Anna Bove Collections, Inc.

To: abc.all@fusemail.com

Sent: Saturday, June 30, 2007 5:58 AM
Subject: INGA, important

Do net send any more payments to annbh297 @fusemail.com. Palina picks it up and does business. Send everything through
ladydin@fusemail.com

Ann

9/23/2008




Page 1 0of 1

Daniel

From: vadinga@hotmail.com

Sent: Tuesday, September 23, 2008 11:36 AM
To: da@valmandelpc.net

Subject: Fw. INGA, vajno
Importance: High

----- Original Message -

From: Anna Bove Collections, Inc.

To: abe.all@fusemail.com

Sent: Saturday, June 30, 2007 5:58 AM
Subject: INGA, vajno

bol'she ne posalal payments na annb997 @fusemail.com , Polina ego zabiraet i deiaet buseness.
Posilai vse cherez ladydin@fusemail.com

Ann

9/23/2008




