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Jennifer Kirk

From: Stephanie Walker [stephaniewalker@roadrunner.com]
Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2007 3:25 PM

To: Jennifer Kirk

Subject: Re: my account

Sorry try this

Stephaniedwalker8703

Nibley4118

Stephanie Walker

Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2007 2:56 PM
Subject: RE: my account - :

Stephaniedwalker doesn’t work?

Jennifer Kirk
[en@sscty.net

From: Stephanie Walker [mailto:stephaniewalker@roadrunner.com]
Sent: Wednesday; May 30, 2007 12:34 PM

To: Jennifer Kirk

Subject: Fw: my account

This is from Nathan. One of the emails.
My login is:

Stephaniedwalker4118
Bella8703

and

Bella8703
Nibley4118

Stephanie Walker
stephaniewalker@roadrunner.com
-—— Original Message ——
atham:Counley:
To: 'Stephanie Walker'
Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2007 11:59 A
Subject: RE: my account i

LAU 00909
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Steph...I can't read either of those attachments just @ bunch of script, can you just do a screen print of the card totals? Go

to "Transactions” Select "SETTLED" for the date period (all of May), then select VISA only, next do a report for MC only,
add those 2 #'s up... ’

Thank you,

Nathan Counley

National Bankcard Systems of Durango
(p) 608.467.6672

(f) 413.431.2720

www.Durango-Direct.com -

From: Stephanie Walker [mailto:stephaniewalker@roadrunner.com]
Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2007 1:41 PM

- To: Nathan Counley :

Subject: Re: my account

Hi Nathan,

‘Here is the month of May but Discover and AmEx are included. April isn't good enough
but as I said I was shutting down my adwords so I didn't go over budget. Should I try to
go over so that I can get a increase or can we ask them now anyway? Let me know what
to do so that next month I can start out the right way.

Thanks!

Stephanie Walker
stephaniewalker@roadrunner.com
—— Ori i_n_gl Mess_qge -
NG tHAnG oHn

: 'Stephanie Walker _
Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2007 8:37 AM
Subject: RE: my account - '

Stephanie...volume limits are finicky...if you are doing $10K less than your limit then they don't usually want to give an
‘increase, if you are within $5K then that's close enough. ) . .

Talk w/ you soon...and yes we need the URL live before we can get it added...

Thank you, -

Nathan Counley

National Bankcard Systems of Durango
(p) 608.467.6672

(f) 413.431.2720

www.Durango-Direct.com

From: Stephanie Walker [mailto:stephaniewalker@roadrunner.com]
. Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2007 10:35 AM

To: Nathan Counley E

Subject: Re: my account
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Thanks Nathan. Iwill get the forms back to you but do you need to wait until the new
site is live to present it to the banks?

Also, I will get the Visa and MC numbers for you later today, however I have stopped
my adwords (which is where I market and get all of my business from) around the third
week in fear of going over each month so they may be lower than the limit. Is that

a problem? I guess wait to see what I have for totals and we can go from there.

Thave a appointment that I need to go to and won't be back until around lunch and will
get the numbers for you then. '

Thanks for all your help!

Stephanie Walker

stephaniewalker@roadrunner.com

inal Messag

P

NERAREehnISY
To: ‘Stephanie Walker
Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2007 8:17 AM
Subject: RE: my account

Stephanie,

Adding URL's to your account isn't a big problem, since your "DBA" is Strive Handbags. Just let me know, we need the
forms attached for the different banks, the Frontline one unfortunately needs to be notarized.

For volume...I need to know how much Visa & MC volume you are at for the past 2 months on each account, can you
took up ONLY Visa & MC volume from the transaction reports from Authorize.net? (just select to search by those card
types only in transaction search for the monthly totals). :

Thank you,

Nathan Counley _

National Bankcard Systems of Durango
(p) 808.467.6672

() 413.431.2720
www.Durango-Direct.com

From: Stephanie Walker [mailto:stephaniewalker@roadrunner.com]
Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2007 7:56 AM

To: Nathan Counley

Subject: my account

Importance: High

Hi Nathan,

Iwanted to ask you if we can add a new domain name,

www.celebritystylebags.com
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The reason for this is I received a email from Louis Vuitton for thepursescene.com. That
is more than half of my business.

The new site isn't live yet but I wanted to keep you informed. Can you let me know if
we can add this or not? Iwill keep thepursescene for a while too though.

Also, when can I ask for a increase from the banks on how much I can process each
month? It would make a big difference especially when running two sites.

Thanks!
Stephanie Walker
stephaniewalker@roadrunner.com
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