

	copies of defendants exhibits		
April 19, 2012	Review of "expert disclosures" and discussion w/JLN re: objections pursuant to Rule 26	1.4	GMC
April 20, 2012	Revise and file proposed voir dire and accompanying letter for person places and entities pursuant to Judge Orenstein's order	1.2	GMC
April 20, 2012	Trial prep cont.: review of ECT guidelines, draft cross for PO Joseph Sena, prep cross notes for PO Fox and confer with JLN re: fingerprints and changes to voir dire and points to go over with JM on cross	6.6	GMC
April 20, 2012	Meeting with JM - final trial prep, purchased suit, arrange meeting for trial on April 23, 2012	2.5	GMC
April 20, 2012	Meeting w/JLN and JM: mock cross of JM	2.0	GMC
April 21, 2012	Trial Prep: review of arrest paperwork, deposition transcripts, grand jury transcripts, direct examination, cross examinations and attorneys notes on same.	6.1	GMC
April 21, 2012	Review of motion for reconsideration on rulings on motion in limine	2.8	GMC
April 21, 2012	Legal research on reconsideration motion	1.1	GMC
April 22, 2012	Review of motion for reconsideration on rulings on motion in limine	.8	JPF
April 22, 2012	PC discussion w/ GMC Re: defendants motion for reconsideration	.45	JPF
April 22, 2012	PC discussion w/ JPF Re: defendants motion for reconsideration	.45	GMC
April 22, 2012	Trial Prep: review of arrest paperwork, deposition transcripts, grand jury transcripts, direct examination, cross	11.7	GMC

	examinations and attorneys notes on same. Prepare arguments against reconsideration motion and inadequate expert disclosure. Raise <u>Rehberg</u> issue for jury instruction.		
April 23, 2012	Travel to and from EDNY (2.5 hrs) from Westchester	1.25	GMC
April 23, 2012	Trial: pretrial arguments, jury selection	4	GMC
April 23, 2012	Trial Prep JM - Mock Cross of JM	1.4	GMC
April 23, 2012	Confer w/JLN on points for opening	1.2	GMC
April 23, 2012	Trial Prep: review entire file, review direct	2.7	GMC
April 23, 2012	review of Expert Disclosure	.8	GMC
April 23, 2012	Internet research and discussions with former colleagues at the innocence project regarding DNA found on firearms	1.4	GMC
April 24, 2012	Travel to and from EDNY (2.5hrs) from Westchester	1.25	GMC
April 24, 2012	Trial: Randall, Burbridge, JM	7	GMC
April 24, 2012	Legal Research Daubert Standard	.9	GMC
April 24, 2012	Draft cross for expert	1.7	GMC
April 24, 2012	Finalize cross for PO Joseph Sena	1.9	GMC
April 24, 2012	Draft Closing Argument Bullet points for JLN	1.3	GMC
April 24, 2012	Email to JLN Re: proposed jury instructions	.3	GMC
April 25, 2012	Travel to and from EDNY (2.5hrs) from Westchester	1.25	GMC
April 25, 2012	Trial: Fox, Sena, Lamouse-Smith, Closing Arguments, Jury Charge	8	GMC