

EXHIBIT G

04/20/12	Reviewed letter to Defendant's Notice of Persons, Places and Entities for Jury Voir Dire by GC	0.10	JLN
04/20/12	Reviewed Defendants Motion for Reconsideration of Certain Rulings on Defendant's Motion in Limine	0.30	JLN
04/20/12	Email to and from J. Castro regarding Ms. Lamouse-Smith's background report; conducted independent research on witness	1.30	JLN
04/20/12	Email from J. Castro advising Judge to hear both parties motions on Monday.	0.10	JLN
04/20/12	reviewed all documents for trial. Selected four documents for Trial Graphix to be highlighted	2.50	JLN
04/20/12	Scanned and e-mailed documents to Trial Graphix to be highlighted	0.2	NB
04/21/12	Review of Defendant's Motion for Reconsideration; made notes re: same, prepared for Oral argument on Mon	2.7	JLN
04/22/12	Went through entire cross outline of Burbridge & Marked up cross with notes; highlights, arrows and post-its to facilitate use at trial	2.75	JLN
04/22/12	Went through entire cross outline of Randall & Marked up cross with notes; highlights, arrows and post-its to facilitate use at trial	2.80	JLN
04/22/12	Drafted outline of opening statement; practiced delivering same	6.80	JLN
04/23/12	Confer w/GC on points for opening	1.90	JLN
04/23/12	Travel to/from Eastern District of New York from Bronx (2.0)	1.00	JLN
04/23/12	Argued defendants motions for reconsideration - denied	1.00	JLN
04/23/12	Selected Jury	2.80	JLN
04/23/12	Continued reviewing, editing and practicing opening to be able to deliver w/o notes	6.00	JLN
04/23/12	Reviewed Minute Entry for proceedings held before Hon. Gold on 4/23/12	0.10	JLN
04/23/12	Email from J. Castro enclosing report of Nana Lamouse-Smith; reviewed same; took notes	1.75	JLN
04/24/12	Travel to/from Eastern District of New York from Bronx (2.0)	1.00	JLN
04/24/12	Reviewed City's Motion re: "open door" claim; researched case law re: same	1.70	JLN
04/24/12	Delivered opening statement; cross-xed Burbridge, Randall and Fox (on trial whole day)	7.80	JLN
04/24/12	Reviewed Minute Entry for proceedings held before Hon. Weinstein on 4/24/12	0.10	JLN
04/24/12	Read Email from G. Cohen re: Proposed Jury Instructions of April 24, 2012	0.10	JLN
04/24/12	Read Email from G. Cohen re: attaching closing argument points for Marshall	0.20	JLN
04/24/12	Drafted Summation outline; started rehearsal of same	5.25	JLN
04/25/12	Continued rehearsing summation	3.50	JLN
04/25/12	Travel to/from Eastern District of New York (2.0)	1.00	JLN
04/25/12	Court - Sena Direct Cross; DNA expert; Delivered Summation; Deliberations	3.50	JLN
04/25/11	Reviewed Defendants' Brief in Support of Multiple Trial Motions; Discussion with GC re: same	0.50	JLN

04/25/12	Reviewed Minute Entry for proceedings held before Hon. Weinstein	0.10	JLN
04/26/12	Reviewed defendants' Brief and attachments in support of motion for mistrial; discussion with GC regarding same	0.75	JLN
04/26/12	Conferring/Email with JF & GC waiting for verdict re: handling post verdict jury questions; Deliberations, jury charge, verdict rendered	3.00	JLN
04/26/12	Travel to/from Eastern District of New York from Bronx (2.0)	1.00	JLN
04/26/12	Reviewed Minute Entry for proceedings held before Hon. Weinstein on 4/26/12	0.10	JLN
04/30/12	Meet and Confer: GC and JF Re: Atty fees Application	0.3	JLN
05/02/12	Research regarding Attorney's fees in the Eastern District	2.3	JLN
05/07/12	Discussion w/ Gerald and Josh re: Conference Re: Atty Fee Application	0.4	JLN
05/08/12	Telephone conversation with Hon. Pohorelsky re: filing of Attorney's Fees application	0.10	JLN
05/08/12	Discussion Post re: Conference Re: Atty Fee Application	0.5	JLN
05/09/12	Discussion/emails regarding atty fees potential resolution	0.35	JLN
05/09/12	Review of final bill costs & disbursements	0.75	JLN
05/09/12	E-mail exchanges with GC re: proposed letter to defense counsel	0.10	JLN
05/14/12	Co-counsel Discussion with Re: no answer from city	0.35	JLN
05/16/12	Drafting Personal Declaration	2.1	JLN
05/16/12	E-mail exchanges w/ J. Abady, A. Saleem and C. Galiardo re: obtaining supporting Declaration.	0.3	JLN
05/17/12	Review Memo of law and exhibits	2.8	JLN
05/18/12	Conference call w JPF re: final fee app	0.3	JLN
05/18/12	Final review of Decl. & Submissions	0.5	JLN
05/18/12	Telephone conversation JF and GC re: Attorney's Fees Application	0.30	JLN
05/18/12	Reviewed Atty Fee Mem. of Law and made revisions/edits to same; t/c JPF re: edits	1.25	JLN
05/18/12	Reviewed JLN Decl. and made revisions/edits; reviewed all exhibits annexed to JLN Decl	1.10	JLN
	Total Hours	453.25	